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Ted Hill Home
From Hospital

RIVERVIEW Ted Hill came 
home Tuesday He was in the St 
Vincent hospital several days 
then spent three weeks at the 
home of his niece and husband 
Mr and Mrs Wallace at Canby

Mr and Mrs Claude Gibson 
attended the marriage of their 
daughter at Provo. Utah re­
cently The ceremony was per 
formed at the Provo Temple 
uniting Nancy Ann Pearson and 
Francisco Escobedo on October 
5 A reception was held that 
evening for family and friends

Sgt Douglas Steele of Berg 
strom Air Force Base. Austin. 
Texas is home on a 2 week s 
furlough His wife has been with 
her parents in Salem and plans 
to return to Texas with him 
They visit his mother. Mrs 
Juanita Steele here from time to 
time

Mr and Mrs Claude Norris of 
Portland spent Sunday afternoon 
visiting Mrs Nettie Lloyd and 
Mr and Mrs Virgil Snook

DEQ Requires
Burn Permits
Backyard burning is sche 

duled for Portland Vancouver 
Longview residents from Oc­
tober 26 through November 25

Permits are required and are 
available at local fire depart 
ments in four Oregon counties 
Multnomah Clackamas Wash 
ington Columbia

Washington s Clark and Cow­
litz County residents should in 
quire at local fire departments to 
find out whether permits are 
necessary

The limited burning period for 
yard and garden clippings and 
clean wood is being iniplemen 
ted by the Department of En­
vironmental Quality. Portland 
and the Southwest A ir Pollution 
Control Authority. Vancouver

Public Service Announce­
ments on local radio stations 
beginning at approximately 8 
a m on the last Frida v in 
October through the last Sun­
day in November w ill con­
firm  whether burning conditions 
are acceptable on any given day.

Mrs. Nellie Dunlap 
Entertains Guests

maoMMammMMaaooK

Church Notes
nooooooooMoeoooooBaai

Evangelical
Friday evening at 6 30 there 

will be a time set aside to pray 
for personal and community 
needs If you have a prayer 
request you may telephone it to 
429-5575

From 7 to 10 p m Friday there 
will be activities for Junior 
Highers Gym games the Teen 
Room, singspiration. devotions, 
and refreshments are planned A 
similar "Open House" for high 
school only is planned for Sa­
turday evening between seven 
and ten

Next Lord's Day activities 
begin with a men's prayer time 
at 7:30 a m  Sunday School 
activities begin at 9 45 under the 
leadership of Superintendent 
Paul Weidman The worship 
hour w ill feature singing, 
prayer, and short messages by a 
special guest from the Gideons 
and the pastor Koffee Kononia 
follows at noon All are warmly 
invited to become involved with

, our growing fellowship of Chris­
tians in the making 

Teen Choir practices at 5:15 
followed by Youth Fellowship at 
6 p.m The Sunday Classmeeting 
w ill be held at 7.

Hoot Owl Breakfast Tuesday 
morning 5 -7 :30  a m

Home Bible Classes are being 
held in the community, for 
information concerning a class 
in your area telephone 429-5522

Deer Hunten 
Successful

Building Permits
Down In August 7 3

Building permits down in Co­
lumbia County in August 1973. 
compared to August 1972. the 
University of Oregon Bureau of 
Business and Economic Re­
search has reported

In August 1973. the total was 
$278,517 compared to $391 686 m 
the same month last year

Building permits from 147 
identical reporting centers in 
Oregon totalled $64 639.903 in 
August 1973 This was 10.6 
percent lower than in August 
1972

The state total in August 1973. 
included $32,663,503 for 1.788 new 
dwelling units $17,634,733 for 
new nonresidential construe 
tion. and $14,341,627 for addi­
tions. alterations and repairs to 
existing structures

For the same month last year, 
the $72,298,184 total of permits 
was composed of $45,669,524 for 
2.801 new dwelling units; 
$15,879,906 for new nonresiden­
tial construction; and $10,748,754 
for additions, alterations, and 
repairs to existing structures

NATAL-PITTSBl'RG - Mr 
and Mrs Eowin Kalesse of 
Portland, visited Mrs Nellie 
Dunlap Sundav

Mr and Mrs Jan Miller of 
Beaverton visited Mr and Mrs 
Joe Howard Sundav

Recent callers at the Max 
Oblacks were George Holding 
and Mr and Mrs Reed Holding 
of Scappoose

Mr and Mrs Floyd Deeds of 
Salt Lake City spent several 
days here last week, flvmg home 
Sunday.

Mr and Mrs Dan Clark of 
Salem Mr and Mrs Max Wolff 
of Portland and Bill Keim of 
Portland were dinner guests 
Sunday of Mrs Mildred Tupper

Commission Meets
The Oregon Transportation 

Commission w ill hold its regular 
monthly meeting on Wednesdav, 
October 24 at 9 a m in the 
Conference Room I Room 122) of 
the Highway Building in Salem

Christian

Th is  Land  
Is  Y o u r Land  
K eep  I t  C lean

EMMANUEL EPISCOPAL 
CHURCH
BIRKENFELD, OREGON 
The Rev. C. S. Sfculda. Vicar 
Pheae Clatskanie 728-2331
Celebration of the Holy Commu­

nion the Fourth Sunday of each 
month at 12:00 Noon.

The Women's weekly prayer 
meeting Tuesday at 10 a m., 
choir practice Wednesday even­
ing. both at the church

Bible Study Thursday evening 
at 8 p.m at the Orv Olson home

If  you're without a church 
home, come join us in the 
Sunday morning services. Sun­
day School begins at 9 45 a.m., 
with classes for all ages Wor­
ship Service starts at 11 a m The 
Evening Fellowship hour starts 
at 6 p m. with Jr High and CYT 
starting at 7 p.m

At 9:30 a.m October 24. the 
CWT w ill be working on quilts, 
bring sack lunch, then the regu­
lar meeting w ill start at 1:30 
p.m This w ill be in the fellow­
ship hall in the church Don’t 
forget the Halloween party Sat­
urday. October 27. 7:30 to 9:30 
p.m Fun for everyone—come 
dressed in a costume

Bible

LODGE A N D  CLUB NOTICES
VERNONIA JAYCEES | NEHALEM 

VALLEY 

CHAPTER

Meet« the 2nd A 4th 

Tuesday ad every

J.C. Hell—Old Mill Market 
7:39 P.M.

Bob Carson. President 
Bill Hunter, Secretary 3-74

PYTHIAN SISTERS
VERNONIA TEMPLE NO. (1

_ LO.OF. Hall Second 
Fourth Wednesdays af each 
“  at 8 pan.

Leona Haverland, M.E.C.
Cora Lange. Secretary 3-74

A T . & A J C
to  Vernonia Lodge No. 184 
I  A. F. A A. M. meets at 
A  Masonic Temple. Stated

at 8:80 p.m.

Jim Norwoc W.M 
Walter E Linn, Sec’y. 1-74

A.F.L, — C.I.O.

IWA Local 
3-14

Meeting on 1st 
Monday of 
each month.

7:30 p.m.
4-74

Meets at West Oregon Electric 
Bldg., third Thursday of each 
mouth 7:30 p.m.
Joe L Dailey, President 
Ralph Bergerson. Sec y. 3-74

VERNONIA CHAMBER 
OF COMMERCE

Board of Directors report to mem­
bers quarterly Board meets the 
second Monday. 8:10 p.m. at 
West Oregon Electric office 
Visitors invited.
T. F. Tomlm, President
Mrs Evelyn Heath Sec y. 7-74

MT. HEART REBEKAH 
LODGE NO. 243

Meets 2nd A 4th Thursday even­
ings of each month in the I.O.OT. 
Hall
Irma Chance, Noble Grand 
Evelyn Heath, Sec’y. 3-74

Vernonia Lodge No. 246

,1.0.0-F.
First and Third Tuesday

8 p.m.
Lloyd Qumn, Noble Grand 
Harry Culbertson, Sec’y

Those persons looking for an 
active, friendly church that 
stands for the Word of God are 
extended a warm welcome to 
attend the following services 
Sunday School 9:45 a m
Morning Worship 11 a.m
Evening Service 7 p.m
Family Night (Wed.) 7:30p.m

A representative of the Gideon 
Bible w ill be with us this Sunday 
morning October 21st He w ill be 
sharing with us the work of the 
Gideons Plan on attending

A bus is run every Sunday 
morning for those needing a ride 
to Sunday School and church 
For more information phone the 
pastor at 429-3363

Junior Church w ill be held 
during the morning worship 
service for kindergarten through 
4th grade and w ill be geared to 
the understanding and needs of 
the boys and girls Great things 
are planned for the future'

An adult Bible study on the 
book of John is held every 
Thursday evening in the home of 
Mr and Mrs V irgil Snook 
Everyone is invited

The high schoolers meet every 
Wednesday evening from 7:30 - 
8:30 for Bible study and fellow­
ship

A Halloween Party for Sa­
turday October 27th is in the 
makings for the Primary De­
partment, nursery through 4th 
grade from 3:30 5 p.m in the 
afternoon and the Juniors, 5th - 
8th grade from 7 - 9 in the 
evening Games, prizes, re­
freshments. and even more are 
planned

MIST - Fred and Mike Busch, 
and Dick Vaughn returned home 
from Desolation and Rim Rock 
Springs, near Bend, in Eastern 
tiregon. Thursday evening, with 
two deer Mrs Ixxiise Banzer 
visited the Busch's Sunday a f­
ternoon

Butch and Norm Crawford 
returned home from Eastern 
Oregon last week Butch re­
turned home successful. bagging 
a spike Mrs Wilbur McKinney 
and daughter from Forest 
Grove, visited the Crawfords 
Friday Mrs Paul Goodman 
visited the Crawfords over the 
weekend Saturday, the Craw 
fords attended the West Oregon 
Electric Co-op meeting and won 
a com popper

l-arry Garlock returned home 
successful Wednesday evening 
from Eastern Oregon with a 
forked horn

The Lloyd Garlocks returned 
home from a successful hunting 
trip to Eastern Oregon with a 
four-point Sunday dinner guests 
were Mr and Mrs Roy Tottens 
and daughter Linda Mrs Gar 
lock also received word Sunday 
that Leonard Harris passed 
away on Saturday The Harris's 
lived in what is now the Casper 
Serby home

Ray Grimsbo was home visit­
ing his father over the weekend

Mrs Marie Murphy. Mrs 
Jane Hansen s sister, left for 
Portland, after a three-week 
visit Mr and Mrs Ted Kulyu 
were out for the weekend to visit 
and do some hunting

Mrs Steve Hanson spent the 
week with her parents, the Nor­
man Hansens

Mrs Martin Hansen and Mrs 
Nettie Cox attended the Electric 
Co-op meeting last Saturday 
Mrs Cox won a toaster, and Mrs 
Hansen won a toaster-oven

Mrs. Allen Wise and two 
children visited Mrs Nettie Cox 
on Friday. Mrs Wise, children, 
and Mrs Cox were in Longview 
last week on business

The Roy Kyser family re­
turned home from China Hat in 
Eastern Oregon last Wednesday 
evening, after several days of 
hunting

Mr and Mrs Casper Serbv 
were in Cedar Hills. Tuesday 
afternoon on business The Ser 
bys were in Vernonia. Saturday 
to attend the Electric Co-op 
meeting, where Mrs Serbv won 
an electric griddle Mrs Rodger 
McDowell, of Beaverton, visited 
the Serbys, Sunday afternoon 
Mrs McDowell lived formerly in 
the Harold Case place in Mist

Mr and Mrs Jim Wilson of 
Portland, were guests of Mr and 
Mrs Bud Hemeon last weekend 
Vicki Hemeon and Sue Floeter 
returned home from California 
and Mexico last weekend

Mr Eldon Shelter and Forest 
returned home Tuesday night 
from  Southeastern Oregon 
Robin and Blossom accompa­
nied them and they returned 
home with two deer

Mr and Mrs Sundland took 
Mrs Noble Dunlap to Forest 
Grove to see Noble While in 
Forest Grove, the Sundlands 
visited the William Bridgers 
home, the Bridgers are former 
residents of Vernonia The Sund 
lands visited the Marsons in 
Portland, last Thursday Thurs 
day evening, the Walter Fosters 
arrived from Stockton. Califor 
ma for a visit May M ills was a 
Sunday dinner guest at the 
Sundlands

MORAN OIL Company of Portland
*U ch  was to have been installed at W n k

Grade School prior to the opentog of

MeMaoaoaoMeMMaaMK
D irectory  
O f Churches
VERNONIA BIBLE CHURCH 
Adams A Maple 
Kenneth Wooten. Pastor
Sunday:
9:45 a.m - Sunday School 
11:00 a.m. - Morning worship ser­

vice
5:45 p.m. - Junior Youth Fellow­

ship
7:00 p.m. - Evening worship ser­

vice
Wednesday
7:30 p.m. - Bible Study and Pray­

er
If you have a spiritual need or 

question, call Pastor Wooten at 
429-3363

CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST 
OF LATTER-DAY SAINTS 
VERNONIA BRANCH 
850 Madison Avenue 
Branch Pres. - Henry T. Hudson 
1st Coon. .  Claude E. Gibson 
2nd (ouas. - Ebner C. Schrader 
Ward Clerk - Robert E. McNair 

Meeting Schedule 
Priesthood - 8 30 a.m.
Sunday School - 10:15 a.m 
Sacrament Mtg. - 11:30 a.m. 
Relief Scty - Tuesday. 10:30 a.m 
M.I.A - Wednesday, 7:30 p.m

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
Jefferson and Maple 
Rev Dan Billing!. Pastor
9.45 a.m. - Sunday school Classes 

for all ages
11:00 a.m. - Morning warship 
7:00 p.m. . Evangelistic service 
7.30 p.m. - Wednesday Prayer 

Meeting and Bible Study 
(Need a ride* Call 4294353'

ST. MARY’S CATHfXJC 
Father Anthony Gusein
Mass is celebrated every week- 

day morning at 8:30 in the rec­
tory. Confessions are heard be­
fore Mass

Saturday - Mass at 7 p.m. in the 
church

Sunday • Masses at 8:30 and 10 
a.m.

Confessions • On Saturday from 6 
to 6.45 in the church, before 
Mass

and la double seoslsM far 
and Washington Grade

Nordstroms 
In Portland

BIRKENFELD Mr and Mrs
Francis Nordstrom were in
Portland last Friday and visited
John Cahill at the Satterlund
Nursing Home He is now bed­
fast and not very well 

On Tuesday of last week Mrs 
Lloyd Beach took Mrs Robert 
Mathews and went to Rainier 
where they niel their sister Mrs 
Mary Boone and from there 
drove to Morton. Washington to 
visit relatives

Mrs Bob DuPuts accompa 
med by Mrs Francts Nordstrom 
and Mrs George Richardson and 
Joe attended the West Oregon 
meeting on Saturday.

Mr and Mrs Francis Larson 
were Saturday evening dinner 
guests at the home of Mrs 
Audrey Rodgers It was a be 
la ted birthday dinner for, Her 
bert and Lorene. it so happened 
it was also the wedding anm 
versary of Francis and Ethel 
Others there were Mr and Mrs 
Victor Jarrett, and Mrs Mike 
Tiedeman. The dinner was real 
nice and all had an enjoyable 
time.

Mrs Lloyd Beach accom­
panied Mrs Robert Mathews to 
Clatskanie last Friday, and on 
Saturday Mrs Beach took Mrs 
Mathews They were Vernonia 
callers

Paul Provost of Hammond 
spent three days at the Bob 
DuPuis home

Mrs Art Bellingham and Mrs 
Lloyd Beach were in Seaside 
Sunday and visited Mrs Elsa 
Richardson and Aunt Julia 

The Joe Lonnauists visited her 
cousin. Mrs Freda Foster, of 
Clatskanie Sunday

Our Health Insurance 
Plan protects you 

FOUR ways
L e t  us g iv e  yo u  th e  fa c ts  
ab ou t o u r H e a lth  Insurance  
P lan  that offers y o u r fa m ily  
m o re  protection  than m ost 
p lan s . I t  can ( I )  h e lp  yo u  
m eet hospital bills and m a­
jo r  m e d ic a l expenses , ( 2 )  
p ro v id e  incom e to  help re­
p lace earnings lost th rough  
d isab ility , ( 3 )  in c lud e p a y­
m ents fo r  y o u r dependents i f  
you suffer fa ta l in ju ries , and  
(4) prov ide substantial lu m p  
sum benefits fo r  loss o f  sight 
o r lim bs. C a ll us fo r  m ore  
in fo rm a tio n .

BILL J. HORN
Vernonia Insurance 

Exchange
Phone 429-6203

953 Bridge S treet 
Vernonia, Oregon
R tprtifnttng  
Hsrtls rO Accidsnt snd 
Indsmnlty Csmpsny S
Btomter Tbs Harttori C V *
Insursne» Group 
Hartford 15. Conn.

Wilneues
AMERICAN LEGION

Meeta 2nd and 
4th Taesday af 
each month.

VERNONIA

POST 11»

Wilbur E. Wilsoc, Commander 
Harry Culbertaon, Adjutant

AUXILIARY
First and Third Tuesdays
Reatha Horn. Presidait 
Gertrude Schaiock Sec’y. 1-74

Vernonia Barrack» 
Veterans of World War I

1-74

Order of Eastern Star
N ehalem  Chapter 153, O .E .S

Regular com­
munication the 
3rd Wed. each 
month at Ma- 

Tempie. 
All vMtting sU- 
ten  and bro­
thers welcome

Hope Koch, W M.
Irma Fisher, Sec’y. 1.74

ALCOHOLICS 
ANONYMOUS 

Vernonia Friendship Group
EVANGELICAL CHURCH 

KITCHEN
Thursdav Evas. 8 p.m.

429-2941 . 429-6245
2-744th Monday 

■Math at the
IO W  hall. 12 Nom

AUXILIARY
*h Meaday, I.O.O.F. HaD 

Ova Lange, President 
raye Davis, Secretary 8-73

VERNONIA 

LIONS 

CLUB
MEETS AT PINE CONE 

SUMMER RECESS
Darrold Proehl, President 
Ted Forbes, Secretary 8-74

The public talk and Watch­
tower study at the Kingdom Hall 
of Jehovah’s Witnesses here in 
Vernonia will be cancelled for 
this Sunday, October 21 The 
Witness from this area will be 
joining several thousand others 
from the greater Portland area 
in a special gathering at the 
Memorial Coliseum for a color 
slide program about the Holy 
Lands

Sunday's program will begin 
with a review of an article from 
the September 15 issue of the 
Watchtower, "What Kind of 
Training Do Children Need?” , 
from 10 to 10:30 a.m This will be 
followed by an hour and fifteen 
minute slide program on the 
theme "Bible Lands Speak To 
Strengthen fiur Faith "  The first 
part of the program will show 
many locations of Bible events in 
ancient Israel and w ill aid all in 
attendance to develop a greater 
appreciation of the events they 
read about in the Bible A second 
part of the slide program, after a 
short intermission, w ill illustrate 
how the news about Christ 
spread throughout the ancient 
world, and how that ministry is 
also being carried out today 

All who would like to be in

Visiters Enjoys Trip 
To Si. Helens Area

BIRKENFELD - Mrs E.T. 
Johnston visited on Monday in 
Warren at the Bruce Larsen 
home, and also in St Helens at 
the home of her Aunt Mary 
Cooper

Mrs Tomblad went to the 
West Oregon meeting with Mrs 
Ardys Hanson and Mrs Nettie 
Cox.

Mr and Mrs Bruce Larsen 
visited at the E.T Johnston 
home Sunday.

Mrs Ann Lonnquist, Eve and 
Luke of Eugene arrived at the 
Ixinnquists on Friday. They 
returned hack home on Sunday

The E T Johnstons received 
word that ’heir daughter-in-law 
Mrs Gary Johnston s mother 
had passed away at Waterville. 
Maine of a heart attack The 
Gary Johnstons live at Dallas 
Sympathy goes to the family

Last Friday Mrs Ardys Han 
son and Mrs Douglas Barr 
visited at the Tornblad home 

Art Bellingham. E.T. Johnston 
and George Richardson all left 
Thursday of last week going 
duck hunting at Klamath Falls 
The Georgi Bellingham family 
also went duck hunting

attendance at this special pro 
gram will be most welcome The 
local congregation’s regular 
meeting sctiedule w ill resume as 
usual next week

SEVENTH-DAY ADVENTIST 
2nd A Nehalem 
L. L. Huntington. Paster 
Claade Veal. Local Elder 
9:30 Sabbath School 
11:00 Worship Service 
7:00 P.M. Monday - Dorcas So­

ciety at Veal's home.
7:30 P.M. Wed. - Prayer Meeting 

at Veal's home
7:00 P.M. Man. - Pathfinders at 

Scout Cabin.

FIRST EVANGELICAL CHURCH 
857 State Avenue 
Jack Carlson. Pastor
9:45 am. .  Sunday School, Paul 

Weidman, Sup’t.
11:00 a.m. - Morning worship 
5:00 p.m. - Youth Fellowship. 
7:00 p.m - Evening service 
Every Evening
7:00 p.m. - Hour oi power, prayer 

and Bible study.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Washington A A Streets 
Terry E. Lowe», Pastor 
Phone 428-3381
Sunday: 10 a.m. Sunday School 

11:00 A.M. Warship Service 
7:00 P.M. Evening Worship

Wednesday: 7:00 P.M Midweek 
Prayer Service

MIST - BIRKENFELD COMMU­
NITY CHURCH

Birkenfeld, Oregon 
Elds» «better, Pastor 
9:46 a.m. - Sunday School 
11:00 a.m. - Church Services 
7:30 p.m. - Wed. Prayer Meeting 
10:30 a-m. - »Waiter Months) on 

2nd Wed. Women's Missionary 
and Work day.

VETERANS SERVICE OFFICE
Old Courthouse Basement 
ST. HELENS. OREGON 

Phone 397-2268 — Alter Hour« 397-1730
M onday - W ednesday - Thursday 

9:30 a.m. to 12 Noon

FALL SALE

CHECK YOUR FALL SALE 
CIRCULAR AND SAVE

ENDS TH IS  WEEK
MASTERCRAFT

PERMANENT

A N TIFR E E ZE
Gallon

$ 1 .6 9

Baptist

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
430 North A
Rass Vtoyard, P

First Baptist Church of Ver­
nonia invites you to worship and 
fellowship at the following ser­
vices:
Sunday School 10a m
(Classes fo r everyone) 
Morning Worship 11 a.m
Evening Worship 7 p.m
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m
»Bible study and prayer)

Sunday - Bible School 9:45 a.m. 
Homer Fuller, Supt 
Morning Warship 11:00 a m. 
(Nursery Provided)
Fellowship Hour 8:07 p.m.

Wednesday Choir Practice 
7:00 p.m.

(1st only- Church Night 0:80 p.m. 
(»d  A 4th) CWF . 1:80 pm. 
Friday: Bible Study - 8:00 pm.

(Call for location of Bible 
Study)

MASTERCRAFT

Therm ostats
Starling At

$ 1 3 9
B R U N S M A N

HABDWARE and ELECTBI 
f i n e  f u r n i t u r e  

WE DELIVER

Gould» balanoad 
Jfluw. no tank, no 

axtraa shallow 
wall system

$ 1 2 7 .0 0

tt I


