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County Agency '72-73 Season 
Seeking Hanes Reforestation

Columbia County Children's
Services Division is recruiting 
foster homes for the coming 
school year They are interested 
in families with a deep love for 
children, who are interested in 
providing special parenting for 
these special children. Foster 
children are challenging young­
sters with intense needs The 
rewards of foster parenting are 
not material but emotional.

The Children's Services D iv­
ision currently needs homes for 
all ages of children but ex- 
pecially adolescents There are 
certain qualifications to be met 
by the foster parents To find out 
if you qualify you can inquire at 
Columbia Children's Services 
Division. Their phone number is 
397-3292

Auto Plates 
Due Changes

When Oregon begins to issue 
reflectorized license p l a t e s  
sometime this fall, they will 
have a yellow-gold background 
with dark blue letters and num­
bers, Chester W Ott, Motor 
Vehicles Division administrator 
announced Thursday.

The two colors are as close as 
possible to the state colors.

The state also will end a long­
standing practice of using dif­
ferent color plates to distinguish 
certain types of vehicles when 
reflectorization arrives as a 
result of 1973 legislation

All plates will have the same 
gold and blue color combination 
except prorate plates issued to 
commercial vehicles registered 
in more than one state and per­
manent identification plates is­
sued to mobile homes.

New custom license plates, 
which allow the owner to select 
his own “tag line," also will be 
changed to the gold background.

Indians called 
clams quadhogs

hard-shelled

How to duck 
cl knockout blow

to your business

I f  a  fire o r similar peril seri­
ously damaged your busi­
ness, it could be a knockout 
blow . . ,  even i f  your prop­
erty insurance is adequate/ 
D u rin g  the rebu ild ing  pe­
riod, you’d be out o f business 
• • .  without business income. 
Yet certain unavoidable bus­
iness expenses would con­
tinue. This financial drain  
could bankrupt you unless 
you have Business Interrup- 
tw n Insurance . . .  protec­
t io n  f o r  y o u r  business  
income. Cafi us about i t

Crown Zellerbach has ann 
ounced that nearly 12,000 acres 
of timberlands in western Ore­
gon and Washington are growing 
newly planted young tree seed 
lings following completion of the 
company’s 1972-73 reforestation 
season

Combining one-year-old seed­
lings initially grown in plug­
shaped containers at Crown 
Zellerbach‘s Wood Nursery near 
Aurora. Oregon, with regular 
bare root stock, over 2.7 million 
young trees have been planted 
this year on company forests in 
the two states

The plugs, which remain in 
their fertilized growing contain­
ers under controlled greenhouse 
conditions until planting time in 
the field, accounted for 1.4 
million of the total seedling pro­
duction and are being watched 
carefully by company foresters.

“We’re most interested in how 
these plugs react in the soil,” 
explained George Schroeder. CZ 
chief forester, "because we feel 
that survival rates should be 
better with fully moist roots. As 
opposed to bare root seedlings, 
which are grown in forest tree 
nurseries, then removed from 
their growing soil, taken out into 
the field and planted, plugs stay- 
in their original containers and 
are exposed to the air only for a 
short time,” Schroeder added. 
“The roots remain compact and 

fresh and are healthier and more 
adaptable to the natural forest 
environment.”

Seedlings planted during this 
last season were grown at IFA  
nurseries and at the company's 
Wood Nursery from seeds gath 
ered on CZ Northwest timber- 
lands Trees were selected for 
their adaptability to the par­
ticular Oregon or Washington 
locale where they were to be 
planted, the predominant spe­
cies in this region being Douglas 
fir.

In addition to nursery study, 
research on the company’s Gen­
etic Tree Improvement Pro­
gram - a cooperative project 
initiated in 1966 - continues 
within the company’s Northwest 
Timber Division and at the 
Central Research Division at 
Camas, Washington

Foresters have hand-pollin­
ated selected parent trees in 
the woods, marking the first step 
towards a planned orchard for 
the production of genetically- 
superior seedlings for use in 
future reforestation programs

Crown Zellerbach manages 
770,000 acres of Oregon and 
Washington timberland, class­
ified into seven individual Man­
aged Forest locales, under the 
concept of sustained yield - har­
vesting annually only the volume 
of timber equivalent to the total 
annual growth on these acres

Vets Loans at 
Record Level

J. HORN
Vernonia Insurance 

Exchange
Phone 429-6203

953 Bridge Street 
Vernonia, Oregon

Merttert 15. Corn.

Oregon veterans’ farm and 
home loans went to 8,838 veter­
ans in 1972-73 in the amount of 
$164,727,632 for the highest fiscal 
year on record, H. C. Saalfeld 
Department of Veterans’ Affairs 
director, has reported.

This was a six percent in­
crease in loans and a 10 percent 
boost in dollar volume over the 
previous year, 1971-72. Loans 
last year averaged 736 per 
month for $13.7 million, com­
pared with the 1971-72 average of 
690 loans a month for $12 million.

In Columbia County last year, 
loans were granted to 164 vet­
erans in the amount of $3,074,241, 
compared with 147 loans in 
1971-72 for $2,567,800

Since the loan program started 
in 1945, loans have gone to 1,367 
veterans in this county in the 
amount of $16,585,441.

*  Ready Mixed Concrete
★ Concrete Aggregate 
★ Crushed Reck 
★ Road Gravel
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SCAPPOOSE 
SAND & GRAVEL CO.

PHOKE 543-7141
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Church Notes
Adventists

IT'S A FAMILY affair. Fear 
prtoea to iraU l of this yaaP»

COWBELLE BEEF TIPS . . .
by U *  H yde

MamaoMMmMeoaaNMmMMMMaMaaMösaaMM
Sharply rising food prices call 

for a readjustment in spending 
habits and values within each 
home The sum of all these 
individual decisions will deter­
mine future demand Supply and 
demand will then balance out at 
new levels, probably at lower 
than the recent highs but higher 
than a year ago. The recent 
freeze on prices will at least 
assure that they go no higher this 
year.

One measure of the fact that 
food prices had not kept pace 
with other inflationary forces is 
that food has been taking a 
smaller and smaller percentage 
of total income. It was inevitable 
that food prices would have to 
catch up sometime to enable the 
farmer to make ends meet It is 
unfortunate that it had to be done 
so dramatically.

The higher prices may mean 
that you can’t eat as much beef 
as you might like, but demand 
will determine at what price 
level the available supply will 
move. It is not necessary to 
boycott meat, though, to de­
crease overall demand. A boy­
cott has only temporary impact 
and doesn’t prove anything ex­
cept the level of frustration. It 
distorts the eventual solution 
just as the sharp rise has Also 
increased buying pressures on 
substitutes will force up their 
prices.

What can you do to meet the 
current crisis in your food bud­
get? You’ve probably already 
done them, but cut down on the 
size of your servings of roast and 
steak, use more extender reci­
pes, substitute other proteins in 
some meals, shop the specials, 
eat out less, use less convenience 
food, plan ahead. Given time you 
can adjust your overall budget 
here and there to allow more for 
food

Take the current situation as a 
challenge to test your ingenuity 
and talents. How can I serve my 
family well, including tasty beef 
dishes and still keep my food 
budget in balance.

Planning ahead is important in 
any attempt to cut costs. Check 
the specials each week and plan 
to shop where the best ones are 
and plan meals around them.

Does it pay to shop around at 
different stores? If time and gas 
are a factor, probably not. At a 
given time each store has some 
cuts higher and some lower than 
another store, but generally they 
are competitive. Each store fea­
tures some beef cuts at special 
prices each week. It might pay to 
pick the store with the best beef 
specials to do all of your shop­
ping today. Or pick two stores 
close together and shop some at 
each. Going out of your way for 
one or two specially priced items 
is seldom wise use of time or 
m o n ey

How often do you eat out? It 
costs roughly three times as 
much to eat out as to eat the 
same thing at home.

When was the last time you 
made soup? This is a hearty dish 
around which a meal can be built 
at savings There are many 
dishes that contain meat flavor 
with a minimum of meat—ex­
tenders. Most foreign dishes are 
good meat extenders, Chinese, 
mexican, Italian, stews and stro- 
ganoff to name a few.

Here are recipes using soup 
meat and soup stock

Using shank and neck bones 
with meat, make a soup stock 
Meat may be browned a little to 
develop flavor before covering 
with cold water Season with 
celery tops, onions, herbs of 
your choice and salt. Simmer 
slowly at least five hours. The 
scum may be skimmed off but is 
very nutritious. Remove meat 
and bones and cool broth. You 
may strain the broth through a 
strainer or cloth if you wish a 
clearer soup. When cold, the fat 
will have hardened and be easy 
to remove. A small amount of fat 
helps the flavor. If  stock does not 
jell, it needs further simmering.

Remove the meat from the 
bones and cut into small pieces. 
Make your favorite barbecue 
sauce, add meat and serve over 
rice, noodles, etc., for a hearty 
and inexpensive m eal.,

Use the soup stock in another 
meal such as this filling pistou:

In a large kettle, bring Ito

3uarts of water to boil. Add l cup 
ried white beans; boil 2 min­
utes Reduce heat and simmer, 

covered Ito hours. Remove

about half water and add beef 
stock to again make Ito quarts 

Add 2 potatoes, pared and 
diced, and 8 to' 10 oz. fresh or 
frozen green beans, cut in pie­
ces Add 2 T  crushed dried basil 
and 5 cloves, crushed garlic, or 
equivalent. Simmer 15 minutes.

Meanwhile saute 2 onions, 
sliced, in butter or oil until 
golden Add to soup along with 1 
(16oz) can stewed tomatoes. 1 (8 
oz) can tomato sauce, 2 zucchini 
washed and diced. 2 T salt, 1 t 
pepper. Simmer, covered, 3t 
minutes longer Serves 6-8 

In a New England cookbook I 
found an interesting recipe for 
Portable Soup It was soup stock 
cooked down until it was very 
thick and stiff, then dried in a 
shallow pan. You could take an 
hunk with you and make soup by 
adding it to hot water! The 
original instanl soup.

Vernonia Jamboree
Enjoyed by Visitors

BIRKENFELD M r and Mrs
Lloyd Beach were Clatskanie 
business callers on last Friday.

Mr and Mrs. Stanley Tornblad 
of Cherry Grove came over to 
the Walt Tornblad home on 
Thursday of last week. They all 
had dinner at Oneys, they went 
on to Cannon Beach where they 
enjoyed theirselves along the 
beach.

Mr. and Mrs Francis Larson 
were in Tualatin on Wednesday 
of last week at the Gene Larson 
home. M arvin Larson, his 
daughter and little son were 
there. He was spending a week of 
his vacation there They left for 
their home at Conroe Texas on 
Thursday.

On Monday of last week Mrs. 
Tornblad and Agda Rognan took 
Mrs. Bob Harberg to Longview, 
on business on their way back 
they shopped in Clatskanie

The Gary Johnston family and 
Lloyd Johnston family spent the 
weekend at the home of their 
folks the E.T. Johnstons Jon 
Johnston is also home on two 
weeks vacation. Gary’s wife and 
little son remained over for a few 
days. Boone will fly them to their 
home at Dallas on Wednesday. 
They all took in the Jamboree on 
Saturday and had a picnic lunch. 
Mr. and Mrs Art Bellingham 
and Jim joined them.

Hellie Cex Has 
Visitor From Calif.

MIST - Mr. and Mrs. John 
Kudrna of Vernonia and Mr. and 
Mrs. Virgil Van Alstine, Prine­
ville visited the Walter Mathews 
Friday. The group had great fun 
looking at Grad-Reunion pic­
tures and reminiscing about old 
times when they attended Ver 
noma High School.

Mr and Mrs. Ben Leppa, 
Hibbing, Minn., visited Mrs 
Jane Hansen, Saturday. It had 
been nine years since they last 
visited here. Mrs. Bud Hemeon 
visited Mrs. Hansen Thursday.

Mr. Ray Rodman. Los An­
geles, visited his niece, Mrs. 
Nettie C. Cox during the week.
His son brought him out from 
Portland. He visited the Martin 
Hansons also. On Friday he left 
by bus, from Kelso, for Kalispell, 
Montana for a visit with Mrs 
Lulu Wilson. Mrs Agda Rognan, 
Seattle and Mrs. Walt Tornblad 
visited Mrs Cox and guest one 
day during the week. Mrs Cox 
and Mrs Hanson attended the 
Jamboree Gospel Concert Sat­
urday night at the Assembly of 
God, in Vernonia, and again on 
Sunday.

SEAT BELTS SAVE LIVES  
USE THEM!

Services this Sabbath, August 
4, will be held on the banks of 
Rock Creek at Clints Tree Farm  
on Keasey Route.

Both Sabbath School and Wor­
ship Services will be conducted 
as scheduled and will be followed 
by a potluck picnic

All are invited to come and 
worship the creator in the natu­
ral beauty of His creation and 
share in the fellowship dinner 
that follows. Bring your own 
seat.

Vacation Bible School will 
start Monday. August 6 at the 
Seventh-day Adventist Church, 
2nd and Nehalem streets, and 
will continue for ten days, 9-12 
a.m.

Headed by Mrs Ruth Clark, 
the program offers a full sche­
dule of activities, classes and 
crafts.

Again this year we are happy 
to have a team of academy girls 
to assist and share their talents.

Age limits are 4-14 and all 
children are invited.

Bible
Those persons looking for an 

active, friendly church that 
stands for the word of God are 
extended a sincere welcome to 
attend the following services:

A bus is run every Sunday 
morning for those needing a ride 
to Sunday School and church 
For more information phone the 
church at 429-3363

An Adult Bible Study on the 
book of Revelation is held every 
Thursday evening at 7:30 p.m. in 
the home of Mr and Mrs Virgil 
Snook All are welcome.

The Juniors will be having a 
barbecue party this Friday eve­
ning Meet at the church at 6:45 
p.m.

The High Schoolers are meet­
ing every Wednesday evening 
from 7:30-8:30for a time of Bible 
study and planning their sum­
mer activities

Dr Quemada, missionary to 
the Philippines, will be here 
again Sunday, August 12. A pot 
luck dinner is planned

Directory 
Of Churches
VER NO NIA B IB L E  CHURCH  
A dam s A  M aple  
K ea a sto  W a stsa . F a ster
Sunday:
9:46 a m. - Sunday School 
11:00 a.m. - Morning worship ser­

vice
6:46 p.m. - Junior Youth Fellow­

ship
7:00 p.m. - Evening worship ser­

vice
Wednesday:
7:30 p.m. - Bible Study and Pray- 

■ er
If you have a spiritual need or 

question, call Pastor Wooten at 
4293363

CHURCH O F  JE S U S  CHRIST  
O F L A T T E R -D A Y  SAINTS  
VER NO NIA BRANCH  
850 M adteoo A v ea a e  
B ranch P r e s . - H enry T. H adsea  
1st Cours. .  C laude E . Gibeoa  
2nd C oons. - E b n er  C. Schrader  
Ward Clerk -  R obert E . M cN air  

M eeting Schedule  
P riesth ood  - 8:30 a .m .
Sunday School - 10:15 a m .  
Sacram ent M tg. -  11:30 a .m . 
R elie f Scty . - T u esd ay , 10:30 a .m . 
M .I.A . -  W ednesday, 7:30 p .m .

A SSEM BLY OF GOD 
Jefferson  aad  M aple  
R ev . D an  B illin gs, P a ster  
9.45 a.m. - Sunday school. Classes

for a ll ag es
11:00 a .m . - M orning w orship  
7:00 p .m . .  E v a n g e lis tic  serv ice  
7:30 p .m . - W ednesday P ra y er

M eeting and B ib le  Study
(N eed  a  ride? Call 4294353)

ST. M A R Y ’S  CATHOLIC 
F a th er  Anthony G usein  
M ass is  ce leb rated  ev ery  w eek ­

d a y  m orn ing a t  8:90 In the  rec­
tory C onfessions a r e  heard  b e­
fore  M ass.

S aturday - M ass a t  7 p .m . in  th e

Bond Purchases 
Grow in fane

U.S Savings Bonds sales fig­
ures released by the U.S. Trea 
sury Department today, reveal 
that Oregonians purchased 
$3,706,783 worth of bonds in the 
month of June This is a startling 
increase of $500,000 worth of 
sales over the record-setting 
sales of June 1972

Bruce Ward, the volunteer 
“Take Stock in America" Chair­
man for Oregon, said, “We are 
pleasantly surprised with the 
June results as we felt we had 
done a ‘whale of a job’ last June 
I feel that this windfall must be 
attributed to the magnificient 
support afforded by Oregon in­
dustries which are making the 
Payroll Savings Plan available 
to their employees We have a 
record number of companies 
which have given the program 
their support this year and their 
efforts are bearing fruit.”

The June sales boost Oregon's 
purchases year-to-date to 
$27,130,000 which is 55 percent of 
the state’s annual goal. Ore­
gonians now own in excess of 
$500 million worth of U.S. 
Savings Bonds

According to Columbia County 
Chairman, June sales totaled 
$63,333 with 48 percent of the 
annual goal of $293,988 already 
in.

Nationally, the sales figures 
are showing an increase of 9 
percent over the record- 
breaking year of 1972. June sales 
of $556 million boosted sales for 
the first six months to $3,523 
million Twenty-three million 
American families now own 
more than $59 billion in Savings 
Bonds earning them more than 
$2to billion dollars in interest 
annually

K E E P  O R E G O N  
G R E E N  A N D  C L E A N !

Sunday - at 8:30 end 10

Confessions - On Saturday from S 
to 6:46 in the church, before

Witnesses
The public discourse held at 

the Kingdom Hall this Sunday, 
August 5, is entitled, “How Well 
Do You Know God?" The speak- 
ker will be S.M Scotto, a local 
minister Mr. Scotto will en­
courage the audience to look to 
Jehovah God and get to know the 
creator of all mankind

First Peter 4:8-10 will be the 
main thought for the Bible study 
consideration following the pub­
lic talk This week's article is, 
“Above All Things, Have Intense 
Love for One Another "

All interested persons are in­
vited to attend. Any further in­
formation may be obtained from 
Kent Battrick, 429-8333

SEV E N TH -D A Y  A D V E N TIST  
2nd A N eh a lem  
L . L. H a a tta g tes . P a ater  
Claude V eal, L ocal E ld er
9:3o Sabbath School
11:00 Worship Service
7:00 P.M. Monday - Dorcas So­

c ie ty  a t V ea l’s  hom e.
7:30 P.M. W ed. - P ra y er  M eeting

a t V ea l’s  hom e.
7:00 P.M. Mon. - Pathfinders at 

Scout Cabin.

F IR ST  EV A N G ELIC A L CHURCH  
967 S ta te  Av 
Jack  Carlaen,
9:46 a.m. .  Sunday School, Paul 

Weidman, Sup’t.
11:00 a.m. - Morning worship. 
5:00 p.m. - Youth Fellowship. 
7:00 pan. - Evening service. 
Every

F IR ST  BA PT IST  CHURCH  
W ashington A  A S treets  
T erry E . L e w es, P astor  
P hone 4293901
Sunday: 10 a .m . Sunday School 

11:00 A.M. W orship S erv ice  
7:00 P .M . E v e n in g  W arship

W ednesday: 7:00 P .M . M idw eek  
P ra y er  S erv ice

M IST - B IR K E N F E L D  COMMU­
N IT Y  CHURCH

O regon

9:46 a.m. - Sunday School 
11:00 ajn. - Chinch Services 
7:90 p.m. - Wed. Prayer Meeting 
10:90 a.m. - (Whiter Months) on

2nd Wed Women's Missionary 
and Werk day.

F IR ST  C H RISTIAN CHURCH  
499 North A

V toyard ,

Christian
Due to VBS continuing there'll 

be no choir practice or Bible 
study this evening. Thursday, 
August 2

VBS will have Gary Anderson 
speaking today and tomorrow at 
both morning and evening clas­
ses

Pre-school through 3rd grade 
meet from 9:30 a.m .-11:30 a .m .; 
4th grade through 7th, 7 p.m.-9 
p.m. tomorrow evening.

Friday, August 3, at 7 p.m. is 
the closing program for VBS, 
where the Andersons will share 
their plans to bring the good 
news about Jesus to China Gary 
and his wife Joyce, are both San 
Jose Bible College graduates. 
They plan to spend the next three 
years, two in Hong Kong and one 
at the University of Southern 
California, in intensive language 
and cultural studies, then they 
hope to enter mainland China, 
where missionaries are so badly 
needed. Everyone is invited to 
this program We will have 
“Finger Food" fellowship fol­
lowing the program.

Saturday, August 4 will be 
another all day work day on the 
church for the men.

Teachers Meeting will be can­
celled until a later date.

Monday, August 6 at 7 p.m. 
The Continental Singers will be 
giving their outdoor musical 
concert at the Beaverton Chris­
tian Church.

August 8 the women's prayer 
meeting will meet at 10 a.m. at 
the church, with the CWF having 
their only meeting for the month 
at 1:30 p.m. in the church fel­
lowship hall.

Week of missions start August 
6-11 at Wi-Ne-Ma. “The Making 
Of a Missionary” will be fea­
turing: Wayful Jew, Hong Kong; 
Lew Cass, Indonesia; Paul Baj- 
ko, Poland; Don Johnson, Ethi­
opia; Jesus Fiels, Mexican- 
American Evangelism; George 
Alder, Bible Lecturer.

7:00 p a n . - H our o f  pow er, p rayer  
and B ib le  study.

E M M A N U E L  E PISC O PA L  
CHURCH
B IR K E N F E L D . OREGON  
T he R ev . C. S . 81ml da, V icar  
P hon e C iatekaato 729-2931 
C elebration  o f th e  H oly C om m u­

nion the F ourth  Sunday of ea ch  
m onth  a t  12:00 Noon.

Sunday - Bible School 9:46 a.m.
. Horner F u ller , Supt

M orning W orship 11:00 a m .  “ 
(N u rsery  P rovided)
Fellowship Hour 6:07 p.m

W ednesday: Choir P r a c tic e  
7:00 p.m.

( la t  only- Church Night 6:90 p.m. 
(Bid A  4th) CWF .  1:90 p.m. 
Friday: Bible Study - 8:00 p.m.

(Call for location of Bible 
Study)

B R U N S M A N
HAHDWAHE aad ELECTRU 

F I N E  F U B N I T U B E  
WE DELIVER

Muster-Mag
JB CAUBEB

Coast to Coast 
Master-Mag .22 cali­
ber long rifles cart­
ridges. Box of 50 in 
new plastic self-feed 
box. 606-0073

69c

Goulds balanced 
flow, no tank. no 

•xtrai shallow
w ell system

$127.00

GAL.

SUM M ER P A IN T  VA LU E S

A Registered one-coet white latex houae 
paint dries in 1 hour. Over 1000 custom col­
ors et slightly higher prices. 632*6202
B. 100% acrylic white latex house paint for 
ail types of surfeces. Over lOOOcuttom col 
or» i t  »lightly higher price». 631-6112
C. Spray point In 4 0  colon contain» a rust 
inhibitor. Non-toxic whan dry. 16%-oz. can. 
579-4003 thru 579-446815%OZ.

r t ia ii ti em t im u
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