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Boat Repair

••OUTBOARD REPAIR••
Clatsop Power Equipment

34912 Hwy 101 Bus, Astoria
1-800-220-0792 or

503-325-0792

Construction
Design

Jack Coffey Construction
•New•Repair•Remodel

•Drywall•Concrete•Decks
•Licensed•Bonded•Insured

(503)325-7406 * CCB#55284 

Lawn & Garden

•JIM’S LAWN CARE•
•Brush Clearing•Lawns•Shrubs 

•Hauling•Gutter &
Storm-Cleanup
(503)325-2445

•Free Estimates 

SHOP LOCAL!
Check the Business Directory 

daily to utilize the local 
professionals advertising

in The Seaside Signal.
To place an ad in our Business 
Directory, call 503-325-3211.

Ellis Tree & Lawn Service 
One-time clean-up or

year-round lawn care. Brush 
clearing, tree service, stump 
grinding, pressure washing & 

many other services. 
Call Rick(503)791-1837

Diego’s Lawn Care LLC

One time clean ups!
Year-round maintenance!

Mowing, Edging, Weeding, 
Trimming, Bark Dust, Hauling.

Many other services!

Call Diego
(503)791-0190

Masonry

B&B STONE AND TREE LLC
Stone Masonry

•Retaining walls
•Steps
•Patio’s
•Artistry

(503) 853-5991
CCB# 212106

Vegetation
Management

Bigby’s Tree Service

•Excavator mounted Flail 
Mower•Brush Raking•Brush

Hogging•Lot Clearing•Scotch 
Broom Removal •Chipping

•Invasive Species
Removal•Levey/Dike Mowing

•Low Impact Logging.
(503)791-0767

bigbys tree service.com

Affordable rates.
CCB#158562

Planning to move?
Sell those items you can’t

take with you with a classified 
ad in The Seaside Signal!

652 Work Wanted

• JIM’S LAWN CARE•
Brush Clearing, Lawns

Shrubs, Hauling
Gutter & Storm-Cleanup

(503)325-2445 Free estimates

NOTICE: Oregon Landscape       
Contractors Law (ORS 671)       
requires all businesses that        
advertise landscape contract-
ing  services be licensed with 
the Landscape Contractors 
Board. This 4-digit number 
assures the business has a  
bond, insurance and an asso-
ciated individual     contractor 
who has fulfilled the testing 
and experience              require-
ments for  licensure.  For your 
protection call (503)378-5909 
or use our web site: www.lcb.
state.or.us to check license 
status before contracting with 
the business. Persons doing 
landscape maintenance do 
not require a LCB license. 

664 Services

IF YOU HAVE QUESTIONS 
about a Business or School
Advertised, we advise you 

to call: The Consumer
Hotline in Salem at 

(503)378-4320,
9AM-1PM, Monday-Friday 

or in Portland at
(503)229-5576 

807 Fuel, Heating
& Firewood

NOTICE TO CONSUMERS
Oregon Firewood Law re-
quires advertisements quote a 
price and also express quan-
tity in units of a cord or frac-
tional part of a cord. Ads must 
also identify the species of 
wood and whether the wood is

unseasoned (green) or dry. 

Arborist

Affordable Rates
BIGBY’S TREE SERVICE

ISA CERTIFIED
ARBORISTS

•Pruning
•Removal

•Stump Grinding
•Excavator/Brush Rake

•Vegetation Management

(503)791-0767

bigbystreeservice.com

CCB#158562

ARBOR CARE TREE
SPECIALISTS

ISA Certified Arborists
ISA Board-Certified

Master Arborist
ISA Tree Risk Assessment 

Qualified
Comprehensive Service, 

Pruning/Removal,
Stump Grinding/Hazard 

Evaluations
(503)791-0853

www.arborcarenw.com
CCB#171855

WA#ARBORCI909RW
Care for Your Trees 

www.SeasideSignal.com

651 Help Wanted

The City of Cannon Beach 
is seeking applicants for 

a part-time/seasonal 
Recycling Assistant.  

Visit ci.cannon-beach.or.us/
jobs for full details.

Sales professional
Exciting opportunity for a 

skilled sales and marketing 
professional with knowledge 

of and contacts in the 
Seaside, Ore. area. 

The Daily Astorian and 
Seaside Signal are the north 
coast’s leading media outlets. 

Starting on May 10, the 
Seaside Signal becomes a 

weekly community 
newspaper, reaching more 
readers than ever before.   

More than just a newspaper, 
we represent the community 
at events, through print and 

digital products, and bringing 
credible, relevant coverage to 

readers and advertisers.  
Can you be a part of our 

team?  We seek someone 
who is skilled in business 

development, contract 
negotiations, communicates 

clearly with an internal 
support team, thrives in a 

CRM driven environment and 
has outstanding proposal and 

presentation skills. 
Do you have what it takes? 

This position requires a 
strongly-motivated person to 
be in the territory daily, with 
regular check-ins at Seaside 

or Astoria office.  Three+ 
years of sales experience 

are required with a marketing 
or communications degree 

preferred. 
This position comes with 

generous compensation for 
someone with the drive and 
determination to succeed. 

Benefits include paid time off 
(PTO), a 401(k)/Roth 401(k) 

retirement plan, expense 
reimbursement and 

insurances. 
Send resume and letter of 

interest to EO Media Group, 
PO Box 2048, Salem, OR  

97308-2048 or e-mail 
hr@eomediagroup.com

652 Work Wanted

Seeking light 
housekeeping/homecare.

No heavy lifting, 
years of experience, 

have own transportation.
Seaside/Gearhart area.

$10/hour 
(971)320-0842

Oregon state law requires 
anyone who contracts for 
construction work to be

licensed with the
Construction Contractors 
Board. An active license 
means the contractor is

bonded and insured.
Verify the contractor’s CCB 

license through the CCB 
Consumer Website
www.hirelicensed
contractors.com 

651 Help Wanted

Coast Weekend Editor
The Daily Astorian, one of 

the Pacific Northwest’s best 
small newspapers, has a rare 

opportunity for a creative 
journalist with strong editing 
and writing skills and an eye 

for design. 
Coast Weekend is a weekly 

tabloid arts and lifestyle 
entertainment magazine, 
distributed widely in the 

community and inserted in 
The Daily Astorian. 
It is published every 

Thursday, focusing on the 
North Coast of Oregon and 

the Long Beach Peninsula in 
southwest Washington. The 
Columbia-Pacific is a vibrant 

region for the arts — from 
music festivals to community 
theater, Astoria’s FisherPoets 
Gathering to Cannon Beach’s 

Get Lit at the Beach. There 
are art walks, author read-

ings, concerts, galleries and 
a multitude of other activities 

year-round. 
The Coast Weekend editor is 
responsible for every aspect 
of its publication — writing, 
coordinating coverage by 
freelancers, editing, and 

overseeing design. He or she 
will also direct a weekly 
feature called Weekend 
Break and participate in 
producing Our Coast, an 

award-winning annual 
magazine with circulation 

throughout the Pacific 
Northwest.

We are looking for an 
enthusiastic newsroom 

leader who is detail-minded, 
deadline-driven, can write 

and produce sparkling story 
packages, and will nurture 

and recruit freelance writers 
and columnists. 

We are a digital-first 
newsroom. The successful 

applicant will have 
demonstrated multimedia 
and social media skills, 
and help manage our 

tourism portal at 
DiscoverOurCoast.com. 

Benefits include paid time off, 
insurances and a 401(k)/Roth 
401(k) retirement plan. Send 

resume, writing samples 
and cover letter to EO Media 
Group, PO Box 2048, Salem, 

OR 97308-2048, or e-mail 
hr@eomediagroup.com

UPGRADING?

Sell your used equipment
fast, by listing it in The

Seaside Signal classified section.
Call 503-325-3211.

651 Help Wanted

Lower Columbia 
Bowl

Seeks a Part-time 
Front Counter
Attendant,

Friday/Saturday/
Sunday evenings,

excellent
customer service 
skills a must.
WE SELL FUN!!

OLCC permit and food 
handlers card will 

be required

Apply in person
Lower Columbia Bowl

826 Marine Dr.
Astoria

Digital Marketing 
Executive for 

OurCoastThisWeek.com
We are growing!  

As our Digital Sales & 
Marketing Executive you will 
to develop new relationships 

with local Eat, Shop, Play 
and Stay businesses in the 
North Oregon Coast market 
by focusing your attention on 

developing revenue by 
selling digital marketing 
products and delivering 

powerful results to potential 
clients. The position plays a 
vital role in the company’s 

overall growth strategy 
by building key customer 
relationships, identifying 

new opportunities, 
negotiating and closing 

business, maintaining long 
term customer relationships 
through excellent customer 
care and communication. 

The ideal candidate will be a 
seasoned sales professional 
with strong local experience 
and great connections, plus 
a solid understanding of the 
sales process and a proven 
track record of prospecting, 
developing and closing new 

business. This is a 
collaborative, creative, fun, 

digitally-facing position 
located in our Seaside office. 
Benefits include Paid Time 

Off (PTO), insurances and a 
401(k) Roth/401(k) 

retirement plan. Send 
resume and letter of interest 

to EO Media Group, Attn: 
Human Resources, PO Box 

2048, Salem, OR 
97308-2048 or email hr@

eomediagroup.com. 

651 Help Wanted

Experienced 
Housekeepers needed. 

Pick up application at The 
Tides at the corner of Ave U 

and Beach Dr. 
2316 Beach Dr, Seaside

McCall Tire Center

Immediate Openings
Full-Time

Brake/Alignment Techs
Min. 2 yrs. verifiable

experience

Sales & Service Techs
Experience preferred

but not required

Starting wage DOE

Generous benefits
Medical, Dental, Vision, 

401K, Vacation, Sick Pay, 
Profit Share

Uniforms provided

Apply in person
1167 SE Marlin Ave

Warrenton

Event Content 
Specialist

We are growing! As our Event 
Content Specialist, you will 
be responsible for creating, 
improving and maintaining 
event content in our digital 
network by working with 

organizations and Eat, Shop, 
Play and Stay businesses on 
the North Oregon Coast and 
Long Beach WA Peninsula. 

OurCoastThisWeek.com 
needs someone to collect, 

write, organize, and maintain 
event calendars for multiple 
publications, using a central 

online calendar database 
system. To do this job well, 

you will need excellent writing 
and grammar skills, 

knowledge of CMS systems, 
social media and basic 
graphic design skills. 

Knowledge of events and 
tourism within the area 

communities is helpful. You 
should also be comfortable 
making calls to verify the 
accuracy of data received 

or offer additional products.  
Creativity in presenting this 

information in a fun, 
informative way is prized and 

accuracy is essential.
You’ll work 30-32 hours per 

week and be eligible for 
benefits including healthcare, 

401(k) retirement plan and 
Paid Time Off. 

To apply, send your resume 
and letter of interest to EO 
Media Group, PO Box 2048, 
Salem, OR 97308-2048 or 
hr@eomediagroup.com. 

Make a Social Impact 
working at Tongue Point 

Job Corps!

We are hiring!

Systems Technician
Provides administration, 

support, and maintenance of 
center hardware and software 

systems and networks.
Full-time

$17.50-$18.50/hr DOE

Security Officer
Swing & Graveyard Shifts

Full-time
$13.00/hour

Residential Advisor
Swing & Graveyard Shifts

Full-time
$13.00/hour

On-Call Residential Advisor
Working as needed

evenings, nights 
and weekends

$13.00/hour

For job description 
and to apply:

www.mtc.jobs

All Applications are 
processed online.

Questions? 
Call 503-338-4961

Management & Training 
Corporation is an Equal 
Opportunity Employer

Minority/Female/
Disability/Veteran

MTC Values Diversity!
Tongue Point Job Corp 

Center is a Drug-free and 
tobacco-free workplace.


