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LEGAL NOTICELEGAL NOTICE LEGAL NOTICE LEGAL NOTICEOn The Record
TIMBER f'OR SALE. I'NITTD NOTK'K Of STHFFT VACATION

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that
I. Bone Keller. Recorder of Ihe Cil

of Klamath Falls. Orrgon. do hereby

WANT AD
CLASSIFICATION

DIRECTORY

KLAMATH rOTS'TV
M ARklAtiK LIltNStS

STATES DEPARTMENT Of THE IN-

TERIOR. Bl'REAU OF LAND MAN the Common Council of the Cil
Industry Turns Deaf Ear
On Plan To Slash Prices

cert if thai the above and foregoing
AGEMENT ORAL AUCTION BIDS Klamath Falls. Oregon, at it a true copy of a resolution tnlroT)arrel1 Houiton Blackwell, 23. and

Either Kay S house. 17. s hereinafter designated will be re duced and adopted by the Common
AUTOHOTrVICouncil of the City of KUmath FallsHenry Delaney, 30, Chtloquin. and) TrailersOregon, al its regular meeting held

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that the un- -

dersigned has been appointed adminis-
tratrix of the fc.tale of Thomas Wil-

liam Plcare). also known as T. W

deceased, by the Circuti Court
of Klamath County, and hat
all persons having claims against said
estate are hereby notified to present
the same to said administratrix al the
office of the undersigned at Room 4.
Melhase Building. KUmath Falls. Ore-

gon, together with proper vouchers.

on Monday Ihe toth. day of August Auto Miscellaneous
New Cars St Trucks ,1959. and thereafter approved and

signed by the Ma or and attested by Used Cars . Trucks

Ur meeting. August ltnh. 1.V, adopted,
a resolution, declaring nn its pun in- -

vestigaiton ar.d initiation. it in i rut ton
to vacate: that portion ot Laurence
Street described a follow!.:

BEGINNING at a point on the South-eale-

line of Lawrence Street. aid
noint being SI H feet Northeaster
from the most Westerly corner of Lot
t. Block 14, HillMdr Addition in the
City of Klamath Kills. Oregon: thence

WASHINGTON AP-- The steel Oct. 1. Officials are convinced

ceived by the District Manager, Bu-

reau of Land Manimmenl. South Riv-

erside at Barnett Road. Medford.
at 10 JO A. M. PACIFIC

STANDARD TIME, on Thursday. Sept
10. 1959. for all limber marked or

designated for rutting. Before bids are
submitted full information concerning
the Umber, ihe conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be obtained

a-- IMPLOTMEKT V

there wilt be no sizable steel
trie Cltv Becnrdrr

ROS1F. KELLER
Recorder

No 26. August 1.1, 14. IB. 17.

Help Wanted. Female
Helo Wanted. Male
Help Wanted
Situations Wanted

lean or ascivenzie, mi, cnuoquin
Thorman Dene Marler, IB, and e

B. Singleton. 17.

Guy Hitson, 28. Bonanza, and Jo-
anne Keysor. 25, Bonanza.

Terry Gordon Hannon, 21. and
F ranres Cox. 20.

Jasper Franklin Howell. 27, and
Marie Eastman. 21

DIVORCE PETITION
Mary Marjorie Mainey vi. tjohn

Michael Matney. seeks
Lee Ward vs. Kenneth Eu-

gene Ward, seeks divorce.

industry. it was reliably reported
today, has rejected a suggestion
that it cut steel prices $10 a ton in
lieu of granting a wage increase

shortage until then.
2. Secretary of Labor James P

REAL KITATIfrom the above District Manager. The Northeasterly alone, the Sniithratrrl: Rooms For Rent .. 29
Apartment For Rent 24

Mitchell, who is studying the
strike situation as a for

right is hereby reserved to waive tech-- line of Lawrence Street to the South--

meal defect in this advertisement ' westerly line of HilUide Avenue;'

within six months of the date of the
first publication of this notice, which
is Julj 1958

Helena Edith Picard
Administratrix

O'Neill & McLaren
Attorneys for Administratrix
No. 88, July Ki. 30. August 6, 13. 1959

Houses For Rent . Vi
in the current strike situation.

The suggestion was made by
and to reject any or all thence Northwesterly along the South- -

19, 20, Jl. 23. 24

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS
Sikiyou County High Schools

Siskiyou County. California
Sealed bids are requested for two

projects a follows. Site facilities al
the Mt Shasta High School. Ml. Shas-
ta, and ihe Weed High School, Weed.
California

itc. Prooertv to Lei 37

Vernon L. Bryson vs. Mabel Marie
Eisenhower, has conferred several
times with top figures in the steel
companies and striking union..

Real Eitate Wanted . M
Real Ettate Exchange 20
Real Estate For Sale M

bids. The United States reserves the) westerly line of Hillside Avenue to the
right to waive any informality in bids Northwesterly line of Lawrence Street,
received whenever such waiver is in thence Southwesterly along the North-th-

interest of the United States. IN! westerly tine of Lawrence Street to
JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON la point which lies 111 feet Soulhwester- -

Bryson. seeks divorce.
Minnie Jane Brown vs. Henry Jack'

on Brown, seeks divorce.
Business Opportunities-

3. The union is convinced that NOTICE!RESOLUTION NO. 980All added facilities at each schoolOiC- GREEN: All timber designated ly from the most Easterl corner of Card of Thanks ,for cutting on NWNE1 Section 27. Lot 16. Block 7. said Hillside Addition: will be included on a separata Pro--

Rep. Chester A. Bowles
in a letter to President Eisen-
hower, who in turn had it referred
directly to Chairman Roger
Blough of the U.S. Steel Corp.

Blough is said to have turned
down the idea on the ground that

in .
with no settlement likely the gov-

ernment soon will have to inter
A RESOLUTION DECLARING THE

INTENTION OF THE COMMON
COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF KLAM

T 39 S , R E.. w. M , esiimaieai tnence Souiheily crossing Lawrence posai rorm tor eacn scnooi.
for the ouroose of this sale to be 'Street to Ihe noint of bee in nine, all in Site facilities in general will con- -

Funeral Homes
Meeting Notices ,

KLAMATH CALLS
BIRTHS

BOYS k

DAGGETT Born to Mr and Mrs
Lost ft Foundvene, either by invoking

or other methods.
ATH FALLS, OREGON. TO PAVE
AND IMPROVE. VAN NFSS AVENUE
FROM THE SOUTHWESTERLY LINK

General Notices
Roddy M. Daggett August 10 in Klam Personals g

Public Charipr Services 14. U.S. Steel revealed it has sentwnthm in settling the monthlong strike. OF PACIFIC TERRACE TO THE
EASTF.HLY LINE OF FAIRMOUNT

ath Valley Hospital a boy,
9 lbs II'-- nzs. Services 10out a statement to striking em

4- HIRrELLANinmSTREET. CALHOUN STREET FROM
THE NORTHERLY LINE OF VAN

the steel companies are going to
have to give the strikers some
sort of wage increase anyway.

368 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- . 288 M bd Klamath Falls. Oregon nM of athletic fields, running track,
ft. ponderosa pine. 207 M bd. ft su-- l That al a recuinr meeting of said tennis and multi-us- paved areas,
gar pine. 2.1 M hd ft. incense-ceda- Common Council to be held on Ihe jumping pit, tin fed and lawn areas.
83 M bd ft. white fir. No bid for ler;Uih day of September. liVt, at the sprinkler slem. fencing, walks, park-tha-

$3120 per M bd ft. for the Doug-- : hour of 7 30 o'clock PM thereof, in ine areas, etc.
33 30 per M bd. ft. for the 'he Council Room of the Cit Hall Bids, are to be delivered to the Board

ponderosa pine. $34 80 per. M bd. ft for said City, a public hearing will of Trustees of the Siskiou L'nion
for the sugar pine. $12 00 per M bd be held on said matter, at which any High School District at their office
ft. for the incense-ceda- $14 90 per! objections or remonstrances which m the Warrens Building. Yreka. Cah--

bd. ft. for the white fir or a tolal may be made m writing and filed forma, on or before 230 p.m. Pacific
purchase price of S29.T8S 30 will be with the Recorder of said Cily will be! Daylight Saving Time on Thursday,
considered. Minimum deposit with bid heard and considered, and at which September 3. 1959. The Board or

00. KLAMATH COUNTY. All the Public may be heard. tees reserves the right to open all
timber designated for cutting on This notice is given by order of the bids at any one tuna during the meet

NESS AVENUE TO THE NORTHER
LY LINE OF BENSON STREET. BEN
SON STREET FROM THE EASTER

ployes saying the union has exag-
gerated the effect of steel man-

agement proposals to change work
rules. U.S. Steel's statement saidSo far the industry's position is LY LINE OF CALHOUN STREET TO

Transportation . ,Health , 19
Educational IS
Financial Loans ,, 34
Building Remodeling M
Fuel - Heating ,. ,,. m
Food - Produce ... 39
Boats Pet - Sport - Hobbies 40
Radio TV Music . 41
Livestock Poultry 43
Machinery . 44

THE WESTERLY LINE OF FAIRthat it cannot, in the public in

SMITH Born to Mr and Mrs Her--

bert M. Smith August 10 in Klamath
Valley Hospital a boy, weighing S lbs..

at
WALKER Born to Mr. and Mrs

Elmer Walker August 8 in Klamath
Valley Hospital a boy, weighing 7 lbs.,
f ou. (correction

r.iRLff
ROBERTS Born to .Mr. and Mrs.

Ronald R. Roberts August 10 in Klam-
ath Valley Hospital a girl, weighing
S lbs., 2'j nu.

10.19 ROI'N'Dl P

terest, increase steel labor costs
MOUNT STREET. AND FAIRMOUNT
STHEET FROM THE NORTHERLY
LINE OF VAN NESS AVENUE TO

that from 1940 through 1958 its
worker employment costs have
risen 288 per cent while shipments NE', W'j. WaSE' Section 13. Common Council of said City. ingand thus spur inflation. The strik

Contract documents which include THE SOUTHERLY LINE OF THET 39 S.. R. 5 E . W. estimated Done August LI. 1959.
ALLEY IN BLOCK 31. MOUNTAINfor the purpose of this sale to he, Rosie Kellering United Sleelworkers contend

that this is an attempt to reverse
Misc. For Rent 4AVIEW ADDITION. IN SAID CITY

plans and specifications, may be ob-

tained at the office of Howard R. Per-n-

Arihitecl, 1121 Main Street. Klam- -
Cltv Recorder

of steel products increased only
30 per cent. l.812 M bd ft. Douglas-fir- . 1.805 M Mite WantedSAID PROJECT TO BE KNOWN ASNo. 125. August i:i, 20, 27. Sept 3.

traditional American economic Mic. To Exchange 4ft
Misc. For Sale SIIMPROVEMENT UNIT NO. 14(i: ANDaih Falls. Oregon, for a deposit of287Boys: 347 Girls:

DIRECTING CERTAIN STEPS BE$25 00 per set. containing both schools,policy that workers are entitled to
S. In reply the union said the

work rules couldn't be too much
of a problem at U.S. Steel because

TAKEN IN CONNECTION THERERFSOLUTION NO ft which deposit will be returned to the
regular sharing in prolits. RESOLUTION DECLARING THE bidder upon receipt of the documents WITH; AND FINDING PLANS.

AND ESTIMATES FORimlahus ur uir, iummu.-- u the Architect

bd. ft. ponderosa pine. 485 M bd. fi.
sugar pine. 129 M bd. ft. incense-- '
cedar. 1.330 M bd. ft. white fir. 54

M bd. ft. Shasta red fir. No bid fori
less than $29.05 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fi- $29 60 per M bd. ft. for
the ponderosa pine. $.12.85 per M bd
ft. for the sugar pine. $12.20 per M

bd. ft. for the incense-ceda- $14 45

per M bd. ft. for the white fir. $13.95
per M bd. ft. for the Shasta red fir or
a total purchase price of $137,443.95

there have been only 135 cases in COUNCIL OF THE CITY OK KLAM SAID PROJECT SATISFACTORY.Contract documents are on file at
ATH FALLS. OREl.ON. TO CON

Bowles told a reporter if the in-

dustry went along with his pro
posals. he felt sure the sleelwork

volving work rules in U.S. Steel the San Francisco Builders Exchange,
850 S. Van Ness Avenue. San FranSTRUCT AND LAY A SEWER LINE

WANT AD

RATE SCHEDULE
For additional rot information

Phon. TU

i I - I WORDS
Insertions .73
Insertions . l.M

WHEREAS, the City Engineer, ol
the City of Klamath Falls, Oregon,
pursuant to a resolution of the Com

Thefts Told

At Crypts
grievance procedures since 1947, TO SERVE, portions OF BLOCK 12. cisco. California; Daily Pacific Butld- -

ELDOR ADO ADDITION. BLOCK 24. rr Plan Room. 465 Tenth Street, San mon Council of said City, heretoforeOut of the 135 cases, the union
ELDORADO HEIGHTS ADDITION Francisco. California; Sacramento adopted, having filed plans, specifics

tions and estimates for the cost of imAND BLOCKS 20. 21. 28. 29. 36 and 37

Mountain View Addition. ALL TO SAID
said, the company won all but 23

in arbitration. Also, the union said
Builders Exchange, 1331 T Street, Sac-

ramento. California; Valley Conlrac
tors Exchange. 325 West 4th Street,

proving and paving. Van Nss Ave
will be considered. Minimum dcpOMt
with bid, $1.1.800 00.
All timber designated for cutting on
NE'. E'zNW's. LOU 1. 2. 3. NE'- -

1 Month (Daily 125CITY; APPROVING PLANS. SPECI
CAIRO IAP) Investigators

ers union would have to abandon
its wage increase demands in the
public interest. Bowles was the
government's World War 1,1 price
administrator.

"The effect oi a steel price cut
would help the entire economy,"

ir l WORDSindustry profit per man-hou- r rose FICATIONS AND ESTIMATES
nue from the southwesterly line of
PacUio Terrace to the easterly line
of Fa i mount Street, Calhoun Street

Chico. California: Builders Exchange
317 Builders ExchangeTHEREFORE FILED RY THE CITYhave discovered that the Cairo SW'i, N'SE', Section 31. T. 40 S,from $1.47 in 1957 to $2.28 in 1959,

Insertions ...... 1.90
Insertion ... a. 30

1 Month (Dally) 6.50
ENGINEER: DESCHIR1NG THE utlding, Portland. Oregon; cugene from the northerly line of Van Nessmuseum has been systematically or an increase of 67 per cent. Avenue to the northerly line of BenBOUNDARIES OF THE PROPERTY Builders Exchange. 145 East 29th
BENEFITED; AND DIRECTING Street. Eugene. Oregon; e Build 11 15 WORDS

R. 7 E.. W. M., estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 1.304 M

bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 10 M bd. ft. pon-
derosa Pine. 376 M bd. ft. incense- -

looted ot antique treasures. The son Street, Benson Street rom the Insertions 2 24
Insertions 375easlerly line of Calhoun Street to theCERTAIN STEPS TO BE TAKEN; cr, Exchange, 246 S Central.

PROJECT TO BE KNOWN AS;fnrd. Oregon, and at Ihe office ofremaining treasures of ancient
1 Month (Daily) t.78

Bowles said. "It would probably
mean that prices of new 1960 auto SEWER UNIT NO. 27

cedar. No bid for less than $23.78 per
M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fi- $16.30
per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine.

westerly line of Fairmount Street, and
Fairmotint Street from the northerly
line of Van Ness Avenue to the south

IS X0 WORDBDr. J. E. Hurley, Superintendent. Sis-

kiyou Union High School District, Warmobiles would have to be lower Insertions S.00
Insertions 3.00

1 Month (Daily 13.00
erly line of the alley in Block 31rens Building, Yreka, California.

Bidders are hereby notified that pur
$621 per M bd. ft. for the incense-ceda-

or a total purchase price of

The City Engineer of the City of
Klamath Falls, Oregon, pursuant to a
resolution of the Common Council
heretofore adoplrd, having filed plans,
specifications and estimates for the

too.

Highway Group
To Pave Road

AMES. Iowa (API It may nol
be loo long before happy bridal
couples can drive down the road

Mountain view Addition, in said
and the Common Council of said City,suant to the Statutes of the State of tl U WORDS$33,510.08 will be considered. Mini

mum deposit with bid $3,400.00. All finding the said plans, specifications
and estimates satisfactory for said

Insertions S.7S
Insertions 6.29

1 Month 'Daily! 16 as
limber designated for culling on N'a.

"We've just gotten out of the
habit of cutting prices. But once
started the idea would catch on." SW'4. N'jSE', SWSE4 Section 27 project, which shall be known as Im

? S WORDBand SE'.NE'. E'3SE' Section 33. T. provement Unit No. 148;
In Inwa's Little Rrnwn Thurrh in '40 s. 8 E , W. M.. estimated for

Egypt have been sealed, and a
check is being made to determine
how much was stolen.

The robberies came to light
when a touring Soviet professor
noticed that one of King

scepters was missing
from its display case. He counted

only 10 when the sign said 11.

All points of exit from Egypt
have been alerted against at-

tempts to smuggle the sceptre or

any other relics out of the

With steel negotiations conlinu THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED Insertions 4.50
Insertiona 7.50

1 Month 'Dailyl
. .the of thia sale to be :I28 Mpurposeha VbIa Illlthnnt n.Hlnrt mill . . ... . .... BY THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THEing in a complete stalemate in

CITY OF KLAMATH FALLS, ORE HI SB WOKDS

California, or local laws thereto ap-

plicable, the Trustees of the Siski-
you Union High School District have
ascertained the general prevailing rate
of per diem wages in the localities
in which this work is to be performed
for each craft or type of workmen
or mechanic needed to execute the
contract. The prevailing rates so de-

termined arc as follows:
Asphalt Raker and lroners. $2,935;

Carpenters. $3 58: Cement Finishers,
S3 525; Concrete Mixer lover 1 yd.t,
$3.48; Dump Truck Driver mnder 4

vds.i. S2.76; Dump Truck Driver (over

GON, DULY ASSEMBLED IN REGU
LAR SESSION, AS FOLLOWS;

ponderosa pine. 111 M bd. ft. sugar
pine, 970 M bd. ft. Incense cedar. 187
M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less
than 327 45 per M bd. ft. for the

Insertions . B.3S

Insertiona .. .. . 8.75
1 Month (Daily- ... 22. 75Section 1.

New York, other facets of the situ-

ation became known.
1. The administration has no in-

tention of invoking the Taft-Har- t

That said plans, specifications and S WORDS

mingled with the Stardust in their
eyes.

The State Highway Commission
bent an attentive ear Wednesday
to pleas that the stretch of

graveled Highway 346 be paved.

estimates for the Improvement of saidDouglas-fi- $29.8.1 per M bd. ft. for
the ponderosa pine, $40.25 per M bd Inneruona 6:00

Insertiona 10. 00

cost of constructing and laying what is:
known as the 27th. sewer unit of the
City of Klamath Falls, serving, por-
tions of Block 12. Eldorado Addition.
Block 24. Eldorado Heights Addition
and Blocks 20, 21. 2R. 29. :i6 and 37

Mountain View Addition, of said City;
embracing in said unit all of the ter-

ritory hereinafter bounded and de-

scribed; and the Common Council hav-

ing taken said plana, specifications and
estimates under consideration, and hav-

ing determined the boundaries of Ihe
assessment district;' now finds all
thereof satisfactory:

"THEREFORE. BE IT RESOLVED
BY THE COMMON COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF KLAMATH FALLS.
OREGON. DULY ASSF.MB1.ED IN
REGULAR SESSION AS FOLLOWS:

Section I.

That the plans, specifications and
estimates for the construction and in

portion of said street, heretofore filed
by the City Engineer, b and the sameft. for the sugar pine, $11.15 per M I Month (Daily) tt 0ft

bd. ft. for the Incense-ceda- $14.45ley law's national emergency pro-
visions at least until Sept. 15 or are hereby approved.4 yds i. S2 89; Grader Operator, Powerper M bd. ft. for the white fir or a

total purchase price of SB2.908.510 will DEADLINE 5;30 p.m. day before
publication. Noon Saturday for Sun.

That the Common Council of the
City of Klamath Falls, Oregon, hereby
declares its intention to improve saidbe considered. Minimum deposit with

dav or Monday. For rate and in

Pull Blade, $3.75; Laborers, Group No.
1 S2.0:t5; Laliorers. Group No. 2,
$2 785; Laborers. Group No. 3, $2,685;
Painter, S3 25: Plumber, S4.05.

Roller Oneralor. $3.50: Trarlor Driv
portion of said streets in accordancebid $8.:t00.00.

No. 127 Aug. 13, 20. formation concerning Classified Dis
with Mne plans, specifications ana esu play pleaie eall TU Mini'

mum charge 50 cents. Box nummates aa follows:er with Bonm, $3.75; Transit Mix. 4NOTICE TO CREDITORS Paving of said portion of streets bers 25 cents. Please read the firstyds. and over. $2 965: Transit Mix,NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that will consist of 3" asp name concrete or Insertion of your ad. The Heraldunder 4 yds., $2,865; Trenching Mathe undersigned has been appointed 6" of cement concrete and will bo Ac News reserve the riant to elchine. $3.55; Sheet Metal workers,
$2 30.

stallation of what is to be known as
the 27th. sewer unit of the City of of the following widths, Including ceby the Circuit Court of the State of

Oregon for Klamath County, Oregon. tfy edit or reject any Want Ad
copy and will be responsible for
only one Incorrect Insertion of any

mrnl concrete curbs and gutters:overtime not le.is man one ana one-Klamath Falls. Oregon, filed with theas Administratrix of the Estate of
half (Pal times the ahove rates, Sun Van Nets Avenue will be 36' In width

from the southwesterly .line of. PacificCity by the City Engineer, shall be,
days and holidays, not less than two

Another 1000 H&N Families

For Herald & News Advertisers
the same are nercny approved publication of same. Correction! or

cancellations li received by 0:30
p m. will be made in following

Terrace to the westerly line of Caltimes the above rates. Biddersand adopted- houn Street and 32' in width from theshall check with the Building Trades
Council having jurisdiction, for any day's publication.easterlv line of Calhoun Street to theSection U

That the Common Counril of the

Gerald Roy Lalo. Deceased. All per-
sons having claims against said estate
are hereby required to present them to
me at the office of Glenn D. Ramirez,
Suite 205. I.O.O.F. Building. 432 Main
Street, Klamath Falls. Oregon, with
vopcr vouchers within six months
frnm the date of this notice.

DATED this 23rd day of July. 1959.

westerly line of Fairmount Slree1
Fairmount Street and Benson StreetCity of Klamath Falls, Oregon, hereby

declares its Intention to construct and FUNERAL HOMES Cwill be 32' in width, Calhoun Street
will be 36' in width.nut a II the 27th. Sewer Unit of said

rates not covered, for health, welfare
and other funds and benefits for
changes in rates or benefits, which1
have been established by craft agree-
ment.

Bids are to be accompanied by 3"r
bld bond or certified check and the

City in accordance with the said plans. No sidewalks are to he ran st rue ted. O'HAIR'S Memorial Chapel. 530 Pine,
Phone TV Parking lot availGrace Lalo, Administratrix of specification, and- estimates; this proj Four Intersections are Included.ect consists of constructing lines Asphalt Ic concrete driveways will bethe Estate of GERALD ROY

LALO, Deceased able.for a sanitary sewer serving a portion successful hiddrr will be required to constructed to the property line where
required and requested.of Block 12. Eldorado Addition. Block WARD'S Klamath Funeral Home. 021

High Street. Phone TUfurnish a surety company R0rh perfor24. Eldorado Heights Addition, and
GLENN D. RAMIREZ
ROBERT M, REDDING
Attorneys for Administratrix
No. 93, July 23, 30, August 6, 13, 1959.

mance and 50 Labor and MaterialsBlocks 20, 21, 2H, 29, 36 and 37 Moun-
tain View Addition, to said City. The

Necessary miscellaneous items as re-

quired to give a completed project
are included.

Bond, and he shall be required MEETING NOTICES 1
Public Liability Insurance tosewer lines will be constructed of ci-

ther concrete pipe, or vitrified clay. cover all phrases of the work. The estimated cost of nil classes of
Improvment .embracing all work and.The Board of Trustees of inr sis-

The Herald and News will adjust adver-

tising rates, effective Oct. 1, 1959, on the basis

of 15,000 net paid subscribers. Present rates

were established Dec. 1, 1957 on the basis

subscribers.

CRATER LAKE LODGE No. 211,or cement asbestos pipe and the proj-
ect will include all necessary manholes materials for the complete improvekivou Union High School District re

ment of said project for such type of

No.
NOTICE OF FINAL. ACCOUNT

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF
THE STATE OF OREGON

IN AND FOR
THE COUNTY OF KLAMATH

serves the right to reject any and all
pavement being as follows:bids and to waive any informalities.

Anphaltie Concrete Pavement 3" InSigned James D. Herbert
Clerk thickness, S30.in;f.is.In the Matter of the Estate of

A.F. & A.M. Special
Communication Thurs-
day, August 13, 7:30
p.m. Work in Master
Mason Degree.

Dale Howell, W. M.

No. 124, August 13, 20, 27( Portland Cement conrrete paveJESSIE BOBBINS WEISER, Deceased
Notice is hereby aiven that I have
led my Final Account as adminiS' ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

SiHkiyou County High Schools
Siskiyou County, Californiarator of the Estate of Jessie Robbing

ment, 6" in thickness, $ao,4H.i9.
Section 2.

That the property lying within the
boundaries hereinafter described be
and the name are hereby declared to
be benefited by the said Improvement,

and other appurtenances, as more fully
shown on said plans and specifica-
tions, at a total estimated cost a, fol-

lows:
Cement Concrete sewer pipr.

Vitrified Clay pipe. $41,442.63;
Asbestos Cement pipe. S40.2O7.22. .

Said estimates include engineering,
attorney fees, supervision, advertising,
clerical assistance and unforeseen con-

tingencies.
Section III.

That the properly lying within ,the
boundaries hereinafter described, shall
be and is hereby declared to be bene-
fited by the construction and installa-
tion of said sewer system,

Welser. deceased, and that the Court
Sealed bids are requested for three
projects as follows: Site facilities at LOST 4 FOUNDas set September 1, 1959, at the hour

f 10:00 a.m.. as the time for the
the Butte valley High school, uorris,hearing of objections to said Final

Beginning at the southwest cornerAccount and settlement thereof.
the Yreka High School, Yreka. Also1 of lot 10, block 36, Mountain ViewDated this July 23rd, 1AM.

LOST. Medium sited golden-haire- d fe-

male dog In vicinity of Mt. Whitney,
Answers to name "Taffy." Reward,
Phone TU

included at Ihe Yreka Hiffh School are Addition to the cltv of Klamath rails,
four classrooms and shop additions! Oregon, thence northerly parallel toLORENTINE S. WEISER

Administrator
NEILL ic MCLAREN and 150 feet distant westerly from thehaving a total area of approximately FOUND one bicycle. TU

7,2ti0 snuare feet.llornevs for Administrator
No. 86, July 23. 30, August 6, 13, 1950.

SORREL QUARTER HORSE
Beginning at the southeast corner

of lot IB, block 36, Mountain View
Addition to the City of Klamath Falls,
Oregon; thence northbrly along line
common to lots 18 and 19 of said

westerly line of Calhoun Street a dis-

tance of 414 feet .lo the ccntcrllne of
the alley in block 2, said Mountain
View Addition1, thence easterly, par-- '

allel to and lift feet distant northerly
from the northerly line of Benson

NOTICE OF
ADMINISTRATOR'S SALE.

Saddle and Bridle lost on Seven
Lukes Trail, west of Fort Klamath.

All added facilities at each scnooi will
be included on a separate Proposal
Form for each school.
Site facilities in general will consist
of athletic Melds, running track, tennts
and multi-us- e paved areas, jumping
pita, turfed and lawn areas, sprinkler
system, fencing, walks, parking areas,
etc. i

Notice Is hereby given that by vir block 36 to the southerly line of the
alley In said block 36; thence easterly Street to the westerly line of t

Street: thence continuing easta one the southerly line ot said aucy
tue of an order of sale duly made on
August 11th, 1959, by the Judge of the
Circuit Court of the. State of Oregon
for Klamath County and entered by

erly crossing Fairmount Street to the,

"OS" brand on left shoulder.
$50 REWARD

for horse and saddle.: Contact
Nicholson, branding inspector. Fort
Klamath.

to the westerly line of Calhoun Street;
thence northerly along the westerly
line of Calhoun, Street In the southerly

northwest corner of 101 u, diock ji.
said Mountain View Addition; thenceBids are to be delivered to the Boardthe clerk of said Court on said date
contlnulna easterly alone the south

HERALD and NEWS
Klamath Falli, Oragon

Published Evaningi Manday through Friday
and Sunday Mornings

DISPLAY ADVERTISING RATE CARD

Effective October 1, 1959
Rotei Apply Doily and Sunday

National Advertiiina pr col. Inch 1.68
Opart Local, Traniignt Advertising , par col. inch 1.68

Rtrail, Political Advertising par col. inch 1.32

L!
' Retail Monthly Earned Ratei

Space used within

calendar month
25 inches or more ' par cel. inch 1.28

50 inches or more ' par col. inch 1.24
100 inchei or more Pr col. inch 1.20

250 inches or more par col. inch 1.16
Pickup rate (Repeat within 30 days) per col. inch 1.16 ,

Church rote par col. inch 1.16
Multiple Advertiser rata par col. inch 1.32

wherein I, A. C. Yaden, the adminis-- : of Trustees of the Siskiyou Union High
School District at thatr office In the

line of Park Row; thence westerly
along the southerly line of Park Rowtrator with the will annexed of the erly line of the alley in said btock 31

to the northeast corner of lot 17. saidestate of Linda Woolley Baker Brown. to the westerly line of Tiffany street Warrens Building, Yrejia, California,
on or before 2:30 p.m.. Pacific DayDeceased, was authorized, ucensea GENERAL NOTICES 4block .11; thence southerly parallel to

and 125 feet distant easterly from thethence southerly along the westerly
line of Tiffany Street to the northeast light Raving Time on Thursday, Au-- Ind empowered to sell at public auc- -

sust 20, 10511. The Board of Trustees easterly line of Fairmount Street to thecorner of lot 16. block 15, Eldoradotinn or private sale in the manner
provided by law, for cash, the follow-- l reserves the right to open all bidsHelahts Addition to the City of Klam

FREE BUILDING
'40xR0. You tear It down, and the
material is yours. Peyton andat any one time durins the meeting,

centerllne of vacated Benson street;
thence easterly along the centerllne of
vacated Benson Street 23 feet; thence

described roalty. ath Falls. Orenon; thence westerly Contract documents which Includetwenty-on- e i21i. twenty-tw- i22i, twen
southerly narallel to and 130 feet dlsalong the lines common to lots 13 and

16 of said block 15 to the northwest
corner of lot 16 said block 15; thence

plans and specifications, may be ob-
tained at the office of Howard R. Per

i23t and twenty-fou- r i24i ot,
Block seventeen U7i jn Second Add- i-

Architect. 1121 Main Street. Klam
tant easterly from the easterly line of
Fairmount Street to the southeast
corner of lot 18, block 34, said Moun

to the City of Klamath Falls,
DOES your organization need money?
f can help you build up that sinking
treasury or pay for your project. Ap-

ply Walkins Product, 209 g. Main.
ath Falls. Oregon, for a deposit ofKlamath County, Oregon.
$25.00 per set, $50.00 for all three tain View Addition; tnence aouinwesiI will on or after the 12tn day oi

southerly along the lines common to
lots 15 and 16 and to Inls 18 and 10

of said block 15 to the northerly line
of Euclid Street; thence crossing Eu-

clid Street to the northwest corner of
sets, which deposit will be returned erly crossing Van Ness Avenue to the
to the bidder upon receipt of the docu PERSONALS U-- 4most easterly corner 01 lot 1, diock

September, 1959. at my office, 41 1

Main Street. Klamath Falls; Oregon,
sell at private sale, for .cash, said
described realty.

ments to the Architect. Hillside Addition to the City ot Klam-
ath Falls. Oreson: thence continuingContract documents are on file at the THE Rawlelgh man. Phone TU

lot 1, block 24, said Eldorado Heights
Addition; thence southerly along the
westerly lines ot lot 1. 4, 5. and 6,
said block 24 to the most norlherly

southwesterly along the southeasterlyDated and first published this I3tn before S or after s for orders.San Francisco Builders Exchange, 850
S. Van Ness Avenue,- San Francisco,
California; Dally Pacific Builder Plan

lines of lot 1, 2, ana a, saio. diockday of August. 1959. t
SPENCER CORSETIERE. Phone TUto the northeasterly line or lot o,A. C Yaoen, Aamimsiraior,

C.T.A.
corner of lot 11, said block 24; thence
southeasterly along the northeasterly said block 7: thence southeasterly

No. 129, August 13, 20. 27, September 3. along the northeasterly line of lot e,lines of lots ll. 14, is. 16. and
ild block 7 to tne most easieny corid block 24 to the southwest corner LEGAL NOTICEner of lot 6, said block 7; thence

southwesterly alone the line common
of lot 17 said block 24: thence easterly
along the southerly line of lot 17 said
block 24 to the westerly line of Tiffany

Toastmistresses
Schedule Meet

Room, 465 Tenth Street, Ban Franclsro.l
California: Sacramento- Builders Ex-

change, 1331 T Street, Sacramento,
California: Valley Contractors Ex-

change, 325 West 4th Street, Chlco,
California; Builder! Exchange Co-

operative, 317 Builders Exrhange
Building, Portland, Oregon: Eugene
Builders Exchange, 145 East 20th
Street, Eugene, Oregon; e Build-
ers Exchange, 246 S. Central, Medford,
Oregon, and at the office of Dr. J. E.
Hurlev. Superintendent. Siskiyou Un

Street: thence southerly along the
to lots 6 and 7, said diock 7, to me
northeasterly line of Pacific Terrace;
thence northwesterly along the north-

easterly line of Pacific Terrace to the
most westerly corner of lot 4, said

westerly line of Tiffany Street to the
northerly line of Van Ness Avenue;

Ewauna and Mt. Mazama Toast- -

block 7; thence southwesterly crossing
thence easterly along tne norineriy
line of Vantyess Avenue to the point
of be a in nine.

mistress Clubs will meet for a

joint program at a dinner meet
Van Nesi Avenue to the point of be
Minn in.

NOTICE OF STREET VACATION
NOTICE IS HEREBY OWEN, that

the Common Council ' of the City ot
Klamath Falls, Oregon at its regular
meeting, July 20, 1050, adopted a res-

olution, declaring on Its own Investi-

gation and Initiation; Its Intention to
vacate; VanNess Street, in a westerly
direction, from its Intersection with
the west line of Highway 87, known
as West Side Bypass, to its intersec-
tion with the east line of Moneliui
Street, all In City of Klamath Falls,
Oregon.

That at a renular meeting of said

Said real property ahove described
ion High School District, Warren

ing in the Willard Hotel, 6:30 p.m. lying In City of Kiamatn Fans, ruam
ath County. OreRnn. shall be and i: Building. Yreka. California.

That all the property Included In the
aforesaid boundaries above described
be and the same Is hereby declaredBidders are hereby notified that pursuThursday, August 13.

ant to the Statutes of the Stale of Calihereby declared to he benefited and
assessed for the expense of said sewer be benefited by said ImprovementFlag salute will be led by Eva and assessed for the expense thereof.unit.

Cook: opening, Reba Martz; tim Section IV.
fornia, or local iaws thereto applicable,
ihe Trustees of the Siskiyou Union
High School District have ascertained
the Bcneral prevailing rate of per diemThat Tuesday the 8th. day of Seper. Eve Morey; lexicologist. Vir

Section 3.

That Tuesday the 2nd. day of Sep-

tember, 1030, at the hour of 4:00
o'clock P M and the Council Room oftember, 1050, at the hour

the Council' WflKe11 ,n ,nc tocalltici in which thisginia Fuller; evaluator, Eunice o'clock P.M. thrreof,
Common Council to be held on the
24th. day nf August. 1959. at the hour
of 7:30 o'clock P.M. thereof. In the
Council Room of the City Hall for
said City, a public hearing will be

Room in the City Hall of KlamathBunnell; all of the Mt. Mazama
Falls. Oregon, shall he and Is hereby craft or type of workmen or mechanic

needed to execute the contract. The
prevailing rates so determined are aaChapter. Helen Bassett of the fixed as the time and place for hearing held on said matter, at wnicn any oo--

objections and remonstrances againstEwauna group will act as topic- - Jecllons or remonstrances which mayfollows:
Asphalt Baker and lroners. $2,935;

CarnenterV $3.38; Cement Finishers.
the construction and lnttanatioin oi
laid 27th. aewer unit.mistrfiss and Ingeborg Pex of Mt.

Mazama will be toastmistress.

the City Hall In Klamath Fans. Ore-

gon, be and It hereby fixed as the
time and place for hearing objections
and remonstrances against said pro-

posed Improvement.
Section 4.

That the City Recorder be and she
Is hereby authorized and directed
to cause notice of such hearing to be

published as provided by the City
Charfer of said City and she shall
publish this resolution aa provided by
taw. and within five days after the

be made In writing and filed witn tne
Recorder of said City will be heard
and considered, and at which the Pub-
lic may he heard.

$3.5X5; Concrete Mixer (over 1 yd.).
$3 45: Dump Truck Driver (underRamona Smith of Ewauna will be vds i. $2.76: Dump Truck Lmver lover This notice ts aiven oy oraer oi tne
4 vds. i. $2.89: Grader Operator. Powcritic for the speeches. Common Council of said City.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that
the Recorder of the City of Klamath
Falls. Oregon, be and she Is hereby
authorized and directed to cause a

of said hearing to he published
aa provided by the City Charter and
conforming thereto she shall cause this
resolution to be published In the City
official newspaper, once a day for ten

er Pull Blade, iarorer. uroupEva Cook, president of Mt. Ma Done this July 23. 1059.
ROSIE KELLER
Cltv Recorder.

New Contracts. . .
New ... the Herald and News will have con-

tracts available . which will provide advertisers

with a guaranteed rate for 12 months; a liberal

reward for contract performance; a substantial

discount for the large space user; and a reward to

the small operator for consistency.

Your Herald and News advertising repre-

sentative has full details. Consult him for help in

planning your advertising for bigger volume and

more profits and for the most beneficial con-

tract.

TU

The Basic Advertising Medium

of the Klamath Basin
,

zama, will report on the Interna
No. 1. $2 035: Laborers, nroup No. z,

$2,963; Laborers. Group No. 3, $2 683;
Painter. $3 25: Plumber, $405.

Roller Operator. $3 50: Tractor Drlv-
first publication thereof the City En

No. 80, July 23. 30, August 6, 13, 1959.tional Toastmistress convention, at gineer shall cause to oe conspicuously
consecutive days, and the City Engiwhich she recently represented posted at eacn ena 01 ine nn m ran.

lemplated Improvement such notice as
i. nrnviderf hv law and ordinance.

NOTICE Or STREET VACATION
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, thatboth local chapters.

neer, be and he Is hereby directed to
post, within five days after the first
publication of this resolution, on the
street or streets along the line of the

Passed by the common Louncii 01

er with Boom. $3.75: Transit Mix. 4

yds and over, $2 065; Transit Mix,
under 4 yd., $2 R63; Trenching Ma-

chine, $3 55; Sheet Metal Workers,
$2.30.
Overtime not less than one and lf

(I'll times the above rates, Sun

Dela Baty. Mt. Mazama, and
the Common Council of the City of
Klamath Falls, Oregon, at Its regular
meeting. July 27, 1950. adopted a reaothe City of Klamath Falls, Oregon,

this 3rd. dav of AufUlt. 103B,Margaret Da vies, Ewauna, will contemplated sewer, at least two no
tices; headed. "NOTICE OF SEWER Presented to the Mayor and by him

approved and signed this 4th day ofgive prepared speeches. Kathy Mc
WORK" In letters of not less than one days and holidays, not less than two

August,2i times the above rates. BiddersDonald, Mt. Mazama educational
chairman, has prepared an educa-

tional feature for the program.

shall check with the Building Trades
Council having Jurtidtrtlon. for any

di Inch In length, and said notices
shall contain In legible characters, a
copy of the resolution of the Counril
and the date of it message, and the
City Engineer shall file with the City

lutlon, declaring on its own investiga-
tion and Initiation: its intention to va-

cate; the alley between Lots fourteen
il4i and fifteen 15i in Block Seven
7i Hillside Addition, to the City of
Klamath Falls, Oregon, extending
from Lawrence to VanNess Streets.

That at a regular meeting of said
Common Council to be held on the
Bin. day of September, 1950, at the
hour of 7 jo o'clock P.M. thereof, in

rates not covered, for health, welfare
and other fund and benefits for
rhanaes in rates or benefits, which

bAwntnL sua i r.n
Mayor
ATTEST: BOSIE KELLER
Recorder.

STATE OF OREGON,
COUNTY Or KLAMATH,

SS.
CITY OF KLAMATH FALLS.

have been established by craft agreeCARD PARTY
Sacred Heart Academy Mothers ment.

Recorder an affidavit of the posting
of such notices, stating the date when
posted, and places where posted and
the number of notices posted,

Passed by the Common Counril of
the City of Klamath Falls. Oregon,

Bids are in be accompanied by S

hid bond or certified check and theClub will hold a card party and

fall style show Wednesday, August Niiccretful bidder wilt be required to
I, Rosle Keller. Recorder of the City!

of Klamath rails, Oregon, do hereby!
certify that the above and foregoing
is a true copy of a resolution intro-
duced and adopted by the Common

furnish a surety .company 30 perror-this loth, day of August, ib.w
19. in the Sacred Heart gym. Des Presented to the Mavnr and by him trounce and 50 Labor and Materials
sert will be served at 7:30 p.m approved and signed this 11th day oi; Bond, and he shall be required to car

The public is invited. For rcserva-- , Au,uit Ji E. SLATER
ry funiic 1.1011 ny insurance u tovir
all phrases of the work.
The Board of Trustees of the Siskiyou

the Council Room of the City Hall for
said City, a public hearing will bo
held on said proposition, at which ob-

jections or remonstrances which may
be made in writing and filed with the)
Recorder ot said City will be heard
and considered, aod at which the pub-H- e

may be heard.
This notice ts given by order of the

Common Council of said Ctty.
Don thts 30th. day of July, 1959

Rosia Keller ,

City Recorder.
No 103. July 30. August t, U, BJk

tions call Lorraine Cavanaugh,
TU June Andrieu, TU

Council or the City of Klamath Falls,
Oregon, -- at Its regular meeting held
on the 3rd. day of August. 1Q30. and
thereafter approved and signed by the
Mayor, and attested by the Recorder.

Roslt Keller
City Recorder.

No. 116. August 6, T, t, 10, 11, IS, 13.

14, 16 IT.

Mavor
ATTEST: ROSIE KELLER
Recorder.

STATE OF OREGON,
COUNTY OF KLAMATH.

SS
CITY Or KLAMATH FALLS.

Union High School District reserves
the right to reject any and all bids
and to waive any Informalities.

Signed James D. Herbert
Clerk

No. 105, iulr 20, August I, U.

Lorraine Huettl, TU e

Hoi ford, TU or Mary
Schiff, TU 13074.

I
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