

## CLASSIFIED AD RATES

Per word each insertion, 2 cents; per week 10% discount; per two weeks 15% discount; per month 20% discount. All classified ads must be cash. Minimum advertisement 25 cents.

### FOR SALE

**FURNITURE BARGAINS**  
Good Cash Register.....\$75  
Toldeo Computing Scale.....\$75  
Nice Upright Piano.....\$195  
Good Office Desk.....\$20 up  
Good Sewing Machine.....\$15 up  
Good Phonograph.....\$30 up  
Good Used Refrigerator.....\$10 up  
Good Used Dresser.....\$10 up  
Good Vacuum Cleaner.....\$15 up  
Liberal Credit Terms  
**KLAMATH FURNITURE CO.**  
1011 Main St.  
16-10\*

**FOR SALE—Block 34-A, Buena Vista addition, \$1,000.00, \$1,000 cash, \$30 per month at 7 per cent. J. B. Wira, 750 Hoffman Ave., Monterey, Cal. 16-10\***

**FOR SALE—Large refrigerator, cash register, tailors sewing machine, graphophone, two chairs and mirrors, gasoline pump, safe. 206 South Sixth street. 20-21\***

**FOR SALE OR TRADE—Three-room house at 80 per cent. Write Box 494, care Herald. 16-10\***

### FOR RENT

**FOR RENT—We can save you big money at the Arcade Hotel Apartments. Furnished completely, electric ranges, linen, dishes and telephone; or rooms with private baths at reasonable rates. Special rates at the Arcade Garage to steady tenants of the Apartment and guests of the Arcade Hotel. 16-10\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished apartments. St. Francis Apts. 625 Oak Ave. 19-21\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished apartment. 133 No. 8th, Lorenz Apts. 17-10\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished, steam heated apartments. Rex-Arms Apts. 1-26\***

**FOR RENT—Cabin and sleeping room. 302 East Main. 20-21\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished bedrooms with bath and telephone privileges. Phone 1145-J. 20-21\***

**HOUSE FOR RENT—Phone 176-J. 18-21\***

### WANTED

**WANTED TO RENT—Modern, Clean four or five-room house, unfurnished, Aug. or Sept. for small family, permanent. May possibly buy later. A. Woodrich, care Lost River Dairy after 6 o'clock p. m. 18-21\***

**WANTED—Assistant bookkeeper. Prefer one experienced on bookkeeping machine. Male preferred. Write Box 564 care Herald. 19-21\***

**WANTED—Green lumber pliers, both day and contract work. Box 1134 or phone No. 8, Medford, Ore. 17-21\***

**WANTED TO RENT—Four or five-room furnished house by August 1st. Write Box 547 care Herald. 15-21\***

**ROOM AND BOARD—\$10 a week. 325 North Sixth street. Phone 1181-W. 20-21\***

**WANTED—Salesman with car, apply 384 Klamath Ave. 11-21\***

### MISCELLANEOUS

**FOR HOUSE MOVING, RAISING and repairing see C. A. Fagerstrom. 1133 1/2 Walnut. Phone 1297. 11-21\***

**LONG'S RADIO SERVICE—Repairing, testing, installing, etc., a. c. or d. c. sets, any make. Tubes, parts, supplies, batteries, etc. Wm. Long, 1012 Donald St. Phone 1454-M. 12-21\***

**INVALIDS and old people boarded and cared for. Unpleasant and Rest Home, Ashland, Ore. 24-21\***

### FOR SALE—Real Estate

**For Sale**  
**ALTIMONT ACRES**  
Second Addition  
Two miles from city. Good roads, irrigation, city water and light. The best soil; close to school. Easy terms, discount for cash. Buy some of these lots and watch them grow into money.  
**PEYTON & CO., Agents**  
126 So. 7th. Phone 535 11-21\*

### NEW TODAY

**TWO GIRLS—18 to 23, special adv. work, no experience. Those qualified and free to travel. We pay salary weekly, commission and traveling expenses. Apply Mrs. Huber, Baldwin hotel, 7 to 8 p. m. 10 to 11 a. m. 22-21\***

### Business Locals

**6% Money—On approved loans. See Jas. H. Driscoll, Williams Bldg.—ad. 11**  
The Marshall House having changed hands, we wish all parties having bills against the place to please present within the next ten days.  
**J. W. STINSON, Mgr.**  
Dated 7-16-20. 17-21\*

**When in Bend, stop at the Altamont hotel, or Alpine lodge. Good rooms, reasonable prices. 22-21\***

**For results use Herald Class Ads**

### NEW TODAY

**FOR SALE**  
Acreage home, 1 1/4 acres or more of finest rich irrigated, sandy loam soil, on gravelled road, city water, trees all planted, new 4-room house. The terms will surprise you.  
—  
Fine view lot on Pacific Terrace for 1920.  
—  
One and one-quarter acres or more of richest soil in county, all irrigated, on gravelled road, city water, trees, good terms.  
—  
Three rooms—clever floor plan, 3-coat bath, no assessments. \$250.00 down.  
—  
**FAVELL-UTLEY REALTY COMPANY**  
Realtors  
Geo. J. Walton, Mgr.

### FOR SALE

**FOR SALE—Block 34-A, Buena Vista addition, \$1,000.00, \$1,000 cash, \$30 per month at 7 per cent. J. B. Wira, 750 Hoffman Ave., Monterey, Cal. 16-10\***

**FOR SALE—Large refrigerator, cash register, tailors sewing machine, graphophone, two chairs and mirrors, gasoline pump, safe. 206 South Sixth street. 20-21\***

**FOR SALE OR TRADE—Three-room house at 80 per cent. Write Box 494, care Herald. 16-10\***

**HOUSE FOR RENT—Phone 176-J. 18-21\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished bedrooms with bath and telephone privileges. Phone 1145-J. 20-21\***

**FOR RENT—Cabin and sleeping room. 302 East Main. 20-21\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished apartments. St. Francis Apts. 625 Oak Ave. 19-21\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished apartment. 133 No. 8th, Lorenz Apts. 17-10\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished, steam heated apartments. Rex-Arms Apts. 1-26\***

**FOR RENT—Cabin and sleeping room. 302 East Main. 20-21\***

**FOR RENT—Furnished bedrooms with bath and telephone privileges. Phone 1145-J. 20-21\***

**HOUSE FOR RENT—Phone 176-J. 18-21\***

**WANTED TO RENT—Modern, Clean four or five-room house, unfurnished, Aug. or Sept. for small family, permanent. May possibly buy later. A. Woodrich, care Lost River Dairy after 6 o'clock p. m. 18-21\***

**WANTED—Assistant bookkeeper. Prefer one experienced on bookkeeping machine. Male preferred. Write Box 564 care Herald. 19-21\***

**WANTED—Green lumber pliers, both day and contract work. Box 1134 or phone No. 8, Medford, Ore. 17-21\***

**WANTED TO RENT—Four or five-room furnished house by August 1st. Write Box 547 care Herald. 15-21\***

**ROOM AND BOARD—\$10 a week. 325 North Sixth street. Phone 1181-W. 20-21\***

**WANTED—Salesman with car, apply 384 Klamath Ave. 11-21\***

**WANTED—Green lumber pliers, both day and contract work. Box 1134 or phone No. 8, Medford, Ore. 17-21\***

**WANTED TO RENT—Four or five-room furnished house by August 1st. Write Box 547 care Herald. 15-21\***

**ROOM AND BOARD—\$10 a week. 325 North Sixth street. Phone 1181-W. 20-21\***

**WANTED—Salesman with car, apply 384 Klamath Ave. 11-21\***

**WANTED—Green lumber pliers, both day and contract work. Box 1134 or phone No. 8, Medford, Ore. 17-21\***

**WANTED TO RENT—Four or five-room furnished house by August 1st. Write Box 547 care Herald. 15-21\***

**ROOM AND BOARD—\$10 a week. 325 North Sixth street. Phone 1181-W. 20-21\***

**WANTED—Salesman with car, apply 384 Klamath Ave. 11-21\***

**WANTED—Green lumber pliers, both day and contract work. Box 1134 or phone No. 8, Medford, Ore. 17-21\***

**WANTED TO RENT—Four or five-room furnished house by August 1st. Write Box 547 care Herald. 15-21\***

**ROOM AND BOARD—\$10 a week. 325 North Sixth street. Phone 1181-W. 20-21\***

**WANTED—Salesman with car, apply 384 Klamath Ave. 11-21\***

**WANTED—Green lumber pliers, both day and contract work. Box 1134 or phone No. 8, Medford, Ore. 17-21\***

## LEGAL NOTICES

**NOTICE TO CREDITORS**  
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned has been appointed Administratrix of the estate of Fred Steeman, deceased, by the County Court of Klamath County, Oregon.  
All persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present same, properly verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Fay Morris, Attorney for Estate, July 1-13-22-29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing 100 acres within section 36, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M. on north side of Cottonwood creek, Cottonwood National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 520,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and lodgepole pine and engelmann spruce. No bid of less than \$4.75 per M feet will be considered. \$3,595.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 1920, for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down, and all the live timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 130 acres within portions of section 34, T. 28 S., R. 6 E., W. M., in vicinity of Pelican Butte, Crater National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 800,000 feet B. M., more or less, of western yellow and sugar pine and an undetermined amount of Douglas fir, white fir and incense cedar to be cut at the option of the purchaser. No bid of less than \$5.00 per M feet B. M. for the western yellow and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M feet B. M. for the other species will be considered. \$4,000.00 must be deposited with each bid to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon. July 15, 22, 29.

**NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE**  
Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon, up to and including August 15, 19