

CLASSIFIED WANTS

If you want all the news of Lake County and Golden Goose Lake Valley, subscribe for **THE EXAMINER**, only \$2 a year.

WANTED

WANTED PILING—Competitive bids for 1000 piles varying lengths. For further information see or write E. S. HERNEY, Lakeview, A711.

WANTED—A position as cook on ranch near Lakeview. Lady has son that could help on ranch or sheep camp during sheep shearing. Address Examiner office.

FOR SALE

FOR TRADE—A four-hill ranch of 280 acres, 150 under cultivation. Hog tight fence and cross fence. An abundance of large white and live oak trees. Six room house, large barn and several outbuildings. Fine well with 2 1/2 horse power pumping plant. Good live spring and creek with mountain trout the year around. Property near Fresno, California. Wants to trade for forty acre alfalfa ranch in Oregon. Value \$5,500. My 26th St. SEAGER BROS.

FOR SALE—10 acres with 5 acre water right, O.V.L. Tract 10, sec. 7, T. 41, R. 19, and Lot 11, Blk. 67, for \$100-\$110. Address: Alfred E. Kendall, Gen. Del., Los Angeles, Calif.

HORSES FOR SALE—Also one fine English-bred Stallion, 6 years old. Enquire of Chas. M. Oliver, ranch 5 miles south of New Pine Creek, Oregon.

FOR SALE—10 acres, with 5 acre water right, O.V.L. Tract 10, sec. 7, T. 41, R. 19, and Lot 11, Blk. 67. Must sell at once. Price \$170. \$180 paid. Address: A. KUYKENDALL, Gen. Del., Los Angeles, Cal.

WHY NOT—Spend your vacation at "The Jefferson," San Francisco? A city hotel situated in a beautiful park but five minutes from Market St. Special rates for the summer.

PIANO FOR SALE—Kobler & Campbell. Enquire of Mrs. G. S. Eater, Lakeview, A1411.

HORSES FOR SALE—Broken and unbroken. Also one English-bred 5 year old stallion. Enquire at this office. Mel1711

FOR SALE—One counter and two show cases in good condition. See T. H. CLOUD.

Blue Prints of any township in Burns Land District showing all land entries, names, dates, etc. Topography. Your order filled on day of receiving. Price \$1. J. C. TURNEY, Burns, Oregon.

STRAY NOTICE

STRAYED, One Bay Mare, One Dark Bay Horse, batters on without rope. Suitable reward paid for any information or returning same to Drews Creek Canyon. Telephone any information to Lakeview Mercantile Co. PETE BILLER.

STRAYED or stolen, about Aug. 15, 1909, one gray mare, branded with "L" on left side, wire ear on front leg, weight 1400, about 10 years old. Light bay, white face saddle horse, same brand, wire ear on left front leg, about 12 years old, weight 1,000 pounds. Liberal reward. ANDREW MORRIS, Adel.

For rent—Section 5, township 39 south, range 20, within one mile of town. Apply to E. A. Bauers. 22

LOST AND FOUND

LOST—Gold necklace, with bunch of grapes pendant. Finder will please leave same at Examiner office.

MISCELLANEOUS

WANTED—Men capable of earning \$50.00 per week selling trees for largest and best known nursery in the West. Choice territory. Guaranteed stock. For particulars, address, OREGON NURSERY COMPANY, OREGON, OREGON 7-12

CANAL CONTRACT TO LET—Enlargement and repairing large irrigation canal 1 1/2 to 2 miles in length at Paisley Ore. Must be completed by the 1st of May or sooner, also wanted man to do ranch work and wife to cook for small force of men. Reasonable wages. Consult with L. F. Conn, Lakeview and call on Geo. Conn, Paisley Oregon

TRESPASS NOTICE

TRESPASS NOTICE—We hereby warn all parties from entering our premises in Sec. 8, Township 39 SR, 20E, for purpose of hunting or fishing or otherwise. J. O. BULL, 38 ft. GEO. JAMMERTHAL

TELEPHONES

LOOK AT THE NOTICE FOR REWARD issued by the Telephone Company for destroying its property. 16ft

LIQUORS AND CIGARS

OST & KING HAVE THE BEST grade of liquors and cigars to be found in Oregon. 11

J. H. CUTLER WHISKY AT THE Hotel Lakeview bar. The best and purest whisky made. 11

HICKS BRAND

James Barry Brands with Sealover Fork in right ear for cures; resorts for wetbers. Some wear Square Crop and still in right ear. T. Brand 111. Range, Crane 1911. W. Oregon

REAL ESTATE

WE SELL 10 ACRE TRACTS under irrigation in the Golden Goose Valley from \$250 to \$400 each. Write for our booklet.

SOUTHERN OREGON REALTY CO., Lakeview, Or. 5217

STAGE LINE

Office at B. Reynolds' Store

Stage leaves Lakeview 8:30 a.m. and Paisley 3:30 p.m. at Paisley at 9 a.m. and 3:30 p.m. days. Thursdays and Saturdays a.m. arrives at Lakeview 7:30 a.m.

Passenger fare 4¢ round trip. Freight \$1.50 per cwt.

WESTERN STAGE

Klamath Falls-Lakeview Stage Company

OFFICES: Mercantile Co's Store, Lakeview; American Hotel, Klamath Falls.

Round Trip 4¢
Our Way 1¢

Northern Stage Line

LAKEVIEW--PAISLEY

A. W. BRYAN, Proprietor

Leaves Lakeview at 6 a.m. every day but Sunday. Returning leaves Paisley at 6:30 a.m. every day but Sunday.

Freight \$1.50 per cwt.
Passenger Fare 4¢ round trip
OFFICE: B. Reynolds' Store.

LAKEVIEW

ALTURAS

STAGE LINE

Stage leaves Lakeview daily except Sunday at 6 a.m. Arrives at Alturas at 6 p.m. Leaves Alturas for Lakeview at 6 o'clock a.m. or on the arrival of the stage from Lakeview. Arrives in Lakeview in 12 hours after leaving Alturas.

Freight - Mattr - Given
Strict - Attention

First - Class - Accommodations

\$1,000.00 Reward.

The Oregon, California & Nevada Livestock Protective Association will give \$1000 Reward for the conviction of any party or parties stealing horses, cattle or mules belonging to any of the following members of this Association:

Cox & Clark, Chevanan Land & Cattle Co., Heryford Land & Cattle Co., Lake County Land & Livestock Co., Warner Valley Stock Co., Wm W. Brown, Geo. M. Jones, Geo. Hankins, S. B. Chandler, C. A. Rehart, N. Fine, W. A. Currier, Frank B. Bauers, J. C. Hotchkiss, Calderwood Bros., T. J. Bratton & Sons, T. A. Crump, Cressler & Bomber, W. T. Cressler, Maud L. Embro.

OFFICERS: J. W. P. HERYFORD, Pres.; F. M. MILLER, Sec.; F. M. GREEN, Finance Com.; S. B. CHANDLER, Sec. 2.

\$1,000 REWARD

The Oregon, California & Nevada Livestock Protective Association, of which the undersigned is a member will give \$1,000 reward for evidence leading to the rest and conviction of any party or parties stealing horses, cattle or mules belonging to any of its members.

In addition to the above, the undersigned offers on the same condition \$500.00 for all horses branded horse shoe bar on both or either leg. Brand recorded in eight counties, Range Harney, Lake and Crook counties. Horses wanted when sold.

None but grown horses sold, and only in large batches. W. W. Howes, Fife, Oregon.

Chamberlain's Stomach and Liver Tablets will brace up the nerves, banish sick headache, prevent dizziness and invigorate the whole system. Sold by All Good Druggists.

CRESCENT

RAISES THE DOUGH and complies with all pure food laws.

CRESCENT MFG. CO.
Makers of MAPLEINE (Better than Maple)

TWO HORSE OVERALLS

MADE BY LEVI STRAUSS & CO.

"with strength and ease they always please"

A Reliable Remedy FOR CATARRH

Ely's Cream Balm

It quickly soothes, Gives Relief at Once. It cleanses, soothes, heals and protects the diseased membrane resulting from Catarrh and drives away a Cold in the Head quickly. Restores the Senses of Taste and Smell. Full size 50 cts. at Druggists or by mail. Liquid Cream Balm for use in atomizers 75 cts. Ely Brothers, 60 Warren Street, New York.

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon

April 20, 1910

Not coal land.

Notice is hereby given that May Barry of Adel, Oregon, who, on June 20, 1893, made Desert Land entry No. 629, Serial, No. 01647, for 2 1/2 Sec. 14, Township 40S, Range 27E, Willamette Meridian has filed notice of intention to make Final Proof, to establish claim to the land above described, before Register and Receiver U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon, on the 8th day of June, 1910.

Claimant names as witnesses: Michael O. Sullivan, of Lakeview, Oregon; C. A. P. Barry, of Adel, Oregon; Charles C. Duggan, of Adel, Oregon; Jack P. J. Barry, of Lakeview, Oregon.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register A28J2

NOTICE OF SALE OF STATE LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the State Land Board will receive sealed bids until 10:00 o'clock A. M., on June 1, 1910, for the following described school lands, to-wit:—

N 1/4 of SW 1/4, NW 1/4 of NW 1/4 of Section 36, T. 38 S. R. 18E, Range 17E, and SW 1/4 of Section 16, T. 41 S. R. 21E.

All bids must be accompanied by a receipted, executed application to purchase and at least one-fifth of the amount offered.

No bid of less than \$7.50 per acre will be considered.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids.

Applications and bids should be addressed to G. G. Brown, Clerk State Land Board, Salem, Oregon, and marked, "Application and bid to purchase state lands."

G. G. BROWN, Clerk State Land Board. Dated April 22, 1910.

NOTICE OF SALE OF STATE LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the State Land Board will receive sealed bids until 10:00 o'clock A. M., June 2, 1910, for the following described school lands, to-wit:—

All of Section 16, T. 29 S. R. 9 W. All of Section 36, T. 31 S. R. 2 W. The SW 1/4, W 1/2 of SE 1/4 and Lots 3 and 4, Sec. 16, T. 29 S. R. 13 W. The NW 1/4 of SW 1/4 and Lots 1, 2, 3, and 4 of Sec. 16, T. 41 S. R. 12 W. The NW 1/4 of NW 1/4, NE 1/4 and NE 1/4 of SE 1/4 of Sec. 16, T. 38 S. R. 22 E. Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, and 5 of SE 1/4 of SW 1/4 of Section 36, T. 19 S. R. 1 E.

All bids must be accompanied by regularly executed application to purchase and at least one-fifth of the amount offered.

No bid of less than \$7.50 per acre will be considered.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids.

Applications and bids should be addressed to G. G. Brown, Clerk State Land Board, Salem, Oregon, and marked "Application and bid to purchase state lands."

G. G. BROWN, Clerk State Land Board. Dated March 24, 1910 M31J2

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 20, 1910.

Not coal land.

Notice is hereby given that Edward A. Snyder, of Lakeview, Oregon, who, on May 1, 1903, made Homestead entry No. 2060, Serial, No. 0310, for E 1/2 SW 1/4, SE 1/4, SW 1/4, Section 22, Township 37S, Range 19E, Willamette Meridian, has filed notice of intention to make Final Five Year Proof, to establish claim to the land above described, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon, on the 10th day of June, 1910.

Claimant names as witnesses: X Arzner, of Lakeview, Oregon; J. Arzner, of Lakeview, Oregon; J. Q. Wilkins, of Lakeview, Oregon.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

FOR SALE—Orchard lands in the demonstrated fruit belt of Lake Co., Ore. 10 and 20 acre tracts, small monthly payments, Write E. R. PATCH, Lakeview, Ore.

SHAKE INTO YOUR SHOES

Allen's Foot-Ease, a powder. Relieves pain, smarting, nervous feet and improving nails and instantly takes the sting out of corns and bunions. It's the greatest comfort discovery of the age. Allen's Foot-Ease makes tight or new shoes feel easy. It is a certain cure for sweating, callous, swollen, tired, aching feet. Try it today. Sold by all Druggists and Shoe Stores. By mail for 25c in stamps. Don't accept any substitute. Trial package FREE. Address Allen S. Olmsted, Le Roy, N. Y. No 3

CRESCENT

RAISES THE DOUGH and complies with all pure food laws.

CRESCENT MFG. CO.
Makers of MAPLEINE (Better than Maple)

A Reliable Remedy FOR CATARRH

Ely's Cream Balm

It quickly soothes, Gives Relief at Once. It cleanses, soothes, heals and protects the diseased membrane resulting from Catarrh and drives away a Cold in the Head quickly. Restores the Senses of Taste and Smell. Full size 50 cts. at Druggists or by mail. Liquid Cream Balm for use in atomizers 75 cts. Ely Brothers, 60 Warren Street, New York.

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Not Coal Land

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, May 25, 1910

Notice is hereby given that James W. Murphy, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Oregon, did, on the 7th day of July, 1910, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02329, to purchase the SW 1/4, SE 1/4, SW 1/4, Lot 7, Section 4, Township 38S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that, pursuant to such application, the land and timber thereon have been appraised, the timber estimated 1,000,000 board feet at \$75 per M, and the land \$120; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 20th day of July, 1910, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Not Coal Land

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, May 21, 1910

Notice is hereby given that James W. Murphy, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Oregon, did, on the 29th day of April, 1910, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02321, to purchase the SE 1/4, Section 26, Township 28S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that pursuant to such application the land and timber thereon have been appraised, the timber estimated 1,100,000 board feet at \$75 per M, and the land \$160.00; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 28th day of July, 1910, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Not Coal Land

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, May 21, 1910

Notice is hereby given that James W. Murphy, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Oregon, did, on the 29th day of April, 1910, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02321, to purchase the SE 1/4, Section 26, Township 28S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that pursuant to such application the land and timber thereon have been appraised, the timber estimated 1,100,000 board feet at \$75 per M, and the land \$160.00; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 28th day of July, 1910, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, May 13, 1910

Not coal land

Notice is hereby given that Ross O. Mayfield, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Lake Co., Oregon, did, on the 14th day of April, 1910, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 03315, to purchase the E 1/2 NW 1/4, W 1/2 NE 1/4, Section 26, Township 38S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that, pursuant to such application, the land and timber thereon have been appraised, the timber estimated 917,000 board feet at \$75 per M, and the land \$160.00; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 21st day of July, 1910, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register 20-9t

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 7, 1910.

Not coal land. DFB

Notice is hereby given that Michael Breen, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Oregon, did, on the 15th day of October, 1909, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02624, to purchase the SE 1/4, Section 10, Township 38S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that, pursuant to such application, the land and timber thereon have been appraised, February 20, 1910 the timber estimated 950,000 board feet at \$75 per M, and the land \$160.00; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 10th day of June, 1910, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register A14J16

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office, Lakeview, Oregon April 20, 1910.

Lakeview 01650. Not coal land.

Notice is hereby given that Phillip P. Barry, of Adel, Oregon, who, on June 21, 1906, made Desert land entry No. 623, Serial, No. 01650, for E 1/2 NW 1/4, NE 1/4, Sec. 34; W 1/2 NW 1/4, Section 35, Township 40S, Range 27E, Willamette Meridian, has filed notice of intention to make Final Proof, to establish claim to the land above described, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon, on the 8th day of June, 1910.

Claimant names as witnesses: CHARLES E. DUGGAN, of Adel, Ore.; MICHAEL P. BARRY, of Ore.; JOHN P. J. BARRY, of Ore.; WILLIAM RINEHART, of Cedarville, Cal.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register. A28J2

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office, Lakeview, Oregon April 20, 1910.

Lakeview 01650. Not coal land.

Notice is hereby given that Phillip P. Barry, of Adel, Oregon, who, on June 21, 1906, made Desert land entry No. 623, Serial, No. 01650, for E 1/2 NW 1/4, NE 1/4, Sec. 34; W 1/2 NW 1/4, Section 35, Township 40S, Range 27E, Willamette Meridian, has filed notice of intention to make Final Proof, to establish claim to the land above described, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon, on the 8th day of June, 1910.

Claimant names as witnesses: CHARLES E. DUGGAN, of Adel, Ore.; MICHAEL P. BARRY, of Ore.; JOHN P. J. BARRY, of Ore.; WILLIAM RINEHART, of Cedarville, Cal.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register. A28J2

Petition for Liquor License

We, the undersigned, legal voters of and who are and for more than thirty days last past, have been actual residents within North Warner Precinct, Lake County, State of Oregon, respectfully petition the Honorable County Court of the State of Oregon, to grant a license to Pat Murphy to sell, to wit: malt and vinous liquors, commonly known as hard cider, in less quantities than one gallon in said North Warner Precinct, County of Lake, State of Oregon, for a period of twelve months, as to duty bound we will ever say.

Notary Public for Oregon.

E. A. Green, Phillip Lynch, R. A. Pugh, W. C. Seaman, Harry A. Green, A. Morris, N. E. Barry, Thomas G. Flynn, K. J. Bonser, A. H. Canterbury, Thos. J. Sullivan, L. C. Beck, Ith. K. Taylor, J. B. Taylor, O. W. Hinch, R. J. Mack, P. P. Lane, H. Robinson, William Koppel Barry, J. E. Walker, W. Higgins, Thos. L. Murphy, Otto Korbe, T. S. Burgess, J. Messner, O. A. Curtis, H. L. Northrup, H. Dent, Pat D. Quinlan, J. W. Loftus, A. O. Kelly, J. J. Scott, John O'Callaghan, I. H. Deboy, J. T. Flock, Matt Riggs, S. M. Luce, M. Handle, W. Z. Moss, E. H. Loftus, D. J. Guiney, Con F. Zeraid, Jack McMillin, Michael Lane, Dick O'Donohy, Louis Manzey, Lake Co. D. Eganet, G. W. Wise, E. C. Stephenson, Jack Kelleher, A. L. Houghton, Con Curtin, Ed. Kienling.

State of Oregon as County of Lake, I, Pat Murphy, being first duly sworn, depose and say: that the foregoing petition contains the signatures of an actual majority of the whole number of legal voters of North Warner Precinct, Lake County, Oregon; that each of the signatures is genuine and that each of the persons whose signatures are signed to said petition is an actual resident in said precinct and resided therein at least thirty days immediately preceding the date he signed said petition, and also of the filer of the same.

PAT MURPHY.

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 6th day of June, A. D. 1910.

J. A. MORRIS, Notary Public for Oregon.

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned will apply to the Honorable County Court of Lake County, Oregon, on the 8th day of July, A. D. 1910, for a license to sell spirituous malt and vinous liquors and fermented cider, commonly known as hard cider, in less quantities than one gallon, in North Warner Precinct Lake County, State of Oregon, for a period of twelve months from the 6th day of July, A. D. 1910.

PAT MURPHY

June 3-11.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon, for the County of Lake.

Annie Blurton, Plaintiff, vs. William H. Blurton, Defendant.

To William H. Blurton, the above named defendant.

In the name of the State of Oregon you are hereby required to appear and answer the Complaint filed against you in the above entitled Court and Cause, on or before the 14th day of July, 1910, and if you fail to answer said Complaint for want thereof, the above named Plaintiff will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for and demanded in said Complaint, namely: For a decree of said Court forever dissolving the marriage contract and bonds of matrimony now existing between the above named Plaintiff, Annie Blurton and you, William H. Blurton, Defendant above named, and awarding to said Plaintiff, the care and custody of Roy Blurton, the minor children of yourself and Plaintiff, and for judgement against you for the costs and disbursements of this suit, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem equitable in the premises.

This Summons is served upon you by publication thereof for six successive and consecutive weeks in the Lake County Examiner, a newspaper of general circulation in Lake County, Oregon, and adjoining counties, published weekly at Lakeview, Lake County, Oregon, under and pursuant to an order of Honorable George Nelson, Judge of the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Lake, duly made and entered in the above entitled cause at Chambers in Klamath Falls, Klamath County, Oregon, on the 27th day of May 1910. The date of the first publication of this Summons is June 2nd, 1910, and the date of the last publication thereof is July 14th, 1910.

L. F. CONN, Attorney for Plaintiff

NOTICE OF SALE OF STATE LANDS

Notice is hereby that the State Land Board will receive sealed bids until 11:00 o'clock A. M. August 1, 1910, for the following described school lands to-wit:—

All of Section 16, T. 23 S. R. 12 E. All of Section 16, T. 34 S. R. 17 E. All bids must be accompanied by a regularly executed application to purchase and at least one fifth of the amount offered.

No bid of less than \$15.00 per acre will be considered.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids.

Applications and bids should be addressed to G. G. Brown, Clerk State Land Board, Salem, Oregon and marked, "Application and bids to purchase state lands."

G. G. BROWN, Clerk State Land Board. Dated April 22, 1910.

Trespass Notice

All persons are hereby required to forbear trespassing on the following described premises and to depart therefrom, to-wit: E 1/2 of N 1/2 of Sec. 16, T. 38S, R. 20 E., W. M., Lake Co. Ore., commonly known as the Race Track Field, situated immediately West of the Town of Lakeview, in said County and State.

And all persons trespassing upon these premises will be prosecuted under the criminal statutes of Oregon.

Dated April 21, 1910.

LIGHT & HARBOW A21-38

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 28, 1910.

Not coal land

Notice is hereby given that Samuel L. Bailey, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Oregon, did, on the 29th day of March, 1910, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02325, to purchase the Lot 2, Section 30, Township 38S, Range 21E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that, pursuant to such application, the land and timber thereon have been appraised, Mar. 14, 1910 the timber estimated 122,000 board feet at \$1.50 per M., and the land \$75.00; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 7th day of July, 1910, before Register and Receiver, this office, at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register. M5-J30

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 28, 1910.

Notice is hereby given that George Aver Edger whose post office address is Niles California did, on the 26th day of July, 1909, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02339, to purchase the SE 1/4, Section 28, Township 37S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that, pursuant to such application, the land and timber thereon have been appraised, Mar. 14, 1910 the timber estimated 769,000 board feet at \$60c. per M, and the land \$120; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of his application and sworn statement on the 8th day of July 1910, before K. M. Richardson, U. S. Commissioner at Klamath Falls, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register M5-J30

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 28, 1910.

Notice is hereby given that the State of Oregon has filed in this office its application, serial 03329, to select under the provisions of Act of Congress, of August 14 1854, and the acts supplemental and amendatory thereto, the NW 1/4, W 1/2 SW 1/4 Section 25, T. 34S, R. 21E, W. M.

Any and all persons claiming adversely the lands described or desiring to object because of the mineral character of the land or for any other reason to the disposal of applicant, should file their affidavits of protest in this office on or before the 21st of June, 1910.

The foregoing notice will be published in the Lake County Examiner a weekly newspaper printed in Lakeview, Oregon for a period of not less than thirty days prior to date last herein mentioned.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 8, 1910.

Lakeview 02625. Not coal land. DFB

Notice is hereby given that May Batchelder, whose post-office address is Lakeview, Oregon, did on the 15th day of October, 1909, file in this office Sworn Statement and Application, No. 02625, to purchase the SE 1/4, Section 22, Township 38S, Range 17E, Willamette Meridian, and the timber thereon, under the provisions of the act of June 3, 1878, and acts amendatory, known as the "Timber and Stone Law," at such value as might be fixed by appraisal, and that, pursuant to such application, the land and timber thereon have been appraised, February 1, 1910 the timber estimated 814,000 board feet at \$75 per M, and the land \$190.00; that said applicant will offer final proof in support of her application and sworn statement on the 23d day of June, 1910, before Register and Receiver, U. S. Land Office, at Lakeview, Oregon.

Any person is at liberty to protest this purchase before entry, or initiate a contest at any time before patent issues, by filing a corroborated affidavit in this office, alleging facts which would defeat the entry.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register A14J16

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior United States Land Office, Lakeview, Oregon, April 27, 1910

Notice is hereby given that the State of Oregon has filed in this office its application, serial 03329, to select under the provisions of Act of Congress, of August 14 1854, and the acts supplemental and amendatory thereto, the NW 1/4, W 1/2 SW 1/4 Section 25, T. 34S, R. 21E, W. M.

Any and all persons claiming adversely the lands described or desiring to object because of the mineral character of the land or for any other reason to the disposal of applicant, should file their affidavits of protest in this office on or before the 21st of June, 1910.

The foregoing notice will be published in the Lake County Examiner a weekly newspaper printed in Lakeview, Oregon for a period of not less than thirty days prior to date last herein mentioned.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Department of the Interior, U. S. Land Office at Lakeview, Oregon, April 27, 1910.

Notice is hereby given that the State of Oregon has filed in this office its application, serial 03329, to select under the provisions of Act of Congress, of August 14 1854, and the acts supplemental and amendatory thereto, the NW 1/4, W 1/2 SW 1/4 Section 25, T. 34S, R. 21E, W. M.

Any and all persons claiming adversely the lands described or desiring to object because of the mineral character of the land or for any other reason to the disposal of applicant, should file their affidavits of protest in this office on or before the 21st of June, 1910.

The foregoing notice will be published in the Lake County Examiner a weekly newspaper printed in Lakeview, Oregon for a period of not less than thirty days prior to date last herein mentioned.

ARTHUR W. ORTON, Register

SALE OF TIMBER, Portland, Oregon, April 28, 1910, sealed bids marked outside "Bid, Timber Sale Application, April 15, 1910, Fremont," and addressed to the District Forester, Forest Service Portland Oregon will be received up to and including the 3 day of June 1910 for all the merchantable dead timber standing or down and all the live timber marked for cutting by the Forest officer here cutting begins including approximately 370 acres in Sec 18 and the N 1/2 of Sec 19 T. 33 S. R. 17 W. W. M., within the Fremont National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 4,218,000 ft B M of western yellow pine, and 782,000 ft B M of white fir, live or dead sawtimber, log scale, more or less. No bid of less than \$2.70 per M ft. B M for western yellow pine and \$1 per M ft B M for white fir will be considered, and a deposit of \$1000, payable to the order of the First National Bank of Portland, Oregon, must be sent to the District Forester. Timber upon valid claims is exempted from sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. For further information and regulations governing sales address Forester, Supervisor, Fremont National Forest, Lakeview, Ore. H. H. CECIL, Acting District Forester