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BULGARIAN NECKWEAR 75c
ITS THE LAST W0RDv FROM NEW YORK Five Dollars

SHOE and worth every
cent of it

Business is Good
ForAnyWear

and
Everywhere

Satisfaction
in every pair.

BECAUSE
The Duke

Tan or Black. Extra Selected
Calfskin. Elegant Custom

Lines. Low Heel.
The Duke

Low Heel and Tom with
Flonheim Comfort

Feature

OUR STOCK IS

RIGHT UP TOFor the Man Who Cares
Most Styles $5.00

Priced $3.50 to $5.00
MANY TO SELECT FROM

NEW GOODS ALL THE TIME Priced $3.50 to $5.00
WE FIT YOUR FEET

FRANK -- A. CRAM

Picture

The FRAME is often half the PICTURE.

Why sH)il the picture with a poor frame?

Bring it to us and it will be framed right

A lot of new Mouldings in all sizes and

shades. OVAL and ROUND FRAMES.

Slocom's Book & Art Store
. " The Place That Docs the Framing "

It is not
whatyoutay
but what you
get when you buy

Frames

A rattling good alarm

to wake up with.

A rattling good time-

piece to tell time hy.

ARTHUR CLARKE

Jeweler And Optician
Oppotit Butler Bank

$2 OO per l.OOO

NURSERIES, Hood River, Oregon

ALWAYS

DATE

Attorney Burket returned yesterday
from Hepppner, where he had been on
business.

Mr. and Mrs. F. W. Leekly, of Port-
land, and their little son, have been
looking over the valley this week.

E. R, Manning, a former orchardist
of the valley, who is now in Los An-

geles, has been here visiting the past
week.

Dr. and Mrs. J. F. Watt and Mrs.
Watt's father, E. L. Smith, left yes-

terday for a visit with Portland friends
and relatives.

William Cass, Donald Onthank and
Roger W. Moe have arrived from the
University of Oregon at Eugene to
spend the summer here.

The ladies of Canby Relief Corps
will meet for a social afternoon today
at the home of Mrs. Hammond, 1121

Fifth street, the Heights.
Mrs. Editii Tortier Weathered and

brother, Albert Tozier, both well
known in the state's journalistic cir-
cles, are camping near I)ee.

James Wishart has returned from
the Willamette .valley, where he has
again visited for the purpose of secur-
ing cows for his Upper Valley herds.

D. C. Eccles and N. O. Huey, of
Ogden, Utah, were here last week in-

specting the Oregon Lumber Co. inter- -

e8'B
The Mission circle of the tlaptist

church will meet with 1). B. Smith
today at 2 o'clock. The lesson will be
on home missions, by Mrs. Wm. Mon-

roe.
Miss Georgia Prather, who has been

attunding the University of Oregon at
Eugene, has returned to Bpeiul the
summer with her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Geo. T. Prather.

Great excitement was created at the
intersection of Oak and Fourth streets
yesti rdny when the steam roller of the
lie iaiice Construction Co., which is
lioiiH! I lie street work, turned on its
vide. No damage was done and the
huge maiiiine was soon righted.

The Cutler Sizing Machine will be on
demonstration next Saturday, June 21,
at the Union warehouse of the App!e
Growers' Association. Appointment,
for demonstrations at any later date
during the summer may be made oy
telephone to Culler Bros.

Unfortunately for the local dealers,
Howe & Ingalls, they failed to 'have
one of their Ford cars on "hand last
Saturday, when J. K. McGregor, of
Mosier, came to the city looking for
one of thete machines. Mr. McGregor
left for The Dalles hoping that he
might find a Ford there. Mr. and Mrs.
McGregor spent the first of the week
in Portland at the rose carnival.

Mrs. J. A. Epping is in Astoria this
week visiting relatives and attending
the commencement exercises of the
Astoria high school, where her daugh
ter. Miss Dorothy, is" a member of the
graduating class. Accompanied by
Miss Dorothy and Miss Betty, the lat-

ter of whom is also in Astoria in
school, Mrs. Epping will return home
Saturday.

Howard Bigger, a graduate of the
University of South Dakota, who has
been at O. A. C. at Corvallis for the
past year, was here last week visiting
his friend, C. C. Starring, of the local
experimental fetation. Mr. Bigger re-

turned to Corvallis for a camping outfit
with the intention of coming back here
and taking part in the strawberry har
vest. J. heelers, of the Ureal Nor
thern demonstration farms in North
Dakota, who'has been at O. A. C, was
also here visiting last week.

Miss Hazel Holmes, of Underwood,
Wash., is enjoying the pleasures inci-

dental to a sojourn in the land of pines
and txilsam. She is a guest ot Mrs. A.
A. Brubaker. The Harbor Springs,
Mich., Republican. Miss Holmes, who
has spent the pist several Bummers
here on her ranch in the Urderwood
section, owns a large tract of timber
land in the Michigan country, where
she will spend the summer disposing
of portions of it. The Harbor Sprints
country is an orchard.district and simi
lar in some respects to the Hood River
region.

Electric Theatre

The prorgam at the Electric theatre
today will be a two reel broncho drama
"Grey Sentinel ; lhanhouser drama,
"Barred From the Mails," ; Keystone
comedy, "Algy on the Force."

On Saturday The Marble Heart,
two reel Thanouser film, will be a

special feature.

Boarding Place for Children Wanted
1 desire to secure a place on ranch

for. my two children, a lxy and a girl,
aged 7 and B respectively, where they
can get plenty of eggs, fresh milk and
other wholesome food. I nil pay
month for each of them. Those having
such a place please address .

C. H. LEHMAN,
140." Yeon llldg.,

j2 Portland, Ore.

Row Boats for Rent

Knjoy an afternoon on the water in a
rowbout auiiing the coves north of the
O-- R. & N station. Boats may be
secured at the ollice of the Regulator
Line dock. Telephone 4532. j!9

Dr. J, Rdgington was in Cascade
Locks last .week on professional busi-
ness.

Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Combs were here
last week looking after their orchard
property.

Big reduction sale in all trimmed
hats. One-fourt- off on all block shaies.

Gibson Sisters.
Ben H. Cooper, of Corvallis, was

here the first of the week looking over
the valley.

Leave orders for Culling Cards ami
Special Stationery at Piter's Book Slore.

Dr. W. M. Mackenzie, of Spokane,
has been here looking atfer his Odell
ranch.

Mrs. Clara Wright, of Bucoda, Wn.,
arrived here last week to visit Hood
River friends.

Louis S. Fritz, deputy game warden,
of The Dalles, was here last week on
official duties.

E. C. Rogers, who had been to Port-
land for the- rose' festival, returned
here Saturday.

R. Van Hach, of San Rafael, Calif.,
was fide over the week end looking
ever the valley.

Miss Lurline Winchell spent the week
end in Portland, having gone down for
the rose festival.

Mrs. William Allen and son, "Bill",
were visitors at the rose festival in
Portland last week.

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Crown, of Mon-

mouth, Ore., were here last week look-

ing over the valley.
Judge C. U. Gantenbein, of Port-

land, came up over the week end to
look after his ranch.

Born To Mr. and Mrs. Frank Kollas
Thursday, June 12, at their home on
Summit, a daughter.

State Tax Assessor Galloway was
here last week visiting Jasper Wick-ha-

the local assessor.
Mrs. H. F. Davidson and Mrs. Wil- -

mer Sieg were in Portland last week
during the rose festival.

L. E. Patrick, of San Francisco, was
here last week visiting the family of
his cousin, J. A. bpping.

Mrs. Elizabeth Howell, of Sioux
City, la., is here spending a few weeks
with Mrs. J. 11. Oauarne.

E. S. Dobbin, who has been severely
ill at his home in the Odell district, is
reported to be improving.

Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Wilson, of Port
land, came up the latter part of last
week to look over the valley.

Miss Elsie Jones and Misses Myrtle
and Lily Fisher went down Saturday
to Portland to the rose festival.

J.H. Sutthoff. of Seattle, came down
Sunday to spend several days with his
family at their Oak Grove ranch.

Mrs. Truman Butler was in Portland
Tuesday evening to join Mr. Butler

Born To Mr. and Mrs. Gust Wester- -

burg at their home near Summit, on
Wednesdays June 11, a daughter.

Mrs. Mariorie Fouts, who has been
here for several weeks with her par
ents, returned to Portland last week.

Big reduction sale in all trimmed
hat. One-fourt- h off .in all block shapes.

- Gibson Sisters.

Mrs. C. H. Henney will leave this
week to join Mr. Henney in Portland.
Mr. Henney spent the week end here.

Mr. and Mrs. Mryon Smith, of Un

derwood, have returned to hlmira,
New York, where they will mane meir
home.

Mrs. A. D. Moe and two daughters,
Florence and Frances, and son, Mark,
spent Saturday In Portland at the rose
festival.

Ned Van Horn,-wh- has been attend-
ing the University of Washington, has
returned to. his home here lor the
summer.

Mr and Hh. J. B. Canfield, of St.
Louis, have arrived for a visit with

Ulr. Canfield's parents, Mr. and Mrs.
A. Canheld.'

Mrs. T B. Johnson, of Medicine Hat,
Alberta, and sister. Miss Grace Polk,
of Terrebone, are camping in the Up-

per Valley.
Mrs. Sherman Frank returned last

Friday evening from Portland, where
she had spent the week attending the
rose festival.

E. A. Taylor, of Portland, the city's
consulting engineer in the contsrection
of the municipal water system, was
here Tuesday.

W. P. Spriggs, of Portland, will
preach Sunday at 11 a. m. at the 1m
manuel church on the Heights. Sun
day school at 10 a. m.

Mrs. Elizabeth Raymond returned
home Friday evening after spending
several weeks with her daughter, Mrs.
Brune, at Granddalles.

A petiton has been filed by Stark &

Haslett asking mat uoraon nasneii,
who conducts a meat market at Odell,
be declared a bankrupt.

Geo. H. Sleinhoff, who recently ar
rived with his family from southern
California, where they ,pent the win
ter, has left for Seattle.

Mrs. Mabel Bretherton, who, has
y iW at the Cottage hos-

pital, has been removed to her home
and is now convalescing.

Arthur D. Dabney left Saturday for
Livingston, Mont., where he will meet
his brother. Cadet H. H. Dabney,
from West Point. They will visit rel-

atives and will go through Yellowstone
National park before returning home.

Mrs. W. E. Johnson and daughter,
Miss Ruth Johnson, of San Jose, Calif.,
where Miss Johnson is a teacher, have
arrived here to spend the next two
months visiting Mr. and Mrs. F. G.
Church at their country place on the
Belmont road jnst west of the Heights.

One of the recent attractions at the
Commercial club, a decorative feature
that every one notices is the elk's head
which has been placed in the main cor-

ridor over the registration desk. The
fine head js the property of Carl H.
Vaughan.

Miss Gretchen Hoerlcin, who has
been spending the past winter and
spring in Portland where she has been
attending Washington high school, re-

turned home last week to spend the
summer here with her mother and
brothers.

Freeman Mason, of the Oregon Agri-
cultural College at Corvallis, has ar-

rived here for the summer and will be
with V. Claude Thompson, who is ter-
racing and planting the "Little Boy
Ranch" trad of C. W. Parker at
Mitchell's Point west of the city.

At the Congregational church next
Sunday morning the service at 11

o'clock will be conducted by the chil-

dren in observance of children's Day.
A program will be rendered consisting
of songs and recitations by the chil-

dren and talks by Mr. tlazlett and
Miss Ollie Richards.

A. L. Lovett, of the Entyimilogy de-

partment of O. A. C, who spends a
portion of his time here studying insect
problems connected with Hood River
county's experiment station, advises
the orchardists to spray for co'llirg
moth. This is the second sprajni'for
this destructive insect.

J. W. Wallace will join ti e Oregon
veterans who will leave for the

reunion next Wednesday. Mr.
Wallace saw active service through the
war. He enlisted with the Rfth New
York Regiment nnd was transferred to
the Pennsylvania Reserve, Light Ar-

tillery.
Webster Kent is in Murshfield, where

he has the contract for painting a large
building, which is just Leing completed
by Joe M. Wright, formerly mayor of
this city, who has gone to the southern
Oregon coast city and is again in the
contracting and buliding business,

One of the beautiful places of the
valley at present is thut of Prof, and
Mrs. (J. 1). Ihompson on tne macadam
road one the West Side. Their lawns
are a mass of color and a riot of bloom-
ing roses and peonies. A large bonnet
of the latter flowers were used in dec
oration at the Hotel Oregon Sunday.

Services at the Unitarian church
Sunday are as usual, at 11 o'clock and
at 8 p. m. In the evening Mr. Mac- -

Donald will speak on "The Bible and
Higher Criticism." The musical and
literary program consists of a violin
duet by Mr. Newman and Dr. Sharp
and a reading by Miss Jewel Taylor.

N. P. Conway, formerly of White
Salmon, where he had charge of the
Apple Growers Union, has left for
Carlisle, Ky., where he contemplates
making his permanent horflfe. Mr.
Conway was called back on account of
the illness of his mother. He has been
residing in. Hood River for the past
tew months.

Mrs. Chas. T. Early left Monday for
Portland to join Mr. Early. They then
proceeded to Seaside 'to secure a cot-

tage, where Mrs. Early will spend the
heated months. Their son, Key in mid
B., who has been at hugene for the
ast week, will meet them in Portland
efore going to California,' where I e

has planned to attend college at Berk
eley.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry McCall. who
have been at Mrs. Alma Howe's place,
the Cottage Farm, have returned to
their home at Prineville. They are ex
pecting a visit from Mrs. McGall s
father, Thomas W. Lawson, in the near
future. Other recent visitors at Mrs.
Howe's have been Mrs. and Miss Rus
sell, Miss Josephine bunivan, Miss
Avery and Mrs. Graven, all of Port-
land.

Mr. and Mrs. Hermann O. Kresse
returned tc Jthia city lust Friday, after
having spent several days in Portland.
In order to avoid friends on a charivari
bent, they dec;dedto leave the train at
Ftuthton and to ride to the city by
automobile. An automobile from the
Fashion Stables met them. But the
wires were tapped, news of their plans
leaked out, and they were met also by
four other automobiles loaded with
friends.

Dr. R. D. Alexander, of St. Louis,
where he is chief surgeon at the hos
pital of the Iron Mountain and Missouri
Pacific railroad companies, arrived last
Friday to visit Mb ranch in the Centtal
Vale district. He was joined Monday
by his sister, Mrs. 1). G. Gibson, also
of St. Louis. They left for the east
yesterday. Dr. Alexander, who pur
chased his ranch here two years ago
from G. K. Hone, has made a Pacific
coast tour each year since then. He
expects to retire from his profession
after a few years and make his home
here.

John Castner was In The Dalles Sun-

day to play baseball with the Elks'
team, which on that day trimmed the
Eagles by a score of 5 to 0.

Prof. Reimer, who has'charge of the
southern Oregon experiment station,
was here last week visiting C. C. Star-
ring and inspecting the valley.

Mrs. Geo. W. Simons, of Portland, is
spending the summer here on the Si-

mons' Oak Grove ranch. She is joined
each week end by Mr. Simons.

Culver K. Osgood spent several days
in Portland last week, having journeyed
there to see the roses ami to partici-
pate in the carnival festivities.

W. E. Michael, of the Gibson Fruit
Co., of Chicago., was here last week.
Mr. Michael is making his annual tour
of the northwestern fruit districts.

Clifford Sifton, who has been attend-
ing the Boston Institute of Technology,
has returned to spend the summer here
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. W.
Sifton.

Miss Laura Ames, of Seatle, is here
visiting her college mate. Miss Lottie
Kinnaird. She and Miss Kinnaird were
in the University of Washintgon to-

gether. 2
Earl Cannon, who has been spending

the winter in southern- - California, re-

turned last week to spend the summer
here with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. L.
W. Cannon.

Dinner and supper will be served on
the lawn, corner of Fifth and Oak
streets, on July 4. Watch for menu
next week. Mrs. J. W. Dickinson and
Mrs. M. Wheeler.

Mrs. H. Boetzkes and daughter, Miss
Ottilie G. Boetzkes, from Seattle, will
come to Hood River Thursday to spend
the summer at their bungalow on the
nnch near Odell.

Miss Mary Knight has been in Port-ln- d

the past week visiting Miss Gene
vieve Butterfield. While in the Rose
City she was the honoree of a number
of pleasant social functions.

Rev. G. W. Kennedy presented mem
bers of the Glacier office force with a

number of boxes of luscious strawber-
ries last week. The fruit was grfiwn
on his ranch west of the city.

Big clearing sale at the Heights
greenhouse for one week, beginning
r ridav. June 20. hverything hair price.
25,000 spring (lower plants and plenty
of cabbage and tomato plants.'"

Miss Jennie Edgington left last
Thursday for Portland to attend the
rose festival. She will be in Salem
this week to attend the graduating ex
ercises of Willamette Univeristy.

The Laides' Aid of the Methodist
church will hold their monthly social
meeting at the home of Mrs. r . G.
Church Friday at 2:110 p. m. All ladies
of the church are cordially invited.

Silas H. Soule, who has been in Port
land undergoing treatment for his eyes,
has returned to the city. He was ac
companied by nis brotner, wno is in ine
musical instrument business in Port- -

and.
Little Miss Betty Jane Skinner,

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Skin- -'

ner. arrived last week lor a visit oi
several weeks with her uncle and aunt,
Dr. and Mrs. Malcolm Bronson, of this
city.

W. C. EPruitt, of Portland, was
here Monday to act as referee in the
case of H. C. Peters, vs. R. E. Robert
son, which involves a dispute over a
private road passing through the liti
gants property.

Miss Eva Brock, who has been at the
University of Oregon at Eugene, the
past year, and her sister, Miss Lillian
Brock, "who has been there visiting for
the past several, weeks, returned home
Tuesday evening.

E. R. Bradley left the first of the
week for Salem, where he will attend
the commencement exercises of Wil
lamette Univeisity, where his daugh-
ter. Miss Pearl Bradley, is a membtr
of the graduating class.

Mr. and Mrs.. Jonathan Bradley, of
Calgary, who have been spending the
winter and spring in southern Califor-
nia, spent several days last week at
th; homes of their nephews, b. R. anl
Willis Bradley, of this city.

Mr. and Mrs. J. O. McLaughlin have
left for Markle, Pa., where they will
spend the next few weeks visiting
with Mr. McLaughlin b lather, who is.

seriously ill. They will return over
the Canadian Pacific route.

Mr. and Mrs. C. R. Bone spent a
portion of last week in Portland at the
rose festival and visiting relatives.
Mr. Bone's mother and niece, who are
here visiting, remained over in Port-aln- d

to be with relatives there.
Illustrating an article in the Chris-

tian Science Monitor of May 24, the
title of which Good Roads lmproe
ment Progressing Rapidly," appears a
picture showing a macadajn road being
laid out in the liooa reiver valley.

But few of the first issues of tie
Glacier are In existence. One of these
is possessed by Bert Stranahan. "1
was in Portland, when the paper was
itarted," say Mr.. Stranahan. "The
people sent it to me, and 1 remember
how eagerly I used to read everything
cn its pages."

Big reduction sale on all trimmed
batt. One-fourt- h off on all block shapes

Gibson Sisters

A,,l,M,l,,.Hl-HH- l
BRIEF LOCAL MENTION

4"l 1 i..i..H..H"H"l"H-!"l"HH-H--

Butter Wrappers printed at this ollice
Buy your coal of Taft Transfer Co.

Shoes made or repaired at Joliusen's
For prompt delivery f coal, call Tafi

rausfer Co. fciotf

L. T. Bragg, of Colfax, Wash., is
here on business and visiting relatives.

If your shoes have gone wrong take
then to Johnsen.

F. W. Marsh, of Underwood, was a
business visitor in the city last Friday.

Coal or wood delivered on short no-

tice. Taft Transfer Co. f'JOtf

John Copper has returned from the
University of Washington at Seattle.

If you want shoes that don't go
wrong go to Johnsen'a.

Mis. Norman Tostevin left Monday
for Portland for a visit. '

Can deliver coal or wood promptly.
Taft Transfer Co. flUtf

Geo. R. Wilbur left Monday for Sa-

lem and Portland on legal business.
Order your Hressed Chicken for your

Sunday dinner at McGuire Bros. jlilt.
Peter Shively left Sunday aflernoon

for Portland to spend a few days with
friends.

Big reduction sale on all trimmed
hats. One-fourt- h off on all block shapes.

(iiUHon Sisters.
W. N. Newman and C. A. Thomson

were in The Dalles last week visiting
friends.

Chicken dinner 50 cents at the Hotel
Oregon from 11:30 to 2 o'clock Huu-da-

tf
Mr. Buff, of Spokane, arrived Tues-

day to look over his ranch property
h le.

Mrs. M. F. Shaw wa in The Dalles
last week spending several days with
friends.

The choicest 75x100 in Hood River,
corner 9th and Oak Streets, at a hargxin
if taken quick. Call W. J. Baker & Co.

V. J. Williams, of Geary, Ind., was
here the first of the week visiting
friends.

Better keep flies and mosquitoes out
than to "swat" them after thty're in.
Screen doorB and window screens at
Franz.

Frederick & Arnold, local builders,
recently submitted bids on the con-

struction of the high school at Camas,
Wash.

Dr. Brosius has resumed his practice
here, in his former ollices. He may be
reached night and day by telephone No.
1881,. ni8tf

Dr. M. H. Sharp was in Portland
last Friday and Saturday attending the
state convention of the Osteopathic
Association.

S1.000. S2.000 or $3,000 to loan on
improved income orchard land in
lower Hood River Valley. Roberts
& Simms. mmi

Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Bell spent the
latter" part of last week at Milwaukie,
visiting Mrs. Bell's sister, Mrs. Geo.
WisBinger, and ehildren.

Before ordering your "Burbank" and
"Vermont Gold Coin" Seed Potatoes,
vou had better call U.C. M. Ranch,
Phone Odell-33- mint!

A. R. Lindbur?. of Seattle, is here
spending sevei a days with the fan i y

of E. E. Stanton in the Oak Grove
community.

Attorney John Baker announces the
removal of his law office, from his former
location in the Smith Building, to bmte
16 Brosius Building, over ogt s clotl
ing stoie. Telephone 1723. jltf

Geo. R. Miller returned Sunday from
Portland to his UDDer Valley ranch.
Mr. Miller says that he does not know
when Cloud Cap Inn will be open for
visitors this year.

Anvone knowinz where William M

Trengove, who left Hood River about a
year ago, has gone, mnniy communicate

T Trunrrnvo r,9.i Sixth Street.mill a. iw.6., - .... . ;
Portland, Oregon. Ji

E O. Hair was in Goldendale last
week, where he had gone to submit
bids on the construction or aaamonai
pipe lines to the municipal water sys
tern there.

Just Received--- A fine assortment of

the famous Cranes Stationery. Pifer s

Book Store. J

Joe G. Vopt spent Sunday in The
Dalles with his parents. Mr. ana Mrs.
Frank Vogt.

Big clearing sale at the Heights
greenhouse for one ween. oegimnnK
Friday. June 20. Everything half price.
25,000 spring flower plants and plenty
or cabbage and tomato plants.

Mrs. W. R. Warner. Jr.. of Duffryn
Mawr. Pa., accompanied by her two
dajghters, Misses Klancbe ana jo war-np- r

arri vi Sunday for a visit with
her daughter. Miss Alberta, and her
son.W. R.Warner, III. at their Central
Vale home.

When going to Portland try a lat
ride on one of the D. P. A A.N. Co.'s
Regulator Line steamers, the Dalles
ritvnr the Bailev Gatzert. The latter

. makes daily round trips, except on Pun--

daya and Mondays. W hen m rortiana
return home on a boat np the scenic
Columbia.. Dock at footot Alder street.
Local phone 4532. m--

'TIS A FACT

I'LL FIT YOJ
OR NO PAY

You'll appreciate the clothes I make to your measure-THA- T

ELEGANCE. POPULAR PRICES.

SPAULDING'S TAILOR SHOP
Cleaning and Pressing Phone 1124

HOOD RIVER WHOLESALE NURSERIES

Sell Direct to Plantera At Wholesale Prices
We have a tint' lot of Hood 1 liver grown trees, including audi
varieties as Yellow Newtown, Spil.enburg, Ortloy, Delicious,
Jonathan, Winter Banana, etc., d'Anjou and Winter Nellis
Pears, Prunes, Peaches, Apricots and a general line of Nursery
Stock, at greatly reduced prices.

Strawberry Plants
II INTr.KKSTKD WKI I K

HOOD RIVER WHOLESALE

j


