
MEDFOBD MAIL TRIBUNE, MEDFORD, OREGON
THURSDAY. MAY 23. 1963

LEGAL NOTICESLEGAL NOTICES
TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU Or LAND
MANAGEMENT. MEDFORD DIS-
TRICT. Oral auction bids will be
received by the District Manager

""CREDIT EQUITY, INC.

Is a debt consolidation agency
licensed it banded by the State
of Oregon wllh the purpose of
planned debt reduction.

201 Medical Center BIdg.
33N1CENTR AL773-- 7 03

DRINKING YOUR PROBLEM?
Contact A A- Sun. 8 paThurs. 8 30, 404 Walnut

Ph.

at the timber sale room. Armory
Drive (mailing address 1133 S. Rl- -

Your Money's
Worth

By SYLVIA PORTER

Copyright, Hall Syndicif. Int.

erslde). Medford, Oregon, at 9 30
A M, on Thursday. June 13. IBttf,
for all timber designated for cut-
ting. Before bids are submitted,
full Information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and

NOTICE OK FINAL HEARING
In the Circuit Court ol the State

of Oregon for the County of
Jackson

In the Matter of the Etate of
Everett R. Sublette, deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

the undersigned has filed hut
Final Account as Administrator of
the above estate with the Circuit
Court of aaid County, and the
Court has iixed the 10th day of
June. 19c3, at the hour of 9:30 a.m.
of said day and the Court Room of
said Court in the County Court-
house in Medford. Oregon, as the
time and place respectively for the
hestriiig of objections, if any there
be, to the said Final Account and
you are hereby notified to file ob-

jections if any you have, to the
said Final Account on or before the
time fixed for hearing.

Dated this 9th day of May, 1963.
Donald K. Denman.
Administrator

submission of bids should be ob

KENNEDY'S JANUARY FORECASTS 'TRUE OR FALSE ?

I uiai fivt mnnthx SCO todav that President Kennedy

tained trom the Dulnct Manager.
The right is hereby reserved to re-

ject any or all bids and to waive
any technical defects in this
advertisement and to waive any
informality in bidi received when-
ever such waiver is in the inter-
est of the Untied Stntcs. IN JACK-
SON COUNT V. OtthGON: OiC:
All timber designated for cutting
on NW'iNE'i. NWl Sec. 17. T.
39 8.. R. 1 W.. Will Mer, estimated

submitted his 1963 Economic Report to Congress in which

AUTO INSURANCE PROBLEMS?
If age. driving record, un-

insured aceident financial re-

sponsibility filing, etc.. is making
if difficult for you to secure
proper insurance, see us. Con-

venient monthly installment. Don
Stathos Insuror. 1005 E Main.
Medford, Open Mon
tt fucs. 'till 0 p ni.

MERLE NORMAN Cosmetic Studio,
214 Fluhrer Bldg. 1 1

DENTURES repaired and "refined
while you wait Day or eve. Ph

25 Lozier Lane.
JACKSONVILLE DENTAL LAB

Dentures repaired w hile you wait

MALE HELP

l""COMMISSION" Salesman needed
Excellent opportunity. No can-

vassing S t r k 'S. 622 No.
Riverbide. ...

MEN Over 21 to train for in-

structors. Evenings 6 p.m. Apply
12 noon or 5 p m. Arthur Mur-

ray Dance Studio. 320 E Mam.
WANTED neat appearing married

man for Fuller Brush Route,
S1U5 per wk guaranteed to sidtta

MANAGER CAREER

OPPORTUNITY

We have a limited number of
openings for alert, ap.rei.siva
men interested in a secure man-
agement career with a reput-
able, national organization.

Experience is not necessary sines
vou will receive complete train-
ing on full salary plus all em-

ployee benefits.

If you are a high fcchool grad-
uate, some college preferred hut
not necessary, build your career
with one oi America's oldest, ex-

panding consumer finance com

panics.
Come In and talk to the man-
ager.

LOCAL LOAN CO.

s:ir Men lord Shopping Center

if - 'r S he made specific assumptions ana lorccasis oi me
r concern to all of us. How -- true or false-ar-

his assumptions and forecasts shaping up?
In view of the fact that, by this date last year, every

hall th white House economists had used to pre
for the purpose of this sale to be
1,522 M bd. fl. Douglas-li- 27 M
bd. ft. ponderosa pine. 11 M bd. ft.
incense cedar. 13 M bd. ft. white CLASSIFIEDpare 1962' Economic Report had been shattered to bits and

o bid for less tnan iia ou
PERSONA ANYONE having a drinking probthe stock maricel was on me eve ui ...a.- - .....

Here, therefore, is a Mayquestion.is more than a superficial
21 dissection of the five basic points in Kennedy s Jan. 21

blueprint. . ..... ... ,.....,
Lodge Notices -

Special Club Notices
Personal ,
Lost and Found

per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fi-
$18.30 per M bd ft. for the pon- -
deroia pine. $7.05 per M bd. ft. for
the incense-ceda- $4.05 per M
bd. ft. for the white fir. or a total
purchase price of $30,642.60. will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $3,100. All timber designated
for cutting on N'a, N'.jSWU.
NW',SE', Sec. 17, T. 33 S., R- X

W., Will Mer, estimated for the

Instructions(1) "I do not expect a imn postwar re """'"i"

3
3

5
10

- 11
-- - 12

13
1

15

lem ts welcome at me aieaiuru
Grouo of Acoholics Anonymous
8:30 pjn. Tues A Sat. rear
of 2P N Oakdale

Group every JTuesdajr
SPOT CASH for" old "coins. 772- -

2fl.sJLE vesi77 26782.
FLY ANYWHERE. Charter a plane

from Aviation Service, your Pi-

per Agency For charter, rental
oi Instruction. Nights

or

our progress in 1963 ... Wanted Male Help
Wanted Female Help
Male or Female Help

wf o'ro tar from beln In a recession. On the contrary, Wanted situations ....
Wanted Miscellaneous

iurpose oi inn sale 10 oe z.zoo m
id. ft. Douslat-flr- . 43 M bd. ft. pon Financial 6c Lanswe are heading into the 28th month of the 1961-6- 3 expan-

sion on a quickening upbeat. The whole economy has taken

on new life, records are being toppled on every side.
REAL ESTATEderosa pine, 10 M bd. ft. sugar

pine. 38 M bd. ft. incense-ceda- r.

No bid for less than $19.65 per M
bd. ft. for the Douglai-fir- . $22.30

AND FOUND
(2) "Prospects, taking into accoum u iii per hi do. ii. ior me ponaerosa

nine. $26.65 uer M bd. ft. for the

For Rent Houses - 20
For Rent Apartments . 21

For Bent Furnished Rooms 22
Rent Rooms and Board 23
For Rent Miscellaneous 24

Wanted To Rent 23
Medford Realty Beard 30

duction, lead to the projection oi a grow
FOUND Lady Medford Beauty

Salon at 32 N. Oakdale.
LOST Lady's white-gol- d wrist

watch. Reward. Mrs. T. J. Hart,
614 S. Central. Ph.

11 -- WANTED FEMALE HELP

KINDERGARTEN teacher for next
Fall Mornings only. Must be
active Christian. .

sugar pine, $8.33 per M bd. ft. forfor 1963 of $578 billion , . ."

Office Receptionist-Assis- t
Exnerience necessary. Sal

For sale Keai tsiaic ...

Business Opportunities
DR's

ant.
ary open. Tribune Box 3B80.wan tea neai ia

AD DIRECTORY ENROLL now for sewing classes.
Age trom 10 to 21. Contact Mrs.
Neil) at Singer Sewing Machine
Co. 318 E. Main

Way understated.
Our total output of goods and sarvices in 1963 is likely

to b. at least $7 billion above Kennedy's January esti-ma-

at least. It could be that In lha final quarter of this
will ba running wall abova

year. CNP in our country
$590 billion, approaching the $600 billion landmark. Every

type of spending Is now rising at a rata faster than the

Whit. House projected In January. This is happening with-

out "taking into account the proposed tax reduction.

(3) "I am proposing a major reduction in individual in

FOR SALE MISCELLANEOUS
Building Supplies SEARSAppliances
furniture

GARDEN
SPECIALScome tax rates . . . beginning July l...

LtVihO "00
' T T " " t .13 II

r f
i j Jm DIN MO WORKSHOP f

S
'

E. Hll TTTT T7TT EfL, WA'i I $

A k i uii m i r l r

I "
1 FAMILY BOOU - KITCHEN gCl

Musical Equip., Radio. TV 43

Sports and Hobbies 41
Miscellaneous -.. 45
Nurseries 46
Dogs and Pets , 50
Poultry 51

Livestock $2
Wanted Livestock
Hay. Grain and Feed 54
Fruits & Vceetables 55

WE PREPARE

MEN &. WOMEN For
CIVIL SERVICE

EXAMS

Over 18. No experience neces-r- v

r.rnmmar school education

Not a chance for July 1.

The odds are this session of Congress will pass a bill
substantial tax reductions to individuals and corporations,

BEGONIASu.. . u.. t.,1,, 1 onH nnt. with an eltcctive aaie oi juiy i.
37c

37c

22c

Automotive & EquipmentNor will the bill Congress passes be the one the President

submitted. Kennedy's January assumption for tax cuts Ea.GERANIUMS..
Machinery and Tractors

-- 61Logging Equipment .

Equipment For Rentboth in form and timing is in tne asncan.
(4) "Prices have been essentially stable for five years,

usuallv sufficient. Civil Service
jobs are permanent, no layoffs,
short hours, high pay. advanc- -
mcnt. Send name, home address,
directions, phone number and
time home. Write MARCEL CO.
Mail Tribune Box 2687.

ROSES.. Ea.TrailersThe out-
This has broken the inflationary psychology

PLAN NO. 3964 w look for stable prices is excellent . . .
139ft SQUARE FEET

Parts and Accessories 21
Cycles and Scooters ?2
Cars and Trucks - 73

UNCLASSIFIED COPY
Too Late to Classify A

MONDAY ONLY
Business Directory o

ine lnccnse-ccaa- r. or a loiai pur-
chase price of $46,069 60, will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $4,700. All timber designated
for cutting on S'iNE'i.SE'l.NW1.',,
E'iSWli, N'.'jSE','. SWUSEU Sec.
15: SWi, Sec. 27, T. 33 S., R. 3 W.,
Will Mer, estimated for the pur-
pose of thii sale to be 2,909 M bd.
ft. Douglas-fi- 18 M bd. ft. pon-
derosa pine, 52 M bd. ft. sugar
pine, 78 M bd ft, incense-ceda- 74
M bd ft. white fir. 14 M bd. ft.
western hemlock. No bid for less
than $16.30 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglai-fi- $22.45 per M bd. ft.
for the ponderosa pine, $31.60 per
M bd. ft. for the sugar pine, $5.70

M bd. ft. for the incense-ceda-rer per M bd. ft. for the white
fir. $5.85 per M bd. ft. for the
western hemlock, or a total pur-
chase price of $50,231.90, will he
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $5,100. All timber designated
for cutting on SEUSW'. SEU
Sec. 35. T. 34 R. 3 E.; SE'iNW",
NliSWU. SW'iSW'i Sec. 2. T. 35

S., It. 3 E., Will Mer, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
2.721 M bd. ft. Douglas-ri- 56 M
bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 4 M bd. ft.
sugar pine, 89 M bd. ft. incense-ceda- r,

135 M bd ft. white fir. No
bid for less than $20.00 per M
bd. ft. for the Douglas-fi- $30.70
per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa
pine, $38.10 per M bd. ft. for the
sugar pine, $9.75 per M bd. ft. for
the Incense-ceda- r. $5.55 per M bd.
ft. for the white fir. or a total
Eurchase price of $57,908.60, will

Minimum deposit
with bid $5,800. All timber desig-
nated for cutting on Lots 1. 2. Ac 3,
W'iiNE'i. SE'4NE'', E'.iNWU,
NE'.SW'i Sec. 7. T. 36 S.. R. 3

E., Will Mer, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 2.810 M bd.
ft. Douglas-fi- 23 M bd. ft. sugar
pine, 22 M bd. ft. Incense-ceda-

2.311 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid
for less than $19.10 per M bd. ft.
for the Douglas-fir- . $30.53 per M
bd. ft. for the sugar pine, $7.20
per M bd. ft. for the incense-ceda-

$2.90 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir. oi a total purchase price of
$57,413.95, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with hid S5.800.
IN JACKSON AND KLAMATH
COUNTIES, OREGON: All timber
designated for cutting on SE

NljNWU, SE'iNWU,
NW'.SE''. Sec. 13, T. 38 S., R. 3

E.; SEUNWV, NEVSWV, NW'i-SE-

SaSE4 sec. 19; EliSE1,

As of this da'le. Inflation Is In check. The modest increaseis4 MALE HELP

GOOD Mechanic wanted at once.

Sears has
PETUNIAS

SNAP DRAGONS
LOBELIAS

MARIGOLDS

In steel prices is not kicking on anomer .miowu.. -- h"
4 o a.m. to o p.m.

This Week's Plan for Home Builders Rather, this price hike was a neanny xning mu
ing to the strength in our economy. As in most years since

World War II, our cost of living measured by the consumer
,JL: .. ,n .hh In . new oeak in 1936. but the rate

Card of Thanks
OUR Heartfelt thanks to all whogarage door has been so lo

rice uiucA-n- iu ., , t- -cated to provide a storage
JUNIOR MERCHANTS

WANTED
for

of rise will be within the range of reasonaoie sxaouuy. in
arated from the water closet
by a partial wall with obscure
glass above. There is both a

shower and a tub with plumb-

ing in one wall to serve each.

extenaea comiorung ympouij
and help in our recent sorrow.
For the beautiful service, floral
offerings, and other kindnesses,
we are deeply grateful.

The Ravburn Family.

area on the outside garage
wall. flation could become a danger again u uu. ..v...,

into a major boom in 1964, but it Is not a danger now
Doz.

rnmnlete workins drawings for (5) "Price stability nas e ,hli:r"A second bath Is on tne 1 LODGE NOTICES
Jacksonville

Medford Gold Hill
While They Last!this plan can be purchased at a

tost of S7.9U for the first set And
$5 for each additional net when

to e lminate tne continuing .. -- -

naZLl balance of payments . . We cannot relax our
deficit still further . . .

to reduce the paymentsHieh windows In two of the

By HIAWATHA ESTES
Human nature being likely

to stay the same, a house will
probably be judged as much
lor its charm as lor its prac-

ticability. This home has a

generous measure of both
qualities.

The long, low exterior of
this house has been treated
with rich, rugged materials
to achieve a rustic ranch char-

acter. Used brick completely
frames the family room win-

dows and is also used In the

Rcames Chapter No. 66.
OES. Stated Communica-

tion, Thurs., May 23. 8:00

p.m. Election of Officers.
Nellie Dlvke. W. M.

ordered at tne same time, mis
plan will be available at these
prices unttl Sept. 12. Please allow
two to three weeks for delivery.
The following home plan hooks

Age 12 to 15
The Mail Tribune needs jr. Mer-
chant!! to deliver naoers in Jack-
sonville, Central Point and Med-

ford. Apply in person at Office or
phone

bedrooms provide more wall
space for furniture arrange-
ment and give privacy. A

wide wardrobe opens to each
bedroom and the front bed

Disappointing slow progress iieic.
The deficit in our balanc. of payments this Y- -he

difference between what w. earn abroad -- nd mperidabroac

probably b. larger than 1962's $2 billion. The

of gold from the U.S. well may be greater than in
CLUB EVENTS

are Biso avaiiaoie: naiimarK nunico
$1; Award Homes, $1; Town and
Country Homes, II; Homes for
Living, SI; Homes of Distinction,

1; Ranch and Modern Homes, $2.
All hnnki. s 17 value, onlv $5.

RUMMAGE SALE, Fehl Bldg.. Sat..
May 25, 9 to 5. Good clothing.

1962.
. .... r,irni lhl relentless threat to our kitchen ware, plants, first mein-odi-

Church Guild. SALESMAN KIRBY CO.
Commission.

room has the luxury of an ex-

tra closet.
Ellmete Partition

Sena an oraers ior euner pinnior hooks to: Hiawatha Estes. post dollar's value, but Kennedy's January projections will not RUMMAGE PLANTS (dahlias.
office box 404-- Northrldge, Calif. mums, ivy, etc.) iuui mag,iW. 6th, 9 a.m, - S p.m, - May

chimney and the two highly
appealing planters on each
side of the front bedroom.

' By eliminating the partition be ll,"r.',.. ha.ir. mints. Kennedy was too pessi-
between the living ana am

. Y"'!' "... -- IT" th.r. no 'ootlmistic. but the happy RUMMAGE sale. Cat Care Society,sec. i!3 BW'.nwUi swusiuSee. 29; N'.fcNEV. NWl'NW!'4
Sec. 33: SE'iNE'. Sec. 34: NV?- -ine rooms, you gain a muchNote the dramatic effect Thurs. & n.. May iwra oe

Fehl Bids.. 9 a.m. to 4 p.m. Any

SERVICE MANAGER

& MECHANICS
Applications are now being taken
for service manager & mechan-
ics, must furnish own tools &
references.

772-52-

ASK TOR BILL

Potluck Dinner Is

Planned by Bureau
larger looking area than you iK',4 sec. j 5, i. j ., it. 4 r..; one wishing to donate items mayachieved by extending the

steep gable root over these
nlnntera.

would usually expect in
that, overall, he erred on the side of caution not

ri.Jimi.rn balls are made to be broken, its far
mPore peasant". te breaking them the way we are in 1963

than the way we did in 1962

5 W ' INK ',4 O W IS W V4 Ofc 4

Sec. 15: Lot 4. SWSE'i Sec. 20: call 3 ior piCKup service,
RUMMAGE SALE: Frl. & Sat.. MayS ' i, N E ' i SEHNW'i, W'.jSW'ihouse of this size. Sliding

glass doors open from the liv 24 Be 25, 9 a.m. to 3 p.m.Corbels are located under A potluck dinner will be ate. zi; a'nw'4. rv'.io'a c. 2j;NE'lNE'i Sec. 23: N N W 'i. turn., toys ec misc. joo a. uv
dale.ing room to the paruauy LEGAL NOTICES SWUNW" Sec. 29; Lot 3, SW!',.the garage gable which pro

iects past the Wall of the ga NU'i, Sit'4JVW'4 oCC. SV, 1. J 8 H.,

held in the Central Point
Grange hall at 7 p.m. Friday,
May 24, sponsored by the

FARM
DEPARTMENT

LAWN FENCING
36" With 9Q.
Lino Post C Ft.

42" With 1.Una Post WW" Ft.

48" With i.n.
Line Post S Ft.

CHAIN LINK
FENCE

With Line Post & Top Rail

33" 7Sc fi.

42" 82c fl.

43" 92c fl.

COMPLETE
STOCK OF

FARM
FENCING

i K.l L,OtS 3. 4. EVjSW4 Sec
Lot 1. NE'iNW'i. NWSEV.rage. This, together with the

tapered barge rafter and dis frkf. Haircut at Medford BeautyJackson County Farm Bureau.
Scbooi. 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. inis
Sat., by Juniors, under supervi- -Coffee, milk and ice cream

SE4SE" Sec. 30. T. 38 S., R. fl

K., Will Mer. estimated for the
of this sale to be 31 M

Eurpose Doudas-fir- , 44 M bd. ft.
ponderosa pine, 11 M bd. ft. sugar
nine, 1 M bd. ft. incense-ceda-

sion. wo appointment neccKsaty,will be furnished, and those
attending should take table OPENING

MAIL TRIBUNE

CARRIER BOYS

wanted for Ashland and
Phoenix areas.

Call 772-614- 1

482-300- 2

433 M bd. it. white fir, 19 M bd.
Shasta red fir. 27 M bd. ft.

roofed patio.
As only cablnels and an

eating bar are used to separ-
ate the family room from the
kitchen, one area "lends"
space to another and proves
that careful planning works
wonders In the face of space
limits.

An offset In the oversized
garage 21' x 21' outside d-

imensionshas room for a fur-
nace and water healer with
enough space remaining for a

good sited workshop. The

Western white nine. No bid for

Driver of Armored

Car, Money Missing
Vancouver, B.C. -(-UPD- An

employee of the Loomis Ar-

mored Car Service Company
here Is missing along with
about $300,000 in cash.

Loomis officials report the
man made the last pickup for
Ihe company on Saturday
night with a partner.

According to police, the

NOTICE
No. 11378

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

PROBATE DIVISION
In the Matter ol the Esute

ot
CLAIR FRANK VARNEV. Dccefl'M

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
that Wanda Y. Crowl hai filed
her final accounting in the above
entitled estate and that the above
Court has fixed Monday, the 27th
dav of Mav. 1963, at the hour of
1 30 o'clock p.m. In the Circuit
Court in tne Court House of

OrcRon. as the Ume and place
for hearing of said final account
and for the aettlement thereof.

Dated and first published thla

MAY 25thless than $20. 30 per M bd. ft. for

tinctive garage door design,
enhances the overall appear-
ance of this charming home.
Protected Entry

The protected entry leads
directly to the living and fam-

ily rooms and the short bed-

room hall.
Today's bath requires less

care, offers more comfort and
beauty. This family bath has

twin lavatory which is sep

the Douglas-fi- $18.45 per M bd Old and new friends come and
for the Donderosa Dine. $17.40 enioy good food at our new

per Ai do. ii. ior ine sugar pine,
$8 30 ner M hd. ft. for the incense- -

restaurant on
EVANS CREEK

PETER & KETURA RIIS

service for guests.
In addition to a speaker

from the state office, Dairy
Princess candidates will each
give a brief talk and other
entertainment will be pro-
vided.

Members of the Josephine
County Farm Bureau have
been invited as well as fami-
lies of Dairy Princess con-

test entrants.

cedar $4.75 per M bd. ft. for the
white fir $7 40 per M bd. ft. for

FOR SALE Beauty Shop Dryerthe snasta red nr. $2.V2U per M
bd. ft. for the Western white nine.
or a total purchase price of MAN with small tractor w 'blade& cnair, rn. ojj-i.- a

eves.
$4,314 (!0. will be considered.

deposit with hid $300. STUDIO GIRL COSMETICS to smootn driveway, nt-na-

eves, after 6:30.two men then put the money,
which totaled $500,000 - of Classified Rates

25th day of April. 11G3
WANDA Y. CROWL
Administratrix

HAVILAND & CLINKINBEARD
Attorneys for Administratrix
1003 East Main Street
Medford, Oregon

rnan-- u

LlXLIES BEAUTY SHOP
123 Pine - Central
iu... nn..n a nav Weekwhich $200,000 was in checKs

Wanda & Myrtle "to Serve YouMinimum Size: Two LinesGrange News
Phoenix Grange

Open Eves bv Appointment
5

1 day per word..
NOTICE OF ELECTION

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

IN THE MATTER OF THE PRO-
POSED FORMATION OF THE

The public is invited to 'GINGER'i --J i

Bo

.15c
19c
20C

-- in the company's vault.
How the money was taken

from the vault is a mystery,
as far as the police are con-

cerned.
Tuesday the man's car was

found in a Richmond, B. C,
parking lot with a small
amount of cash and the $200,-00- 0

in checks

2 days per word
3 days per word...
5 days per word.- -
6 days per word...

view slides of the Columbus
Day storm at Phoenix Grange
at 8:30 p.m. Tuesday, May 28,

SAMS VALLEY IRRIGATION BRING IN A SKETCH
WE DO THE REST

DISTRICT
OWNER OF BEAUTY SALON at
880 Stewart Ave. Special person-
alized service. All work guaran-
teed Welcomes ladles with thin.

Jackson. Josephine and SiskiyouTo all electors within the above
nrniimed Irrigation district:during the literary program.

The pictures will be shown
counties

Rate Other Areas Per Word
8c Per Day

Pursuant to an order of the
above entitled court entered the
15th dav of Mav. 1963. VOU are

fine or oroDiem nair.
EVENING APPOINTMENTS

Closed Monday s
rn'MMFBrtAI. SPRAYING

preceding the regular meet
Police fear the man may herewith advised that there will

No problem here to find the plan
that best suits your needs. If you
don't find what you want in our
catilog, just bring in a rough
sketch. Our draftsmen will develop
it for you free of charge.

ing fur the benefit of h held within th boundaries oi Of all kinds, no iob too smallBy Line Per Month $3 00
Box Number Service Charce 50a

(Minimum Cash Ad 80c )

hove flown out of Vancouver
to the United States or East-- State license St City license.

W1THROW 8Several guests were present
at the Inst meeting. Tlio.se es-

corted to the master's station
cri'i Canada.

Police did not release the
man's name Immediately.

Reasonably Priced WE WILL ARRANGE FOR

the abova proposed irrigation dis-

trict an election to determine
whether or not that certain area
described more particularly in the
order defining boundaries on file
with the Jackson County Clerk
shall b formed Into an Irrigation
district with all the powers con-

ferred by the Irrigation District
Art. The noil In nlace for said

Talent 2 BR, Interior needs face
3 0LYOUR FINANCINGlifting probably like tc

choose vour own colors any

were Slate Overseer Koscoo
Roberts, and E, Ramsay, mas-

ter of Upper Applegate
Grange.

Whether vou choose to finance vourhow. City water, sewer and only home through t local source or usemr u c i. in- - w' tr

fiuslneis Directory
Each line par month...,,.... S2 35
Minimum per month $8 75

Dead Line on Classified Ads
5 :00 p.m. for following day.
except 10 am. for Monday;
for Sunday noon Saturday.
Dead Ltne on Display Classi-
fied Ads 10:00 a m. Saturday
for Sunday and Monday; 3 p.m.
the day before publication for
Tues. through Frl.

election Is designated as the Sams
Valley Grange Hall, which shall
he open for balloting between
8:00 o'clock a.m. and 8:00 o'clock

$4950.
Can We Help Anyone? will make all necessarr arrangements

t m the 2Sth dav nf June. 1963 Subdivide We'rt getting forthe financing of your home. BUILDING & L0AN3
many inquiries for acre or twoThere shall be further considered

the matter of election of three
directors for the proposed district.

This notice shall be oubltihed

Subscribers
To report imprinter or non-

delivery of the Mail Tribune in
Medford, phone 7 Ash-
land call at 418 Bridge or
phone Yreka. phone
Victory before 6:45 p m.
dally and 10.30 a m. Sunday,

If regular delivery arrives
shortly after ou call pleaie
notify office, thus eliminating
special messenger service.

homesttts. ui we oe WE DO THE HARD PART OF
a lad to help vou get the high.
est market price for your

Roberts conferred the first
and second degree work on
Mr. and Mrs. William Krugel,
also from Upper Appk-galc- .

Elected to become members
of Pl'oenlx Grange are Mr.
and Mrs. Bill Frooin, Jumcs
h, Jeroue and Mr. and Mrs.
Roscoe Owens.

Mervln lli.vson reported
that the slate agriculture

CONSTRUCTION
once a week for four consecutive
week prior to the date of elec-
tion. The date of first publication
nf thW notice la Mav 23. 1963. ARROW REALTY

trect the shell on the foun-
dation

a Apply the roofing
lostill the exterior doors,
wmdowt and interior partitions
Supply all oecessary lumber and

and the date of last publication It
APPKOVkD CRBD1T
CHARGES BILLED

BY THE LINK

Minimum Charce II 50
Roy H. Maudlin Rtallor 2j una ltwj.

E M. Madden.
Jackson County Clerk. Al Hit Blinktr Light In TaKnt

muiworic to complete

WE USE TOP QUALITY;;W -- -'

BUILDING MATERIALS
From top to bottom an IBC HOME offers you the finest in qualirr
materials, craftsmanship and construction available todayl

Tooley-Barne- tl

& Pflugrad, Inc.
Realtors

(42
S. Rirertidt

chairman wjs urging more
young people to Join the
Grange, and to consider a

nursery for those with young
children.

Charles Johnson said an es-

timate of about 20 per cent
of the Bartlett pear crop is

expected this year due to wea-

ther damage. Other types o(
pears have not suffered so

greatly.
Roberts reported on insur-

ance including cover-

age and benefit.
Mother's Day was the

Win --yz""' -- .a

f 3-B- D HOMEVw
Dsn nd utility room, firplac,II crt, city wtr and well, attached 1

If garag. Juil radacoratad. For tale by 1 1
II owner. I I
II 1176 Ro lan I I
U PRICED ONLY I I

w$13'700-0- 0

V 7736453
or 7nAS

"RESTRICTED AREA"

2 bedroom home on one- -

half acre. A quality horn m

in t nice district, local- -

ed in new home are. B
i 4.350.

WILL TRADE

2 bedroom home in Oak

Grove school district.
Consider trade for larg.

r horn.
$11,750

Iheme of the literary program.
There were readings by Mrs.
Charles Johnson and Bobby
Whiteside and a tableau by
Lecturer Mrs Lester Carr and
Mrs. Christine Dinsmore J Othar Hamas With Acrtage litate Acreage

Unimereee' Acreaee Ranches Motels Stl US NOW

...act as your own CONTRACTOR
. . . supervise the completion ... do the euy jobs yuunelf . . . it's jutlike paying you'ieif ;.?0 an hour for ihe work you do m your spare
bine,

VISIT OUR DISPLAY HOME TODAY!

AT 2816 DUELL AVE,
IBC H0MES-P- h. 772-972- 7

27 North fir - Suite 3

Arnold Pfluarad1

Marty 8arnelt ? Arthur Wallman

Your Own Business
Piolitiblt A M Z Rtnlal
Stort ffi Mtdferd. For Dtt.il.

Call 77 1474
r tnquirt at

till N RivrniH.

OPIN SUNDAY AT NOONCLOSED SATURDAYS

IRANIAN HOMELESS An old woman sits amidst ruins o(

har village In the louthern province of Khuzistan in Iran

aftar rain atorm and floods destroyed villajtos and crops.
Tht Inundation left more than 30 persons dead and thousands
homeless. (UP).


