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30 REALTORS12 MALE OR FEMALE HELP 24 For Rant Miscallanaout

fTORXef SPACE rorrent Med"
ford Fuel Court it MrAndrews

30 REALTORS
krlTH BATES. REALTOR

For result. aither sailing or
eKCnanalnaT your properly.
131 N Crap,.

OR RENT APARTMENTS
SMALL furn. apt., ideal forIT

no pets 81T W. 10th st.

fURN. Duplex, 1 bdrm. Water
Pd. 60. or

3 RMS. & Bath. Newly painted?
Good neighborhood. 3

aftci 8 pm. and week-en- ds.
ATTRACTIVE 3 rm. furn. Private

entrance. Close in. 531 Pfnn. a v .

LOVELY 1 bdrm., furn. util.; adults
t80. No. Grape.

1 BDRM. furn. apt. Electricity it

ONLY

REALTORS

Display This Emblem
YOUR ASSURANCE
of INTEGRITY and

RESPONSIBILITY

FOR SOUND REAL ESTATE
ADVICE See Your Local Realtor

WHERE TO BUILD?

Good building lots are carce
but we have a small number
for sale in Medford, in selective
locations with handy financing.
Also we can offer two 10
acre parcels with city water &

i,;i.'jble in Medford
City.

CALL:
Luetic Daniela
Bob Bauman

Bob Bauman Realty
233S Cratar Lake Avt.

9V LEARNS LE880N
D9 Molnu -t-ort- David Al

len Dtvti, 8, already knows
bout con men. David was on

his way to buy candy with a
dollar he got from his dad
when he met a boy who told
him "Hide your eyes and see
tf you can lind me money.'
When David opened his eyes
the boy and money were gone

IfOAl NOTICES

TIMBER TOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. MEDFORD DIS-

TRICT. Oral auction bids will be
rtttlved by the District Manager

t th timber tale room. Armory
Drive (mailing addreaa 1133 S.

Medford, Oregon, at 8:30
A.M. on Thursday. June 13. 13,
lor all tlmbar deilfnaled for cut-.i-

nfnr htd. are submitted.
full Information concerning the
timber, trie condition! of sale and
aubmixlon of bid. should be

from the District Manager.
The right ll hereby reierved to

any or all blda and to waive
IrTv technical defects In thla
advancement and to waive any
Informality In blda received when-ov-

such waiver la In the
the United statea. IN Jack-Io- n

COUNTY, OREGON: OftC!
All limber deilgnated for cutting
in NW'lNEli. NWU Sec. 17, T".

IS S., R. I W Will Mer, estimated
for the purpose of thla aale to be
J.SJJ M M. ft. Dougla.-fl- 27 M
M. ft. ponderoaa pine. 11 M bd. ft.
Incense-ceda- 63 M bd ft. while
fir. No bid for leaa than IS.30

M bd. ft. for tne uougias-nr- ,
Jar per M bd. ft. 'or the

pine, 7.5 per M M. ft. for
the Incenae-ceda- S4 OS per M

- , urhlt fir. or a total
urehas. price of S30.6t3.S0. will he

innildered. Minimum depoilt with
bid 3.1: AU timber designated
for cutting on N,. N(,swt4.
NWIibEU sec. I'. J
W Will Mer, estimated for the
purpose of thll aala to be S.288 M
Sd.K Douglaa-'l- 43 M bd. ft. pon-

deroaa Pine, 10 M bd. ft. aular
Ine. as M bd. ft. Incense-ceda-

No bid for lew than Sis.ss per
bd. ft. for the Douglaa-flr- . S22.30

per M bd. ft. for the ponaeroia
pine, 2t.5 per M bd. ft. tor the
augar pine, SJS per M bd. ft. for
me 1I1LCT...-V- 11. ui - w

-- .a ip- nf 111.060.60. W

considered. Minimum depoalt with
hid 14.700.' All timber designated
for cutting on S'aNE'i.SEUNW'i,
CSWu, N'jBE',. aw'4oe.',4

: SW'i fee. 17, T. ., .

Will Mer, estimated for the pur- -

of thla sale to be 2.809 M bd.
rviFiti-fir- . ig M bd. ft. pon- -

derosa pine, 52 M bd. ". sugar
Ine, 71 M bd ft. incense-ceda- 74

with the money you save 5

5 by finishing your own home

All Brokers are not Realtors
BC SURE. Deal with a

REALTOR

Attractive 3 Bdrm.
On 1 acre with rail fence.
Good location. mi. to Central
Point. Several out bldgi,
$16,900 Total, and worth the
asking price.
Bill Colley Real Estate
319 E- Pine Central Point

661.3311 or

jS Leaver

Whalin Really
I

I Dan Wnilin ..772-387- 9 V

Evelyn Crush .772-600- 6

gill Leavar ....772-669- 2

. Parsons 7

1 G. Honnold 2

Richardton..772-99S- S

NEEDS HELP
One of Mediord's most charm,
ing and best-ke- homes needs
you to make it complete. At

$21,000.00 you can't miss.
Your family will love its

lot, patio, 3 bedrooms &

2 baths.

COUNTftr CLUB
This 2 year old can do more
things than most. For less than
$20,000.00 you'll own 1350
square feet of pure joy includ-
ing family room, 3 bedroom &

Vi baths.

VIEW HOMESITES
Medford Schools Domestic
Water District Oak Trees
View of whole valley floor and
just a good Iron Shot from
the Country Club. Laroe 'A
acre lots. Prices start at $4,500

RIVER ESTATE
A most fantastic setting Fin-

est fishing riffle on the Rogue
15 Minutes from town 5

Bedroom home with separate
apartment and a Guest House

Private fishing Lake Soec- -

tacular outdoor Patio overlooks
Ihe river 8 Oak Covered
Acres.

FOR LEASE
SHOPPING CENTER LOT

Big Commercial Lot smack on
the middle of a busy Shopping
Center Corner Owner will
lease or build to suit. INTER.
ESTED? CALL US TODAY.

328 SOUTH CENTRAL

Ph. 1

CLARK J WALKER AGENCY
Call Ua To Usl Your Proparty

Rallabla Courtaoua Servlca
411 Kaat Main 171.S711

IfMNW REAL ESTATE"

on Wast Main
7734609

CLOSE IN FARM
30 acres, plenty Irrigation,
5 acre In pears, old ranch
home, good outbuildings, the
neceasery equipment Is includ-
ed. Only 3 miles from Medford
and priced at $43,000.
ROGUE RIVER AREA

Must sell 4 9R. home, one
acre, be the lucky family that
moves In this full baaement,
large roomed home, setting on
a choice irrig. piece of land,
close to Evans Creek. Good
terms, fast possesion.

ALSO
a 3 BR. 3'i acre dandy place
to live. It t a solid older home
that needs refurbishing. Could
sell building sites, close to
all water recreation. Beautiful
trees and all sprinkler irrig.
Terms can be arranged.
Call Larry McBee 4

LOYD WHITNEY, Realtor
Erma Jones, 4

Multiple Listing Service

. Phena- -

,,1

garDxge pa. mo s. iaatn a tier
P.M $45 mo.

FURN "apt. "3 rm. for couple. Util.
pd. Go! tiiii. Bja-ii-

apt., partly furn.. 343.
115 Oak st.. Central Point. Also

furn apt, 160 119 W.
Pine. Central Pt. Also, trailer sp.

3 BDRMS .. furn., upstairs., $407
Central Point. 5 7 .

LARGE downstairs
furnikhed apartment. 115 Mistle-
toe also
apartment

HOME-LIK- duplex available June
1, Fireplace, large airy kitchen.
2 bdrms.; garage, fenced patio;
water it garbage pd. Adults. No

CLEAN roomy nicely furn.
upstairs apt. for couple. Elec.
refrU & washer; garage; water
it garbage paid; no pets. $60.

furn. apt. tor I

NEAR shopping center furn. 1

bdrm. court, adults. 206
Hawthorne

FURN. Apt., utilities paid. $80.
aquiis. ai a ao. MQiiy. t it-- ou .

ATTRACTIVE 3 rm furn., very
ciean. nz'Uotio aiier o.

FURN. Bachelor apt. util pd. $89.50
ivieaiora riazm ap.

3 RM FURN. APT.
531 No. Holly

$30 Clean, lurn. Washer,
qryer; grounq level, rn. 77jouuu

2 BDRM apt nicely furn. Cloa, In.
util. posus w. Main.

UNFURN. 5 rm, hath, ground
lloor. garage Close in.
TURN Apta Wk or mo. 5179

Crater Lake Hwy.
NEW YORKSHIRE APTS.

83S Taylor
MODERN APTS. S35. S40, $50. Sea

Apt. 1. 108 O St.. Jacksonville.
KITCHENETTES

WEEKLY MONTHLY RATES
BEAR CREEK MOTEL

Weekly & Monthly Ratea
Oak Manor Motel.

VILLA ROGUE APTS.
1140 up.

K & C Motel-Apt- Wily ratea
Kitchens Util pd.

PARK TERRACE APTS.
Right in back of Medford Shop-
ping Center. 1 ee 2 bdrma.
Wwall carpets, appliances,
drapes, air conditioners, pool.Furn. or Unfurn. $95 to $120.
753 Stevens St.

22-- For Rent Furnished Reomi
SLEEPING Rms. Nice clou In.

HOME privileges. Employed lady.

23-R- ent Room and Board
BOARD & ROOM. CLOSE IN
GOOD FOOD,

Price Reduced0Wi A. view bldo, site, MO'
paved frontage, east Valley lo
cation. New price is $2650.
Owner needs cash, will consider
any reasonable offer. MLS No.
5528.
Close in, neat 2BR on paved st.
Good foundation, good roof,
new water heater and closet.
Fireplace. Drapes, oil stove, and
all paint for int. decor. A nice
home for only $7500.- -

Lfe-RE- ARROW REALTY
Madford Br. At Yaur Sarvlca

2 6 9

Choof Irani ovmrlOO plana! B
When you have completed your beautiful IBC Home,

youH find you paid yourself approximately $3.50 per hour "
for the work you did in your spare time. 5

What's more, you have the satisfaction of knowing
that your home built to your specifications

has been constructed of the highest quality, brand-nam- e gmaterials. Regardless of your income, there's an
IBC Home to fit your budget. Immediate and

complete financing available!

VISIT OUR DISPLAY HOMES T0DAY1 -

western hemlock. No bid for loss
than W0 lr M bd. for the
Douglas-fi- 922.45 per M bd. ft
far the nonderosa pine, 131. 60 per
M bd. ft. for the sugar pine, $5.70
mt M bd. ft. for the Incense-ceda-

fijO per M bd. ft, for the white
fir. fVflS per M bd. ft. for the
western hemlock, or a total

price of tso.23l.90. will be
considered. Minimum deposit with

$5,100. All Umber designated
Ur cutting on SE'iSW'i. SE'i
gee. 31, T. 34 .. R. 1 E.; SEUNW'i
WliSWn. SW''SW"'. See. 2. T. 35

- . I E.. Will Mer, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
l,T)l M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- 56 M
M. ft. ponderosa pine. 4 M bd. ft.

pine, BO M bd. ft. Incense-3a-

135 M bd ft. white fir. No
bid for lata than $20.00 per M
fed. ft. for the Douglas-fir- . 930.70

M bd, ft. for the ponderosa
Sne, $39.10 par M bd. ft. for the
sugar pine, $9.78 per M bd. ft. for
the Incense-ceda- $5.55 per M hd.
ft. for the white fir, or a total

refuse price of 957.908.80. willK considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $5,800. AU timber desig-
nated for cutting on Lots 1. 2, & 3,
WiNE, SE'iNEU. E'iNWU.
NTl.SW'i Sec. 7. T. 38 8.. R. 3

At 2816 DUELL AVE.
IBC HOMES - Phona 772-972- 7

27 No. Fir Suit 1

...,....r..,....,,.a.BI.aaS
Pleaae aend free literature J

Ibavnalot
M"

SEND
COUPON

for
2 FREE

Informa- -
tion and

Literatim
Addrtss.

MEDFORD
EMPLOYMENT SERVICE
Room 201 Executive Bldg.

218 E Main
OFFICE, Manager Permanent

position, qualified in complete
Dook Keeping procedures, secrc
tarlai it general office aimer-
vlsion Muni have had at least
3 yrs. employment In respondble or supervisory position. Ex.
cellent working conditions, in'
ciudiiiK reaular ncnetlts. Si
dependent on ability it expert
ence AoDlications should includi
recent photograph, complete
record of oast employment. All
replies confidential. Tribune
Box 2727.

SITUATIONS
YARD and garden work, call any.

lime.
PERMANENT resident want "ler

ical. sales, supervisory ware'
house, maintenance or other
position. Top references. Call
evenings

EXPERIENCED choker aetter de
sires job. Will go anywhere

CARPENTER experienced By
hour or contract.

SUMMER CHILD CARE
Medford Nursery School

Mrs. Ethel Tennant 7

rVANTED Housewashing. Interio
Local reft S1.25 nr.

RON IN G it Mending. Free pickupana aeuvery. i.

CHILD care, experienced, my own
iransporaiion. i

LAWNMOWING & Lona Grass cut
ting neage trimming, train
hauling KJDiey.

LAWN Ae Garden work, flower
beds. Have equipment.

IRONING your home or mine
JFree pickup j)elivery855-i&a- 6

EXPERIENCED Fry cook & broiler
man. Work in Medford area.
47u-4- uranta trast.

HOUSECLEANING, ironing, Refer- -
ences. i

ALL lawn mowers machine sharp,ened. pick up & del.
EXPERIENCED sitter. My home.

ivierriman Kd. 3

ROTO VATING LEVELING. ETC,
i uustom tractor worx.
WANTED Housecleaning by

nuurj reierences.
CUSTOM MADE SLIP COVERS
it DRAPES. 5

ROTOVATING gardens & lawns.
wait rippa, i id-- a uu

ALL typea carpenter work. Nojob
IOO small 7

TAILORING ALTERATION-S-

SERVICE REPAIR
Gold Hill area 0

CARPENTER work. Contract or
by nr.

PAINTING Reasonable. Nice
work 5 before 7:30 a.m.,
after 6 p.m GU Johnson.
LAWNMOWERS SHARPENED
26 Newtown

TRACTOR ROTOVATING
or 0

CUSTOM TRACTOR
flc GARDEN ROTOVATING

Earl Lenz
ODD jobs, carpenter, painting,

lawn, garden, hedge trimming.L. H. Lynch

14 Wanted Miscellanaoua
PENSIONER without car would

like board and room out on the
"Applegate" where he can do
some panning and trout fishing.
Must be reasonable. Tribune
box 32S3.

WALNUTS WANTED

CASH FOR FURNITURE
Misc. tools or anything salable.

Or will sell on consignment.
Red Barn Auction Co.

S. Hwy. 69
CALL US1 8

WE NEED FUBNITURE
USED PIANOS wanted. Will pay

Cash Ersklne's
WE BUVfurtC appliances it misc.
.

BEST CASH Of.AL for
Furniture Appliance MUc.

OAK GROVE FURN.
WANTED Volks Mlcrobus or

Kombl. Norge Laundry. 1660
Siskiyou. Ashland.

WE PAY
CASH FOR HOMES

TO BE MOVED
WESTWOOD HOUSEMOVING
it WRECKING CO. 0

CASH FOR FURNITURE.
Misc. tools or what have you

8 or 0

WANT BARKIE POLES
J H BAXTER it CO.

Box 30 Grants Pas. 8

15 FINANCIAL I LOANS
WANT to borrow $12,300, loan

secured by 1st mortgage on
$25,000 busineas property. Write
Tribune Box 3163.

REAL Eitate Loans available in
conservative amounts, install-
ment or straight. Competitiverates No appraisal fees. Quick
decision. W. E. "Gene" Thomas,
46 s Central. Park Free on lot in
rear of office.

WANT $7500 Real estate loan 6.Excellent property. Call 5

CASH' for contracts it mortgages.
r.j. oox ota, meoiora.

20-F- OR RENT HOUSES
LOOK Children accepted. This

uniurn. J onrm. in pi ex. uaroageit water pd. Carport it locker
rm. for storage. (2 block from
Sears hopping center it Park.
$ o0 mo. 832 Benne

1 BDRM. house furn. 558 W. Scenic
Ave., Central Point.
RM., unfurn. house. 2014 E. a

McAndrews.
NICE newly decorated 5 rm. house

A bath. Nice yard. Close in $t3.

BDRM house. 1600 S. Peach St.
For information call

- BDRM. "house 1130 Niantlc. Tor
information inquire at trailer
house 2562 JacksonvlUeHwy.

RENT furn. cabin. Rt. I. Box" 44,
Old Hwy. 98. Talent.

6r LEASE 3 bdrm. house. Central
Point.

NEWLY decorated 1 bdrm. house,
unfurn in Shady Cove. Suitable
(or I or 3 persons. See Red
Arrow Rlly.,

FOR RENT

1 Older house
FURNISHED
1018 So. Grape

WILL REDECORATE
Carport
Walrr Paid

$80 per mo.

Phone Days 773-48-

EARHART PARK CO.

3FibRM. unfurn. house it storage.
lnguir at U1W. McAndrev.

3 RDRM. house, 95? par mo. 327
Edwards

OWNER'S 3 Mrm. homT7of.ee
jn i. iiiu mo. o Janneyline

0NFURN T rm. older home Cor-n-

N. 1st it Manranlta. Central
Pt $60 nm 4.1M0 after p.m.

NICE clean 3 bdrm. house, fenced
hark yard, service porch, no ptcI.U9 Stewart

UNFURN. 2 bdrm.. efec range,
re frig wood heat, 938. 503 Al-
bert. 7733429,

WAITER H. JONES-S.R- .A.

tofautonal Real tttat
Appraise r Cniv(tant

72 Ctnrury Bldg.
Phone 772-44-

lEOAl NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING
In the Circuit Court of the State

of Oregon for the County of
Jackion

In the Matter of the Eatate of
Everett R. Sublette, deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

the underalgned ha filed hla
Final Account aa Administrator of
the above eatate with the Circuit
Court of aald County, and the
Court hna lixed the 10th day of
June. 10U3, at the hour of 9:30 a.m.
of aald day and the Court Room of
aald Court In the County Court,
houae in Medford. Oregon, aa the
time and place respectively for the
hearing of objectiona, if any there
be, to the laid Final Account and
you are hereby notified to file ob-

jection! tf any you have, to the
aaid Final Account on or before the
time fixed for hearing.

Dated thla Bth day of May. 1063.
Donald K. Denman,
Administrator

NOTICE OF HEARING UPON
FINAL ACCOUNT

NO. 11503
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

Probate Denartment
In the Matter of the Estate of

LYNN ETHEL HOWARD.
Deceaaed.

Notice la hereby given that
Clara Ethel McClung. executrix of
the Eatate of Lynn Ethel Howard,
Deceaaed haa filed in the Circuit
Court of the State of Oreeon for
Jackson County, her First and
Final Account as such executrix of
aaid estate, und the 27th day of
May, 1063 at the hour of 0:06
o'clock A.M. in the Courtroom of
the said Court at the Courthouse,
Medford. Jackson County. Oreeon.
has been fixed aa to the time and
place for hearing of objectiona to
aaid First and Final Account, and
all persons having objections
thereto are hereby reau red to
make or file the same on or be
fore said time.

DATED April 20,
Clara Ethel McClung,
Executrix

Robert D. Dames, Attorney '

Aledford, Oregon
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

File No.
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OK OHECiON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

In the Matter of the Estate of
UK.UKUE JT. oKAULCi,

Deceased
The undersigned, having been

appointed Administrator of the
above entitled estate by the Cir
cuit couri oi ine oi jacK-so-

State of Oregon, and having
qualified, notice la hereby given
to all persons having cjaims
against the aaid estate to present
mem at ine on ice oi ma under-
signed's Attorney at Fluhrer
Building, 5 S. Central, Medford,
Oregon, properly verified and
with proper voucher within six
(6) months from the date of the
first publication of this notice.
which is the 25th day of April,
1983.

' Ainert u Nelson
Admf nistrntnr

George W Rode '
Attorney at Law
Fluhrer Building .
5 S. Central
Medford. Oregon '

Classified Rates

Minimum Size." Two Lines

1 day per word.,.w 8o
3 daya per word.- - ...12c
3 days per word..,. ....ISC
S days per word.. 19c
0 days per 0c

Jackson. Josephine and Siskiyou
Counties

Rata Other Areas per Word
flc Per Day

By Una Per Month 93.00
Box Number Service Charge 500

(Minimum Cash Ad 8(ic)

Business Directory
Each Una per month ..92.25
Minimum per month 98.75
Dead Line on Classified Ada

p.m. for following day,
except 10 a.m. for Monday;
for Sunday noon Saturday.
Dead Line on Display Classi-
fied Ads 10:00 a m. Saturday
for Sunday and Monday; 3 p.m.
tha day before publication for
Tues. through Fri.

APPROVED CREDIT
CHARGES BILLED

BV THE LINK
Minimum Charge ......,.,.,..,..31.30

-L-ODGE NOTICES

Medford Lodge 103. AF
& AM. Stated Commu-
nication on Friday, May
18th at B P.M.

trvin Patten, WM

CLUB EVENTS
THE Zulel'ma temple Daughters

oi ine mie rstrm will noin a
rummage sale on Saturday, May
IBth at the Eagles' Hall, 217 W.
Main Street, Medford, during the
hours of 0 a.m. to 4 n.m.

LADIES Aux- uTPostiil Clerks an
nual rummage sale Friday, May
17th in Fehf Bldg.. i) to 4.

RUMMAGE SALE Saturday. May
1MI. 8 a m. 4 p.m., Fehl Bldg.,
108 N. Ivy, by ALCW of Ascen-
sion Lutheran Church.

THE Daughters of the Union Vet
erans oi the civil war. rummagesale at the Eagles Hall. Maynih. 9 a.m. to 4 p.m.

RUMMAGE Sale L.D.S. Church.
S ivy. May 17th 0 to fl.

3 PERSONAL
FREETM.ReufVZThis SaluTday

oy Hcginnrrs (Under hupcr-vlsio-

at Medford Beauty School
No auDOlntment iicceauirv.

cTeXn home for
ladies, reasonable price.

ANYONE witnessing 'accident he- -

iween ou vuiks. At .in Hcnault
at corner of Front it 6th St
please call

XFTER thla date. May 14. 10R31
win not ne rcinonti tile for i
debts other than my own. Luis
Medina. Ht. 2 Box 20.1C. Medford

STUDIO GIRL COSMETICS
Phone

LILtlES BEAUTY SHOP"
123 Pine - Central Pint
Now Onen 8 Dava a Week

Wanda Af Myrtle to Serve You
upon sves ny Appointment

CREDIT EQUITY, INC.

Is a debt consolidation agency
licensed A bonded by the State
of Oregon with the purpose of
uiiiuen nrni renticiion.

201 Merfit-n- t Center Bldg.
33 N. CENTRAL 3

'GINGER'"
OWNER OF BEAUTY SALON at
8B0 Stewart Ave. Special person-
alised service. AH work guaran-
teed Welcomes ladies with thin.
line nr prnoiem nur.

EVENING APPOINTMENTS
Closed Monriuva 17l.li--

Xtfr fiTTTi's i rA cep1( 6b le m s?
If age. drtvlnt record, un
intiureii accinrni financial
ponthiltty filing, etc. is makingIt difficult for vou to secure

proper insurance, see us. Con
venWm monthly installment. Don
msiintw insurer. iuu,i K Main,
Medford, Open Mon
AJTues. till 0 fm.

mi;rle norman Cosnistic aiwftSl
214 FluhrerRldg 1

5lNfURF.8 repaired and relihed
while uu watt Day or eve. pti

25 Loiier Lane.
TATft.SONWr.EnrvfAt.--TT- ni

Dentures repaired while you wait

"Brlnlting proh-le-
Is welctime at the Medford

Grouo of Acohohca Anonymous
Uta r T" fat. rear

Of 21 N Oakdale 77;t.4R49. Ah
Anon Group every Tuesday,

20-P- OR RINT HOUSES
OR FOR Lease 3 bdrm. home on

2 A- Nice garden 3c pasture. Rent
' iiiu. Ltaiv ior teas, oce at

2217 Kings Hwy., or call 9

FOR RENT Du Diex 1008 W. 9th.
2 bdrm. unfurn. Frlgtdairoranee d shwasher. d soosat. car
port, yard service, water 3c gar- -
page pa. ana mo, no pets.

rBDRM partly" furn. House. 013
wanranita.

NEW duplex. Range. dls.
posal; patio, carport it storage.
$fi0, waterpd.

furn. house. ga
rage, near scnooie ana snopping;
garbage pd.glOO. after 1

NEW 3 bdrm home for LEASE'
Fireplace, hardwood floors. I'.i.
bath Comer lot, paved sta.
rnoenix.

FOR RENT

3 Nevt duplex units
2 Bedroom
Wall to wall carpets
Electric range
Water paid.

$90 PER MO,
758 and 798 Oak St.

Phone
GABY CONRAD

899-15- 68 Nites
or

773-48- 65 Days

EASTSIDE house. 215 Van-
COUver

UNFURNISHED Small
house in rear. 350 month. 772-
8103

LOVELY bdrm. modern houae.
Beautiful Grounds; S70.
aiier o p.m. ana weex enas.

SMALL House, partly furn., $45.
i aq. nony.

FOR RENT 3 bdrm. Eaatside,
old; electric kitchen,
natin. Furn. or unfurn.

Available June 9th. Phone after
5,

NICE unfurn. l bdrm. duplex.
Or

SMALL 2 bdrm. Butte Falls Hwy.

FOR RENT June 1st. In Central
oini. nice narawooa

floors, carport or 3rd. bdrm.
water pd. older children OK.

3 or
MODERN COTTAGES

340. 2060 Table Rock Rd.
RM DUPLEX, west side, close
in $43.

2 BDRM UNFURN. $63.
1 or

MODERN unfurn. 2 - bdrm., no
doga. no a rinKers. win accept
a baby; $45 month. In rear. 2194
Camp Baker Rd.

SPARKLING clean unfurn. 3 bdrm.
aupiex: water pa., garage, uo.

NEWLY decorated, large den ic 2
bdrm. house $95 mo. Option to
buy. 360 Stewart Ave.
RM. house. 1106 W. 4th. Med
ford water, garbage pd. 664-v- J

31B.

UNFURN. 1 bdrm.. Jacksonville.
Gas range Be heat, 350.

JUST Painted 2 bdrm. unfurn.
Duplex alter 4 p.m,
or wk. endg.

CHOICE Central Point duplex,
large 2 bdrm. partly turn., sep-
arate garage, fenced yard, water
pa. foo. Available

SMALL houae. Partly furn. $33.

BDRM. furn. house. $49. In
Talent.

FURN. 8 rooms. 1 or 2 units. $50
mo. Available around June l.
Inq. Daniela Cafe. Phoenix.

BDRM. duplex. Carport. Water
pd. 55 mo.
'BDRM. house, 30. 2535 Chic-
ory Lane off Beajl Lane. 446- -
laia.
OR 3 bdrm. house. Furn. or

unfurn. 4005 S. Pacific Hwy.

4 RM. cot tag., furn., Westslde,
close in, comptt.ely redecorated,
adults, no drinkers, no pets.
References. $65. 772 9473.

WESTSIDE 2 bdrm. attached ga-
rage, plus separate garage it
work shop, $85. 6 days.eves

2 BDRM. unfurn. home, Medford.
Very nice, $85.

FOR RENT

OLD HOME
To party who

will repair it repaint
VERY LOW RENT

Phone days
773-486- 5

EARHART PARK CO.

new" 2 bdrm hmiio in TaUnt
built In oven it cool ine unit,
birch Kitchen, hardwood floors,
fireplace. $93.

CABINS - 8 W ETK & VP
1501 N. Rlvenldar it 2 BDRM. unfurn. duplex, far- -

.vara icrvice. 4 13 oK.
UNFURN. 1 bdrm. dunlsx with

garage H03 Withlngton 7

outtw unturn. aupiex. uaract.aso. 502 Palm.
BDRM. duplex. Range it refrig.,

21 -F-OR RENT APARTMENTS
Furn. $45. Adulti. 239 N

Oakdale.
CLEAN

except gat. No drinkers
CLEAN furn. $60. Adult.

528 N. Crape.
FURN. 2 or 3 rm. apt.. $40 & $50.

all uttlltiei pd., in Medford.
aiier a:30 p.m.

CLEAN. Furn. 2 rm. 935. Uttlitiea
paid. 1005 W. M aln.

FURN. upstairs clean, roomy. Uttf
pq. nu mo. ji ,i wa i

3 RM. furn. apt. $45. 546 Maple at.,
Central Point.

EXCEPTIONALLY NICE 3 rm.
apt., 714 King. Inquire 733

King. or
DUPLEX a bdrnv. range tk refrig..

carport. $83. Phone daya
night

NEWLY painted furn. upstairs
npi.. i oarm. iiij4 ueaarr Avt.

fter4 pm.
FURN APT., $33"!

1203 E. Main.
BACHELOR apt utilities pd . $38.

La.03E I" i 31L
CARC.E pleasant 3 rm& sleeping

ftorch, unfurn.. compact Youngs-ow- n

kitchen, service hall, ample
closets, storage. UtillUes pd..cenlral heat. Ideal for retired
couple, adults. 8th Holly.

LOVELY i rms. f, bath, new
convenient off street

parking 3 blocks from down
town Medford. Water, electricityA garbage pd. Adult $83.

9

I Reasonably Priced
Talent 2 BR. interior needs face
lifting probably like to
choose vour own colors any-
how. City water, sewer and only
$4950.

Can We Help Anyone?
Subdivide We're getting
many inquiries ior acre or two
nomesifes. Call us we'll be
glad to help you get the high
est market prke for your prop-
erty,

RED ARROW REALTY
Ray H. Maudlin K.alfar JJ3 U32
At tha llinkar, UjM iitTalint

DRINKING YOUR PROBLEM?
Contact A.A. Sun, 8
Thura. 8:30, 404 Walnut

Ph. 77C 12M
SPOT CASH for old colna. 772'

2839. Eves.
FLY ANYWHERE. Charter a plana

from Aviation Service, your Pi-

per Agency For charter, rental
or Instruction. Nights

AND FOUND
FOUND Ladles wrist watch,

owner lacnniy or pay lor aa.
310 N Bartlett. Apt 2

ENROLL now for sewing classes.
A ne from 10 to 31. Contact Mrs,
Neill at Singer Sewing Machine
CO. 318 g. Main.

WE PREPARE

MEN & WOMEN For
CIVIL SERVICE

EXAMS

Over lfl. No experience neces-
sary. Grammar school education
usually sufficient. Civil Service
Jobs are permanent, no layoffs,
short hours, high pay, advano
rnent. Send name, home address,
direction, phone number and
time home. Write MARCEL CO.
Mail Tribune Box 2687.

SAXOPHONE or Clarinet lessons,
beginners or advanced. Your
home.

PIANO beginners ages 7 to 10 or
anvanceo. o.io-- i i 1.

10 WANTED MALE HELP

WANT log truck to haul" ft. to
27 ft. logs. Steadyhaul. 9

CHAUFFEUR TO ARKANSAS

WANTED
"

EXPERIENCED

;
Men & Boys

'Clothing' Salesman

Many liberal Sears
..employee benefits.

40 hour, 5 day week.
a Strict promotion from within

organization.
Sears famous profit sharing

lsn.
ears (linens allowance.

Family hospitalization.
Life Insurance.
Paid vacation.
7 paid holidays each year.

APPLY IN PERSON
Personnel office 10 a.m. 3

SEARS ROEBUCK & &.
MEDFORD. ORE.

MANAGER CAREER

OPPORTUNITY

We have a limited number of
openings for alert, agresslve.men interested in a secure man-
agement career with a reput-
able, national organization.

Experience la not necessary since
you will receive complete train-
ing on full salary plus all em-

ployee benefits.

If you are a high school grad-
uate, some college preferred but
not necessary, build your career
with one of America's oldest, ex- -

panding consumer finance com
panies.
Come In and talk to the man-
ager.

LOCAL LOAN CO.

533 Medford Shopping Center
GRAPPLE 'Operator wanted. Must

be experienced. Tod wasea. 333.
W 5. H flcrS ji.m.

WANTED neat appearing married
man ior r uiier aruan kouic,
$105 per wk. guaranteed to start.

SERVICE MANAGER

& MECHANICS
Applications are now being taken
for service manager St mechan-
ics, must furnish own tools it
references.

772-52- 91

ASK FOR BILL

JUNIOR MERCHANTS-want- ed

for
GOLD HILL .

MEDFORD

Age 12 to 15
The Mail Tribune needs Jr. Mer-
chants to deliver papers In
Central Point and Medford.
Apply in person at Office Or 5
phone

ELECTRICIAN
3

with Oregon Journeyman At
Supervisor card. State experiencein call or letter.

Willamette Plywood Corp.
Aumsville, Oregon

1 Area Code 303

SALESMAN kTRSVecT

FITTER FOR FILING RST
sieady employment on nightshirt Call llapny Camp, Calif.
GYpsey iB a.m. toji p.m.
COMMISSION Salesman needed;
Excellent opportunity. No

S t r k a. 822 No.
Riverside

1 1 WANTED FEMAIE HE1P
WAITRESS wanted neat it. appear-

ance, apply In person 1016 N.
Riverside. North's Chuck Wagon.

DENTAL Assistant with experienceWrite qualifications to Tribune
Box 31B7.

ENROLL now for June 17th Class
at Medford Beauty School. Tui-
tion l'J25 wllh liberal discount
for cah. Come In and see ua at
3 W. Sixth St. it learn this fas-
cinating profession.

EXPERIENCED typist AcaiHtef
for ladies ready to wear store.
Reply, staling experience it
qualifications to Tribune Box
3143

Kitchen help. NeatTnTppe a ranee
Apply in person. 1018 N. River-
side Norths.

fULL or" part tin,eWall groomedwomen use l.urier Cosmetics
iSubatdary of We
need neat appearing salesladies
to introduce our tndlvidualiied
service Lutier sells itself. Ex-

perience unnecessary. Good
Comm. Call or

write Tribune Rnx 3 0i J

AIJ OR FEMAIIHEIP
WAnTKD Z Someone making

dally trio from Klamath rt.ii
to Medford in lata afternoon to
deliver mall parcel. Phone 773- -
5084 tit tvonlnaa

ft'K HAVE i openinta. One for
man or woman, comm plus bon-
us On for man. talarv of $103
per wk plus bonui. plu comm.
Apply 7 to I a m 6 to f p m
Watklnt Products Inc., 414
Stag rd So m

What is the most
you should know
before buying or

important fact

selling a home?
(Or any other real estate)

It is this:

Wot every
real estate firm
can display
this seal.

, raw

9- - Will Mer, estimated for the pur-,o-

of this sale to be 2,810 M bd.
ft. Deuflas-flr- , 33 M bd. ft. sugar

ine, 22 M bd, ft. Incense-ceda-

1.S1! M bd. ft, white fir. No bid
for less than $19.10 per M bd. ft.
for the Douglas-fi- $30.58 per M
pa. ii. tor ine sugar pine, f v
per in do. ii. J or me mcense-cena-

82.90 per M bd. ft. for the while
fir, or a total purchase price of
07.419.vd, win ne foniinertu.

Minimum deposit with bid 93.800.
IN JACKION AND KLAMATH
COUNTIES, OREGON: All timber
designated tor cutting on

SENW1,.
IslBKi'.ai Rtli I I. ill 0. II. at

I.J SE'iNW'i, NEUSWU. NWr,-fiS-

SVsSEU Sec. 1$; E'jSK'ilee. 2li SWUNWU. SWiSKU
Its. 29; N'.jNEU. NWViNWU

NE'V 8te. 31, T. 38 8.. R. 4 t

lac. 15i Lot 4. SW'iSE'i Sec. 20;
SNEV, 8ENWU. Wi.SW'i
See. 21: S,sNWl, NliSU Se("- - 23;
ME'.NE', Sec. 25; NliNW!',,8WV4NW'i See. 29; Lot 3. SWU- -
NSU. SE7Nwy ate. so, t. is b..

. I E.J Lots 3. 4. EWSW'.i Sec.
I9J Lot t, NEUNWU. NWU8EU.'

EU6E' Bee. 39. T. 39 ft., R. 8
fc Will Msr, etU mated tor the

of this sale to be 31' Mturposo DougUj.fir. 44 M bd. fl.
Mndarosa prne. 11 M bd. ft. sugar
ftne, l M bd. ft. Incansa-ceda-

133 M bd. ft. white fir, 19 M bd,
ft. Shasta red fir. 37 M hd. ft.
Western white pine, No bid for
less than 930,30 per M bd. (t. for
the Douglas'flr, 91B.45 per M nrl.
ft. for the ponderosa pine, 917.40

M bd. fl. for the sugar pine,BrSO per M bd. ft. for the Incense-eda- r
94.75 per M bd. ft. for the

white ftr. 7.40 per M bd. ft. lor
tKe Shut red fir. 923 20 per M
bd. ft. for the Western white pine,r a total purchase price of

4,814.00. will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid 9500.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR RIDH
EALED KOPOSALS ARE

and will hn received at the
fflea of the City Auditor of ihe
" oi uranis fass, Josephineunty, Oregon, to and until the
our of 2:00 o'clock, n m Mv 31

1943 for the construction of ap- -

treximately 1300" of 30" and 218"
line as authorised bythe Common Council and approved

by the Mayor, and the plana and
specifications prepared by the Cltv
Engineer, which plans and soeclfl- -
cation are on file and may be
examined at the office of the Cltv
Manager at the City Hall. Grants
rass, urvgon. ann in wnicn refer-
ence la hereby made.
fples of the plana, Specifications,to Bidders. Annrnxi.
mate Quantities, may he ohtatnrd
upon receipi oi jen (smmnWhich will be refunded Ir
ease a bonaflde htd is mad nrt
the plans and specifIra tiona art
riurno in gona ronaiiion.
Bids must be sealed and rilrH'tsw4

m the City Auditor of the City of
want pass. Oregon, and marked
"Sealed Pronosal for 30" and ah"
drainage Line" and must be prop
erty signco. oy ine person makingeven bid. All bids must be accom
panied ty a bid bond or certified
cnecK in ine sum oi ten (10 per

m oi ine amount nia as m guarante that the bidder will enter
Into a contract If award la made
U him.
AH bids must state the time In

i)fh all the work shall be enm- -

Iieted. The successful bidder
before entering upon hta

ejuties. rurrusn a good and suffl
elent bond in favor of Ihe City of
Grants Pass, in not less than One
Hundred (100 per cent of the
Contract Price, with surety to he
approved by the Common Council.
Tne Common Council reserves the
rtfht to reieet any and all bids
The Contract will be awarded to
ine lowest responsime bidder, sub-
ject to the limitations and condi-
tions herein contained.
All bids will be opened and pub
licly read by the City Manager at

;w r m may in. ittoj, i ne vny
Manager will prepare a tabulation

i n pins ann sunmn taia la nu
tation and recommendation for

ward of contract to the Common
council ai it next regular or pe-
els) meeting. The Common Coun-
cil will authorise) award of con-
tract.
IN WTTNEIf WHEREOF. I have
hereunto set my hand and affixed
the Corporate Seal nf the City of

renie rasa, josepnine county,
rtgon. on thla Utn day of May.

193.
Earl T. Rtmonson

' Auditor nf the City of
Ig Grants Pass, Oregon

1
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This seal tells you that the firm is
headed by one or more Realtors
men or women who are members of
the National Association of Real
Estate Boards and their local board
. . . and who subscribe to the profes-
sional standards of an established
code of ethics.

This means, if you wish to sell a
home or any other real estate, that a
Realtor will be able to tell you ac-

curately what it is likely to bring in

the current market. And to market
It for you as quickly as conditions
warrant, with a minimum of bother
to you.

If you want to buy any kind of real
estate, it means that a Realtor will

be able to find property for you
which suits your needs and pocket-book- .

We are Realtors, qualified to give
you experienced, skilled counsel
whether you are buying or selling
real estate. For further information
on how we can help you, call us.
No obligation of course.

MedfordWTribune


