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Sylvester Defends

Awarding of Contract
Washington iL'PD Pentagon

press chief Arthur Sylvester
said Wednesday that the Gen-
eral Dynamics Corporation's
financial troubles "no
bearine" on award nf fha rfic.

11, 19S3 0 5
20-F- OR RENT HOUSES
EASTSIDE 2 .1 hrirm H.ml....'

Gaa forced air heat Water St
garbnne pd No pets.

2 no KM uniurn. hoVseTTaienf
area $50. 2 children OK. 482.

T-- drSi mod er.n- - CCTAOtS"
$40 206u Table Rock Rd

UNFURN. hdrm duplex with
Barege 1103 Withington

FURN. bdrnf duplex. $70. nriults.10oOV. 13th. atter 5:15.
1 BDRM. FURN. HOUSE "

in MccUord. 6

OR LEASE Option "$123. Newer
uurrn. nonie, I'j oaths, builtm appliances dishwasher. 2341

Table Rock Rd. No
uiiqh. laiis.

SMALL bdrmr use"
lit

Medford. util. pdL$30.
FOR SALE 2 bdrm. house i'n goodcondition set) on easy term. 5ri

interest, small down pnyment or
will ene with option to buy.
Owner,, Itfll Spring Street.

NICE 2 bdrm. house. No drinkers.

1 & 2 BDRM. unfiirn. duplex,
service. 413 Oak.

FURN. "l "hdrm. duplex. $83 mo.
Adults.

2 BDRMR & Hen; Fenced"yird.
West idt. $113. after
3 and week ends.
IIDR M. Hlmiist ni'Wno"peta7$65T

FURN. nice rlean duplex. 2 bd'riiu
Close in

NEW 3 bdrm home, in Medford.
$100 pel Mo. Days or

Evetv
3BDRM unfiirn." house. B31 West

14th. Inql2B Cottage
ONE he'd rm elenn; unfurn House;Adults 9

FOR RENT Hdmr'furn. duplexin Gold Hill. $65 per mo., in-

cluding all lit I. 835; 1421.
BDRM unfurn. house. Also FurriT
apt. foi I 132 Almond.

5 BDRM. unfurn.. children & petswelcome. 125 S. Oakdale.

LEASE OR RENT Remodeled,
studio home, close in. dlnlnu
rm., living rm,, large fireplace,
large kitchen. 3 bdrms., bath,
patio, central heat, air condition,
smull lawn. Inquire Lusk Muslo
Co., 333 So. Riverside.
or coll alter 5:3U.

NEAT furnished house.
Adults

2 1 --FOR RENT APARTMENTS
FURN clean, uroiind Moor, prlvote. Oloae in. nil utilities furn,

except nil heat Refined couplaor Dingle man or lady. No
diinkcra. 123 Portland
Ave.

UNFURN" f bdrm. apt., for ainila
w uiui-r- nil lie, HI.

431 W. 4th.
FURN bdrm. pt. Water & Bar

ifte im. Washer & dryer, fl3,
lit N. tlth Central Point.

PARTLY'riifnT Rnchelor Apt. with
k n r h k c mornmga.Jacksonville.

BACllKLOR apt rm. & kitchen
Tiic. .mi umuics pa., mo mo.
14 S. narllcU.

t'UltNr lipitRirs, roomy, utilities
pel M0 ndulta only.

NICE 3 rm. furn ground floor
lululLs. S6S. 603 N. llnrtlctt.

COMPACT, convenient."" heatedl
furn., adults. 330 N. Holly. 773
4736 or afternoons.

Stmmi heat. Util, pd. 943.

ATTRACTIVE, spHclous unfurn.
not. Complete compact Youngstown kitchen, aim deck, Iota ot
closets and storage. Utilities pdAdults Ideal for retired couple.ulk. from library. Phone
7 7 3-- 4 375

LOVEI.Y 3 rm. apta. Alto alaep-In- a
rms. All util. nd.

MODERN APTfT$3o. 467s56. See?
Apt. 1. 108 Q St.. Jacksonville.

K it C Motef-Ap- t Wkty rates
Kitchens Util pd. 1

MTC"E warm 3 rm. close in. ."(

LEGAL NOTICES

timber designated for cutting on
Lot 12. SWUSEW. Sec. 30, Lots 1.
2. 3. 6. 7. 8. 11 andl2. N'SE',Sec. 31, T. 32 S.. K. 3 W.; N E
NW', Sec. 7. SE'4NW'4. SW",-NE'-

Sec. 31. E'iSE1,. Sec. 33, T.
33 S.. R. 3 WJ NWi.SEV Sec. 15,
T. 34 S.. R. 3 Wn Will Mer. esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 108 M bd, ft. Douglas-fir- .
4 M bd. ft. white fir. 3 M bd, ft.
Incense-ceda- r No bid for less than
$20 05 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-
-fir. $5.25 per M bd. ft. for the
white fir. $9.10 per M bd. ft. for
the incense-ceda- or a total pur-
chase price of $2,231.90. will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $250. All timber designated for
cutting on SKUSWU,
Sec. 19. SWUNW't, SW' Sec. 29,
SE'4 Sec. 30, T. 39 S., R. 4 W.,
Will Mer, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 1.509 M bd
ft. Douglas-fir- . Ill M bd. ft, pon-
derosa pine. 50 M bd ft. migar
pine. 74 M bd. rt. white fir. 56 M
bd. ft. incense-ceda- No bid lor
less than $20.45 per M bd. ft. for
the Douglas-fir- . $26 25 per M bd.
ft. for the ponderosa pine. $22 13
per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine.
$5.90 per M bd ft for the white
fir. $10.15 per M bd. ft. for the
incense-ceda- or a total purchase
price of $33,885.30, will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid
$3,600.

PUBLIC AUCTION
BUILDINGS

April 17, 19G3, at 10:00 A.M.
The Oregon State Highway Com-
mission will offer for sale at
oral public auction ihe former
Vanderwood-Van'- s Motel & Cafe,
located at 5000 Hwv 99, South.
Ashland. Oregon. The sale will
he held on the premises on April
17. 1963, at 10:00 A.M.:

Motel building 2rxtD3 Office
building Wxl5 Cafe building
31'x36', with misc. cafe equip-
ment, including combination

e A: refrigerator. 2,500
gal. water tank, gasoline tanks,neon cafe sign, and water pump.
(File No. :i4S84i

BUILDINGS WILL BE OPEN FOR
INSPECTION AT 9:00 A.M. THE
DAY OF THE SALE
BUILDINGS MUST BE REMOVED
ON OR BEFORE MAY 25. 1U63.
TERMS OF SALE: Cash or check
at the time of sale. The buildingsto be sold to the highest bidder at
oral public auction With the State
reserving the right to accept or
reject any or all bids. All of the
bid price must accompany the
oin. aAL,t; nu. na.
INFORMATION: Propertv Mana-
ger. 506 Slate Highway Building.
Salem, Oregon.
For information regarding move-
ment of these buildings on State
Highways, contact District Main-
tenance Sunermtendcnt. State
Highway Dept.. Medford. Oregon.Phone prior to date of
sale.
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NOTICES
COOKED FOOD SALE by

Olive Rehekah Lodge No. 28
SEARS STORE. APRIL 12 Ac 13

Friday 6 p.m. to 0 p.m.
Sat,., 10 a m. to 5 p.nu

Medford Lodge No. 103.
A F. & A M. One FC
degree on Friday, April
12th al 7:;i0 p.m.

Irvin Patten. WM.

Reames Chapter Ot'SJul Stated meeting Thursdiiv.
April II, 8:00 P.M. lniti- -

ation.
Nellie Dyke. W.M.

- I'iniiuiii Clonics, DCUtUPnA Rite. Thursday. April 11.
aWuat p.m Maund:

HQB 7 hursday nhsei vanci1ST Hall oi Central PointV No 1.1.". AFAcAM,
Central Pt.. Orcg. Speak- -

c ..i. diu, naipn i. .wuore.
33". PGM

Fred A Purdin, Secretary.

LARGE 2

STORY HOME
Rooms planned for gracioui
country living Beautiful Urge
yard. Stage Rd. So.

TWO-FAMIL- Y

HOME

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS as hereinafter designatedwill be received by the District
manager. Bureau of Land Manage-ment. BLM Warehouse Area, Arm-
ory Drive, Medford. Oregon (Mail-
ing address 1133 S Riverside), at
9.30 A.M.. PACIFIC DAYLIGHT
TIME, on Thursday. May 9, 1963.
for all timber marked or designat-
ed for cutting. Before bids arc
submitted, f nil information eon.
cernlng the timber, the conditions
of sale and submission of bids
should be obtained from the above
District Manager. The right is
hereby reserved to waive technical
defects in this advertisement and
to reject any or all bids. The
United States reserves the right to
waive any informality in bids re
ceived whenever such waiver is in
the interest of the United States.
in ! u hMi.N KLAMATH
COUNTIES. OREGON: OiC: All
timber designated for cutting on
EUSE1, Sec. 25. T. 38 S.. R. 4 B.J
Lots 3 & 4. SW'.NEU, SENNW'i
BUSWU.WW SEU Sec. 30. Lots

& 2, NE',NW, sec. 31. T. 38
S., R. 5 E., Will Mer, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
1.822 M bd. ft. Douelas-fi- K23 M
bd. ft. ponderosa pine. 1.023 M
bd. ft. sugar pine. 220 M bd. ft
Incense-ceda- 2.312 M bd. ft
white fir No bid for loss than
S21 20 per M bd, ft. for the

$29.80 per M bd ft. forthe nondcrosa niti SM iff nir m
bd. ft. for the sugar pine. $9.70
per M bd ft. for the incense-ceda-

$4.85 per M bd. ft. for the
white fir. or a total purchase priceof $104.728 55 will bo considered.
Minimum deposit with bid $10."no
IN JACKSON COUNTY: All tim-
ber designated for cutting on
S'.NE'i. SE' Sec. 23, W'j Sec.
2.. NE' Sec. 35, T. 38 S., R. 3 E
Will Mer, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 69 M bd.ft.
Douglas-fir- . 3 M bd. ft. ponderosa
pine. 26 M bd, ft. sugar pine. 8 M
bd. ft. incense-ceda- 519 M bd.
ft white fir No bid for less than
S18.85 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-
-fir. $32.13 per M bd. ft. for the
ponderosa pine. $32.25 per M bd.
ft. for the sugar pine, $8.10 per M
bd. ft. for the incense-ceda- $3.45
per M bd. ft. for the white fir. or
a totBl purchase price of S4.090.95
will be considered. Minimum de-
posit with bid $450. All timber
designated for cutting on SW,- -

t';Bfc', ec. 23, NE',,NEUNW'i, S'jNW4 Sec. 33. T.
38 s R. 3 E., Will Mer. estimat-
ed for the purpose of this sale to
be 5 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- . 310 M
bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less
than $19.40 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fir- . $4.60 per M bd. ft. for
the white fir. or a total purchase
price of $1 523.00. will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid
$200. All timber designated for
cuiung on loi z, sec. 30 T. 38 S
R. 3 E., Will Mer, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 26
M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- 5 M bd. fl.
ponderosa pine. 9 M bd. ft. while
fir. No bid for less than $22 90
per M hd ft. for the Douglas-fi- r
$31.50 per M bd. ft. for the pon-
derosa pine. $5.40 per M bd. ft.
for the white fir. or a total pur-chase price of $80!.50. will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $100. All timber designated for
cutting on S ' NE j,, N'aSE'jSEUSEU Sec. 8. T. 34 8., R. 2 ..,
Will Mer, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 2,520 M bd.
ft. Douglas-fi- 3 M bd, ft. ponde-rosa pine. 304 M bd. ft. Incense-reda-

205 M bd. ft. white fir, 2!)
M bd. ft. western hemlock. No
bid for less than $2 ,20 per M
bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- . $32 25
per M b:l ft. for the ponderosanine. $10.20 per M bd. ft. for the
Incense-ceda- $6.15 per M bd. ft.
for the white fir. $10.10 per M
bd. ft. for the western hemlock,or a total purchase price of
$58,728.70, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid $5,900.
All timber designated for cuttingon SW4NE'4. SENW',. SW'..W'.SE' Sec. 33. T. 32 S., R. 2 E.J
Lot 1, Sec. 5. T. 33 S., It. 2 E.,
Will Mer. estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 166 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fi- 7 M bd. fl. sugar pine.M bd. ft. Incense-ceda- 43 M
hd. ft. white fir. No bid for less
than $21.05 per M bd. ft. for tho
Douglas-fi- $38.40 per M bd. ft.
for the sugar Dine. $10.35 per M
bd. ft. for the Incense-ceda- $5.25
per M bd. ft for the white fir, or
a total purchase price of $3,999.20,
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid $400. All timber
designated for cutting on SW'i-NE'-

S'jNWVi. N'jSE'i. NW.
SE'4 Sec. 18. T. 33 S.. R. 1 W.,
Will Mer. estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 66 M bd.
ft. Douglas-fir- . 42 M bd. ft. pon-
derosa pine. 143 M bd. ft. sugar
pine, 5 M bd. ft. Incense-ceda-

No bid for less than $20.90 per M
bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- . S27.70
per M bd ft. for the ponderosa
pine, $29.50 per M bd. ft. for the
sugar pine, $9.55 per M bd. ft. for
the incense-ceda- or a total pur-
chase price of $19,244.55. will be
considered Minimum deposit with
bid $2,000. All timber designated
for cutting on SW',, SW'aSE1
Ser. 5. T. 33 R. 2 W Will Mer,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1.3G2 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- .

75 M bd. ft. sugar pine, 48 M
bd. ft. Incense-ceda- 28 M bd. ft.
white fir. 15 M bd. ft. western
hemlock. No bid for less than
S21.75 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-

-fir. $34.00 per M bd. ft. for
ihe sugar pine. $11.40 per M hd, ft.
for the Incense-ceda- $6.70 per M
bd. ft. for the white fir. $9.55 per
M hd. ft. for the western hemlock,
or a total purchase price of

will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $3,400. All
limber designated for cutting on
S'3NW4. SW',, W4SE'4 Sec. 25.
T. 33 B R. 4 W Will Mer. esti-
mated lor the purpose of this sale
to be 4.920 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- .
147 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 377
M hd. ft. sugar pine. 310 M bd. ft.
Incense-ceda- 157 M bd, ft. white
fir, 4 M bd. ft. western hemlock.
No bid for less than $20.50 per M
bd. fl. for the Douglas-fir- . $26.50
per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa
pine, $30.75 per M bd. ft. lor the
sugar pine. $9.03 per M bd. ft.
for the Incense-ccda- $6.05 per M
bd. ft. focthe white fir, $8 85 per
M bd ft. for the western hemlock,
or a total purchase price of

will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $12,100. All
timber designated for cutting on
SWUNW'i Sec. 29, SWSNE'i,
NW',. NijSW', NW'4SE', Sec.
19. T. 34 S.. R. 4 W.. Will Mer.
stimatrd for the purpose of this

sale to be 93 M hd. ft. Douglas-fir- .
14 M bd ft. ponderosa pine, 19
M bd. ft. sugar pine. 2 M bd. ft.
Incense cedar No bid for lews
than $1!).70 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fi- r $26.25 per M hd. ft. for
the ponderosa pine. $25.05 per M
bd. ft. for the sugar pine. $6.93
per M bd ft. for the incense-ceda-

or a total purchase price of
S2.689.45. will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $300. All

service Warehouse. 1319 E
Road. Medford. Ores,Tuesday, April 23. 1963. start., c

tSflSS? ,0:0 A M Thi sale
r.rlvft ",0" rader. pickups,panels. 4x4's. I , ton
""r"ij t se?an' a Kasoline engine.

""gators. Insnec- -Hon u
0 4:00 P.M April 19 and 22 andbefore the sale time. 10:00 A MWJ 1JV1083. full payment of ac

3.00 P.M. on date of sale Payment
fV rf ",3de bv money order

l'I !,f';d or c"Weri check, or
draft, payable to Forest Serv-ic- e

USDA. Personal checks or cashcannot be accepted. Full informa-tion available al the Supervisor s
Office. Rogue River National For-
est. Room 315. Post Office Build-
ing. Medford, Oregon.

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

ioftTC00UNTGO-NFORJACK-JOA-

MAY F1TZPATRICK.
Plaintiff.

GAROLD WESLEY FITZPA TRICK

T GAROLD WESLEDY'eFdITZ.'
PATRICK, the above named De-
fendant:

N THE NAME OF THE STATEr i ou arc herein
uq !Xred to aPPear and answerthe Complaint filed against you inthe above entitled suit withinfour weeks of the date of thefirst publication of this Summon-.-an-

if you fail so to appear andanswer for want thereof, thePlaintiff will apply to the Courtor the relief demanded in her
Complaint, For a Decree
IV .hls Court forever dissolving-ui-

bonds of matrimony heretoforeand now existing between Plain-tiff and Defendant, and grantingPlaintiff a divorce from Defend-
ant; and that Plaintiff be award-
ed the care, custody and controlof your minor children; that theDefendant be ordered to pav tothe Clerk of the Circuit Court ofJackson County for the accountof the Plaintiff the sum of $75 00
per month per child for the care
support udn maintenance of saidminor children of the parties; thatthe Plaintiff be awarded the 1953
Chevrolet. Admiral refrigerator.
Viking sewing machine, miscel-
laneous household goods and fur-
nishings and that the Defendant
-- y i'.iu u 10471 iii.eriiauonai
pickup; that the Defendant be re- -
t.untu iu pHy ine sum ot 9940 .00
as lump sum alimonv and thatthe Defendant be required to pavthe Kiim rif 'nn on .. .i, m .,

tiff s attorney fees herpin nlns
costs of suit. The date of theOrder for Publication of this Sum- -

prescribed for the publication of

for four consecutive weeks; the
date of the first publication of
this Summons is April 11. 1963

RONALD L RICKET1S
Attorney for Plaintiff
Post Office Address:
1003 East Main Street
Medford. Oregon

No. M85
CITATION

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY PROBATE DE-
PARTMENT

In the Matter of the Applicationor
JOHN CARPENTER and FRANCES
MAE CARPENTER, for themselves,and on behalf of Donald Carpen-
ter, infant, asking for leave to
change their names.
TO ALL PERSONS INTERESTED

AND WHOMSOEVER MAY BE
CONCERNED:
You. and each of you. are here-

by cited and required to appearin thu Cir.-.i- fnt.i-- t i...
Court House in Medford. Jackson
county. Oregon, on the 22d dav
of April. 1963. at the hour of
1:30 o'clock P.M., and then and
there show r;insr if nnv Ihnr H

Why the apDlication of John Car- -
penter and Frances Mae Carpenter,to change their names to that of
John Williams Branch IV and

change the name of their child to

granted and allowed in all things.
10th day of April. 1963.

EDWARD C. KELLY
Circuit Judge

No. 10323
NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL

ACCOUNT
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY PROBATE DE-
PARTMENT

In the matter of the Estate
of

CORA MOORE, deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN

that the undersigned has filed hit,
Final Account as administrator
with will annexed of the estate
of Cora Moore, deceased, with
the Circuit Court of Jackson
County. Oregon, and that said
Court has set the 13th day of
May, 1963. at the hour of 10:00
o'clock in the forenoon of said
day in the Circuit Courtroom of
the Courthouse Building. Medford,
Jackson County. Oregon, as the
lime and place for hearing ob-

jections thereto and the settle-
ment thereof.

DATED AND FIRST PUBLISH-
ED this llth day of April. 1963.

A. E. Piazza. Administrator
with Will Annexed.

Harbison and Piazza
Attorneys for Administrator

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS as hereinafter designated
will be received by the District
Manager, Bureau of Land Manage-
ment. BLM Warehouse area. Arm-
ory Drive. Medford, Oregon (mail-
ing address 1133 S. Riverside), at
0:30 A.M., PACIFIC DAYLIGHT
TIME, on Thursday. May 9. 1963.
for all timber marked or designat-
ed for rutting. Before hlds arc
submitted, full information con-

cerning the timber, the conditions
of sale and submission of bids
should be obtained from the above
District Manager. The right is
hereby reserved to waive technical
defects in this advertisement and
to reject any or all bids. The
United States reserves the right to
waive any informality in bids re-
ceived whenever such waiver is in
the interest of the United States.
IN JACKSON COUNTY. ORKGON:
O&C AND P.D.: All timber desig-
nated for cutting on Nl7. N'jS1-- .

Sec. 13. T. 37 S.. R. E.; SW',-NE'-

SE'4.SW'...W',SE,. Sec. 7.
NE ' (NE'i, Sec. 18. T. 37 S.. R. 'i
.., Will Mer. estimated for the

purpose nt this sale to be 2.960 M
bd ft. Douglas-fir- . 1.324 M bd. ft.
pondcrosa pine. 40 M bd. ft.
nse-cedar. 4 M bd. ft white fir.
No bid for less than $19 90 per M
bd ft, for the Douglas-fir- , $22 25

per M bd ft for the ponderosa
pine. 9.05 per M bd ft. for the
incense-ceda- J3 70 per M bd. ft
for the white fir. or a total pur-
chase price of J88.739.80. will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $8,900

puted TFX fighter plane con-
tract.

The assistant defense secre-tar-

for public affairs told a
newsman that the company's
earnings record had "abso-
lutely nothing to do" with the
decision to give the contract
to General Dynamics instead
of Boeing Co.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Notice is hereby given that I

have been appointed bv the Cir-
cuit Court ot the State of Oregonfor Jackson County Executrix of
the Will of Alexander H. Smith, de-
ceased, and have qualified. All per-sons having claims against theestate of said decedent are herebv
notified to present them, with
proper vouchers, duly verified tome at the office of Skyrman &
Heisel, attorneys for said Execu-
trix, at Room 321 Medical Center
Building, in Medford. Oregon,within six months from the dale
of this notice.

Dated and first published March
21, 1963.

Ruby M. Burton
Executrix

Skyrman & Heisel
Attorneys for Executrix

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
In the Circuit Court of the State

of Oregon for Jackson CountyIn the Matter of the Estate or
Bernice C. Kunzman, Deceased.
Notice is hereby given that I

have been appointed as executrix
of the above estate bv order of
the Circuit Court, and have quali-fied. All persons having claims
against said estate are notified to
present the same, duly verified,and with proper vouchers, to myoffice at 246 East Tenth Street
Medford. Oregon, within six
months from the date of publica-tion of this notice.

Dated and first published this4th day of April. 1963.
Jeanette Marshall
Executrix

THOSJ.HIGHT!':
22 NO. bl tinCENTRAL

LET'S TALK TURKEY!

We expect this bargain to
be "gobbled up" quickly. 2

newly redecorated 2 B.R.

homes on lot. Fireplaces.
Outside finish combed cedar
shakes awnings. Excellent
rental property $15,500.

THE CADILLAC OF HOMES

A few of the advantages in
this beautiful floor home:
exceptional heating system-a- ir

electronically filtered,
making it dust and pollen
free refrigerated cool-

ness for hot summers 3
B.R. 3 baths with ultra
modern fixtures family
room covered patio a
host of other fine features
that must be seen to be ap-

preciated.

COUNTRY HOME 9.4 A.

260 ft. frontage each side
of Little Applegate water
right. Some cultivated
some wooded. 2 B.R. home,
2 baths, den, sundeck and
patio overlooking river.
WILL TRADE for Medford
home or duplex.

WALTER H. JONES S.R.A.
Professional Real Estate

Appraiser Consultant
72 Century Bldg.

Phone 3

Gas Pumps Store
In heart of busy community,
ideal setup; sotck can
be purchased; big store build-

ing and repair shop; $10,000
cash required, balance contract,
consider trades.

Money Making Dairy Setup
Good home; $20,000 down.

3 Acres; Modern 3 Bedroom
Near Talent, fine for beef;
horses, and kids, $1 1,950.

--fe.RED ARROW REALTY

Roy H. Maudlin, Talent,
Smiley Jones, Medford,

UNSPLIT-R- ED FIR

LOG ENDS
Big Double$1050 load. Clean

No taik

EAGLE WOOD CO

Phono 826-408- 1

TELEPHONE SOLICITORS
To phone from home for in-
surance appointment Hourlyrate. Only experienced women
need apply,

CALL MR. CARPENTER

773-756- 1 Ext. 102

12 MALI OR FEMALE HELP
MEN & Women over 21 to trainfor instructors. Evening 6

12 noon or 3 p.m.
Alur...M1urr8y Dance Studio.
320 E, Mai n

3 LICENSED Salesmen 2 homes
3 hutinesa. 1 ranches. Write Real
Estate, P.O. Box 5,Medford.

MEDFORD
EMPLOYMENT SERVICE
Room 201 Executive Bldg.

316 E Main

1 SITUATIONS
TRUCKING service, rubblih. hay,

furniture lor (3.30 per hour.

RETIRED PoliceTnanoTTieeda
job to supplement income. Han-
dy with tools, painting, etc. Con-
sider anything. write
P.O. Box TH3 Central Point.

EXPERIENCED Waitress nee"dl
steady employment. Call

BABY Silting, my home. Talent",

WANTED Houiecieanlng by
hour; references.

HOUSEWORK T cleaning bv the
hr.Jlroning.viiur home.

CARPENTRY Cabinet woTiT
Finest. No added coat.

Christian standards.
WM. B. POWELL

IRONING"!
or

ironing Mending, Fret pickupdelivcr
BULLDOZER work, clearing, lev.

elliug, Road construction or iog.
King. Lew ujnrcy,

Ironing and mending, Good
work. 7734488,

EXPERIENCED woman baby sit-
ter 30c hr.. plus transportation.
Goodreferences. 77280201

ROTO v AT l N g fardeni & lawna.
Walt Fipps,

CUSTOM MAMTSLIP COVERS
& DRAPES.

ROTO V ATI NG LEVELING, ETC.
Custom tractorwork

CUSTOM TRACTOR''
& GARDEN ROTOVATING

Earl Lenj "
HOUSE CLEANING A: Ironing
References

YARD clean up. mowing, hedge
trimming, tilling. Call early

TRACTOR ROTOVATI N H
or

LAWNMOWERS SHARPENED
'' newiown

6ABY SITTING - My h 6Tn a.
reiicca yarn.
ROTOVAfE YOURG ROUND
ready for planting

FOUNDATIONS, remodeling, 'new
aaaiuons urcpiacei. utle I fin-
ancing

WANTED TRACTOR WORK
Large Rotuvator. Gardens, yardsblade. E. M. Garwood.

LAWN Mowera machine aharp- -
cucu. ricis up tv ueuvery.

LAWN mowing, hedge trimming,
HBhlhauling R'Ply.

CARPENTER" work; "Contract of
oy nr.

TAILORING ALTERATIONS
j.l?:a"5:AXL types carpenter workNo'lob

too tmsll
PAINTING ReaaoiiaHle. Nice

work before 7:30 a.m..
jiftet 6 p.m Gi) Johnson.

CUSTOM BUILDING St REPAIR.
ReterencM 470-4- 1 0B

ODD JOBS, carpenter, lawn, Gar-
den Pruning. L. H. Lynch

MlKilUrnoui
WANT used rafrleafalor for trail

cr, no more than 34" wide with
noor open.

WANTKD 'VolKawafan trailar hitch

GOOD Horse Trailer for 2 horsed
Phone eves..

WANTED Pickup, leas than
1300. Evenings. 028 Loiter Lane.

WANT a studio piano

CALL USI 8

WE NEED FURNITURE

kvmmm WW

I LIKE IT!!!
Look at the nice soft carpets
on Ihe floor for me to play on.
It has lots of nice things that
mom and dad like too. There
are j baths, 3 bedrooms,
built-i- oven and range and
much more. It's new too; and
only $450 down, Oh yes, I'll go
to Wilson school when get
big.

ROOSEVILT SCHOOL
3 BR home near Roosevelt and
Hcdrick schools. Built-i- dish-

washer, new roof, beautifully
landscaped, even a playhouse
for the kids. We'd love to show
it to you.

HILLCRIST
A really outstanding Eastside
home near the Country Club.
It is in excellent condition and
features 3 bedrooms, 2 Vz baths,
party room and much, much
more. If you are looking for a

truly comfortable home, be
sure and call on this one.

SURURIAN
I00V200' tot, beautiful trees
surround this outstanding 3BR,

Va bath home. Call now to
see it.

PfVI ACRIS
Good building sites, irrigated.
(1,500 down, bal. $60 per mo.

DORAN
REAL ESTATE

311 SO. RIVERSIDE

Multiple Inline Service
W, gy, lulM, Ml and Trade

Phone 779-24- 1 1

r 0

Jan. Smith

Tad Dow 772424
ill Karr 772 44.

Mvlet Doran. Realtor, 2

CLUB EVENTS

FOOD SALE

FBI, !;30 to 4 p,m,
Penney s Dept. Store

by Seventh-Da- Adventist
Church Ladies

PLANT & SHRUB SALE
Sat., April 13. 9 a.m. to S p.m.

NORTON MKT PARKING LOT
rtmt,ll. la A HUt. N LLl'H

'GINGER'
Wishes to announce she will

hold over those
EASTER EXTRAS

Until they are all gone. Ph. now
for your appointment .

EVENING APPOINTMENTS
Closed Mrmia,vt

SPOT CASH for old coins."772
2B59. Eves.

WANTED Good con valorem c;irc
for elderly lady. Your home.
Medford Vicinity. 4821803.

NOTICE!

COMMERCIAL SPRAYING
of all kinds. No job too

little. WITHROW
SPECIAL NOTICE Gospel Meet- -

niK now in progress eacn eve
7:30, W. Main at Chestnut
Everyone invited. No collec-
tions. Wonderful vocal music
Free transportation.
DRINKING YOUR PROBLEM?

Contact A. A. Sun. 8 p.m.Thurs. 8:30. 404 Walnut
Ph. 6

ANYONE having a drinking prob-
lem if welcome at the Medford
Group of Acoholics Anonymous8:30 p.m. Tues. & Sat. rear
of 2T' N Oakdale. Al- -
Anon Group every Tuesday.

TAX REPORTS. Cleo Canoose, 55
Ross Court. For day or eve. ap-
pointments phone Same
location since 1941.

DENTURES repaired and felined
while you wait. Day or eve. Ph.

25 Lozier Lane,
INCOME tax service. Cecelia

243N.
lFYOU are Elderly wewouldlike

you to live with us At be at
homo & feel at home call

AUTO INSURANCE PROBLEMS?
If age. driving record, un-
insured accident financial re-

sponsibility filing, etc.. is makingit difficult for you to aecure
proper insurance, see us. Con-
venient monthly installment. Don
Stathos Insuror. 1003 E. Main,
Medford, Open Mon.
& Tues. till 9 p. 111.

MERLE NORMAN Cosmetic Studio.
214 Fluhrer Bldg, 1

SPACE available at Lyn Haven
Home for man or woman, by the
day, week or month.

DRESS upfor Easter with a new
hairdo. Permanents $8.50 & up.

CALL MARGARET

TALENT BEAUTY SALON
JACKSONVILLE DENTAL LAB

Dentures repaired while you wait
9

CREDIT EQUITY, INC
is a debt consolidating agency
licensed Ac bonded by the State
of Oregon with the purpose of
planned debt reduction.

201 Medical Center Bldg.
33 N, Central 773-71-

Open Free Classen Supplies
FERRIS WHEEL CERAMICS

2475 Sttwart 6

Eastside
COIN LAUNDRY

9 Hawthorne St.
Open 24, hrs. day

CERAMICS Instruction in Cer
amic porcelain china paint-
ing underglazo glasa lamina-
tion Ooen Tues.. Wed. At Thurs.

iui w. main.

10 WANTED MALE HELP

INSURANCE INSPECTOR
National company needs trainee
in Med lord. Pro tor 2 yrs. col-
lege. Automobile A ability to
type necessary. No over-nig-

traveling or selling. Salary,
bonus, auto expense, & group
insurance. Call Mr. Taylor,or write P.O. Box 23a,
E u gje ne ,p rc.

WANTED Service Salesman, sell'
A: repair vacuum cleaners. Hour-
ly wage plus bonus. Apply Starkh,
(522N. .

ONE SALESMAN needed. It has
been proven that our methods A
epnini. schedule gives salesmen
excellent steady earnings. Apply
Starks. 622 N. Rlveralde.

HERRIED
REAL ESTATE

SINCE 1929

1 King Si. 773-746- 4

GREAT VIEW

One of the Iruly beautiful view
locations in the valley. Spacious
4 bedroom home, very large liv- -

mg room witn pancica tirepiacc
Larrje dining room and

kitchen Oil forced air heatmq
$yste This lovely home with
appro
can be yours for $22,000 Also

modern cottage adjoining main
home suitable for " or
rental residence included in to-

tal price of $26,950 with good

Home are really lellinq in Cas-

cade Village! $50 down to Vttl
$450 down H A, no extra costs
to move in. Take a look at these
fine 3 bedroom homes.

PRIVACY AND POTENTIAL

See (his 160 acres with many
lovely homes. tes. A near new 2

oedroom home with loads of'
closets & storage, designed for

easy expansion. Landscaped yard
has hundreds of bulbs, flowers,
shrubs and trees. Year round
stream through property A well

priced package at $37,500.

Now it the time to buy your
buildinq lot or view property.
Call us, wc have many fine lots
and acreages and can arrange
everything from terms through,
construction of your new home.

If you want a productive ranch
with a fine home, see this 144
acres with brand new 8 room
anch home Also a second 5

bedroom home, Grade A bam,
2 large hay barns 99 Acres of

irrigated pasture. Priced with a'l
equipment and hay.

Exclusive Agents For

-

. 10 WANTED MALE HELP
MAN OR woman for Watkins

route $103 wk. guarantee if youcan qualify. From 8 to 9 a.m.
and from 6 to 7 p.m. 1414 StageRd South. Med lord.

SALES
I NEED 2

Neat appearing Men
to assist in my insurance busi-
ness. Take advantage of top
training to prepare vou for top
earning in this rapidly develop-
ing field. Top commissions. Ap-
pointments furnished.

also have an opening for
man who can assume manage-ment responsibilities. You owe
it to yourself to come in and
investigate this unlimited

For confidential In-

terview phone
MR. CARPENTER.

7737561 Ext. 102

Salesmen Wanted
Jackson-Josephi- ne Co

Leading A & H Company
run or rm lime

o Experience Not Necessary
o Must be over 21 yr. & have

car,

o Hichest commissions A Company
pousored medical program.
For personal Interview

215 Leverette Bldg,
9:30 AM.-- A.M.

Benafletal Insurance Group

Experienced Body Man

In Chevrolet, Oldimobile
Pontlac & Cadillacs

Dealership.
o Permanent positiono Excellent worklnc conditions

Phone 60 or Write Motor
Co., John Di.y.jOrefon

COMBINATION paint & hody man.
Oood job for right party Ap-
ply in person Walt's Llthla
Motors, Ashland.

WANTED clown to entertain chil-
dren, hourly rate. Contact 1

for appointment.

WANTED

JUNIOR MERCHANTS

for

WESTSIDE - MEDFORD

Age 12 to 15

The Mall Tribune needs Jr.
Merchants to deliver papers
In West Medford. Apply in per-
son at office or phone

PART TIME warehouse work, ex-
cellent opportunity to developinto full time employment and
future with Sherwln Williams
Paint Co. For appointment Ph.
6B4 2204

SALESMAN KIRBYC6;
Commission.

11 --WANTED FEMALE HELP

CULLOP
EMPLOYMENT SERVICE

Stenographer who can take
xnorinnno yaw words a minute
& type at least 60.
Experienced bank teller
Legal aecretary.

104 E. 6th
773-36- 94

WANTED Baby Sitter, own
after 3 p.m.

STOP
You need look no longer. Full
or purl lime. You will make
no better money. Excellent com-
missions. Call LUZIER COS-
METICS or write
Tribune Box 0766.

Position
open in itcai jsiate utnee tor
lop girl with minimum seven
years experience In heavy office
delal), plus ability to meet pub-
lic. Local references required.
5'i day week. Salary open, de-

pending on background and ex-

perience. Write Tribune Box
9340.

Leaver y
'

Whalin Realty I
G. Honnotd 2 V
S. Rlchardion.772.tftS
Don Whalin .772-SS- 7

Eclyn Prugh
ill Laavtr

I. Parwni 7

LIVE IN GRACE
FOR

$21,000.00
If you are a gardener inquire
about this. The lot is huge.
There arc 2 baths 3 Bed-

rooms and An exquisite kitchen.
On the

FOR THE IMMACULATE
LAZY

Just the right amount of yard:
enough to set off the house,
not enough lo weary you. The
house has that ono irreplace-
able asset, solid quality bound
COMPORT

HAUNTED HOUSE
If ranch type homes, with com-
fortable informality and de-

lightful neighborhood graced
by large caves over hanging en-

try walkway and generous 'ne
Bedrooms with 'i baths
scares you, don't look at (his.

FAMILY LIFE
SOME HOME You can
lust tee Ihe Son shooting bas-

kets in the drive, the Mother
getting up a meal in the roomy
kitchen and two other young-
sters reading before the fire,
in the cozy, carpeted living
room. Shady oaks in the yard
and a nice area for
Dad just off the big double
garage

121 SOUTH CENTRAL

Ml. 773-32-

t4id MIIUnom
USED safe large. Write to ChiTck

WANT BAHKIE POLES
1 H BAXTER & CO.

Box 30. Grants Pasv

Cash for furniture
Misc. tools or what have you

Oi 0

WANTED TO BUY 200 CORDS
16" green Laurel and Black Oak

BEST CASH DkiW
Furniture Appliances Muc.

OAK GROVE FUHN 4

USED PIANOS wanted. Will pay

CASH FOR FURNITURb
Misc. tools or anything salable

Or will sell on consi,7nment.

ted Barn Auction Cu.
S. Hwy !)&.

CAIN'S 2nd HAND STORE"
New & Used Furniture

BUY SELL TRADE
524 Crater Lake Ave,

A LOANS
$3000 AVAIL, for 1st inorlSHcc or

seasoned contract. Write Loan
P. O. Box 5, Medford. Ore

TO BORROW $330O--st mortgage.

pgr mo. write rii)une Box !746
CASH for contraels "mortgages

20-F- OR RENT HOUSES
RM. house. 1106 W. 4lh. Med
ford water, garbage pd. 664- -

OLDER couples to rent bdrm.
homes In Talent, $40. Eves.
338-1- 1 38

3 BDRM. older "home "in Central
Point. $75 mo. Water & garbage
pd.

NEWLY decorated 2 Sdrm"" fin n.
house Garage. Adults. No pets.
$85.

CLEAN bdrm. unlurn 640 Ross"
JLanr. 772-- 84

2 BDRMS. Eire, fangi St refris"'
$80. Available Apr. 15. Whilnev
Real Est. of

SMALL 2 Bdrm. furri". house. 480
DcBarr. Adults. $68 30, Refa. re- -

. c'utrcq- 773'saIL
SMALL l bdrm. House in EaglePoint, furn.

3 BDRM. house, $70.
6

2 BDRM. unfurn. 'house." A"

round with outbuildings or
veatpck$ap.773. 07 jaf ler 3.
BDRM home; yard fenced;

$32.30. 2817 N. Pacific Hwy.
2 BDRM.. iinfurn. duplex with car

pet. eves, or Sat. V
Sundajy.

$73 PER MO., 1 bdrmrhome Now-l- y

decorated. Garage, range,water pd. New kitchen cab-
inets with formica drain boards,
750 Oak St. daya or

- SSfciIgS evCM-

VACANT 2 or 3 bdrm. home,
fenced, sprinkling system, citywater & aewage. $90. After 3:30.

3 BDRM., MODERN
Fireplace, picture windows, car-
pet, beautiful view.

WAGNER CREEK AREA
No small children. $R5 mo., part-
ly furn. E. J. Hansen, Bonanza
Motel, 1001 Clark. Yuba City,Calif. Phone

l bdrm. kbujf partly furn.. uiil
ties pd, a Her 3.

CLEAN hdrm. furn. duplex;Water pd. No pets. $63.
UNFURN. nice 3 bdrmVhousc.

baths. 2 h n p It ft nit Hwv R1
2225 Fuwler Rd Near Desert
service biauon, white CUy

FOR RENT clean 2 hdrm. untuin.
nome ai liiiu w. Main Medforrl
Furnace heat, fenced buck yard
sprlnkltne system, oaraee with
storage. $87 50. Call Herfled Real
Estate.
BDRM. house partly furnished,
$35.. water pd.. adults.

2 BEDROOM furnisbert clotio "in.
garage, $70,, no peta. See at 521

pgneir avb. or pnone
FOR RENT Furn. i bdrm. h'ouHe"

no cnunrtn. ain oarueia. 772- -
4331).

BDRM., modern cottage, unfur-
nished, country living with
ehade. water, and nice garden

duplex with carport
Drapes furn. & water pd. $02.50.
, jacicaon.

suwnt duplex, unu
Adults, m.

unfurn. duplex. 321 W.
am ago monin.
CABINS - .8 WEEK A VP

1301 N Riverside

Builder of var 400 Medford

family homes tine (Ml. "We
stand back ot our construction."

SENIOR HI DISTRICT

Modern 3 bedroom home at

913 King. AppW 1200 j. ft.

fireplace, deep lot. Only $13,-30-

$400 down, FHA terms.

JACKSON SCHOOL DISTRICT

$8,500. $250 down,

terms. A solid older home with

payments less than rent.

1523 PLAYROOM

Plus baths, double garage,
3 bedrooms. A new home on

paved street, fine Eastside res-

idential district. Would cost

$20,000 to duplicate. Sacrifice
at $17,700 Attractive terms

LARGE LOT

$13,500. New 3 bedroom wilh
beautiful f" replace, efficient
automatic radiant healing sys-

tem, large closets, $500 down,

trade considered. Call us for

particulars and location.

$10,900
NEW 3 BEDROOM HOME

$350 down or paint your down

payment. A roomy plastered
home of outstanding quality.
Compare this with homes sell

ing for two thousand more. In-

cludes hardwood floors, natural
wood cabinets, fully insulated
and wealherslripped. Save up
to $20 per month over rent for

similar home Possession in 2
weeks on several homes. Ask to
see model home.

D. L. PICKELL
Builder-Realto- r

411 I. Main St

Week Mt 1 Altar S p.m.

Harry WHhrsw 7

Mai Cramer 772 S930
Cliff Ilk. 77J-70- 4

u' ! " ' if Pa
furn. apt., water St gaf

batic.pd 43 Oak at.. Central Point.
TURN Apta Wk. or mo. 5179

Cratcr Lake Hwy.
3 RM, furn. Apt. Close In. jfT

Holly40.
fURN. ADULT $40"

437 N. Grape 773- 4 43

LIASf OPTION 3 m
2 baths, fireplace, built ins,
tamfly rm., dbl. garage.

SPLIT LEVEL 4 BR

2 baths, fireplace, dbl. gar..
built-ln- family rm.; shake
roof, ww carpet. View lot.

WESTSIDE 3 BR
Full basement, oil heat. Ex.

rm., dining rm., $10,650.
REDUCED WESTSIDE

Lg. .2 BR; unfinished up-

stairs; fireplace, ww carpet,
oil heal; $10,600. Real Buy.

NEW 3 BR $12,300
Vi balhs, birch kitchen,

rock roof, fireplace. Value.
BLOSSOM HILL 3 BR

Family rm., 2 baths, 2 fire-

places, dbl. garage; all the
built-in- $21,500, $1200
jown; time to pick colors.

1 BR $5500
$500 dn., $50 mo., Ig. lot.

HOOVER SCHOOL 3 BR

2 baths, family rrpj,',:flr...
place, built-in- dbf. parage,
jas heat, covered patio; new.

WESTSIDE 3 BR

$10,500. Lo down, $85 mo.
WESTSIDE S BR

2 baths, fireplace, $1 1,000.
LOW DOWN-S- SS PER MO.
Ex. Ig. 3 BR, ww carpet,
city water. Mull ba told.

2101 CORONA

Lg., 3 'BR, I Vi baths, gas
heat, fireplace,, ww carpet.

CENTRAL POINT 3 BR

Fireplace, builjins, dbl.
lease oprton. New.

TALENT- 'LG. 3 BR
2 baihs. lireplacc, dbl. ga-

rage $12,500. Water, sewer.
HOOVER SCHOOL

New 3 BR, Vi balhs, fire-

place, paneling, built - Ins.

NEW 4 BR 2 BATHS

Fireplace, built-in-- $13,500
3 BR 1 ACRE

Vacant, low down, $9500.
PHOENIX NEW 3 BR

2 bath-,- bullMni, fireplace,
dbl garage, $15,500.

NEW 3 BR $15,800
Family rm. or 4th BR H
n a t h s, lireplacc, paneling,
birch kitchen, oven, range,
Ig. covered patio, brick
planters, Ig lot. Real Quality.

WILSON SCHOOL

Lg. 3 8R, 2 baths, gas heat,
fireplace; $450 down Trade
13a Acre Snowy Butto Road
2. BR lireplacc, $12,500.

WHY RENT?
New 3 BR's, $83 mo. ine.
Est. taxes and insurance,
$350 dn, or woik out down
$49 total if you paint.

EASTSIDE 3 BR
2 bath., ww carpet, built
ins, Ig. fireplace. $16,500

- w
I STOP... I Gocd Rental N

don't look at another home I I Close in on Ivy St j

until you ve seen this omr Pnced nght I
Charming 1900 sq .ft of IN
modern 'iving area, beauti- - I

1&&m Waller H. Jones If
baths, covered patio, big 3 I Realtor N

mtnt and
' ' U I Rm. 72 CENTURY BLDG.

v.nln9 ' 773773.3'n7 I Salaimin
B Wright Real Einte (

Spring Is
See the New

COUNTRY HOMES
at the

LAND '0 MANY OAKS
Drive out Table Rock Rd- Crost the rtver

COMICE PEARS

GOLDEN DELICIOUS
APPLES

Bring your own containers

Monday through Saturday
8:00 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Pinnacle Packing Co., Inc.
220 North Fir Street

Between 4th and 5th Streets ana renew wrin nuuit signs, or cana h THE DUOGAN- S- 855-113- 8
j

I M


