
MEDFORD MAIL TRIBUNE. MEDFORO. OREGONTHURSDAY, MARCH 21. 19634 D
LEGAL NOTICES LEGAL NOTICESLEGAL NOTICESLEGAL NOTICES

I Firemen Seek Part

T, V. Iff. I.I. tt Iff.

"Oh, you, about the incentive plan our Classified Ad men

tionedto hold this job you've

Feeding the Family

and FRANCES B. MacDOUGALL,
husband and wife: Commencing
at the southeast corner of Dona-
tion Land Claim No. 41, Township
38 south. Range 2 west. Willamette
Meridian. Jackson County, Oregon,
thence east, 1077.6 feet apd north,
451.6 feet to the centerline inter-
section of Thomas Road and Sun-
set Drive; thence north 0 03' 30
west, along the centerline of said
Thomas Road, 327.0 feet; thence
north 89 56' 30 east, parallel to
said Sunset Drive, 25.0 feet to a
, iron pin on the east boundary

of Thomas Road for the point of
beginning; thence north 89 58' 30"
east, 335.0 feet to 1 V iron pin;bn nnWh fl ID'niMt 180 0
feet to a i" iron pin; thence south
89 56 30 west. 3350 feet to a

Din on the east boundary of
Thomaa Road; thence south 0' 03'
30" east. 160.0 feet to the point of
oeginning.

I.A1IRRNCR L. BRIG G 8 and
GERALD1NE E, BRIGG8, husband
and wife, and VERA HEFFNER:
Commencing at the soutneast cor-
ner of Donation Land Claim No.
41, Township 38 south. Range 2
west, Willamette Meridian, Jack-
son County, Oregon; thence east,
1077.6 feet and north 451.6 feet to
the centerline intersection of
Thomaa Road and vSunset Drive;
thence north 0 03' 30" west,
along the centerline of said
Thomas Road, 697.9 feet thence
north us so au , parauei to saia
Sunset Drive, 310.0 feet to a W
iron nin for the Doint of beginning;
thence north 89 56' 30" east, 310.0
feet to a ,t iron pin; .tnence
north 0 03' 30" west, 70.3 feet to

iron pin: thence soutn w
aa' .1(1" went. 310.0 feet to a V."
iron pin; thence south 0 03' 30"
east, 7U j teet to tne point oi oe-

ginning.
PAUL CULBERTSON and MA

MIE T. CULBERTSON, husband
and wife: That portion of the fol-

lowing described property lying
within the present boundaries of
the Medford Irrigation District and
west of the now existing West Side
Main Canal of said district,
Beginning at a point on the east
line of Donation Land Claim No.
40. Townshlo 38 south. Ranse 2
west of the Willamette Meridian,
Jackson County, Oregon, said point
being 23,78 chains north of the
southeast corner of said Donation
Land Claim No. 40. and in tne
center of the county road; thence
nortn along tne east line oi saia
Donation Land Claim No. 40. 13.82
chains to the northwest corner of
Donation Land Claim No. 50. said
township and range; thence east
io.i i cnains; Tnence soum 1 .do
chains to the center of the county
road: tnence nortn 7o" 20 west.
alonir the center of the countv
road, 16.66 chains to the point of
oeginning.

GUY MALOTTE and VEDA MA
LOTTE, husband and wife: From
the southeast corner of Donation
Land Claim No. 38, Township 38
south, Range 2 west of the Wil-

lamette Meridian, Jackson County,
Oregon, run thence north on the
said claim line 2098.9 feet to the
south line of a 30 foot roadway,
thence west on said road line
520.0 feet to a true ooint of begin
ning: thence south. Darallel with
said claim line. 522.4 feet to the
south line of tract described in
Volume 260, page 342 of the Deed

gon; tnence west iw.g ieet: tnence
north parallel with said claim line,
.122.4 feet to said roadwav: thence
east 166.9 feet to the true point of
oeginning.LEE D. RICE and DORIS M,
RICE, husband and wife: Com
mencing at a point which bears
north 420.49 feet and west 1352.0
feet from the southeast corner of
Donation Land Claim no. 38,
Township 38 south. Range 2 west
of the Willamette Meridian, Jack
son county, uregon, tnence norm
14IV.7B teet, tnence soutn - zo
west 347.14 feet, and thence south
280.0 feet to the true ooint of be
ginning; thence south 89 26'
west 312.79 feet to a point on the
west line of tract described in Vol-
ume 288, page 174 of the Deed

gon; thence south along said west
line 323.30 ieet; tnence east au.ia
feet to a point south of the true
ooint ot beginning: thence north
323.36 feet to the .true point of
Deginning.MILFORD E. WHITE and
CLARA M. WHITE, husband and
wife: Commencing at a point 420.49
feet north and 1352.0 feet west
of the southeast corner of Dona-
tion Land Claim No. 38, Township
38 soutn. Mange 2 west oi wina-mett- e

Meridian in Jackson County,
Oregon, and thence nortn a dis
tance of 313.21 feet to the true
point ot beginning, thence west
3i7.i ieet; tnence norm j38.ia
feet; thence east 317.14 feet;
thence south 138.19 feet to the
true ooint of beginning.

PAUL LtlDWIG, JR. and
YVONNE JEANNE LUDWIG. hus
band and wife: Commencing at a
point 420.49 feet north and 1352.0
feet west of the southeast corner
of Donation Land Claim No. 38.
Township 38 south, Range 2 west
ot tne wuiameite Meridian, jac

County. Oregon: thence north,
a distance of 451.40 feet to the
true point of beginning; thence
north., 276.38 feet; thence west
317.14 feet: thence south, 278.38
feet; and thence east 317.14 feet
to the true ooint of beginning.

ROBERT D, HEFFERNAN, JR.
Administrator with Will Annexed,
and WILLIAM S. NEWIIALL and
WILLIAM F. WARNOCK, trustees
under the Last Will and Testa-
ment of Ad a belle Story Newhall,
aeceasea: Beginning at tne norm
west corner of Donation Land
Claim No. 43, Township 37 south,
Mange a west, wuiamene meri-
dian. Jackson County. Oregon:
thence north 89 55' west. 293.94
feet to the southwest corner of
Donation Land Claim No. 44, of
said township and range; thence
nnrlh fl f&r in" ufaat Inner Um

west Dnunaary oi saia ciatm no,
44. 852.24 feet to a iron Din
located on the westerly boundary
of the Old Stage Road; thence
along said road boundary as fol
lows: South 52 45' 50" east, 647.39
feet: thence south 26' 07' 20" east,
224.77 feet; thence south 3 18' 30'
east, 576.99 feet: thence south
4" 38 30" west, 167.64 feet to a
an iron Din: thence north 82" 47'
west, 341.70 feet to a 1" Iron pipe
found on the west boundary of
said Claim No. 43; thence north
0 02' 30" east, 443.10 feet to the
point of beginning.

CLE AXIS D. LEMLEY and
ALICE L. LEMLEY, husband and
wife: Commencing at a point on
the west line of Section 16.
Township 37 south. Range 2 west
of the Willamette Meridian. Jack-
son County, Oregon, which point
is 874.0 feet north of the south-
west corner of Government Lot 5
of said section; thence east 175
feet; thence north 125 feet; thence
east 295.58 feet; thence north 175
feet to the northeast corner of
premises aescrioea in ueed record-
ed in Volume 332. naire 231. Heri
Records of Jackson County, Ore-
gon; thence west 470.58 feet to the
northwest corner of said oremlses:
mence sou in juu ieet to me pointol beginning.

WILLIAM FROHNMAYER and
I1UKUTHY FROHNMAYER, hus-
band snd wife: Tract A: Com.
mencing at the corner common to
secuons ie, 17, 20 and 21, Town
ship 37 south. Range 2 west of
wuiamene meridian, Jackson

Countv Oregon, and thence nnL
along the section line between
Sect-o- 16 and 17, a distance of
260.T feet to the true point of be- -

inmng; tnence west uu.ianorth 0' 28' east 208.8
South 67 35' east 36 A

feet to said section line; thence
south 77 J feet to the true point
of beginning. Tract B: Commenc
ing at the corner common to Sec.
tlons 16, 17. 20 and 21, Township
37 south. Range 2 West of Willa-
mette Meridian. Jackson County

the section line between Sections
18 and 17, a distance of 338.0 feet
to the true point of beginning-thenc-

north 67 35' west 36lj
feet; thence west 32 IX) feet, to east
line ot tract described in Vrh..
341. page 396. Deed Records of
Jackson County, Oregon; thence
norm, parauei wim uio east une
ot said Section 17, a distance of
404.7 feet to an Iron pipe; thence
east 8611.0 feet to the east Un. n
said Section 17: and thence south
aiona swwmi n, a aistance
of 536.0 feet to the true point of
Deginning.

MARKS ROSSELL GIBBONS and
JEANETTE BRUCE GIBBON'S
husband wife: Beginning at a point
610 feet south of the section cor-
ner common to Sections 16, 17, 20
snd 21. Township 37 south. Ranee
2 west of Willamette Meridian,
Jackson County, Oregon, thence
west 282.5 feet; thence south 30
feet; thence in a southeasterly di-
rection to a point 240 feet due
south of the point of beginning-thenc-

north to the point of begin-
ning.

MELVIN H. HALL and DORO.
THY C. HALL, husbsnd and wife:
From the inside EU corner of Do-
nation Land Claim No, 40, Town- -
snip 37 soutn, Mange 2 west of
Willamette Meridian, Jackson
County, Oregon; run thence south
174 feet to a harrow tooth, the
place of beglnnlne. running thence
south 87 52' west 517.5 feet to
an iron pin on the easterly line of
the county road; thence along said
road line as follows: south 28 24'
west 625.2 feet; south 3 30' west
(ow.a icei 10 an irun pin on tne
north line of the tract of land do.
scribed in the Deed Records of
Jackson County, Oregon, Volume
147. page 332; tnence east on the
north line of said tract 953.5 feet
to an Iron pin on the westerly
line 01 uie rigm ui way 01 the
Medford Irrigation District canal;thence along said right of way,
north 16' 33 east 728.3 feet to nrt
iron pin; thence north 26 46' east
164 feet to an iron pin; thence
north 2 20' east 470.2 feet to an
iron pin; thence south 87 52' west
385.5 feet to the place of begin-
ning, excepting that portion lyingsouth of the natural drainageway
which commences approximately
750.0 feet northerly from the
southwest corner of the tract and
extends on a southeasterly course
to its intersection witn tne Med-
ford Irrigation District main canal,

OTTO N1EDER MEYER and NEL-
LIE NIEDERMEYER, husband and
wife: That portion of the following
described tract lying south of an
unnamed draw which runs in an
easterly direction across the tract,
Just south of the north line of
Section 28, Township 37 south.
Range 2 west: Beginning 20.0 A
chains west and 31.92 chains south
01 tne soutneast corner 01 uona-tlo- n

Land Claim No. 42. running
thence 40.11 chains (2647.26 feet)
south, thence west 20.00 chains
U3ZU.UU leeti, tnence nortn 40.11
chains (2647.26 feet); thence east
20.00 chains (1320.00 feet) to the
point of beginning. EXCEPTING
therefrom a strip 20 feet wide on
the east side and a strip 50 feet
wide on the south side, reserved
for road purposes.

RAY OFFORD, JR. and FRAN-
CES N. OFFORD, husband and
wife: Commencing at a point of
intersection of the westerly right
of way line of the Old Stage Road
with the southerly line of the
Livingston Road in Donation Land
Claim No. 38. Township 37 south,
Range 2 west of the Willamette
Meridian, Jackson County, Oregon,
which point is 1873.60 feet south
and 2921.18 feet east of the sec-
tion corner common to Sections
19, 20, 29 and 30, said township
and range; thence north 13 22'
east, along the Old Stage Road,
60 feet to the true point of begin-
ning; thence continue north 13
22' east, along said road, 550 feet
to a point; thence north 76 15'
west 440.00 feet to a point, thence
south 13 22' west, 550.00 feet!
thence south 76 15' east, 440 feet
to the westerly line of the Old
Stage Road, the point of beginning.

WILTON A. WHITE and CAROL
D. WHITE, husband and wife, end
V. RAY HOOPER and EILEEN
HOOPER, husband and wife: Be--

inning at the northeast corner of
6iovernment Lot 3, Section 9,

Township 37 south, Range 1 west
of Willamette Meridian, Jackson
County, Oregon; thence south 0'
13' 30" east, along the east line
of Government Lot 3 for a dis
tance of 1326.5 feet to a '" iron
pipe for the true point of begin-
ning; thence south 0 13' 30" east
along the east line of Government
Lot 4, 884.6 feet to the northeast
corner of property described In
Volume 96, page 218, Deed Rec-

ords of Jackson County, Oregon;
thence north 89 45' west, along
the north line of said property,
351.7 feet more or less, to a point
on the east line of Donation Land
Claim No. 66, Township 37 south,
Range 1 west, Willamette Meridian;
thence north 0 27' 30" west slong
the east line of said Donation Land
Claim, to a point which is south
0 27f 30" west 305.00 feet from
the northeast corner of Donation
Land Claim No. 66; thence north
47 48' east 245.75 feet, more or
less, to a point north 89" 45' west
from the true point of beginning;
thence south 89 45' east 171.90
feet to the true point of beginning,
excepting that part lying within
the boundary of Foothill Road.

RAYMOND R. RETER and JOAN
M. RETER, husband and wife;
FLOYD H. BAKER and PEGGY
M. BAKER, husband and wife,
and J 8. ENTERPRISES, INC., an
Oregon corporation: Beginning at
a point on the south line of the
northeast quarter of the southeast
quarter of Section 9, Township 37
south, Range 1 west of Willamette
Meridian, Jackson County, Oregon,
said point being south 89 45' 10

east 25.0 feet from the southwest
corner thereof; thence continuing
along said south line, south 89
45' 10" east 1269.32 feet, to the
esst line of said Section 9; thence
north 0 18' 10" east along said
east line 624.91 feet; thence north
89 45' 10" west 1273.53 feet to a
fi" iron pin monument, which

bears south 88 45' 10" east 25 0
feet from the west line of the
northeast quarter of the southeast
quarter of said Section 9; thence
south 0 05' 00" east 624.90 feet
to the point of beginning.

All persons interested are here-
by notified to appear at the office
of the Medford Irrigation District.
1310 Barnett Road, Medford, Jack-
son County, Oregon, at the regular
meeting of the Board of Directors
to be held on the 2nd day of
April, 1963. at the hour of 1:15
o'clock P.M., Pacific Standard
Time, and show cause. If any you
have, why the foregoing petitions,
or any of them, should not be
granted.

MEDFORD IRRIGATION
DISTRICT

By J. A. Hoffbuhr,
Secretary

GARET E. POWELL, husband and
wife: That portion of the following
described tract lying between the
toe of the slope of the Medford
Irrigation District main canal and
the east y line of the
Rogue River Valley Irrigation Dis
trict main canai, as iouows: Be-

ginning st the northeast corner of
the south half of the northeast
quarter of Section 30, Township 36
south. Range 1 east of the Willa-
mette Meridian, Jackson County,
Oregon; thence run west, along the
the northeast quarter of section
30, a distance of 2520 feet to a
point; thence run south and paral- -
nunn line 01 seia sou in nan 01
lei with the east line of said south
half of the northeast quarter of
Section 30, a distance of 515 feet
to a point; .thence run east and
Sarallel with said north line of

half of the northeast
quarter of Section 30. a distance
of 2520 feet to the east line of
said subdivision; thence run north
slong said east lines, 515 feet to
the point of beginning.

GEORGE L. HOWARD and MIL
DRED M. HOWARD, husband and
wife: Commencing at the quartercorner common to Sections 35 and
36, Township 36 south of Range
1 west of Willamette Meridian Tn
Jackson County, Oregon; thence
south 64 24' west 89.35 feet to an
iron pipe for the true point of be-

ginning; thence north 12 49' east
373.3 feet; thence north 2' 41'
east 663.0 feet; thence north 14
46' east 405 J feet to an iron pipeset at the northwest corner at the
tract ot land being described;
thence south 75 45' east 422.9 feet;
thence south 89 23' east 836.4 feet
to an iron pipe; thence south

aa west ieet; tnence soutn
' 54' east 517.8 feet: thence

south 89 52' east 755.8 feet to an
Iron bar for the northeast corner
of said tract: thence south 13 37'
east 921.0 feet; thence south 1 40
east ou.u ieet; tnence soutn 43'
51' west 127.1 feet; thence south
1 33' west 351.5 feet; thence
south 88 34' west 397.8 feet;
thence north 40 43' west isflft
feet; thence north 72 51' west
403.3 ieet; tnence north

west 299.0 feet: thence north
40" 15' west 358.8 feet: thence
south 81- - 21' West 321.7 feet:
thence north 87 10' west 244.8
feet; thence north 1 38' west
774.0 feet; thence north 89 47'
west 237.7 feet; thence south 52
30' west 573.0 feet: thence south
51 54 west 369.0 feet to the true
point ot beginning.

ELBERT DARIUS DAVIS and
ELSIE MAY DAVIS, husband and
wife: That portion of a tract of
Lots 9. 10 and 11 of the Sunny
Crest Orchard Tract, which lies
south and west of the centerline
of the East C Lateral Pipeline of
the Medford Irrigation District, as
described in document filed in
volume sis, page 237, Deed Rec-
ords of Jackson County. Oreson.
which is not now included and
assessed by the Medford Irrigation
District.

CHARLES A. WHITCHER and
LAURA E. WHITCHER, husband
and wife, and W. A. DARLING.
INC., an Oregon corporation: Com-

mencing at the corner common to
sections u. a. 10 ana 17. Township
37 south, Range 1 west of Willa-
mette Meridian, Jackson County,
Oregon; thence east 265024 feet
and south 1336.05 feet to a wx31"
galvanized iron pipe; thence west.
parauei 10 tne norm line 01 sec-
tion 16, a distance of 500.0 feet
to the point of beginning; thence
aoutn u id air east obu.hi ieet;
thence east. Darallel to the north
line ot Section 18, a distance of
170.0 feet; thence south 0 23'
east 400.0 feet, more or less, to a
point where this course is inter-
sected by the westerly corner of
jacKson county iax
iw-7-- 2 tnence soutn si so east.
208.0 feet, more or less, along the
southwesterly line of said Tax
Lot, to a point on the westerly
boundary of Roberts Road, thence
south 37 0' west, 243.0 feet, more
or less, to a point on the north
line of the county road: thence
west along the said north line of
tne county roaa, uua.u ieet, more
or less, to the sixteenth line;
tnence norm u 23 west, izuz.i
feet, more or less, to a Doint from
which the northwest corner of
Section 16, Township 37 south.
Range 1 west of the Willamette
Meridian. JacKson county, uregon
bears north 45 4' west, 1880.2
feet: thence south 89 50 east,
816.0 feet to the oointof beginning.

unasLBB r. tnisum ana
DORIS J. CHISUM, husband and
wife: The north 519 feet of Lot 1.
hiock 2. Fierce subdivision, ex
cepting that portion lying north
and east of the Medford Irrigation
District main canal and also ex-

cepting that portion Included in
the county road.

UUNHAR CARPENTER and
JANE CARPENTER, husband and
wife; Parcel No. 1: Commencing at
the corner common to Sections 21.
a, 27 ana zu, lownsnip at soutn,
Range 1 west. Willamette Meridian,

north 1,980.00 feet; thence west
1.836.80 feet to the true point of
Degmning; tnence nortn i.ubu.uu
ieet: tnence west 1.320.00 feet:
thence south 1.980.00 feet; thence
east 1,320.00 feet to the true pointof beginning, a sixty acre tract, but
excepting therefrom all land, some
29.75 acres, lying above the canal
of the Medford Irrigation District,
except for the following described
tract, wnicn contains 3.uu acres,
snd which shall be included: Com
mencing at the corner common to
sections 21. 22. 27 and 28, Town
ship 37 south. Range 1 west. Wil-
lamette Meridian. Jackson County,
Oregon; thence north 2254.30 feot;
thence west 2269.10 feet to the
true oolnt of beginning: thence
north 435.60 feet: thence west
300.00 feet; thence south 435.60
feet: thence east 300.00 feet, to the
true ooint of beginning. Parcel
no. 2: Lts 1. a ana one square
acre out of the northeast corner
of Lots 4, 5, 6, 7 and 8, Block 6,
and all of Block 10, of the Pierce
suDoivision in 1 own snip 37 soutn,
Range 1 west of Willamette Meri
dian. Jackson Countv. Oregon, ex.
ccpting tnat land presently ana
neretoiore inciuaea in tne

Irrigation District.
RALI'H 11. till ELL and LU

CILLE J. ODELL. husband and
wife: that part of Lot 4. in Block
7 01 tne fierce aunaivtsion de
scribed as follows: Commencing
at the northeast corner of Block 9
of said subdivision; thence west 25
ieet, tnence along tne west siae ot
county road, north 0 33' west
m7.2 ieet; tnence soutn 87 is
west 385.4 feet for the ooint of be
ginning, thence south 87 13' west
211.3 feet, thence nortn 0" 33
west 206.2 feet to the north line
of said Lot 4. thence north 89 54'
east along the north line of said
lot to a point that Is north 0 33'
west from the ooint of beginning.
thence south 0 33' east to the point
01 oeginning.RALPH L. COOK and VIRGINIA
D. cook, husband and wife,
VAUGHN C. KKYSER and Br.U-
LAH V KEYSER, husband and
wile, and medford lodge,
BPOE, NO. 1188: That part of Lot
H OI tnbslbnUUK ORCHARD
TRACTS, in Jackson County,

described as follows: Begin
ning at the southeast corner of
said Lot 14; thence north. 302 93
teet lor the true point of begin-
ning, which point Is also the north
east corner of property described
in voiume 333, page bb. ueea nee
ords of Jackson Countv. Oreson
thence north 805 57 feet, more or
less, to the southeast corner of
.orooertv described in Volume 3S1
page juv, ueea Kec orris 01 JacKson
Countv. Oregon: thence west alone

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE OF ELECTION

Notice Is hereby given that the
Board of Supervisors of the Rogue
Soil Conservation District have set
Thursday, the 21st day of March.
1S63, at 8:00 P.M. in Central Point
Grange Hall, as the time and

for holding the Annualftlaceand Election. One supervisor
will be elected for a four year
term from the Medford-Ashlan- d

area.
Dated the I4th day of March, 1863.

Harlan Cant rail.
Rogue S. C. D. Chairman

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL
ACCOUNT
No. 11413

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

In the Matter of the Estate of
MARGARET McLEAN, Deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN

that the undersigned has filed his
final account as administrator of
the estate of Margaret McLean,
deceased, with the Ctrcult Court
of Jackson County, Oregon, and
that said Court has set the 8th day
of April, 1963, at the hour of
10:00 o'clock in the forenoon of
said day in the Circuit Courtroom
of the Courthouse Bldg., at Med-
ford, Jackson County. Oregon, as
the time and place for hearing
objection thereto and the settle-
ment thereof.

DATED AND FIRST PUBLISHED
this 7th day of March, 1963.

Sam B. Harbison, Administrator
Harbison and Piazza
Attorneys for Administrator

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER
FOR SALE

NORTHSIDE UNION CREEK
SLOWDOWN

Oral auction bids will be received
by the Forest Supervisor, or his
authorized representative at the of-
fice of the Forest Supervisor, Post
Office Building, Medford, Oregon,
beginning at 10:30 A.M.. March 28,
1963. for all merchantable timber
marked or designated for cuttingon an area embracing 100 acres,
more or less, within section 34, T.
30 S R. 3 E and Section 3, T.
31 S., R. 3 E., W.M., surveyed, in
the Rogue River National Forest,
Jackson County, Oregon, The esti-
mated volumes are: 45 M board
feet of Douglas-fir- : 58 M board
feet of western white pine and
ponderosa pine; and 45 M board
feet of white fir and other species.The minimum acceptable bid perM board feet is as follows: Douglas-fi- r

$24.15; western white pine and
ponderosa pine $11.55; white fir
and other species $74)5. This In-
cludes the following rates, per M
board feet for stumpage: Douglas-fi- r

$18.20; western white pine and
ponderosa pine $5.60: white fir
and other species $2.00; and $5.95
for slash disposal for all species.
Sealed bids will be publicly opened
and posted at the office of the
Forest Supervisor, at 10:30 A.M.
on March 29. 1963. All those who
submitted a satisfactory sealed bid
win db permitted immeaiatery to
continue auction bidding. A money
order, bank draft, cashier's or
certified check in the sum of
$700.00 must accompany each bid,
to be applied to the purchase price,
refunded, or retained for applica-
tion to any claim for damages,
according to the conditions of aa,le.
If requested by the purchaser, con-
tract terms will permit felling of
timber in advance of payment upto the value of the performance
bond. If an oral bid is declared to
be high at the closing of the
auction, the bidder must imme-
diately confirm the oral bid by
submitting it In writing; on a For-
est Service bid form. The right to
reject any and all bids is reserved.
Forest Service bid forms for use
in submitting sealed bids and full
Information concerning the timber,
the conditions of sale and the sub-
mission of bids should be obtained
from the District Ranger. Union
Creek Ranger Station, Prospect,
Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor.Medford. Oregon, before bids axe
submitted.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER
FOR BALE

SUNSHINE SLOWDOWN
Oral auction bids uHll h rmmlwA
by the Forest Suoervlsor. o his
authorized representative at the of-
fice of the Forest Supervisor, Post
umce ouiiaing, meaiora, uregon,beslnnlna at 2:00 P.M.. March 20
1963, for all merchantable timber
marked or designated for cuttingon an area embracing 2,715 acres,
more or less, within Sections 1, 2,
11, 12, 13, 14 and 15, T. 31 S.
R. 3 , and Sections 7, 17, 18 and
19. T. 31 S R. 3 E., W.M., sur-
veyed, in the Rogue River National
Forest Jackson County, Oregon.
4110 siumiwa volumes are: 4,zauM board feet of Douglas-fir- ; 1,710
01 ooira ieei 01 sugar pine, west-
ern white Dine and nonderoaa nln
840 M board feet of white fir and
other species. The minimum ac-

ceptable bid per M board feet Is
as iouows: uougias - fir 125.10;
sugar pine, western white nine and
ponderosa pine $15.60; white fir
and other species $8.85. This in-
cludes the following rates, per M
board feet for stumpage Including
ucuubiv iur aaic area Denermem:
$14.30 base rate plus an additional
$8.70 for Douslas-flr- - 88.20 bi.se
rate plus an additional $5.30 for
sugar pine, western white pineand ponderosa pine; $2.00 base rate
plus an additional $4.75 for white
fir and other species; and $2.10 for
slash disposal for all species. The
siumpage rates payamo for earn
species will be increased bv the
amortization rate in effect for tliet
species when the unamortized es-
timated reconstruction cost of the
main haul roads has ben am nr.
tized by timber scaled. The un-
amortized estimated cost is S4,- -
I44.QU. Amortization rates are:
Douglas-fi- r $0.68 per M board teet;
sugar pine, western white nine and
ponderosa pine $0.69 per M board
feet: white fir and other species
$0.68 per M board feet. Amortiza-
tion of estimated main haul road
reconstruction cost is comnuted on
loo percent of the estimated tim- -
Der voiume. Tne purchaser may
rcDueii init ine contract nrnvinn
for more rapid amortization of the
estimated cost of roads which must
De constructed Derore normal a

ODerations will h nntlhl
The prices bid for stumpage shall
be considered as tentative rates
subject to quarterly calendar ad- -
juiuncm upward or downward by05 of the difference between the
average of the monthly Douglas-fi- r

nciion inaiccs. as calculated bv the
Forest Service of th Wi.rn ti
Association L.umDcr price index forthe three previous months, and the
following base Indices: Douglas-fi- r
105. 15(C): suear nine wilrnwhite pine and ponderosa pine

v w,,,, r na oiner species9288(A) Such adjustments in the
price for stumpage shall be appli-cable to timber scaled during the

period following the
quarter for which the adjustmentIs computed. In no event, however,shall the payment rates for each
quarter be less than the base rates
as stated above. When the adjustedrates by species are lower than the
base rates, th tUttrnmnnm htu--
the total dollar value of the timber
cut at adtusted rates and at base
rates will be recorded for each
species. The stumpage rate for anv
species will not he Increased above
the base rate until the subsequent
adjusted rates above the base rate
for all species develoo an accumu-
lated total dollar value in excess
of the total recorded accumulated
difference for all species. Sealed
bids will be Dublirlv nnenerf and
posted, at the office of the Forest
Supervisor at 2 AO P M. on March
29, 1963. All those who submitted
a satisfactory sealed bid will be
permitted immediately to continue
auction mooing a money order,bank draft, cashier's nr rertirtri
check in the sum of $10.900 00
must accomoany each bid. to be
applied to the purchase price, re-
funded, or retained for application
10 any riaim tor a images, accorfl'
ing to the conditions of sale. If re
quested bv the purchaser, contract
terms will permit felline of tim
ber tn advance of pavment up to
ine vatue 01 ine performance tona.
If an oral bid Is declared to be
nign at tne closing of the auction,
the bidder must Immediately eon.
firm the oral bid by submitting it
in wriuns; on a rorest service nio
form, The ritht to relect anv and
all bids is reserved. Forest Sen-ic-

bid forms for use in submitting
sealed bids and full Information
concerning the timber, the condl
Hons of sale and the submission of
bids should be obtained Irom the
District Ranter. Prospect, dregem,
or the Forest Supervisor, Medford,
Oregon, before bids are submitted,

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OK OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

Probate De foment
In the Matter of the Estate

of
FRED L. JOHNSTON, deceased.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
that the undersigned has been ap- -

by the Circuit Court of theEolnted Oregon for Jackson Coun-
ty. Administratrix of the estate of
Fred L Johnston, deceased. All
persons having claims against the
said estate are hereby notified to
present the said claims with the
proper vouchers to the undersign-
ed administratrix at the offices of
Harbison and Piazza, 201 U. S- Na-

tional Bank Building, Medford.
Oregon, within six months Irom
the date of this notice.

DATED AND FIRST PUBLISH-
ED this 7th day of March 1863.

Betty A. Conner,
Administratrix

Harbison and Piazza
Attorneys for Administratrix

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS as hereinafter designated
will be received by the district
manager, Bureau of Land Man
agement, BLM Warehouse Area,
Armory Drive, Medford, Oregon
(mailing address 1133 S. Riverside)
at 10:30 A.M., PACIFIC STAND-
ARD TIME on Thursday, April 11,
1963, for all timber marked or
designated for cutting. Before bids
are submitted, full information
concerning the timber, the condi-
tions of sale and submission of bids
should be obtained from the above
district manager. The right is
hereby reserved to waive technical
defects in this advertisement and
to reject any or all bids. The
United States reserves the right
to waive any Informality In bids
received whenever such waiver Is
in the interest of the United
States. IN JACKSON COUNTY:
OREGON: O&C: All timber desig-
nated for cutting on SEU SEV4
Section 21; S'iNU. S'i Section
22; NW'(NW'4, SNW',4.

Section 2; NE, W'iNWT.
NVaSEU Section 27; E ',4 NE V Sec-

tion 28; T. 38 8., B. 4 W., W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 4,308 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r.

113 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine,
305 M bd. ft. sugar pine, 17 M bd.
ft. lncense-ceda- 209 M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
$16.95 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-

-fir. S10.85 oer M bd. ft. for the
pine, 915.65 per M bd.ft.Jionderosa pine, $6.20 per M bd.

it. lor tne incense-ceaa- r, aie per
M bd. ft. for the white fir. or a
total purchase price of $79,825.46
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid $8,000.00. All timber
designated for cutting on Lots
3. 4, StsNli, N'iS'.i Section 3.1
T. 36 8., R. 2 E., W.M., estimated
fnr the nurooie of this sale to be
2.334 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r, 1,026
M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, as m do..
ft. suirar nine. IRS M bd. ft. ln- -
cense-ceda- 19 M bd. ft. white fir.
No bid for less than $19.10 per M
bd. ft. for the Douglas-fi- r, $18 50
ter M bd. ft. for tne ponderosa pine,
;23.90 oer M bd. ft. for the sugar

pine, $7.65 per M bd. ft. for the
lncense-ceda- $5.85 per M bd. ft.
for the white fir or a total purchase
price of $65,923.30 will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with bid
$6,600.00. Alt timber designated for
cutting on Lots 3 and 4, E'aNE'.ii,
NE USE 14 flection 33, T. 33 8., R.
2 E., W.M., estimated for the pur- -

of this sale to be 1,691 M bd.
t. Douglas-fi- 27 M bd. ft. sugar

480 M bd. ft. lncense-ceda-
Sine,M bd. ft. white fir, 45 M bd. ft.
hemlock. No bid for less than
$21.20 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-

-fir, 539.00 per M bd. ft. for the
sugar pine, $10.15 per M bd. ft. for
the lncense-ceda- r, $5.40 per M bd.
ft. for the white fir, $8.60 per M
bd. ft. for the hemlock, or a total
purchase price of $43,467.80 will
be considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $4,400.00. All timber
designated for cutting on

Lots 3 and 4. W'jSE'i Sec
tion 19, T. 33 ., K. 3 E.( W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 87 M bd. ft, Douglas-fi-
3 M bd. ft. sugar pine. 51 M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
$20.80 per M bd. ft. for the Dougla-
s-fir $38.15 per M bd. ft. for the
sugar pine, $5.80 per M bd. ft. for
the white fir or a total purchase
price of $2,219.85 will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid
$250.00.

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL
AUUUUIMT
No. 11374

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

In the Matter of the Estate
of

RICHARD CASEY, Deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN

that the undersigned has filed his
Final Account as Administrator of
the estate of Richard Casey, de-

ceased, with the Circuit Court of
Jackson County, Oregon, and that
said Court has set the 8th day of
April, 1883, at the hour of 10:00
o'clock In the forenoon of said
day in the Circuit Courtroom of
the Courthouse Bldg.. at Medford,
Jackson County, Oregon, aa the
time and place for hearing objec-
tions thereto and dhe settlement
thereof.

DATED AND FIRST PUBLISH
ED this 7th day of March, 1863.

A. E. Piazza.
Administrator

Harbison and Piazza
Attorneys for Administrator

SUMMONS
No.

Suit In Equity for Divorce
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

DEAN E. LUEHRS, Plaintiff. Vi.
NAOMI LUEHRS. Defendant,

TO: NAOMI LUEHRS. Defendant.
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE

OF OREGON: You are hereby sum
moned and required to appear ana
answer the First Amended Com-
plaint of Plaintiff In the above en-

titled court on or before the last
dav of the time prescribed in the
Order for Publication of Summons
herinafter referred to,

on or before tne 4tn aay ot
April, 1063, you are hereby noti-
fied that if you fall so to appear
or answer, for want thereof, the
Plaintiff will aoolv to tne above
entitled court for the relief prayed
for in ms nrst Amenaeo. com-
plaint, that Is:

1. Granting to Plaintiff an ab-

solute Decree of Divorce from
and against Defendant, and for
ever dissolving the bonds of
matrimony and the marriage con
tract heretofore made and now
existing between Plaintiff and
Defendant.
3. That the Plaintiff be awarded
the custody of the minor chil
dren of the parties hereto, that
is DEBORAH LOUISE LUEHRS
and PAMELA JEAN MOORE
with Defendant to have the risht
of reasonable visitation under
reasonab e circumstances.
3. That Plaintitt be awarded the
owner of the household furniture
and the Studebaker Station
w ason of the oartirs hereto: that
Plaintiff be awarded the real
property commonly known
4R5 Beach Street, Ashland, Ore
gon, and more particularly des-
cribed,
The North Half of Lot Fourteen
(141 in H. B. CARTER'S ADDI-
TION to the City of Ashland,
Jackson County. Oregon, accord
ing to the official plat thereof,
now of record.
4. For such other and further
relief as to the Court may seem
lit st snd equitable.
1 nis Summons Is served by pub

lication thereof In the Medford
Mali Tribune, a newspaper of gen
eral circulation, published in Med-
ford. Jarkaon Countv. Oregon, ud- -
on and by virtue of an Order of
Honor a Me Edward C Kelly, judge
of the above entitled court, dated
March 6. 1963, directing publication
hereof once a week for four )4t
successive weeks, in said news-

which Order requires youfaper. and answer the First
Amended Complaint on or before
four t successive weeks from fire
date of the first publication of this
Summons.

That the date of the first publi
cation of this Summons is March
7U1, 1963.

Sidney V. Alruworth
Davis and A insworth
Of Attorneys for Plaintiff
4.10 Siskiyou Boulevard
Ashland, Oregon

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
uecn ap

pointed Administrator of the es- -
" jy, ac

cessed, and has duly qualified." " "vim ciaims againstsaid estate are hereby notified to
present the same with propervouchers to the Administrator at
the Crater Title Insurance Co..
510 West 6th St. Medford. Oregon!
within six months from February

mviMR satin
Administrator of the Es-
tate of Frank Leo Emrick,Deceased.

NOTlCR
IN THE MATTER OF THE INCLU- -

Biun or lanus in tne MED-
FORD IRRIGATION DISTRICT,

political subdivision of the
state of Oregon
NOTICE is nerebv aiven under

the provisions of ORS 545.586 that
the following named persons have
xueu wiin ine uoara 01 uireciorsof the Medford Irrigation District
their petition to have included in
me Meaiora irrigation District
lands owned by them as herein-
after set forth,

H. W. 8CHWIETERT and E

8CHWIETERT, husband
and wife: That portion of the east
half of the following described
tract which Ilea south of the Med-
ford Irrigation District main canal
and north of Payne Creek: com-
mencing at the northeast corner
of Donation Land Claim 42, Town-
ship 38 south, Range 1 west of
Willamette Meridian, Jackson
County, Oregon, thence south on
the east line of said Donation Land
Claim 42 a distance of 22575
chains; thence west chains to
the road; thence north 22.875
chains: thence east on the north
line of said Donation Land Claim
42 a distance of 6.90 chains to the
point of beginning.

a, u. mcanTOiiE.! ana
ALD F. HOUSE and PAULETTE
MAY HOUSE, husband and wife:
Beginning at the northwest corner
of Donation Land Claim No. 82,
Township 38 south, Range 1 west
of Willamette Meridian, Jackson
County, Oregon, and running
thence south along the westerly
line of said Donation Land Claim
1568,0 feet to Intersect the south-
erly tight of way line of the Fern
Valley Road for the true point of
hesinnlnff. thence continuing south
along the said Donation Land Claim
ijine ous.u xeci to a nun iHcmonument; thence north 66 40'
east 782.0 feet to intersect the
westerly rleht of way line of the
Medford Irrigation District main
canal at a 2" pipe monument:
thence northerly along said right
of way line to the intersection of
tne lam csnai ngm 01 way line
and the southerly right of way
line of the Fern Valley Road;
thence southwesterly along said
road line 784.0 feet more or less.
to the true point of beginning.
Excepting therefrom a 15.0 foot
road right of way situated parallel
and adjacent to the entire west
line of the above described tract.

Willis i. house ana mauue
HOUSE, husband and wife:

All of that portion of the follow-
ing described tract which Ilea west
of Medford Irrigation District main
canal: Beginning 1160.0 feet south
and 890.0 feet east of the north-
west corner ot Donation Land
Claim 82, Township 38 south.
Range 1 west of the Willamette
Meridian and run thence north
1160.0 feet; thence west 990.0
feet; thence south to the north
line of the county road known as
Fern Valley Road; thence follow-ln- c

said line of said county road
easterly to ine piace ui uckiiuuiik,
all in Jackson County. Oreson.

HAKKi an it uaviu, an uregon
corporation: That portion of the
following described tract 'which
has not been previously obligated
for irrigation by the Medford Ir-

rigation District under the Phoenix
Mill Ditch agreement:

rnmmtnnne at ine loumeasi
corner of Donation Land Claim No.
43. Tnwnnhln SR soutn. Kan Be 1
west. Willamette Meridian. Jack
son county, uregon; tnence west
1311.47 feet; tnence norm tr.u
feet to tne true point 01 oeginning;
then re south 64 19' 40 West,uo an '.-- 4. Ui.a nvU A't OA'

10" west. 97.0 feet; tnence nortn
46 22' 40" west, 172.82 feet;
thence north 38" 00' air west,
1QH.70 feet! thence north 46 40
so" west. 62.48 feet: thence north
0 01' east, 470.31 feet; thence
south 56 57 30" west, 108.26 feet;
tnence soutn ai- - ui west, ai.ai
feet; thence nortn 22' 12' west,
ITT AS m. 4Vihm havOi no. AO1

30" west. 170.16 feet: thence north
40 07' west. 124.52 feet; thence
north 39' 16' east, 00.70 teet:
thence north 21 13' east. 43.46
feet; thence north 49 20' west,
68.20 feet; thence north 15 11' 30"
east, 40.24 feet: thence west.
1941 feet: thence nortn 31" 05
west, 272.65 feet; thence north
12' 20 west. 204.15 feet; tnence
north 79 00' east, 114.05 feet;
thence north 89' 00' east, 118.80
feet; thence north 74" 30 east.
184.80 feet: thence nortn 97" au'
east, 116.15 feet; thence south

41' 50" west. 288.13 feet; tnence
north 89 38' east, 178.50 feet;
thence north 0 22' west, 300.00
feet; thence north 89" 38 east,
62B.65 feet: thence south 36 00'
east, 729.85 feet; thence east 459.67
feet to intersect the southwesterly

y line of Interstate
Hichwav No. 5: thence south
42r 03' east along said highway
line 248.56 feet; thence south
53 21' 40" east along said high-
way line 101.98 feet; thence south
42 03' east along said highway
line 874.62 feet; thence north 89
48' 50" west, 1055.13 feet to the
trii nnlnt nr beeinnina.

H. C. WAINSCOTT and PHYL-
LIS F. WAINSCOTT, husband and
urlf Tract A: From the northeast
corner of the southeast quarter of
Section 8, Township 37 soutn.
Range 2 west of Willamette meri-
dian. Jackson County. Oreson: run
thence south 20 chains; thence
north 330.0 feet to the place of
beginning, running thence west
ant s feet to the center line of the
old Military Road; thence along
said road line, nortn a cast
164.83 feet; tnence east 7U4.3 teet
to the east line of Section 8;
thence south on the section line

m n ffnt tnthe mice 01 neainninE,
Tract R- From the northeast cor
ner of the southeast quarter 01
Section 8 in Township 37 south.
Range west 01 wmamciie meai-dta-

Jackson County. Oregon,
thence south 20.00 chains, thence
north 495.0 feet to the point of
beginning; thence west 794.5 feet
to tne cemernne 01 tne mili-
tary Road; thence north 2' 29' east
164.85 feet along said road line to
the north line of track described in
Volume 102. page 401. Deed Rec-
ords of Jackson County, Oregon;
thence east 787.5 feet to the cast
line of said Section 8; thence south
on the section line, 165.0 feet to
the point of beginning.i.Yi.r P. wiLCOX. a slnsle man
That portion lying east of the
Military noaa 01 tne nortn nan 01
the north half of the southeast
quarter of Section 8. Township 37
soutn, nange 2 west, wuiamcue
Meridian. Jackson County, Oregon,
more particularly aescriDea as fol-
lows: beslnnins at the east Quar
ter corner between Sections 8 and
9 in Township 37 south. Range 2
west or wuiametie meriaian,
thence westerly alons said Quar
ter section line 901.4 feet, more or
less, to the easterly right of way
line of the Military Road; thence
southeasterly a Ion said rtsht of
way line 671 feet, more or less, to
tne soutn line 01 ine saio norm
half of the north half of the south
east Quarter of Section 8 In said
township and range: thence east
778 feet, more or less, to the sec-

tion line between sstd sections 8
and 9 in said township and range
thence north 660 feet, nore or
less, to the ootnt of betinnlng.

GEORGE E. CLARK and FLORA
L. clark. husband and wife
That Dortlon of the foliowin a de
scribed tract lying between the
toe of the slope of the Medford
Irrigation District main canal and
tne east Dana of Antelope ireeic,
as follows: Beainnins st the south
east corner of the south half of
the northeast quarter of Section
jo, townsnip jo soutn. nance 1

east of Willamette Meridian. Jack-
son County. Oregon: thence run
west, along the south line of said
soutn nan ot tne northeast quar
ter of Section 30 a distance of
3 000 feet to exlsttni county road.
thence north 60S feet along said
county road; thence run east and
Darallel with said south Una a dis
tance of 3.000 feet to the east line
of said property, thence south 805
teet to tne point 01 oeginning,

FLOYD M. POWELL and MAR-

Of Ciqarette Tax
called

(or a fraction of any cigarette
tax here Tuesday night to
help pay for fighting ciga
rette-caute- d fires.

Two members of the house
tax committee, in response,
rebuked the firemen's chief
spokesman, Harold Jacobson
of Multnomah county, who
spoke for the Oregon Fire
Chiefs, Volunteer Firemen's,
and Rural Fire Protection
Districts association.

Jacobson said if a cigarette
tax war levied, firemen want
one-fift- h of a p.nny of it for
training centers, strengthen
ing the state fire marshal's
office, and setting up a fund
for relatives of firemen killed
in action. The sum would
amount to $900,000 a bien-nium-.

WILL APPEAL
Salem-fllPD-T- he State Tax

Commission said Wednesday
it will appeal a tax decision
involving Harvey Aluminum
company to the Oregon Su-

preme Court.

water and 3 tablespoons soy
sauce. Add to asparagus in
broth and cook 1 minute. Re-

move garlic. Serve plain or
better still, on buttered toast
points.
Cheesa Sauces

Use a medium cheese sauce
with pimiento strips over stuf
fed eggs, sauteed mushrooms,
broiled oysters or cooked
shrimp. Combine cheese sauce
with diced chicken or tuna
and leftover vegetables for a
quick shortcake over buttered
toasted English muffins.

LEGAL NOTICES

BUS BIDS
April 9, 1963

The Board of Dlrectori of Cen
tral Point School Diitrlct Mo. fl.
Central Point, Oregon, Invites bids
for a 73 passenger pusher type
school bus. Bids will be received
separately for the body and chassis
except where the body manufac-
turer can give a better bid bv aiv--
1ns; the price on a complete unit.

mas are to .be in a sealed en
velope addressed to Mrs. Merle
Obenchaln, Clerk, School District
No. 6, 491 No. 3nd St., Central
Point. Oregon, and marked
SCHOOL BUS BID. All bids must
be In the clerk's office bv ADril
9, 1063, at 8:00 P.M. A bidder may
submit aa many bids as he wishes.

The board reserves the riant to
qualify, to accept, or reject any
or all bids and to waive any in- -
lormamies.

Specifications may be obtained
at the office of the Superintendent
In Central Point.
Published: March 21, 1863; March

28, 1HB3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Notice la hereby riven that I

have been annotated bv the Cir
cuit Court of the State of Oregon
tor Jackson county Executrix or
the Will of Alexander H. Smith, de-

ceased, and have qualified. All per
sons naving claims against me
estate of said decedent are hereby
notified to present them, with
proper vouchers, duly verified to
me at ine oince or sxyrman at
He lie, attorneys for said Execu-
trix, at Room 321 Medical Center
Building, In Medford, Oregon,
within six months from the date
of this notice.

Dated and first published March
21, 1063.

ituoy m. Burton
Executrix

Skyrman aV Helsel
Attorneys for Executrix

NOTICE ON FINAL ACCOUNT
Na. Hiss

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OP THE
STATE Or OREGON FOR THE
COUNTY Or JACKSON.

Probate Deoartment
In the Matter of the Estate

of
WAYNE R. WELTY. Deceased

Notice Is nerebv riven that the
ruiai nuuuiu ui nnnii a. Trciijf.as Executrix of the d

estate, has been filed herein and
that a:30 o'clock a.m. on April 8,
1863, In the Courtroom of the
above Court in the Courthouse In
Medford, Oregon, has been ap- -

n ted as the time and place for
earing objections to such Final

Account and settlement thereof.
Dated and first published this

7th day of March, 1863.
Helens s. weity,Executrix

Van Dyke, Dellenback fc
McOoodwin
Attorneys for Executrix

NOTICE ON FINAL ACCOUNT
Estate of
PEARL M. BLACKBURN, Deceased

Notice is nerebv aiven that the
undersigned has filed Its final ac-
count in the estate of Pearl M.
mackDurn deceased, in trie circuit
Court of the State of Oregon for
the County of Jackson, and the
court nas nxea Monday April 6,
1863, at 8:30 A.M. In the court-
room of said court as the time and
filace for the hearing of objections

and the settlement thereof.
The First National Bank
nf Orpirnn PnrtlsanH

By: VAN DYKE, DELLENBACK Si
McGOODWIN
Attorneys for Administrator

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON, FOR
JACKSON COUNTY IN
PROBATE

In the Matter of the Estste of AR.
Ttii in ra. gpa DcfTU r... j
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

I nave been aDDOinted bv the Cir
cuit Court of the State of Oregonfor Jackson County as Administra
trix 01 tne estate of Artnur h. .

deceased, and have dulv ouh1
(tied. All persons having claims
against said estate are hereby noti-
fied to present them, with proper
vouchers and duly verified, to me
at ine oinces of Keny & 'Jrant At
tornevs 1003 East Main Strtt.
Medford, Oregon, within six months
from ine dale of this not re.

DATED at Medford Oregon this
28th day of February 19fi3

DOROTHY S GERHARD
Administratrix

KELLY & GRANT ATTORNEYS
Attorneys for Estate
1005 East Main Street
Medford Oregon
NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL

ACCOUNT
No. 114SS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

Probate Department
In the Matter of the Estate

of
LESTER JOHN STEPHENS.

Deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN

that the undersigned has filed her
Final Account as Executrix of the
estate of Lester John Stephens.
deceased, with the Circuit Court
ot Jackson County. Oregon, and
that said Court has set the 8th
day of April, 1983. at the hour
of o'clock In the forenoon of
said day in the Circuit Court
Room of the Courthouse Building,
at Medford. Jackson county. ore
ion, as the time and place for hear
ing oojec-imn- uiereto ana tna
settlement thereof

DATED AND FIRST PUBLISH
ED this 7th day of March. 1963.

Catherine Irene Stephens.
Executrix

Harbison snd Piazza
Attorneys for Executrix

goua worm -

VINCENT
Editor

naise, add 2 tablespoons pre-

pared mustard, dash of salt
and pepper; blend in 4 table-

spoons dairy sour cream to
give nice consistency.
New Potatoes and
New Green Peas
Herald Spring

First of the season new po-
tatoes are the round reds with
the thin skins that are gently
scraped off If you insist,
though many enjoy them
cooked in their skins. If the
potatoes are larger than good
sized walnuts, you may want
to cut them in half or in quar-
ters if they're to be combined
with new green peas. For each
4 servings.

Scrape 1 pound new pota
toes and shell 2 pounds fresh
peas (you'll get about- 1V

cups). Combine potatoes and
peas with 1 tablespoon finely
sliced green onion in a sauce-

pan; add 1 cup boiling water,
Vz teaspoons salt. Cover and
cook 15 or 20 minutes or until
vegetables are tender. Add Vi

cup evaporated milk or cream
and 2 tablepsoons butter and
simmer very gently until
liquid is somewhat thickened.

Many good cooks like to
fold the potatoes and peas in-

to a nicely seasoned white
sauce using the liquid in
which the vegetables are
cooked. For a bit of color,
add 2 thinly sliced radishes
just before serving,
Fresh Green Peas

First green peas of the sea
son are a treat well worth the
work. Most peas now go into
cans and frozen food pack
ages w h 1 c h are in super
abundance the year around.

Lets recall however the
tender sweetness of new peat
dropped into boiling salted
water and cooked only 15

minutes, perhaps with a dash
of onion salt or cooked with
a small onion, then seasoned
simply with butter, salt and
pepper.

Or pair new peas with
small cooked onions, with
freshly sauteed mushrooms,
with diced cooked celery or
with the smallest of the new
potatoes. Chopped parsley
and mint are flavor comple
ments long enjoyed with peas.
Mint by all means If lamb is
served.
Magic Mushrooms
For Magic Moments

Magic moments of eating
magic mushrooms. The
Pharoahs of Egypt monopo-
lized mushrooms for their
own use. Feeling they were
mucn too magic to be eaten
by common folk. Mushrooms
now are cultivated in tremen- -

dou quantity in our part of
the country; are picked,
packed and rushed dally to lo
cal markets for enjoying at
very modest cost.

A mushroom grower of our
acquaintance has cooked them
like this for 20 years. That
seems a good enough recom
mendation. Butter a deep pan,
cut up or slice freshly laun
dered, impeded mushrooms
so they fill the pan to a depth
of about 2 inches. Simmer
over low heat until mush
rooms are covered with their
own juice; takes about 10
minutes. Then cook more
briskly for about 5 minutes
no longer. Add salt and pep
per to taste.

If cooking is done by other
means over higher heat, cook
only about 8 minutes. Over-
cooking toughens this fragile
vegetable that grows so mag
ically.
Asparagus Oriental

Fresh asparagus has been
around long enough that you
may be looking for a new
way with it. Soy sauce gives it
an Oriental savor that will be
favored by many.

For 6 servings, wash
pounds asparagus, break off
each stalk wherever it snaps
easily. Cut into inch long
pieces and saute in 2 table
spoons cooking oil along with
1 clove of garlic. Add cup
chicken stock or consomme
(bouillon cubes or canned)
and cook covered for 10 min-
utes. Combine 1 tablespoon
cornstarch. 1 tablespoon cold
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Splendor of Spring
Filli Food Baskets

No one can be expected to

speak of such mundane things
as best buys in beans and
hamburger when local mar
kets proclaim gaily that
Spring is here. And in me
Spring, our fancy turns to
festive meals featuring new
fashions in food as nature pro
duces early samples that hint
of the abundance to come.

Spring comes to our area at
20 minutes past midnight
(3:20 a.m. EST according to
the almanac), Thursday,
March 21. The vernal equinox
as you know occurs when the
sun's center crosses the
equator and day and night are
everywhere of equal length.

So today we throw budget-
ary discretion to the winds
wafting past the window and
revel in new arrivals in the
market places.

There are tender new green
peas for the shelling and well
worth the effort. New round
red potatoes; tubers for cook-

ing in their thin skins and for
combining with those newly
shelled peas or for buttering
and rolling in finely chopped
parsley.

Asparagus and artichokes
showed up earlier but belong
on Spring menus more often
as cost comes down. Supplies
were never handsomer.

Snowy cauliflower, broccoli
and magic mushrooms speak
of spring. Rhubarb, the vege-
table that behaves like a
fruit is in excellent supply.
Green onions and rosy rad
ishes taste a little sweeter.
We've sighted corn on the
cob and there are a few quite
expensive strawberries but
they never taste better than
when new and expensive.
Marinated Sardines and
Artichokei Are Fine
Seaional

The new crop of sardines
for which Maine is famous is
jamb-packe- d into cans which
are well displayed in markets
as a Lenten treat. The fish are
small and firm, nutritious, de-
licious and bargain priced.
We team them with new sea-
son artichokes which never
looked better in the produce
bins than right now.
Sardines in Marinade

Drain 2 or more 4 ounce
cans Maine sardines; spread
out in shallow dish. Sprinkle
with 6 whole cloves and bit of
bay leaf. Make marinade by
combining 34 cup salad oil or
olive oil, m cup lemon juice
or mild vinegar, 11 teaspoon
salt, 2 teaspoons dry mustard,
J2 teaspoon Tabasco, 2 table
spoons minced parsley, 2
tablespoons water. Spoon
marinade over sardines; chill.
Drain and arrange on plate
with lemon wedges for

squeezina over". Use un mar
inade for more sardines, for
dressing up artichokes or pi
mientos or eggs
or a vegetable medley.
Artichoke Cookery

Trim artichokes; stand up
right in pan just big enough
to hold artichokes snugly. Add
water to cover. 1 minced oar-
lie clove, 2 teaspoons lemon
juice and 1 tablespoon salad
oil. cover and boil gently un
til leaf can be pulled easily
from stalk or stem can be eas
ily pierced with a fork
matter of 23 to 40 mtnuies
dependent on size of artl
chokes. Remove immediately
from water; drain upside
down. Serve wholi? or halved
with "chokes" removed: with
marinade leftover from sar
dines, with hot melted butter.
lemon butter, mayonnaise or
easy Hollandaise in separate
small dish for artichoke leaf
dipping.
Pimientos

Pimientos are fine accom
paniment for sardines and all
other fish. Select whole bright
red pimientos from canned
product, reserving ragged
ones for use later in salad or
sauce. Drain pimientos and
serve plain or with marinade.
Mustard Dip

Favored for accompanying
any sardine cold plate ar-

rangement. To cup mayon

COMICE PEARS

GOLDEN DELICIOUS
APPLES

Bring your own contiinan
Monday through Saturday

i:00 a.m. to S p.m.

Pinnacle Packing Co., Inc.
220 North Fir Street

Between 4th and 5th Streets

the south line of said property,
798 feet to the west line of said
Lot 14: thence south along the
west line of said property, 805.57
feet, more or less, to the north-
west corner of property described
tn Volume 353. page 88. Deed Rec-
ords ot Jackson County, Oregon;
thence east along the north line
of said property. 798.0 feet to the
point of beginning.

LOUIS L. RKNTZ and GLADYS
B. RKNT7., husband and wife:
Commencing at the northeast cor-
ner of Government Lot 1 in Sec-
tion 2. Township 38 south. Range
2 west of Willamette Meridian in
Jackson County, Oregon: runningthence east. 228 feet: thence north
481 feet tn the center of the county
road: thence east along the center
of the county road. 1967 feet to
the true point of beginning, and
from this, the true point of begin-
ning, run east 223 feet; thence
south 487 feet; thence west 223
feet; and thence north 487 feet to
the true point of beginning, known
as Lot 14 of Hp nacre. (Un-
recorded!

DAVID O. MatDOUGALL, JR.


