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IT'S YOUR, LAW
Rnptel or law Main Dtmocttcj Lira

TheyTl Do It Every Time By Jimmy Hatlo

Lawyer loophole just admitted Ten years later-- now its judgeto the bar, has all the legal facts' loophole. everything mas to be
and figures at his fingertips spelled out ano laid right w mis lap
p I r J l i

TV BY LIGHT
Chicago - Mi - Lighting

fixtures attached to the wall
or ceiling add to the relax-
ation of television viewing,
according to the American
Eoi e Lighting institute
which says a television tube
is not designed to be view-
ed in a darkened room like
a movie screen.

ABSOLUTELY.' WHAT'S IPSOUH-- DO

I HAVE 'AS DEFINED IN

LAW Kbb, COLONIAL UWA CASE.
1771 RUMCAkt

EN6LISU YEBONNE- R-

THt
DEFENSEVERSUS
CONTENDS

THAT--KUMQUAT,l924IPSO
FACT- O- GLADSTONE,

WANTED Second hand material
of any kind, will clean out your
attics or garage St pay you lor
It

WANTED Furniture Si appli-
ances St misc. dishes, any condi-
tion, highest prices paid. 772- -
aoto.

AFTER this date Feb. 19. 1889. I
will no longer bt responsible for
any debts other than my own.
W. G. Wllklna, Rt 1, Bos 308,
Talent

IF YOU art Elderly and in need of
a home and good care, wt would
like to make you one of our
family and our ntw homt your
nomt.

SPOT CASH for old coins.

HAVING MONEY PROBLEMS t
See Wayne Medford. He can ar-
range loan for you from 850 to
8150. on furniture, aulorucbilt
or sa'ary.
LAURENTIDB FINANCE CORP.
123 W. Main

ANYONE having drinking prob-
lem is welcome at tht Medford
Group of Acoholics Anonymous

pjn. Tues. At Sst. rear
of 21 N. Oakdale.

Group every Tuesday.
MAXENE'S TAX SERVICE

Day or eve.
3558 Table Rock Rd.

IT IS YOUR FAULT IF HOUSE
BILL 1263 IS PASSED. (Pd. Po-

litical Adv.) by W. D. Doern-bac-

143 Mact rd., Medford. Ore.

FACTO ? TO WHAT
CORPUS ARE YOU

DELECTI-IN6- ? WHICH
S THE PLAINTIFF r

WONT YOU COME HOME
BILL BAILIFF? IS
GLADSTONE STILL

VALID T

Q

-- .3ft

This right is called eminent
domain.

Eminent domain laws re-

quire that there must be a

public use and necessity for
the taking of the land, and
that the landowner be com-

pensated adequately for what
is taken, and for damages re-

sulting to other land not
actually occupied.

The word "taking" as ap-

plied to this phase of law has
been held to include, besides
actual possession, cases where
land is damaged, as for In-

stance where land is flooded
by backed up waters from a
dam, or where a highway cuts
through the middle of a farm,
making it dangerous to drive
livestock to pasture.

Under certain condi t i o n s
private corporations such as
telephone and power compa-
nies or other public utilities
may exercise the right to con-
demn property, provided the
conditions of public use and
necessity and adequate com

627 TO 70l

Your

By
Cpvrlht,

Editor's notai Sylvia Poriar

Dennis the Menace fX TIME

V V;) for

jdL CHICKS

Money'
Worth

SYLVIA PORTER
Hill Syndicate, Int.

CLASSIFIED
PERSONAL

Lodge Notices .
Special Club NoUcej
Personal
Lost and Found
Instrucuons
Wanted Male Help
Wanted Female Help
Male or Female Help
Wanted SltuaUons
Wanted Miscellaneous .

Financial At Loans

REAL ESTATE
Por Rent Houtei . 20
For Rent Apartment! 21
For Rent Furnished Roonu 22
Rent Rooms and Board
For Rent Miscellaneous
Wanted To Rent
Medford Realty Board
For Sale Real Estate ...
Buslnesi Opportunities
Wanted Real Estate

AD DIRECTORY
FOR SALE MISCELLANEOUS
Building Supplies
Appliances
Furniture
Musical Equip., Radio, TV
Sports and Hobbies
Miscellaneous
Nurseries ..
Dogs and Pets
Poultry

Wanted Livestock -
Hay, Grain and Feed .

Fruits & Vegetables .

Automotive A Equipment
Machinery and Tractors . 60
Logging Equipment 61
Equipment For Rent 62
Trailers 70
Parts and Accessories 71
Cycles and Scooters 72
Carg and Trucks 73

UNCLASSIFIED COPY
Too Late to Classify A

MONDAY ONLY
Business Directory ...... h

CLUB EVENTS

ROGUE YACHT CLUB General
meeting Sunday, Feb. 24, 3 p.m.
Temporary club quarters, old
Stage rd.

RUMMAGE St Food Sale by Mis-
sionary Ladies of First Church
of God. Feb. 22. Fehl Bldg.
9 a.m 4:30 p.m.

LEON'S
JANE. SHARON St BEV

Specialize in personally
shaping, coloring St styling
your hair at

LEON'S HAIR FASHIONS
231 E. 6th. 2

JACKSONVILLE DENTAL LAB
Dentures repaired wnue you wail

absence a column by Ralph McGill will ba subtlituttd. Mc
Gill it writing a taritt of articlat on African nation!, where

...and your chick starting needs.
Now is the time to order your chicks to cash In on
favorable egg prices early next fall. Place your order
with us for chicks of strains. We can
also supply you with all your chicks' starting needs
Purina Chick Startena, Disinfectants, Check-R-Tab- s,

Tylan, feeders and founts. And, bf course, our
friendly service is always available. Be sure to visit
our Checkerboard store real soon.

he it prattntly touring.

A VIEW FROM A TERRACE
' Conakry, Guinea It was just after breakfast that a tall,

solemn African with a attractive little girl came

to the terrace of the home of U. S. Ambassador William

Atwood. He spoke politely In Trench. The tiny, slender girl,
of about five years, took us all in with her somewhat fear-

ful eyes.
She had, it developed, two badly infected ears. They had

been pierced for rings, and a dirty string had been looped

through each. Infection followed. Her ears were swollen

about the lobes and pus pockets had formed behind each.

The father knew that the ambassador's wife did volunteer
work at the hospital. He had brought his young daughter.

Mrs. Atwood went to her quickly, spoke to her, and sat
her on a bench on the terrace. She then went into the house

and returned with cotton, a bottle of antiseptic wash, and

some antibiotic salve. The child sat quietly, her eyes large
with apprehension of pain, while the ambassador's wife care-

fully cleaned the Infected areas, drained the pus from the
boil-lik- e swellings, and after another gentle but thorough
antiseptic cleansing, applied the antibiotic salve. The father

'HEY! CCWE BACK
THIS OWN 6ALIO0H

NOTICE
' No. urn

IN TUT. CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE Or OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

In the Matter of tht Eatat of
ELIZABETH WOODSON.

Deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN

that the underaisned administra-
tor of the abov estate haa filed
his final report and account here-
in and that Monday. March 18.
1983. at 9 30 o'clock jn. at the
courthouse in the city of Medford
In aaid county haa been fixed by
the above named court as the time
and place for hearing objections to
said final report ana account and
for tht examination and allowance
thereof.

Dated and first published this
14th day of February. 1883.

William V. Deatherasa,
Administrator

Frohnmayer, Lowry, Hogan
St Deatheragt

Attorneys for Administrator

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS as hereinafter designated
will be received by tht District
Manager. Bureau of Land Manage-
ment, BLM Warehouse Area, Arm-
ory Drive, Medford, Oregon (Mail-
ing address 1133 S. Riversldel, at
10:10 A.M, PACIFIC STANDARD
TIME, on Thursday, March 14,
1963. for all timber marked or de-

signated for cutUng. Before bids
are submitted, full Information
concerning the timbtr, the condl-tion- a

of sale and submission of
bids should bt obtained from the
above District Manager. The right
Is hereby reserved to waive tech-
nical defects In this advertisement
and to reject any or all bids. The
United States reserves the right to
waive any informality in bids re-
ceived whenever such waiver is in
the interest of the United States.
in iACSSUN CUUNTY: OKKUUN:
OliC: All timber designated for
cutung on skunwu. see. Z9. t,
34 s, R. K, W1IL Mer estimat-
ed for the purpose of this salt to
be 10 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r, S M
bd. ft sugar pine, I M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
120.00 per M bd. ft. for tht Douglas-

-fir, S39.20 per M bd. ft. for tht
sugar pine, ss.65 per M bd. it. for
the white fir, or a total purchase
price of 8523.23 will be considered.
m:lnimum deDosit with bid S7S.00.
All timber designated for cutting
on SW'.SE".. Sec. 28: E!;NI
Sec. 34: W'iNE'.i, NW".

NW'tSEi), Sec. 33: T. 32
S., R. 1 W, WIU. Mer., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
4.102 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r, 80 M
bd. ft. sugar pine, 102 M bd. ft.
Incense-ceda- 334 M bd. ft. white
fir, 44 M bd. ft. hemlock. No bid
for less than 817.75 oer M bd. ft.
for the Douglas-fi- r, S29.75 per M
bd. ft. for the sugar pine, 86.90

ier M bd. ft. for tht lncense-ceda- r,

5.65 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir, 87.50 per M bd. ft. for the
hemlock, or a total purchase priceof 878.408.90. will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid 87,
900.00 All timber designated for
cutting on S'iSW. SEW. Sec. 33,
T. 33 S, R. 3 W.; Lots 1 & 2.

Sec. 3, T. 34 8, R. 3 W,Will. Mer., estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 2.233 M
bd. ft. Douglas-fir- . 33 M bd. ft.
ponderosa pine, 228 M bd. ft.
Sugar pint. 2 M bd. ft. Incense.
cedar. 87 M bd. ft. white fir, 1 M
bd. ft. hemlock. No bid for less
than $18.00 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fi- r. 826.90 per M bd. ft.
for the ponderosa pine, $31.55 perM bd. ft., for the sugar pine. $5.25
per M bd. ft. for the lncense-ceda- r.

$7.30 per M bd. ft. for the
white fir, $7.70 per M bd. ft. for
the hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $48,964.40. will be con-
sidered Minimum deposit with bid
$4,900.00. All timber designated for
cutting on SWi'.SW',',. Sec. 29;

aec. 30; WliNWH.
N'.iSW",'.. Sec. 32, T. 38 S.,

R. 3 E, Will. Mer., estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 475
M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 10 M bd. ft.
ponderosa-pln- 11 M bd. ft. sugar
pine. 21 M bd. ft. lncense-ceda-

1.623 M ba. ft. white fir. No bid for
less than S17.R3 ner M hri ft tnr h
Douglas-fi- r. $16.00 per M bd. ft.
for the ponderosa pine. $11.20 perM bd. ft. for the sugar pine, $595

cr m ua. i. lor me incense-ceda-

4.50 per M bd. ft. for th um
fir, or a total purchase price of
$16,199.40, will be considered.Minimum deooslt with km
$1,700.00.

NOTICE TO rRMUTOni
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

"""a ur UKEUON FORJACKSON COllNTV
IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE

Deceased
NOTICE IS HFBFHV nTMVM

that by an order of the aboveentitled court dated February 18,
mo, me unaersignea was an.
minted executor of the estate ofna Rader Stanliv riv..ri -- a

all persons having claims againstsaid estate are hereby notified to
present the same to said executorat 230 Franklin Building. Medford,

.. " ....el ij vcmiea as pro-vided hy law and within six
months from the date of first pub-lication hereof.

Dated and first published this
21st day of February, 1963.

J. narvey StanleyExerntop
Farrtll. Blackhurst & Hornecker
Attorneys for Executor

NOTICE OF HEARING
UPON FINAL ACCOUNT

NO. 1141?
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

finift ur UHtiUUH FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

Prnhnt n.nirlm.nl
In the Matter of the Estate of

rntuamta u. SNEDICOR.
Deceased.

Notice ! hrHv
Jean Piatt Fety. executrix of th.Eatate of Frederick G. Snedicor
Deceased, has filed in the Circuit
Court ot the State of Oregon for
Jackson County, her First andFinal Account as such executrixof said estate, and the 20th davof March. 1963. at the hour of9:00 o'clock AM. In tht Court,room of tht said Court at the
Courthouse. Medford. Jackson
County. Oregon, has been fixed as
the time and place for hearing of
objectiona to said First and Final
Account, and all persons hsving
objections thereto are herebyto make or file the aame
on or before said time.

uaifcu February 14, 1963.
Jean Piatt Fety
Executrix

Robert D. Dames. Attorney
Medford. Oregon

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING
Probate No. 1 225

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

IN THE MATTER OF THE ES-
TATE OF AMOS W. WALKER,Deceased
Notice is hereby given that The

First National Bank of Oregon,
Portland, executor of the above
estate, has filed in the above en-
titled court and cause Its Final
Account and Report and said court
has fixed March 25. 1963 at the
hour of 8.00 o'clock : a m.. In the
Court Room of said Court at the
Court House tn Medford Oregon
as the time and place for hearing
objections thereto and for the set-
tlement thereof.

Dated this 21st day ot February,
THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK

OF OREGON. PORTLAND,
Executor

Farrell. Blackhurst A Hornekr
Attorneys for Executor

Classified Business and Service Directory
Firms and Individuals Specializing to Save You Time and Money I

Editor'! nofei The follow-

ing article waa prtparad as
public service by the Ore-

gon Slat Bar. It 1$ not in
tondad to b lagal advice.
Tboao having lagal prob-la-

ihould taka all oi tha
(acta to an attornay. A alight
changa in iacta may altar
tha outcoma of caaa.

EMINENT DOMAIN

Under the feudal system in

England, all land was owned

by the Crown, with apeclfied
lords or tenants having the
right of pessession. Property
owners in this country own
their land outright, the states
no longer having the ultimate
title.

But even in this country,
ownership of land is not abso
lute. It Is still subject to the
right of the state or federal
government to take the prop
erty for certain essential uses,

HERE AND TAKE

fV0

Will Be Dedicated
day's noon luncheon of the
Kiwanis club. Taking part
were The Rev. Harvey Coo-ver- t,

pastor of Zion Lutheran
church; Salvation Army Ma.
William Ricken, Dr. L. Paul
Walker and Jennings Pierce.
All are members of the Med-
ford club.

It was announced at the
luncheon that the district
board will meet within a few
days to name a man to carry
on Rice's duties for the re-

mainder of this year. The suc-
cessor will be named from
among past governors or from
among division lieutenant
governors.

was then Informed that when
were pierced, only strings which
should be used to keep them opened, and that the piercing
Instrument also should be dipped in it. He thanked her, took
the little girl's hand and walked away. The next morning

TAX REPORTS. Cleo Canoott. 5J
Robs Court. For day or tve. ap-

pointments phone Saino
location since 194L
DRINKING YOUR PROBLEM

Contact A A. Sun. pan.
Thurs. 8 30.404 Walnut

Ph. 8 1

DENTURES repaired and rtllned
while you wait. Day or tvt. Ph.

25 Loiier Lane.

Prompt Tax Service
MAKUUEK1TE HONE

Call Day or Evt.
3312 Table Rock Rd. Medford

'GINGER'
OWNER OF BEAUTY SALON at
880 Stewart Ave. Special person
allied service. All work guaran
teed. Welcomes ladies with thiiu
fine or problem hair.

EVENING APPOINTMENTS
Closed Mondays .... ...,773-3l- 3

VACANCY lor Lady or Man need-
ing nursing care. Mountain View
Nursing Home. 586 Park St.Aihlana.

INCOME TAX
SPECIALIZED BOOKKEEPING
216 E Main

MERLE NORMAN Cosmetic Studio,an nunrer uiqg. 772-0- 6 1 1
INCOME tax service. Cecelia Ray?

uu.it, ..) n, ivy. f

Po$t and Termite Control

Call Paramount Pest Control
Inspect before buying 1

SURESKILL PEST CONTROL-772-80-
61.

After S p.m.You can be sure with Sureskill.

Plumbing

AAA
PLUMBING

REPAIR
24 Hr. Service

Radiator Service
DALE NEWMAN'S

Medford Radiator Service
203 W. 8th at Grapa

Radio-T- Service
Home, transistor, record players,etc. Free tube testing, estimates.

Bring In At save. Phillips. 703
Bcattv.

Roofing
RON THOMPSON ROOFING CO."

All types Of shinala rnofln.
Insured. 3

Free estimates. 100 flnsnclng.
iE3S?N. T At ROOFING

E. Jackson 1
OldestJon0lnSjOregonROOFING ALL TYPES '
Alum siding At shingles. Alaroof repairs. Low rates.

Septic Tank
SANITATION SERVICE

Mp,lc tanlt service.
2870 Crater Lake Hwy 3

MITCHELL SEPTIC SERVICE""
Tanks cleaned At repaired. Fieldsl.iid. Now Installations. 0

Speedometer Service
SPEEDOMETER SERVICE

5I5R2.RI AUT0 ELECTRIC
2301 Table Rot-- RH

Towing Service
REQUEST: .lAClTSlDES

ROGUE TOWING SERVICS
Equipped to handle any ob.5 A; H Green Stamps.

Tree Service
A- Tree SurgeryV.F"' Reasonable Rates

. 1

..... ,- .J Dnua.TREE SERVICE 2

Licensed A-- Insured

Wa$hing Midlines
PARTS At Repairs on ALL homo
laundry Equip. on
Maytag. Easy At Kltchensld.
LARSON APPLIANCE

Well Drilling
CRATER WELL DRILLING

3061 Crater Lake Ave. 1

?HA terms on wells and pumps.
ROTARY At PNEUMATIC drllllntT

P,v 'he ft Any formation.
HARD ROCK OUR SPECIALTY

MAJORS WELL DRILLING
8 ANY TIME

GRIBBLE At MILKOWSKI
WELL DRIt.l.INn

8 or 2

ROTARY DRILLING CO.
Drill by foot: any formation, any
depth, anywhere. Well drill As
test drill

SHULTS BROS well drilling and
kuiiip service- we strive to pieasoevery one Days or

Eves
GOFF BROTHERS Well Drlllerl

Any formation by the foot. SAH
Green stamps. Office Slsklvou
Hardwsrt 9 aves. 772-7-

or

& tV it teV

Use 7 rib one Want Ads

For Action ... .

she was back. The ears were

pensation are met.
Landowners may, if they

feel compensation offered is
not adequate, have comoensa.
tion determined by a jury
Dut wey cannot prevent the
taking of their lands if public
necessity for such taking is
snown.

Classified Rates
Minimum Sizei Two Lines

1 day per wor-d- 80
2 days per word.. .120
3 days per word.. 15a
S days per word.. 19o
6 days per word...,..MM... 20c

Jackson, Josephine and Siskiyou
Counties

Rate Other Areas Per Word
8c Per Day

By Line Per Month $3.00
Box Number Service Charge SOo

(Minimum Cash Ad 80c)

Business Directory
Each lint per month.MHn..S2.2S
Minimum per month.. ....S6. 75
Dead Line on Classified Ads
SK)0 p.m. for following day,
except 10 a.m. for Monday;
for Sunday noon Saturday.
Dead Line on Display Classi-
fied Ads 10 AO a.m. Saturday
for Sunday and Monday; 3 p.m.
tht day btfort publlcaUon for
Tues. through Frl.

APPROVED CREDIT
CHARGES BILLED

BY THE LINE
Minimum Charge $1 JO

Legal notices
NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL

REPORT JAND ACCOUNTING
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY.

IN PROBATE.
In the Matter of the Estate

of
HERMAN HELLER. Deceased.

NOTICE Is hereby given that
March 11, 1883. at the hour of
10:00 O'clock a.m. In thn rtrrnlt
Courtroom of the Jackson County
Courthouse, Medford, Oregon, has
ueen u.v uraer oi tne Honorable
Edward C. Kellv. Circuit June
dated and filed the 3th day of
rrotuary, 1UOJ, set RS the time
and place for hearing on said
Final Report and Accounting, and
all persons having objectionathereto should file the same with
the said Court on or before said
date ot hearing. Date of first publi-cation of this Notice. February 7.
1B63. Hugh W. Gould, Administra-
tor. Sherman S. Smith. Attorneyfor Administrator, 127 N. W. "D"
Street, Grants Pass, Oregon.

NOTICE OF SALE
No. 11411

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

In the Matter of the Guardianshipof the Estate of
ANNA L. KENNEY also known as

NAN L. KENNEY,
incompetent.NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN

that pursuant to order made and
entered In the above entitled court,In the matter of said estate, the
undersigned guardian, from andalter the 18th day of March, 1963,on bids which are to be receivedat the otilce of Jones. Reeder A
Bashaw, attorneys at law. Fluhrer
Building. P. O. Box 567. Medford.
Oregon, will proceed to sell at
private sale and for cash, all theriant title and interest of theabove named ward In and to the
following described real propertysituated In Jackson County, Ore-
gon,

Beginning at a point North
21',' East 60 feet from the
Northwest corner of Block 37
In the City of Jacksonville,Jackson County, Oregon, said
point being on the Easterlyline of Oregon Street: thence
Northeasterly along the saidstreet line 250 feet: thence
Southeasterly parallel to F
Street, 200 feet; thence South-
westerly parallel with OregonStreet. 230 feet to the Norther-
ly line of F Street- thence
Northwesterly along F Street200 feet to the point of begin-
ning

CHRISTIAN JOSEPH KENNEY
Guardian

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR
JACKSON COUNTY

PROBATE DEPARTMENT
In the Matter of the Estate of
Jacob D. Brown, deceased.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
I have been appointed Executrix
ol the above estate bv an order
made therein on January 28. 1963-al-

creditors having claims againstsaid deceased are herebv notifiedto present the same, duly verifiedand with proper vouchers attached,to me at the office of Roberts
Krllinjrton. Branchfleld ft Heffrr-na-

711 East Main Street. Med-
ford. Oregon, within six months
from the date of this notice

Dated at Medford. Oregon, this
31st day of Jsnuary. 1963.

Bettte R. Huson
Executrix

it on vacation. During htr

the ears ol any otner children
had been sooked in alcohol

much better. They got careful

economy and doing damage
nations also are giving aid

so much for Its dollars as in

POLLA- N-

tfltA

Ll7.J9.70 Vi'l
icoirio61 To

62 To OCT. 34

6J Ol NOV. 23

64Viol
SConloClS

dressing.
Two days each watk Mrt. Atwood and Mrt. Eugane

Abramt, wife of tht Embassy Davalopmtnt officer, work
at voluntttr aidtt In tha Conakry hospital. Thty help
dcllvar babitt, scrub bads, pailantt, and do all work
usually dona by hotplial aidtt. Tha ambassador and tha
staff are popular and raipaciad because ihty have oarnad
it. It it relatively a small group, and to mo it taams
overworked. But it it dedicated and makes intelligent,
understanding contact with tha lift of Guineant.

The ambassador has traveled over most of the country,
visiting where no automobiles have been. The roads traveled
are often mere tracks between which grasses and weeds
grow as high as the car Itself. It Is necessary to carry food
and sleeping bags along. But the hundreds of villages have
been visited and have seen the American flag flying from
the ambassador's Jeep. They are a friendly people, eager to
learn, and appreciative of respect and understanding.

The Republic of Guinea has about the area of Oregon.
It is divided into three geographic regions, ranging from
coast to mountains. The coastal region is quite hot and humid.
One of its problems is to communicate with and unite more
than 13 ethnic groups. Three of these are quite large, The
Fulalis make up about one million of the republic's three
million population. The Mnllnkes, of the northeast, number
about 600,000, and the Soussons, of constnl areas, about
325,000. French is the official language, but as of now only
about 30 per cent of the people spenk It.

Communication and education are imperative prob-
lems. But here everything it a necessity. This it the more
ironic because Guinea potentially it one of the richest
countrlet In Africa. It hat one-thir- of tha world't known
rttervet of high grade bauxite. Many of lit mountain!
are heavy with iron ore. Along the beachei are huge
deposits of volcanic-lookin- g ttone. Much of it ttemt to
be almost pure iron. There are large diamond depotiti
and the agricultural economy has possibilities.

Farm Store
10th & S. Fir

Gla$s
Specialists in Auto Glass

GLASS Window plate mirrors.
FARRELL'S GLASS SERVICE
9th It Front 0

Granite and Top Soil
GRANITE: Loading or Delivering

LUCIUS It WILBERT LULL
Phone

CREEK RUN GRAVEL
Granite, Shale. Top Soil

DUMP TRUCKS loader for
hire. Free estimates.

JIM NUNES
GRAVEL

Granite, sandy loam, fill dirt.
Creek run gravel. Prompt del.
Good measure on all orders.
Chas Bennett Jr. 1

GRIZZLY GRANITE CO.
ugnt colored uranlte.

Shale Road Base
Bulldozing.

GRANITE CRUSHED It PIT
RUN LOADED OR DELIVERED
R. G. "BOB" LULL
If no answer call

CRUSHED ROCK, SAND
it GRAVEL

CONCRETE PIPE It DRAIN TILE
M. C. LININGER St SONS

Guns
BREN GUN WORKS

Repairs, Accessories, Supplies.106 S. Grape 8

Heating
COOL TOP Oil floor furnace

KENNEDY FUEL OIL
922 Boardman at Kennet

YOW'S
1729 N. Rlvrrnlrtc

Income Tax
FED. It STATE Income tax assist.

S. C. Jones At Agcv.413 Lithla Way. Ashland. Cor-ne-r
6th At Grape. Medford.
MARGUERITE RONE

INCOME TAX RETURNS
DAY or EVE.

3312 Table Rock Rd. between
Overpass At Airport Rd.

INCOME TAX BOOKKEEPING
PERSONAL COMMERCIAt

9 A.M. - 6 P.M.
INP.0MF TAX

SPECIALIZED BOOKKEEPING
216 E. Main

MAXENE DltNGEY, Fed. or State"
Call 1 DAY or EVE
3558 Table Rock Rd. Medford

landscaping
BATEMAN At SONS

LANDSCAPING
Lawn Construction Top Soil
Ornamental Rocks Fill Dirt

FREE ESTIMATES

Miscellaneous
BEAUTIFUL new. HAWTHORNE
CONVALESCENT HOME has

or rooms avail-
able. Registered nurse on duty24 hrs. Your Inspection invited.
Reasonsble rates. 7737711

Strven St

Office Machines
Late model FRIDEN calculators,also rebuilt ADDING machines
for sste or rent.
Georce Wilson 0

Oil Burner Service
KrfCHEN'SPOWER-VA"-

Fumsces, Chimneys. Oil stores
cleaned. 7

SPARK OIL BURNING HEATERS
922 Boardman

KENNEDY FVE1. OIL

Painting
PAINTING BRUSHITSPRAY"'

Free Estimates At terms
A Q Murphy

PAPERHANGiNG

exacting srorkmanshlp Also

SIGN PAINTING
low cost truck lettering etc.
Henry J. Burmeuter 772-7- J

But Guinea was perhaps the most neglected of the French
colonies. Certainly this was true of education, roads and

Building and Construction

REMODELING?

CALL DAN PATCH CO.
or

PLASTER It STUCCO REPAIR
Free estimates on remodeling
Ic repair. 3

Call 664-16- 54

for ALL your Building &
Remodllng needs. Financing.
WESTWARD HO Const. Co.

BACK HOE WORK. LOADER
tt DUMP TRUCK WORK.

Lee D. Williams 4

APPLEGATE EXCAVATING CO.
Back Hoe Dump Truck Loader

Bulldozer PH. 3

D. K. "DON" HAINES
BUILDING & REMODELING
Rooting Siding all types. Ce-

ment block work, foundattona
under older homes. 100ri financ-I-

Free estimates.

Chain Saws
McCulloch Chain Saws

Trucks
Caveman Campers & Rentals

BARNES RENTALS
530 W. 6th 3

CHAIN SAW SALES 4i SERVICE
1321 rf. Riverside

Lombard Chain Saws Oregon
chain General Bars.
Rrntals. Repairs on all saws.

Electric Shaver Service
Elec. Shaver & Clipper Service
Guaranteed service, parts - all
makes. Closed Sat. P.M. Monday
114 E. 11th 2

Fuel
OAK. LAUREL ti FIR
CUT TO ORDER It

DELIVERED. 3

DRY TRASH BURNER It
COOK STOVE WOOD. J5 losd,

delivered.
16" ' to 24" DRY RED FIR

$13 A CORD
Immediate Delivery.

8

CALL 772-62- 23 FOR
Flying "A" Heating oil. Dry Body
fir, hardwood At log ends.
Naumes Equipment It Fuel Co.

LAUREL & OAK
PROMPT DELIVERY

or 2

BODY FIR
18" $18 cord. , cord $10.

Csll 3

RED FIR LOG ENDS
Fireplace or Heater

Dry split 400 eu. ft. $29
Dry split 200 cut. ft. $13

Green unsplit 400 cu. ft. $19
NO ROT OR PITCH
tmmLiMte Delivery
PHELPS FUEL CO.

Call
EAGLE POINT WOOD YARD

Red Fir $15. Osk $18
Delivered. Cut 18" to 24"
FREE starting pilch with each
order

You naul: $10 Fir, $12 Oak.
or 1

DRY WOOD
30 dav special low prices. 18
cedar slab. dbl. load. $12 50. Also

planer trim, big load .$7 50.
Stock up at these bargain prices.
MAC S FUtX 1

24" Oak. $18 a cord.
Immediate Delivery

Ph. 8

RED FIR LOG ENDS
Split big double load. $34 50
Whole approx 3 cord. $19 00

BAB WOOD SALES
Good Wood At The Right Price

FIREPLACE WOOD 1 ft. or
short blocks $16 A $18 Isrge

loads, prompt del. 4

HILTON'S FUEL
ALL RED FIR WOOD

!8 In loads in. loads
New Sawdust Old Sawdust
Can evji

Garden Work
LET DAVE CARE

TOR YOUR LAWNS it SHRUBS
Dave's Gardening Service
BEST ICH'tPMEVT-nrPENDABL- I

PH.

Use Tribune WanAds

FLOWER SHOW QUEEN Carol Corbctt, 21, a strawberry
blonde from Brooklyn, has been named queen of the 46th
International Flower Show to be held next month In New
York. (UPI)

communications. The Soviet bloc has been busy, hoping to
make a satellite of Guinea because of her desperate need for
almost everything. But while Soviet aid still is being accepted
its barter aspects are hurting the
to the balance of trade. Other
That of the U. S. la relatively small, but has a high degree
of sincerity and grass roots help. Here almost everything that
is done seems a drop In the bucket. But drops can fill buckets
Nowhere is U. S. aid getting
Africa-an- d especially in Guinea.

-- Br CLAY R--

ym mar. n M Youf Boil

Kapers Production
Medford Kiwanis club will

dedicate Its 1963 Kiwanis
Kapers production to E. Ron-

ald Rice.
Rice, member of the Med-

ford club and governor of the
Pacific Northwest district of
Kiwanis International died
Tuesday. He had taken part
in 14 past Kapers shows.

The show, "Well, Flip My
Wig," will be presented Feb.
27 and 28 and March 1 and 2
at Medford High school audi-
torium. It has all local talent
with professional direction.

Memorial services for Rice
were conducted at Wednes

Adnly GWt K
"t According ro fha Start.

To develop message lor Friday,
read words corresponding to numbers
ot your Zodiac birth sign.
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&64l-8?-9- 19 AonnjocMng 4Com Cap C. Vandagrift
MAI ISTATI APPRAISIR, CONSULTANT 4 NEGOTIATOR

ANNOUNCES
HIS NEW LOCATION

1 King Street Phone 779-166- 6

Medford, Oregon

JO Down SOli
31 Sam 31 You
32 Fe S3 An
23 Opportunity 53 And
24 And 54 Cloih
25 Go 35 Plans
26 Smites 56 Rfgordtng
27 Only 57 Important
28 Contomlng 58 You'll
29 ItKts 59 Your

uo
JULY

Add 23

MJ-O-

30 Crcureodl 60 Soclol

1961 CHEVROLET

4 Dr. Station Vfaeea Psrltwawl. l, Auto- -

:V $2299.00

LEA RAMBLER
Fifth i lartftft Phtnt 772 115(glGood Adn )Ncu...l1") 8 19.XH1

r- -' 5237-6-


