
THURSDAY. JULY il. 1069 MEDFOHD MAIL THIBUNE; MEDFOHD, ORE. D 5
LEGAL NOTICES LEGAL NOTICES 20-F- OR RENT HOUSES 24-- For Rant Mlillantout

I itON N G S P 3 1207 . 408 W. and".wm 3 PERSONAL
UNBELIEVABI.KI What "

Itx will do for Hick.
Clnssy, Nervous Stomncns, Dlssl- -

Gas, Heartburn, Nausea,
Jizzlness, etc., In 10 minutes.

Guaranteed!! F.xcluslvely at HUD.
HONS PHARMACY and MED-
FORD PHARMACY, your Rx
Specialists.

WANTED "COINS lor my collec-
tion. Early Indian and Lincoln-hea- d

cents: also complete collec-
tions. Private collector. Top cash
alueJP '

ASHLAND SKATEWAY
PUBMC SKATING HOURS

Tues. St Wed. 7:30 - 10
frl. it Set. 7:30-1- 2

Call MU

WxW Y ft

8MILINO BROTHER. milling Kon-- Democratic Prcaldontlnl nominee arc bro- -

jiudy brothon arc ihown toKolhor Wlne- - thori Robert (center) and Edward (rlht).
day at the lummer home of Son. John F.
Kennedy at llyannl.port, Mam. With the (UPI Telephoto)

Benefits From U.S. Research
Declared Expensive, Needed

TWO houses, PartfyTurn. on same
jot, vui rem oom ior sou mo.
SP 8 for Information.

NEW unfurn. Carports,
plenty of storage. Located near
Medford Shopping Center. 832
At 01 U .. mam ant 4 jiq

NEW unfurnished home,
2 baths, double garage. 3 acres.
$80. References required. Rt. 1,
Box BOJdighjjJTalentFOR RENT: l bdrm. furn. house.
Vane Lu lr. Talent Junction.

FOR RENT; Large clean 3 bdrm.
home, close to schools. 308 Haven
St. SP

VERY nice unfurn. duplex,
$80. SP or BP

FURN. 1 bdrm. cottage. Water St
garbage paid. No children or
pets. $30. SP 4 49;

UNFURN. houseT"$7"5.
aio jau i w

unfurn. 023 Grant St. In.
quire 207 Haven St.

DUPLEX Very nice lane 2 BR.
unlurn. Tile bath St klicnen, car-
port St lots of storage. Water
paid. 033 So. Holly.

LARGE clean 2 Bdrm. Huplex.
wiuvc o. nciii,. rurnace neat,
carport, storage. Children allow-e-

180. SP
FURNISHED CABINS

UTILITIES PD. KE3-H0-

FOR RENT modern cot.
teges, elec. kitchen, oil heat, $40
mo. -- uou laoie HOCK no.

FOR RENT Large 1&2 bdrm
Lots of built-ln- eara.e.

yard service. 73 St SOS. 415 Oak
l.

FOR RENT Modern unfurn
Large living rm. No drink-

ers. No dogs. M3. 210 Camp
patter na. jva

CABINS, 8 up. 3P
FURN. COTTAGE. 3m Orator

Laxe Hwy af
21 For Bant Aportnwnti
FURN1-BR- . apt. Water c gar- -

anc y.tu. ar
FURN. apt. In Gold Hill. 1 50 mo.

umiwca mm. ui.a-ii-- 0

LIVE In Ashland Cooler Cheaper.
Pleasant comDletely (urn. aot.
Utilities pd. Come look. 423 No.
Main. MU or MU

(urn. apartment, $42 30;
utilities paid. Shady Oaks Trailer

oun. wcnrrai roint.
CLEAN (urn. upstairs, entirely pri-

vate apt. 180. 310 W. Pine or
NO

CLEAN furn. upstairs apt. Close in.
Adults. 40. Call at 708 W. 6th
at. or pn. SP3-4B- or ar

CLEAN, furnished, St hath,
ground floor apt. (37.50. Water
and garbage service furnished.
at--

SMALL (urn. Water pd, 33.

FOR RENT Dandy un-
furn. aDt across from eitv
library and park. Ph. SP

CLOSE n 2 rm. apt. Most utilities
pa. wuiung lacuiues. eua w
Main.

LARGE unfurn. apt.Elect stove, refrigerator, wash-
ing facilities Ac swimming pool."uu. b mng at. ar

ATTRACTIVE (urn., most
utilities pd. Adults. 173. Grape

LARGi; Unfurn. upstairs
api. uarDage. water, neat paid,365. SP

CLEAN, ATTRACTIVE
(urn. single apt. (or employed
person. S55. Utilities paid.
344 No. Central SP

FURN. apt, (or lady. 31 N. Oakdale.
NEAT, well furnished small apartment in nawinorne Apt. House

on s.asi side. au sp
NEWLY decorated nicely furn. apt.

ior aavuts. no nets. &iec. sonit.
ances, garage, close In. water
& garbage paid. $60. SP
or at- -

NICE new apt. Birch kit-
chen, ceramic tile. $65. SP
or at--

FURN. St bath. Close in. 1
or 2 adults. $45. SP or see
uwner, tW3 W. Bartlett.

BEAUTIFUL deluxe furn. apt Newww carpet, rreierar 14.
FURN. upstairs apt. Quiet

jio ou. ivy.
furn. apt., near court

nouse. w mo. at
NICE furn. apt. Clou in.

SMALL unfurn. cottage one or
coupie. Liay or eve. SP 34923.
' luiti. wi cunniuoner, iv,
auuj. nawu OH arKT. WBlKing

lame. aw io appreciate.Adults only. SP days or
&r eves.

apt.. Stove & refrig.

wii- - o i eves.
REASONABLE 3 rm. furn. apt

.uick ucigiiuutnoua, ciose in. 1(1
rung.

FURN 1240 N. Rivendde.
OR 2 BR apt Unfurn. Elec. stove
and refrig. Heat, hot water, laun-
dry facilities. Adults. Evelynno n. ivy, ar ObiJj.

VERY NICE large unfurn.
aupiex. arpori, Dja a. MollySP

FOR RENT turn. 328 S
ivy. ara-tHB- alter 4.

CLEAN With bath. Close In. All
uuiiues pa. wasmng faculties.
si I o. xuversiae.

MEDFORD Plaza Apts. 10th St
uaKaaie. furn. at uniurn. apts.Utilities furn. Clean, safe St com-
fortable. "A really good place to
live, or no.

FOR RENT Furn or unfurn. 3
Darm apts. near college campus.

22-- For Rent Furnlshtd Rooms
CLEAN sleeping room; outside en

trance, no annKers. call SP2- -
.jyo or see at 233 Beany St.

PLEASANT room with private
bath St entrance. Carports, close
in. East side. 114 Genessee.

FURN. rm. for man. 429 N. Holly.
EXCEPTIONALLY nice rm. Close

in. Measonapie. 409 . Central.
Clean sleeping rm. 133 N. Oakdale.
RMS FOR MEN 123 S Oakdale

23-R- ent Room and Board
SLEEPING cabin, private bath.

iieai wnen necacq, ciean, well
turn. ...en only. SP

BOARD A RM Clfwp In SP 1 72

24-F- or Rent Miscellaneous
NEW office. Downtown. 8100

mo. inciuaes janitor, neat, lights
St carrier air conditioning.

or SP

FOR LEASE
Business Building

nil S. Riverside
Space 20x60. y garage,
type door 10x11 (or vehicle
entrance oft street

Ph. SP 7 13

LEAVING (or service, will rant or
lease new mobile home. No chll
dren or pets. Low rent. See al
Valley Center Trailer Court of
ph. SP eves.

ornce For rent 222 S.' C.ni

TOR RENT Warehouse space.
meaiora fuel o.

For Lease-Busin- ess BIdg.
400 E. Msln, SP

25 WANTED TO RENT
2 Sood young milch eows, 1

uuernsey, i anormorn. recenujiresn. -l jut.
TRADE livestock for 12 to IS fC

camp trailer. HI
ili mare colt, N0 4

13119.

WANTED house, vicinity
agie roini. sr

FOR LEASE house, un
furn.; acreage, barn, chicken
house, etc. SP2-8M- days, SP.

evenings.
WANTED Small house close in by

auk. ., noi over au mo. ara
-- wo.

WANT to rent house trailer for 3
mos. prereramy aa it, or iess
AQU1U OMJ. BP

WANTED by Aug. I or
wiin asn. centra, roins

school district Will lease with
option to buy. Writ Trlbun
Box 7161

ONLY

REALTORS

Display This Emblem
YOUR ASSURANCB
at INTEGRITY and
KZSPONSIBIL1TV

FOR SOtTNn REAL ESTATK
ADVICE Se. Your local Realtor

WHEN you think of r.al mm
.muiu. i op. incvr 0Biajagtncy. 224 W 6th. Madlord.

SPECIAL!

tCflA DOWN or will teas
JUU with option to buy

horns, garage, on la
ACRE Irrigated. City water as
sewer. Nice shade. Total priceS8S0O. Or make cash offer St
assume aJ. Loan. Located lust
south of Medford.

CALL

The M & M Agency
Central Point NO4-350- S

Evenings call NO 4.34.04
Margaret Naples Realtor

ONE ACRE, 2 BR .

City water, well for irrl.
ramlly orchard, garden. WITH '

a clean nouse, lovely
'

yard with lota of shade. Ww '
carpet, draw drapes. Work
shop. Insulated fruit room.
110,900, 34000 down.

IVi Acres, Nice House
Peaches, apples, berries, aprl.cot St walnut trees, garden As
pasture. Lovely house,
clrc. fireplace, built-i- n oven
St range, tile bath plus guest
bdrm. St workshop. Close In. '
Worth asking price of 313,600.

Central Point --:'
Clean carport could
be 3rd bdrm. Large dble. gar
age St storage Paved street.
Close to new hospital. 311.000.
Will rHA or CU.

Col. Teif Tfanlrin.
THE ROGUE VALLEY REALTOR

ivw raoie stock Road
"Across from the Big Y

SP ;

Nettle SUgcr SPJ-678- 4

Pat McKlnsey NO

IT WORKS FOR YOU

A very good home
with large kitchen, fireplace
and huge bedrooms. Just re-
decorated. The rental la cut
and Ideal, and easily rented.
All buildings wU be painted
outside with your choice of
color. Asking 1 10,730. Make a
reasonable offer on price St
payment.

MOVE RIGHT IN i

Easy living for the family that '

needs an Inexpensive home.
Has dining room and break-
fast room, well arrangedkitchen, comfortable livingroom. All very clean and

Large lot with good
garden spot. .Large trees and
garage. $8900.00 with $1300
down and $75 per month in-
cluding taxes.

EAGLE POINT

On an acre and a half. Thla
home Is completely remodeled
and very comfortable. Nice
yard with cyclone fence. Pas- -
ture with Irrigation water
Owner wants to sell furnished.
LOOK IT OVER.

EASTSIDE CONVENIENCE

In Earhart Park and almost
new "young of heart" home by '

' Catalano, On quiet Fortune
Drive. A good value at $14,990,

CALL Bob Bauman SP

Place Your Confidence
With The

Mackenzie Agency, Inc.
104 W. Main St SP
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICE

GOOD long logger needs steady
haul.

FREE rent for upkeep on smaU
ranch. SP

CARPENTER work. Free estimates.
H

BABY sitting. In or out. Good re'fs.
0 . 07.

PAINTING Call Harry for the
best. Average nouse ex-

terior $93. Labor St i materials
guaranteed. Best references. Free
estimates. SP

WANTED Job as companion for
elderly person, nave car. at 3--
8338.

NEW LAWNS PLANTED
Yard work St odd Jobs.

BP or SP
EXPERIENCED restaurant help

wants night work.
CHILD care for fruit season. Fenc

ed yard with play equipment.
Supervision by young adult.
Orchard Home Dr. SP

BABYSITTING, my home. SP3- -
6307,

IRONING St curtains.-S- 16.

MibDLE.agedIady wishes "light
nouseworx. Trioune jjox oziw.

WILL care for 1 or 2 children In
my home. 214 So. Columbus.

SAWMILL foreman. exper
ience. Can furnish references.
Call Glendale VE rnon

CHILD care my home. Jackson
scnooi vicinity, bp

NO FUSS, no muss, call us for
cleaning of your attics, u

St etc. Call NO for
further Information.

CEMENT work Block work, flre- -
piaces. uuaranieeq. mu a 4761.

nmrSP wnrlc hv hi SP 3.tR91
WILL do ironing. $3.50 per basket.

WANTED Carpenter work. Call
MU

CUSTOM HAYING Mow, rake,
bale and hauling. Cash or share.
SP

ROOFING WANTED SPECIALTY
shakes, wood shingles, hot

roofs. Moderate Dricei. 2806
Crater Lake Hwy.. SP

YARD work. Any kind. Have pow-
er mower. SP eves.

BABY sitting, my home, SP
IRONING SP
CHRISTIAN mother desires to care

for child between ages 4 and 7
SP

BABYSITTING SP
CUSTOM haying and combining by

nr. or ton. SP
TRACTOR WORK

Backfill, level, grade, mow.
Ernie Mallams, SP

YARD work, mowing, light hauling
and fertilizer. Ripley. 5P

SEWING. SP
HAYING on shares. SP or

SP
CHILD care, own car. S7

FURNITURE rebuilding, upholster
ing ee tailor made sup covers.
All work guaranteed. Fabric
samples. SP

ALL types carpenter work. No Job
too StnaU. St SP

CARPENTER work SP
IRONING Free pickup it delivery

PAINiING Reasonable - Lota of
local rofs. SP

Shrubs pr.ined right NO

14 Wanted Miscellaneous
WANTED 200 used field lugs.ta gar Kose. fierce na.
HAVE cash for furniture, appli

ances at miscellaneous. tfor NO
WANTED 100 yards of good

sanay 10am. contact Ken Mea-
dows, Crater Greenhouse, 1048
Crater Lake Ave. SP

OLD COrNS. MU

Best Cash Deal For
Good used furniture Sc Misc.

OAK GROVE FURNITURE
SP or SP anytime

CASH FOR FURNITURE
Misc. tools or anything saleable
Or will sell on consignment
oaie every xnurs.

WE PAY MORE!
m I -. a .

tiea oarn Auction uo,
S. Hwy. KE

WANT BARKIE POLES
Contract us for prices Sc

J. H. Baxter St Co.,
P.O. Box 30. GR Grants
Pass.

FURNITURE CASH DEAL
SP or SP

FOR a better deal on your coins
THOMPSON. SP

USED PIANOS wanted. Will pay
cash. Erskine's. SP

WE NEED FURNITURE
Call us SP

& LOANS
WANT loan up to $10,000 on Ash-

land business property. Will pay
7 Details Phone MU

WILL buy real estate contracts or
mortgages. Write Tribune Box
8186.

MONEY
CONSOLIDATE YOUR DEBTS

1. Instead of different pay-
ments each month.

3. You can have Just one conven-
ient payment monthly.

3. And only "ONE" place to pay

CRATER FINANCE
CENTRAL POINT
SEE OR PHONE

FRANK WILKINSON
NO

20-F- OR RENT HOUSES
3 RMS. Carport attached, 218

Lincoln.
unfurnished house; gar-

age. SP
FURN. Modern cottage. Suitable

for 1 or 3 adults. Patio. $45.
543', So. Ivy. SP

4 miles N. Clean,
quiet. $50, Middle aged couple
preferred. References please,
TA

UNFURN. duplex, gar-
bage. SP
DELUXE apt. Built-i- n

oven & range: storage, carport,
utility. 1102 Dakota. $00. Adults
only, no pets. SP after 3
p.m. Inquire 61 6 Han . t Item.

house. Call after 2 p.m.
SP

NICE furn duplex: garage,
fenced yard; water pd. $75. Call
SP

HOME, close In, Eastside,
$89 mo. Town At Country Realty,
SP

FOR RENT Just completed new
duplex in Talent. Call

SP
house with 19 acres
pasture. KE

CLEAN duplex, $no. Water
pd. 23 Corning Court. SP

Use Tribune Want Ads
For Action . . .

SALE
3 Months Old
GHOSTLY PULLETS

2 Months Old
KIMBER PULLETS

Farm Supply
Phone SP

NATIONAL KOItKHT TIMI1KK
FOR KAI.K

Prairie Mrlert No, 1

Oral auction hlds will ho received
by Iho Forest Supervisor or hla
authorized roprcmunuiUvo at the
ofIre of the Forest Supervisor,
Post Office Building. Medford,

beginning at a 00 P.M., Au-

gust 30, 1UIK), for all merchantable
timber marked or designated for
cutting on an area embracing 110
acres, more or luss, within Sec-

tion 30, T. 2D B., It. 3 .. ond Sec-
tion I, T. 30 8.. R. 3 E., W.M., sur-
veyed, In the Rogue River Nation-
al Forest, Douglas County, Ora- -

The estimated volumes aro:ftm. M board feet of Douglas-fi- r,

DO M board feet of pine species,
i iu an ooara ivai oi nomine at
oilier soerles. I he minimum ac
ceptable bid per M board feet Is
as follows: Douglas-fi- r 139.70, pine
species $26.40, hemlock St other
species HOMO, This Includes tho
following rates, per M board feet
for stuinpuge (including deposit
for sale area betterment); Douglns-fl- r

$211.75, nine species 121.40. hem- -
iock at outer species sj.un, ana
tn.Utl for slush dlsoosnl for nil
species. In addition there Is within
Ilia stile nren an unust minted vol
utne of Douglas-fi- r lous and blocks
uruncrchnntfthle becnuso of defect
which the bidder may usrrce to re
move at $1,20 per acre. Bids may
be submitted for either the mer-
chantable timber alone or for the
merchantable timber and unrnerch.
anKihlo Douglas-fi- r logs and blocks,
the award to be made on tho bus Is
or the total return to the United
Htatcs under the terms of the bid.
Sealed u di will be DUhliclv oDoned
and posted at tho office of Forest
supervisor ai i:uu p.m., August 39
inno. All those who submitted s

suUsfactory sealed bid will be per-
mitted Immediately to continue
aucuon mooing, a money order,
bank draft, cashier's or certified
check In the sum of $4,300 00 must
accompany each bid, to be appliedto the purchase price, refunded, or
retained for application to any
claim for damages, according to
mo conaiuons oi seie. ji requeued
by the purchaser, contract terms
will permit felling of timber In
advance of payment up to the
vaiuo oi ine pc norma nee nonn. ii
an oral bid is declared to be highat the closing of the auction, the
bidder mutt Immediately confirm
the oral bid by submitting It In
writing on a Forest Service bid
form. The rlvht to relect any and
all bids Is reserved. Forest Service
bid forms for use In submitting
sealed bids and full lnformaUon
concerning the Umber, the condi-
tions of sale and the submission of
bids should be obtained from the
unmet Hn niter, union creek
Ranger Station, or the Forest Su-

pervisor, Medford, Oregon, before
bids are submitted.

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
as hereinafter designated will be
received by the District Manager,
Bureau of Land Management, BI.M
Warehouse Area, Armory Drive,
Medford. Orecon. (Mai line address

P. O. Box 1106. Medford, Oregon)
at 10:30 A.M.. PACIFIC STASll- -
Allll TIME on Thursday. A u rust 11.

DUO. for all timber marked or
designated for cutting. Before bids
are tuommea. run iniormauon con
cerning timber, the conditions of
sale and submission of bids should
be obtained from the above Dis-
trict Manager. The right is hereby
reserved to waive any technical de-
fects In this advertisement and to
relect any or all bids. The United
Stales reserves the right to waive
any Informality in bids received
whenever sucn waiver is in ine
interest of the United States. IN
JACKKON COUNTY. OREGON:
UtVC A.N rUHLIU DOMAIN! All
timber designated for cutting on
SlsNU, NS',, SecUon 12.T. 40 8.,
It. 3 W., W.M., estimated for the

oi mis snie to dc i.ua m
Curpose Douftlas-ii- 30 M bd. ft.
ponderoia pine, 3 M bd. ft. sugar
nine, a m do. ii. incense-ceaa- r ana
10 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for
less than $22.20 per M bd. ft. for
ine uougias-nr- , 3J5 per w bd.
ft. for the pondcrosa pine, $20.90
per M bd, ft, for the sugar pine,
$1000 Dcr M bd. ft. for the in
cense-ceda- $12 45 per M bd. ft,
for the white fir. or a total

price of $39,622.20 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $4,000 00. OAC: All timber des-
ignated for cutting on EiNE1,
SWUNEi's. SEiNW", SWU. ..

NESE'4 Section 23 and
E'jNWi, Section 27, T. 34 S.. R. 3

E., W.M., esUmated for the purpose
of this sale to be 2,764 M bd. ft.
Douglns-fir- . 33 M bd. ft. ponderosa
pine, 43 M bd. ft. sugar pine. 118
M bd, ft. Incense-ceda- r and 498 M
bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less
than $2050 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fir- , $20.60 per M bd. ft. for
the ponderosa pine, $23.30 per M
bd. ft. for the sugar pine, $8.85 per
M bd. ft. for the Incense-ceaa- r,

$11.00 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir, or a total purchase price of
$h4.1121.60 will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $6,500.00.
All timber designated for cutting
on SWU. W'iSEU, SESEU Sec-
tion 21, T. 38 S., R, 3 E.. W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 248 M bd. ft. Douglasn r, U7 m na. it. ponaerosa pine, M
M bd, ft. sugar pine. 45 M bd. ft.
Incense-cedn- and 476 M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
$10.53 per M bd. ft. for the r.

$15.75 per M bd. ft. for
the pondcrosa pine, $21.f)0 per M
bd. ft, for the sugar pine, $7.30

M bd. ft. for the Incense-cedn-
Ser per M bd. ft. for the white
nr. or a uttni ourennae once oi

11. 028.05 will be considered. Mini
mum deposit with bid $1,000.00.

FUEL AND INSURANCE BIDS
School District No. 6. Jackson

County, Central Point. Oregon,
will receive bids unUl 8 P.M. Au-

gust 9. 1060, for Items as listed
herewith at the office of the
School Superintendent, at the
Crater High School building, at
which time bids will be received
and opened. Detailed specifications
may be obtained from tho school
clerk. The right is reserved to re-

ject any or all bldi and to waive
any informalities.

1. Insurance Comprehensive lia-

bility Insurance covering school
directors, employees, and school
buses,

2. Approximately 30,000 gallons,
regular grade, to be delivered as
required ai me mnKS oi me acnooi
District at Central Point (tank
capacity 330 gallons); at Gold Hill
(tank cnpnclty 550 gallons); and at
Sams Valley School (tank capacity
21)0 gnllnns).

3. siove (J Approximnieiy
10,000 gallon. Pacific Const Spec.
100. to be delivered ns rcoulred nt
the tnnks of the School District at
Central Point Junior High school.
Didder may submit an outline of
burner service and maintenance
which will be furnished.

4, Fuel Oil Approximately 40,-0-

gallons. Pacific Const Spec. 300,
to bo delivered to thrco tanks, each
of 10,000 gnllon cnpnclty.

Gold Hill One tank at Hanhy
School (old school) will use 15,000
g til Ions. One tank at Patrick School
(now school) will use 20,000 gnllons.
Central Point Jcwctt Elcm. School
(new school) will use 20,000 gnllons.

5. Fuel Oil Approximately 3,000
gnllons Pacific Const Spec. 200, to
be delivered nt tanks at the Sams
Valley School building, and CP.
Jr. High Gym.

8. Sawdust Approximately 1,000
units of snwdust delivered to the
schools at Central Point as needed.
Snwdust must be fresh burnnhle
Doug ns ftr snwdust from sound
logs not to exceed 45 water con-
tent. No sawdust which has gone
through a heat will bo accepted.
Tho successful bidder will be re-

quired to furnish a pcrformanco
baud In tho amount of tho con-
tract to gunrnntco delivery,
Snmptrs may bo required.

Fuels as Hated are to be delivered
between tho dates of Sept. 1, 1060,
and August 31, 1061,

Hlds for nny or all of the sev-
eral Items are to bo dollvered to
Mrs, Merle Obcnchnln. Clork nf
School District No, 0, P.O. Box 437,
Central Point, on or before tho
date specified for opening of the
bids.

Use Tribune Want Ads

TIMBER FOR HALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT ORAL AUCTION
as hereinafter designated will be
roceaved by the District Manager,
Bureau or Land Management, RLM
Warehouse Area, Armory Drive,
Medford, Oregon, (Mailing address

PO. Box 1100) at 10:30 A.M.,
PACIFIC STAND Alt!! TIME on
Thursday, August 18, 1000, for all
timber marked or designated for
cutting. Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be ob-
tained from the above District
Manager, ine right la hereby re
served to waive anv technical de
fects In this advertisement and to
reject any or all bids. The United
States reserves the right to waive
any Informality In bids received
whenever such waiver is In tho
interest or the united Htatcs. IN
JACKSON COUNTY. OREGON:
PUBLIC DOMAIN; All Umber de-

signated for cutting on HE'.'NW''H
KecUon 17, T, 3$ 8.. K. 1 E,. W.M..
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 153 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r,

81 M bd. ft. ponderosa pineand 8 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid
for less than $I8.')0 ocr M bd. ft
for tho Douglas-fi- $15.70 per M
bd. ft. for tho Dond cross nine and
$0.00 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir, or a total purchase price of
$4,143.60 will be considered. Mini
mum deposit with bid $430.00.

CLASSIFIED
AD DIRECTORY

PERSONAL
(jOdf Notlcfli . 1

Specif Club Evtnt, . a
PerBonal . 3
Lort and Found 4
Instruction. . S
Winltl Mall Help 10
Wanted Female Help 11
Male or Female Help 12
Wanted Sltuatloni .. 13
Wanted Miscellaneous 14
Financial St Loans 19

REAL ESTATE
For Rent Houses 20
For Rent Apartments 21
For Rent Furnished Rooms - 11
Rent Rooms and Board 23
For Rent Miscellaneous
wonted To Rent
Medford Realty Board -
For Sale Real Estate
Business Opportunities
Wanted Real Estate

FOR SALE MISCELLANEOUS
Building Supplies . 40
Appliances 41
rurmiure 42
Musical Equip., Radio, TV . 43
Sports and Hobbles - 44
Miscellaneous 45
Dogs and Pet SO

Poultry SI
Livestock 52
Wanted Livestock 53
Bay, Grain and Feed . 64
Fruits it Vegetables - S3

Automotive & Equipment
Machinery and Tractora 60
Logging Equipment 61
Equipment for Rent .. 62
Trailers 70
Parts and Accessories 71

Cycles and Scooters 72
Cars and Trucks 73

UNCLASSIFIED COPY
Too Late to Classify A
Business Directory B
Card of Thanks C

Classified Rates
1 day per word - le
2 days per word . So
3 days per word loe
4 days per word ize

days per word .14a
By Line Per Month 9225

(Minimum First Issue 50c)

Ituslneti Directory
Each line per month .fl-TS

Minimum per monUi

Dead Line on Classified Ads
530 pjn. for following day,
except 10 for Monday;
for Sunday noon Saturday

Dead Line on Display Classi-
fied Ads 10:00 A M. Saturday
for Sunday and Monday
3 PJM. the day before publi-
cation for Tues. through Frl.

APPROVED CREDIT

CHARGES BILLED

BY THE LINK

A Too Late To Classify
FOR SALE Mining claim on Sar-

dine Creek; 40 acres, small
cabin and S stamp mill. Call
SP3. 1 3 19.

FOR RENT unfurn.
house, $43 mo, 2809 N. Pacific
Hwy.

NOTICE If you are bothered with
your trees dripping from Aphis
or Caterpillar. Wi throw. SP
or SP

LARGE BUSINESS building for
sale or lease. 160-f- t. highway
frontage In Medford. SP 4 59.

FOR SALE Near new
home, plastered, hardwood
floors, colored bath fixtures,
Youngstown kitchen, wardrobe
closets, insulated At weather-strippe-

baseboard elec. heat
living area, oversize single at-

tached garage. $9750, Terms. 207
F.lm St.

FOR RENT Clean, furn., upstairs
apt. Close in, suitable for 1 or 2
adults. S P2-7- 3 00;

FOR SALE Double car garage,
folding doors with track Ac all
hardware. $20. 1610 E. Main.

HEATHKIT

From your authorized factory
representative. Southern Ore.
Northern Calif.

VERL G WALKER CO.
203 W Jackson SP

Med font Oregon
ROUGH CEDAR FENCING 6 to

$35. per M. 1x6 Ac 8" pencil
cedar paneling $40. per M. Dutch
Boy outside white houso paint,
reg. $0.40, now $5.25 gal. Pabco
Asbestos siding $15.50 sq. Norton
Lumber Co. Phoenix, CampWhite and Ashland. S Ac H
Green Stamps.

FENCE POST
Yew Wood.
7xf) B corner posts.
Pressure treated creosote post.
FARMERS LUMBER CO.

Burnett It Riverside SP

SPECIAL
BILTWELL W1NDAW UNITS,

ASSEMBLED
Regular Snie

1 3!lxl8.. $.0.01) $12 00
4 39.22... $22.03 $12.83

44x18 $22.63 .$.8SDOUBLE UNITS
4 39x18 $38.18 . $21.28
4 39x22 $42.08 $22 85
8 44x18 $41.36 $22.90
8 28x14 $30.08 $17.20

FARMERS LUMBER CO.
Burnett te Riverside, SP

BUNDLES OF OLD NEWSPAPERS
for snie, 20c ench. Mall Tribune
offlrc 33 North Fir

FOR RENT Clean apt. close In,
with bath. All utilities paid.
Washing (ncllltios, 217 S, River-
side.

SEVERAL used fv sivhT Eow
priced. l. Ill W. Central.

RODACOLOR or SLIDES' enlarged
3x7, $1: 8x10 $2 Phillips,
703 Brntly. SP

NOTICE I will not he responsible
tor any debts othor than my
own alter this data. Ronald W.
Adkins, Box 304, Phoenix. Ore,

REAL ESTATE LOANS to $2500.
Commercial Industrial Finance
Corp., Main & Riverside SP

BAWEElCfH Products. 8P2-438- 7

ANYONE having a drinking prob-
lem Is welcome at Alcoholic
Anonymous 830 p.m. Tues & Sat.
n 0 8 r of 212 N Onkd a e SP

IvIASON shoes. SP
HAVING MONEY PROBLEMS?
See Dick Milestone. He can ar-
range a loan tor you from 150
to $1500 on furniture, automo-
bile or salary. American Finance
Corp., 123 W. Main St Ph. BP- -

WATKINS Products SP
REMEMBER

DAN PATCH CO. builds
TOP VALUE HOMES.

DENTURES repaired it
while you wait. Day or eve. Pb.
BP Lozler Lf.t.

Merle Norman Cosmetic
214 riuhrer BIdg

STANLEY PRODUCTS
RENA HAGLKR. SP

AND FOUND
THESE stray dogs are at the Coun

ty rouna ana win oe neui &

days:
One black St white mixed female
pup. One brown, black St white
mixed male. One brown it white
mixed male with 1960 license
No, 822. One black, white mixed
male. One black part Lab. male.
One brown mixed female. One
black 6c white mixed male. One
brown St white Terrlor male.
One white male Pug. with 1960
license No. 5328. One red male
Cocker.

WILL the finder of billfold belong-
ing to Michael Redmond, Rt. 4.
Box 393, please keep the 9 and
mall me the reit.

FOUND: Good curls at LADY
MEDFORD BEAUTY SALON
Mally Robertson, Alice Gldney.
Ann Marie Runyan and Pat Mo
Vay.

5 INSTRUCTIONS
STRING BASS Slmandl method.

SP
APPLICATION for Electronics Auto

Mechanics, and Practical Nurse
training are available at the Med-
ford Senior High School. For in- -
formation call SP

GUITAR LESSONS. KE
WANT a TRADE WITH a FUTURE?

Learn to operate bulldozers, mo-
tor graders and other heavy
equipment the way contractors
want it operated. America's only
contractor owned and operated
school. VA approved. Write for
full details. WESTERN SCHOOL,
WEISER. IDAHO.

ED MALE HELP
LARGE milling company has open-

ing for Southern Oregon Sales-
man. Headquarters Medford or
vicinity. Salary, bonus and fringe
benefits. Car furnished. Write
name, age, education St

to Tribune Box 8376.
A- OPPORTUNITY

MAN or woman to deliver na
tional brand of instant coffee to
motels. Several territories avail-
able. No selling. Just supply es-
tablished accounts. Must have
car, be permanent resident and
be able to Invest $2,950 for in
ventory. Excellent return for
few hours spare time work. For
Interview write immediately giv
ing pnone numoer 10 kwik jvup
.gmpanj. iriounc dqx oiot.

ALERT Industries representative
wanted for Medford regional of-
fice of rapidly growing firm. Pre-
fer bondable man with sales or
public relations experience. Make
home safety presentations to in
terested persons oy appointmentsmade for you. Take the first step
toward an exciting future. Ade-
quate Income assured while
training. See manager, Mr.

at 1213 N. Riverside. Med-
ford. No phone calls. 9 to 11
Salary and commission.

IMMEDIATELY

Man for tales work ' with old
reliable firm.

WE OFFER
A salary plus commission &
bonuses. We furn. a company
car & expenses, paid vacation,
a company retirement St Insur-
ance program.

WE EXPECT IN RETURN
A neat & aggressive man will-ttr-

WWft "14 t i SI J ft 1U
oi living & future ad-

vancement with a progressive &
expanding company. See Mr.
Mcatte mornings 9 a.m. to 11
a.m. Singer Sewing Machine
Company 318 E. Main.

WANTED Experienced meat cut.
ter. Self service shop. No eve. or
Sun. work. Wages $150 per week.
Call TRojan Riddle or con-
tact Vedder's Market, Riddle,
uregon

BRIGHT alert man Interested in
learning to make money. Person-
al interview given 9 to 10 ajn.Mon.. Tues. & Wed. Polar-Col- d

UO.. 3430 n. pacific Hwy.
$100 A WEEK GUARANTEED

Rich Plan of So. Oregon
20 S. Fir St.. Medford

M --WANTED FEMALE HELP
BABYSITTER My home or yours.

rnoemx area, ims
MAID with experience. Please call

l to s pjn. rnoemx Motet, ke
UTILITY waitress. Relief on all

shifts. 40 hrs. wk. Union scale.
Call at 1182 Court, ask for Cash.

WANTED Experienced cocktail
waitress. Apply in person Med-
ford Hotel Lounge.

WOMAN WANTED for finance
company office. Recent high
school graduate acceptable. No
experience necessary. Must know
typing and shorthand.
week. Apply In person only, to
Crater Finance Corp., Centrnl
Point, between 9 & 10 a.m.,
Monday through Friday.

12 MALE OR FEMALE HELP
SALES PERSONNEL

HIGH EARNINGS
Experience helpful but not nec-
essary. Immediate earnings if
you can qualify. No competitionin selling a product that every-
one needs and wants. Must be 21
or over, no maximum age limit,
have car, and be willing to work.
Seo Mr. Leo Meadows at 827 W.
Jackson, between 9 a.m. and 11
a.m. or phone SP COM-
MUNITY HEALTH ASSOCIA-
TION, INC.

EARN up to $4 hr. in commission
selling Keai miks famous wear-
ing apparel. For Information call
SP after 6 p.m.

FOR

1,000
3,000

Albers Feed &
330 North Fir

value of hydrazine alone con
not be calculated In dollars
and cents.

Pycrocoram, developed for
missile radomc (housing for
radar antennas), hus made
possible better and more at-

tractive pots and pans for the
modern kitchen. Satellite scan
dovlces are being used in such
domestic Infrared appliances
as lumps, roasters, and ovens.
Better portable radio and tel-

evision sots are available now
because of miniature electron-
ics and bearings used In and
designed originally for satel-
lites.

There are new matorlals,
fabrics, alloys and compounds
that are being adapted for
consumer commcrical mar-
ket.

Silicones used for motor In-

sulation and subzero lubri-
cants required for space arc
being used In new

techniques for countless
products for both home and
industry.
Improve Aircraft

Engines, automatic pilot,
radar systems and flight
equipment, dovelopcd for
spuco already have been used
to Improve conventional air-
craft.

Missiles have been used to
help build the St. Lawrence
seaway and are bringing down
the high costs of quarrying,
thus making economically
available new sources of ore
and hydrocarbons.

In the future, mall may
become almost as swift as
telophone when guidance de-

vices, now being developed,
make possible soft landings
necessary for commcrical roc-
ket cargo and passenger trans-
port.

A new welding process us-

ing a electron
beam will mean stronger and
more buildings
and homes in the future at
more economical cost.
Provides New Tools

Space research has provid-
ed new tools for food and
agriculture. Infrared blanch-
ing Is a new and effective
technique In preparing foods
for canning and freezing. A
new forage harvester based
on principals of aerodynamics
developed by missile engine-
ers is a spaceago contribution
to the age-ol- d profession of
farming.

The development of new
foods for growth In the con-
fines of a space cabin may
prove to be a vaulablc food
source as the world popula-
tion climbs and our conven-
tional food sources decline.

Weather modification is
another promise of the space
age further in the future. But
better understanding of
weather processes soon may
make accurate, long-rang- e

weather prediction possible
which would mean millions
of dollars saved by being able
to know when to plant crops
as well as being able to avoid
crop damage,
Work Invaluable

Tho Army's work on an
n drug not only

would be Invaluable In civil
defense In the event of atomic
war, but It would be a great
protection for atomic workers
in peaceful pursuits.

The axiom that you have to
spend money to make money
is amply demonstrated in the
space program which has
opened vast now industries,
thus increasing the demand
for workers and specialists,
scientists and technicians to
an e high, Increasing

WnsliliiKton, (Sclonco Sorv.
U--) milium of dollar al
ready huve been poured into
paco renearch and burned up

In rocket luiinchc.; and in the
next decade, the U.S. will
apend another $30 to $50 bil-

lion on II apace program.
The financial Investment la

ataitiferlnK; but, happily, o
are the bonoflta already re-

ceived a well as the promise
of (uturo dlvldonds.

Our efforts In space have
greatly advunccd medical re-

search. Hydrazine, a liquid
missile propcllnnt, has proved
useful In treating certain men-
tal illnesses and tuberculosis.
Space designed electronic
equipment is being adapted to
measure body temperature
and blood flow. Film resist-
ance thermometers, highly
useful In medical roscarch,
arc another development from
the space program.
Can't Ba Calculated

The unexpected and Import-
ant breakthrough from the
one discovery of the medical

Scientists fo

Fish for Profile

Of Ocean Floor
New York - (Sclonce Serv-

ice) - Scientists will soon drop
a rockct-ahape- device to the
ocean floor about 180 miles
west of Bermuda and fish for
profiles of the ocean bottom.

The device Is a new under-
water seismograph for record-

ing shock waves. It was built
at Columbia University's

Geological observatory
In PnlUndos, N.Y.

It may toll scientist now
things about under water
sound transmission and may
Indicate a fairly good sound
channel or wave guide in the
upper part of the ocean-botto-

scdlmont. These sound
atudies could have application
In military communications
and submarine detection sys-
tems.

John Ewlng, the Lamont
geophysiclat who will direct
the test of the new
device, believes the device
will be "as valuable to us as

telescope on a high moun-

tain is to an astronomer."
Has Not Con

Columbia university' re-

search team was scheduled to
leavo July 15 for tho tests.
Tho now device hos a
noso cono with a spike on one
end and tall fins on Uie otlier.

Tho scientist will drop the
device noso first into sedi-

ment 18,000 feot below the
ocean' surface. It will stand

upright on its spike.
Columbia's converted mine

sweeper, Sir Horace Lnmb,
will drop depth charges and
tho seismograph will record
tho shock.
Signals Amplified

As the s e 1 s m o graph re-

sponds to motions of tho earth,
Its signals will be amplified
and transmitted through tho
wutor acoustically to Colum-

bia's schooner Grace.
Tho seismograph may also

be useful In recording natural
earthquakes that often occur
under tho ocean, and In study-

ing ocean-botto- sediment.
The transistorized device

has batteries that will keep it
functioning for four and a

half to five days.

employment and notional In
come.

These are some of Iho vnlu-nbl- o

rewards reaped from ef-

fort In space as reported by
the Hou.se committee on Sci-

ence and Astronautics In The
Practical Values of Space Ex-

plorations. But probably the
Rreatevt benefit may come In
that, as nations arrive to con-

quer space, the hlffh cost of
space cxplorntlon may force
nations striving to conquer
that area to give up conquer-
ing each other.

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT or THE

STATE OK OREGON FOR THE
COUNTY Or JACKSON

JUVENUI.K DEPARTMENT
In tho Matter of GEORGE AR-

THUR LaCOUHSE a minor
TO: ARTHUR GEORGE LaCOtJRSE

ml ELIZABETH MADGE
GATES LnCOURSE. the parenle
of G cur go Arthur L Course,
minor

IN THE NAME OK THE STATE
OF OREGON you are hereby re-

quired to appear at a hearing In
tho d court on the

d matter, which aaid
hearing hall be held on August 1,
ltfflO. at the hour of 1:30 o'clock
p.m. or aa soon thereafter ai the
lime may he heard.

A proceeding concerning the
child la pending In the court and
an order making an adjudication
with reference to him will be en-
tered therein.

If you fall to appear the Court
will conduct a proceeding con-
cerning the child and will enter an
order making an adjudication with
reference to him.

Thla lummoni In publlahed once
each week for three iucceilve
weeka commencing July 7, IBflO. In
accordance with an order of the
Judge of the above court entered
herein on the 5th day of July, jOflo.

VAN DYKE. D ELLEN BACK
St McGOODWIN

Attorney! for petitioner
By J. V. McOoodwln

110 East Sixth Street
Med ford, Oregon

PRORATE NO. 10R2S
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE
OF

CHARLES A. WING. Deceased
Notice li hereby given that the

underalgncd was appointed execu-
tor of the estate of Charles A.
Wing, deceased, by an Order of
the above entitled Court dated
June 39, 1080, made and entered
In the matter of said estate. All
peraons having claims against anld
estate are hereby notified to pre-
sent the in me to the undersigned
at Its offices at 1 Ea.it Main Street,
Med (or d, Oregon, proporly veri-
fied as provided by law and within
alx months from the dnta of first
publication of this notice.

Dated and first published this
30th dny of June, 1000.

THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK
OF OREGON
Executor

Farrelt St Blackhurst
Attorneys for Executor

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
In the Circuit Court of the State

of Oregon for tho County of Jack-io-

Probate Department.
In the Mnttcr ul the Estate of

Loud R, Martin Deceased, No.
10.148.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
that tho undersigned has filed hla
Final Account its Administrator of
the above estate with the Circuit
Court of said County, and the Court
hnt fixed the 1st day of August,
1000, at the hour of 0:30 A.M..
of aaid day and the Circuit Judge s
office In the County Courthouse in
Medford, Oregon, as the time and
place respectively for the henrlng
of objections If any there be, to
the said Final Account, and you
are hereby notified to file objec-
tions, If any you have, to sntd
Final Account on or before tho
time fixed for hearing.

Dnted and first published this
30th dny or June, liinn.

RAYMOND L. MARTIN,
Administrator

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

Iho undersigned tins been duly up- -
In tad by tho Circuit Court of theEn of Oregon for Jncksnn Coun-

ty, ns Executrix of tho Estate of
WILLIAM FISHER GRIFFITH,

and hns duly qualified na
such.

NOW, THEREFORE, all persona
having claims against nnld Estate
are hereby noli fled and required
lo prusont the same, together with
proper vouchers therefor, to the
undersigned In care of Colonel Ted
Hopkins, Rnguo River, Jnckson
County, Oregon, within six months
from tho date hereof.

Dated this 30th dny of June, 1080.
LOU GRACE HEYMAN
Executrix of the Eitnte of
William Fisher Griffith,

Drrenscd.
J, Arthur Berg

Attorney at Lnw
Coqulllo, Oregon

NOTICE TO THE PDI1LIC
Tho Jackson County Court will

hold a public hearing In the Coun-
ty Court Room, Court Houso, Fri-
day, July ail, ID IK) at it o'clock
A.M. for tho purpose- of taking
net ion upon application of Frank
Preston, dba Hunter's Tavern,

at tho Four Comers on
Crater Lake Highway, to secure
Court approval of a llconso to nell
Wine not to exceed 14 alcohol,
All persons Interested are roqucntcd
to attend

Earl M Miller
County Judge

Chester II. Wondt
County Commissioner

R, A. Jnmos
County Commissioner

BARGAIN GRADE

2x4x8'
t

I100 Per M'

Cheney Sfud Mill

Central Point
amis


