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1 PUBLIC AUCTION BUILDINGS
- April II. 1M0 at 9:00 A.M.

Capitol MemoThe Oregon Stat Highway Comm.iiion will offer for tale at oral
nnhllc auction the following build. nm In the Med ford area. The iale
will be held on the premlaea of

by such disadvantages as lack
of cohesion, lack of supervi-
sion, and a tremendous

. ."
The Goldhammer reportwas the first in a series, part

of a broaded study of the
curriculum of Oregon schools,
quality of education and
teacher utilization and per-
sonnel practices.

Another dozen or so re-

ports are in the making.

Husband Gets Even
For Wife's Splurging

Long Beach, Calif.-- A man
who said "My wife splurged
for Christmas, now lt'i my
turn" spent 43 minutes choos-

ing shirts, ties and other ap-

parel in a store.
Then he turned a gun on

the clerk, took $75 from the
cash register and fled with
both the money and clothing.

" the next order on Apru iv, iwou, ai w;ou J.m.:' The former Childera houie at 419 Spencer Ave., Medford, Ore- -
i gon. (File 29083)

The former Glau houaa at 425 Karhart Road, Medford. Ore
eon. (File 29094)
The former Dean houie a. 1312 Barnett Road, Medford, Ore- -

Applegaie Kin

Dies at Yoncalla
Yoncalla - (UPD - Funeral

services were to be held today
for Mrs. Annie Appiegate
Kruse, 84, granddaughter of
pioneer Douglas county settler
Charles Appiegate.

Mrs. Kruse, an author of
several books dealing with
Douglas county history, died
Monday. Survivors include
two sons, two brothers and
three sisters.

UO Research Bureau
Discovers Reasons
For Teachers Moving

ton. (File 28B7B)
? BUILDINGS MUST BK REMOVED WITHIN AO DAYS TROM THE

TERMSOF SALE: Caih or check at time of iale. The above buildingi
- to be lold to the highest bidder at public auction with the State

described In the British scien-
tific journal Nature here by
H. Koopman and J. Daams of
N.V. Phllips-Dupha- Holland.

H 133 was found to be es-

pecially effective in inhibi-

ting germination of seeds. It Is
easily absorbed by seeds
either from a solution or from
the vapor,

Young growing tips were
found to be very sensitive to
the compound, which acts via
the roots as well as by way of
the green parts of the plants.

Experiments in which res-

piration or photosythesis was
measured showed that neither
of these processes in tobacco
leaves was inhibited if the
leaves were placed in a sat-
urated solution of H 133.

New Herbicide

Kills Young Plants
London, (Science Service)-- A

new herbicide has been re-

ported that ts especially effec-
tive in killing young plants
yet has a low acute toxicity
for warm-bloode- d animals.

It is active against many
weeds, such as wild oat, brac-
ken, chickweed and cleavers.
Seds of some plants, however,
such as rice, groundnuts, corn
and sunflower, show a dis-
tinct resistance to it.

The substance is
and is known by

the code name H 133. Experi-
ments Involving its use were

- reeerving ine ngni w accept or ny or mti uiu.
price muit accompany the aucceuful bid. Consult your mover prior

LUMBER OUTPUT
Washington - The U.S. pro-

duces about 36 per cent of the
world's total lumber supply.

I 1
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INFORMATION:' Property Mgr., 806

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
SeDarate sealed proposals for

Mih nf th following streeu,
'addressed to the City Council of

the City of Central Point. Oregon,
and endorsed "Proposal for street
Improvement," will be received
at the office of the City Recorder

.until 7:30 PJfl. on the 36th day of

.April, 1880.
The work consists of excavation

and grading complete, concrei
curbs both sides, asphaltlc paving
and other work pertaining thereto

'on the loiiowing sireeis:
7 Hazel Streetr-Th- ird to Tenth

The total principal bid Items
- upon which separate bids for each

project Invited are:
" Excavation and grading complete

Creek run gravel, stone oase. Crushed granite, leveling course
concrete euros
Drima nnii MP. 5 Oil sliced

' Asphaltlc concrete pavement, 1"
thick

Plane, specifications. Instructions
. in niaaers, special ptuvmww, Hm-- .

(( in hn tiBPrl In pomoarlnff bids,
nnrap Anrt hnnri fnrmi for each

project can be obtained at the
. Oil ice Oi ns ii..v nctuiusi ,

Hb), Central Point, Oregon, upon
.deposit of Ten and no100 Dollars
i (910.00).

Bids must be accompanied by a
"certified check equivalent to five
.'per cent (S of the proposal pay- -

able to the Treasurer of the City
of Central Point, or a Bidder's

' Bond In like amount which will
' guarantee that if a proposal Is ac- -

cepted, a contract will be entered
fir into and it performance assured.
. Bid must be In writing, signed
"by or on behalf of the Bidder.

The City of Central Point re-- -
serve the right to reject any and

; all bids and to accept such bids aa
, are to the best Interest of the City
; and consideration of bids received

is contingent upon the City Coun- -
ell approving and ordering the
above mentioned street improve-- :
menu at a hearing thereupon to

i THE CITY OF CENTRAL POINT
f By: Lyle Paull

City Recorder
Dated April 5, I960

NOTICK TO BIDDERS
Separate sealed proposal for

s eacn of tne toi lowing atresia,
addressed to the Cltv Council oi
the City of Central Point, Oregon,
and endorsed "Proposal for Street
Improvements" 7:30 P.M. on the

P nmk 4 ... Anvil i nai
The work consist of asphaltlc

paving, and other work pertaining

Wizard 22" Deluxe Mower

leading power mower value.
inner ring confines clip
pulverized.

Fingertip throttle coo
handlebar. Safety Float-Loc- k

Adjust-O-Mati- c trim heights.

wim m rs a a a, Mm .usma

TLmw'm a Wi'vnrf Sap Evsirv Lawn
. . . Every Budget! See Them Today!
No matter how large or small your lawn is,
Western Auto has just the right mower to
solve your mowing problems. Come in and
see our complete line of Wizard rotary,

and riding mowers today!

r uieroio an ina iQiiuwuigSouth Second Street Fine to
f Bush
X The total principal bid Items
v upon which separate bid for each
; project Invited are:

AsphsHto concrete pavement, 2
thick

Prime coat, MC-- 2 Oil placed
Plans, specifications, Instructions

to bidder, special provisions,
quantities to be used In comparing
bids, contract and bond forms for
each project can be obtained at
the office of the City Recorder,
City hall. Central Point, Oregon,
upon deposit of Ten and no100

! Dollar (910.00).
Bids must be accompanied by a

certified check equivalent to five
? per cent (5) of the propoaal pay- -

ihli tn the Treasurer of the City

at least 359 Oregon teachers
relocated last year. All were

queried, 49 per cent replied
and most said it was better
pay that made them move.
Haasons Brokan Down

Tha Goldhammer group
broke down the reasons into
three sections; Economic, per-
sonal and professional.

Of the 339, 190 moved to
California and 169 to Wash-

ington. Higher pay was Cali-
fornia's biggest lure while the
chief reason for moving to
Washington was because their
spouses were transferred or
got work there. More money
also was a factor in the Ever-

green state.
The average salary Increase

of those moving to California
was $977 a year and In Wash-

ington $617.
Some Samples

The unsatisfied teachers
were asked why they moved.
Some samples:

"There is a closer relation-
ship between administrators
and teaching staff."

". , . Teachers have stand-

ing in the community (in the
new locale) ..."

"Less interferences with
teachers by school boards,
principals, and parents, more
attention to discipline . . . few
useless meetings, no lesson
plans required."

One irate teacher wrote:
"Some young veterans from
World War II holding public
relations Jobs in the name of
principals are a menace to
Oregon."
Recurring Theme

The recurring theme in
moving for professional rea-
sons was better opportunity
for advancement in larger
school systems In more popu
lous areas, and a lighter load.
Along with higher salaries,
other economic drawing cards
for California and Washing-
ton Included better state sup-

port of schools, a better state
retirement system and a more
liberal system of fringe bene-
fits.

One teacher took a job in
California paying $2,000 a
year over her Oregon salary.

"Should the state of Ore-

gon ever find It possible to
keep pace salary wise with
states such as California and
Washington," one instructor
replied, "and to meet the ex-

cellency of its curriculum,
I'm very sure you will have
no difficulty attracting the
best of the teaching profes-
sion."
Expects to Return

A few found the new pas
tures not so green after all.
One wrote, that "the disad-

vantages are such, In my case,
that we expect to return to
Oregon. The advantages such
as greater pay, excellent
working conditions, and larg
er budget- for art, are offset

LEGAL' NOTICES

NOTICE OF ANNUAL SCHOOL
ELECTION AND MEETING

notice is Hereby given, in
compliance with Sec. 331.010, ORS,
to uie legal voters oi acnooi uui-ri-

No. 1, of Jackson County,
State of Oregon, that tha ANNUAL
SCHOOL ELECTION of sntd Dist-
rict will b held at the High
School; between the hours of 2
P.M. and 8 P.M. on the tirst Mon-
day of May, being the 2nd day of
May, A.D. 1060, for thi purpose of
electing one local director tor a
five year term; one rural scnoni
board member Zone S. for a two
year term; one rural school board
member, member-at-larg- e for a
two year term.

uated tnis lain aay oi Apru,
li)60.

Douglas Finch
Chairman Board of Directors

ATTEST;
Zelda Edmondson
District Clerk

No. 1029
NOTICE

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT Or THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY
In tht Matter of the Estate of

THOMAS A. NABOBS.
ueceaiea.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
that the undersigned administra-
trix of the above estate has filed
her final report and account and
that Monday, May 2, 160 at 9:30
o'clock A.M. at the courthouse In
the cltv of Medford, Jackson Coun-t-

Oregon has been fixed by the
above named court as the time
and place for hearing objections
to said final report and account
and for the examination and al-

lowance thereof.
Dated and flnt published this

3 1st tlflv of March. 1U60

ETHKL NABOBS otlREKVK.
Administratrix

FROHNMAYER, LOWRY, HOGAN
At IiEATHVKAuG

Attorneys for Administratrix

Put Your Confidence in Precision-Engineer- ed Wizard
Power Mowers Chosen Nearly 1 Million Times!

By DOUGLAS GRIPP
flock

of Oregon teachers gave their
schools and students the
heavcho in 1059 and moved
to what they considered green-
er pastures In California and
Washington. Most of them
are happy, too.

Alarmed by this trend, the
Legislative Interim Commit
tee on Education asked the
University of Oregon's Bureau
of Educational Research to
find out why.

Dr. Keith Goldhammer, bu
reau director, has turned over
the results of the study to
the committee.

The researchers found that

LEGAL NOTICES

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS a, hereinafter designated will
be received by the District Man
ager. Bureau of Land Management,
BLM warehouse Area. Armory
Drive, Medford, Oregon. (Mailing
address P. o. Box 11". Medloro,
Oregon at 10:30 A. M., PACIFIC
KTANI) ARB TIME, on Thursday,
April 28, 1900, for all timber mark-
ed or designated for cutting. Be-

fore bids are submitted full Infor-
mation concerning the timber, the
conditions of sale and submission
of bids should be obtained irom
above District Manager. The right
l hprnhv reserved to waive techni
cal defects In this advertisement
and to retect anv or all bids, tne
United States reserves the right to
waive any informality in bids re-

ceived whenever such waiver Is In
the Interest of the United States.
IN JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON:
O&C: All timber designated for
cutting on S'iNE'i. SE!'NW'.i
Section 25, T. 34 S R. 1 K W. M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sole to be 34 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r,

l.l M bd. ft. oonderosa Dine, l M
bd. ft. Incense-ceda- r and 1 M bd.
ft. white fir. No bid for less than
$23.60 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fl- r.

an fl oer M bd. ft. for the
ponderosa pine, $0.00 per M bd.
ft. for the lncense-ceda- $10.03 per
m hri rt. for the white fir. or a total
purchase price of $1,2BS.10 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $100.00. All timber designated
for cutting on lots 2 and 3, Section
3, T. 34 S., R. 3 W., W. M., esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 09 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r and
1 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine. No bid
for less than $23.50 per M bd. ft. for
tha Douslas-fl- r and $20.00 per M
bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine, or
a total purchase price of $2,346.50
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid $250.00.

NOTICE OF SCHOOL ELECTION
UPON THE HUKS-IIIII- ur IN-

CREASING TAX LEVY OVER
AMOUNT LIMITED BY SECTION
II, ARTICLE XI, ORKOON hiais
CONSTITUTION.
Notice Is hereby given that an

election will be held In School Dis-

trict No. 6 of Jackson County, State
nt n.mi from a P.M. to 8 P.M.
nn Mnv 2 num. In the Central
Point Junior High School Gym
nasium, the Gold Hill School Gym-
nasium, and the Sams Valley School
Building. In said school district, for
the purpose or suomuung to wic
legal school voters of said school
district, the question of increasing
the tax levy for the fiscal year

over the amount limited
by Section II, Article XI, of the
Constitution of Oregon.

The reasons for increasing such

The amount now within the 8
limitation Is Inadequate to operate
the school; there is an Increase
in cost of supplies; operational costs
are higher; additional teachers and
buses are needed.

The amount of tax, in excess ui
tfcn R& limitation. Drooosed to be
levied for said fiscal year la $566,- -

1900.
C. Norman Gail
Chairman Board of Directors

ATTEST:
Merle Ohencnain
District Clerk

NOTICE OF ANNUAL SCHOOL
ELECTION ANII MEETING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, In
uiltli Hec. 3.11.010. ORS

to Uie legal voters of School District
No. H, of JacKson tnuniy, -

Oregon, that the ANNUAL SCHOOL
ELECTION of said District will be
hold at the Central Point Junior
High School Gymnasium, the Gold
Hill School Gvmniislum, and the
Sama Valley School Building: be-

tween the hours of 2 P.M. and B

PM. on the first Monday of May,
being the 2nd dny nf May. A D.

1060, for the purpose of electing
a District No. 6 Director for a 3

vrar term: a Rural School Board
Vi..ntM.r 7.nne i for a 3 vear term:
and a Rural School Board Member

"Dated' this sixth day of April,
IB60- - r Vnrmtn Gall

Chairman Board of Directors
ATTEST:
Merle Onenchaln
District Clerk

NOTICE OF HEARING
OF FINAL REPORT

:n inj.in
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE or OKLliun tun .iiwnv
Bnu rOITMTV

In the Matter of the Estate of
nvi i. a it MKYER. Deceased
Notice Is hereby given that the

undersigned, administrator of the
ahove entitled estate, has filed
herein his final report and account
and that Monday, May 18, 1060. at
9 30 o'clock am. In the courthouse
In the cltv of Medford, Jackson
Counlv. Oregon, has been fixed by
the above named court as the time
and place for hearing of objections
to said final report and account
and for the examination allowance
thereof.

Paled and first published this
14th dav of April, timo.

Flovd G. Haworth,
Administrator

Frohnmayer, Lowry, Hogan
oi neatnerage

Attorneys for Administrator

PRINCE IN CONGRESS
Washington - A former

member of Hawaiian royalty,
Prince Jonah Kuhio Kalanl-anol-

represented the Terri-
tory of Hawaii In congress
from 1902 to 1922. He was list-
ed as a Republican.

we

Prices Good
3 Days Only

i i

. lafafr Contral
throttltj clutch
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Wizard Tiller
Perfect for the aversga
bomsl Versatile, powerful,

Famous Clin-
ton
3H.P.mo- - 1fM44
IDI. airNow! IW"1
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Ideslfor,.- -
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04330. .iwss
Versatile
"Hostable" 2M
Regular $2.98
The table. 19"
steel top, y tubular
steel legs. Asst'd colors.
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A FREE VACATION FORI
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f ft I Garden

of Central Point, or a Btdder'e
Bond in Ilka amount which will. iiirintaa that If nronnsal ts ac- -
cepted, a contract will be entered

? ntn anil nrf nrrnance assured.

"t Bids must be In writing, signed
by or on behalf of the Bidder.

The City of Central Point rea-

p serves the right to reject any and
? all bids and to accept such bid as
r are to tne dcsi tnieresi or ine tuy

and consideration of bids received
' Is contingent upon tne wiy foun--

cil approving and ordering the
above mentioned street improve- -

w i

the flnt place lilted and continue to

State Hwy. Bldg.. Salem, Oregon.
NOTITK TO BIDDERS

Separata sealed proposals for
snh nt thm fdliowinc streets,

addressed to the City Council of
the city or central romi, urcgon,
and endorsed "Proposal for street
Improvement", will be received at
the office of the City Recorder
until 7:30 P.M. on the 26th day
of Anrll. lUbfl.

The work consists of excavation
and grading complete, concrete
curbs both sides, asphaltlc paving
and other work pertaining thereto
on the following streets:

First Street Pin Street to Oak
Street

The total principal bid items
Upon which separate bids for each
project invited are:

Excavation and grading complete
Creek run gravel, stone base
Crushed granite, leveling course
concrete euros
Prim coat. MC 3 Oil Dlaced
Asphaltlc concrete pavement, 2"

Plans and specifications, instruc
tion to Diaaers. soeciai orovisions.
quantities to be used in comparing
DlaS, contract ana nona lornw iur
each project can be obtained at the
office of the City Recorder, City
Hall. Central Point. UrfiBon. uptin
deposit of Ten and no100 Do'iara
(SlU.UUf .

Bids must be in writing, signed
by or on behalf of the tidier.

The Cltv of Central Point re
serves the right to reject any and
all bids and to accept such bids
as are to tne best interest oi tne
Cltv and pons deration of bids re
ceived contingent upon the City
Council approving and ordering
the above mentioned street im
provement at a hearing thereupon
to be held Anrll 26. IWQ.

By: Lyle Paull
City Recorder
Dated April 6, 1960

INVITATION FOR BIDS
Sealed bids will be received until

3:00 P.M., May 3, iueo in tne ui
fice of the Business Manager
Churchill Hull, Southern Oregon
Col ese. Ash and. Oreiron for As
phaltlc Concrete Paving on the
(jamoua oi aouuiern itckuii Al
lege.

Specifications and form of con-
tract document mav ba obtained
from the Business Office, Southern
Oregon College, Ashland. Oregon.

Bids must be completed in the
manner provided in the "Instruc-
tions to Bidders' uoon the form
provided and accompanied by the
appropriate security In an amount
not less than ten percent of the
total amount bid.

southern ureaon i;ouege re
serves the right to accept or re
ject any or all bid and to waive
all Informalities.

Donald e. Lewis
Business Manager
Southern Oregon College
Ashland, Oregon

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
as hereinafter designated will be
received by the District Manager.
Bureau of Land Management. BLM
Warehouse Area, Armory Drive,
Medford. Oregon, (Mailing address
i. O. Box liutv ivieat ora, uregoni
t 10:30 A. M. PACIFIC STAND

ARD time on Thursday, May 12,
1060, for all timber marked or
designated for cutting. Before bids

earning the timber, the conditions
or sate ana submission or mas
should be obtained from the ahove
District Manaeer. The r aht is here'
bv reserved to waive technical de-

fact in this advertisement and to
reieet anv or all bids. The united
States reserve the right to waive
anv informality In bids received
whenever such waiver la In the
Interest of the United States.
IN JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON:
OAC: All timber designated for
cutting on S'.NWli, NfcSW4,
SWUSW Section 11, T. 34 8., R.

E. estimated for the ournoae or
tnis saie to no bz m do. 11. dour

35 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine,
200 M bd. ft. sugar pine, B7 m bd.
ft. lncense-ced- and 220 M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
$24.25 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-

-fir, $21.73 per M hd. ft. for the
Fionderosa pine, $32.03 per M bd.

sugar pine. $10.03 per
M bd. ft. for the lncense-ceda- r,

$13.00 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir, or a total purchase price of
$33,108.10 will be considered. Mini,
mum deposit with bid $3,400.00.
All timber designated for cutting
on IlsNWVs, NW'.NWU. NEH- -

lection 21, T. 3 S., R. 1 K., SE,,
SijNE'',. Section II, T, 36 .. It.
3 E., estimated for the purpose of
this sale to ha 2 801 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fi- 200 M bd. ft. Don- -
oerosa pine, e M na. ft. sugar pine.
la m do, it. inrense-ceiia- r ann
1.190 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid
for less than $22.40 oer M hd. ft
for tha Douglas, fir, $23.63 per M
bd. ft. for tha. pondero.A pine,
$27.90 per M hd. ft. for the sugar

$9.08 per M bd. ft. tor the
ncense-ceda- r, $11.65 per M bd. ft.

for tha white fir, or a total pur-
chase price of $R1,243.IB will he
considered. Minimum deposit Willi
bid $8.200 00, All timber designated
for cnttlne nn NE, NSNWii.
SE'INWH, BVI',, N,SE". Rertlon
3S T. 33 . lots 1 and 2. Sen Ion 3,
T. 34 ., R. '., estimated for the

of this sale to be 1.630 M
Kurpose Douglas-fl- 153 M bd. ft.
ponderosa nine, 103 M bd. ft. sugar
pine. 109 M bd. ft. lncense-ceda- r
and 129 M bd. ft white fir. No
bid for less than $19 20 per M bd.
ft. for the uouglas-flr- . $21.70 ner
M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine,
$23.30 per M bd. ft. for the sugar

$3.95 per M bd. ft. for the
ncense-ceda- $8.15 per M bd. ft.

for the white r or a total nur
chase price of $39.196 45 will he
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $4,000 no. All timber designated
rnr cutting on lots i, a, a ann 4,
Section It, Nil. SE,. NE'.SWU
Section 33. T. 34 ... R. 1 r... esti
mated for the purpose nf this sale
to be 4.87B M bd ft. Douglas-fl- r
962 M bd. ft. ponderosa nine, 2.10
m do. ii. sugar pine. 4 is m no. it
lncense-ceda- 477 M bd. ft. while
fir. No bid for less than $24.45 per
ni tra. tt. tor tne imui s?h as
per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa
pine, aai sn per M bd. ft. for the
sugar pine. $)0.45 per M hd. ft. for

ar. 112.73 ner m no
ft. for the white fir or a tolal nur.
chase price of $162,493 20 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
am eio,.iuu.uu.

NOTiric or nriinois rtrrnov
I'PON Qt'KftTlON Or INCH PAS.
IN'Cl TAX l.KVV OVKR AMOUNT
1.IM1TRO HY SUCTION 11,'
AKTKI.K XI, STATU CONSTI-
TUTION
Notlrft ll hvrtthv vnn that in

l?Ctlon Will l held In Hchonl Dint.
rict No. OI at J nekton Count v,
Stat of Oregon, from 2 00 p.Mu o o r m , on mv z, in ho, mi
lh Hlfh School tn taid school ri.it.
rict. tor the purpose of tutlimlttinx
in ine irum voter ni iam district
the question or Increattnjc the 1nx
levy for the flucal year IDtiiMiHfl
over the amount limited hv See
tlon II, article XI, of the Conitltu
lion of Ore fon

The reatona for Increasing tuch
levy are:

To provide for Hit necearjr x- -

Bendtturea of the District, and
has no tax hnc n the

total budget ntust he submitted to
Uie vote of the people.The amount of tax. In rxceaa nf
the ti limitation, proposed to he
levied for said fiscal year Ii
904.103 20.

Dated this ltth day of April,
UflO.

DoufTai Finch
Chairman Board of Directors,

ATTEST;
Zelria Kdmondsoa j

District Clerk

I I Grass

, menta at a neannf inereupon to
f be held April 26, 1B60.
? THE CITY Or CENTRAL POINT

By: Lyle Paull
0 City Recorder
- Dated April 0, I960

Buy On Easy Terms!

ONLY 5.00 DOWNI

1.50 WEEKLY

America's
Safe, strong
pings until
Clinton engine.
trol on
Handle. 4

Wizard 25"

L S Pushbutton Trim Heihtt

I 'Tak ' 1'
I

,i n. a

W ' ""SiI - -

Level Head

Wizard Rake 2M i

Regular $2.29
Excellent for lawn care .14 I

teeth. 4" wide head. I

Wizard Garden Hoe.. 2.09 I

Nylon Bristle All
Wall Brush 2 !

Regular $2.95
Long - lasting nylon bristles
stand up longer. 4" size,
flagged bristles. Balanced.

.T- - VMS"1190

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
Separate sealed proposals for

each of the following streets, ad-- ,
dressed to the City Council of the
City of Central Point, Oregon, and
endorsed "Proposal for street im- -

provements," will be received at
V the office of the City Recorder

. until 7:30 P.M. on the 26th day of
?. April, i960.

The work consist of excavation
? and grading complete, concrete

rurha both aides, asnhaltlc paving
and other work pertaining thereto

i on the following street:
Third Street Pine Street to Oak

Street
f The total principal bid Item

upon which separate bids for each
nrnlMi lnvltawl ars:

Hr-"- klZXSW ' raftm ,

f hyjj 5(VV !
f "HP j! 1

a Premium ff

Riding Mower

32995
$10 down, $5.25 weekly
Drive It iuit as you do
your car. Powerful 4ydl
4H-H.- Clinton engine
pulls the steepest grades.
Separate controls for gear
shift and safety blade
dutch. Auto-typ- e brake.

Can Be Oienged While Mewing!

CM.
K

Vertical
M I

squeeze type

Paint Roller 1W& Tray Set
Regular $2.25
7" roller & tray with handy
corner dauber. For oil base
or rubber base paints.

WiserslHeesePelMS
la Casaa ( a Bala.

fijojj,

088
OaL as

'CaseaeS

d17
InI Cuter 4

Ouslfyl

MUFFLERS,
Westline Std.
Priced froi
Installed P..

S "Poli.W.x"aF3 I Dash Tray 47

6' Wooden

T 95
Trellis

Rog. 1.15

Ready for
painting.

Lawn
Cart

JC66

Reg. 6.65
Full 2Va cu.
ft. capacity.

Magnetic

Regular 63c
Sticks tight to any steel ob-

ject without marring finish.
Plastic. 7V4" long.

DAVIS IMPERIAL

sEI1IKT
S.rOstl Black Tub. Type

4 wno
Tls Sn4
Retsapsals
Tite

in of
Premium
Quality!

UAMTSS e
New Davis

Safety Shape!

"Shoc'k Ab.
sorber" Tread!

100 Du Pant
Nylon Cord!

Excavation and grading complete
Creek run gravel, stone base
Crushed granite, leveling course
concrete euros
Prime coat. MC-- Oil placed

T Asphaltlo concrete pavement, V
thick

Plans, specifications, instruction
- to btdders, special provisions, nunu

i(Ua in "ha intri In com Darin bids,
contract nnd bond forms for each
nm pi ran na nnuinio be inn ui
fir nf the Cltv Recorder. City
Hall, Central Point, Oregon, upon
denosn oi ien ana noiw isuuaia
iimnnt

. Bids must be accompanied by a
certified check equivalent to five

. per cent 16) of the proposal
'. pavable to the Treasurer of the
' City of Central Point, or a Bidder's

Bond In like amount which will
c guarantee that u a proposal is

cepted. a contract will be entered
Into and its performance assured.

T Bids must be In wrtUng, signed
hv nr nn hahalf of the Bidder.

r The City of Central Point re- -,

serves the right to reject any and
all bids and to accept such bids as

V are to tne best interest oi ine wny
.r and consideration of bids received

i

iXX6
"Decorative

Lawn Fence"25'KcfuUr 40c
Adds beauty to your yard,
flower beds, etc. 36" long,
stands 11" high. Wooden.

Regular $1.60
Gives easier, longer lasting
shines. Weatherproofs car.
One pt. With FREE sponge.

rrisrWo
n.rfs-"a-"-"n . ' .. ,.iall

rrHTira "Tllse

Meuntltif "rTiexts

Soft Whttl " o

Balancing JJ0XI3
'Plus

Only 1.40 Similar
Per Wheel

r cil approving and ordering the
f above mentioned street Improve--

menta at a hearing thereupon to
P be held April 26, 1H0.

THE CITY or CENTRA! ruin r
By: Lyle Paull
city itecorner
Dated April 9. I960

f NOTICE OF ADMINISTRATOR'!
IALE OK REAL PROPERTY

PRIIRATK NO. IS1SA
h IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
. STATE OF OKEUUn fUH JftV-f- t'

orM rniTNTVt IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE
OF WILLIAM F. O' DON NELL.

. also known as Wm. F. O'Donnell
JL and as W, F. O'Donnell end a
I Willis F. O'Donnell, Deceased

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
L the undersigned administrator with
Z Will annexed of the above entitled
k estate will, pursuant to an order
Z entered in the above entitled Court
Y and cause on the 13 nay oi Apru,r lflHO. offer for sale and sell at prl- -

vat sale from and after the 13th

t dav of May, 180 that certain per-
il eel of real property situated and

; being tn wacxson toumj, wrcon,
! The East Half of the Southeast
I Quarter of Section 82, Town- -

hip 38 South. Range 1 West,
Willamette Meridian. Jackson

Paint a House for as Little as
$5 Down . . . Save 3.52 with CaselIH

a
Tuba Type Tubelrss

Black W wall Blsca W'waU-1.10-

IS.M'I ISJS'J '11.S81S1.S
iss'XLis fjo.s.s'ljn.ss'-"i;iox-

is

.sl 2.'j I

ti.t; S.4 l.41'
Fed. Tax. Retreadable Tire

Savinis en 14" Tubeless fires

WIZARD HOMESTEAD WHITE. Econom-icii- l

protection and beauty for your home.
Long wearing exterior paint for Budget-Minde- d

jobs. Single Gallon Price....... 4.69
WIZARD ALKYD-RUBBE- R SATIN FIN-
ISH. Now anyone can get professional-lik- e

results in half the time. Won t fade, crack or
chip. Washable. Single Gallon Price... 5.29

21,000,000 Gelftns SoM-Pos- ffirt Proof ofStiffs Tlrti-Pre- vtsi Oyer 22 Millim Timet

BEGINNING 9 A.M.

TUESDAY, APRIL 19
We Will Have a Servics for

APPOINTMENTS
For Shovel, Haircuts, Shampoos, Shlnoi

WEST MAIN BARBER SHOP
SP 3-5- 128 Wtsl Main

I County. Oregon,
t The terms of the sale being for
I cash or for part cash and part
i credit to the bet and highest bid- -

der and that all offers and bids
for said property shall be marie

t to the undersigned administrator
i at the office nf its attorneys. Far.
! roll A Rlackhurst. Suite J30
f Franklin Building, Medford. Ore- -

gon, said sal to be subiect to the
I approval and confirmation of the
I abovo entitled Court.
I THE UNITED STATES
J NATIONAL BANK OF
i PORTLAND. AdminlsUator
$ with Wilt Annexed

Date of First Piihltrationr April 14.
Data of Last Publication; May l

Galeae SHOCK ABSORBERS

Double Action
Priced from J95
Installed 1 ea.

These prices are oed in all Western Auto Cempany stores)

She 0--r Cetaiot 25 SOUTH RIVERSIDE AVENUE

Order Decent. PHONE SP


