

A-TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY
BUNDLES OF OLD NEWSPAPERS
for sale 20¢ each. Mail Tribune
office 33 North First
Medford, Ore.
SP 2-2111

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF SALE
The City of Gold Hill, Oregon,
invites sealed bids to 5 P.M.
June 25, 1959, at office of City
Recorder, for sale of the following
used equipment:
1 reel type 21" lawn mower.
Rotary type 21" self propelled
riding mower.
Equipment may be inspected at
city shop in Gold Hill.
Bids must be received by 5 P.M.
on or before June 15, 1959 for one
used 1951 GMC 2 1/2 ton dump
truck, 4 cu. yd. capacity. Motor
No. A-270-775675. Speedometer
reading 14450 miles. This truck
may be inspected between 8:00 a.m.
to 4:00 p.m. at:
Rogue River Valley Irrigation
District
3139 Merriman Road
Medford, Oregon
Phone NO 2-4160
The Rogue Soil Conservation
District's Board of Supervisors re-
serve the right to reject any and
all bids. Bids may be filed with the
Chairman of the Equipment
Committee
Don Minear
Rt. 4 Box 358
Medford, Oregon

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON IN AND
FOR THE COUNTY OF JACK-
SON
Probate Department
In the Matter of the Estate of
James Thomas Buckley, also known
as James T. Buckley, deceased.
Notice is hereby given that the
undersigned has been appointed and
now is the duly qualified and acting
executor of the will and estate of
the above named deceased, and
any and all persons having claims
against said deceased or his estate
are hereby required to present the
same, with proper vouchers and
duly verified as by law required,
to the undersigned at his residence
near Ruch in Jackson County, Ore-
gon, within six months from the
date of this notice.
Dated and first published the
24 day of May A.D. 1959.
Lewis T. Buckley, Executor

**NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL
ACCOUNT**
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY
In the Matter of the Estate of
JOSEPH FRANKLIN, Deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the
undersigned has filed her final
account as administratrix of the
estate of Joseph Franklin, de-
ceased, with the Circuit Court for
Jackson County, Oregon, and that
said Court has set the 15th day
of June, 1959, at the hour of 10
o'clock in the forenoon of said day
in the Court Room of said Court
in Medford, Jackson County, Ore-
gon, as the time and place for hearing
on the account and the settle-
ment thereof.
DATED and first published this
14th day of May, 1959.
Jean L. Franklin,
Administratrix

**HARRISON AND PLAZZA
ATTORNEYS FOR ADMINISTRATRIX**
TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT, ORAL AUCTION
BIDS, as hereinafter designated
will be received by the District
Manager, Bureau of Land Manage-
ment, South Riverside at Barnett
Road, Medford, Oregon, at 10:30
A.M. PACIFIC STANDARD TIME,
on Thursday, June 25, 1959, for all
timber marked or designated for
cutting. Before bids are submitted
full information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be ob-
tained from the above District
Manager. The right is hereby re-
served to waive technical defects
in this advertisement and to reject
any or all bids. The United States
reserves the right to waive any
informality in bids received when-
ever such waiver is in the interest
of the United States. IN JACKSON
COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: SAL-
VAGE: All timber designated for
cutting on NW 1/4 NW 1/4 Sec. 15, T.
33 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 29
M bd. ft. Douglas-fir. No bid for
less than \$23.10 per M bd. ft. for
the Douglas-fir or a total purchase
price of \$669.90, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid \$75.00.
GREEN: All timber designated for
cutting on N 1/2 SE 1/4, SW 1/4, Sec.
2, T. 33 S., R. 2 E., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
230 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 54 M bd.
ft. ponderosa pine, 19 M bd. ft.
sugar pine, 121 M bd. ft. incense-
cedar, 17 M bd. ft. white fir. No
bid for less than \$22.00 per M bd.
ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$17.35 per
M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine,
\$23.50 per M bd. ft. for the sugar
pine, \$7.75 per M bd. ft. for the in-
cense-cedar, \$8.80 per M bd. ft.
for the white fir, or a total pur-
chase price of \$7,608.25 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid \$800.00. All timber designated
for cutting on N 1/2 NE 1/4, SW 1/4,
NE 1/4, SE 1/4 NW 1/4, Sec. 13, T.
35 S., R. 2 E., W.M., estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 3,727
M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 138 M bd. ft.
ponderosa pine, 502 M bd. ft. sugar
pine, 12 M bd. ft. incense-cedar,
713 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for
less than \$26.35 per M bd. ft. for
the Douglas-fir, \$22.00 per M bd.
ft. for the ponderosa pine, \$23.50
per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine,
\$6.60 per M bd. ft. for the incense-
cedar, \$12.10 per M bd. ft. for the
white fir, or a total purchase price
of \$123,063.35, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid \$12-
400.00. All timber designated for
cutting on E 1/2 SE 1/4, Sec. 24, T.
34 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 330 M
bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 20 M bd. ft.
ponderosa pine, 14 M bd. ft. sugar
pine, 2 M bd. ft. incense-cedar. No
bid for less than \$20.55 per M bd.
ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$20.35 per M
bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine,
\$20.05 per M bd. ft. for the sugar
pine, \$10.40 per M bd. ft. for the
incense-cedar, or a total purchase
price of \$10,914.20 will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid
\$1,100.00. All timber designated for
cutting on Sections 1, 3, 9, 15, 21,
29 and 32, 1, 39 S., R. 3 E., W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 333 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir,
333 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 711 M
bd. ft. white fir and 1 M bd. ft.
lodgepole pine. No bid for less
than \$28.00 per M bd. ft. for the Dou-
glas-fir, \$23.60 per M bd. ft. for the
ponderosa pine, \$14.55 per M bd. ft.
for the white fir and \$27.35 per M
bd. ft. for the lodgepole pine, or a
total purchase price of \$27,535.00
will be considered. Minimum de-
posit with bid \$2,800.00. All timber
designated for cutting on N 1/2,
N 1/4 NW 1/4, NW 1/4, NW 1/4, NW 1/4,
W 1/2 NE 1/4, Sec. 15, T. 34 S., R.
Douglas-fir, 47 M bd. ft. ponderosa
pine, 54 M bd. ft. sugar pine, 78 M
bd. ft. incense-cedar and 31 M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
\$13.40 per M bd. ft. for the Dou-
glas-fir, \$13.25 per M bd. ft. for the
ponderosa pine, \$13.25 per M bd.
ft. for the incense-cedar, \$4.75
per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine or
per M bd. ft. for the white fir, or a
total purchase price of \$48,309.80
will be considered. Minimum de-
posit with bid \$4,900.00.

A-TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY
HEILITE Camp Trailer for sale.
SP 2-2725

**CASH & CARRY
WEEKS BEST BUY**
40,000 ft. 2x6 No. 2 S&S Doug.
fir, specified lengths \$70. per M.
12,000 beautiful old used bricks
6¢ ea.
S&H Green Stamps
NORTON LUMBER CO.
Phoenix TA 6-2037
Camp White TA 6-2521
Ashland MU 9-4833

1-LODGE NOTICES
Medford Lodge No. 103,
A.F. & A.M. Special com-
munication on Friday,
June 5 at 7:30 P.M.
Work in MM degree.
Visiting brethren wel-
come. Refreshments.
Ross Glikson, W.M.

2-SPECIAL CLUB EVENTS
THIRTY shop selling used clothing.
Clearance Sale before closing for
summer months, May 28 & 29,
June 4 & 5, 9:30 AM to 12:30 PM.
McAndrew Rd., & Fridy St. Will
reopen Sept.

3-PERSONAL
WHY SUFFER? "MERRILLS"
SPECIAL PRESCRIPTION quick-
ly relieves Gas, Nausea, Heart-
burn, Dizziness, Stomach Nerves
(10 min.) It's guaranteed. Ex-
clusively at MEDFORD PAR-
MACY & HUDSON'S PHAR-
MACY, Your RX Specialists.

DICTATING & TRANSCRIBING
machines, also photo copies. MU-
2-5771.

Miriam's Beauty Shop
909 E. Jackson SP 3-3806
Miriam Ward, operator.
RAYLEIGH Vitamins & fruit drink.
701 N. Modoc SP 2-4426.

LEGAL NOTICES
No. 10,111
NOTICE OF HEARING ON
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY
PROBATE DEPARTMENT
In the Matter
of the Estate of Fionnie M. Wood-
ridge, deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the
undersigned has filed its Final
Account and Report in the above
entitled estate, and that by order
of the Circuit Court in and for
Jackson County, Oregon, Probate
Department, a hearing on the same
has been set for Monday, June
22, 1959, in the Circuit Court
Room at the Court House in Med-
ford, Jackson County, Oregon, at
the hour of 9:30 o'clock A.M.
All persons having objections
thereto are hereby notified to pre-
sent the same on or before such
date.
DATED this 14th day of May, 1959.
THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK
OF OREGON, PORTLAND
Executor
Roberts, Kellington & Branchfield
Attorneys for Executor

Anchorage Looking Forward To Biggest Season of Tourists

Anchorage—UPI—Anchorage, Alaska's largest city, is looking forward to the biggest tourist season in its his-

TAX BITE
New York—UPI—The average American taxpayer is 29 years old, earns \$5,183.71 a year and will pay nearly 10 years of his lifetime earnings in taxes, according to the Commerce Clearing House. The average taxpayer will shell out \$47,221.18 in taxes before retirement, or about one-fourth of his income, the clearing house said.

A-TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY

PAINT CLOSE OUT
Marshall Wells Paint
Stock on hand only. Top grade.
Rubber base wall paint
\$4.25 gal. Was \$5.79
1 coat wall paint \$3.50 Gal.
Was \$5.25
Satin enamel \$4.85 gal.
Was \$7.25
House paint—colors—\$4.95 gal.
Was \$6.29
We Give S & H Green Stamps

Floyd Hibbard Hardware
310 E. Main SP 2-2113
THINNERS NEEDED for peaches
& pears. Register now for em-
ployment. Bear-Creek Orchards,
Pacific Hwy. S.

RUGS SHAMPOOED—Average size
\$4. Floors cleaned & waxed. Ave-
rage room \$3. Medford Main-
tenance. SP 3-5497.

story this summer. The only trouble is it might be too big. Merchants are happily antici- pating the sound of jingling cash registers but those directly involved in the tourist industry are fast develop- ing ulcers over the very real prospect of not being able to meet the demand for accom- modations.

Depends on Impressions
Travel agents and progres- sive hotel owners realize that their future business de- pends largely on the impres- sion Alaska makes this sum- mer on the flood of visitors expected to arrive for a glimpse of the 49th state.

To avoid requiring tourists to sleep in their cars because they cannot find rooms, the Chamber of Commerce opened its tourist information center a month early on May 1. Since June 1, two girls have been on duty seven days a week to help steer visitors and to act as a clearing house for information on sleeping accommodations.

The chamber has also issued a call to local residents to open their homes to out- sider when hotels and mo- tels are full. These private rooms will be inspected be- fore they are placed on the

office's accommodations list. Until this year, Alaska's tourist business was strictly a summertime deal. Hotels and motels were practically empty half the year and only partly full during spring and fall.

Pocketbooks Loosened
Up to Alaska's entry into the union, people knew little about the former territory and thought everyone lived in igloos. But the millions of dol- lars of free publicity which followed statehood has loos- ened pocketbooks all over the country and created a lively curiosity among residents of the "South 48" to find out more about their neighbors to the north.

For the first time since the war and then the big con- struction boom of 1952 and 1953, Anchorage hotels were filled to capacity all this past winter. Financiers, especially those from the east coast and Texas, have been sliding in and out of town in droves looking for places to spend their money and some have found them.

Hotel Being Built
Michael Halbouty, inde- pendent Texas wildcatter, joined forces with Walter J. Hickel, Anchorage millionaire

contractor, to build a \$10-000,000 hotel and office build- ing development in downtown Anchorage. The two struc- tures are scheduled for com- pletion in 1961. The Captain Cook Hotel will have 11 sto- ries and the office building 10.

Western Hotels, owners of the Westward Hotel and Westward Inn, bought out the former owners of the Anchor- age Hotel this spring. The company has already started work on building what will eventually be a 16-story hotel development.

But Alaskans are still faced with the problem of handling more tourists than they have room for during the next two years.

Common Cold Vaccine Predicted in Future

Corvallis—A common cold vaccine, effective heart con- dition drugs and a cancer cure are predicted by pharmacy re- search scientists to come about during the next 5 to 10 years.

Dr. Leo Sciuchetti, Oregon State college pharmacy pro- fessor, said there will also be a thorough understanding of geriatrics, the aging process. All of this progress is being made possible through re- search funds spent by phar- maceutical manufacturers and by federal government re- search grants. The manufac- turers spent \$170,000,000 on

research in 1958, an increase of 37 per cent over 1957. And for 1959, the research budget will be close to \$200,000,000. Government research grants almost equal that spent by manufacturers.

For the past 10 years, about 30 entirely new drugs have been introduced each year. Each new drug has about \$6,000,000 of research behind it. To keep pace with the med- ical practices during the next decade—the lunar or space age—the practicing pharmacist will have to be better trained

so he can better serve his role as "consultant to the physi- cian," Dr. Sciuchetti said.

Calcutta in Indian has a population of 2,982,000, while Bombay is listed at 2,840,000.

DAILY'S
Body & Paint
Southern Oregon's
Oldest and Finest
29 S. BARTLETT
Phone
SP 2-2395

NOW...RAMBLER OUTSELLS ALL BUT 2 IN OREGON!



Here's Why Rambler is the Success of the Year

You save hundreds of dollars on price, more than ever on gas, get highest resale value in the low-price field with Rambler... America's smart compact car. Turns easier, parks anywhere, yet gives you room inside for six big adults. Discover Personalized Comfort, too: sectional sofa front seats glide back and forth individually; Airliner reclining seatbacks; adjustable headrests; low-cost All-Season air conditioning. Go Rambler 6 or V-8 and save. See your Rambler dealer.

NEW RAMBLER AMERICAN STATION WAGON
Save \$500! Lowest factory-delivered price of the three best-selling station wagons makes by better than \$500. Full 5-passenger room.

LEA MOTORS, Bartlett at 5th, Medford

WORLDWIDE OPENING

TOMORROW-FRIDAY, JUNE 5

See Our Complete Display!

FIRE!!
POTTED PLANT
To First
100 Ladies
in Our
Shop Friday!

- Convenient Location
- FREE Parking
- Easy Loading
- Large Variety

Capable
Experienced
Workmen

We will be
OPEN
Friday &
Saturday
till 8 p.m.

Special Opening Prices
NEVAMAR—for Counters... 59¢ sq. ft.
PLASTIC..... lineal foot 59¢

- Vinyl & Inlaid Linoleum
- Counter Topping—All Kinds
- Tile—of All Kinds
- MANY DESIGNS & PATTERNS

**BUY AT
SACRIFICIAL
REDUCTIONS**

**600 Yds. Standard Gauge
Inlaid Linoleum**
\$1.59
Regular \$2.65 Square Yard & up SQ. YD.
Just See the Savings!
Many Remnants

**9' x 12'
Print Rugs**
\$4.89
Regular \$5.95

JIM'S FLOORCOVERING SHOP

1256 S. Riverside—Next to Weter & Olson Shell Station

Phone SP 2-4448 & Even. SP 2-6653