
ARD OF THANKSLEGAL NOTICES 9MAIL TRIBUNE, Medford, Or.

Thursday, May 21, 1959 A An roAiTbiifm a Turn nsnfftiEvii cirmfnr? I
Although the United States

has approximately 40 per cent
of the world's coal reserves,
neighboring Canada has only
about two per cent.

A-T- OO LATE TO CLASSIFY

CARD OF THANKS
Our heartfelt thanks to all who

extended comforting sympathy and
help in our recent sorrow. For the
beautiful service, floral offerings,
and other kindnesses, we are deep-
ly grateful.

Mr. Hugh Mitchell & family

KEEP DOGS out of your flower
beds with fencing from Monarch
Seed & Feed Co.LEGAL NOTICES

A-T- OO LATE TO CLASSIFY
ZIG ZAG PORTABLE

Beautiful Zig Zag Portable just
5 mo. ole. Payments S6.35 permo. Full balance $72. New guar-
antee, SP

627 North Central Avenue Medford Phone SP 2-50-
56

IPAUOJEM'S TIMFT MAKCCET
Central Point's Most Complete Shopping Center

SPECIAL: Red Geraniums 6 for $1.
Chastains Nursery, 1940 Table
Rock Rd. Closed Sundays. WANT A QUALITY POWER Lawn

mower? Get a Reo from the Mon-
arch Seed & Feed Co.BIG FIR

Best Green Fir Slabs
Delivered in May & June.

S&H Green Stamps
MEDFORD FUEL CO. SP

1 -L- ODGE NOTICES

BRING YOUR BUG troubles to us.
Monarch Seed & Feed Co.

Medford Lodge 103,
A.F.&A.M. Special Com-
munication on Fridav,
May 22nd at 730 P.M.
Work in FC degree. Vis-

iting brethren welcome.
Refreshments.

Say Congratulatory Sensationally!

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS as hereinafter designated will
be received by the District Man-
ager. Bureau of Land Management,
South Rivenide at Barnett Road,
Medford Oregon at 10:30 A.M,
PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on
Thursday. June 11. 1959 for all
timber marked or designated for
cutting. Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be ob-
tained from the above District
Manager. The right is hereby re-
served to waive technical defects
in this advertisement and to re-

ject any or all bids. The United
States reserves the right to waive
any 'informality in bids received
whenever such waiver is in the
interest of the United States. IN
JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON:
OAC: GREEN: All timber desig-
nated for cutting on Lots 1, 2. 3,
4. 5. 6. SE',4NW'4, SE'iNE'.i Sec-
tion 31. T. 34 S, R. 3 E., W.M.
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 4.795 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r,

66 M bd ft. ponderosa pine,
58 M bd. ft. sugar pine. 197 M bd.
ft. incense-ceda- r. 1,181 M bd. ft.
white fir. No bid for less than
$25.60 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-
-fir. $16.95 per M bd. ft. for the
ponderosa pine. S25.25 per M bd.
ft. for the sugar pine, $9.35 per M
bd. ft. for the incense-ceda- r,

$12.20 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir, or a total purchase price of
$141,585.35 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with -- bid 0.

All timber designated for
cutting on WiNEU. NW'i Sec.
19, T. 35 S., R. 3 W, W.M.. esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 2.710 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r.

79 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 24 M
bd. ft. sugar pine. 172 M bd. ft.

CASH & CARRY
WEEKS BEST BUY

8 & 16 box nails, a keg, $10.50
Pabco roofing, sq. $ 9.75
50.000 ft. 2x6 T&G, $45, $65 Sc $75
per M.

S&H Green Stamps
NORTON LUMBER CO.

Phoenix ... e KE

C3TCG2LL CDICnRoss Gilkison. WJM.

CLUB EVENTS
GIVE THE GRAD IN YQUR

LIFE A Y--M MODEL 301
o 45 RPM SiC50

NOTICE OF SALE OF
REAL PROPERTY

No. 10482
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

PROBATE DEPARTMENT
In the Matter of the Estate of

CHRISTOBEL ROSE HEFFNER,
Deceased.
Notice is hereby given that the

undersigned will, from and after
the 8th day of June. 1959. sell all
of the right, title and interest of
the above entitled estate, in and to
the following described premises,
situated in Jackson County, Ore-
gon:

That certain parcel or strip of
land 117.9 feet in length north
and south, and 52.8 feet in width
east and west, lying north of
Pennsylvania Avenue in said
City, as same is more fully de-
scribed in that certain deed ap-
pearing of record in Volume
143 at Page 597 of the Deed
Records of Jackson County.
Oregon, to which said deed
and record reference is hereby
made for a more particular de-

scription of the land herein
conveyed.
Said property will be sold at

private sale for cash or credit at
the office of DeForest & Hansen,
228 Franklin Building. Medford,
Oregon, subject to confirmation of
the above entitled Court.

Dated and first published May 7,
1959.

Eunice A. Fernland,
Administratrix

.TA RUMMAGE Sale Fri. May 22 Fehl
Bldg. 9 to 5. Sponsorer Phoenix
Fireman Aux.

Camp White
Ashland c J"""MU

ALASKA FISH makes beutiful
flowers and tasty vegetables. Get
from Monarch Seed & Feed Co. o 16 23 RPMBUNDLES OF OLD NEWSPAPERS
for sale 20c each. Mail Tribune
office 33 North Fir.

I AM starting as of this day. May
21, 1959, that I am not responsi-ble for any debts or bills other
than my own. Mrs. Rita Crandall,
219 S. Ivy St.. Medford, Oregon.

new mulch
SA .VDUST

MEDFORD FUEL CO.
SP Miriam's Bdauty Shop

909 E. Jackson SP
Miriam Ward, operator.

LAWN MOTH showing up in your
lawn? Use Scott's Cope to con-
trol. Monarch Seed & Feed Co.
Both stores.

NU BONE Foundation Garments.
Alterations & repair.Mrs. Ethel Rogers.

128 S. Holly SP
- Mrs. E. Johnson SP

We fix em while you sleep
Hawkins Kite Garage. SP

incense-ced- ar and 98 M bd. it. RAWLEIGH Vitamins & fruit drink.
701 N Modoc. SP

STANLEY Home Products. NO- -

200 DISCOUNT on all our top
Quality Schorn Paints (A National
Lead Product) for balance of May.
Rock Lath 38c a yard.
i2x4x8 Sheetrock S2.24 a sheet.
?ax4x8 Sheetrock $152 a sheet
',4x4x8 Sheetrock S1.60 a sheet

WESTSIDE LUMBER
924 Summit SP

Plays stereo and monophonic 45
and 16 rpm records. Amazingly
light and easy to carry only
16V 2 lbs. Two powerful speak-
ers each in a detachable sec-

tion. Dual channel stereo am-

plifier system. Separate bass
treble and loudness controls.
Now you can own a complete
stereo system at a budget
price. See hear this remark-
able stereo phonograph today.

WILL not be responsible for any
debts other than my own. Carthal
James Hamilton, 870 Ellen ave.,
Medford, Ore.

white fir. No bid for less than
$28.75 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-
-fir, $28.05 per M bd. ft. for
the ponderosa pine. $22.90 per M
bd. ft. for the sugar pine. S9.90 per
M bd. ft. for the incense-ceda- r,

$12.20 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir or a total purchase orice of
$83,576 45 will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid 58.400.00.
All timber designated or totting

BEGONIA PLANTS in 5 colors. 4
for 95c. Monarch Seed & Feed Co.
Downtown Store.

ANYONE having a drinking prob-
lem is welcome at Alcoholic
Anonymous, 8 pjn. Tues. & Sat.
Rear of 212 N. Oakdale SP

Model 21 Ll 59
on SW'iSW'i Section 27, NE1- -

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

at 7:30 PJW. on the 28th day of
May. 1959 in the Council Chambers
of the City Hall in the City of
Medford, Oregon there shall be a
public hearing by and before the
Planning Commission of said City
on the question of allowing a vari-
ance in height restrictions applic-
able under Ordinance No. 5135,
Section 5, Subsection B, Multiple
Family Dwelling District, on the
following described real property,
to-w- it:

Commencing at the East South-
east corner of Donation Land
Claim No. 51 in Township 37
South, Range 1 West of the Wil-
lamette Meridian in Jackson
County, Oregon, thence North
89" 51' 40" West along the South
boundarv of said Claim 470.0
feet: thence South 0 04' East 680.0

W ATKINS Products SP '
CELOTEX, ab roofing $9.75 a

square.
WESTSIDE LUMBER CO.

924 Summit Ave. SP
OST AND FOUND

SW'i Section 27, Right-of-wa- y

Section 27, Right-of-wa- y

Section 34, Sections 22 and 23, T.
38 S- - R. 3 E., W.M. estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
1.304 M bd. ft. Douglas-fi- r, 5 M
bd. ft. sugar pine. 34 M bd. ft. in

DAHLIA TUBERS in a good selec-
tion. Monarch Seed & Feed Co.
Downtown Store.

LOST at Boy Scout Circus Saturday
night boy's blacK jacket size 12.
SP

cense-ceda- r, and 2,413 M bd. ft.
LEGAL NOTICES LOST Brown Pomeranian Sat.

Bigham Rd. Eagle Point. Ans. to
name "Tuffv". UL

Hew years-ahea-d design and engineering features for performance
and listening pleasure unequaled by any ether fine TV! New Cus-

tom Chassis, fully UNIT-IZE- with seven basic plug-i- n TV Units
Provision for addition of plug-i- n AM Radio, FM Radio, Stereo Am-

plifier, and Record Player. Full power transformer operation. Supe-
rior Cascode Tuner gives you sensational fringe area as well as
local reception. Room-flatteri- select wood hand-rubb- cabinets
of genuine African Mahogany, Limed Oak, Fruitwood Cherry, or
Walnut, in beautiful upright Console or horizontal Low Boy styling.
Special High Fidelity Woofer and Tweeter Speakers for superior
sound realism.

Other Console Models from $255.50

white fir. No bid for less than
$33.50 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-
-fir. $24.35 per M bd. ft. for the

feet to a " iron pin, for the point
sugar pine, $8.70 per M bd. ft. for
the incense-ceda- r, $11.65 per M bd.
ft. for the white fir or a total pur-
chase price of $72,213.00 will be

PIANO Instruction for children
or older beginners. 124

Model 312 -- Portable

Stereo High

Fidelity System
Four powerful 5" speakers-t- wo

in each of the detacha-
ble sections. Dual channel
stereo amplifier system.
Plays all the new stereo rec-

ords as well as standard
monophonic records. Separ-
ate BassTreble and Loud-
ness controls. 4 speed V--M

"Stere - O ' Matic" changer.
V-- M "Reject-O-Mati- c" but-
ton. ' Delightful blue and
white case.

Plays All 5 yi 95
4 Speeds fl'

considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $7,300.00. All timber designat-
ed for cutting on lots 1 and 2,
S'iNEV4, SE'iNW'i. N'iSW'i.

ENROLLMENTS are now being
taken for the Young Stylemaker
Sewing Classes. Ages from 10 to
21. Singer Sewing Machine Co.
318 E Main SP

N',3bt' section 3, T. 41 3., K. z
E- - W.M. estimated for the purpose

- 5Sw ill' !ISH

e l4

of this sale to be 1.725 M bd. ft.
1 0 WANTED MALE HELP 17-In- ch PortableDouglas-fi- r. 4 M bd. ft. ponderosa

pine. 2 M bd. ft. sugar pine. 119 M
bd. ft. incense cedar, and 2.587 M
bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less
than $30.35 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fi- r. $16.95 -- er M bd. ft.

TV MODEL

$19995
for the ponderosa pine, $25.25 per

ALERT AMBITIOUS MAN WITH
CAR TO WORK FULL TIME:
Servicing fully established route
in Hombrook and Yreka. Prefer
man who is now working and
wants to better himself. Age no
barrier. Opportunity to earn $5000
or more annually. Contact the
J. R. Watkins Co., P.O. Box 681,
Redding, Calif.

jvi do. it. lor tne sugar pine, sv.ys
per M bd. ft. for the incense-ceda- r.

$10.60 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir or a total purchase price of
$80,840.30 will be considered. Mini
mum deposit with bid $8,100.00.

Check Our SPECIAL OFFER On

NOTICE
In the Circuit Court of the State of

Oregon for the County of Jackson
Probate DepartmentIn the Matter

of ' - .

the Estate of Joseph M. Burrows,
deceased.
To Joseph M. Burrows, or any

other person for him and to
whom it may concern:' NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

at a hearing duly and regularly
held in this said court and cause
under date of May 18, 1959, upon
the application of Margaret Grabel,
the daughther of Joseph M. Bur-
rows, it was satisfactorily estab-
lished to this said court that the
said Joseph M Burrows not having
been heard from for a period of in
excess of seven years, is legally
presumed to be dead, and you, and
each of you. shall produce to this
said court wthin twelve weeks from
the date of the last publication of
said notice, which is May 28, 1959,
satisfactory evidence of his con-
tinuance in life, and that upon
your failure so to do an order will
be made herein granting the pray-
er of the petitic.i of the said
Margaret Grabel appointing her
administratrix of his said estate,
and for such other and different
relief as to the court at that time
might seem meet and proper.
. IN WITNESS WHEREOF the un-

dersigned has hereunto affixed the
hand and seal of the Circuit Court
of Jackson County. Oregon, and
the Judge thereof, all on this 18th
day of May 1959.

Edward C. Kelly
Circuit Judge

Attest:
E. M. Madden
County Clerk of Jackson County,
Oregon
By Irene F. Brenner
Deputy

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE m'i

ot Degmmng; tnence jNorin ua
51' 40" West 150.0 feet to a i"
iron pin; thence South 81 40'
West 134.0 feet to a 3,i" iron pin:
thence South 57 40' West 136.0
feet to a t," iron pin; thence
South 27 40' West 140.0 feet to
a 3,t" iron pin; thence South 4
53' 20" West 143.97 feet to a
3t" iron pin: thence South 5
29' 20" West 215.06 feet to a i"
iron pin; thence South 6 02' 10"
East 283.0 feet to a 3,i" iron pin;
thence South 41 44' 30" East
503.0 feet to a at" iron pin;
thence North 57 26' 30" East
159.42 feet to a 3,k" iron pin;
thence North 62 28' 30" East
60.12 feet to a 3V iron pin;
thence North. 62 58' 10" East
177.83 feet to a 3" iron pin;
thence along a curve left 162.60
feet to a iron pin (which
has a radius of 542.96 feet, and
a long chord of North 54 23' 25"
East 161.99 feet); thence North
45 48' 40" East 18.65 feet to a
3t" iron pin; thence along a
curve left 257.03 feet to a 3,A"
iron pin (which curve has a
radius of 1402.4 feet, and a long
chord of North 38 16' West
256.69 feet); thence North 43
31' West 152.77 feet to a Viron pin; thence along curve
right 264.14 feet to a 3" iron
pin (which curve has a radius
of 348.31 feet, and a long chord

- of north '21 47' 30" West 257.86
feet); thence North 0 04' West
376.54 feet to the point of be-

ginning,
said property being the proposed
building site for the Rogue Valley
Manor in the City of Medford,
Oregon.

O. R. McNeel
Building Inspector

STATE OF OREGON IN AND 45 RPM STEREO RECORDS

BOYS (18 to 26) free to travel U.S.,
Alaska, Hawaii & Puerto Rico
for Hardele Publishers. All new
car transportation furn., immedi-
ate expenses advanced. $250 mo.
drawing acct. Must be ready to
leave immediately. For interview
see Mr Hall Hotel Medford 10
a.m. --12 noon Fri. only. No phone
calls.

FOR THE COUNTY OF JACK-
SON

Probate DepartmentIn the Matter of the Estate of
James Thomas Buckley, also known

Designed and engineerd with
extra power for finest Indoor-Outdo- or

Televiewing ... Su-

perior reception in fringe as
well as local areas! Full er

operation with
Silicon Rectifiers

. . . Three double-tune- d I.F.
Stages for matchless perform-
ance, greatest selectivity ...
Proven short-dept- h

17BJP4 super-aluminiz- ed Pic-

ture Tube . . . Finest long-ran- ge

CASCODE Tuner . . .
Built-i- n antenna ... These and
other superior features give you

'unequalled televiewing perform-
ance, regardless of location!

EXCLUSIVE NEW

Picture-Tub- e Saver
Eliminates high current surge
during initial warm-u- p pe-

riod, thereby increasing pic-

ture tube life. When picture
tube becomes slow in warm-u- p,

and pictures are dim or
because of pic-

ture tube age, a simple serv-
ice adjustment adds in-

creased performance and ad-

ditional picture tube life.

WANTED retired man or couple to
manage Trailer Park. MU

WANT jammer man & cat skinner
combination. Call Ashland MU- -

mornings & eyes.
REGISTERED barber, steady. Good

opportunity. Call SP after
7 p.m.

Portable and home hi-- fi sets can be seen and heard at your authorized dealers.
See them today!

PAULSEN'S THRIFT MARKET
126 East Pine Stret Central Point Phone NO

A- -l RADIO & TELEVISION SERVICE
627 North Central Medford Phone SP 56

as James 1. Buckley, deceased.
Notice Is hereby given that the

undersigned has been appointed and
now is the duly qualified and act-
ing executor of the will and estate
of the above named decedent, and
any and all persons having claims
against said decedent or his estate
are hereby required to present the
same, with proper vouchers and
duly verified as by law required,to the undersigned at his residence
near Ruch in Jackson county, Ore-
gon, within six months from the
date of this notice.

Dated and first published the
24 day of May, A.D. 1959.

Lewis T. Buckley. Executor

WANTED young brilliant man to
assist in proven sales of house-
hold appliance. Opportunity to
make over $100 weekly with 6
hrs. devoted to this project. All
appointments furnished, no so-
licitations. SP

Plenty of Free Parking Space!

FESTWAL lueooosaftarr
a. RTx--V

SUCCOTASH

PEAS PEAS & CARROTS

O MIXED VEGETABLES

CHOPPED SPINACH

FRENCH FRIES

Free tPorfraSt
To you, our many fine customers, we
have made arrangements to offer a free
finished portrait of your child, family
group, or whatever you would like.

These Portraits Will Be Taken In Our
Booth At The

FARM FESTIVAL
Saturday 10 a.m. to 6 p.m.

No cost ... no obligation. Limit one per
family. Minors must be accompanied by
parents.

Z7
See You at the Festival

FRIDAY and SATURDAY

CRATER HIGH SCHOOL 1 All Prices Effective

Friday and Saturday!
CUT BROCCOLI

tcVE6ETABUS

00SAVE at Central Points Most Complete Shopping Center! 7Blue Goose

Af

F
0
RGOLDEN

RIPE
n n n

fiffi v U uw
NESTLE'S

2 LBS.,

Don't Miss Our

NORTHRUP
KING

DISPLAY
at the

Farm Festival!

Problem:
THIN LAWN

I IfC

STRAUSS CHOICE GUARANTEED MEATS

LARGE HEADS NO RUBBING FLOOR WAX

LETTUCEPork Chops
(CENTER CUTS)

FRESH EASTERN PORK

mm Aw
qt

LONG GREEN

..If

10 49'

Feed with new improved
NK high analysis (20-8-- 8)

Lawnfood. Organic
nitrogen assures steady,
season-lon- g growth, root
development.

CucumbersT-BON-
ES

Aged Just Right Well Trimmed NO. 1 WHITE
NK

Lawn Food

Covers
5000 sq. ft.

STIDD'S-1-- LB. CANPOTATOESK.
cken doodleU95 Cll10EXTRA FANCY WASH.

WINESAPSAPPLES lb.EDVRDC Fancy-P- an Ready t.4I k4 I E..W) lbTender Tasty Birds

WIEMme Skinless
PAULSEN'S. . . ...

uiBfifc Ml n fo) r? frirlb.Tasty Brand if j uu
Lots of Free

Parking
2 Big Lots
AT THt REAR OF

THE STORE!

fUEEtfE Mild Cheddar u mjM Uir u uvuKiinmiir. u

CENTRAL POINT, OREGON

Closed Every Sunday We Reserve the Right to Limit Quantities

WILIJI Will Cut Any Size

21

i


