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Foreig
SummiI_M_eeting

Will Hinge on
Success of Talks

Geneva— Pl -The Western
and Soviet foreign ministers
meet May 11 in this tradi-
tional “City of Peace™ to try
to prevent the Berlin crisis
from exploding into a nuclear
third world war.

If they can show the world
even a modest measure of suc-
cess, they may pave the way
for an East-West meeting at
the summit this summer.

The meet under the shadow
of the six-month ultimatum
delivered by Soviet Premier
Nikita Khrushchey to the
West last Nov. 27 to get out
of West Berlin by May 27.

Since he plunged the world
into this new Berlin crisis,
Khrushchev has sought to wa-
ter down his original demand,
denving that it really was an
“ultimatum.” He has declared
repeatedly that all he wants
is East-West cold war peace.
He has promised to take no
explosive action against Ber-
lin—for.a while, anyhow—pro-

|vided
gotiations are underway.
Secondary Importance

fear Soviet action on May 27
that might plunge the world
into war at once. But they
noted that Khrushchev's shifts
and apparent ‘‘concessions”
were only tactical and of sec-

no sign of readiness on his
part to back down or even
ease up on his major demands,

Here is what the Russians
have demanded and will de-
'mand again at Geneva:

~The West must get out of
|West Berlin, the occupation
regime must be “liquidated™

lated 110 miles behind the

formed into a ““free city.” The
West knows this would mean
that sooner or later free West
Berlin would be absorbed by
Communist East Germany.
-The West must agree to a
conference to conclude a

halves of divided Germany.
If the West refuses., Russia
will conclude one with Com-
munist East Germany alone.

Must Accept Ban

~The West must accepl an
unconditional ban on nuclear
test explosions — an issue on
which Russia and the West
have been stalled at a Geneva
nuclear conference since last
October.

—The West must agree to a
ban on nuclear weapons for
West Germany.

nonaggression pact between
the North Atlantic Treaty
Orgonization and the Com-
munist Warsaw Alliance coun-
tries.

The West has made it plain
it will not get out of Berlin
and will not let itself be
squeezed or maneuvered out.
It has declared unequivo-
cally that it will fight rather
than capitulate on this.

But the Western Allies have
had more trouble deciding on
counter-proposals to the So-
viets.

It tock a meeting of the
Western foreign ministers in
Washington at the end of
March, laborious behind-the-
scenes work by a four-power

Western working group in

and the Western sectors, 1so-|
Iron Curtain, must be trans-|

peace treaty with the two

~The West must accept a|

West's diverging ideas

i Counter Proposals

| The West now is likely to

counier the Soviet demands
with these proposals:
—The West will offer to dis-

ondary importance. They saw |CUSS new “arrangements” to|

{“implement” the" existing
| four-power status of Berlin
land free lines of communica-
{tiom. It may agree to bring
the United Nations in some
way into this new arrange-
iment, But it will refuse firm-
|1y to scrap the existing four-
ipower zgreements on Berlin.
—The West may offer Rus-
|sia a new East-West control
land inspection scheme to
Iguard against surprise attacks,
| —The West may propose, as
|a second phase in a cold war
| settlement, that there should
be gradual limitation of forces
|and_arms in Central Europe
| —providéd progress is-made at
the same time towards Ger-
|man unification.

For newly named U. S. Sec-
retary of State Christian Her-
ter it is his fi{st major con-
ference with the Soviets. The
other Western delegation
chiefs are British 'Foreign
Secretary Selyn Lloyd and
French Foreign Minister Mau-
rice Couve de Murville.
Headed by Groups

The . Soviet delegation is
headed by Foreign Minister
Andrei Gromyko.

West German Foreign Min-
ister Henrich von Brentano
{and East German Foreign
i Minister Lothar Bolz will sit
{at the conference table as ob-
Servers. D

The Soviets have asked that
C om m unist Czechoslovakia
and Poland also should attend,
But it was left to the confer-
ence itself to decide wheth'er
they should and in what ca-
pacity.

Once again the ministers
will meet in the green-uphol-
stered council chamber of the
massive United Nations Eu-
ropean headquarters building
overlooking Lake Geneva.

It was there that the first
summer conference was held
in the summer of 1955 as well
as the abortive foreign minis-

ters’ meeting that followed

%

LIPS

“serigus” East-West ne- London and another Western |it-the last time East and West
[toreign ministers’ meeting in‘met at the same conference
| Paris, April 29 to bring the|table to seek a solution of the
| into | problems of Germany and Eu-
Western officials no longer anything like a common front. | ropean security.

i

Package Tours
Help Dream Trip
To Come True

New York -TPI- “Package”
tours can help make vour
“dream trib” come true.

Worked out by experiencéd |
tour operators, these tours as-
sume for the traveler the
problem of how to get from
air or train terminal to hotel.
They have a local representa-
tive at each stop to assist with
any, problems and they care-
fully plan a sightseeing pro-
gram that will utilize ‘avail-
able time to the fullest. Anoth-
er feature: you pay in ad-
vance. This eliminates doling
out money along the way.

You can select a package
tour to fit not only the time
vou have, the price you want
to pay, the place you want to
visit, but almost any hobby
you want to pursue.

Choice of Companions

Another wvariation is pos-
sible’.in the choice of travel-
ing companions. Some prefer
to travel in a group, accom-
panied by an experienced
guide to take care of details.
Another type of escorted tour
is one in which the group gets
a guide for each city, but
travels to the different cities
on its own.

Independent package tours
also are available for those
who prefer to travel alone, or
with friends or family.

Travel agents can show you
many different types of tour
and help select the one you
will enjoy the most. They can
advise about the best time of
year to make certain trips, the
kind of clothing to take, the
immunization “shots” and
travel documents required.
It’s their job to know all the
answers.

Cuban Policemen
Now Clean Shaven

Havana TP~ Chin whisk-
ers, side burns and moustach-
es were only memories today
for members of the National
Police force.

With Police Chief Efigenio
Almeijeires himself wielding
one of the razors, barbers
worked in shifts Wednesday
to give policemen clean-shay-
en chins.

Beards were popularized
by Fidel Castro as a symbol
of Cuba’s revolution but the
police chief apparently decid-
ed the revolution was over.

He ordered the mass shear-
ing early this week, rescinded
it after some of the revolu-
tionary veterans protested and
then reinstated the order on
Wednesday.
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London - WP — A 14-year
struggle between East and
West for control of Germany
is the historic backdrop to the
Geneva Foreign Ministers con-
ference.

Almost 14 yvears ago to the
day — May 8, 1945, Lo be pre-
cise — the beaten remnants of
Nazi Germany capitulated to
the Allies of World War II.

In the years since, the one-|

time Allies who joined hands
on the Elbe river in Germany
in 1945 have become deadly
rivals of a nuclear age cold
war.

Still Without Treaty
‘Germany still is without a
peace treaty — a nation of 70,-
000,000 in the heart of Europe
divided between East and
West, its former capital, Ber-
lin, the fuse that could ex-
plode a third World War.
The 14-year-old -battle is

LEGAL NOTICES

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
%%N&GEMENT, ORAL AUCTION
be received by the District Man-
ager, Bureau of Land Management,
South Riverside at Barnett Road,
Medford, Oregon at 10:30 AM.,
PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on
Thursday, May 28, 1959, for all
timber marked or designated for
cutting. Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be oh-
tained from the above District
Manager. The right is hereby re-
served 1o waive technical defects
in this advertisement and to reject
any or all bids. The United States
reserves the right io waive any
informality in bids received when-
ever such waiver is in the interest
of the United States. IN JACKSON
COUNTY: OREGON: 0&C: SAL-
VAGE: All timber designated for
cutting on NE!,SEly, SE!;SE!;.
SE'4NW!5 Sec. 19, T. 33 S.,, R. 1
W., W.M,, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 40 M bhd.
it. Douglas-fir, 5 M bd. ft ponderosa
pine, 3 M bd. ft. sugar pine and
1 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for
Iess than $22.00 per M bd. ft. for
the Douglas-fir, $25.90 per M bd.
ft. for the Funderona pine, $16.60
per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine,
S7.00 per M bd. ft. for the white
fir, or a total purchase price of
51,066.30 will be considered. Min-
imum deposit with bhid $125.00.
GREEN: All timber designated for
cutting on E!.SE Sec. 19, T. 34

8, R. 2 W, W.l4., estimated for
the pl.ll?mie of this sale to be 144
M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 2 M bd. ft,

ponderosa pine, and 1 M bd. ft.
sugar pine. No bid for less than
$26.05 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas~
fir, $19.45 per M bd. ft. for the
ponderosa pine, $19.65 per M bd.
ft. for the sugar pine, or a total
purchase price of $3,809.75 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $400.00. All timber designated
for cutting on NIL.NW!;, SWIi;-
NWi,. SWiy, S1.5E!,, NW1.SE%,
Sec. 21, T. 34 5., R. 3 E, WAL,
estimated for the ggrpm of this
sale to be 4,091 M . it. Douglas-
fir, 85 M bd. ft ponderosa Nrine.
40 M bd. ft. sugar pine, 88 hd.
ft. incense cedar, and 768 M bd.
ft. white fir. No bid for less than
$27.00 per M bd. {t. for the Doug-
las-fir, $18.15 per M bd. ft. for the
onderosa pine, $20.60 per M bd. ft.
or the sugar pine, $7.70 per M
bd. ft. for the incense cedar, $10.75
per M bd. ft. for the white fir
or a total purchase price of $121.-
75735 will be considered. Minimum
deposit with bid $12,200.00, AD
timber designated for cutti.n.f on
the Niz, N!.SE!; Sec. 13, T. 38
8., R. 3 E, WM, estimated {for the
purpose of this sale to be 2,080
M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 80 M bhd. ft.
ponderosa pine, 7 M bd. {t. incense
cedar and 2839 M bd. ft, white
fir. No bid for less than $40.20 per
M bd. ft for the Douglas-fir, $26.20
per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa
pine, $10.20 per M bd. it. for the
incense cedar, $13.40 per M bd. ft.
for the white fir, or a total pur-
chase price of $123,826.00 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $12,400.00.
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SPARE RIBS

U.S. GRADED GOOD

BEEF ROAST

CASCADE BRAND

CASCADE

SWEET CURED JOWL

BACON

Try ‘em
barbecued

Guaranteed
tender

LIVERSAUAGE

FRESH SLICED

PORK LIVER

SMOKED SAUSAGE

Polish Rings

Rich in
vitamins

wsm—— BORDEN'S PURE

» 39"
n 99*
CHILI DOGS =" .. 45¢
n. 33
n 2*
3« *1.00
'MAYONNARISE ... 49°

e B9
BUTTER ....°1.98

Midget Prices

LARGE SIZE

W i

CELERY

THURSDAY
FRIDAY
SATURDAY

2 .20

SWEET JUICY CALIFORNIA

ORANGES

NEW WHITE ROSE

POTATOES

ARIZONA SEEDLESS

OCCIDENT

TOMATO

Salad
special

FLOUR  25..1.79

family size I7¢

CHATTERBOX

PEACHE.

2V can 29¢

26~lb.. crate
$2.90

4..99
10 .. 49"

GRAPEFRUIT 12 .99

TIME TO FREEZE WASHINGTON

ASPARAGUS

SNOBOY FANCY

LETTUCE

KING OF FRUITS

AVOCADOS ... .

s 13
2 .. 19
- 10°

Imgground 0

S as hereinafter designated will | .

——
| being fought ouf once more at
| the cohference table - not be-|
|cause Russia and the West are
| more optimistic of success but
|because they at least are
| united in fear of the nuclear
| conflict that might be the
| price of failure.

. At the Potsdam conference
in the summer of 1845, the
World War II victors laid
down the broad lines of a joint
| policy for destruction of Ger-
|man militarism and the last
traces of the Nazi system.

Rift Opened

That was their last agree-
ment on Germany. Within
weeks after the guns in Eu-
rope were silent, the rift be-
gan to open. Germany’s future
became the major point of
conflict and also the _chief
prize of the cold war that
gradually lined up the Com-
munist world sgainst the free

West. -

By three years after the

Potsdam agreement, Russia
had swallowed most of east-
ern Europe into her new satel-
lite empire.
As the division of Europe
became more and more ob-
vious, both sides increased
their efforts to win control
over the one great remaining
power vacuum — Germany.

Sectors Merged

In the spring of 1948, the

Western Allies halted the

‘drain of reparations from

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY
PROBATE DEPARTMENT
In the Matter

of =
the Estate of Frank A. Dufek,
deceased.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
I have been appointed Executrix
of the above estate by an order
made therein on April 28th, 1859;
all creditors having claims against
said deceased are hereby notified
io present the same, duly verified
and with proper vouchers attached,
to me at the office of Roberts,
Kellington & Branchfield, 201-3
U. S. National Bank Building, Med-
ford. Oregon, within six months
it ot SISy
ated a s

30th day of April, 1959,

» Lesta Dufek

Executrix

No. 10845
NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL
ALCOUNT
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

In the Matter offthe Estate

0

CHARLES V. JONES. Deceased.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
the undersigned has filed his final
account as administrator of the
estate of Charles V. Jones, de-
ceased, with the Circuit Court of
Jackson County, Oregon, and that
said Court has set the 25th day
of May, 1959, at the hour of 10:00
o'clock in the forenoon of said
day in the Court Room of said
Court in the Court House Building
at Medford, Jackson County, Ore-

on, as the time and place for

earing objections thereto and the
settlement thereof.

DATED and first published this
23rd day % April, 1939,

. Norman S, Thames,

Administrator
HARBISON AND PIAZZA
Attorneys for Administrator

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
at 7:30 o'clock P. M. on the 14th
day of May. 1859 in the Council
Chambers of the City Hall in the
City of Medford, Oregon there shall
be a public hearing by and before
the Planning Commission of said
City on the question of changing
the zoning of the following de-
scribed area within said City,
to-wit:
The Westerly 10 feet of Lot 20,
all of Lots 21, 22, 23 and 24,
Block 1 of the Fruitdale Addi-
tion to the City of Medford,
being an area on the North side
of East Jackson Street between
Hawthorne Street and Howard
Street, from non-conforming to
Class IIT A, Limited Commercial

District.
0. R. McNeel
Building Inspector

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN that
at 7:30 o'clock P. M. on the 14th
day of May, 1959 in the Council
Chambers of the City Hall in the
City of Medford, Oregon there shall
be a public hearing by and before
the Planning Commission of said
City on the question of changing
the zoning of the following de-
seribed area within said City,
to-wit:

Commencing at the WNortheast
corner of 1 in Block 5, of
Valley Center Subdivision in

Jackson County, Oregon; thence
West, along the North line of
said lot, a distance of 100.0 feet
to the point of beginning; thence
continuing West, 15.0 feet; thence
South, 1000 feet; thence West,
parallel with the North line of
sald Jot, to the Westerly line of
said Lot 1; thence South 35* 08’
East, along said Westerly line to
the Southwest corner of said
lot: thence East, along the South
line thereof, a distance of 00.05
feet to the Southeast corner of
said lot; thence North, along
the East line of said lot, a dis-
tance of 146.59 feet; thence West,
100.0 feet to a point South of the
point of beginning; thence North,
100.0 feet to the point of be-
also,
Beginning at the Southwest cor-
ner of Lot 2. Block 5. Valley
Center Subdivision in Jackson
County, Oregon;. thence easterly
along the South line of said Lot
2, 1924 feei i{o the Southeast
corner thereof: thence northerly
along the Easterly boundary of
said Lot 2, 4650 feet: thence
Westerly 15124 feet on a line
parallel with the Southerly
boundary of Lot 2 : thence
Soubtgm‘“ feet to the point
of g
being an area on North Pacific
Highway In the Berrydale area,
from Class IA, Single Family
Dwelling District and Class IV,
Limited Light Industrial District
to Class V, Light Industrial Dis-

frict.
0. R. McNeel
Building Inspector

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
| NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
at 730 oclock P. M. on the 14th
| day of May, 1959 in the Council
Chambers of the Cit¥ Hall in the
Citv of Medford, Oregon there shall
be a public hearing by and before
the Planning Commission of said
City on the question of allowing
a variance in setback provisions
and parking regquirements applic-
able under the Class Il A, Limit-
ed Commercial classification on the
Westerly 10 feet of Lot 20, all of
'il..m.-: 21, 22, 23 and 24, Block 1 of
the Fruitdale Addition to the City

STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-| '}
SON COUNTY

—

Yea

their

The Soviets refaliated by
walking out of the Allied Con-
trol Council and blockading
Berlin. The West defeated the
blockade by the Berlin air-
lift. But the blockade already
had completed the division of
Germany and of Europe itself.

The result was establish-
ment of two rival German
states which ultimately were
incorporated into the Western
and Communist military bloes.

In the summer of 1955, the
first Geneva Summit Confer-
ence gave the world a short-
lived hopeof a cold war thaw.
The Russians joined the West
in accepting equal responsi-
bility for reunifying a divided
Germany.

But the Summit Conference
hopes died quickly, too, at the
Geneva Foreign Ministers'
meeting three months later.
Russia again blocked all at-
tempts at agreement on Ger-

\man reunification except on

her own terms.

Dr. Buck to Take

Part in Convention

Dr. Robert Buck, Medford,
will be one of two moderators
at the 12th annual conven-

tion of the Association of Ore-
gon Medical technologists in
Gearhart this week end. Dr.
George Nicholson of Klamath
Falls will be the other mod-
erator.

Speakers at the conven-
tion will include John Moran,
Houston, Tex.: Dr.'Keith Mec-
Milan, Eugene; Dr. Arthur
Seaman, Dr. Arthur Liver-
more and Melvin Mangum, all
of Portland.

i

ts of Cold War

zones to the Sovieis,| :
soon merged the three West-| viet Premier Nikita Khrush-|many is reunified or not, they
ern sectors into one economic |chev to declare with brutal{never will permit East Ger-
unit and finally gave it a re-|frankness that Russia was not/many to abandon Commu-
formed currency in.place of |interested in German reuni- Dism.

its worthless, inflation-ridden | fication at all.
Reichsmarks. |

Finally, it remained for So-|

Since Potsdam, there have|
\been nine conferences of the
| Western and Soviet toreign‘
{ministers and one summltl
| meeting. The net result has
|been a mounting toll of frus-
tration, bitterness and harden- |
ing of the cold war fronts. |
| German reunification appears |
further away than ever. !

What do the two sides)
want? |

The West still is solamnly |
pledge to reunify Germany
“in peace and ‘freedom"
through completely free elec-
tions throughout the country. |

The West put forward its|
proposals in the so-called |
“Eden Plan” at the Berlin|
Big Four Foreign Ministers’
Conference in January, 1854.
It was spelled out in greater |
detail in a Western draft
treaty for Germany at the|
Foreign Ministers Conference
in Geneva in October, 1955.
Al-German Elections

The “Eden Plan” is based
on free all-German elections
for an all-German parliament.
This would produce an all-
German government ‘with
which a German peace treaty
would be negotiated.

The West always has main-
tained that a united Germany
also should have the right to
decide whether it wanted to
join the North Atlantic Treaty
Organization, the Communist
Warsaw Pact or remain neu-
tral.

The Soviets: want to main-
tain the East-West division of
Germany into iwo separate
states. They have urged the
two German states to get to-
gether and form a looge Ger-
man federation. Khrushchev

n Ministers Meeting Under Shadow of Khrushchev’s Ultimatum

should be headed by East Ger-
man Communist Premier Otto
Grotewahl.

The  Soviets have declared
repeatedly that, whether Ger-

In effect, what the Russians
want is final acceptance by
the West of a permanent “co-
existence frontier” in Europe
under which East Germany
and the other satellites would
be recognized irrevocably as
members of her satellite em-
pire rather than regarded by
the West as countries to be
liberated some day.
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Compars ths cost of
Clathar Gifl, sunce for
ounca, with that of
other isading Brands ..
You'll be surprised!

—

Ciabber Girl is exclusively
known as the baking powder
with the balanced double
action . . . balanced for
uniformity in both mixing
bowl and oven.

BALANCED
Double Action
Means BETTER Baking

CLABBER GIRL

recently suggested that it

BAKING POWDER"

. Get
on your grocer’s shelf in
the fruit juice section

| of Medford
0. R. McNeel
Building Inspector

Try Real Gold 6-oz. concentrated Grape
Drink, Lemonade, and Tropical Punch

YES, LADY. IT’'S THE ECONOMY'
BREAKFAST ORANGE JUICE DRINK!

Vitamin C Enriched —Today’s Answer To Sky-High Citrus Juice
Prices! Each 8-ounce glass of Real Gold provides the daily adult mini-
mum requirement of Vitamin C...the good-health vitamin your body
needs every day. And Real Gold is so economical. You get a big family
quart from each 6-ounce can. Tastes so good, too. Each can contains
the juice of 6 to 8 luscious, tree-ripened California oranges. A consist-
ently delicious flavor — glass after giass! Never thin and watery —never
acid-sharp. Always flavor-perfect. Get some today!

|d

$2.50 Rose Clippers. One pair...$1
2 epn tops...2 pair...52 and 4

valse for jest $3!

Allow three weeks for delivery.

SENSATIONAL OFFER!

$2.50 to $3 Value SCISSORS saly $1
and 2 Real Gold can tops. YOUR CHOICE:
$3 Pinking Shears, $3 Kitchen Shears,

tops —ail 3...%3 and 6 can tops. $3.50

REMOVE can tops (2, 4 or 6)...with
Real Gold or @ number stamped on
them. Print mame and address, with
shears you want, on a piece of paper,
enclose with cash, check or money
order i envelope, mail to- REAL GOLD
Scissors, Box 451, Fremont, Ohio.

and
can




