

A-TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY

FOR SALE: 240 ft. of 2 in. pipe, fitted with new sprinklers. \$125. Reeling chaise longue, \$30.00. Trade for 2 captain chairs. See 1008 Hilton Road or call SP-3-2222.

Garden Hose?
We have a complete assortment.
Big Y Feed & Seed.

LEGAL NOTICES

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT, ORAL AUCTION
Bids as hereinafter designated will be received by the District Manager, Bureau of Land Management, South River Road, Medford, Oregon, at 10:30 A.M., PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on Thursday, April 2, 1959, for all timber marked or designated for cutting. Before bids are submitted, all information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and submission of bids should be obtained from the District Manager. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement and to accept any or all bids. The United States reserves the right to waive any informality in bids received whenever such waiver is in the interest of the United States.

IN JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON: O&C GREEN: All timber designated for cutting on E-55W-1/4, Lots 3 and 4, Section 36 and Lot 1, NE-1/4, Section 31, T. 32 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2,000 M board ft. Douglas-fir, 8 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 150 M bd. ft. sugar pine, 82 M bd. ft. incense cedar, 147 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less than \$24.35 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$30.90 per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine, \$31.00 per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine, \$8.10 per M bd. ft. for the incense cedar, and \$9.90 per M bd. ft. for the white fir, or a total purchase price of \$16,750.00. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,700.00. All timber designated for cutting on N-1/2, Section 34, T. 32 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 230 M bd. Douglas-fir, 17 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 21 M bd. ft. sugar pine, 5 M bd. ft. incense cedar, 63 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less than \$19.10 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$12.25 per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine, \$16.65 per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine, \$3.60 per M bd. ft. for the incense cedar, and \$16,750.00. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,700.00. All timber designated for cutting on N-1/2, Section 34, T. 32 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 33 M bd. Douglas-fir, 76 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 26 M bd. ft. sugar pine. No bid for less than \$23.10 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$19.70 per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine, \$21.95 per M bd. ft. for the sugar pine, or a total purchase price of \$2,830.20 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$300.00. All timber designated for cutting on N-1/2, Section 34, T. 32 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 142 M bd. Douglas-fir, 428 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 38 M bd. ft. white fir. No bid for less than \$26.10 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$28.85 per M bd. ft. for the ponderosa pine, \$12.00 per M bd. ft. for the white fir, or a total purchase price of \$16,750.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,700.00.

LEGAL NOTICES

No. 10081
NOTICE OF SALE OF REAL PROPERTY
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR JACKSON COUNTY
In the Matter of the Guardianship of ANSON V. THOMPSON, Inc.

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, Lauretta N. Thompson, the duly appointed, qualified and acting guardian of the above entitled estate, under and by virtue of an Order duly and regularly made, rendered and entered by the Circuit Court of the County of Jackson, State of Oregon, dated of October 14, 1958, licensing, empowering and ordering her so to do, will offer for sale and will sell at private sale in the office of her attorney, Robert D. Dames, 1 Gentry Building, Medford, Oregon, on the 10th day of April, 1959, for cash in hand and subject to the further order and confirmation of said Circuit Court, all the right, title, estate, lien and interest that she as guardian of said estate has in and to the following described premises, lying and being situate in the County of Jackson, State of Oregon, to-wit:

A strip of land 30.0 feet in width over and across lands described in Jackson County Deed Records, Volume 334, Page 16, being more particularly described as follows: Beginning at the Southeast corner of Donation Land Claim No. 75, Township 34 South, Range 2 West, Willamette Meridian, Jackson County, Oregon, thence South 89 degrees 54' West, 150.0 feet, thence North 15.0 degrees 54' East, 30.0 feet, thence North 15.0 degrees 54' East, 30.0 feet, to the point of beginning. Dated and first published this 12th day of March, 1959.

LAURETTA N. THOMPSON,
Guardian of the Estate of Anson V. Thompson,
Incompetent.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Jackson, Probate Department.
In the Matter of the Estate of Roland W. Eagle, also known as Roland W. and R. W. Eagle, Deceased.
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, Joseph R. Hosick, has been appointed and qualified as administrator of the estate of Roland W. Eagle, deceased, and all persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same, with proper vouchers, at the office of C. H. D. Ouellette, attorney for said Joseph R. Hosick, 128 E. Main, Medford, Oregon, within six months from the date hereof. Dated and first published this 12th day of March, 1959.

JOSEPH R. HOSICK,
Administrator

A-TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY

THE Women group of the R.L.D.S. Church is having a baked goods sale Saturday April 4th at the Home Appliance Store from 9 a.m. to 1 p.m. Special home made candy. Miscellaneous also. FOR SALE—GARDEN TRACTOR cultivator, plow, mower, \$125. SP-3-4545.

LEGAL NOTICES

New & Used
Garden tillers & lawn mowers. Complete repair service.
Big Y Feed & Seed.

FOR SALE 1951 1/2 ton Ford pickup will take motorcycle in trade. HI 6-3763.

"OIL TO BURN"
Expert Burner Service
S&H Green Stamps
MEDFORD FUEL CO.
SP-2-2111

DRY MIX Concrete & Dry Mix mortar for the do it yourself man.
Big Y Feed & Seed.

LEGAL NOTICES

No. 10081
NOTICE OF SALE OF REAL PROPERTY
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR JACKSON COUNTY
In the Matter of the Guardianship of ANSON V. THOMPSON, Inc.

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, Lauretta N. Thompson, the duly appointed, qualified and acting guardian of the above entitled estate, under and by virtue of an Order duly and regularly made, rendered and entered by the Circuit Court of the County of Jackson, State of Oregon, dated of October 14, 1958, licensing, empowering and ordering her so to do, will offer for sale and will sell at private sale in the office of her attorney, Robert D. Dames, 1 Gentry Building, Medford, Oregon, on the 10th day of April, 1959, for cash in hand and subject to the further order and confirmation of said Circuit Court, all the right, title, estate, lien and interest that she as guardian of said estate has in and to the following described premises, lying and being situate in the County of Jackson, State of Oregon, to-wit:

A strip of land 30.0 feet in width over and across lands described in Jackson County Deed Records, Volume 334, Page 16, being more particularly described as follows: Beginning at the Southeast corner of Donation Land Claim No. 75, Township 34 South, Range 2 West, Willamette Meridian, Jackson County, Oregon, thence South 89 degrees 54' West, 150.0 feet, thence North 15.0 degrees 54' East, 30.0 feet, thence North 15.0 degrees 54' East, 30.0 feet, to the point of beginning. Dated and first published this 12th day of March, 1959.

LAURETTA N. THOMPSON,
Guardian of the Estate of Anson V. Thompson,
Incompetent.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Jackson, Probate Department.
In the Matter of the Estate of Roland W. Eagle, also known as Roland W. and R. W. Eagle, Deceased.
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, Joseph R. Hosick, has been appointed and qualified as administrator of the estate of Roland W. Eagle, deceased, and all persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same, with proper vouchers, at the office of C. H. D. Ouellette, attorney for said Joseph R. Hosick, 128 E. Main, Medford, Oregon, within six months from the date hereof. Dated and first published this 12th day of March, 1959.

JOSEPH R. HOSICK,
Administrator

1-LODGE NOTICES

Medford Lodge No. 103, A.F. & A.M. Special Communication 7:30 P.M. on Friday, April 3rd. Visiting brethren welcome. Work in the F.C. degree. Refreshments. Ross Gilkinson, W.M.

2-SPECIAL CLUB EVENTS

RUMMAGE SALE: Sat. April 4th. Eagles Hall West Main. Clothing, gadgets & plants. Doors open at 9 a.m.

ROYAL Neighbors of America White Elephant Sale. All new merchandise. Everything from Tip & Sip Cup to coffee dispenser. Felt Bldg. Sat. April 4th.

RUMMAGE & plant sale by Towns Club, Eagles hall Apr. 3rd 9 to 5.

3-PERSONAL

WANTED—Information on whereabouts of Richard Hurd, his address or name of insurance Co. working for Was in Medford. Rogue River area Jan. & Feb. selling insurance. Write Tribune Box 5381.

ANYONE having a drinking problem is welcome at Alcoholics Anonymous, 9 p.m. Tues. & Sat. Rear of 212 N. Oakdale SP-2-6657.

STANLEY HOME PRODUCTS
NO 4-2696

JO RENNICK
is now with the Big Y Beauty Shop, 248 S. 1st. Styling, Permanent, Tinting, Manicuring, etc. Even by appointment. Free parking in the lot.

SEE STOKES
For watch repair.
248 S. 1st.

MOUNTAIN VIEW NURSING HOME, 24 hr. nursing care, 536 Park St., Ashland, Ore. MU 2-7135.

PROMPT TAX SERVICE

3512 Table Rock Rd. NO 4-1352.

RAWLEIGH HEALTH PRODUCTS, 701 N. Modoc. SP-2-4438.

WATKINS PRODUCTS, 3567 E. Main. SP-2-5697.

A-TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY

NAILS 9 d & 16 d Box Nails, \$11.90 per 100 lbs. Lewis Wholesale Builders Supply, 139 S. Fir. SP-2-7135.

BEVEL Redwood Siding 955 A.M. 3/4x10" Shado-edge Cedar Bevel Cedar Siding \$225 a M. sheet, 3/4x10" Exterior Chip-board \$228 a sheet. 4x4 Surfaced Cedar Posts 6 Lin. ft. 1x6 Cedar Fencing \$40 a M. No. 2 Oak Flooring \$140 a M. Fine Pine Shum Paint.

WESTSIDE LUMBER CO., 924 SUMMIT AVE. SP-2-5539.

HARDBOARD 1/2" \$1.80 per 4x8 sheet, Lewis Wholesale Builders Supply, 139 S. Fir. SP-2-7135.

WANTED TO TRADE—EQUIPMENT in small 2 bdrm. home with large lot, on paved street, for modern trailer house. SP-2-7101.

WANTED carpenter work any kind, free estimates, work guaranteed. SP-2-2035.

BOOK SALE, St. Mary's Gym, 11th & Holly, April 3rd & 4th.

CASH & CARRY
Beautiful cedar 1x8 T&G tight knot, rough 3 rustic or raised paneling \$115 per M.
1x10" or 12" reverse board & bat cedar, \$130 per M.
30,000 ft. 1x8" or 10" resaw Doug. Fir sheathing, unit lots \$35 per M.
S&H Green Stamps
NORTON LUMBER CO.
Camp White. KE 3-2037.
RUMMAGE SALE, St. Mary's Gym, 11th & Holly, April 3rd & 4th.

BARNYARD fertilizer, 2 & 3 yr. old. By yard, pickup or truck load. SP-3-8761.

BUNDLES OF OLD NEWSPAPERS for sale 20c each. Mail Tribune office 33 North Fir.

Commercial Spraying of all kinds. No job too large or too small. T. W. Withrow. SP-2-5376.

3-PERSONAL

WOMEN hard to fit. Powers Dressing. SP-2-8756.

POWDER PUFF BEAUTY SHOP, 2302 Crater Lake Ave. Open every day. Even by appointment. Styling, Tinting. Permanent. Phone 3-4323. Ruth Shama, Owner-Operator.

5-INSTRUCTIONS

BALLROOM DANCING Private or group lessons. Call SP-3-8373 after 1 p.m.

GUITAR LESSONS, SP-3-4672.

10-WANTED MALE HELP

CARWASHERS
Apply Big Y Signal.

SALESMAN WANTED
Need one more man to round out sales crew. Sell the world's most popular automobile. Experience preferred.

HANSEN CHEVROLET
Roseburg, Oregon.

BOYS, age 12 yrs. old or over, to deliver Mail Tribune routes in Phoenix, Jacksonville & Central Point. Call Mail Tribune Circulation Dept. SP-2-6131.

NIGHT crawler gatherers, P.O. Box 1144, Medford.

MILKER Non-drinker. Good working conditions. HI 6-3821.

11-WANTED FEMALE HELP

PRACTICAL help for semi-invalid lady live in Prospect. SP-2-5541.

2 EXPERIENCED waitress, over 21. Union house. SP-3-4773 or SP-2-8755 for appointment.

EXPERIENCED switch board operator. Inquire Medford Hotel, Dan Marmo.

12-MALE OR FEMALE HELP

MAP DRAFTSMAN
Must be familiar with assessment map system. Apply in person Jackson Co. Assessor's office. SP-2-7050.

COUPLE for Apt. house managers, man can work apt. & wages. For appointment. SP-2-8202.

EXPERIENCED Hotel Clerk. Medford Hotel.

13-WANTED SITUATIONS

BOY wants light work or chores on ranch willing to learn. Does not smoke. Prefer Christian home. SP-2-7050.

GARDEN work & expert lawn care. SP-2-7524.

Wanted yard work any kind, have power mower. SP-3-4168.

CHILD care, anytime. SP-2-8886.

FENCE building & other rough carpenter work. SP-2-7524.

APRIL "HALF PRICE" SPECIAL. Average floor, cleaned, waxed, polished \$2.80. Average rug shampooed just \$3. Latest methods, equipment. Free estimates. Medford Maintenance Service. SP-2-9497.

IRONING by hr. SP-3-4097.

ROTOVATING Garden plots. SP-2-7500. Earl Lenz, 830 Taylor.

OLDER woman wants work, prefers housekeeping on ranch or with older couple. Live in. SP-3-3998.

CHRISTIAN widow wants steady housekeeping. Refs. Call Vesper House, 10846.

BOY SCOUT, reliable, run errands, do odd jobs. SP-3-4031.

CARPENTER work SP-2-4332.

IRONING 75c hr. TA 6-2966.

TELEVISION & RADIO REPAIR

All makes repaired. Credit terms available. All parts & repairs guaranteed.
WARD'S Service Dept., 833 S. Riverside.
Phone SP-3-5567.

ROTOVATING, Grading, Flow, disk. Garden & farm. 202 Vashit Way. SP-3-1278.

13-WANTED SITUATIONS

EX-SERVICEMAN desires steady work, 3 yrs. experience aircraft mechanic with USAF. SP-3-6154.

Adults 424 S. Grape. SP-3-6154.

POWER MOWERS & HAND MOWERS, machine sharpened, cleaned, oiled, adjusted. JERRY SERVICE at your home. KELLY. SP-2-8795.

Painting, paper hanging. SP-3-3881.

CHILD CARE. SP-2-2287.

TRACTOR WORK
Level, backfill, plow, etc. Ernie Mallams-SP-2-4310.

CARPENTER. References. KE-2-2938.

CLEAN redecorated 3-bdrm. unfurn. 601 Plum. SP-2-5572.

1-BDRM. house, 123 Chestnut. Inquire 202 Lincoln St. SP-2-8629.

2-BDRM. unfurn. Large yard. On quiet lane off Orchard Home Dr. 1987 Westwood.

2-BDRM. unfurn. house \$46. Mo. Can be seen at 12 Jeannette. SP-2-6054.

4-RM. house. Tile bath. wired for elec. washer & dryer, garage. Very clean. SP-2-8474.

1-BDRM. house. SP-2-2536.

2-BDRM. unfurn. or unfurn. Adults only. \$60. SP-2-6497 or MU 3-8561.

2-BDRM. unfurn. duplex, no dogs. North Holly. \$40. SP-2-2568.

UNFURN. 2-bdrm. house & garage. Inquire 624 Chestnut.

VERY nice Eastside, 2-bdrm. unfurn. house. \$90. SP-2-8091.

SMALL 2-bdrm. unfurn. modern home. Fireplace, large garage. 1277 Saling St. SP-3-2931 or UL-5-1246.

ALMOST new 2-bdrm. 3555 Connell. \$55. Water paid. SP-2-7810.

SMALL furnished house neat & clean. Suitable for two only. All utilities paid—No pets—\$55. 1557 Ford. TA 6-9185.

WANTED restaurant gas stove; double basket French fryer, triple mail mixer, toaster. Phone Paul UL-5-9582.

WANTED used Bar-Bell set. SP-3-1000.

WANTED house looking show. Write Tribune Box 7028.

SEVERAL 1/2 HP Deep Well pumps. Call Desert Pump Co. Eagle Point. SP-2-7050.

WANT TO BUY 1,000 watt Onan light plant must be in fair condition. State price. Write P.O. Box 86, Prospect, Ore.

NIGHT CHAULERS, 319 Earhart. Call us! SP-2-8218.

Best Cash Deal for good used Furniture. SP-3-1564.

WANTED Saddle & Bridle cheap. HI 6-3092.

INDIAN HEAD PENNIES. Some Lincoln & other old coins. SP-2-8945 after 6:30 p.m.

CASH for furniture, clothes, antique dishes & misc. NO 4-1994.

WE WILL buy your piano SP-2-4146.

WANTED wood heaters. SP-3-3227.

IMMEDIATE cash for furniture & other household effects. SP-2-2114 or SP-2-6355.

CASH for electric ranges, refrigerators, furniture tools, dishes & misc. SP-3-3227.

USED PIANOS wanted. Will pay cash. Enidene. SP-2-4995.

WANT BARKIE POLES. Contract us for prices & specifications. J. H. 8846.

P.O. Box 20, GR 6-6866, Grants Pass.

FURNITURE CASH DEAL

SP-2-2958 or SP-2-8760.

15-FINANCIAL & LOANS

Would like to borrow up to \$16,000. Good security on property. Rate 6% interest. Payable in \$1600 per year or by month. Write Tribune Box 7473.

REAL ESTATE LOANS to \$3000. Commercial, Industrial Finance Corp. Main & Riverside SP-3-4564.

20-FOR RENT, HOUSES

1-BDRM. modern unfurn. house. Water paid \$50. 2802 Springbrook. Adults. 424 S. Grape. SP-3-6154.

3-BEDROOM house, fireplace, large living room and dining room. Located on West Main St. \$75 per month. Call SP-3-6255.

FOR RENT trailer house. Refrigerator, laundry, private shower. \$35 mo. Utilities paid. Adults. 503 S. 3rd St. Jacksonville.

MODERN 3-bdrm. house unfurn. Also store room. \$50 month. 1808 Spring.

CLEAN redecorated 3-bdrm. unfurn. 601 Plum. SP-2-5572.

1-BDRM. house, 123 Chestnut. Inquire 202 Lincoln St. SP-2-8629.

2-BDRM. unfurn. Large yard. On quiet lane off Orchard Home Dr. 1987 Westwood.

2-BDRM. unfurn. house \$46. Mo. Can be seen at 12 Jeannette. SP-2-6054.

4-RM. house. Tile bath. wired for elec. washer & dryer, garage. Very clean. SP-2-8474.

1-BDRM. house. SP-2-2536.

2-BDRM. unfurn. or unfurn. Adults only. \$60. SP-2-6497 or MU 3-8561.

2-BDRM. unfurn. duplex, no dogs. North Holly. \$40. SP-2-2568.

UNFURN. 2-bdrm. house & garage. Inquire 624 Chestnut.

VERY nice Eastside, 2-bdrm. unfurn. house. \$90. SP-2-8091.

SMALL 2-bdrm. unfurn. modern home. Fireplace, large garage. 1277 Saling St. SP-3-2931 or UL-5-1246.

ALMOST new 2-bdrm. 3555 Connell. \$55. Water paid. SP-2-7810.

SMALL furnished house neat & clean. Suitable for two only. All utilities paid—No pets—\$55. 1557 Ford. TA 6-9185.

WANTED restaurant gas stove; double basket French fryer, triple mail mixer, toaster. Phone Paul UL-5-9582.

WANTED used Bar-Bell set. SP-3-1000.

WANTED house looking show. Write Tribune Box 7028.

SEVERAL 1/2 HP Deep Well pumps. Call Desert Pump Co. Eagle Point. SP-2-7050.

WANT TO BUY 1,000 watt Onan light plant must be in fair condition. State price. Write P.O. Box 86, Prospect, Ore.

NIGHT CHAULERS, 319 Earhart. Call us! SP-2-8218.

Best Cash Deal for good used Furniture. SP-3-1564.

WANTED Saddle & Bridle cheap. HI 6-3092.

INDIAN HEAD PENNIES. Some Lincoln & other old coins. SP-2-8945 after 6:30 p.m.

CASH for furniture, clothes, antique dishes & misc. NO 4-1994.

WE WILL buy your piano SP-2-4146.

WANTED wood heaters. SP-3-3227.

IMMEDIATE cash for furniture & other household effects. SP-2-2114 or SP-2-6355.

CASH for electric ranges, refrigerators, furniture tools, dishes & misc. SP-3-3227.

USED PIANOS wanted. Will pay cash. Enidene. SP-2-4995.

WANT BARKIE POLES. Contract us for prices & specifications. J. H. 8846.

P.O. Box 20, GR 6-6866, Grants Pass.

FURNITURE CASH DEAL

SP-2-2958 or SP-2-8760.

15-FINANCIAL & LOANS

Would like to borrow up to \$16,000. Good security on property. Rate 6% interest. Payable in \$1600 per year or by month. Write Tribune Box 7473.

REAL ESTATE LOANS to \$3000. Commercial, Industrial Finance Corp. Main & Riverside SP-3-4564.

21-FOR RENT, Apartments

NICE 3 rm. furn. \$50. Adults. 427 N. Grape. SP-3-4143.

DOWN stairs 3-room furn. apt. Adults. 424 S. Grape. SP-3-6154.

2-BDR