

They'll Do It Every Time

By Jimmy Hailo

WHEN LUSHWELL WAS A KID HE JUST COULDN'T MEMORIZE A THREE-WORD PERM...

BUT TODAY...OH, BOY! HE'S THE LIFE OF ANY PARTY WITH HIS LONG REPERTOIRE OF LITTLE GEMS!



Vacation Season Recalls History Of Postal Cards

Washington—With arrival of the vacation season, when millions of "wish you were here" notes will be mailed, Postmaster General Arthur E. Summerfield has described the post card as "the most economical means of communication the world has ever known."

His department estimates it will deliver 3,250,000,000 postal and post cards this year. (Postal cards are pre-stamped and distributed by the post office; post cards usually feature a picture or drawing and are privately sold.)

The government issued the first postal card 84 years ago this month—in 1873. However a dozen years before John P. Charlton of Philadelphia copyrighted the idea and permitted H. L. Lipman to sell "Lipman's Postal Cards." Uncle Sam horned in on the market, and Lipman went out of business.

Actually, Austria, Germany, England, Switzerland, Belgium, and the Netherlands issued pre-stamped postal cards before the United States.

The McKinley Card. Postal cards one cent until 1952 when the price was doubled. Apparently, Summerfield thinks they would still be an "economical means of communication" at three cents because he's urged a price increase to help wipe out the postal deficit.

During World War I there was a one-cent tax on postal cards. When the war ended the post office was stuck with 200 million cards printed "2 cents." The government stamped them over as "1 cent."

One of the most valuable postal cards was issued in 1902, featuring the likeness of President William McKinley. Supposedly, Mrs. McKinley didn't like the picture of her husband, and most of the 1,425,000 cards printed were destroyed. The few still in existence are valued by collectors at \$200 each.

International postal cards, at two cents apiece, were first sold in 1879. Double international reply cards, with already-stamped return cards attached, were issued in 1893 at four cents and permitted immigrants to receive messages from folks in the "old country" too poor to afford postage.

Air mail postal cards, at four cents, appeared in 1949, although regular postal cards with three cents extra postage were used before that.

Crop Duster Dies Near McMinnville

McMinnville—A routine crop dusting flight Tuesday afternoon ended the career of Dean C. Johnson, 34.

Johnson was flying toward McMinnville airport from a crop dusting job about four miles southeast of here when his plane crashed into a small grove of oak trees and burst into flame.

Three men who were working in an adjacent field pulled Johnson from the small plane and he was rushed to a McMinnville hospital where he was pronounced dead on arrival.

Johnson was owner of Dean Johnson Helicopters Inc., and has done crop dusting work throughout western Oregon. He had spent many years seeding the Tillamook burn area.

Last winter he received considerable publicity when he flew a mission in central Oregon to break ice from power lines.

Johnson is survived by his wife, Elleen, and two children, and his father and mother, Mr. and Mrs. W. O. Johnson of McMinnville.

Johnson served as a Marine dive bomber in the South Pacific during World War II.

LEGAL NOTICES

TIMBER FOR SALE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT ORAL AUCTION BIDS as hereinafter designated will be received by the District Forester, Bureau of Land Management, City Hall, Medford, Oregon, at 10:30 A. M. PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on Wednesday, June 28, 1957, for all timber marked or designated for cutting. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and submission of bids should be obtained from the above District Forester. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in bids received whenever such waiver is in the interest of the United States. **JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON, O&C SALVAGE.** All timber designated for cutting on SE 1/4, Sec. 11, T. 23 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 30 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$25.00 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, or a total purchase price of \$750.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$100.00. All timber designated for cutting on SE 1/4, Sec. 11, T. 23 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 30 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$25.00 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, or a total purchase price of \$750.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$100.00. All timber designated for cutting on SE 1/4, Sec. 11, T. 23 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 30 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$25.00 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, or a total purchase price of \$750.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$100.00. All timber designated for cutting on SE 1/4, Sec. 11, T. 23 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 30 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$25.00 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, or a total purchase price of \$750.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$100.00.

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING Notice is hereby given that at 7:30 o'clock P.M. on the 27th day of June, 1957, in the Council Chambers of the City of Medford, Oregon, there shall be a public hearing by and before the City Council, on the question of annexing to the said city the following described territory contiguous thereto, to-wit:

Beginning at a point on the corporate limits line of the City of Medford, in Jackson County, Oregon, said point being N 0° 10' W 29.91 feet from the northeast corner of D. L. C. No. 45 Township 37 South Range 1 West of the Willamette River to the westerly line of tract described and recorded in Volume 230, Page 174 of Deed Records of Jackson County, Oregon, thence N 9° 06' E along said westerly line of said tract, thence east along the north line of said tract 700.0 feet, thence south along the easterly line of said tract and the projection thereof 533.3 feet to the north line of Renshaw Subdivision, thence along the existing city limits line S 0° 10' W 704.2 feet, thence N 12° 34' E 743.0 feet, thence N 34° 22' E 193.0 feet, thence N 12° 34' E 87.0 feet, thence N 10° 10' E 170.0 feet, thence N 3° 02' W 383.0 feet, thence N 8° 01' W 100.0 feet, thence N 18° 54' W 633.3 feet, more or less, to the north line of Renshaw Subdivision, thence along said north line N 89° 59' 30" E 1026.6 feet to the center of Bear Creek, thence along the center of Bear Creek as follows: N 12° 15' W 174.4 feet, thence N 12° 15' W 180.0 feet, thence N 82° 08' W 342.0 feet, N 85° 18' W 441.0 feet, N 3° 00' E 23.0 feet, N 3° 00' E 23.0 feet, N 3° 00' E 23.0 feet, thence along the south line of Barnett Road, thence N 89° 58' W 201.3 feet to the northeast corner of property described in deed recorded in Volume 247 at Page 495 of Deed Records of Jackson County, Oregon, thence S 53° 47' E 91.4 feet, thence S 10° 00' W 63.0 feet, thence S 15° 45' E 100.0 feet, thence S 83° 15' W 278.0 feet, thence N 81° 04' W 260.0 feet, thence west 163.0 feet, thence north 436.20 feet to the south line of Barnett Road, thence west on said right of way line 600.0 feet to D. L. C. line, thence S 0° 10' E along said D. L. C. line 473.34 feet, thence curve to the right 288.0 feet the angle third of which curve bears S 44° 34' E 45.0 feet, thence 11.1 feet being on the existing city limits line, thence along said city limits line N 89° 59' 30" E 512.11 feet to the point of beginning, and that at said hearing the registered voters of the City of Medford, Oregon, may appear and be heard on the question of annexing said territory to the said city.

D. F. Huxon
City Recorder

World's civilian airline in 1956 carried about 78 million passengers.

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS (State to quiet title) No. 57-332-E
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON, FOR JACKSON COUNTY
D. ESTREMADE and A. ESTREMADE, husband and wife, Plaintiffs,

VS.
THOMAS IRVIN and PEARL IRVIN, husband and wife, each and all the unknown heirs of Thomas Irvin and Pearl Irvin, husband and wife, if deceased, also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint hereinafter.

Defendants.
TO EACH, EVERY AND ALL OF THE ABOVE NAMED DEFENDANTS: You and each of you are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of four weeks from the date of this summons, and if you fail to appear and answer said complaint, the Court will grant the relief demanded in said complaint, and decree that the plaintiff's title to the real property situated in Jackson County, Oregon, described as follows, be quieted.

Beginning at the Northeast corner of the Southeast Quarter of the Northwest Quarter of Section 33 in Township 36 South Range 3 West Willamette Meridian, Jackson County, Oregon, thence West along the North line of said tract a distance of 819.0 feet, more or less, to the Easterly right of way line of the Galla Creek County Road, thence Southerly along the Easterly right of way line of said County Road a distance of 41.0 feet, more or less, to an iron pin on the Southerly line of tract described in Vol. 253, Page 414 of the Deed Records of Jackson County, Oregon, thence Southerly along said Southerly line a distance of 673.0 feet, more or less, to a point on the East line of the Southeast Quarter of the Northwest Quarter of said Section 33, at a point 260.0 feet South of the Northeast corner thereof, thence North 260.0 feet to the point of beginning.

and declaring any and all such claims to be null and void, and decreeing that the said plaintiffs are the owners, in fee simple, of said premises, and of the whole thereof, free and clear of any and all right, title, estate, lien or interest of said defendants, and of all persons claiming, or to claim, by, through or under them, or any of them, be forever enjoined, restrained and barred from asserting, attempting to establish, or claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in or to said property, or any portion thereof, and that plaintiffs title to said premises be forever quieted and set at rest.

The date of the order for publication of this summons is June 19, 1957, and the time prescribed for publication of this summons is once each week for four successive weeks, the date of the first publication of this summons is June 19, 1957.

NORRAN A. KELLY
Attorney for Plaintiffs
20 Goldy Building
Medford, Oregon

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Jackson. Probate Department. No. 9815.

IN THE ESTATE OF CHESTER C. PATSON, Deceased. No. 9815.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned has filed her Final Account as administratrix of the above estate with the Circuit Court of said County, and the Court has fixed the 1st day of July, 1957, at the hour of 10:00 A. M., of said day, for the hearing of objections, if any there be, to the said Final Account, and you are hereby notified to file objections, if any you have, to the said Final Account on or before the time fixed for hearing. Dated and first published this 29th day of May, 1957.

Audrey C. Patson, Administratrix

Antarctica has the highest mean elevation of the world's seven continents.

VACATION

With The Greatest of Ease

If It's a Question of Vacation Money We Have The Answer! Borrow The...

American Way LOANS

\$25 TO \$1,500
• AUTO • SALARY • FURNITURE

For Any Worthwhile Purpose PAYMENTS TO FIT YOUR BUDGET

American Finance Corp.
Phone 5Spring 2-8886
123 W. Main • Medford

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Jackson. Probate Department. No. 9815.

IN THE ESTATE OF GRACE M. TRIPP, Deceased. No. 9815.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned has filed her Final Account as executrix of the above estate with the Circuit Court of said County, and the Court has fixed the 17th day of July, 1957, at the hour of 10:00 A. M., of said day, for the hearing of objections, if any there be, to the said Final Account, and you are hereby notified to file objections, if any you have, to the said Final Account on or before the time fixed for hearing. Dated this 18th day of June, 1957.

LEO JOSEPHINE HAUPERT, Executrix

NOTICE TO CREDITORS In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Jackson. In the Matter of the Estate of Clarence F. Korthase, deceased. No. 10079.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned has been appointed executor of the estate of the above deceased, and all persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present their claims, with proper vouchers, at the office of Kenneth G. Demman, Attorney at Law, 128 E. Main Street, Medford, Oregon, within six months from the date hereof.

Dated and first published this 20th day of May, 1957.
Heleen Jane Korthase, Executrix

NOTICE IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR JACKSON COUNTY
IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF HATTIE HILL, Deceased.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned administrator of the above estate has filed her final report and account and that Wednesday, July 10th, 1957, at 9:00 o'clock A. M. in the County Courtroom, County of Jackson, Oregon, has been fixed by the Court for the examination and allowance thereof.

Dated and first published this 12th day of June, 1957.
Thomas J. Reeder, Administrator

IN THE BASKET West Warwick, R. I. — Mrs. Marcel Gillingham's little daughter became wedged so tightly in a wastebasket that police had to be called to free her.

LEGAL NOTICES

TIMBER FOR SALE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT ORAL AUCTION BIDS as hereinafter designated will be received by the District Forester, Bureau of Land Management, City Hall, Medford, Oregon, at 10:30 A. M. PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on Thursday, July 18, 1957, for all timber marked or designated for cutting. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and submission of bids should be obtained from the above District Forester. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in bids received whenever such waiver is in the interest of the United States. **JACKSON COUNTY, OREGON, O&C GREEN.** All timber designated for cutting on NW 1/4, Sec. 35, T. 23 S., R. 1 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 47.1 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 107 M bd. ft. Ponderosa Pine, 644 M bd. ft. Sugar Pine, 411 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$25.00 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$33.45 per M bd. ft. for the Ponderosa Pine, \$11.45 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$163,830.70 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$7,530.00.

STOP THIEF! Provincetown, Mass. — Mrs. Julia McLean was walking along a street when a big Air-dale grabbed her handbag and ran away. The bag was found not far from the scene, but a wallet and a change purse containing a total of \$12 were missing. They were later found in the yard of the dog's owner, with contents intact.

\$587
1952 Chevrolet 4-Dr.
Deluxe Club Coupe
One of our city police officers will attest to the soundness of this car — he formerly owned it.

LEA MOTORS
5TH AT BARTLETT

Wednesday, June 19, 1957

MEDFORD (OREGON) MAIL TRIBUNE—THREE

Lamb Resigns Post At MacLaren School

Salem — The State Board of Control Tuesday accepted the resignation of James Lamb, superintendent of MacLaren school for boys at Woodburn.

Lamb had held the position since July of 1949.

The resignation is effective Sept. 1.

Lamb said he had no plans to announce at the present time. The Board of Control said in a statement: "Superintendent Lamb's resignation has been submitted to the Board of Control and we reluctantly accept it in the spirit in which it was given. During his time at the school he has greatly advanced various programs of rehabilitation. His interpretations to the public of the needs and objectives of the institution contributed much to the citizens' understanding of the school."

"We are appreciative of those constructive phases of his administration."

The board said it would welcome applications and nominations for the position.

Umatilla Signs Pact For Disease Control

Pendleton — Representatives of Umatilla county, the U. S. Public Health service and the Oregon State Board of Health signed contracts here on Tuesday for a two-year public health demonstration project on insect and rodent-borne disease.

Dr. Harold M. Erickson, state health officer, said the program will cost an estimated \$20,000 the first year of operation, and is designed to study actual and potential health problems resulting from insects and rodents.

The project, first of its type ever awarded to Oregon, is expected to get underway about November 1 under the direction of Dr. Walter P. Browne, Umatilla county health officer.

Do not toast breads in a toaster because they can burn out the heating element.

Nautilus Heads for Visit at Portland

Portland — The atomic-powered submarine Nautilus headed up the Columbia river today for a two-day visit to Portland.

The sub, under its new skipper, Cmdr. William Anderson, was due here about 4 p.m. and will leave Friday for San Diego.

Red Fir Slabwood SUMMER SPECIAL

3 Loads \$33.00

1 LOAD \$12.00
Immediate Delivery
Ph. SP 3-5878 or SP 2-5055

PHELPS FUEL CO.
1337 So. Peach St.
Save this ad for reference

Don't Miss . . .

Your Home Theater tonight at 8:30

KBES-TV

NEW 1958 GENERAL ELECTRIC PORTABLES

With Even Greater Pulling Power Than Before!

PLAYS WHERE A CONSOLE WILL --- GOES WHERE A CONSOLE WON'T!

108 SQ. IN. PICTURE AREA

GE PORTABLE TV

- Big Easy To Watch Picture
- Long Range Reception
- Light Weight — Easy to Carry
- Built-In Telescoping Antenna
- GE Engineered For Dependability

\$149.95 **\$9.75 A MONTH**

155 SQ. IN. PICTURE AREA

GE PORTABLE TV

- Big Console-Like Picture
- Compact To Save Space
- Built-In Telescoping Antenna
- 1 Year Guarantee On Set

\$189.95 **\$10.00 A MONTH**

GE PORTABLE TV

SAVE \$20

CLOSE OUT PRICES ON 1957 MODELS

Every 1957 Model Will Be Closed Out At SPECIAL LOW CLEARANCE PRICES . . . Your Chance to Really Save.

What! No TV Tonight!

One week tube can spoil your TV fun

GET OUR TV TUNE-UP WITH G.E. SERVICE DESIGNED TUBES. Call Home Appliance Today for Expert Service, Any Make or Model. All Work Guaranteed, of Course.

FOR SERVICE CALL SP 2-5254

HOME APPLIANCE CO.

YOUR GENERAL ELECTRIC DEALER

115 EAST MAIN - MEDFORD