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Southern Pacific

Wins Damage Suit
Klamath Falls (U.R) A U. S.

District Court jury here yester-
day returned a verdict in favor
of Southern Pacific Railroad in
a $150,000 damage suit brought
against the railroad.

The case, first to be tried in
the Klamath Falls federal court
session, was heard by Judge
James Alger Fee of the Ninth
Circuit Court of Appeals.

The suit was brought by the
widow of Donald L. Daulton,
railroad brakeman killed in a
fall from the footboard of a
worktrain engine near Klamath
Falls in October, 1952. She had
claimed the railroad was neglf
gent.
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BELIEVING HIM DEAD, Una Schmidt, wife of Cpl. Daniel C. Schmidt (left), tells of mar-ria- ge

to Alford Fine, Soda Springs, Cal., lumberjack last September at time when Schmidt
was war prisoner in China. Unaware of problem, Schmidt is returning to California after
being released by Communists. Schmidt's wife stands with new husband and soiC Danny
Schmidt, 2Vz, after Enoch Arden story was revealed. She says she loves Fme.(Internatiorud)

By ELIZABETH HURLOCK, PH.D.
unbiasei way and see if she is

right about what she says? Then
ask for help in correcting (tbse
faults instead of getting angry
at her.

(Copyright 1955, qGeneral Feature Corp.)
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DIRECTORY

Tractor Worie

TltENCHING excavation loading &
back filling LeBov Calkins 53?
C:ilm Ph

TV & Radio Repair
FWDIO & TV SERVICE All makes.

If it's worth repairing, we can
do it!

.MEDFORD RADIO SERVICE
10N. fir Eves.

TV & RADIO "SERVICE
FELDMAN & OLSON ELECTRIC

PHONE or
CITY APPLIANCE TV

Expert service on all makes
Phone day ur night

Home calls Mecilorn Area S3 50
IIAMMILL T V SERVICE CO.
ia;i() W Main Phone

eTiERSON-- TV SERVICE
Fast efficient. guaranteed fnot
just another TV man) BE SURE
Dial

Tree Service
CHAMBERLAIN TREE SERVICE All

types of trimming, topping, remov-
ing Mistletoe removal. Surgery. Ph.

for free estimates.
"LINEBAUGH BROTHERS

Pruning looping Removing
J Ph Jacksonville

Septic Tank
CASPERS

Septic tanks pumped and cleaned
TANKS INSTALLED

Drain work Free inspection
Low set prices No mileage charge
24 hour service Local War H vet

Dial or
DICK'S RURAL DISPOSAL SERVICE

Septic tanks pumped and repaired
Tanks installed to State specifica-
tions any size lrom 500 gallons up
Square concrete Domestic or Com-
mercial tanks Drain fields laid
Free estimates and inspection. AH
work guaranteed. Phone M. R
(Dick Gust. Medford.

"
SANITATION SERVICE

Darrell Fariss O E. Conklin
ROUND CONCRETE SEPTIC TANKS

500-e- $68 750-g- $98
Commercial Tanks (all sizes)

DRAIN FIELDS SEWER LINES
Meets all State & FHA Codes

TANKS PUMPED
TRENCHING EXCAVATION

CORN. 40c doz. Rt. 2. Box 402. M. W.
Olson. Ross Lane.

FRIENDLY MARKET
106 Jf. Ivy St.

Beef roast 39c lb.

Short Ribs 23c lb.

Ground Beef 3 lbs. for 99c

Old Fashion All Beef Weiners 49c lb.

Skinless Weiners 39c lb.

Phone
CO-O- P PTZ Mineral Mix helps control

internal parasites in livestock. 25 lb.
sack for S2.G5.

GRANGE CO-O- P

Central Point Ashland
FOR SALE Trailer. 6x11

box bed with rack, low
easy loading. Excellent 15" tires.
A fine trailer you'll be proud to
tow. Only $195. Phone See
at 3598 So. Pacific Hwy.

YELLOW TRANSPARENT APPLES
For FREEZING SAUCE PIES

Available SAT. & SUN. 8 a.m. to
7 p.m. or Ph. Eves. for special
appointment at your own conven-
ience. '
You pick 8c lb. PICKED 10c lb.
We have good ladders & buckets for
your use. Please bring container.

2580 STEWART AVENUE

FOR SALE '35 CHEV. flat bed. Med-for- d

Fuel. Court & McAndrews.
WILL purchase Contracts and Mort- -

gages. Tribune Box 3629.
NOTICE! COMMERCIAL SPRAYING

Withrow Phone
BLOX rough pine and slabs. bigdouble loads $7.50.

MEDFORD FUEL. Tel.
ROLL ROOFING SPECIAL.

45 lb. roll S2.20
90 lb. roll S3.50

GRANGE CO-O- P

Central Point Ashland
WE FIX EM while you sleep

Hawkins Nite Garage
616 S Central Ph

NOTICE! Now is the time to have
your mistletoe and dead wood
taken out of your oak trees. Free
estimates. Ph. Withrow.

LIME your legumes now. between hay
cuttings Our delivery price includes
spreading services Phone Gold Hill

Agricultural Lime Distribut--
mg Co,

'49 FORD tudor club coupe. Very
clean. $375. See at 1105 West Main
St. after 5:30 p.m.

SAVE
No. 4 and better Sheeting $40 per M.
D vertical grain flooring S140 per M.

2X6 beveled cedar siding $90 per M.
Free deliverv.
NORTON LUMBER CO.. Phoenix

SAWDUST for mulch.
MEDFORD FUEL Tel.

BUNDLES OF OLD NEWSPAPERS for
sale. 20c each Mail Tribune Office.
27 N Fir

Ground Barley $3.00 cwt.
Ground Barley & Oats $3.15 cwt.

Rolled Barley 70 lb. S2.25
Dairy Special S3.55 cwt.

GRANGE CO-O- P

Central Point Ashland
PLANER BLOX
Clean quick delivery.

MEDFORD FUEL 'Tel.
MEDFORD FURNITURE

2ND HAND STORE
USED Furniture and Appliances
2502 W Main Phone

APPLICATION for Medford Mail
Tribune carriers Must be 12 yrs. old
and in Jr high school, resident of
Medford Apply in person at Mail
Tribune circulation department.

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS
Suit in Equity for Divorce

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR THE
COUNTY OF JACKSON

MARION MARTHA CRAWFORD.
Plaintiff,

vs.
RICHARD W. CRAWFORD.

Defendant;
To RICHARD W. CRAWFORD, the
above named defendant:

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF
OREGON: You are hereby required to
appear and answer the complaint filed
against you in the above entitled suit
on or before the last day of four
weeks from the date of the first pub-
lication of this summons, and if you
fail to so appear and answer said
complaint, for want thereof the plain-
tiff will apply to the Court for the
relief demanded in her complaint,
succinctly stated as follows, it:

That a decree be entered as follows:
a. Dissolving the bonds of matri-

mony heretofore and now existing be-
tween the plaintiff and defendant, and

b. Granting unto the plaintiff the
care and custody of the minor child-
ren of said marriage. Richard Charles
Crawford. Willard Henrv Crawford.
Thomas Paul Crawford. Alice Martha
Crawford and Ann Marguerite Craw-
ford, and

c. f"or such other and further equit-
able relief as to the Court may seem
meet and proper in the premises.

This summons is published by order
of the Honorable H. K. Hanna. Judge
of the Circuit Court of Jackson Coun-
ty. Oregon, made and entered on the
29th day of July. 1955. and the time
prescribed for publication of this
summons is once each week for four
consecutive weeks.

Dated and first published this 5th
day of August. 1955.

Warren G. Lesseg
Attorney for Plaintiff
Postoffice Address:
128 East Main Street
Medford. Oregon

NOTICE
No. 9485

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR JACK-
SON COUNTY

IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE
OF W. T. NORRIS. aka WILLIAM
T. NORRIS. Deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

the undersigned administratrix of the

By Jimmy Hatlo

27 BUSINESS DIRECTORY

Rug Cleaning
RUGS. Furniture Cleaned repaired

Carpets made to order, any color
MEDFORD RUG FACTORY Ph

511 Mary St

Building
FRANK'S PERMA-ROOF- S

Roofing, Siding, Free Estimates
Grants Pass JU Medford

L. L WHITESIDE CONTRACTOR
Residential and light Commercial.

Free estimates. Fhone
CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

Driveways patios sidewalks Free
estimates for all tvpes of cement
work Office Ph

JOHN JORE. CONTRACTOR
Or call Gold Hill COLLECT

Electric Motors
MURRAY'S ELECTRIC SHOP Electric

Motors. Appliances. Hand tools
2389 N. Pacific Hwy.

GAGE ELECTRIC MOTOR SERVICE
Delco and Smithway Motors

Motor Rewinding and Repairing
1 12 N Front Phone

Fuel and Sawdust
PLANER BLOX Summer rates

Heavy hand-picke- d Red fir clean
no trash, buy now and save. 6

loads $27 50 10 loads $45 Medford
area. Ph.
All hand sorted wood, select slabs
rough block 2x4 edgings ft fire-
place wood graded and screened
sawdust or shavings coarse and fine

BIG LOAD LOW PRICES
McGINTY FUEl CO Ph

Plumbing
WOODY. THE PLUMBER
Complete Repair Service

Ph.
BROWNIES

PLUMBING & HEATING. INC.
PROMPT EFFICIENT SERVICE
519 Crater Lake Ave Ph.

BROOKS ELECTRIC
PLUMBING DEPT

For fast, courteous and efficient
service on all vour olumbing orob- -

lems. Call ,

WM SWARTZ YOUH PLUMBER
since 1920 1213 N Riverside

All work guaranteed Repair and New
Phone

Dead line for Sunday Classified is
at noon Saturday.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF SALE
Notice is herebv given that on the

27th day of August. 1955. at 10:00
o'clock A.M., at the front door of the
Court House in Medford. Jackson
County. Oregon. I will sell at public
auction for cash to the highest bid-
der, all the right, title and interest
of the defendants in and to the fol-

lowing described real property situ,
ated in Jackson County, Oregon, it:

The, East Half of the Southeast
Quarter of Section 34 in Town-
ship 35 South of Range 1 East of
the Willamette Meridian in Jack-
son County. Oregon.
Said sale is made pursuant to an

execution Issued out of the Circuit
Court of the State of Oregon for the
County of Jackson, on the 26th day
of July. 1955. in a certain suit there-
in, wherein Carl Hasler and Lora
Hasler. husband and wife, are plain-
tiffs and Alex M. Culbertson and
Jane Doe Cuibertson. his wife, are
defendants.

Dated this 26th day of July. 1955.
Howard Gault. Sheriff
Jackson County. Oregon

For Action, Use
Mail Tribune

Want Ads

e
e

lo

their actions, speech and general
attitudes.

The teens are trying years. The
only way a family can live
through them without causing
bad feelings all around is by
taking a philosophical attitude.

Your husband cannot expect
adult behavior from your

son. He may not do
things as you would want him
to do them, but show him how
instead of criticizing. He may
be at a loss to know what to do
and how to do it.

As for your daughter, don't
let her criticisms of you and
of the little boy upset you. In
fact, she may have a point. Why
not look at her criticisms in an

GRAIN & MOlin

This is definifefv

AMERICA'S MOST

SENSATIONALISAtf VALUE J
THENEW
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COME IN AND

As We Live
Family Friction
Gets Mother Down

Some families live together
harmoniously with only an oc-

casional quarrel, while in other
f a m 1 1 les the
members seem
to be at each
ohers' thro a t s
c o n s t a n tly.
What causes
this friction,
and how can it
be avoided?

(Q) "I am
just about at

Dr. Htrlock the end of my
rope. We are a family of five,
my husband, lwo teenage chil-

dren, a boy of 17 and a girl
of 15, the baby of the family,
a boy of eight, and myself.
Until recently, we lived to-

gether very happily and every-
one seemed lo get along well
with everyone else. But in the
last year things have been go-

ing from bad to worse. I can't
quite put my finger on the
cause of the trouble, but it
seems lo come mainly from Ihe
teenagers and their father.

"My husband is always criti-

cizing our son for
this or that, and our

daughter is always picking
on her little brother and on
me. She says I spoil the little
boy, that I won't lei her do
what other girls are allowed to
do, that I am getting loo fat,
etc. I must admit she tries my
patience at limes and I get .

pretty annoyed at her critical
altitude. What advice can you
give me?"

(A) You and your husband
should learn to take your teen-

age children less seriously. I do
not mean that you should push
them out of the family nest, let
them do as they please, or per-
mit them to rule the roost. But
you should not get so upset over

PICNIC SPOILED
Tokyo '(U.R) U.S. Air Force

weathermen of the First weath-
er wing packed picnic baskets
with sandwiches and cold beer
and headed for a gala outing yes-
terday but didn't stay out long.
It rained.

Use Tribune Want Ads

QUICK and EASY!

Free Estimates Guaranteed Work
PHONE 2B75 Lone Pine Rd

MITCHELL SEPTIC TANK AND
CESSPOOL SERVICE Tanks clean-
ed and repaired drain and sewer
laid New tanks installed All work
cusrantred Phone

At
Buy Builders Supply

QUALITY
BLOCKS
Bricks, Flues

Drain Tile
V27

W. McAndrewS
Phone

r u
.

S
FEATURES3

NEW smoothness
and

accuracy

SEE IT TODAY! 0

logo!
(0

Sedan!
Buy to Win! o

Body of Prineville

Man Found in River
Prineville OI.R) The body

of Jerry Battles, Prineville, was
recovered from a wide, deep
pool between two Crooked River
rapids about a mile and a half
upstream from Cove State Park
yesterday.

More than 100 men had been
looking for Battles' body for the
past five days. Battles and Mar-
tin Martinson, also of Prinve-ville- ,

drowned Sunday when
their rubber raft capsized in
rapids at the head of the Crook-
ed River Gorge. Two other occu-

pants of the raft survived.

LEGAL NOTICES

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER
FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the
forest supervisor or his authorized
representative at the Forest Service
office. Post Office Building. Medford,
Oregon, beginning at 10:00 a.m., Sep-
tember 5, 1955, for all live timber
marked or designated for cutting, and
all merchantaule dead timber located
in four separate and distinct units
within the Rogue River National For-
est, Oregon, as particularized below:
Lower Deer Creek Salvage: Sealed
bids will be received up to and not
later than 10:00 a.m.. September 5.
1955. Area embraces about 504 acres
within Sections 24. 25. 26. & 35. T. 30
S., R. 3 E., and Sections 19, 20. 21. 29.
& 30. T. 30 S.. R. 4 E W.M. Estimated
volumes are 780 M board feet more
or less of Douglas-fi- r, 100 M board
feet more or less of pine species, and
360 M board feet more or less of
white fir and other species of r.

No bid of less than S23.60
per M board feet for Douglas-fi- r,

i41.35 per M board feet for pine spe-
cies, and $5.90 per M board feet lor
white fir and other species will be
considered. In addition to the prices
bid for stumpage, a cooperative de-
posit of S2.20 per M board ieet. to be
used by the Forest Service for paying
the cost of slash disposal, and a co-

operative deposit of SO. 85 per M board
feet, to cover the cost of tree planting,
seed sowing, and timber stand im-
provement work on the area cut over,
lor the total cut of timber under the
terms of the agreement, will be re-
quired. Rock Creek Spur Salvage:
Sealed bids will be received up to and
not later than 11:C0 a.m., September
5, 1955. Area embraces about 192
acres within Sections 21. 22, 27, Ac

28, T. 30 S.. R. 4 E.. W.M. Estimated
volumes are 150 M board feet more
or less of Douglas-fir- , 30 M board
ieet more or less of pine species, and
20 M board feet more or less of white
fir and other species of sawtimber.
No bid of less than S20.90 per M
board feet for Douglas-fi- r. S44.40 per
M board feet for pine species, and
$8.55 per M- - board Ieet for white fir
and other species will be considered.
In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage, a cooperative deposit of
$0.80 per M board feet, to be used
by the Forest Service for paying the
cost of slash disposal, for the total
cut of timber under the terms of the
agreement, will be required. Deer
Creek Spur Salvage: Sealed bids will
be received up to and not later than
2:00 p.m., September 5. 1955. Area
embraces about 329 acres within Sec-
tions 21. 22. 23. 25. & 26. T. 30 S.. R.
4 E., and Section 30. T. 30 S.. R. 5 E.,
W.M. Estimated volumes are 500 M
board feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r,

350 M board feet more or less
of Shasta red fir, 170 M board feet
more or less of pine species, and 180
M board feet more or less of white
fir and other species of sawtimber.
No bid of less than $19.35 oer M board
feet for Douglas-fi- r. $10.10 per M
board feet for Shasta red fir. S37.15
per M board feet for pine species,and S7.10 per M board feet for white
fir and other species will be consid-
ered. In additionUo the prices bid for
stumpage. a cooperative deposit of
$1.35 per M board feet, to be used
by the Forest Service for paying the
cost of slash disposal, for the total cut
of timber under the terms of the
agreement, will be required. BybeeCreek Spur Salvage: Sealed bids will
be received up to and not later than
3:00 p.m.. September 5. 195o. Area em-
braces about 152 acres within Sec-
tions 16. 20. 21. 22, & 23. T. 30 S.. R.
4 E., W.M. Estimated volumes are 460
M board feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r.

140 M board feet more or less of
pine species, and 400 M board feet
more or less of white fir and other
species of sawtimber. No bid of less
than $18.05 per M board feet for
Douglas-fi- r, $36.05 per M board feet
for pine species, and $5.65 per M board
feet for white fir and other species
will be considered. In addition to the
prices bid for .stumpage. a coopera-
tive deposit of $1.70 per M board feet,to be used by the Forest Service for
paying the cost of slash disposal, and
a cooperative deposit of S1.05 per M
board feet, to cover the cost of tree
planting, seed sowing and timber
stand improvement work on; the area
cut over, for the total cut of timber
under the terms of the agreement,
will be required. A deposit of
$1,000.00. made payable to Forest
Service-USD- must accompany each
bid for each sale area, to be appliedon the purchase price, refunded, or
retained as liquidated damages, ac-
cording to the conditions of sale. The
right to reject any and all bids is
reserved. Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the tim-
ber, the conditions of sale, and the
submission of bids should be obtained
from the Forest Supervisor. Medford,
Oregon, or the District Ranger. Union
Creek Ranger Station. Prospect,
Oregon.

above estate has filed herein her final
report and. account and that Monday,
August 15. 1955. at 9:30 o'clock A.M.
at the court house in the city of Med-
ford in said county, has been fixed by
the above named court as the time
and place for hearing objections to
said final report and account and for
the examination and allowance
thereof.

Dated and first published this 15th
day of July, 1955.

Osie Norris. Administratrix
NEFF. FROHNMAYER & LOWRY
Attorneys for Administratrix

LTQ2R
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Oil Burner Service
SPARK & H. C. LITTLE SPECIALISTS

4th & Front Ph
KENNEDY FUEL OIL

Well Drilling
ROGUE VALLEY DRILLING CO. Im

mediate service on wells & pumps.
Work guaranteed. Terms. Beef stock
accepted. Ph. 885 Shafer
Lane off Kings Hwy.

CRATER WELL DRILLING No well
too deep Immediate service All
work guaranteed FHA terms ar-r- a

nged. Phone 1111 W. 10th
A E GOFF & BROS Well Drillers

Can perforate vour casing in well
with gun Best for less 1311
N Riverside Mtdloid Ph.
or

GOFF BROTHERS Well Drillers; ex-

perienced & reliable S&H Green
Stamps. Olfice Siskiyou Hdwe 225
W Main. Med t orn Phone
or evenings or

DEISTER'S WELL DRILLING CO. For
your water well problems Reliable
& experienced Up to the minute

eouipmerit 139 Vancouver Ph
SHULTS BROS well drilling & pump

service We strive to please every
customei Ph Eves

Granite 8c Top Soil
TOP SOIL S2 yd. Creek run. $150

yd. Small reject. $2 yd. Drag line
for rent. A. L. Nash. Ph.

TOP SOIL, fill dirt, granite & creek
run gravely. Tractor and Cat dozer
& loader for hire. Austin L. King,
Trucking. Phone or

BEAR CREEK sar.dy loam, creek run
gravel pit run and crushed granite
Jim Nunes. Phone

LULL'S GRANITE
Crushed Loaded Delivered

Ph NO Central Point
CRUSHED ROCK. SAND & GRAVEL

M C LININGER & SONS
Phone or

Services & Repairs
Armstrong's Garage Phone

Specialized Service in wheel align-men- t.

balance, brakes & tuneups.
HOUSECLEANING Walls. Ceilings,

Woodwork. Floors. Windows. Rugs
& Furniture. Ph.
RANDY'S CLEANING SERVICE

Professional Housecleaning Specialists
SAW SERVICE

Frost's Saw Shop moved to
1736 No. Riverside

FRANCES D ALLAIRE FURRIER
Complete Fur Service

Restyling, clean glazed and storage
Ph. 1060 Crater Lake Ave.

KIRBY COMPANY
Service and Repairs

1028 Murray Ave Phone

Refrigeration Service
MODERN

PLUMBING & SHEET METAL CO.
Air Conditioning Refrigeration
613 E. Jackson Ph.

Generators Starters
Generator-Start- er repairs St exchange

Armature winding. Cliff's Auto
Electric 1311 N Riverside

Asphalt & Cement Paving
ASPHALT PAVING D r i v e w a y s,

motels, parking areas mill yards,
roads and industrial floors Free esti-
mates. Work guaranteed. Rogue
River Paving Co Ph Medford

Beads Restrung
PEARLS & BEADS RESTRUNG

JEWELRY REPAIRING
SANTO'S AGATE SHOP 411 E Main

Pests and Termite Control
TERMITES

Call Paramount Pest Control
Inspect before buying. Ph.

LOYD Termite Control Protect vour
home from termites Free inspection
Ph Ash Foundation Work.

J

DEVILISH

r iMiism

CONVENIENT TERMS

CRAIN & MOHR
YOUR HOME TOWN HARDWARE

225 East Sixth
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Only 20 Days

Floor Sanding
Floor Sanding & Finishing

Free Estimates
Geo. Dennev Phone

Transportation
ATHEL HUPP DUDLEY TRUCK

TRANSPORTATION
P. O. Box 242 Medford. Oregon.
1CC-1- C 71652 Rapid transportation
between Southern Oregon and Points
and Places in Calif on all building
materials heavy machinery and
livestnck Ph Medford Ore..

Painting
PAINTING, brush or sprav. All work

guaranteed. Call A. Q. Murphy

jSPRAY painting roofs houses, general
- painting Free estimates Sullivan

Bros 219 S Ivv Phone

e Loans
MONEY AVAILABLE to reduce pay-

ments, pay bills, take a vacation,
or for a.ny purpose. WE OFFER
YOU every plan plus friendly,
prompt, courteous service.

OREGON FINANCE CO.
Gene Thomas. Manager

Your Home-Owne- d Co. since 1928
V S. Central. Craterian Theatre
Bids.

Phone

Use Mail Tribune Want Ads
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Drop in and
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for "the taste

mm Ford
' No Need to

FREE BIKE

EACH WEEK!
E L

c a !!

GOOD DRINK'
1st Week's Winner

Clifford Shellabarger

Age 7, 50ZVi N. Riverside

Adults - Register chil-

dren between 5 and 12
for next drawing

August 10

Drinks Between 7 to 8
Free Entertainment By The Melody Wranglers
see us today, during our GRAND OPENING, and anytime ....
treat oi your life! Come in between the hours of 7 and 8, and

FQRTUW
So. Central al
So. Riverside

MEDFORD

Central Market, Crater

IT'S FUN TO

BUY GAS AT

Free Ford tickets from

Lake Motors.

have a delicious, truly different ORANGE JULIUS ... ON US! You'll find
ORANGE JULIUS is really a thirst-quenchin- g, taste-tantalizi- treat . . .

pure, ORANGE JULIUS is healthful and good for children, too . . .
The whole family will love ORANGE JULIUS. ORANGE JULIUS is available in
70 and 20 cent sizes at our drive-in- , and in take-hom- e cartons of pints,

' quarts, and half-gallo- . . . come in and see us, and bring your friends!

Take Home Orange Julius in Handy Pints, Quarts, and 12 Gallons

Orange Julius, 4th and Riverside
Fortune, McLains Drug,

9


