
Monday, January 3, 1961EIGHTMEDTORD (OREGON) MAIL TRIBUNE Fall in Mud Puddle Drowns Youth, 15TheyH Bo It Every "fide By Jimmy Hatlo
O Powers the boy had a past his-

tory of fainting and apparently
fainted . while riding his bike
and fell into the puddle and
drowned. "

Roseburg (U.R A

Umpqua, Ore., boy died
Friday afternoon when he ap-

parently fell from his bicycle on
an old logging road near IJmp-qu-a

and drowned in a mud pud-
dle.

Russell Walker Jennie set out
yesterday on a bicyole ride.
When he didn't return, his fath-
er went looking for the boy and
found his body on the road about
7:30 p.m.

According to Coroner L. L.

TIMELY
Kansas City, Mo. (U.R) A

boy was born to Mr. and Mrs.
Loyd A. Yearout just five hours
and 46 minutes before the end
of 1954. .

Dead line for Sunday Classified Is
at noon Saturday.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE TO CRBD1TORS
Kotice is hereby given that I have

been appointed by the Circuit Court
of the State of Oregon for Jackson
County. Executor of the Will of Ida
J. Clarke, deceased, and have quali-
fied. AJ1 persons having claims against
said estate are hereby notified to pre-
sent them, with proper vouchers duly
verified, to me at the office of'Skyr-ma- n.

Ouellette & Heisel. Room 418
Medical Center Building, in Medford,
Oregon, within six months from the
date of this notice.

Dated and first published December
13. 1954.

Harry W. Barnebura
Executor

Skyrman. Ouellette & Heisel
Attorneys for Estate

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Notice is hereby given that I have

been appointed by the Circuit Court
of the-Stat- e of Oregon for Jackson
County. Administrator of the Estate

Oof Frank S. Janosky. deceased, and
have Qualified. All persons having
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claims against said estate are hereby
nouziea io pre&eni mem. ww
vouchers duly verified, to me lt my
office. Room 418 Medical Center
Building, in Medford. Oregon, within
six months frffro the date of this

Dated and first published December
13, 1954.

O Harry C. Skyrman
g Administrator

Skyrman, Ouellette & Heisel
Attorneys for Estate
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8008 Federal Workers

Ousted as Bad Risks
Washington (U.R) The Civil

Service Commission reported to-

day that 8008 federal employees
have been fired as security risks
or resigned while their status
was clouded by unfavorable se-

curity information.
The files of 2096 of this num-

ber "contained information indi
eating, in varying degrees, sub-
versive activities, subversive as-

sociations, or membership in
subversive organizations," the
commission said.

The other 5912 include drunks,
sexual perverts, those with crim-
inal repprds, character defects,
and persons found to be insane
or undesirable for other medi-
cal reasons.

Under President Eisenhower's
security order of May 28, 1953,
all of these are characterized
as security risks along with
those accused of subversive ac-

tivities or associations.

The emigration of Scottish
men and women to Canada, the
United States and Australia from
the Hebrides seems to be on the
ebb today. The Hebridean is be-

ginning to realize" that life at
home is not so hard as it might
be in newer lands.

There are about 4,000,000
stamp collectors in the U.S.

Leave at 7 a. m., 11:05 a. m.
or 5:15 p.m. Convenient
connections to "All the East".

r

Br M.IZABCTH HURL0CK, PH.D.

of circulation and may have a
hard time getting back. She
knows that a schoolboy is not
serious about marriage, and that
he will feel no obligation to pro-
pose to her, even if he has mo-

nopolized her time for several
years.

(Copyright, 1955,
General Features Corp.)

Bus Smashes Auto;

Two Airmen Killed
Prewitt, N. M. (U.R) Two

airmen returning from holiday
leaves were killed before dawn
near here today when a huge
Greyhound bus skidded on icy
U. S. 66 and smashed into their
car.

State police withheld names
of the victims pending notifica-
tion of their families by the
Air Force. State Patrolman Dick
McCool said the car bore Iowa
plates.

Ten of the passengers in the
bus, loaded with college stu-den- ts

and servicemen returning
from vacations, suffered injuries
in the crash, but only two, both
women, were seriously injured.

Four ambulances from nearby
Grants and Gallup took the in-

jured into Gallup for treatment.
McCool said the eastbound bus
smashed broadside Into the car
which was headed west toward
Gallup. ::.

Dennis Crosby, Son

Of Crooner, Held

On Drunk Charge
Hollywood U.R Dennis

Crosby, 20, one of the twin sons
of crooner Bing Crosby was
ordered to appear in court on a
plain drunk charge today after
being arrested in a wild auto
chase with police.

Young Crosby was booked
early yesterday after a car in
which he was riding with a
friend was halted for speeding
55 miles an hour, swerving at
pedestrians, running a red light
and weaving recklessly.
To Enter Army

The crooner's son, who is to
enter the Army in a few days,
was released from the Los An-

geles Wilshire division station
after two hours behind bars
when the Crosby family chau-fe- r,

Louis Serpe, arrived with
$10 bail. The youth had $12.36
on him when arrested, officers
said.

Police said they pursued the
car, driven by Howard Norman
Gilmore, a Stanford university
student from Atherton, Calif.,
for more than a mile through
city, streets at speeds up to 55
mile's an hour before overtak-
ing it.

Gilmore, who was charged
with drunk driving and freed
on $263 bail, was ordered to ap-
pear in court tomorrow. ;

Pedestrians Friends
Police said the two pedestrians

at which Gilmore allegedly
swerved the car turned out to
be friends of Crosby and Gil-
more.

The pair, Paul B. Mardesich,
22, Saratoga, Calif., and Joseph
Eldon Gresham, 23, Sunnyvale,
Calif., were jailed . as plain
drunks and bailed out for $20.
They will appear with Gilmore
in court tomorrow.

"I knew those guys I swerved
at," Gilmore told police. "I don't
think I came close."

Crosby, a former student at
Loyola university and Washing-
ton State college, listed his oc-

cupation at a rancher. Police
described him' as "very polite,
very cooperative," and said he
slept most of the time until bail
arrived.

ginning at 4:00 p.m.. Pacific Standard
TiPael Eebn"ry 8. 1955; area embracesabout 21 acres in Sec. 33. T. 31 S.. R.
J E.. W.M.; estimated volumes are 650M board feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r,an unestimated volume of pineand 20 M board feet more or less of
2t e. specles- - No bid of less than
f.la45 per M board feet for Douglas-fu- ".

.05 per M board feet for pine,and $5.50 per M board feet for other
species will be considered. In addi-tion to the pices bid for stumpaee. a
cooperative deposit of $1.05 per Mwarn ieet, to cover the cost of tree
planting, seed sowing, and timberstand improvement work on the areacut over, and a deposit of $1.00 perM board feet, to be used by the ForestService for navinff th rnst nf inch
.disposal, for the total cut of timberunaer tne terms of the agreement,will be required. As qualification fororal bidding, aU bidders must submita sealed bid accompanied bv the re-
quired deposit to the Forest Super-visor prior to the time of oral auctionon the above-state- d date. $1,000.00must accompany each bid. to be ap-
plied on the purchase price, refunded,or retained in part as liquidated dam-
ages, according to the conditions ofsale. Sealed bids will be posted at!the
beginning of the auction for the 'in-
formation of all bidders. If an oralbid is declared to be high at the clos-
ing of the auction,- - the bidder must im-
mediately confirm the oral bid bysubmitting it in writing on a ForestService bid form. The right to rejectany and all bids is reserved. Forestservice bid forms fo use in submit-
ting sealed bids and full information
concerning the timber, the conditions

sa, ,and submission of bidsshould be obtained from the Forest
Supervisor, Post Office Building. Med-
ford. Oregon, or the District Ranger,Union Creek Ranger Station. Prospect,Oregon, before bids are submitted.

NOTICE OF HEARING OF FIRST
AND FINAL ACCOUNT

NOTICE IS HEREY GIVEN toi allconcerned that Ernest Ben Sweetman.Administrator of the Estate of Fred-rick Clarke also known as FrederickClarke. Deceased, has filed in the Cir-
cuit Court of the State of Oregon for
theCounty of Jackson. In Probate,his First and Final Account as Admin-istrator of said estate and said Courthas set the 1st day of February. 1955,at the hour of 10:Q0 o'clock ofAJg.j
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As We Live
Going Steady Doesn't
Constitute Engagement

Going steady during high
school days does not mean that
the boy and girl are engaged or
that either has an obigation to

marry the other. A woman
writes:

(Q) "I was interested in
your recent column about the
high school girl who has been
going steady with a boy since
Iheir sophomore year.. She
wanted him lo propose to her
so they could be engaged
before she finished her school-

ing. You advised her not to be
the one to bring up the sub-

ject of marriage. So far, I
agree. But I do not agree with
your implication that this boy
has no obligation io ask this
girl to marry him. After all
he has monopolised her time
for so long that she has . a
right to expect him to. Since
they are finishing school, why
shouldn't he ask her to marry
him as soon at he is settled
in business? A girl likes t
have the security that being
engaged brings.".

(A) When a girl wants to
marry, of course it gives her a
sense of security to be engaged.
But going steady today carries
none of the obligations that
"keenine company" used to.

Boys ana
girls today go
steady because
it is conven
ient for both
of them. They
can count on
each other for
social affairs
at school, and
going steady is

T" Tiki Viuiir certainly not
Dr. Hurlock s o expensive

for the boy as dating a number
of girls is. Many of his dates
with his "steady" consist , of sit-

ting around and talking, an in
expensive form of entertain-
ment.

If every boy felt obligated to
marry the girls he went steady
with at one time or another dur-

ing his school days, he would
be in a bad way. Most of these
girls, he discovers, are not to
his liking and he drops them.
Only after years of dating ex-

perience does he find the one
he wants to marry.

A girl, when she starts to go
steady, knows that she is run-

ning the risk of being taken out

said day In the Circuit Courtroom at
the Courthouse in Medford. Oregon,as the time and place of hearing said
First and Final Account and objec-tions thereto. Ernest Ben Sweetman,Administrator. William F. Johnson,
Attorney at Law. 220 SJI. "H" Street,Grants Pass. Oregon.

LEGAL NOTICES

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER
FOR SALE

Oral auction bids will be received by
the Forest Supervisor or his author-
ized representative in Room 210. Post
Office Building, Medford. Oregon, be-
ginning at 9:00 a.m.. Pacific Standard
Time. February 7, 1955. for all live
timber marked or designated for cut-
ting, and all merchantable dead tim-
ber located in eight separate and dis-
tinct sale areas within the Rogue Riv-
er National Forest, Oregon, as particu-
larized below: Diamond Lake Highway
Area No. l: Oral auction bids will be
received beginning at 9:00 a.m.. Paci-
fic Standard Time, February 7. 1955;
area embraces about 43 acres in Sec.
18. T. 30 S.. R. 4 E., W.M.: estimated
volumes are 1.350 M board feet more
or less of Douglas-fi- r, 50 M board feet
more or less of pine, and 500 M board
feet more or less f other species. No
bid of less than $16.65 per M board
feet for Douglas-fi- r. $35.95 per M
board feet for pine, and S5.35 per M
board feet for other species will be
considered. In addition to the prices
bid for stumpage. a cooperative de-

posit of S0.75 per M board feet, to
cover the cost of tree planting, seed
sowing, and timber stand improve-
ment work on the area., cut over, and
a deposit of $0.65 per M board feet,to be used by the Forest Service for
payir.g the cost of slash disposal, for
the total cut of timber under the
terms of the agreement, will be re-
quired. Diamond Lake Highway Area
No. 2: Oral" auction bids will be re-
ceived beginning at 11:00 ajn Pacific
Standard Time. February 7. 1955;
area embraces about 43 acres in Sec. 7,
T. 30 S.. R. 4 E.. W.M.; estimated vol-
umes are 1,350 M board feet more or
less of Douglas-fi- r, 50 M board feet
more or less of pine, and 500 M board
feet more or less of other species. No
bid of less than S16.65 per M board
feet for Douglas-fi- r, $35.95 per M
board feet for pine, and S5.35 per M
board feet for other species will be
considered. In addition to the prices
bid for stumpage, a cooperative de-

posit of $0.75 per B board feet, to
cover the cost of tree planting, seed
sowing, and timber stand improve-
ment work on the area cut over, and
a deposit of $0.65 per M board feet, to
be used by the Forest Service for
paying the cost of slash disposal, for
the total cut of timber under the
terms of the agreement, will be re-
quired. Diamond Lake Highway Area
No. 3: Oral auction bids will be re-
ceived beginning at 2:00 p.m.. Pacific
Standard Time. February 7. 1955; area
embraces about 27 acres in Sec. 7, T.
30 S., R. 4 E., W.M.; estimated vol-
umes are 850 M board feet more ' or
less of Douglas-fi- r. 50 M board feet
more or less of pine, and 300 M board
feet more or less of other species. No
bid of less than $16.55 5er M board
feet for Douglas-fi- r. $35.85 per M board
feet for pine, and S5.25 per M board
feet for other species will be consid-
ered. In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage. a cooperative deposit of
$0.75 per M board feet, to cover the
cost of tree planting, seed sowing, and
timber stand improvement work on
the area cut over, and a deposit of
$0.70 per M board feet, to be used bythe Forest Service for paying the cost
of slash disposal, for the total cut of
timber under the terms of the agree-
ment, will be required. Diamond Lake
Highway Area No. 4: Oral auction bids
will be received beginning at 4:00
p.m.. Pacific Standard Time. Febru-
ary 7. 1955: area embraces about 33
acres in Sec. 7. T. 30 S.. R. 4 E.. WJW.;
estimated volumes are 1.000 M board
feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r, 50
M board feet more or less of pine,
and 400 M board feet more or less of
other species. No bid of less than
$16.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fi- r,

$35.85 per M board feet for pine,
and $5.20 per M board feet for other
species will be considered. In addition
to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-

operative deposit of $0.75 per M board
feet, to cover the cost of tree plant-
ing, seed sowing, and timber stand im-
provement work on the area cut over,
and a deposit of $0.70 per M board
feet, to be used by the Forest Service
for paying the cost of clash disposal,
for the total cut of timber under the
terms of the- - agreement, will be re-
quired. Diamond Lake Highway Area
No. 5: Oral auction bids will be receiv-
ed beginning at 9:00 a.m.. Pacific
Standard Time, February 8. 1955: area
embraces about 15 acres in Sec. 13, T.
30 S., R. 3 E.. & Sec. 18. T. 30 S., R.
4 E., W.M.; estimated volumes are 450
M board feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r.

20 M board feet more or less of
pine, and 170 M board feet more or
less of other species. No bid of less
than $18.75 per M board feet for
Douglas-fi- r, $355 per M board feet
for pine, and $5.05 per M board feet
for other species will be considered
In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage, a cooperative deposit of
$0.75 per M board feet, to cover the
cost of tree planting, seed sowing, and
timber stand improvement work on
the area cut over, and a deposit of
$0.70 per M board feet, to be used by
the Forest Service for paying the
cost of slash disposal, for the total cut
of timber under the terms of the
agreement, will be required. Diamond
Lake Highway Area No. 6: Oral auc-
tion bids will be received beginning at
11:00 a.m.. Pacific Standard Time,
February 8. 1955; area embraces about
19 acres in Sec. 13. T. 30 S.. R. 3 E..
W.M.: estimated volumes are 600 M
board feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r.

20 M board feet more or less of
pine, and 220 M board feet more or
less of other species. No bid of less
than $18.70 per M board feet for
Douglas-fi- r. $35.60 per M board feet
for pine, and $4.95 per M board ieet
for other species will be considered.
In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage, a cooperative deposit of
S0.75 per M board feet, to cover the
cost of tree planting, seed sowing, and
timber stand improvement work on
the area cut over, and a deposit of
$0.60 per M board feet, to be used by
the Forest Service for paying the cost
of slash disposal, for the total cut of
timber under the terms of the agree-
ment, will be required. Mill Creek
Road Area No. 1: Oral auction bids
will be received beginning at 2:00
p.m.. Pacific Standard Time. February
8, 1955; area embraces about 26 acres
in Sec. 28, T. 31 S.. R. 3 E.. W.M.:
estimated volumes are 800 M board
feet more or less of Douglas-fi- r. an
unestimated volume of pine, and 30
M board feet more or less of other
species. No bid or less than $12.40 per
M board feet for Douglas-fi- r. $41.00
per M board feet for pine. .nd $5.45
per M board feet for other species will
be considered. In addition to the
prices bid for stumpage. a coopera-
tive deposit of $1.00 per M board feet,
to cover the cost of "tree planting,
seed sowing, and timber stand im-
provement work on the area cut over,
and a deposit of $0.95 per M board
feet, to be used by the Forest Service
for paying the cost of slash disposal,
for the total cut of timber under the
terms of the agreement, will be re-

quired. Mill Creek Road Area No. 2:
Oral auction bids will be received be--
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NOTICE OF0 FILING TRADE-MAR- K

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on
Decembe? 7. 1954. DICK LEWIS, with
his principal office at 600 East Fourth
Street. Olympia, Washington, did file
and record in the Trade-Mar- k Records
of the State of Oregon the Trade-Mar- k,

"Auto Biography," the same consti-
tuting an envelope setting forth a
history of used cars sold by purchas-
ing franchise car dealers, and being
attached bv adhesive means to each
used car placed for sale by said
dealers.

The said Dick Lewis does hereby
claim ownership of said trade-mar- k,

and) public notice of said ownership
is hereby given.

DICK LEWIS.
Owner of the Trade-Mar- k.

"Auto Biography"o

NOTICE
Notice is hereby given that the

Jackson County Court will receive
Qsealed bids for the purchase, of the

following described real property lo-

cated at Ashland, Oregon, on West side
of Clay Street and more particularly
described as follows, to-w- it:

Beginning at a point on the North
boundary line of the Southwest
Quarter of the Northwest Quarter
of Section 14 in Township 39
South. Range 1 East of the Wi-
llamette Meridian. 210 feet East of
the Northwest corner of the South-
west Quarter of the Northwest
Quarter of said Section 14: thence
East on said boundary line 420
feet to Street line: thence South
99 feet to corner: thence West
420 feet to corner: thence North
99 feet to place of beginning, con- -.

,

tabling 1 acre more or less, and
being within the Talent Irriga-
tion District.
Bids will be received at the office

of the County Court in the Court
House at Medford. Oregon, until 10:00
o'clock A.M.. of th 28th day of Janu-
ary, 1955, and then publicly opened
and read.

All bids must be accompanied by
twenty per cent of amount bid and
envelope plainly marked that it con-
tains bid on the Clay Street property
in Ashland.

The Court reserves the right to re-

ject any or all bids.
0 Dated at Medford. Oregon, this 28th
day of December, 1954.

Rodney Keating. County Judge
R. E. Lvtle. Commissioner

g L. G. Morthland. Commissioner

1 "
TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY
LOST Black Cocker female from 31

Elm. Ph. or
WANTED Used typewriter in good

condition. Ph. after S p.m.
COCKER Spaniel dog to give away.

Phone .

WANTED To rent. 2 or 3 bedroom
house in Central Point school dis-
trict. Write Rte. 2 Box 32. Central
Point.

WANTED To buy a disc for Fordson
tractor. Must be in good condition.
Ph.

YOUNG man wants work. Some IBM
experience. Ph.

FOR RENT 2 Rm. furn. upstairs apt.,
private entrance. $20. Water paid. '

Inq.r220 Haven st.
NOTICE Tree service of all kinds.

Ph. Withrow.
FOR SALE or TRADE '53 Ford

wagon. Call after 5:30.

FOR RENT Downstairs apt laundry,
refrig.. adults. P.

FOR SALE Good dry Oak. $17 cord.
Ph. after 5 p.m.

FOBi RENT 3 Rm. furn.. apt. $27.50.
203 Laurel st.

FOR SALE Vx hp Jacuzzi pump, -- 951
International --ton pickup, elec.
plating equip. 895 Casino Rd. Ph.

FOR SALE or TRADE for livestock. 1
palomino mare, perfectly gentle for
women or children. 1 palomino filly
colt. 9 months old. 1 Roy Rogers kid
saddle, bridal and Martingale, brand
new. Also 1 heavy springer jerseycow. fresh in few days. Alex Peter-poste- n.

Rt. 1. Box 323. Talent. Col-v- er

rd. Ph.
1940 PLYMOUTH $33. Light

trailer $20. Ph.
PROVIDENCE Guild meeting to be

held at Sacred Heart Hospital. Wed,
Jan. 5th. 8 p.m.

FOR RENT 3 Rm. with bath, gas
stove. Ph.

FOR RENT Small furn. house, mod-
ern. Will sleep 3 or 4 nicely. 99
Hwy.. across from Lithia Drive-i- n
theater.

LILLIES HEALTH & SLENDERIZING
SALON will be closed from Dec.
20 to Jan. 9. Happy New Year to all.

Television and Radio Repair
Trowbridge & Flynn Electric Co.
2 t4 W. Main Ph.

MEDFORD FURNITURE
r 2ND HAND STORE

TTSED Furniture and Appliances
2502 W. Main Phone

FOR SALE Bundles of old news-
papers. 20c each. Medford Mail
Tribune Office.
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LOSE UGLY FAT TODAY

Amazing New Safe Discovery Makes

NOBODY!

There isn't any such thing.

There are, however, lots of people

who enjoy a glass of milk before bedtime.

More important, they enjoy the sound

sleep that comes quickly, stays all night

through. And the next day they feel

fit as a fiddle, right as rain.

Why don't you try Nature's own nightcap

...a glass of milk at bedtime.

Sound advice for sounder sleep.

w

AW
Activity Guide JW

According to the Stars.
To develop message for Tuesday,
read words corresponding to numbers

APR. 201

GM5-27-3M- 6I

iV52-70-81-8- 4 ot your Zodiac
yf TAUtUS I Don't 31 Too

APR. 21 2 Don't 32 Favor

l"MA.Y 21 3 Accept ' 33 In
4 Let 34
5 Yoo 35
6 New 36

GEMM 7 Display 37 For
8 You'll 38 Best

VJpJ JUN22 9 Relations 39 Of
V0 With 40

Trusting
Accepting
Activities

Attention
41 Someone
42 The

FOR MEN AND WOMEN
Everyone is talking about the new reducing sensation

HUNGER TABLETS.
Science now helps you take off your fat while you eat

the foods you choose. HUNGER TABLETS make you lose ugly
fat, pounds and inches of it, without dieting or hunger . . .
and it will not affect the heart.

Think of it! With HUNGER TABLETS you no longer count
calories, you forget all about diets. Fat goes fast from
all over the body! All yeu do is swallow two HUNGER
TABLETS before each meal followed by a glass of water
and eat the foods you like.

And you don't have to worry about HUNGER TABLETS- -It
is absolutely safe It is a food adjunct not a drug.

Nothing like it ever before. You get no "Reducing Plan"
or "Reducing Menus" with HUNGER TABLETS. None are
needed.

With HUNGER TABLETS you eat what you like-gr- ew

slim, more youthful looking, more active and enjoy better
health. -

For easy reducing get HUNGER TABLETS today. A six
teen day supply for less than 19c per 'day. HUNGER TAB-
LETS are sold at all leading drug stores.

MONEY BACK GUARANTEE

McLAIN DRUG CENTRE
8 North Central Ave. - Medford, Ore.

T1 Do
r 12 Go

13 Leadership 43 Wander
CANCEK

J5NE23
JULY 23

14 Changed "oyo 15 Look 45 For
16 Don't 46-

17 Frierids 47 Which
18 Too 48 Show

i
19 Stay 49 Thing
20 Quickly 50 Promise
21 Be 51 Moke

JULY 24t 22 Your 52

Irritating

Condition
53 Skip. AUG. 23 23 Slow

H
24 Situation 54 Try
25 Out 55 Now

56

AQUABUS
JAN. 21 .

FEB.' t9 jSlP?
m

9 MJ
PISCES

FEB. 20
t

MAR. 21

a Now
79 Your
80 Carrying
81 Hurt
82 Interests
83 Or
84 Prestige
85 Making
86 Conserve
87 Responsibility
88 Popularity
89 Money
90 Energy

(J) Initial

People--

57 Collecfton
58 To
59 Com
60 Be

26 Or
27 Out
28 Aspects

"29 Copocity
30 The

(S) Good
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