

27-BUSINESS DIRECTORY

Washing Machines
URED Washers, reconditioned and guaranteed. Larson-May Co. 406 E. Main. 2-3302.
EXPERT Bendix Service and Repair, Larson-May Co. 406 E. Main. 2-3302.
PARTS and Service on all makes washing machines. Larson-May Co. 406 E. Main. 2-3302.

Building
PHOENIX PUMICE PRODUCTS, C. Street. Ph. 2-7045. Bldg. blocks, brick, pier block, all types. Cement work. Free estimate. Everett Lowery, 3748 Hillinger road.

Piano Tuning
PIANO TUNING—Back from tour duty in navy. Thanks to my customers for past business. Call 3-3059. Medford, Marvin Lemaster.

Re-weaving
RE-WEAVING—Tears, burns, moth damage, etc. BEACON WEAVERS, 906 NE 8th. Grants Pass. Ph. 3453.

Cabinet Work
CITY CABINET SHOP, FRANK YASHIN, 924 So. Central. Phone 2-9310.

Tree Service
CHAMBERLIN TREE SERVICE, (The Best for Less), Topping, trimming, removing. Transplanting. Terms to suit you. Licensed and insured. Free estimate. Phone 3-1145, or 525 Franquette.

LINEBAUGH BROTHERS TREE SERVICE, Complete tree service and tree surgery. Licensed and insured contractors. We guarantee our work or no charge. We also give S&H Green Stamps. For free Est. Phone 2-7754.

Electric Motors
Gage Electric Motor Service, Delco and Smithway Motors. Motor Rewinding & Repairing. 112 N. Front. Ph. 2-2626.

Cement Work
RELIABLE CEMENT WORK, By Ray Chamberlin. Free estimates. Licensed contractors. Ph. 3-3085.

Painting
EXP. painting and decorating. Free estimate. J. B. Doss. Ph. 2-5127. Med. or 2-5472. Ashland.

Tractor Work
Flowing, harrowing, mowing gardens or what have you. Prompt, efficient service. Ira Bollinger. Ph. 2-5830.

Tailoring
CHRIS THE TAILOR, Tailored-to-Measure Clothes. Repairs—Remodeling—Alterations. 128 E. Main. 2nd Floor. 2-4473.

Plumbing
For new and repair work call Patterson Ph. Co. 827 Jackson. Ph. 2-3369.

BROWNIES
PLUMBING & HEATING INC., PROMPT, EFFICIENT SERVICE. 518 Crater Lake Ave. Ph. 2-4801.

Granite and Top Soil
TOP SOIL AND GRANITE 2 yd. truck run and fill dirt. \$1.50 yd. Phone 2-4317. A. L. Nash.

TOP SOIL, Granite, Creek Run, fill dirt. Dump Trucks for hire. Also loader. Austin King. 2-7808-2-4167.

Crushed granite, crushed rock, sand and gravel. M. C. LININGER & SONS Ph. 2-5336 or 2-5897.

CREAK RUN GRAVEL, \$1.50 a yard delivered in Medford. Call 2-7001.

Miscellaneous
LAWN mowers, saws, mach. ground. Pick-up & delivery. Hwy. 99, 1 mi. So. of Talent. Ph. 2-8319.

WE MAKE fabric covered belts, buttons, buckles, buttonholes. Large variety of styles and sizes. Rapid service. Ph. 3-3135.

PARK'S Electric Shaver Service, Repairs and sales. All standards makes 10 days free trial. 114 E. 11th St. Ph. 3-3135.

GUARANTEED repairs and parts on all makes of sewing machines. Estimate furnished free in advance. Sewing Machine Center, 143 W. Main. Ph. 2-2388.

Septic Tanks
SANITATION SERVICE, 500 gal. round conc. septic tanks 668. Tanks pumped. Free estimates. Guaranteed Work. To meet all State & F.H.A. codes. PHONE 3-2491.

CASPER'S, Cleaning, repairing, install tanks and drains. Guar. 24-hour prompt service. Free inspection. Low set prices. Free local call. Hwy. 99, 1 mi. S. of Talent. Ph. 2-8319.

MITCHELL SEPTIC TANKS & CESS-POOL SERVICE—Tanks cleaned and repaired. Drains and sewer laid, new tanks installed. All work guaranteed. Phone 3-1116.

Beads Restrung
PEARLS & BEADS RESTRUNG, JEWELRY REPAIRING. SANTOS AGATE SHOP 411 E. Main. Use Mail Tribune Want Ads.

LEAVING TOWN
Sacrifice Sale

Entire contents of Apartment—Nothing over 3 years old.—4-Pc. Sect. Hollywood Beds; Mr. and Mrs. Chests & Mirrors, 1 yr. old. Rugs; Radio, combination; Ivory and Chrome Dinette Set; 8-cu. ft. Refrigerator; Westinghouse Elec. 3 burner Apt. Stove. Come and See 512 SOUTH HOLLY, APT. 3

Lilenquist Motor Co. Has A Truck For Any Type of Job, DIESEL or GASOLINE

1950 TD6 International Diesel Cat, like new, Angle Dozer Blade \$4,500.00

Coltrac, Model E, Crawler Type Tractor, with winch. Top shape

3/8 Yard Bay City Shovel, ready to go to work

SEE Lilenquist MOTORS CO.

1016 North Riverside Phone 2-5207

27-BUSINESS DIRECTORY

Well Drilling
SHULTS BROS. WELL DRILLERS—Sets direct over streams saving up to half in many cases. Ph. 2-9227.

DEISTER & CECH WELL DRILLERS, For your water well problems. Reliable and experienced drillers. Up-to-the-minute equipment. Phone 2-9308—139 Vancouver Ave.

WELL DRILLING BY GOFF BROS.—For fast, efficient and guaranteed work, see us before you drill. F.R.A. terms on wells and pumps. Office: Stamper & Goff Bros. Hdw. 225 W. Main. Ph. 2-2639, evenings 2-7026 or 2-5039. Evenings 3-3744.

ROGUE VALLEY DRILLING CO., A complete well & pump service by War II Vets. Experienced, reliable and guaranteed work with FHA terms. Phone 2-7372. 885 Shafer Lane (just off Kings Hwy.)

CRATER WELL DRILLING—No well too deep. Immediate service. All work guaranteed. FHA terms arranged. Phone 2-2098. 1111 W. 10th.

TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY
BAMBOO LAWN RAKES, Really good, 69c. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

FOR SALE—Bell and Howell "Film-sound 179," \$185. Hawaiian electric guitar with amplifier, \$100. CSAP 16 mm camera, \$40, never been used. 215 Washington.

GRAIN BAGS—all sizes. Used 15c and 23c. New bags 27c. CSAP 16 mm camera, \$40, never been used. 215 Washington.

WILL SACRIFICE for quick sale—Ferguson 30 tractor, like new; front end loader, 12-speed transmission, duals, 42 Ford dump truck. Phone 2-4667. 91 Ross lane.

See our Display Ad on Page 5 Today
WANT second-hand tire size 600x16 and bicycle tire. Phone 2-8324.

ROTECHONE, Bulk—Cheap—Safe—Sure. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

SMALL 16" boy's bike \$20, Two boy's bikes, 26", \$15 each. Phone 2-9153.

PIE cherries 10c, you pick. Home Sunday, after 5 p.m. week days. 638 S. Holly.

CHUCKS—All sizes—1 gallon to 10 gallons, with or without lids. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

3000 ft. of 1 1/2 inch cedar No. 4 pine, grade 2-9521.

NEW 15,000-lb. 2-speed Eaton rear end, including wheels and tires. Will sell with or without tires and tubes. 16 Middleton. Phone 3-3127.

FOR SALE—52 GMC 1 1/2 ton pickup. Ph. Camp White 6522.

GRAIN GRINDING—Will grind promptly to suit you. Parking lot for your grain. 1111 W. 10th. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

TRADE band saw for field glasses or binoculars. Tribune Box 6316.

SLEEPING room for rent, close in. Ph. 2-2172.

FOR SALE—7 1/2 h.p. Mercury motor, 12-ft. boat and trailer. Camp White 6522.

GRAIN HAULING—Let us haul to town or to your granary. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

\$3000 CONTRACT on city property. Payable at \$45 per month. Will sell for \$2500. Write Tribune Box 6020.

DAKOTA PICNIC ASSOCIATION, Tou Velle Park, July 27, 10 a.m.

WANTED—GRAIN—Wheat, Oats, Corn. Highest prices for quality grain. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

1948 BUICK Roadmaster Sedanette, Dynaflow drive, heater, excellent condition. Only \$1295. ROOTS MOTOR CO.

101 West Jackson, 101 West Jackson. Medford, Oregon.

Grain bag prices are lowest in years. At MORTON MILLING CO. If we buy your grain we will loan you bags free.

LAWN CARE—Get rid of weeds—use Weedicide. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

SAVUM—WAMPUM, S & H Green Stamps. 20% discount all GARDEN HOSE until July 19th at F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

Good No. 4 sheathing and dimension \$35 per M. No. 3 sheathing \$35 per M. E. grade siding \$70 per M. WESTSIDE LUMBER CO.

824 Summit Ave. just off McAndrews Rd. Phone 2-3501.

Pep up lawns with Foli-Morcor or Ortho Gro. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

PLASTERBOARD PER SHEET \$1.40, PLYWOOD REJECTS VERY GOOD 4x8x1/4 PER SHEET \$3.20.

BUILDERS SERVICE, 2802 CRATER LAKE HWY.

Sack, Twine and Wire Bale Ties for sale at MORTON MILLING CO.

SPECIAL through July 10% discount on all Glidden paints, a new shipment of 25 used windows and frames. 100 odd window sash for plate glass sash. 52x44. Exceptionally good used doors. New 30 gal. National hot water tank \$79.50.

HAGGARD LUMBER CO., Hwy. 99, Phoenix.

BERRY HALLOCK—CRATES—We will save you money. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

WANTED—Fruit thinners. Apply at Bear Creek Orchards, S. Pacific Hwy. or Hollywood Orchard, Jacksonville Hwy.

You will BUY it if you USE our demonstration power mower 18" and 21" Johnson. Ph. 2-5550. Main & Holly.

TANK SPRAYERS—All sizes. Do a good job. \$7.65 up. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

FOR SALE—1936 Ford 1 1/2 T flat bed truck with Brownline trans. Phone 3-1423 between 6 & 7 p.m.

ORGANIC FERTILIZER—For lawns, gardens, 80 lb. bag \$4.50. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

FOR SALE—1937 Dodge 1/2 T pickup. Ph. 3-1423 between 6 & 7 p.m.

TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY

FOR SALE—Convertible 1950 Delux Chevrolet with powerglide. Call 3-1423 between 6 & 7 p.m.

HARVEST SUPPLIES—Grain Bags, Sack, Twine—Binder, Twine. Save with us. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

USED outboard motors, Outboard motor for oil, portable air, coolers to use in any room. Stamper & Goff Bros. 225 W. Main.

VECH CLEANING—Let us haul—clear—mark for you. F. E. SAMSON CO., Inc.

COLEMAN camping equipment, cast iron skillet, Stamper & Goff Bros. 225 W. Main.

Vagabond Ice Chests \$8.95 & \$11.25 PAR STORE

Phone 2-5550, Main & Holly.

FOR SALE by owner—2-bdrm. home, wonderful location, furnished or unfurnished, lovely yard. Cash and terms. Call 2-2462.

REMEMBER the BUILDERS SERVICE

BUILDERS BARGAINS, Roofing, siding, plasterboard, interior finish, insulation, hardware and paint.

BUILDERS SERVICE, 2802 Crater Lake Highway, Medford, Ore. Ph. 2-8378.

ARCHERY tackle by Bear Grizzly, polar and cub bows, HAAS BROS. SPORTING GOODS. Open until 9:00 every evening.

NOTICE—Commercial spraying. If you are bothered with aphids, phone 3-5374 or 2-5327. Withers.

OVERHEAD garage door with hardware, \$35. Ph. 2-8677.

LEGAL NOTICES

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in W 1/2 NE 1/4, Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, returned or retained as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the location of the timber, may be obtained from the District Ranger, Union Creek Ranger Station, Prospect, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Medford, Oregon.

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, U. S. Forest Service, P. O. Box 512, Medford, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time, July 30, 1952, for all live and dead timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing about 49 acres in E 1/2 Section 30, T. 32 S., R. 3 E., W.M., lying about 1 mile northwest of Prospect, Rogue River National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 369,000 board feet of Douglas-fir, 93,000 board feet of ponderosa pine and sugar pine, 10,000 board feet of incense cedar, and 13,000 board feet of white fir and other species. No bid of less than \$0.50 per M board feet for Douglas-fir, \$2.15 per M board feet for ponderosa pine and sugar pine, and \$4.75 per M board feet for white fir and incense cedar, and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.60 per M board feet to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of tree planting, tree seed sowing, timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement will be required. A deposit of \$3,000.00 must accompany each