
All persons having objections thereto fee 1060 M. feet Douglas fir, 480 M. Friday, Miy 2. 1951 MEDFORD (OREGON) MAIL TRIBUNE SEVENleet marked ronaerosa fine. i am
feet Whit Fir. 55 M. feet Incense Ce

Oregon for Jackson County, her First
and Final Account and Report in the
matter of of the estate, and May 20.
1952, at the hour of 9:00 o'clock a.m.
In the Courtroom of said court at the
Courthouse in Medford. Jackson
County. Oregon, has been fixed as the

dar. No bid for less than $21.35 per M.

to are nereoy nounea to preseni ine
same on or before such time.

Dated this 2nd day of May. 1952.
Margaret C. Loffer
Executrix

Roberts. Kellington Sc Branchfleld
Attorneys for Executrix

PIONEER ALFALFA SEED
37c per lb.

36 .00 Cwt.
Big Y Feed It Seed Co.
Open Sunday it Evenings

FOR appropriate and reasonably
prlced Mother's Day gift call

WURLITZER spinet piano, like new
inside and out. $485. terms. Ersklne's

ft. B.M. for Douglas nr. $33.10 per m.
ft. B.M. for marked Ponderosa Pine,
$11.20 per M. ft. B.M. (or White Fir.

REDWOOD siding $80 per M and up.Good low priced lumber. FHA terms.
NORTON LUMBER CO.
Phoenix. Phone3-28(!- 8

SEE Kristee Miracle Wall cleaner.
May save redecorating. Quick and
easy. Ph.

0 CAMP White windows with screens.
2000 ft. of Camp Whlta in. siding.
1000 ft. cedar shethtt g. new and
used doors, plumbing V fixtures,
cement mixer and Hon sandrr for
rent. Full line of Clit 1en Paints.
We deliver the goods. tl.'ggard Lbr.
Co. on 99 Phoenix.

. All Scouting Ranks

Awarded at Charter

Dinner Wednesday
Boy Scout Troop 8 held its an

ORDER EARLY Select Green Fir
Slabs MEDl'ORD FUEL. Tel.

2 ROOMS steam heat, refrig. all im-
itates paid, close in 217 S Riverside.

WE FIX EM while you sleepHAWKINS all night GAKAGE
616 S Riverside Ph 4. 1534

WE CIVE GREEN STAMPS

H.70 per M. It. b.m. tor incense ueaar,
or a total purchase price of S41.5R1.50.
will be considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $2,700.00. T. 38 S.. R 3 E .

time and place tor tne nettnng oi
to said Final Account and

Report, and all persons having objec-
tions thereto are hereby required to
make or file the same on or before

TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY riano Shop. 1304 Kings Hwy.
W.M.. Sec. 23. all timber designates

said time.
'4 CHEV. Styleline Deluxe. 15.000

actual miles, one owner, priced to
sell. Call after 3 pm. 711
W. 2nd.

for cutting on S':NW'(l SW4. esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale to
be 2265 M. feet Douglas fir. 00 M. feet

Dated: April 25. 1932.
Lena M. Miller,
Administratrix.

LAWN SEED
Formulated for this area.
Arasan treated.

Big Y Feed tt Seed Co.
Open Sunday it Eveningsnual charter dinner April 29 at

mar km bugar fine, iu At leei marKea
Ponderosa Pine. 135 M. feet marked
Incense Cedar. 1840 M. feet marked
Whit Fir. No bid for less than $21.45

F. P. Farrell V B. Kent Blackhurst
Attorneys for Administratrix.

OPEN ALL DAY SATURDAY

Open until 3:30 p.m. Saturday
See us for your Duildlng needs.
Roofing. Lumber. Doon, Nailt.
Shakes. Paint. Cement, Plywood.
Shcetrock. Screen Door Special
$8 50.

ECONOMY LBR. at FEED CO.
2810 Crater Lake Hwy.

DUCKLINGS
Big Y Feed St Seed Co.
Open Sunday & Evenings6t. Mark's Episcopal Guild hall

AUCTION
1133 North Central

Monday and Friday, 7:00 P.M.
Consignments always welcome. We
do appreciate your business.

"A Square Deal Or No Deal"
Phone For Details

YOCKEL'S TRUCKING SERVlcf
Local, long distance, and HKAVY
HAULING, machinery, cats, shovels,etc. Call GEORGE YOCKEL,or Ashland, Ore.

2 Foot

FIREPLACE WOOD
EAGLE WOOD CO.

"Flying Service"
Russell Womclidoif Ph.

per M. ft B.M. for Douglas fir, $35.65 No. 8764
NOTICE OF FINAL HEA.Q

In the Circuit Court of the Suite of

FOR SALE No. 2 oak flooring $125
per M. C it better fir flooring.
$175 per M.

NORTON'S LUMBER CO.
Phoenix, Ore. Ph.

For the first time in the history
of the troop, all Scout awards
from Tenderfoot to Eagle, the
highest scouting award, were

FOR SALE to be moved. 1 br. house
19x201, ft . hardwood floors, flrtex
walls, builtins, sink, toilet, oil stove.
Clean, excellent cond. $900 eash.
Ph.

Oregon lor the county oi jaexson
Probate Department.

In the Matter of the Estate of
CHARLES C. BUCK, deceased.conferred during the one

SELL equity in business Bldf. with 2
bedroom living quarters in Phoenix
on Hwy. 90. Full price (6500. My
equity $1350 or consider car or
house trailer of equal value. Pay-
ments including interest $53 mo.
Inq. 2,04 So. Grape. Medford.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Uiat
the undersiened has filed her final

HAM DINNER
Odd Fellows Hall Sat. eve. May 3rd

5:307:30 p.m. $1.25 for groumuo
and 75c for children under 13 years
of age.

account and report in the above enMike DeVore, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Ron DeVore, became an

per m. ix. b.m. lor marKea sugar
$32.30 per M. ft. B.M. for marked Pon-
derosa Pine. $7 20 per M. ft. B.M. for
marked Incense Cedar. $9.70 per M.
ft. B.M. for marked White Fir. or a
total purchase price of $68,995.75, will
be considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $4,050.00. T. 38 S R. 4 E W.M..
Sec. 19, all timber designated for cut-
ting on SWliNEH. Lot 2 iSW'iNW'W.
SE'iNWV. BiSW!. Lot 3

Lot 4 SW''SW4. WiSE4.
estimated for the purpose of this sale
to be 1140 M. feet marked Douglas fir.
1525 M. feet White Fir. 1750 M. feet
marked Ponderosa Pine. No bid for
less than $24.95 per M. ft. B.M, for
marked Douglas fir, $10.10 per M. ft.
B.M. for White Fir. $36.35 per M. ft.
B.M. for marked Ponderosa Pine, or a
total purchase price of $107,458.00,
will be considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $5,850.00.

Eagle scout during the court of
honor. The rank of Life scout
was conferred on Roy Doe and

PLANTS
Complete selection

FLOWER & VEGETABLE
Big Y Feed & Seed Co.
Open Sunday & Evenings

LUMBER SALE Special for 30 Days
100 Lineal feet 2x4 No. 4. $2.35.
100 Lineal feet 2x4. No. 3. $5.00.
100 Lineal feet 1x6 No. 4 sheathing.

$1.75.
1.000 Lineal feet $17.50.
100 Lineal feet 2x6 No. 4, $3 50.

TAYLOR LUMBER COMPANY
JACKSONVILLE. ORE.

Harold Ashton and Dick Swin- -

titled estate and tnai ny oraer ot tne
Circuit Court of Jackson County, Ore-
gon. Probate Department, a hearing
upon the same has been set for Mon-
day. May 19th. 1952, in the Circuit.
Court Room at the Court House in
Medford, Jackson County, Oregon, at
the hour of ten o'clock, A.M.

AU persons having objections there-
to are hereby notified to present the
same on or before such time.

Date of First Publication of this
notice is April 18th, 1952.

. Metta A. Buck,
Administratrix

Roberts, Kellington St Branchfleld
Attorneys for said Administratrix

ney and Wayne Breeze became
Star scouts.

FOR SALE or will trade beautiful view
acreage for your equity In house.
Ph.

DRAMEXFOR SALE Have about 80 bales good
lotus hay left. Sell by bale or byton. 1 a mile N. and i mi. E. of
Midway Auction on Gregory Rd.
Phone Central Point 822.

UNFURN. 5 rm. Apt close in. Price
$50. Ph.

The rank of First Class scout
was conferred on Bob Glover,
and four boys, Bob Taylor, Doug
Randies, Jerry Swartsley and
John Reeder became Second
Class scouts. Charles Rown, Pat
Connolly, Delbert Harvey, Mike
Bauer and Bruce Bromley were

KEEP A GOOD
MAN ON THE JOB!
Vote for Paul
for District Attorney
In the Primary Election May 16

Hii record for sound, efficient, honest administra-
tion of this office if his best recommendation.

Paid Adv. Haviland (or District Attorney Com.

No. 8547
NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

In the Circuit Court of the State of
Oregon for the County of Jackson
Probate Department.

In the Matter of the Estate of
Nion R. Tucker, also known as Nion
Robert Tucker, deceased.

WnTlPE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

INTERIOR WALL FINISH

Conceals ugly plaster cracks.
Decorates drab wall boards.
One coat covers at low cost.
Quick and easy to put on.

Attractive colors.
See us befora you paint.

BUILDERS SERVICE .

2802 Crater Lake Hwy.
Medford, Ph.

the undersigned hns filed his final aicount and report in the above entitled
given their Tenderfoot rank.
Gueiti Attend

Guests were Clifford Hanson,
scout executive, and Mrs. Han-

LAWN It GARDEN SUPPLIES
Hose
Grass Clipper!
Sprinklers
Insecticides
Weed Killers
Sprayers & Dusten
Lawn Edgers
Complete line of garden tools.

Big Y Feed & Seed Co.
Open Sunday it Evenlnga

NOTICE OF It EARING ON
FINAL ACCOUNT

No. 87 62
In the Circuit Court of the State of

Oregon for the County of Jackson
Probate Department

In the Matter of the Estate of Nora
O'Connor, deceased.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

the undersigned has filed her Final
Account and Report in the above en-

titled estate, and that by order of the
Circuit Court in and for JackxT.
County, Oregon, Probate Department,
a hearing upon the same has been
set for Monday, June 2nd, 1952, in
the Circuit Court Room at the Court
House in Medford, Jackson County.
Oregon, at the hour of 9:30 o'clock A.M.

estate and tr.at ay oraer oi ine circuit
Court of Jackson County. Oregon.
Probate Department, a hearing upon
the same has been set for Monday,
June 2nd. 1952, in the Circuit Court
Room at the Court House in Medford.
Jackson County. Oregon, at the hour
of ten o'clock A.M.

All Dersons having obJ tions there

son; Col. W. H. Paine, council
historian, Mrs. Winnifred Vail,
the Rev. and Mrs. George R. V.

FOR SALE 1x8 shlplap. 1x12 sugar
pine shelving, 1x3 picket stock or
cut to order.

WESTSIDE LUMBER CO.
924 Summit Ave., just off

road. PhoneBolster. John Eddy, district com-
TWENTY per cent discount on all

evergreen shrubs in lot Also few
blueberries left. Ben Schmidt K(V:SasaW.sMaaj

to are hereby notified to present the
same on or before such time.

Dated at Medford, Oregon, this 2nd
PLANER.BLOX. Clean, quick de-

livery. Medford Fuel. Tel.missioner, and Mrs. Eddy, John
Patton, chairman of Big Pines

day of May, 1952.
Earl S. Tumvdistrict, and Mrs. Patton.

Administrator with the Will An-

nexed of the Estate of Nion R.The Rev. Mr. Bolster, rector
of St. Mark's church, sponsoring Tucker, also known as Nion Bob.

ert Tucker, deceased.
George M. Roberta
Of Attorneys for Administrator.

group for the troop, gave the in
vocation and C. A. Stothers,
scoutmaster, introduced guests. NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Harry Barneburg and Stothers In the Circuit Court of the State of

Oregon for the County of Jacksonconducted the Tenderfoot inves probate DepartmentIn the Matter of the Estate of
Howard Maxwell Peirce. Sr.. deceased.titure, End members of the troop

committee, including J. A. Mc- NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that I
have been appointed Executrix of the
above estate by an order
on April 24th, 1952; all creditors hav-
ing claims against said deceased are

Dougall, Elwood Hedberg, Joy
Swartsley, Ron DeVore, Harry
Barneburg, Vincent Swinney,
Robert Bromley, Ben Ashton
and Bob Stothers, conducted the

Since We Were Unable To Accommodate
the Crowds at Our Cooking School in April
We Promised Another Treat For You Soon

So Here It Is!

nereoy notified to present tne same,
duly verified and with proper vouch
era attached, to me at the office of

court of honor. Roberts,' Kellington Bt Branchneld,
201-- 5 U.S. National Bank Bide., Med- -

ford, Oregon, within six months from
the date or this notice.

Dated at Medford, Oregon, this 29th

McDougall, institutional repre-
sentative, conducted the Eagle
court and John Eddy presented
the charter. Ed Glover and

day of April, ihsz.
Dorothv M. Pelrca

Executrix of the Estate of HowardFrank Clark are assistant Maxwell Peirce. Sr.. deceased.

No. 8719
NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL

ACCOUNT
In the Matter of the Estate of
Jacob ChristODherson. deceased.

Merit badges were presented
to Mike DeVore, Roy Doe, Har-
old Ashton, Wayne Breeze,

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
the undersigned has filed his final

Charles Robertson, Dick Swin-

ney, John Reeder, Randal Stoth-
ers and Greg Milnes.

account and report in the above en-

titled estate and that by rder of the 1 1 1 1 1 1 pcircuit court of Jackson countv. Ore
gon, Probate Department, a hearing
upon tne same nas Been set for MonCourt Records

POLICE COURT

day. May 26. 1952, in the Circuit Court
Room at the Court House in Medford.
Jackson County, Oregon, at the hour
ox a:au a.m.

All persons having objections there-
to are hereby notified to present the

Brill Metal Workf, expired motor
Vehicle license, $5.

John W. McConnell, failure to itopt slop sign. $3.
James D. German, violation of bailc

rule! $10.

same on or net ore sucn time.
Date of first publication of this

Claude R. Milei, failure to itop at
notice is Apru o, xhoz.

Carlos W. Morris
Administrator.

Roberts, Kellington & Branchfleld
Attorneys for Estate.

aiup sign. 90.
Naomi M. M. Childress, failure to

top at stop sign, $5.
William A Fleming Sr., expired mo- -

ior venicie license, o. NOTICE OF HEARING OF FINAL
ACCOUNT

CIRCUIT COURT Notice Is hereby given that Lena
Grace Betty Thompson vs. Carey M. Miller, administratrix of the estate

of Francis E. Miller, deceased, haswuiiam inompson in, divorce
tued in tne circuit court of the State of

Ray A. Dopp vs. Charles L.
and others, motion.

Thomas J. Parker and wife vs. Sher
man J. Had ley and others, motion. Tele-fu- n

by Warren GoodrichLEGAL NOTICES OUR FIRST ANNUAL G.E.TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE IN-
TERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND MAN-
AGEMENT. SEALED BIDS will be
received by the District Forester, Bu-
reau of Land Management, located at
The City Hall, Medford, Oregon, up
to 10:00 A.M., PACIFIC STANDARD
TIME, on Mar 20. 1952. for all timber
marked or otherwise designated for
cutting, as follows: information con
cernin? conditions of the sale lnclud

Miss
DeMars

Will
Demonstrate

tng such Items as qualification of bid-

ders, procedure for submitting bids,
road access, marketing area require-
ments, payments, and type of bond re-
quired, should be obtained prior to
the sale, from the above mentioned
office. The right is hereby reserved to
waive technical defects in this adver

(ELUFTTWLIEIE
tisement and to reject any or all bids.
All volumes given are timber estimates
and may be more or less than the
actual amounts. IN JACKSON COUN-
TY: OREGON: JACKSON MARKET-
ING AREA: T. 33 S R. 2 W.. W.M..
Sec. 27, all timber designated for cut-
ting on NEU, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 650 M. feet
marked Douglas fir, 810 M. feet mark-
ed Ponderosa Pine, B10 M. feet marked
Sugar Pine, 205 M. feet marked In-
cense Cedar, 30 M. feet marked White
Fir. No bid for less than $18.10 per M.
ft. B.M. for marked Douglas fir. $29.35

M. ft. B.M. for marked PonderosaPer $31.90 per M. ft B.M. for mark-
ed Sugar Pine, $6.15 per M. ft. B.M.
for marked Incense Cedar, $7.65 per
M. ft B.M. for marked White Fir. or
a total purchase price of $53,651.25.
will be considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $3,300.00. T. 38 S R. 1

W.M., Sec. 3, all timber designated for
cutting on NEiNW', SWi,'NWi,
estimated for the purpose of this sale

"Hurry and alva ma Lau- l-
correct number. And itop
worryin- g- dooin't mean
thing that Iff listed Crab,
louia.". . . Be sure to look up
telephone numbers you're not
sure of before you call. You'll
save time!...Pacific Telephone. Beginning MONDAY

AT OUR STORE

MISS MAXINE DeMARS
... of Portland It coming to our itort to personally demonstrate the wide
array of popular, tlme-iavin- g G.E. Small home appliances. Mitt DeMars will
have many useful suggestions to make your housework easier and pleasantcr
. . . and Ideas for suitable gifts for Mother's Day . . . Father's Day . . .
the June Bride . . . birthdays . . . every event that calls for a much de-

sired, thoughtfully selected gift. We cordially Invite you to come in and meet
Miss DeMars.

Watch For Our Announcement In Sunday's Tribune

STEAM and
DRY IRONS

Triple-Whi- p

MIXERS

Austomatic
TOASTERS

CLOCKS

VACUUM
CLEANERS

Knife Sharpeners

ROASTERS

RADIOS

BLENDORS

Automatic
BLANKETS

Dulane
FRYRYTES

ANNOUNCING...
The OPENING

of The NEW

IPioneeir
Tcaveirmi

Corner 2nd & Pine Central Point

"WHERE FRIENDS MEET"

Be$t Withes From
The General Contractor & Sub Contractor

HOME APPLIANCE CO,
113 EAST MAIN STREET PHONE 2-45-

85


