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PUBLIC NOTICE 

DEADLINE: 
MONDAYS  

AT 5PM

Fencing 
Lancaster Fencing LLC is 
looking to gain some local 
clientele. With over 10+ 
years experience, I am confi-
dent I can deliver 100% cus-
tomer satisfaction. Check 
out my website to see pic-
tures of completed projects 

I've done and 
customer reviews.

Contact Nathan 
@ 360-953-1318

Lancasterfencingllc.com
Licensed & Bonded

9-7-TFN

FENCING

FOR SALE
       

  
THOMAS 

ORCHARDS
Kimberly, Oregon

541-934-2870

Open 7 days a week 
8 am-6pm ONLY

CHECK US OUT ON 
FACEBOOK FOR UPDATES

BRING 
CONTAINERS
& LADDERS
FOR U -PICK

Semi-Cling PeachesSemi-Cling Peaches
$1.75 per lbs$1.75 per lbs
Dark Sweet &Dark Sweet &
Rainier CherriesRainier Cherries
Under 5 lbs $2.25/lbUnder 5 lbs $2.25/lb
5-25 lbs $2.00/lb5-25 lbs $2.00/lb
Over 25 lbs$1.75/lbOver 25 lbs$1.75/lb

U-Pick

NOTICE OF SHER-
IFF’S SALE On August 
10, 2023 at the hour of 11 
am at the Lobby Doors 
inside the Morrow Coun-
ty Court House, 100 N 
Court St, Heppner, OR 
97836, the defendant’s 
interest will be sold, sub-
ject to redemption, in the 
real property commonly 
known as: 75014 SNY-
DER ROAD, IRRIGON, 
OR 97844. The court case 
number is 22CV05884, 
THE BANK OF NEW 
YORK MELLON, F/K/A, 
THE BANK OF NEW 
YORK AS SUCCESSOR 
TO JPMORGAN CHASE 
BANK, NATIONAL AS-
SOCIATION, AS TRUST-
EE FOR RENAISSANCE 
HOME EQUITY LOAN 
TRUST, SERIES 2003-2, 
Plaintiff and THE ESTATE 
OF THOMAS C. TAY-
LOR; THE UNKNOWN 
HEIRS, ASSIGNS AND 
DEVISEES OF THOM-
AS C. TAYLOR; WIL-
LIAM TAYLOR AKA 
BILL TAYLOR; DAVID 
TAYLOR; TOM PAPKE; 
LAND TITLE OF NEZ 
PERCE COUNTY, INC.; 
FORD MOTOR CREDIT 
COMPANY; AND ALL 
OTHER PERSONS OR 
PARTIES UNKNOWN 
CLAIMING ANY RIGHT, 
TITLE, LIEN, OR IN-
TEREST IN THE REAL 
PROPERTY COMMON-
LY KNOWN AS 75014 
SNYDER ROAD, IRRI-
GON, OR 97844, Defen-
dants. The sale is a public 
auction to the highest bid-
der for cash or cashier’s 
check, in hand, made out to 
Morrow County Sheriff’s 
Office. For more informa-
tion on this sale go to:
http://oregonsheriffs-
sales.org/
Published July 5, 12, 19, 
26, 2023 affid

IN THE CIRCUIT  
COURT  OF   THE 
STATE  OF  OREGON    
FOR THE COUN-
TY OF MORROW 
Probate Department In 
the Matter of the Es-
tate of:  No.23PB06095.  
ANNA MAE BUNCH,                                                
NOTICE   TO     INTER-
ESTED PERSONS De-

Morrow County Public 
Transit – The Loop will 
be holding its quarterly 
advisory committee meet-
ing on July 20, 2023, at 
Bartholomew Building 
lower Conference Room – 
110 N. Court St. Heppner 
Or. 97836. The meetings 
are available virtually via 
Morrow County Zoom in-
vitation or at the website 
https://www.co.morrow.
or.us/theloop. To schedule 
a Zoom Meeting invita-
tion please provide your 
phone number and email 
address with the Tran-
sit Manager, Benjaman 
Tucker via phone mes-
sage at 541-676-5667, or 
btucker@co.morrow.or.us
The Morrow County Pub-
lic Transit Advisory Com-
mittee will start at 3 p.m. 
On the agenda, Roll Call, 
Public comment, Election 
of chair and vice chair, 
Approval of Minutes, 
Transit Manager Update, 
and Other Business as 
needed for the good of the 
order. 
Published July 19, 2023 
affid

NOTICE OF APPLI-
CATION BY BANK OF 
EASTERN OREGON
Bank of Eastern Oregon, 
an Oregon chartered stock 
bank, whose main office is 
located at 279 N. Main St., 
Heppner, Oregon 97836, 
has applied to the Federal 
Deposit Insurance Corpo-
ration (“FDIC”) for per-
mission to acquire certain 
assets and assume certain 
liabilities of Farmington 
State Bank, a Washing-
ton chartered commer-
cial bank, whose office 
is located at 103 North 
First Street, Farmington, 
Washington 99128.  Upon 
closing of the transaction, 
Bank of Eastern Oregon 
will assume liability for 
all deposits of Farmington 
State Bank, and the obliga-
tions of Farmington State 
Bank in connection with its 
loans.  The FDIC considers 
a number of factors in de-
ciding whether to approve 
the application, including 
the record of performance 
of applicant banks in help-
ing to meet local credit 
needs. It is contemplated 
that the main office and all 
branches of Bank of East-
ern Oregon will continue 
to be operated and that 
Farmington State Bank’s 
main office located at 103 
North First Street, Farm-
ington, Washington 99128, 
will be closed.  Any per-
son wishing to comment 
on this application may 
file his or her comments 
in writing with the region-
al director of the FDIC 

CARD OF THANKS

ceased Date of Death: July 
22, 2023     Notice is given 
that the undersigned has 
been appointed and has 
qualified as the personal  
representative of the estate. 
All persons having claims 
against the estate are re-
quired to present it, with 
proper vouchers, within 
four months after the date 
of first publication of this 
notice, as stated below, to 
the personal representa-
tive at Kuhn Law Offices, 
267 N.  Main Street, P.O. 
Box 428, Heppner, Ore-
gon 97836, or they may be 
barred.  All persons  whose 
rights may be affected by 
the proceedings in this 
estate may obtain    addi-
tional information from the 
records of the court, the 
personal representative or 
the attorney for the person-
al representative.   DATED 
and first published July 19, 
2023    Brian W. Bunch, 
Personal Representative                                                  
81528 W  Fourth Rd Ir-
rigon, OR 97844 To be 
published for three con-
secutive weeks. PER-
SONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE:  Brian W.  Bunch  
81528  W Fourth Rd  Ir-
rigon, OR 97844 Tele-
phone:    501-554-4739                                         
ATTORNEY FOR PER-
SONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE: William  J. Kuhn,  
OSB   No. 762075   267 
N   Main Street PO   Box 
428 Heppner,OR 97836 
Telephone:541-676-9141 
FA X : 5 4 1 - 6 7 6 - 5 5 0 2    
Email:  wjk@kuhnlawof-
fices.com
Published July 19, 26, Au-
gust 2, 2023 affid

PUBLIC NOTICE PUBLIC NOTICE 
volunteered to help server 

and clean-up; thank you 

to those contributing food 

and helping with the golf 

event; Shanny Farley Mill-
er, Diane Cox Henrich, 

Kay Munkers Alldritt, 
Gary Watkins, Dave Gun-

derson, Molly Rill, Pat-
ty Matheny; Thank you, 
Gary Watkins, for taking 
on the MC role for the 
evening and introducing 

our former teachers and 

spouses Dean Naffzigger 
(Teresa), Steve Brown-

field (Luanne), and Dale 
Conklin(Linda). Thank 

you, Pat Sweeney for tak-

ing us down memory lane 

and reminding us how 

great it was to grow up in 

the sixties and seventies. 

Thank you, Dale Bates 
for putting together a 

slide show to memorialize 

classmates, and other pho-

tos to bring us back to high 

school days. Thank you, 

Tami Meador Sneddon 
for entertaining us with a 

video by her mother, Inez 

Meador (former 7th-8th 
grade teacher), and a note-

book with student poems. 

Thank you, classmate, 

Lindy Leonnig Gravelle 
for entertaining us with 

one of your original songs 

and letting us join you in 

singing “Ring of Fire.” 
We could have listened to 
you all night!  We appre-

ciate Teresa Hughes and 

Sandy Matthews for tak-

ing the class group pic-

tures. Thank you to Jared 

Hedman who provided DJ 

music , great selections 

for dancing and listening. 

Thank you, classmates, 

this amazing reunion hap-

pened because you came! 
Until the next reunion…

Go Mustangs!
HHS Class Reunion Com-

mittee:Molly Becket Rill 
(Class of 70) Ron Sher-

man and Dave Gunderson 
(Class of 71) Patty Luciani 

Matheny and Gary Wat-
kins (Class of 72) Barb 
Sherman Watkins, Kel-
ly Kilkenny Hale, Tricia 

Prock Gunderson (Class 
of 73)

July 19. 2023 1c

at the appropriate FDIC 
office, 25 Jessie Street at 
Ecker Square, Suite 2300, 
San Francisco, California 
94105-2780, not later than 
July 15, 2023. The non-
confidential portions of 
the application are on file 
at the appropriate FDIC 
office and are available for 
public inspection during 
regular business hours.  
Photocopies of the non-
confidential portion of the 
application will be made 
available upon request.
Published June 21, July 5 
19, 2023 affid

PUBLIC NOTICE 

After a weeklong trial 
in early June, U.S. District 
Court Judge Karin Immer-
gut ruled that Oregon’s 
new gun laws banning 
large-capacity magazines 
and requiring permits are 
constitutional under the 
United States Constitution 
in their entirety. 

Immergut ruled that 
Ballot Measure 114’s per-
mitting system does not 
violate the Second Amend-
ment and therefore does not 
deprive Oregonians of their 
liberty. She also wrote that 
large capacity magazines 
“are not commonly used 
for self-defense, and are 
therefore not protected by 
the Second Amendment.”

Immergut made the 
ruling in a 122-page opin-
ion published late Friday 
afternoon, in which she 
said banning large capac-
ity magazines and requir-
ing permits to purchase 
firearms are in keeping 
with “the nation’s history 
and tradition of regulat-
ing uniquely dangerous 
features of weapons and 
firearms to protect public 

Federal judge upholds 
Oregon gun law
Measure 114 still awaits trial 
in Oregon

safety.”
State Attorney Gener-

al Ellen Rosenblum wel-
comed the news, saying in 
a statement that “Measure 
114’s provisions are com-
mon sense safety measures 
that will save lives.”

However, the Oregon 
Firearms Federation called 
the ruling “absurd.”

“Today, Judge Karin 
Immergut ruled against 
gun owners, the Second 
Amendment and a basic un-
derstanding of the English 
language and ruled that 
Ballot Measure 114 is just 
fine,” the organization said 
in a statement said. 

Ballot Measure 114 
passed in November by an 
extremely narrow margin, 
with 50.6 percent of the 
vote. Since then, several 
groups have filed lawsuits 
challenging the law. In Jan-
uary, a state court judge in 
Harney County blocked the 
law from going into effect.

Due to that ongoing 
court case, Measure 114 
remains on hold for now. 
A state trial is scheduled 
for September in Harney 
County.

It was a sunny and 
warm day on Tuesday, 
July 11, for the ladies who 
turned out for the ladies 
play day at Willow Creek 
Country Club.

Low gross of the field 
went to Karen Thompson. 
Sharon Harrison had low 
net of the field, while Lor-
rene Montgomery had least 
putts of the field.

For flight A, Tiffany 

Over the Tee Cup
Clement had low gross and 
Pat Dougherty low net.

Shirley Martin had low 
gross on flight B.

On flight C, Jackie All-
stott had low gross and 
Karen Smith-Griffith had 
low net.

Jackie Allstott was also 
the Chase Rabbit winner.

In upcoming events, 
the ladies are planning a 
guest play day and lun-
cheon on Tuesday, July 25.

Eleven men participat-
ed in men’s play on a hot 
morning July 16 at Willow 
Creek Country Club. The 
results are as follows:

KP #5-14: John Ed-
mundson 13’1”.

Net—1st David Allstott, 
58; 2nd Tom Shear, 61.

Gross—1st/2nd (tie) Jer-
ry Gentry and Logan Burri-
ght, 68.

WCCC Sunday 
men’s play

The next men’s play 
will be on Sunday, July 23. 
The schedule has changed, 
and this will be a regular 
play event. Charlie Fergu-
son and Dave Gunderson 
will be hosting. 

On July 30 there will 
be a two-man event hosted 
by John McCabe and Josh 
Coiner.

InterMountain Ed-

ucation Service District 

(IMESD) has organized an 
opportunity for those who 

coach students in grades 

six through 12 to gather, 

collaborate and learn from 

each other before the 2023-

24 school year. 

The Coaching Sym-

posium will be Thursday, 

Aug. 10, from 8 a.m. to 

2:30 p.m. at Pendleton High 

School, 1800 NW Carden 
Ave., Pendleton. Coaching 

staff from all IMESD and 
OSAA membership school 
districts are invited to the 

free symposium.

The purpose of the 

event is to foster knowledge 

sharing, collaboration and 

IMESD plans regional 
event for school coaches

professional development 

between coaches in east-

ern Oregon schools. Troy 
Jerome, Superintendent of 

Pilot Rock School District, 

is working with IMESD on 
the symposium. 

“We hope this new 
event provides a platform 

for coaches from around 

our region to get to know 

others in their coaching 

field, learn from each oth-

er’s experiences and net-
work,” Jerome said.

Participants are asked 

to register by July 27. 

With questions or for more 
information, contact Troy 

Jerome at troy.jerome@

pilotrocksd.org.

Eastern Oregon Uni-
versity has announced that 
six Morrow County stu-
dents were named to the 
university’s dean’s list for 
the 2023 spring term. 

Heppner students were 
Linsey Mitchell, in the 
College of Science, Tech-
nology, Math and Health 
Science, pursuing a degree 
in Psychology, and Hunter 
Nichols, in the College of 
Science, Technology, Math 
and Health Science, pursu-
ing a degree in Biology.

Boardman students 

EOU announces 
spring term dean’s list

were Ariel Lissman, Early 
Childhood Education; Al-
yssa Luna, Science, Tech-
nology, Math and Health 
Science in General Stud-
ies-Exploratory; Jose Puer-
ta, Business Administra-
tion; and Johana Sepulveda 
Vieyra, Arts, Anthropology/
Sociology.

Qualifying students 
achieve and maintain a 
grade point average of 3.5 
or higher on a 4.0 scale 
while completing a mini-
mum of 12 hours of graded 
coursework for the duration 
of the term.

*Includes product and labor; bathtub, shower or walk-in tub and wall surround. 
This promotion cannot be combined with any other offer. Other restrictions may 
apply. This offer expires 9/30/23. Each dealership is independently owned and 
operated. **Third party fi nancing is available for those customers who qualify. See 
your dealer for details. ©2023 BCI Acrylic, Inc.

The Bath or Shower You’ve Always Wanted 

IN AS LITTLE AS A DAY

(844) 847-9778CALL 
NOW

OFFER EXPIRES 9.30.2023

$1000 OFF*

No Payments & No Interest
For 18 Months**

AND

C O N N EC T S

FREE INTERNET
Qualify today for the Government 

Free Internet Program

CALL TODAY (877) 390-0458

Qualify today for the Government 

YOU QUALIFY  for Free Internet if you 

receive Housing Assistance, Medicaid, 

SNAP, WIC, Veterans Pension, 

Survivor Benefi ts, Lifeline and Tribal.

Bonus offer: 4G Android Tablet with one time co-pay of $20

ACP program details can be found at www.fcc.gov/affordable-connectivity-program-consumer-faq

BOGO  

40
% OFF

OFFER ENDS 10/31

866-643-2965

Call today and receive a 

FREE SHOWER PACKAGE
PLUS $1600 OFF

With purchase of a new Safe Step Walk-In Tub. Not applicable with any previous 
walk-in tub purchase. Offer available while supplies last. No cash value. Must 
present offer at time of purchase. CSLB 1082165  NSCB 0082999  0083445

With purchase of a new Safe Step Walk-In Tub. Not applicable with any previous 

1-833-395-14331-833-395-1433

*To qualify, consumers must request a quote, purchase, install and activate the 

generator with a participating dealer. Call for a full list of terms and conditions.

REQUEST A FREE QUOTE
CALL NOW BEFORE THE NEXT POWER OUTAGE

(877) 557-1912

$0 MONEY DOWN + LOW MONTHLY PAYMENT OPTIONS

Contact a Generac dealer for full terms and conditions 

Prepare 
for power 
outages today 
WITH A HOME STANDBY GENERATOR

FREE
7-Year Extended

Warranty*
A $695 Value!

PAYMENT OPTIONS

ALL NEWS AND ADVERTISEMENT DEADLINE:

MONDAYS AT 5:00 P.M.


