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BUY OF THIS HOUSE
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EVERGREENS
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Horses branded

XThe paramount chief of Demara 
Lind, Africa, has ordered all Ger­
mans to leaves the country.

FROM BURNS LAST EDITION
(October 17.)
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X Soidt< r.*a»lMM. Uuti. lately. 
DA lie .i S\j watch in the world. 
1,1 k'víU'c» InueKeepcR V/ar-

GEORGE W. CRANE

Range—Grant county, Oregon.
P o.—Burn«, Grant county. Oregon

The Chicago Postal Commission­
er reports that city’s postal facilities 
inadequate to tho demand.

A priest in Oneida, N. Y. wi 
poisoned while mass on 13th inst

Democrats made large gains in 
Montana and North Dakota.
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There is wholesale loss of life 
from electricity by use of over­
head wires for electric illumination

NECTARINES,

Prospectors in Lower California 
were lost on the desert for days 
without water, and had a narrow 
escajx) from an awful death.
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Reward of 1500 offered for rap 
tore of wife poisoner, Baciljolope 
of Jackson, Cal.

Rattlesnakes arc invading the 
houses in Sonora,¿Cal., driven in 
town in search of water
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