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Lil Rel Howery hosts as teams of friends and 
family compete for cash prizes, facing unique 
tests of strategy and precision in scaled-down 
games based on real-life locations, in the new 
game show “Small Fortune,” airing Mondays 
on NBC. Get your first look at the big action at 
www.youtube.com/watch?v5XWwANQKLMc

The youngest group of chefs ever in this com-
petition — all 24 years old or younger — head 
to Sin City to gamble it all for a chance at 
winning the position of head chef at Gordon 
Ramsay’s Steak at Paris Las Vegas in Season 
20 of “Hell’s Kitchen,” heating up Mondays on 
Fox. Snack on past seasons at www.fox.com/
hells-kitchen

Simon Cowell returns to his judge’s seat along-
side familiar faces Heidi Klum, Howie Mandel 

and Sofía Vergara as the Terry Crews-hosted 
“America’s Got Talent” airs Season 16 Tues-
days on NBC. Catch up on acts you may have 
missed by going to www.nbc.com/ameri-
cas-got-talent

With grandparents and parents always being 
nearby, there’s no shortage of advice for nine 
young Indian American friends trying to navi-
gate life, friendship, careers and family in Sea-
son 2 of “Family Karma,” airing Wednesdays 
on Bravo. Get your first look at www.bravotv.
com/family-karma

Busy mom of three and SoCal design business 
owner Christina Haack expands her opera-
tion with a fresh team and new clients that 
desire her sought-after style as new episodes 
of “Christina on the Coast” air Thursdays on 
HGTV. Find inspiration for your own home 
at www.hgtv.com/shows/christina-on-the-
coast

WebLinks

Post-Mastectomy Care

Compression, Bras, Hats, Wigs, Breast Pumps
Call for appointment 541.383.8085

345 NE Norton Ave., Bend, OR 97701 | mariposaoregon.com

Wig Sale
Now - May 28th In stock wigs on sale now. Help us make room for new arrivals!

Caring for your entire family’s 
skin health needs.

• Medical Dermatology

• Skin Cancer Care

• Mohs Surgery

• Aesthetic Dermatology

Bend • Redmond • Sunriver 

541.382.8819

derm-health.com

Meet our 
Specialists!

Lindsey Clark, PA-C

Lindsey cares for 
all ages, with a 

passion for medical 
dermatology and 

aesthetics.

Worship online @ trinitybend.org 

Meal schedule @ familykitchen.org

TRINITY EPISCOPAL 

CHURCH

Love God, 

Love Your Neighbor, 

Love Yourself


