
Monaco Dynasty

2004 - LOADED!

4-dr fridge, convection 

micro, built-in w/d, 

ceramic tile � oor, 

TV/DVD, Stainless 

appliances, king size bed. 

All for only $149,000

541-000-000

SUPER SELLER SPECIAL: WHEELS & WINGS
$49*

 FOR A 4 WEEK PACKAGE

Includes autos, RVs, motorcycles, boats & airplanes.
Includes up to 30 words of text, 1.5” in length, full color photo and price. 

Call 541-385-5809 or classifi eds@bendbulletin.com

* Private party ads only. Prepayment required.  Deal expires 3/31/2021.

Community

282

SAVE BIG on HOME 
INSURANCE! Compare 
20 A-rated insurances 
companies. Get a quote 
within minutes. Average 
savings of $444/year! 
Call 1-877-676-8443! 
(M-F 8am-8pm Central) 
(PNDC)

Stay in your home 
longer with an Ameri-
can Standard Walk-In 
Bathtub. Receive up to 
$1,500 off, including a 
free toilet, and a lifetime 
warranty on the tub and 
installation! Call us at 
1-855-876-1237. (PNDC)

Tired of the same old 
dating sites? Meet real 
people in your area & 
make a new connection 
on your terms! 18+ only. 
Call 1-866-308-3216

Garage 
Sales

300
Garage Sales - General

301

Moving Sale March 13th 
and 14th  9am to 3pm - 
ALL MUST GO!  
You determine prices 
of items. Absolutely no 
early birds.
19245 Shoshone Rd. 
Bend

Moving Sale Friday/
Saturday 3/12-3/13 9-3 
21285 Daylily Ave Bend
Patio/garden items, 
kitchen, womens 
clothes, plants and lots 
more!

Farm 

Market

400
Hay, Grain, Feed

404

Horse Hay For Sale 
75lb two tie orchard 
grass. (541)604-1258 or 
(541)-604-4795

Meat & Animal processing

413

ENJOY 100% guaran-
teed, delivered-to-the-
door Omaha Steaks! 
Get 4 FREE Pork 
Chops and 4 FREE 
CHICKEN
BREASTS, Order The 
Omaha Steaks Classic 
- ONLY $129.99. Visit 
www.OmahaSteaks.
com/Dinner184 or call 
1-877-
701-4335 & use code 
66762ENW

Produce & Food

416

Pittman & Davis’s 
Mixed-Fruit Medley for 
the Holidays! Give the 
gift of Winter Sunshine! 
6 Rio Ruby Red Gems. 
4 Tiny
Tim Navels. 6 Mini 
Fuji Apples. Call NOW 
and SAVE 33% OFF. 
Pay just $19.99. FREE 
Shipping! Visit
www.pittmandavis.com/
MN257 or call 1-855-
338-0587 to order item 
MXSP and mention 
code PNVH-N257 for 
savings!

ORANGE SPECTACU-
LAR GIFT BOX for the 
Holidays: Send 4 navel 
oranges, 4 tangerines, 4 
petite navel oranges,
chocolate chip cookies 
& foil-wrapped choco-
lates! SAVE 43%! Just 
$19.99 (plus s/h). Visit 
www.halegroves.com/
me201
or call 844-441-0967 to 
order item 442X (men-
tion code HNVH-E201 
for savings)

Produce & Food

416

Amazing Orange Gift for 
the Holidays – Delicious 
oranges fresh from the 
grove! Four favorite vari-
eties. High in Vitamin
C. December holiday 
delivery. SAVE 43%! 
Just $19.99 (plus s/h.) 
Call 1-855-657-2388 
to order item 496X 
and mention code 
HNVH-N181 for savings 
or visit www.halegroves.
com/mn181

Employment

500
Domestic &

In-Home Positions

501

La Pine OR female car 
owner needs driver to 
post office & Bend OR. 
Call Mary 541-977-6560

Employment Opportunities

504

Exciting outdoor job 
�ghting forest �res 
includes adventure, 
travel, new friend-
ships that will last 

a lifetime, and don’t 
forget the $$$ OT

Basic training class 
starts March 22nd
Apply www.patrick-
�re.net or in person 
1199 NE Hemlock, 

Redmond 9am-3pm 
EOE

LAB TECHNICIAN
 The Center for 
Genome Research 
and Biocomputing 
(CGRB) at Oregon 
State University 
seeks lab technician 
for its genomics core 
facility. OSU is an AA/
EOE/Vets/Disabled. 
For full consideration, 
applications must 
be received by Mar 
18, 2021. To apply 
search for posting 
P04217UF here:
 jobs.oregonstate.
edu

Jefferson County is 
hiring for multiple posi-
tions. Visit our website 
to read about our open 
positions and apply!

Bridge Carpenter 
Position.  Hamilton Con-
struction Company. For 
more info: hamil.com/
current-openings/

Business Opportunities

507

DID YOU KNOW that not 
only does newspaper 
media reach a HUGE 
Audience, they also 
reach an ENGAGED 
AUDIENCE. Discover 
the Power of Newspaper 
Advertising in �ve states 
– AK, ID, MT, OR & WA.
For a free rate brochure 
call 916-288-6011 or 
email cecelia@cnpa.
com (PNDC)

Financing

510

Applying for Social 
Security Disability or 
Appealing a Denied 
Claim? Call Bill Gordon 
& Assoc. Our case 
managers simplify the 
process & work hard to 
help with your case. Call 
1-888-678-1284. FREE 
Consultation. Local 
Attorneys Nationwide 
[Mail: 2420 N St NW, 
Washington DC. Office: 
Broward Co. FL (TX/NM 
Bar.)]

Timeshare Can-
cellation Experts: 
Over $50,000,000 in 
timeshare debt & fees 
cancelled in 2019. Get a 
free informational pack-
age & learn how to get 
rid of your timeshare! 
Free consultations. Over 
450 positive reviews. 
Call Wesley Financial
Group LLC, 844-615-
0146

l Up to $15,000 of 
GUARANTEED Life 
Insurance! No medical 
exam or health ques-
tions. Cash to help pay 
funeral and other �nal 
expenses. Visit www.
Life55plus.info/paci�c 
or call Physicians Life 
Insurance Company, 
1-844-218-4167

ARE YOU BEHIND $10k 
OR MORE ON YOUR 
TAXES? Stop wage & 
bank levies, liens & au-
dits, un�led tax returns, 
payroll issues, & resolve 
tax debt FAST. Call 
1-855-730-0388 (PNDC)

Over $10K in Debt? Be 
debt free in 24 to 48 
months. No upfront fees 
to enroll. A+ BBB rated.
Call National Debt Relief 
1-888-231-4274 (PNDC)

Recreation
& Sports

800
Motorhomes, 5th Wheels,

Travel Trailers

804

WE BUY RV’S! 

LICENSED, BONDED 
AND INSURED. CALL 
FOR A FREE ESTI-

MATE TODAY! 
503-689-0669

Autos &
Transportation

900
Automobiles-Trucks,

Auto, RV, Vans

901

DONATE YOUR CAR 
FOR BREAST CAN-
CER!  Help United 
Breast Foundation ed-
ucation, prevention, & 
support programs.  FAST 
FREE PICKUP - 24 HR 
RESPONSE - TAX DE-
DUCTION.  1-855-385-
2819. (PNDC)

DONATE YOUR CAR, 
TRUCK OR BOAT TO 
HERITAGE FOR THE 
BLIND. Free 3 Day Va-
cation, Tax Deductible, 
Free Towing, All Paper-
work Taken Care Of. 
CALL 1-844-493-7877 
(PNDC)

Automotive Parts

& Accessories

907

Korad ext wheel kit 
cover for jeep 26” tires. 
$108 (805)477-2216

Autos Wanted

913

Done su auto o ca-
mioneta. Ayude a los 
veteranos a encontrar 
trabajo o iniciar un ne-
gocio. Llame a la Fun-
dación Patriotic Hearts. 
Recogida rápida y 
GRATUITA. Deducción 
máxima de impuestos. 
¡Las operadores están 
esperando! Llame al 
855-315-1966

DONATE YOUR CAR 
TO UNITED BREAST 
CANCER FOUNDA-
TION! Your donation 
helps education, 
prevention & support 
programs. FAST FREE 
PICKUP, 24-hour re-
sponse, TAX DEDUC-
TION. 1-844-478-7513

Autos Wanted

913

Donate your car, truck 
or van. Help veterans 
�nd jobs or start a 
business. Call Patriotic 
Hearts Foundation. 
Fast, FREE pick-up. 
Max tax-deduction. Op-
erators are standing by! 
Call 1-844-859-3920

DONATE your car or 
truck to HERITAGE 
FOR THE BLIND. Free 
3-day vacation, tax de-
ductible, free towing, all
paperwork taken care 
of. Call 1-866-871-1497

Legal 
Notices

1000
Legal Notices &

Public Notices

1001

Legal Notice
IN THE CIRCUIT 
COURT FOR THE 
STATE OF ORE-

GON
FOR THE COUNTY 

OF DESCHUTES
Case No. 20CV39661
TO: TRINA DICKSON, 

DEFENDANT
You are hereby re-

quired to appear and 
defend the complaint 
�led against you in 
the above-entitled 
action within thirty 
(30) days from the 
�rst date of publica-
tion of the summons, 
and in case of your 
failure to do so, for 
want thereof, plain-
tiff will apply to the 
court for the relief 
demanded in the 
complaint, and sum-
marized herein.

Count 1 Replevin. Pos-
session of the equip-
ment described as: 
Rotary Tiller, Post 
Hole Digger, Post 
Hole Auger, Pallet 
Fork, Loader, and 
Compact Utility Trac-
tor, Plaintiff’s reason-
able expenses for 
re-taking, holding, 
preparing for sale, 
and Plaintiff’s rea-
sonable attorneys 
fees, costs and dis-
bursements; and

Count 2 Money Due. 
$27,579.50, late 
charges of $157.14 
and a repossession 
fee of $200.00, in-
terest, Plaintiff’s 
reasonable attorney 
fees, costs and dis-
bursements incurred 
herein;  in the alter-
native,

Count 3 Foreclosure. 
$27,579.50, late 
charges of $157.14 
and a repossession 
fee of $200.00, in-
terest, attorney fees, 
costs and disburse-
ments incurred here-
in;  a declaration that 
the security interest 
being foreclosed is 
a valid lien against 
the equipment de-
scibed in Count 1 
above, declaring this 

Legal Notices &

Public Notices
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above, declaring this 
lien to be superior 
to any interest, lien, 
right, title, or claim 
of the Defendant, in 
said equipment;  and 
foreclosing Plaintiff’s 
security interest, 
sale of the proper-
ty and a de�ciency 
judgment if the sums 
collected are inade-
quate to pay the debt 
in full.

The �rst date of publi-
cation of summons: 
March 13, 2021.

NOTICE TO DE-
FENDANT: READ 
THESE PAPERS 
CAREFULLY!

You must “appear” in 
this case or the oth-
er side will win auto-
matically. To “appear” 
you must �le with the 
court a legal paper 
called a “motion” or 
“answer.” The “mo-
tion” or “answer” 
(or “reply”) must be 
given to the court 
clerk or administra-
tor within 30 days 
of the date of �rst 
publication speci�ed 
herein along with the 
required �ling fee. 
It must be in proper 
form and have proof 
of service on the 
plaintiff’s attorney or, 
if the plaintiff does 
not have an attorney, 
proof of service on 
the plaintiff. If you 
have questions, you 
should see an at-
torney immediately. 
If you need help in 
�nding an attorney, 
you may contact 
the Oregon State 
Bar’s Lawyer Refer-
ral Service at (503) 
684-3763 or toll-free 
in Oregon at (800) 
452-7636.

David B. Gray, OSB 
#842346

Attorney for Plaintiff
12275 SW Second 

Street
Beaverton, OR 97005
(503)747-3682

CLASSIFIEDS SELL!

Place your ad online
BENDBULLETIN.COM

Public Notice

OREGON VETER-
INARY MEDICAL 

EXAMINING 
BOARD (OVMEB) 

NOTICE OF PRO-
POSED RULEMAK-

ING PUBLIC 
HEARING 

Proposed amend-
ments to “Unpro-
fessional or Dis-
honorable Conduct”  
Public hearing via 
zoom meeting only. 
Contact OVMEB 
to receive connec-
tion information. 
04/23/2021 9:30 AM; 
Written comments 
to OVMEB: Brenda 
Biggs, Rules Coor-
dinator; 800 NE Ore-
gon Street suite 407, 
Portland, OR 97232; 
Ph: 503-995-3121; 
E-Mail:  OVMEB.
Inspector@Oregon.
gov

Legal Notices &

Public Notices
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PUBLIC NOTICE

The Bend Park & 
Recreation District 
Board of Directors 
will meet for a reg-
ular board meeting 
Tuesday, March 
16, at 5:30 pm. The 
work session agen-
da items include a 
DEI update, CM/GC 
Contract Closeout 
for Larkspur, a rec-
reation update and 
a discussion about 
holding in-person 
meetings. Following 
the work session, 
there will be a busi-
ness session to ap-
prove Resolution No. 
2021-03 to approve 
waiving SDC fees for 
Veterans Village.

To support Governor 
Brown’s recommen-
dation for social dis-
tancing, the Board 
of Directors will con-
duct the board meet-
ing by Zoom video.

Members of the com-
munity who wish to 
make public com-
ment are asked to 
use the link posted 
on the website and 
Facebook to join the 
meeting. To provide 
a public comment 
at 5:30, click on the 
“Raise Hand” option. 
You will be called in 
the order received. 
Remarks should be 
limited to 3 minutes 
or less and relevant 
to a topic on the 
agenda. If there are 
questions, follow up 
will occur after the 
meeting. 

View the meeting live, 
there will be a link on 
the Bend Park and 
Recreation Face-
book page

For more information 
email Sheila Reed 
sheilar@bendpark-
sandrec.org 

Legal Notice
NW Self Storage – 

March 24, 2021 Bid-
ding begins March 
17, 2021 at www.ibid-
4storage.com All ve-
hicles in auction list-
ings are not included 
in the sale and will 
be towed separately: 
100 SE 3 rd St, Bend 
ends at 12:30 pm: 
0C104 Lesle Cortes, 
00B54 Darrin Hill, 
0C207 Skylar Pat-
terson-Miller. 150 
SW Industrial Way, 
Bend ends at 2:00 
pm: 313 Timothy Di-
pietro. 62939 N Hwy 
97, Bend ends at 
2:00 pm: 2065 Karen 
Monnier.

Legal Notice
LEGAL NOTICE 
TO INTERESTED 

PERSONS
NOTICE IS HERE-

BY GIVEN that the 
undersigned has 
been appointed Per-
sonal Representa-
tive of the Estate of 
Candice L. Harvey, 
Deceased, by the 
Deschutes Coun-
ty Circuit Court of 
the State of Oregon 

Legal Notices &

Public Notices
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the State of Oregon 
probate number 
21PR0133 l. All per-
sons having claims 
against the Estate 
are required to pres-
ent them, with prop-
er vouchers, within 
four ( 4) months after 
the date of �rst pub-
lication of this notice 
to the undersigned 
or the claims may be 
barred. 

All persons whose 
rights may be affect-
ed by the proceed-
ings may obtain ad-
ditional information 
from the records of 
the Court, the un-
dersigned or the 
attorneys for the un-
dersigned.

DATED and �rst pub-
lished Feb. 27, 2021.

WAYNE T. HARVEY
c/o Brent S. Kinkade
Karnopp Petersen LLP
360 SW Bond Street, 

Suite 400
Bend, Oregon 97702
TEL: (541) 382-3011
FAX: (541) 388-5410
Of Attorneys for Per-

sonal Representa-
tive

Legal Notice
NOTICE TO INTER-

ESTED PERSONS
In Case # 20PB05946 

the Circuit Court of 
the State of Ore-
gon, for the County 
of Deschutes, has 
appointed Ryan 
O’Toole as Person-
al Representative 
of the Estate of 
Betty Jean Boyd, 
deceased. All per-
sons having claims 
against said es-
tate are required to 
present the same, 
with proper vouch-
ers, to the Personal 
Representative at 
the address below 
within four months 
from the date of �rst 
publication of this 
notice as stated be-
low or they may be 
barred. All persons 
whose rights may be 
affected by this pro-
ceeding may obtain 
additional informa-
tion from the records 
of the court, the 
Personal Represen-
tative, or the Attor-
ney for the Personal 
Representative.

Dated and �rst pub-
lished February 27, 
2021.

Ryan O’Toole, Per-
sonal Representa-
tive, c/o Matthew G. 
Matrisciano, OSB 
084131, MGM Law 
Firm LLC, 869 NW 
Wall St, Ste 203, 
Bend, OR 97703, 
541-233-7441, fax: 
541-610-1585

/s/ Matthew G. Ma-
trisciano

MATTHEW G. MA-
TRISCIANO, OSB# 
084131

Attorney for Personal 
Representative

Legal Notices &

Public Notices
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Legal Notice
NOTICE TO INTER-

ESTED PERSONS
LAURA A. PELL and 

REBECCA PARKE 
PELL have been ap-
pointed Co-Person-
al Representatives 
of the ESTATE OF 
EVELYN C. SRIG-
LEY, Deceased, by 
the Circuit Court, 
State of Oregon, 
Deschutes County, 
under Case Num-
ber 21PB01481. All 
persons having a 
claim against the 
estate must present 
the claim within four 
months of the �rst 
publication date of 
this notice to Brin-
ich & Bertalan, LLP, 
at 250 NW Franklin 
Ave, Ste 101, Bend, 
Oregon 97703, Attn: 
Lisa N. Bertalan, or 
they may be barred.  
Additional informa-
tion may be obtained 
from the court re-
cords, the Personal 
Representative or 
the following-named 
attorney for the Per-
sonal Representa-
tive. DATE OF FIRST 
P U B L I C AT I O N : 
March 6, 2021.

Brinich & Bertalan, 
LLP 250 NW Frank-
lin Ave, Ste 101

Bend, OR  97703
541-382-4980

Legal Notice
The Circuit Court of 

the State of Oregon 
for the County of 
Deschutes, Probate 
Department, has 
appointed Sheree 
T. Loui as Person-
al Representative 
of the Estate of 
Eleanor Ah Choy 
Hung, deceased, in 
Case Number 21-
PB01239. All per-
sons having claims 
against said estate 
are required to pres-
ent the same to the 
Personal Represen-
tative c/o Estana 
Law Group, LLC, 
2685 NW Crossing 
Drive, Bend, OR 
97703, within four 
months from the date 
of �rst publication of 
this notice as stated 
below, or they may 
be barred. All per-
sons whose rights 
may be affected by 
this proceeding may 
obtain additional 
information from 
the records of the 
court, the Personal 
Representative, or 
the attorneys for the 
Personal Represen-
tative. Dated and �rst 
published February 
27, 2021.

Call The Bulletin At 

541-385-5809  

Place Your Ad or E-Mail 

At: www.bendbulletin.com

NEED TO SELL A

VEHICLE?

Call The Bulletin
and place an ad

today! Ask about our 
special deals for  

private party  
advertisers.

541-385-5809

Where 

buyers 
meet 

sellers

in print and online

To place your ad, visit 

www.bendbulletin.com 

or call 541-385-5809
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Sudoku 
High Fives

How to play:

Sudoku High Fives 

consists of � ve reg-

ular Sudoku grids 

sharing one set of 

3-by-3 boxes. Each 

row, column and set 

of 3-by-3 boxes must 

contain the numbers 

1 through 9 without 

repetition. The num-

bers in any shared 

set of 3-by-3 boxes 

apply to each of the 

individual Sudokus. 

@ 20132013 UFS, Dist. by Univ. Uclick for UFS

LAST WEEK’S SOLUTION

To place your photo ad, visit us online at 

www.bendbulletin.com 

or call with questions,

541-385-5809

Sell your stuff fast.
In print and online with the Bulletin’s Classifieds.

Sell your stuff faster with color. FOR JUST ADDITIONAL $1 PER DAY!
BEFORE

FORD F150 XL 2005. This truck can 

haul it all Extra Cab, 4x4, and a tough 

V8 engine will get the job done on 

the ranch.

AFTER

FORD F150 XL 2005. This truck can 

haul it all Extra Cab, 4x4, and a tough 

V8 engine will get the job done on 

the ranch.


