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engineer nau post as near as
possible to eacn end of said im-
provement a copy of this resolu-
tion, the Wednesday following
adoption of this resolution.

IT IS FURTHER RESOLVED
that all persons aggrieved by
this resolution who wish to ob-

ject or remonstrate must file
their objections or remonstrance
with the City Recorder within
15 days of the publication and
posting of this resolution. Objec-
tions and remonstrances not
timely filed will be disregard-
ed.

IT IS FURTHER RESOLVED
that objections or remonstranc-
es timelv filed will be heard at
City Hall in the City of Bend
at 7:45 p.m. o'clock on the 4th
day or September, 1963.

READ and placed upon its
passage this 7th day of August,
1963.

YEAS: 7 NAYS: 0
Leon Devereaux,
Mayor Pro Tern

ATTEST:
Julia S. Johnson.
Recorder of the City of Bend.

212--

RESOLUTION NO. 766
RESOLUTION DIRECTINO

LOCAL IMPROVEMENT
WHEREAS, the owners or

contract purchasers of over 50
per cent of the property com-
prising the proposed improve-
ment district nave petitioned the
City Commission of the City of
Bend to create such a district
for the purpose of making a lo-

cal improvement; and the City
Engineer having estimated the
total cost of such improvement;
and the City Commission hav-
ing found such an estimate sat-
isfactory and having determined
that It is necessary and expedi
ent that said district be formed
and said improvement made,

NOW, THEREFORE. IT IS
HEREBY RESOLVED that Lo-

cal Improvement District No.
363 be created comprising the
property, excluding public ways,
within the following boundaries:

Lots One (1) to Seven (71,
Inclusive, Block Ten (10),
Northwest Townsite Com-
pany's First Addition:
Lots Nine (9) to Sixteen
(16), Inclusive, Block Nine
(9) , Northwest Townsite
Company's First Addition;
and
Lot Two (2), Block Ten
(10) , Keystone Terrace Ad-
dition

for the following Improvement:
Improvement of East Burnside
Avenue from a point 12.0 feet
west of the east line of E. Fifth
Street to a mint 10 0 feet oast
of the west line of East Sixth
Street with asphaltic concrete
pavement 36 feet in width,
curbs and such other work as
will make a finished Improve-
ment, for the total estimated
cost of $10,110.39, to be paid as
follows: County's share: $2,987 --

88, City's share: $3,922.51 and
Property owners' share,

IT IS FURTHER RESOLVED
that the City Recorder cause
this resolution to be published
In The Bulletin, and the City
Engineer shall post as near as
nnartihle tn each end of said Im
provement a copy of this resolu
tion, the Wednesday louowing
nrtnntlnn of this resolution.

if IS FURTHER RESOLVED
that all persons aggrieved by
this resolution wno wisn to ob-

ject or remonstrate must file
tneir oDjections or remonsu am.-- -

es witn tne uty ecoraer wiui-i- n

is Hnvs of the miblicatlon and
posting 'of this resolution. Objec
tions ana rcmonsurBiivea nut
timely filed will be disregarded.

IT IS FURTHER RESOLVED
that objections or remonstranc-c- s

timely filed will be heard at
Citv Hall in the City of Bend
at 7:45 o'clock P.M. on the 4th
dav of September. 1963.

Read and piacea upon 1 1 s
passage this 7th day of August,
1963

YEAS: T NAYS: 0
Leon Devereaux,
Mayor Pro Tern

ATTEST:
Julia S. Johnson,
Recorder of the City of Bend.
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SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT

OF THE STATE OF OREGON
FOR THE COUNTY OF DES
CHUTES.
DONALD LYNN STMONSEN
and BERN1CE C. SIMONSEN,
Plaintiffs,
ALFREnV. DAVIS. JERRY
J. L1BBY. ALBERT E. SUN-

SHINE, SAM R. CHROMAN
and BARRY RAPPAPORT, De
fendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE
STATE OF OREGON, you are
hereby required to appear in
the above entitled Court and
Cause within 30 days from the
date of the first publication of
this Summons upon you and
answer or otherwise plead to
the Complaint of the plaintiffs
herein, and if you tail ior want
thereof, the plaintiffs will take
judgment against you for the re-

lief prayed for in the Complaint,
t: Judgment against the

defendants for the sum of 0.

with interest thereon at
the rate of 6 per cent per an-

num from May 21. 1962. for the
further sum of $1245.00 attor-
ney's fees and for their costs
and disbursements incurred
herein; and for a further decree
determining that said mortgage
as set out in Exhibit A be fore-
closed In this suit, that the prop-
erty described therein be sold
at a public sale under execution
in the manner provided bv law
and the proceeds thereof be ap-

plied first to the costs of the
sale, second to the costs and ex
penses of this suit, including at
torney s fees, third to we pay-
ment of this judgment, and the
balance, if any, to be paid over
to the defendants as their inter-
est mav aorjcar. and in the
event said premises shall not
sell for an amount sufficient to
pay the costs of this suit, attor-
ney's fees, and this said judg-
ment, that plaintiffs be award-
ed a deficiency Judgment
against the defendants for any
sucn deficiency, together with
such other and further relief as
to the Court seems just.

This Summons is served uron
you by oubllcation in the Bulle
tin, a newspaper of general cir-
culation, published daily In
Bend, Deschutes County, Ore

PAINTING KITCHEN $35. Liv--

ing Room $35. Bedroom $35.
Bath SIS. Exterior Painting.
Also Commercial.

Harper 2

ALTERATIONS, Sewing, fab--

Drics, notions, a a.m. to 6 p.m.
Closed Wednesday. Edna's Sew
Shop, 431 S. 8rd.

BRICK BLOCK -- .,ng. all kinds,
icnimneys, fireplaces, walls,
pillars, smaller houses). Rea-
sonable, good work. After 7:36
p.m. 136 Florida.

MIKE'S ELECTRIC

REPAIRS: Washer, dryer, freez
er, refers, water heaters, furn-
aces. ALL MAKES. EV

DAVENPORT
MATTRESS & UPHOLSTERY
Where you buy better, and pay
less. 1164 Harriman. right be-
hind Courthouse.

DRESSMAKING AND altera
tions. Reasonable rates, satis-
faction guaranteed. Mrs. Frier,

WANTED: Yard and lawn Jobs.
by hour or contract. No J o b
too small. Free estimates.
Bend Outdoor Grooming Serv-
ice. extension 2.

FIRE HAZARDS
Reduce 'm with weed and grass
control,

TVTCTrrT. illAOMivnmauvt TTnittsmvy
Spider mites and aphids here
nuw. jrour tree una
shrubs. Spray.

FURNITURE REFINISH1NG
Work guaranteed. 1

MUSSON'S REF1NISHING
EXTERIOR Painting, contract
or hour, Reasonable. Harper,

BEVS REWEAVING, now next
to Tom Tom Drive Inn. Free
estimates.

STANLEY HOME PRODUCTS
Marilyn Bull
EXPERT TV & Radio Repair

Service Call onlv $3.50
Jim's TV Service
IRONING DONE in my home.
Very reasonable.

ELECTRIC HEATING
Complete electric heating serv
ice, installation and ropairs.
Any make electric heater.

BILL'S ELECTRIC

942 Hill St. 1

PAINTING
Pickups $35.00

Clean urt lob Enamel
438 Heyburn
PAINTING DONE. Reasonable
rates. Anderson

Sup.-Con- t.

Beautify Your Yard
with a

FENCE
with materials

from Miller Lumber

Build your own fence-- 5 ft. high
and luu It. long-a- u tne ma.
terials.

13-- 7' cedar posts
500 bd. ft. Vs'-xe-

Hough Cedar Fencing
100 lin. ft. 2x4

complete

73c
per lineal ft.

Now... at Miller's
( ft. long cedar

GRAPE STAKES
for use In fencing, bean or

sweet pea climbing poles, etc.

10c ea.

MILLER LUMBER

COMPANY
Thriftway Store & Yard

1 Greenwood 1

for Sale
FOR SALE: Used household ap--

nances ana lurnuura. Also
oat, motor and trailer. Custom

made camper, saddle and pan'els for pickup. See at 534 Pine
Street, Madras, or call

VVESTSIDE 2ND HAND
725 Columbia off Galveston
5 Used Furn. & Misc.

TOP SOIL, fill dirt, dump truck.
tractor loader work, excava-
tions. 1.

NOW H Beef 45c lb., cut to
order klis, f reezers all
sizes, 10 year warantee. It
pays to shop here for com-

plete freezer food supplies. AU

locally financed. Midstate Meat
Co..

FOR RAWLEIGH Products call
382-- 1 094.

FOR THE best deal on "earth"
call Uirrv Crawford
Top soil, fill dirt, cinders, trac-
tor work.

Powr-Kra- ft

POWER TOOLS

and others.
Take vour choice at

29.95
MONTGOMERY

WARD
1032 Bond St 1

REFRIGERATOR type air con-
ditioner. Nmrly new. Cost $169.
Want $50 cash. 428 S. 4th,
Prlneville. Call

QUICK CAR washrnobile, extra
income, station or garage use.

ARTLEY FLUTE. Conn clarinet
B flat. $65 each. Two

size 6 and
8. $4.50 each.

table model TV, $35.

FOR SALE: Shop Smith saw in
gooo conanion wnn attach
ments,

Furniture
KELVIN ATOR Deluxe 2 oven
range. $175. Ase Rice,

FOR SALE by private party.
Frigidaire electric stove. M.w.
refrigerator, M.W, wringer
washer, wt-v-

WE'RE LOADED with used
ranges, and were practically
giving mem away. Most all
makes and models to choose
from including Frigidaire, Hot-poi-nt

and many others. They're
all reconditioned and guaran
teed to give you the best of
service. Prices start as low as
$29.50. Stop in and take a look
today! Oregon Equipment
Company, 165 East Greenwood.

CHEST TYPE freeier. No down
payment, O.A.C, $5.00 per
month. Ken Cale Hardware,
Third & Greenwood.

BARGAIN TREE
Everything New & Used

Complete Home Furnishings
Buy-Se- ll or Trade I

J & M Furniture
THE BIG GREEN STORE
1854 N. 1st.
lust 3 blks. No. Pioneer Park
PHILIPPINE RATTAN dining
set. 6 pieces, table top Is PhiU
ipplne mahogany chairs
beautifully upholstered.

Prinevtlle.
A Group of 4 used

ZIG-ZA- G

Sewing Machines
Priced to soil at

$39.95 ea.
This week only

SINGER

SEWING CENTER
126 Minn. 2

Instruments
UPRIGHT PIANO $115 or make
Offer.

FOR SALE: One Silverlone
electronic chord and spinet or-
gan with bench, 1 year old.

Prinevillo.
WE DON'T meet "competition."

we maxe hi ntop in and see.
Hcmmingson Piano & Organ
Service, South 97, Museum
Bldg.,

Column
BUY, SELL or trade all types
horses. Wanted, chicken feed,
horses. Madras S or

FOR RENT: 80 acres of pas
ture tor came or sneep.
or

FOR SALE: Electric cream
separater,

SADDLES - repairing. Reed's
saddle Shop, 1142 Galveston.

REGISTERED WELL trained
quarter horse for sale. Will
take beef on trade.

FOR SALE: Good horse hay. aV
so annua in tne stacK. 3z-tt2t-

Horses
GENTLE MARE, eood with

children. Stenkamp Road, 2nd
house on right.

TWENTY-FIV- E head good Here- -
lord neiters. uien Brenner, two
nines soumwest oi Aiiaiiastore.

SIX HEAD of Guernsey cattle
and 4 springer heifers, 1 llol-stei- n

bull, u Haifa hay and oat
nay. .itv-i.- ) evenings.

THREE YEAR old sorrel geld.
nig to tratio ior nay,

MAKES, COLTS, geldings. Some
oroKen. All breeds, itegislereo
Appaloosa stallion, 5 years old,
well marked, color on 90 per
cent oi cons, rire s spec.
Dave Pick, phone
nramnna.

SMALL GENTLE well bred 2
year old, green broke, bay fil-

ly.
FOR SALE 2 good gentle sad
dle norses. ;iz-(i7-

Rabbits
BEND EGG & POULTRY

WHOLESALE Eggs, chickens,
turkeys, Custom poultry killing.
Poultry received Monday thru
Friday. 740 E. First.

Pets, Etc.
VACATION BOARDING, DOGS
AND CATS. Puppies, poodles,
chihuahua, fox terriers ana
pekes. Also Siamese kittens.
Ranch Pet Kennels.

TOWN AND Country Pet Shop.
Boarding nenneis. ssz-j-

TO OIVE away Manx cat with
small kitten, 4 or Box
51, LaPine.

& Motors
THIRTEEN FOOT Enduracraft
boat, 35 hp. Mercury and
Mastnrcraft trailer. $795.

Column
FOhD ton pickup camper,

194!). $295

USED CAMPER. $500. Red-
mond Route 1, Box 202,

RIFLE Remington 0 Sav-

age, extra clip and pad, never
used. 3 after 5 p.m.

NEW CASCADE pickup camp-
ers. Also will custom build to
your specifications.

to Buy
MONEY AVAILABLE

Want to purchase first mort-
gages and sales contracts at a
discount. Write The Bulletin Box
201-- Bend. Ore.

TWENTY FOOT or 30' trailer to
buy or rent.

l, Coal, Wood, Oil
GET WINTER wood now. Jack,

pine M2.S0. Body wood 112.00.

to Rent
THREE OR 4 bedroom modern

house in Bend by September
15th. Take lease to November
15. 1964 .

WANTED 3 or 4 bedroom home
immediately, up to $125 month.

WANT TO rent 2 or 3 bedroom
home, near schools, or near
school bus line.

Board
WANTED ROOM and board for
2 senior high bovs. Write L.
Deadmond, P.O. Box 276, Sil-
ver Lake, Oregon,

SLEEPING! ROOM, men only.
J wo blocks from town, 3 Irv-
ing.

for Rent
"RIVER TERRACE"

One & two bedroom very clean.
spacious grounds, js.so to tm
mo. Call manager

Furnished
UPSTAIRS Apartment, week or
montn, launory faculties. 382--

CLEAN 1 bedroom, good loca.
Uon, garbage, cable, water fur--

rraniuin, s3--
0387

SMALL NICE upstairs aoart--
menl. No children or pets. 3.

CLEAN 2 bedroom, some util
ities furnished, $65.

TWO BEDROOM, close In, auto.
matic gas neat. 412 Hill Street

LOW RENTALS, clean furnish.
ea i and 2 bedroom apart-ments. Private yards. $40 and
up. Hill's Apartments, R e d--
mono. Ore. Phone

ONE BEDROOM, water, heat.
Kniuagc pma. inquire lrvmgApts., Apt, 4, 160 Irving.

for Rent
NEARLY NEW 2 bedroom du- -
plex, attached garage. Avail-
able Sept. 1st. $96.50.

Space
STORE BUILDING
AVAILABLE SOON

for rental or lease. Excellent
location on East Greenwood
across from Eastern Oregon
Mills, Inquire at 137 East
Greenwood or Call

GILBERT'S INSURANCE AGCY
mis wall 2

Looking for a earr Check Clas
sification No. 100 for best results.

Opportunities
SALE OR lease corner proper

ty on mgnway au next to
Bush's Grocery, has S trailer
spaces, all utilities, nothingdown. $25 monthly. P.O. Box
72. Sisters, Oregon.

Estate Wanted
SMALL Undeveloped acreage

wanted. Bend or Sisters area.
Write care The Bulletin Box
731A.

& Acreages
TEN ACRES, 6 acres water.

new cistern and power In, soma
outbuildings. 9 or 6.

COMFORTABLE 3 bedroom
country home. Wired for range,
washer and dryer. 8 acres, 5
of COI. Two cisterns, barn and

Mountain view, Closofiarage. owner. $10,900. $2,500
down. Call or

FOR SALE: 10 acres on river.
5 water, river - mountain view,

FOR SALE: 20 acres, 15 water,
no buildings.

TEN ACRES, 6 acres SwaUer
water. All fenced. On Highway
97 north. Nearly new 3 bedroom
home. Fireplace, oak floors,
electric heat. Two storage
buildings. Double garage. Ben5
School District.

80-Fe- Estate for Sal
BY OWNER: New home, 3 bed
room, 2 baths, large stone fire-
place, hardwood floors, double
garage. Lawn in. Kenwood
Gardens, west side, near
schools and new college site.

or
FOUR BEDROOM stone house.
Large yard with pines and pop-
lar trees. i mile city limits,
city water. Irrigation pond, 5
acres land. 5 acres water,
barn, corral, mountain view.
$18,700.

Located on

Mirror Pond
Lovely older 4 bedroom home

facing Mirror Pond. Choice
location on Riverside Drive.

Living room with fireplace, din

Ing room, kitchen, utility room.
2 bedrooms and bath upstairs.
2 bedrooms and bath down
stairs. Double garage. Full

basement. One of Arnia t top-not- ch

eneluslvei. Price only
$16,500.

Arnie

Swarens
Town & Country

Realty
601 E. Greenwood Ave.

Evenines
Rick RIckabauEh 0

Jim Arntz
Arnie 5

VERN LARSON
Real Estate And Appraiser

1496 CJuincy Ave., 7 Bend

NEW L1STINO S Bedrooms,
electric hest, west side, newly
decorated. Perfect for GI. Only
$8,000.

A 3 BEDROOM LOVELY with
l"i baths, ceramic tile kitchen
and bath, large living room,
wall to wall carpet, electria
heat, patio, rustle. East Side.
"PRICED RIGHT at $17,350.
$15,000 CI loan available and
of course FHA.

A good ihingler could make a
nice home out of this 2 BR
home, only $3850.

fA poem: Sorry for you. I
sold the $15.3)

Qualified buyer wants S BR.
14 bauif for about $13,060. If
YOU have a home like this
for sale please call Vera.

OIVE VERN A TRY
BEFORE YOU BUY

SUMMONS
CASE NO. 12115

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT
OF THE STATE OF OREGON
IN AND FOR THE COUNTY OF
DESCHUTES.

DAVID GERIG and ELLEN
I. GERIG, husband and wife,
and LILYAN KAY, Plaintiffs,

VS.
JANE DOE BRUNING, also

known as Mrs. Robert K. Brun-in-

and also any other person
or persons unknown claiming
any right, title, estate, lien or
interest in the real estate de-
scribed in the Complaint herein,
and all other unknown heirs or
devisees of any such person or
persons, wno may now De de-
ceased, Defendants.

TO: JANE DOE BRUNING,
aka Mrs. Robert K. Bruning,
and also any other person or
persons unknown claiming any
right, title, estate, lien or inter-
est in the real estate described
in the Complaint herein, and all
other unknown heirs or devisees
of any such person or persons,
who mav now be deceased, DE-
FENDANTS,

IN THE NAME OF THE
STATE OF OREGON: You. and
each of you, are required to ap-

pear and answer the Complaint
filed against you In the above
entitled court and cause on or
before the last day prescribed
in the Order for Publication ol
Summons herein, and if you fail
so to appear and answer for
want thereof Plaintiffs will ap- -
Dly to tne court for tne re-i- ef

demanded in the Complaint,
i succinct statement of which
Is as follows:

That the Defendants be com-
pelled to plead and set forth the
nature of their several claims
and interests in the real prop
erty described as tonows, ior
the purposes of submitting the
same to the judicial determina-
tion of the above entitled Court:

The North half of Section 25,
Township 15 South, Range
10 West of the Willamette
Meridian, in Deschutes
County, Oregon.

That all adverse claims of
said Defendants, and each and
all of them, may be determined
bv a Decree of this Court, and
by said Decree it be ccr.r.lrtercd,
declared and adjudged that the
Plaintiffs are the owners in fee
simple, of said Dremiscs. and
that none of the Defendants have
any right, title, estate, hen or
Interest in or to the same, or
any portion thereof, and that the
Defendants be, and each of
them be. forever barred and en
joined from asserting any claim
or right wnatsocver in or to sam
premises or any portion thereof
adverse to the Plaintiffs.

For such other and further re
lief as the Court may deem meet
and proper, the Plaintiffs not
demanding a judgment for costs
against the Defendants or any
of them.

This Summons is oublished
pursuant to an Order of the
above entitled Court, made and
entered on the 22nd day of July
1963. and said Order orescribed
the time of publication as once
a week for four successive
weeks, and prescribed the date
or tne rirst puoiication as tne
31st day of July, and the date
or tne last puoiicauon as tne
zotn flay or August, hum.

Thomas B. Swanton
Attorney for Plaintiffs
530 N. Broadway,
Coos Bay. Oregon

of Thanks
WE WISH to express our heart-
felt thanks to all who extended
comforting sympathy and help
in our recent sorrow. For the
beautiful service, floral offer-
ings and other kindnesses we
are deeply grateful.
The Glenn Davis Family

Notices
ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS

For Information call
or Redmond

& Found
LOST WOMEN'S prescription
eve glasses, Drown irame.

Sitters
WANTED BABY sitter to live
in, 8 or

Trkng, Storage
SAVE 50 OR MORE

Rent New Moving Vans From
Avis. We Furnish Kverything.

But The Driver
AVIS SYSTEM
Bend 1

Wanted
ATTENTION: Man or woma-n-
quality for Rawlclgh business
in Bend or Deschutes County.
Should be 25 or over. Manyearn $2.75 to $3 hourly and up.
Part time considered. Write
Rawlcigh. 306 Adeline, Oak-
land. Calif., 91607.

p Wanted Male
IMMEDIATE opening for tire
service salesman with off the
road experience. Commercial
and passenger tire experience
also desirable. Permanent po-
sition, good wages. liberal
fringe benefits. No phone calls.
Applv in person onlv. Snoop &
Schu'l.e. 1291 Wall Street.

MANAGER'S ASSISTANT

WILL TRAIN

I need a man to train for a
future manager's position, as
my last assistant has been pro-
moted. Must be 21 or over and
have a car. Apply In person,
O'Kane Building. 115 Oregon
Avenue, Bend, between 10 and
10:30 a.m.. Thursday, August
15. Room 17.

p Wanted Female
WANTED BABY sitter in my

home. 8:30 a m to 4:30 D.m.
Preferably COC student. 382.
5666 after 5 p.m.

BABYSITTER Wanted. To live
in, or nights.

EXPERIENCED motel maids
wanted. Pilot Butte Motor
Court.

WOMEN WANTED
To demonstrate sensational new

WONDER . EASE HOME
GYMM in Central Oregon area.
New car furnished after thor
ough training. Call 382--
1518 or write 1210 Jones Road.
Bend. State manager her this
week..

tcresting to know what is going
on, it seemed remarkable to
learn that this subject was of
more current interest to the resi-

dents of that city than other top-
ics.

Anyway, there were some more
shots of pretty girls, one In

slacks, and there was a look at
London's cozy mews cottages
and once again, it almost ap-

peared that we were in for an
ingenious method of tackling the
real subject at hand. But then we
were informed by a British editor
that if there is one thing that
sums up London's problems (pre-
sumably in the architectural
area), it is Piccaddilly Circus
and once again we were light
miles from the main topic of con-

versation on the Thames.

Finally, we had a pleasant visit
to the nightclub of satire, "The
Establishment." And there was
an excellent, viciously humorous

n skit by David Frost,
young host of the acclaimed Brit-
ish television satire show, "This
Was The Week That Was." He
was razor-shar- as an upper-clas- s

British gentleman defending
by saying: "Fox hunt-

ing is the only effective way of

killing fox." Anyway, the show
ended shortly thereafter, and
Frost and reporter Joseph C.

Harsch were so amiable and
adept that one almost forgot that
the major topic of conversation in
London this summer was missing.

The Channel Swim: Writer Ben
Hocht and actress Janet Leigh
visit NBC-TV'- s "Today" show
next Tuesday. Same day, CBS-TV- 's

"Talent Scouts" offers An-

thony Newly, Paul Anka, Hermi-on- e

Gingold, Liberace and Hugh
Downs as the introd:cers of new

professional entertainers.
AU three video networks arc

planning heavy live coverage of

the scheduled Aug. 28 "March on

Washington" which is aimed at
gaining support for President
Kennedy's civil rights bill. . .A
number of same-da- y spot news
specials on the march are in
prospect, too.

Actor John Gavin will star in
a planned one-ho- ABC-T- se-

ries, "Destry," based on the fa-

mous oldtime movie "Destry
Rides Again," a Western with
Jimmy Stewart and Marlene Die-

trich. . .Tentative scheduling has
the series on the 1964-6- slate, if

it makes it.
NBC-T- tills season will air two

r specials dealing with

uniquely American themes. . .The

first, "American Spectacle,"
about natural wonders of the land
and narrated by Van Heflin, is

listed for March 20. . .The other,
"The Red, White and Blue," will

be about patriotism Its past and
what has happened to it: this pro-

gram is set for June or July.

THE BULLETIN
CLASSIFIFD

ADVERTISING
RATE SCHEDULE

2 lines for 1 time only S1.25
2 lines for 4 times only $1.75
2 lines for 8 times onlv $3.00
4 lines for 1 time onlv $1.75
4 lines for 4 times only $2.75
4 lines for 8 times onlv $4.75
6 lines for 1 time only S2.25
6 lines for 4 times onlv $3.75
6 lines for 8 times onlv $6.50

THE BULLETIN
SUBSCRIPTION

RATES
By Carrier

One Month fl.50
Six Months SJ.OO

One Year
By Mail

One Month SI M

Three Months $4.00
Six Months S7.50
One Year SH-5-

FOR CIRCULATION SERVICE

in Redmond 1

In Bend, The Bulletin

In Pnneville
Mrs. Gary Stephens 0

Membtr, Audit Bureau of

Circulations
rhe Bend Bulletin (Weekly)

The Bend Bulletin
(Daily) Est. 1916. Published
Every Afternoon except sundavs
and certain holidays by The
Bend Bulletin Inc. 8 Wall

St., Bend, Oregon.

LOST?
Clauified Ad

INDfclX
To Buy. Sell. . .Trade

Apartments rr k.nl
APPltanMvfurnltur
Aortfofl ............
Apartments Komlshsd
AubiS Vnt Imls ...
Elicit rnr Ssfcs

ashy Sitter
Hiats Mnttirs
Hiralness Oppurtonlttssl .....
Buildlnt Umtraruir
ffcrrj rrl Tkanka
Urmtrart
Ifcws. rets. eto.
ltmeue Service
Ksrms. Acreages
tsrmers (.Mumn
farm Marhlner
reeds Seeds t
rtral. Oral. Hoot. Oil
Fuel Wanted
t'uneral Direefflr
runeral Service
funeral Notice ...
Help Wanted
Help Wanted, PAnssla ......
Help w anted. Mai
House Trailer ....
Hoosekeeptns Knnms
Homes For Kent
Instractten-VboaU- i .....
In Memortam
Iral ffnttce
UrestACI
Lost a round
Lou M RnlMrn Sites .
Livestock Pt anted
Leans ..
Hsehtnerr Tor nal
stachlnerr Wanted

By Rick Du Rrow
UPI Staff Writer

HOLLYWOOD (UP1 NBC-T-

"Report From" series
deals with current topics of con-

versation in various major cities,
an you can imagine with what
eagerness I tuned in Tuesday
night's show fron London.

So far as I know, there hat
been only one topic of conversa-
tion in London this summer
and you know what that is. So
1 grabbed a bottle of beer, told
the wife I had some serious work
to do, locked the door to the
study and settled down for a half-ho-

of healthy dissipation, won-

dering what new tack NBC would
take for the saga of Christine,
Mandy, el al.

Well, first off, there was a re-

port on the new "pop art" craze
which apparently is sweeping

fcjndon, and it struck me that
this was an ingenious way to ap-

proach so delicate a subject,
though the category seemed to
be questionable and a matter of
opinion at best.

Several artists discussed their
work, and there were a number
of pretty girls on camera, though
no one you would recognize. We
were told that there is no Bohe-

mia under Prime Minister Harold
MacmiUan's affluent society and
for a moment it seemed we might
be circling in on our subject. But
thai was about as close as we

got. It was most informative to
hear of the "pop ai l," but some-
how there was a vague feeling
that a certain major topic of con-

versation was missing.
Well, next up, there was a re-

port on London's changing archi-
tecture, and while it is always in- -

Ebony names

top influential

U.S. Negroes
CHICAGO (UPD-Ma- rUn Lulh-e- r

King Jr., Jackie Robinson and
James H. Meredith were Included
In the list of 100 most Influential

Negroes named today by Ebony
magazine.

In a special edition commemo-

rating the 100th anniversary of
the Emancipation Proclamation,
Ebony omitted such
Negro iiersonalitics as heavy-
weight boxing champion Charles
(Sonny) Liston. baseball players
Willie Mays and Ernie Banks,
and entertainer Eartha Kitt.

The list of top Negro leaders
was not a popularity poll which

Ebony said Mays, the San Fran-
cisco Giants' e player,
might well head up "hut rath-

er a list of 'participants' in the
strucgle for equality.

Ebony said Mays' and former
heavyweight champion Joe Louis'

"Influence has rarely extended
beyond the diamond or ring."
Ebony said it also excluded
"those celebrities who have let it

he known their professional ca-

reers and the fight for civil rights
"don't mix'."

The list included:

Philadelphia Municipal .Judge

Raymond P. Alexander, singer
Marian Anderson, author James
Baldwin, entertainer Harry Bela-font-

United Nations Undersecre-

tary Ralph Bunche, Manhattan
Rorough President Edward R.

Dudley,
U.S. Circuit Judge William H.

t Hastie: Associate White House

Press Secretary Andrew Hatcher,
Malcolm X and Elihah Muham-me- d

of the Black Muslins, Rep.
Adam C. Powell and

Carl T. Rowan, ambassador to
Finland.

In addition there were a num-

ber of prominent persons from

the business world, the arts, edu-

cation, business and public life.

Navy silent

on Red ships
WASHINGTON (UPO - The

Navy maintained silence today on

reports that 30 Russian fishing
trawlers had been sighted three
or four miles off Cape Cod, Mass.

When told of the report, a Navy

spokesman would say only: "The
seas are free." He pointed out

that no Objection can oe rauea
to the presence of the vessels un-

less there is grounds for com-

plaint.
One Navy officer, commenting

on past activities of the Soviet

trawlers, said it is known that
some of them carry more elabo-

rate electronic gear than could

conceivably be used for fishing

purposes.
The gear might be used for

monitoring communications, or
the flight of missiles off Cape
Canaveral, he said.

BONE CAUSES DEATH

SWINDON. England L'PI

Mrs. Olive Baldwin, 64. died 10

days after chicken bone be-

came lodged in her throat
failed to discover

it, the coroner said Tuesday.

1 Legal Notice
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE DISTRICT COURT
OF THE STATE OF OREGON
FOR THE COUNTY OF DES-
CHUTES

Probate Department
No. 2534

In the Matter of the Estate of
THOMAS EDWARD LEE, De-
ceased.

Notice is hereby given that
the undersigned has been ap-
pointed Executor of the Estate
of Thomas Edward Lee, de-
ceased, by the District Court of
the State of Oregon, for the
County of Deschutes, and has
qualified. All persons having
claims against said estate are
hereby notified to present the
same, duly verified as by law
required, to the undersigned at
the office of the District Court
Clerk, Deschutes County Court-
house, Bend, Oregon, within six
months from the date hereof.

Dated and first published: Ju-
ly 24. 1963.

Last publication: August 14,
1963.

BRUCE KELLY,
Executor

POTTS & DAVIDSON
1225 Yeon Building
Portland 4, Oregon
Attorneys

NOTICE OF SHERIFF'S SALE
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF

THE STATE OF OREGON FOR
THE COUNTY OF DES-
CHUTES

(No. 12036)
METROPOLITAN LIFE IN-

SURANCE COMPANY, a corp-
oration, Plaintiff,

vs.
LARRY GENE MORRISON

and BARBARA IRENE MOR-
RISON, husband and wife, and
EDWARD R. GLAAB and MAR-
IAN F. GLAAB, husband and
wife. Defendants.

By virtue of an execution is-

sued out of the above entitled
Court in the above entitled
cause, to me directed and dated
the 26th day of July, 1963. upon
a decree rendered In said Court
on the 22nd day of July, 1963,
in favor of Metropolitan Life In-
surance Company, plaintiff, and
against defendants Edward R.
Glnnb and Marian F. Glaab,
husband and wife, and each of
them, for the sum of $11,135.62,
with interest thereon at the rate
of 54 per cent per annum from
November 1, 1962, until paid,and the further sum of $35.00,
with Interest thereon at the
rate of 6 per cent per annum
from Anrll 19. 1963. until oald.
and the further sum of $300.00,
and the further sum of $47.45
costs and disbursements, and
the costs of and upon this writ
demanding me to make sale of
tne following described real
property situated in the County
of Deschutes, State of Oregon,

The North half (N'i of Lots
Fifteen (15) and Sixteen
(18) in Block Twentv-sl- x

126) of CENTER ADDITION
TO BEND, Deschutes Coun-t-

Orecon.
NOW, THEREFORE, by vir-

tue of said execution and in
compliance with the command
of said writ, I will, on Wednes-
day, the 11th dav of September.
1963. at 10:00 o'clock A.M. at
the front door of the County
Courthouse in Bend. Deschutes
County, Oregon, sell at public
auction (subject to redemption)
to the highest bidder for cash,
all the right, title and Interest
which the within named defend-
ants and each and all of them in
the above entitled suit had on
the 1st dav of April, I960, the
date of the mortgage herein
foreclosed, or since that date
had in and to the above de-

scribed property or any part
thereof, to satisfy said execu-
tion and decree, interest, costs
and accruing costs.

Dated at Bend. Orecon. this
13th day of August. 1963.

First Publication: August 14,
1963.

Last Publication: September
4, 1963.

FORREST C. SHOLES.
SHERIFF. Deschutes
County, Oregon

RESOLUTION NO. 765
RESOLUTION DIRECTING

LOCAL IMPROVEMENT
WHEREAS, the owners or con-

tract purchasers of over 50 per
cent of the property comprising
the proposed improvement dis-

trict have petitioned the City
Commission of the City of Bend
to create such a district for the
purpose of making a local im-

provement; and the City Engi-
neer having estimated the total
cost of such improvement; and
the City Commission having
found such an estimate satis-
factory and having determined
that it is necessary and expedi-
ent that said district be formed
and said improvement made,

NOW. THEREFORE, IT IS
HEREBY RESOLVED that Lo-
cal Improvement District No.
364 be created comprising the
property, excluding public ways,
withtn the following boundaries:

Lots Five (5i to Twelve
(12i, Inclusive, Block Nine
'9 1. Keystone Terrace Ad.
dition:
Lots One (1 and Two (2).
Block Ten '101, Kevstone
Terrace Addition; and
Lots Five i5 to Twelve
(12i, Inclusive. Block Nine
'9. Northwest Townsite
Company's First Addition

for the following Improvement:
Improvement of East Fifth
Street from a point 12.0 feet
south of the north line of East
Burnside Avenue to a point 15.0
feet north of the south line of
East Clay Avenue with asphal-ti- c

concrete pavement 36 feet
in width, curbs and such other

cr!; as will make a finished
improvement
for the total estimated cost of
$5,841.81, to be paid as follows:

Countv of Deschutes $1,528 45

Citv of Bend $2,393 36

Property Assessment $1,920,00
IT IS FURTHER RESOLVED

that the Citv Recorder cause
l this resolution to be published

gon, pursuant to an oraer made
and entered heroin on the 29th
day of Julv, 1963, by Honorable
Joe Thalhofer, Circuit Judge
pro tern, which order requires
that you appear and answer or
otherwise plead herein within
thirty days from the data of the
first publication of this Sum-
mons.

Date of first publication: July

I


