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Every Part of the Art of

L A U N D H R I N O
has Hail Our Careful 

Attention

It is our business, so it 
is necessary that we use 
the very best and latest 
methods to turn out the 
best work possible

Our eervice is at your command. 
If you are not already a customer 
we would be glad to add you to 
our host of satisfied patrone.

COQUILLE UUNDHÏ S ICE CO.
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war j
sec i

Str. Elizabeth
Regular as the Clock

San Francisco 
a n d  Bandon

First-class fare only............ $7.50
Up freight, per ton 3.00

E. &  E. T. Kruse
24 California Street, San Francisco

For Reservations

J. E. NORTON
Agents, Coquille, Oregon

$1000 FREE
IF I FAIL TO CURE any CANilER or TUMOR
POOR CURED  AT HALF P il lC E  OR IrREE

NO KNIFE. OR PAIN 
NO PAY UNTIL CURED |
b, GUARANTEE. N o  X
Hay or other swindle
WRITTEN GUARANTEE
3-d i iy  painless plaster 
A N Y  T U M O R .  LU M P  
or SORE on the LIP, FACE 
or hody long is CANCER.
It Never Pains Until Last 
Stage. 120-PAGE BOCK 
•cut free;  testimonials
o f THOUSANDS C U R E DAny lump "’Woman's Breast
I BELIEVE IS ALWAYS CANCER, and ALWAYS poison* 

deep glands in the armpit and K I L L S  Q U IC K L Y  
I swear m s  have C U R E D  lO .O O O . Go see some

Old Dr & Mrs. CHAMLEY ¡¿ ¿UBT° M
“ MOST SUCCESSFUL CANCEA SPECIALISTS IIVINO’ *

A B 436 Valencia St.. SAN FRANCISCO. CAL. 
KINDLY MAIL this to someone with CANCER
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Fi rewood

ec 19, 23 & 26, twp 
$1.00

Warren G. Shaw et al to Lettio Ritch­
ie, q c de d ot p 23 A 24 A lots 7 & 8, b!k 

; 43, North Herd, *1.
Fast Mai ah field Land Co to Newman 

Moon, war deed lots 1 & 2, blk 52, A lot 
j 20, blk 50, Fast Marshfield, $100.

C A Smith et ux to Win I) (Mark, q c 
deed, lots I <k 5, i lk 26, it lois 18 i<c 19,

I It k 41, Railroad a id to Marshfield $1.
J F Node et ux to Lucy Anthony, war 

deed lot 25, blk 80, western add to 
Marsh field, $250.

Frank M Mai buffer et ux to David 
Ne son, war deed lots 17, 18 & 19, blk 8, 
Weft Bunker Hill add to Marshfield $1.

Reynolds Development Co to John 
Kronholm, s war deed lots 29 & 30, blk 
10, first add to Marshfield $050.

Key nobis Development Co to Edwin 
Dolph, s war deed iots 25 A 24, blk 
first add to Marshfield, $000.

John Nielson et ux to A H Post, 
deed w of sw*4 of se1̂  of nw*4.
20, twp 23 s r 14 w w in $10.

March 5, 1914.
T Laskey et ux to R A Cathey, war 

deed lots 21, 22 & 28, blk 18, Sweonev’a 
add to Bandon, $10.

Leon Atnadon et ux to J A Me Keel, 
war deed of nel4 of se1̂ , sec 17, twp 
25 s r 12 w w m, $10.

F C Roberts et ux to L A Roberts, 
war «bed lot 2 A; n b of lot 3. blk 7, 
l < hnheri’s second add to Myrtle Point, 
$ 100.

(no Bellini to Cirij ia Belloni, war 
deed lot 8, see 7 A lotf 1 A 2 & of 
nwl4, aee 18, twp 28 s r 13 w w m, $10.

D P Strang et ux to A F 
war deed s1,. of ne1̂ , 8t c 3, twp 29 s r I
14 w w m, $600.

March «  1914
Reynolds Development Co. to Frank 

W. Black et al S war deed lot 3, blk 19, 
First add to Marshfield, $1225 00

Frank W. Black et ux to Simon An- 
derfon, war deed lot 3, h.k 19, First add 
to Marshfield, 1600.00

J. I>. McNeil et ux to Harry G. Hoy, 
war deed b, interest in strip of land 200 
ft wide, with ti«ie land, off w end of s5 
acres of lot 2, sec 12, twp 26 s r 13 w w m, $10.00

March 7, 1914
O K Kronen berg et al to Adnlpl Ha­

ber ly, q c deed eb, of se'4 sec 31 iwp 28 
a r 14 w w in, $1.

Geo W Ferrey et ux :o Henrietta \V 
Fci rey et al q c deed lots 37 A 38, blk 25, 
Railroad add to Marshfield, $10.

F E Oakes et ux to W R Mavity, war 
deed parcel of land in sec 30, twp 28 s r
15 w w m, $525.

J F Clemens et al to \V J Sweet, q c 
deed parcel of land adjoining blk 1,

t ' l . r l . f ’ a ii.liJ 4.. O . . .I , . . .  l i t

B A D  R O A D S  E X T R A V A G A N T .

The Hon Champ Clark says: 
"I saw it stated once that the 
energy, material, animal life and 
tiiue wasted in this country by 
reason of bad roads amount to 
the enormous sum of $400.000,-
000 annually. This is astound­
ing and may be exaggeration, 
but it is known that the waste Is 
enormous. This state of affairs 
is so easily bettered that It is 
idiotic, if not criminal, to let it 
continue. Twenty odd years ago
1 advocated building by convict 
labor four great roads across 
Missouri 1 was twenty years 
ahead of my time, but I rejoice 
that what I suggested then, and 
even much more, is in contem­
plation and near fruition.”

Sherilt's Sale of Real Property un Foretlornre 8HI!RIKF"S SALK OF FOKECI4M. 
_______  L UK

A t. SHERWOOD Pro,.

Notice is hereby given, That by vir- 
tue of an execution duly issued out of 
the Circuit Court of the State of Ore

o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o

THE INFLUENCE OF
GOOD ROADS ON HEALTH.

Point In Their Favor That Has Not 
Received Much Attention.

Cartw right’s add to B ndon, 10.
Alice S Field et vir to U F Snow, war 

deed parcel of land, beginning at nw 
corner lot 2 blk 61 Elliotts add to Co- 
quille, $1.

March 9, 1914
J M Baker to D A Patterson, war 

deed parcel of land in sec 25, twp 28 s r 
15 w w in, $123.75

Ellen Hempel, admx to Felix Hull, 
agreement to sell sel4 of swl4, sec 30; 
eb. of nwbj, sw*4 of ne%. sec 31 twp 29 
8 r 14 w w m, $3000*

Jas Magee et ux to Southern Pacific 
Co, B & N deed lot 3, blk 5, North 
Marshfield, $2600.

Lydia A Rumble et vir to Willamette 
Pacific R R Co, war deed parcel of land 
in sw ‘4 of 8w 14, sec 35, twp 23, s r 13 
w w m $1.

Archie Taylor to W L Taylor, war 
deed lot 8, I-Ik 3, Crawford Point add to 
Coos Bay, $10.

R T Kaufman to Steve Herman, war 
deed lot 12. blk Ee, Western add to 
Marshfield, $10.

March 10, 1914
1 S Kaufman et ux to D A McLeod, 

war deed lots 3 A 4, blk 39, North 
Bend, $12.

Robert Banks to Margaret Banks, 
war deed lot 10 blk 68, Porter add to 
North Bend, $10.

March 11, 1914
Lillie M. Davidson et ux to Louisa M. 

Smith el al war deed 35.52 acres in sec 
23, twp 28 s r 14 w w in $4000.

Frederick Noli & Co to Rogue River 
l arm Products Co war deed ee)4 sec 18, 
twp 29 s r 10 w w m $1.

W C Parker et ux to Seeley-Anderson 
Logging Co lease lot 10 A part of lot 9, 
sec 10,twp 28 s r 14 w w m.

A T Beatul to Frank C Warren war 
deed 1 acre in sec 34, twp 27 a r 13 w w 
m $100.

Geo F Quiggle et ux to Gertrude F 
Andrews war deed lot 21, blk 10, Ed­
mondsons Second add to Marshfield $10.

(Continued on second page)

This N e w  M edicine
Saves You M oney

The influence of good roads on pub­
lic health is a point in their favor that 
has uot received much attention. The 
Kansas state board o f health puts the 
feature in the foreground and wants 
modern Improved roads in that state 
because they prevent disease.

They do this because they afford 
drainage. A good road can never re­
main a good road unless it is well 
drained. The roadbed must not have 
any standing water either on its sur­
face or below the surface. It must 
have drainage, and the gutters beside 
the roads uiust have slope and be kept 
free from obstruction so that all sur­
plus water can escape quickly and 
easily.

An old fushioned, ill drained road, 
with Its frequent pools of standing 
water on the road or by the roadside, 
with its ditches filled with weeds, 
brush and all sorts of trash, Is a breed­
ing place of Insect life. Mosquitoes, 
flies and other Insects, such as chinch 
bugs and grasshoppers, multiply there 
in profusion. It is these insects which 
either carry disease or are of the kind 
which destroy the farmer’s crops. For 
these reasons well built, well drained 
highways are a double benefit since 
they give the farmer the inestimable 
advantage of easy communication with 
ids market at all times of the year and 
by improving the drainage check the 
breeding of harmful insects.

Good roads mean, therefore, not 
only n great saving of time and labor 
for the farmer, but the improvement 
In the hygienic conditions of the farm 
lug community. He is brought nearer 
to his market, the hauling capacity of 
his teams is greatly increased, and he 
is no longer marooned on his farm for 
many weeks each year owing to the 
impassable conditions of the roads. 
That health is promoted as well as 
comfort and wealth by good roads 
should give the argument for their 
construction Irresistible force so that 
their building shall not cease until the 
w hole country is lined with them.

SCOTLAND FOR GOOD ROADS.

à
-ON-

Projected Construction of Experimen­
tal Road Sections In Scotland.

In December, 1912, according to an 
article in a recent issue of the Journal 
of the Institution of Municipal and 
County Engineers (Great Britain), the 
Scottish District of the Institution of 
Municipal and County Engineers ap­
pointed a committee to “collect and 
tabulate data ns to Improved methods 
of road construction and particularly 
Information as to the effect of climatic 
conditions taken in conjunction with 
traffic upon experimental road lengths 
to be laid down in districts in Scotland 
which have distinctive climatic condi­
tions.”

After having the matter under ad­
visement the committee decided to put 
down experimental road lengths in a 
number of districts in Scotland. Ar­
rangements have been made for the 
location of these sections in parts of 
that country where the climatic condi 
tions are suitable for the experiments 
and where the local surveyors will co­
operate with the committee Provi­
sional arrangements with county sur­
veyors have been made 

It is stated that the road board Is co­
operating with the instltuUon In this 
work and that it is expected that the 
experiments will be of exceptional In­
terest on account of the close consider­
ation it Is proposed to give to the ef 
feet of climate. It Is also expected 

, that the great variations In climaUc 
We are druggists right here in your conditions In Scotland will facilitate 

town and make a living out of the drug ! the isolation of the factor of weather 
business, but it is because people have effect in the destruction of road sur- 
to have drugs and not because we like f„ces
to see people suffer -we don’t. Our ! ’ __________________
duty is to render the best service we
can, and when someone is ailing, we Rubber Roads,
are interested in seeing them take the The proposition to build rubber roads

SUBSCRIPTION

best medicine there is for their particu­
lar trouble. We don’t recommend | 
“ cure-alls,”  as we don’t believe there 
are such things. We don’ t want you to 
spend more than you have to. Some of 

>u get small wages, and when you’re

has been seriously put forward In Lon 
don It is said that the vibration in 
the streets due to the heavy solid tired 
motor trucks and omnibuses has be­
come so great ns to constitute a serf

sick, none at all, and you shonid get ous menace to the Integrity of old 
the most you can for your money, buildings It is, besides, in some por-

We recently came across a new rem- tions of the city an Intolerable nui- 
edy for increasing strength and building sauce to the office workers The case 
up people who are run down and ema- of t|lp r,.Blon ilbo)lt 8L Pnl,rg onthe-

QHICHES I Ufi
I n d i . » !  A « L  '  .mm It

T i l l *  in I I.  .1 . (. .I b-'ves. sealed viti, | i 
T u t e  no ol her I 
H rn n M . A f H 'fl 
DI A l i o  NI» ILK VN

years known a ilic t.' >
SO lD lYD fit

Thco. Bcrgiian ShocMfff.Co.
Incorporated

Manufacturersfof

The Celebrated tierqniann Shoe
The Strongeef and Nearest Water 
P roo f ahoe made for logger*, miner* 

proapeetors an 1 mil! men.
621 T l u r m a D  Sticet

P o r tlan d , O re ion.

dated. We know that a alight trouble 
sometime, grows into a serious one, 
and to atop it in the beginning, will 
aave you money in tin end. This new 
compound is called Rexail Olive Oil 
Kmulaion. It is the best remedy, 
when you are run-down, tired out, ner­
vous no matter what the cause. It 
doesn’ t merely stimulate you and make 
you feel good for a few hours, but takes 
held of the weakness and builds you up 
to a healthy, normal condition. It  is a 
real nerve-food tonic and builder of 
good blood, strong muscle, good diges­
tion. it contains Hypophosphitea. 
which tone the nerves, and pure Olive 
Oil, which nourishes the nerves, the 
blood and the entire system. Pleasant 
to take. Contains no alcohol or habit- 
forming drugs. We promise that if 
you are not perfectly satisfied with it, 
we’ll give back your money as soon as 
you tell us. Sold only at tne 7,00«) Rex- 
all Stores, and in this town only by us. 
$1.00 l uhrrnan s Pharmacy, Coquille, 
Oregon.

drat Is cited In particular. It will soon 
be a question there of reducing vibra­
tion at any cost. And. although It has 
been calculated that a rub how road 
to compete commercially with wood 
blocks or asphalt most have a life of 
fifty years (which of course It would 
not hard, the lilg cities may he driven 
to such roads In concealed district, de­
spite their high cost

P O L I V S i
OREGON and W ASH ING TO N  ’Business Directory

A  D irectory o f each C ity , T o w n  find  
V illage , g iv in g  de scrip tiv e  sk e tch  of 
each place, location, popu lation , te le ­
graph. «h ipp ing  and b a n k in g  po in t;
aleo C lassified  D irectory, compiled by

gon, for the County of Coos, and to me 
directed on the 21th day of February, 
1914 upon a judgment and decree duly 
rendered, entered of record and docket­
ed in and by said Court on the 7th day 
of January. 1914 in a certain suit then 
in said Court pending, wherein William 
Grimes was plaintiff ami Mary E Sibel, 
J A. Ward and Minnie S. Ward, wife 
of said J. A. Ward and Millicoma De­
velopment Company, a corporation, and 
J. A. Muuday were defendants in fa­
vor of plaintitf and against said defend­
ants by which execution I am com­
manded to sell the property in said ex­
ecution and hereinafter described to 
pay the sum due the plaintiff of Three 
Thousand Six Hundred Eighty-four 
and 00-100 Dollars, with interest there­
on at the rate of 6 per cent, per annum 
from the 7th day of January, 1914 until 
paid together with the costs and dis­
bursements of said suit taxed at Eigh­
ty-two and 50-100 Dollars and costs and 
expenses o f said execution. I will on 
Saturday, the 26th day of April,1914,at 
the hour of 10 o’clock A. M. of said day 
at the front door of the County Court 
House in Coquille, Coos County, Oregon, 
sell at public auction to the highest Did­
der for cash in hand on the day of sale, 
all the right, title, interest and estate 
which said defendants Mary E. Sibel, 
J. A. Ward and Minnie 8. Ward wife 
of the said J. A. Ward and all persons 
claiming under them subsequent to the 
Plaintiff’s Mortgage Lien in, of and to 
said real property. Said Mortgaged 
premises hereinbefore mentioned are 
described in said execution as follows, 
to-wit: The South-east quarter of the 
North-east quarter, and the North half 
of the North-bast quarter of Section 19, 
Township 25, South of Range 12 West 
of the W'lllamette Meridian, Coos Coun­
ty, Oregon, containing 120 acres of 
land more or less. Said sale being made 
subject to redemption in the manner 
provided by law.

Dated this 13th day of March, 1914.
W. W. Gage,

3-24-5t SherilF o f Coos County, Oregon.

Restoration to Entry of Lands in National Forest

Notice is hereby given that the lands 
described below, embracing 380 acres, 
within the Umpqua & Siskiyou Nation­
al Forest, Oregon, will be subject to 
settlement and entry under the provis­
ions of the homestead laws of the United 
States and the act of June 11, 1906 (34 
Stat., 233), at the United States land 
office at Koseburg, Oregon, on May 1 I. 
1914. Any settler who was actually and 
in good faith claiming any of said lands 
for agricultural purposes prior to Janu­
ary 1, 1906, and has not abandoned same, 
has a preference right to make a home­
stead entry for the lands actually occu­
pied. Said lands were listed upon the 
applications of the persons mentioned 
below, who have a preference right 
subject to the prior right of any such 
settler, provided such settler or appli­
cant is qualified to make homestead en­
try and the preference l ight is exer­
cised prior to May 14, 1914, on which 
date the lands will be subject to settle­
ment and entry by any qualified person. 
The lands are as follows: The E'.j NW’ 

.. the N 'a N E '4 SW>4 Sec. 30, T. 28 
S., R. 10 W., W. M. 100 acres, listed 
upon application of James I. Spring- 
stead, R. F. D. No. 1, Box 118, Rose- 
burg, Oregon; List 6-1143. The S1., N 
E 'j, the S'.. NJc NE'4 Sec. 0, T. 30 S., 
R. 13 W., 120 acres, application of Wil­
liam G. Whabrey, Myrtle Point, Ore­
gon; List 6-1146. TheSE 1. Sec. 30, T. 
28 S., R. 10 W., 160 acres, application 
of Carl Vogel, Box 227, Coquille, Oreg­
on; List 6-1161. February 28, 1914, 
C. M. Bruce, Assistant Commissioner 
of the General Land Office.

Notice lo Creditors

Notice is hereby given that the un­
dersigned has been duly appointed by 
the County Court for Coos County, Ore­
gon, adm: listra.or with the will annexed 
of the estate of Rose E. Pershbaker, de­
ceased and that all persons having claims 
against said estate are hereby notified 
that they are required to present the 
ame properly verified and with vouch­

ers therefor to the undersigned at his 
office in Coquille, Coos County, Oregon 
within six months from the date of this 
notice.

Dated this 23rd day of February, 1914.
A. J. 8HERWOOD, 

Administra tor with the will 
f  “ -  annexed of the estate of Rose 

2-24-5t E Pershbaker, deceased.

Notice of Final Account

Notice is hereby given that the under­
signed has filed her final account in the 
matter of the estate of James L. 
Thompson, deceased, and the county 
court of Coos County, Oregon, has set 
Wednesday, the 8th day of April, 1914, 
at 10:00 A. M. as the time, and the 
county court room in the Court House 
at Coquille, Oregon, as the place for 
hearing objections to said final account 
and for the settlement of said estate.

Dated this loth day of March, 1914.
Lu i.a Etta  Thompson, 
Administratrix of the estate 
of James L. Thompson, de- 

3-10-5t ceased.

Notice to Creditors

Notice is hereby given that the un­
dersigned has been duly appointed ad­
ministrator o f the estate of William 
Panter, deceased and that all persons 
having claims against said estate are 
hereby notified that they are required 
to present the same duly verified and 
with the proper vouchers therefor to 
the undersigned at the office of A. J. 
Sherwood in ‘ ■ idie. Coos County, Or­
egon within six months from the date 
of this notice.

Dated this 17th day of February 1914.
W. R. Panter,

2-3-8t

Have you pni I the printer.

OVER 66 YEARS' 
EXPERIENCE

n. P« i k *  co.. Seattle : 
I

T rade M arks
Designs 

C opyrights Ac.
Anrone «end!« j  «  sketch and description nmy 

quickly «»certain < ir opinion free whether an 
Invention 1» pr- mMy patentable, Oomrounlca. 
ti •ns yfrictlv« i v.itla l. HANDBOOK on Patent» 
sent free. OMe-t h rency fo r  »ecurinir patent».

Pat.mi* taki M through Muim A Co. receive 
apo inl notice, r Iihout charge. In the

Scientific A m e ric a n .
A handsomely I 'usfrated weekly. T.nreeet otr-
dilation «*f niir nfle Journal. Term », a
year : ft nr m t. gold by all pewtuiealer*.

MUNN&Co.”  4 Broadway.
Branch nm .. K St- Waahlu*ton, O.

N u iiC K  IS HEREBY GIVKN that 
under and by virtue of the Execution 
and order of sale issued out of tl o 

¡Circuit Court of the State of Oregi n 
j l or the County of Coos, on the 2t, 1 
| day of December, 1913, in a certain 
suit wherein John R. Miller is plain­
tiff, and A. H. Stutsman and Emma F. 
Stutsman. Flanagan & Bennett Bank, 
C. D. Mael and A. S. Hammond and 
C. R. Hammond, partners doing bu - 
Iness as the Title & Trust Cor - 
pany, and B. F. W illey and William 
Schroeder, composing the firm of 
Willey & Schroeder, are defendants, 
being case No. 294 4 o f said court, 
and commanding me to sell said re. l 
property hereinafter described to sa - 
isfy the sum of $2581.67 with lntei- 
tst thereon at the rate of ten per 
cent, per annum since the 14tli day of 
June 1911, less the sum of $500.09 
paid on said judgment, Septemper 16, 
1911 and less the further sum of 
91060,09 paid September 22nd, 
1911, and the further sum of $240.00 
attorney fees, and costs taxed at 
$23.60, being the amount of plain­
tiff’s judgment; also the sum of 
$115.76 with Interest at the rate of 
six tier cent, per annum from the 
14th day of June 1911, and attorney 
fees of $50.00, and costs taxed at 
$10.00, being the amount of W illey 
& Schroeder judgment, and also the 
further sum of $1087.01 with Inter­
est at the rate of 8% per annum 
from the 14th day of June 1911, to­
gether with attorney fees to* the 
amount of $150.00, and costs taxed 
at $11.00; I sold all of block 26 E. 
B. Dean & Co.’s Addition to the 
town of Marshfield, Coos County, 
Oregon, according to the plat thereof 
on file and of record in the office o f  
the County Clerk of Coos County. 
Oregon, to Flanagan F; Bennett Bank 
for $2644.20, and sold the dwelling- 
house situated thereon, separnre ¡rii 1 
apart from said real property, which 
said dwelling-house is generally 
known as the Stutsman residence to 
the said Flanagan & Bennett Bank 
for the sum of $500.00 on the 10th 
day of Janu.:.}, 1514, and In pur­
suance of the Order of the Circuit. 
Court of Coos County, Oregon, 
made In said above entitled court an l 
cause on the 24tli clay of February, 

914, setting aside said sale and o r ­
dering a re-sale of said premises, and 
directing that execution i sue thereoa 
for the enforcement of said Decree 
and Order, and in pursuance of the 
Execution issued In purse ance of 
said Order received as of the date 
of said order, to-wit, on the 24C’ 
day of February, 1914, issued out 
o f said court, requiring me to se'l 
said property for the satisfaction of 
said judgment and as by said decree 
and said order of court directed, di­
recting and requiring that I sell the 
property aforesaid exclusive of the 
house, to the highest and best bidder 
for cash, and that I receive no bid for 
said property exclusive of the hous<. 
for a less sum than the bid o f the 
Flanagan & Bennett Bank of $2 - 
644.20, which shall be deemed to he 
renewed and continued; and that I 
sell the building located upon the 
eastern portion of said premises 
known as the Stutsman residence, 
and that I receive no bid for same, 
except in excess of the bid of the 
Flanagan & Bennett Bank of $500.00, 
which said bid Is deemed to be re­
newed and continued, I did levy on 
the property hereafter described, 
and I will on the 26th day of March, 
1914, at the hour of ten (10 ) o ’clock 
In the forenoon of said day at the 
front door of the County Court 
House in the City o f Coquille, Ore­
gon, sell at public auction to the 
highest and best bidder for cash, 
all of the right, title and interest of 
said defendants, jointly and several­
ly, in and to the following describ­
ed property, to-wlt:

A ll of Block 26 In E. B. Dean & 
Co.’s Addition to the Town of Marsh­
field, according to the plat thereof 
on file and of record in the Countv 
Clerk’s office, Coos County Oregon, 
being generally known and described 
as the Stutsman residence property, 
the same not to Include the dwelling- 
house of A. H. Stutsman thereon, but 
all other buildings, together with 
the tenements, hereditaments and ap­
purtenances thereunto belonging, or 
in any wise appertaining, and also at 
said time and place aforesaid, sell 
the dwelling house located upon the 
eastern portion of said property be­
ing the dwelling-house generally 
known and described as the Stutsman 

i residence. Said property will he 
sold seperate from the dwelling- 
house thereon, and no bid for the 
said block 26 exclusive of the dwell*

I ing will be received except for a 
greater sum than the amount of the 
Did of Flanagan & Bennett Bank of 

¡$2644.20, which is deemed to he re­
newed and continued, and no bid 
will be received for the dwelling- 
house located upon said above de­
scribed property heretofore referred 
to exrept In excess of the bid of the 
Flanagan & Bennett Bank of $500.00 
which shall be deemed to be renewed 
and continued.

DATED this 24th day of February, 
1914.

W. W. GAGE,
Sheriff of Coos County, Oregon 

n t  Feb. 24. Mch 3, 10, 17, 24.

B U T T E R
W R A P P E R S

AT THE
HERALD OFFICE

l. H. HAZARD, Cashier
k l.SHINE, V .-l’res. 

0. C SANFORD, Aist. Cashier

F I R S T  N A T I O N A L  B A N K
O F  C O Q U IU L aE .  O R E G O N .

T r a r i H u c t s o G e n e r a l  G a n k i n u  G u a i n e « » *

Boari of Olroctoro. ¿orra¿pondent«
R.O. Dement, A. J. Sherwood, National Hank «» ( ’onimeice. New Yi‘rk Cl

L. Harlorker, L. II. Hazard. ; Crocker Wool worth NMBank, San Kranci
Iuaiah Hacker. H.K. Shine. First Nat’l hank <<f Portland, Portland.

R. S. Knowlton, President Geo. A. Robinson, Vice-Pres.-
R. I I . Mast , Cashier.

Farmers and Merchants Bank
COQUILLE. OREGON 

Opened for Bustnes March, 1890

c o r r e s p o n d e n t s :

Ladd & Tilt >n Bank, Portland First National Bank, San Francisco 
National Park, New York First Trust & Sa 'ings, Coos Bay

AS-Cl
OLD RELIABLE—EQUIPPED WITH WIRELESS

S T E A M E R  B REA KW A TER
ALWAYS ON TIME

Sails from Portland at 8  P. M.,
Mar. 3, 10, 18, 25, and April l.

Sails from Coos Bay
Mar. 6, 9:00 p. m.; 14th 11 a. m.; 21sf 7:00 a. m .; 28th 11:00 a. m.

W. L. K0LM Agent Phone Main 181
”-3' gp -'t. T.-ST VJVi-E Í-- =t «S-Öv.'-r ¡L* .C$Ä*. Ce SÎ-riî-ÿÉ

Y )  Fred Von Pegert c _ , Kjm<.

J KiMc & VON PEGERT
ÿ  M E C  I A r I C A L

g S H O P
G e n e r a l  ; 'iaekgmithimç 
Wagon Making, Machin*
Work, Pattern Making anp 
Casting, Automobile Work,

C O Q U I L L E ,  O R E G O N

! X > 0 <  o o o o o o o o o o c o c o o o o o

Roseburg Myrtle Point Stage
And Auto Line

Leavi u Myrtle Point 5 a. m. 
Arrives Koseburg, next day 
Leaves Korebiirg (i p, m .

Arr. Myrtle Point l.y 10 p. ni.

Make reservations in advance at (Jw I 
Drug Store, Marshfield.

Carrying Baggage and United Slates Mail 
J .  L .  L A I R D ,  P r o p r i e t o r

Office at L,nird’ « Livery Barn, Myrtle Peint, Both Phones

T U I FO LLY  OF T W O  TE LE PH O N E S
*pilE  cities that attempted to secure a better telephone service by 

introducing a competing telephone system are beginning to realize 
the folly of their course. The opinion prevailed some years ago that 
two telephone Companies would reduce the price and give better ser­
vice, but it has been learned by experience that it not only doubles 
the expense to the people, but it is an awful nuisance. In some cities 
these dunli" (to companies secure franchises under the name of co- ■  
operative c mpanies, when a number of people organized and secured B  
privileges under certain representations. They were encomaged in ■  
their efforts and the public is today payin'.' the price o f its folly with B

I
I

. . . .  r _________ folly _____
an unsatisfactory double system, no one being equipped “ telephonic- 
ally”  without paying for both systems, those not having two being at 
the disadvantage of not being «b 'e to to talk to those who are on the 
the other line.

Main Office
Coos Bay Home Telephone Co

Marshfield, Oregon

i
■

SHOOT STRAIGHT

If you are to hit w hat you aim at.

A I M  THROUGH US
Peop!e should know what you have 
to offer and w e have the means of 
= = = = =  telling them. = = = = =

An Ad. from you in this paper will reach 
buyers who buy, isn’t that sufficient?*

\


