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$1000 FREE
IF I FAIL TO CURE any CANCER or TUMOR
POOR CURED AT HALF PRICE OR FREE
NO KNIFE, OR PAIN 
NO PAY UNTIL CURED |
by GUARANTEE No X '
Kay or other swindle 
WRITTEN GUARANTEE.
3*day painlch» plaster i 
A N Y  T U M O R ,  L U M P  
or SORE <>a the LIP. FACE 
or body long is CANCER.
It  Never Pelns Until Last 
Stage. 120-PAGE BOOK 
sent free; testimonials1
o f  THOUSANDS C U R E D ------------ —

Any Lum p'» W o m an ’s  B reast
I BEUEVE IS ALWAYS CANCER, and ALWAYS poison* 

deep glands in the aim pit and K I L L S  Q U IC K L Y  
I swear we have C U R E D  1 0 , 0 0 0 .  Go see soma

•»SOId Dr. & Mrs. C HAMLET
"M OST SUCCESSFUL CANCER SPECIALISTS LIVING"

A B 436 Valencia St., SAN FRANCISCO, CAL 
KINDLY MAIL this to someona with CANCER

HEAL ESTATE TRANSFERS ’  s h e  w a s  n o t  a f r a i d .  FROM THE NATIONAL C A P I T A L 'l '“ V k“  *b“ * "
Reported for The Herald by the Title 

Guarantee and Abstract Co.

Edith J 
Co, War, 
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SUBSCRIPTION
C H I C H E S T E R

TH E  D IAM O '

e  p ip  j

D ru fff i« t . A f f e r e n t  « I I IX - T F I T S  
D IA M O N D  I I I» A N D  I 'T L I .S  for « 5  

years known as Best, Safest, Always Reli iblo

SOLD BY ORI QfilSTS LVLRYKHi

Tlieo.BerpiiDSIioeIf.Co.
Incorporated 

Manufacturers of

The Celebrated Berqmann 8  hoe
The Strongest anil Nearest Water 
Proof shoe made for loggers, tinners 

prospectors and mill men.
21 Thurman Street

P o rtland , O regon.

Str. Elizabeth
Regular as the Clock

San Francisco 
and Bandon

First-class fare only $7.50
Up freight, per ton 5.00

E . &  E . T .  K ru s e
24 California Street, San Francisco

For Reservations

NOSLER & NORTON
Agents, Coquille, Oregon

Babbitts
PURELYE

Kills Germs Kills Odors
Use it  today— the 
strongest Lye in
the New Sifter Can

A  L IT T L E  Babbitt’s Lye and 
a lot of water will keep your 

home and barn free of all germs 
and odors.
Why not try it today?— and see 
for yourself how easily, cheaply 
and thoroughly it does the work.

Write fur booklet shoving many 
uses. Valuable presents far the 
labels. Write far Catalogue
Highest in Strength 4  —
But Not in P rice  I U C

You Use Less It  Lasts Longer

B .  T .  B A B B I T T
P .  O . B o x  1 7 7 0 N E W  V O R K  C IT Y

iiw H

February 17, 1914
L. J. Simpson et ul to Edith J. Judd. 

War. Deed. Lot 17, Blk 20 Lakeside.$10.00
Judd et vir to Dennett Trust 
Deed. Lot 17 Blk 20, J.ake- 

$220.00
February 18, 1914

L. J. Simpson et al to Herman A. 
Nabb. War. Deed. Lot 9, Blk 19,

$5.00
Marshfield Realty <k Trading Co. to 

W. J. Conra«l t*t al. War. Deed. Par­
cel of land in Marshfield. $10.00

Henry Fengstaeken et ux to Henry 
Sengstacken Co. War. Deed. All Belt 
Line Kailway Add to Empire. K1« of 
SE)£, Sec 3, <k W }i of SW!£, Sec 2 Tp 
S6 > R 15 W W M. $10.00

Clias. Walker to Mark O. Con. War 
Deed. Lot 2 Blk 40 Woodland Add to j 
Bandon. $10.00

Ben Fogelsonger et ux to O. W. 
Thompson et al. war deed. Lot 0 blk 7 j 
Bennetts’s Bandon Beach,Plat A. $10.00 

John iS. Coke,Jr, et ux to McPherson- | 
Ginser Co. Q. C. D Part lot 7 blk 41, 
E. B. Clement’s plat of Marshfield,
Parcel of land in Sec 33Twp 25 S R 11 
W W M. $10.00

A. E. Seaman et ux to Chas. Walker 
war deed. Lots 2 10, blk 40, Woodland 
add to Bandon. $10.00

Februrary 19, 1914 
Rhoda E. Ross et al to W. C. Harris, 

war deed. Lot 23, 24, 25 & 26, blk 36 
East Marshfield $100.00

A. M, Crawford et ux to Merchant 
Land Co. et al. (¿. C. D. All their 
interest in West Bandon except lots 4 
to 9, blk 38. $10.00

Chester Snow to L. W. Tope. Option
lots 13, 14, & 15 blk 43, North Bend.

N. Berneics Moore to E. Roy Moore 
war deed lots 6 to 10, blk 7 Bav Park. 
Lots 10, blk 24 Lakesiile. * $10 00 

H. E Brown et ux to Warren J. Bur­
den et al war deed NK*4 of NE% NE!4 
sec. 35, twp. 29 s. r. 15 w. w. m. $10.00 

A. M. Crawford et ux to Merchant 
Land Co. et al, war deed one-ihird in­
terest in various lots in west Bandon. 
$10.00.

James H. Rookard et ux to Lawrence 
Jennings, war deed, ne‘4 of se££, 8eV4 
of ne*4 , wW of ne1̂ , & of nw.^, sec 
34, twp. 29 8. r. 11 w. w. m. $1000.00 

February 20 1914
E. C. Mather et ux to E. Lillebo, war 

deed Lot 1, blk 13, Coos Bay Plat A 
Division 2. $10.00

Aila Graber et vir to Frank T. Malley 
et al B. & S. deed e}» of sw34 ° f SWM> 
sec 13, twp 30 8. r. 12 w. w. m. $10.(X)

T. M. Hermann et ux to H. A. John­
son, war deed ne!4 of Be1*, sec 8, twp. 
30 s. r. 12 w w m $10.00

Georgia A. Stephans et al to Carrie 
McCulloch, war deed, that part of lot 3, 
sec 16, twp. 29 s. r. 12 w w m lying east 
of county road. $10.00 

Ora M. Worthington et vir to Georgia 
A. Stephens, q c deed that part of lot 3 
sec 16, twp 29 s r 12 w w m lying east of 
county road. $5.00

February 21 1914
F. J. Fahy et al to J. C. Shields, b & 
deed lot 11 & sy% of lot 10, blk 17,

Woodland Add. to Bandon. $10.00 
Ora L. Clark to Edith A. Irish, war 

deed «32 ft of lot 7 A n3 ft of lot 6, blk 
40, Nasburgs Add to Marshfield. $1760.

Menasha Wooden Ware Co. to C. A. 
Smith Timber Co. q c deed, right of 
way through various lands of grantor in 
tps 30 A 31, r r 12 w w m $1.00

U. S. of A. to Northern Pacific Rail­
way Co. patent various lands in tp 25 s 
r 9 A twp 23 8 r 10 w w m

Annie Clark et vir to Jesse P. Byers, 
war deed 1 acre in sec 36, twp 27 a r w 
w in $800.00

D. D. Pierce to Edith Ada McCurdy 
b A a deed s'.j of se1̂ , nw ^ of se}^, see 
6, tw p 28 s r 12 w w m $5 00

Andre Anderson et ux to Wm Carlson 
et al, war deed 2 acres in sec 3t5, twp. 
26 h  r 14 w w m $10.00

February 24 1914
Ira B. Bartle et ux to Wm. N. Ekblad 

war deed one eighth interest of fiel4 of 
nw *4, sw V* of ne>i, sec 10, twp 24 s r 13
w w m $10.00

J. Wright Wilson et ux to Dorsey
Kreitzer war deed lots 16 A 17, blk 26, 
lots 26, 27 A 28, blk 39, Railroad Add. 
to Marshfield. $10,00 

Tbos. Langlois et ux to F. J. Feeney, 
war deed lots 2 A 3, blk 1, Langlois Add 
to Bandon $10 00

8. P. Bartlett to Mrs. M. J, McKenna 
war deed parcel of land in town of Ban­
don $10.00

E. R. Hunt et ux to Christian Peter­
son, w ar deed lot 18, A 19, blk 22, Ocean 
View’ Add to North Bend $100.00

!>. O. Kinyon et ux to Christian Pet­
erson, war deed lot 4, blk 18, and lot 3 
blk 12, Lakeside, $10.

Reynolds Development Co. to Ira M. 
Schwas, s w d lot 5, blk 14, first add to 
Marsh lie Id, $300.

L .1 Simpson et ux to J C Toelle, war 
deed parcel of land in North Bend $10.

Wm T Warner et ux to C A Smith 
Timber Co war deed right of way 
through land in see 28, twp 29 8 r 12 w 
w m $100.

Myrtle A Rackleff et vir to Lyman 
KackletT, war deed lots 7 and 8, blk 5,
P A Decker’s add to Myrtle Point $10.

A P Owen to Jotty Watson Folsom, 
war deed sl4 of lots 7 and 8, blk R, 
western add to Marshfield $1.00 

(Continued on second page)

Every Part of the Art of

L A U N D E R I N Q
Lias Had Our Careful 

Attention

It is our business, so it 
is necessary that we use 
the very best and latest 
methods to turn out the 
best work possible

Our service is at your command. 
If von arc not already a customer 
we would !h> glad to add you to 
our host of satisfied patrons.

COQUILLE LAUNDRY & ICE CO.

T h a r «  W a s  N o  R e a s o n  W h y  8 h e  S h o u l d  
D r e a d  t h e  In d i a n s .

Among the frontiersmen who closely 
followed the footsteps of Lewis and 
Clark across the Rockies was Colonel 
Joseph L. Meek. lie  settled in Ore­
gon, and, like all the earliest pioneers, 
he w as obliged to choose his helpmate, 
so the Portland Oregonian says, from 
among the dusky maidens of the for­
est.

During the early settlement of the 
territory the Cayuse Indians w e r e  
quite menacing In their demonstrations 
of hostility to the little baud of pio­
neers, so much so indeed that a meet­
ing of the settlers assembled to take 
counsel about the safety of the com­
munity resolved to send two of their 
number across the mountains to im­
plore aid from the government at 
Washington.

Colonel Meek and Squire Eberts 
were appointed, and they set out 
across the mountains and the deserts 
and in due time reached their destina­
tion. While there the colonel was in 
vited to a levee given by some one of 
the political notables. He was intro­
duced to a lady who naturally enough 
made Inquiries about Oregon, the hos­
tile Indians, and so forth.

"But your wife,”  began the lady In a 
lull betw’een thrilling narratives, "or 
haven’t you a wife?”

"Yes,”  replied the colonel, " I  have a 
wife.”

“ Why,” said the lady, “ I should 
think she would be so afraid of the 
Indians.”

"My wife afraid of Indians!” ex­
claimed the colonel. “ Why, madam, 
she Is herself a squaw!”

HEROIC MUSICIANS.
C o n d u c t o r ,  F o r  W h o m  t h o  O r c h e s t r a  

I s  M e r e l y  a  P e d e s t a l .
Dr. Max Nordau has an umuslng ar­

ticle in the Farts Revue on the evolu 
tion of the orchestra conductor. For­
merly the conductor was a modest 
man who took Infinite pains with the 
rehearsals and effaced himself on the 
great day of the public concert.

Nowadays he Is a hero. You only 
see 1dm. The orchestra 1s merely a 
pedestal for him. In the French army 
of former days there was a personage 
who could be compared with him—the 
drum major. He has the same pres­
tige without the aid of the drum ma­
jor's stature, lace and stick. lie  must 
be n finished actor. He must play the 
part of the Hon which shoots the wa­
ter Into the fountain.

There was Gustav Mahler, the most 
astounding artist In dumb show. All 
the muscles of his clean shaved face 
were contracted Into the furious mask 
of a samurai when he let loose the he­
roic sonorities and relaxed Into ecstasy 
during the pianissimo.

Arthur Nlktseh also "reflects”  trage­
dies nnd Idylls, but grace suits him 
best. In the pastoral symphony (Bee­
thoven) he Is the rococo shepherd tick­
ling with the outstretched finger of 
his left hand the fair neck of n pretty 
shepherdess.

T h e  P re s iden t and  War.
According to the constitution of the 

United States, article 1. section 8. 
clause 11, the power to declare war be­
longs to the congress. The president, 
as the chief executive, when war Is 
declared becomes commander In chief 
of the army and navy, but lie cannot 
take the Initiative in bringing on the 
war. The president who should have 
the temerity to declare the country at 
war with unuther people would be In­
stantaneously removed from his high 
office. The men who made the consti­
tution upon which our government 
rests knew how fatal to human rights 
nnd happiness the monarchical prin­
ciple had been, and therefore they Baw 
to It that the nation's head should have 
nothing to do with declaring war with 
another nation.—New York American.

SHERIFF'S SALB OF 
URK

KORE0T/O8-

(Continued from first page) j County Treasurer, Frank C'aug-
laying the building the Canal. The : liell, is still confined to the house
North American Indians have been ! bo‘  is 8lo" 'y  lalrenK 'h,

.. . . , , . will 800u be able to be out if to
repeatedly chased Irom their own | otber CODJ|lllctttiou,  8t.t io .
fields, their forests and streams, 
back to the reservation; and likely 
the presetit agitation will deter­
mine whether the Colombians are 
open to opportunity, in which event 
they will not shy Irom the pathway 
of progress, but may even outdis­
tance the people of the United States 
in reaping the harvest of the 
achievement of Panama.

WASHINGTON POLITICS 

Senator La Follette’s denuncia­
tion of the Progressive party was 
uot unexpected, but the return of 
Senator Bristow to the Republican 
party was a disappointment to the 
Progressives. The latter organiza­
tion finds cold comlort in the atti­
tude of Senators Clapp and Cum­
mings, whom, it has been thought 
might be ‘ ‘coaxed away”  and in 
duced to rejoin 
‘ ‘ Christian Soldiers

N irnCB  IS HEREBY GIVEN that 
under and by virtue o f the Execution 
and order of Bale Issued out of tho 
Circuit Court of the State of Oregon 
for the County of Coos, on the 2nd 
day of December, 1913, In a certal l 
suit wherein John It. Miller Is plain-'

t  J . S H E R W O O D  P r e V

l .  H . H 4 Z . R 0 .  C a s h ie r
R. E.SHINE, V.-PreB. 

0 .  C SANFORD, A ss t.  Cashier

F I R S T  N A T I O N A L  B A N K
op  c o l u m n s ,  o r b g o h .

r r a n s a c t a  a  G e n e r a l  B o n k i n g  B u s in e s p

S o s t i  s t  O l r s e le r s . C e r r e s p e n G e n t ,

R. O. Dement, A. J. Sherwood, | National Bank o Commerce, New York Ci
L. Horlocker, L. H. Hazard, Crocker Woolworth N'lBank, San Krsnci

Isaiah Hacker, It. K. Shine. First ¿iat’l Rank of Portland, Portland.

tiff, and A. H. Stutsman nnd Emma F. 
Stutsman, Flanagan & Dennett Dank,! 
C. D. Mael and A. S. Hammond and 
C. R. Hammond, partners doing bus­
iness as the Title & Trust Com­
pany, and B. F. W illey and William 
Schroeder, composing the firm of 
Willey & Schroeder, ar« defendants, 
being case No. 294 4 of said court, 
and commanding me to sell said real 
property hereinafter described to sat­
isfy the sum of $2581.67 with intei-
tst thereon at the rate o f ten |>er 

the march ot ¡cent, per annum since the 14th day of 
whose leaders 1 June 1911, less the sum of $500.00 

declare they will reach Armegeddon P a id  on said judgment, Septemper 16,
iu the next presidential election 
Meanwhile,Washington being Deni 
ocratic— lor the simple reason that 
the administration is of that politic­
al party, finds comlort in the divis­
ion of it opponents.

NEARLY A MtLLION A DAY
Congress will provide^ to,ooo,ooo 

for its postoffict business the com­
ing year. The parcel post is proving 
a great money maker, but it is de­
signed to make extensions in the 
service, and reductions in rates, in 
order to keep the Department down 
to merely a self-supporting basis.

CURRY COUNTY CULUNGS

1911 and lers the further sum of 
$1000.00 paid September 22nd, 
1911, and the further sum of $240.00 
attorney fee? and costs taxed at 
$23.60, being the amount of plain­
tiff’s judgment; also the sum of 
$115.76 with interest at the rate of 
six per cent, per annum from th-j 
14th day of June 1911, and attorney 
fees o f $50.00, and costs taxed at 
$10.00, being the amount of W llle/ 
& Schroeder judgment, and also the 
further sum of $1087.01 with Inter­
est at the rate of &r/c per annum 
from the 14th day of June 1911, to­
gether with attorney fees to the 
■amount of $150.00, and costs taxed 
at $11.00; I sold all of block 26 E.

(Port Orford Tribune) B' Dean *  Co ’8 Addition to tho
T ,, town of Marshfield, Coos County,
J. L . M iller, representing l he i „  . . .  , . ,1 °  Oregon, according to the plat thereof

Buckingham Heeht Shoe conipa- on f j an(] Df record in the office of 
uy of Sau Francisco, has been siik the County Clerk of Coos County, 
in Port Orf ird with appendicitis Oregon, to Flanagan & Dennett Dank 
for the past several days.

A. A. Jamieson, of Port Orford 
has let it become known among his 
friends that bis announcement as 
Republican candidate for nomina­
tion ns County Commissioner may 
be expected later.

The stores at this place have not 
been able to stock up since the 
wharf went down, and as a conse- 
queuce they are short on many sta 
pie articles.

A subscription has been raised 
for the purpose of extending the 
sidewalk along Jackson street from 
Gillings' store to the Maslereon cor-

R. 8. K nowlton, President Geo. A. Robinson, Vice-I’res.
R. 11. Mast, Cashier.

Farmers and Merchants Bank
C 0Q U IL L E , OREGON 

0p>ned for Busines March, 1 8 9 0

CORItESPONDENTS:
Ladd & Tilton Bank, Portland First National Bank, San Francisco 
National Park, New York First Trust & Sa-dngs, Coos Bay

7 * IE »4 S C !4 5  C$ < £ £ - T f  w-w-fcw «0-03 AJ-Jfcas J j »  .re <fs wp

J OI.D RELIABLE—EQUIPPED WITH WIRELESS

STEAMER BREAKWATER
ALWAYS ON TIME

Sails from  Portland at 8  P. M.,
Mar, 3, 10, 18, 25, and April 1. (fj;

Sails from Coos Bay
Mar. 6, 9:00 p. m.; 14th 11 a. m.; 21st 7:00 a. m .; 28th 11:00 a. m il

()
W.L.  K0LM, Agent Phone M ain 181

His Bluff.
Mr. Montgomery was calling on a 

young woman to whom he wished to 
appear extremely well.

“Are you familiar with Dante’s ‘Di­
vine Comedy,’ Mr. Montgomery?” 
nsked the young woman.

“No. I ’ve never seen it,” replied the 
man. “The fact is, Miss Tinder, I 
think this comedy business is being 
overdone. The sooner the stage re­
turns to tbe legitimate drama the bet­
ter it will be.” —Llppincott’s.

J im m ie ’s  W isdom .
Myrtle, who is studying physical ge­

ography, likes to flaunt her superior 
knowledge.

"Jimmie ” she said to her little broth 
er, " I  bet you don’t know what ger­
mination produces.”

"I don’t know what it produces,”  re­
plied Jimmie, "but I know the German 
nation consumes lots of sauerkraut 
and Wienerwurst.”—Youngstown Tele­
gram.

Her Choice.
Ethel—Strange that Kitty should ( 

have married Tom. She told me posl j 
tively that she liked Jack better. Ma- ; 
rie— Well, she felt more sure of being j 
able to boss Tom.—Boston Transcript. !

for $2644.20, and sold the dwelling- 
house situated thereon, separate and 
apart from said real property, which 
said dwelling-house is generally 
known as the Stutsman residence to 
the said Flanagan & Bennett Bank 
for the sum of $500.00 on the 10th 
day of January, 1914, and in pur­
suance of the Order of the Circuit 
Court of Coos County, Oregon, 
made in said above entitled court and 
cause on the 24th day of February, 
1914, setting aside said sale and or­
dering a re-sale of said premises, and 
directing that execution issue thereon 
for the enforcement of said Decree 
and Order, and in pursuance o f the 
Execution issued in pursuance of 
said Order received as of the date 
of said order, to-wit, on the 241li 

neroh Gth street. Enough money | day of February> 1914i iasued 01lt
anil donation work has been secured (of said court, requiring me to s e l l  

to guarantee the improvement b e i D g  said property for the satisfaction of 
made in the near futuie.

Dr. J. R. Weatherbee of the Starr 
ranch at Langlois, is fitting up one 
of the finest dairy farms in this 
part of the state. He has recently 
built two 300 ton silos, together 
with other up-to-date improvements 
He expects to milk 180 cows this 
season, and is substituting Holsteins 
in place of tho Jerseys that have 
formerly been on the place.

Atty. Kendell, of Marshfield, after 
spending several days in town d<- 
parted by stage this morning for 
Gobi Reach, where he will spend a 
week or ten days. Mr. Kendell is 
associated with Judge Goss in the 
practice of law, and among other 
things iB looking up timber that is 
on the market in this section, pre­
sumably in the interest of C. A.
Smith.

N. C. Divelbiss of Sixes, who suf­
fered a stroke of paralysis last full, 
has so far recovered ns to be able to 
get around the house with the 
assistance of crutches. Tbe disease, 
which hss kept Mr.Divelbiiss in bed 
for several months, affected him 
mostly in tbe muscles about the 
knees. “ Newt’s” many friends will 
be glad to learn that he is recover­
ing.

) Fred Yea Pegert C. I. Kime

: KIME. & VON PEGERT
k   — '  —

> M E C H A N I C A L
1 S H O P

G e n e r a l  Klacks mi thing 
Wagon Making, Machine 
Work, Partem Making anp 
Casting, Automobile Work,

C O Q U I L L E ,  O R E G O N

Roseburg M yrtle  Po in t Stage
A n d  A u t o  Line

N o t  A p p r e c i a t e d .
"Fve Just been telling my daughter 

It Is wrong to play the piano Sunday. 
Don't you agree with me?”

“But why Sunday especially'?” —Lip-
plncott’s.

said judgment and as by said decree 
and said order of court directed, d i­
recting and requiring that I sell the 
property aforesaid exclusive of tho 
house, to the highest and best bidder 
for cash, and that I receive no bid for 
said property exclusive of the house, 
for a less sum than the bid o f the 
Flanagan & Bennett Bank of $2,- 
644.20, which shall be deemed to be 
renewed and continued; and that I 
sell the building located upon the 
eastern portion of said premises 
known as the Stutsman residence, 
and that I receive no bid for same, 
except in excess of the bid of the 
Flanagan & Bennett Bank of $500.00, 
which said bid Is deemed to be re­
newed and continued, I did levy on I 
the property hereafter described, 
and I will on the 26th day of March, 
1914, at the hour of ten (10 ) o’clock 
in the forenoon of said day at the 
front door of the County Court 
House in the City o f Coquille, Ore­
gon, sell at public auction to the 
highest and best bidder for cash, 
all of the right, title and interest of 
said defendants, jointly and several­
ly, in and to the following describ- i 
ed property, to-wit:

All of Block 26 in E. B. Dean & 
Co.’s Addition to the Town of Marsh­
field, according to the plat thereof 
on file and of record in the County 
Clerk's office, Coos County Oregon, 
being generally known and described 
as the Stutsman residence property, 
the same not to include the dwelling- 
house of A. H. Stutsman thereon, but 
all other buildings, together with 
the tenements, hereditaments and ap­
purtenances thereunto belonging, or 
in any wise appertaining, and also at 
said time and place aforesaid, sell 
the dwelling house located upon the 
eastern portion of said property be- 

dwelling-house generally

Leavts Myrtle Point 5 a. m. 
Arrives Ruse burg, next day 
Leaves Roreburg (1 p in.
Arr. Myrtle Point by 10 p. in.

Make reservations in advance at Oh I 
Drug Store, Marshfield,

Carrying Baggage and United States Mail
J. L. LAIRD, Proprietor

Office at Laird’s Livery Barn. Myrlle Point, Holh Phones

THE FOLLY OF TWO TELEPHONES
fH E  cities that attempted to secure a better telephone service by 

introducing a competing telephone system are beginning to realize 
the folly of theircourse. The opinion prevailed some years ago that 
two telephone Companies would reduce the price and give better ser­
vice, but it has been learned by experience that it not only doubles 
the expense to the people, but it is an awful nuisance. In some cities 
these duplicate companies secure franchises under the name of co­
operative companies, when a number of people organized and secured 
privileges under certain representations. They were encouraged in 
their efforts and the public is today paying the price of its folly with 
an unsatisfactory double system, no one being equipped “ telephonic- 
ally”  without paying for both systems, those not having two being at 
the disadvantage of not being able to to talk to those who are on the 
the other line.

Coos Bay Home Telephone Co
Main Office Marshfield, Oregon

SHOOT STRAIGHT

Explained.
“ I heard her praising the conduct of

a little hoy just a few mluutes ago. 
Whose boy Is It?”

"Hers."—Detroit Free Press.

(Gold Beach Globe)
M. Doyle has sufficiently recover­

ed from his recent sickness to en­
able him to get over town yester­
day.

Jock Fitzhugh, of Nome is visit- ing the 
ing his brother and sister Mr. and , known and described as the Stutsman 
Mrs. Mel Fitzhugh and family of residence. Said property 

Langlois.

Industry pays debts, while despair
l u c r e n s e t h  t h e m . - -Benjamin Franklin.

BUTTER
W R A P P E R S

A T  T H E

H ER ALD  OFFICE

Said property will he 
sold seperate from the dwelling- 
house thereon, and no bid for the 

Langlois will have a cooperative sa|d block 26 exclusive of the dwell­
'd ) eese fnctory this summer. The ing will be received except for a 
farmers have organized a companv greater sum than the amount of the
and have bought an engine, and a re 'M<I of F 'anagan & Bennett Bank of 

, . , , , . , . I $2644.20, which is deemed to be re­now having the lumber cut for the , , , , . . .  <6 newed and continued, and no bid
building. will be received for the dwelling-

_ _ _ _ _  house located upon said above de-
„  . T . . scribed property heretofore referred(Curry County Leader) ,' J J to except In eioess of the bid of the

Doctor Dunlap was called to l ’is- pIanagan & Bennett Bank of $500.00 
tol River to give medical aid to Mrs. j which shall be deemed to be renewed 
Arthur Walker who is suffering and continued.
with the measles. DATED this 24th day of February,

1914.
All o f Ace Turner’«  family have ^  GAGE

been having their turn with the; sheriff of Coos County, Oregon, 
measles. However, we are are glad Pub Feb. 24, Mch 3, 10, 17, 24.

If you are to hit what you aim at.
A I M  T H R O U G H  U S

People should know what you have 
to offer and we have the means of 
= = = = =  telling them. = = = = =

An Ad. from you in this paper will reach 
buyers who buy, isn’t that sufficient ?


