
and record an annex-
ation agreement specif-
ic to the property, must 
pay system development 
charges for the utility 
being connected, and 
the owner must annex 
when annexation re-
quirements are met or 
when the city requests 
annexation.

� is ordinance would 
only allow for extra-
territorial connections 
outside city limits and 
within the urban growth 
boundary.

A second ordinance 
also addresses potential 
connections beyond the 
city’s UGB, which would 
be treated as a land use 
decision and be subject 
to appeals through high-
er agencies.

Staff  reported, how-
ever, that it has received 
only one request to con-
nect to the city water 
system outside the UGB 
in the past four years and 
the city council ultimate-
ly voted to pass only the 
fi rst ordinance.

Several locations 
within the city’s urban 
growth boundary con-
tain clusters where prop-
erty owners have asked 
to connect to the city 
utilities which run by the 
incorporated properties.

While most requests 
have been handled by 
annexing properties into 
the city, some requests 
have been denied.

City staff  brought to 
the council’s attention 
on Feb. 8 a case in which 
a property owner is out-
side city limits, inside the 
urban growth boundary 

and has a city waterline 
adjacent to the property 
which serves homes on 
each side of the property.

However, the proper-
ty could not be annexed 
as it is not contiguous 
to the city limits and no 
provisions in the city’s 
code allowed for new 
extraterritorial connec-
tions.

City staff  reported that 
the requests to connect 

to city utilities are fre-
quently due to on-site 
well or septic failures. 
Such failures can seri-
ously endanger the life 
safety and health of the 
property owner and 
could become a nuisance 
to the neighborhood and 
city if not dealt with.

Allowing for a utility 
connection, staff  rea-
soned, could maintain 
the viability of the prop-

erty and prevent such 
cases.

� e State of Oregon 
requires all cities to es-
tablish urban growth 
boundaries. � e bound-

aries are meant to pre-
vent urban sprawl by 
preserving land outside 
the boundary in its nat-
ural state or use it for ag-
riculture.
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One gallon potted Trees $5-$10
Giant Sequoias • Red Alder • Paper Birch
Nine Bark • Red Cedar • Redwood Trees

Incense Cedar • Ponderosa Pine

lakesidefarmandnursery.com

503-381-6054

Spring Seedling Sale

 SALES, SERVICE & REPAIRS

Complete 
tech, 
networking, 
security and 
IT solutions 
for your 
home or 
business.

711 E. Main Street | Cottage Grove

541-649-1073 |www.pcgargageoregon.com

Handguns
Long Rifles

Concealed carry classes 

Call for Schedules

standardsFITS YOUR

Book your FREE design 

CONSULTATION today!

855-962-4793

6 Cubic FT. wheel barrow 

steel handle no flat tire

LANDSCAPE AND
BUILDING MATERIALS

Open 

Tuesday-Saturday 

9am-5pm

79149 N. River Road

541-942-4664

Reg. 

$118

FROM
$2,599*

$2,349*

TM

1-866-523-0103
promo code N7017

* Free date changes anytime up to 45 days prior to departure for land tours, up to 95 days prior to departure for cruise tours. Deposits and final payments remain 
non-refundable. Prices are per person based on double occupancy plus $299 in taxes & fees. Single supplement and seasonal surcharges may apply. Add-on 
airfare available. Offers apply to new bookings only, made by 6/30/21. Other terms & conditions may apply. Ask your Travel Consultant for details.

Oahu • Hawaii Island • Kauai • Maui — Enjoy a fully 

guided 4-island Hawaiian vacation with centrally 

located lodging in Waikiki on Oahu, and beachfront 

lodging on the “Big Island” of Hawaii, Kauai, and Maui. 

Guided throughout by our friendly Tour Directors—

your local experts. Includes 3 inter-island flights.

12 days, departs year-round

BEST OF HAWAII FOUR-ISLAND TOUR

FREE DATE CHANGES ON 2021 TOURS*

ZERO-TURN 

RIDING MOWERS

�����������
– MEDICAL CLINIC, P.C. –

170 Melton Rd., Creswell, OR 97426

(541) 658-5301

Open M-F 8:30-7 * 

Saturday 8:30-4

Closed Sundays
*Hours subject to change due 

to COVID 19

FAMILY PRACTICE • IMMUNIZATIONS

PHYSICALS • SPECIALIZED CARE

AESTHETICS • NEW PATIENTS WELCOME

www.camasmedical.com

We know a thing or two 

because we’ve seen a thing or two. 

#SeenItCoveredIt.

Jim Goodling - Mike Grant
330 OR-99 Suite C • Cottage Grove, OR 97424

541-942-0165

A Smarter 
Way to Power 
Your Home. 

REQUEST A FREE QUOTE! 

ACT NOW TO RECEIVE
A $300 SPECIAL OFFER!*

(844) 989-2328

*Off er value when purchased at retail. 
Solar panels sold separately.

Code                   from A1

Cottage Grove Police amend personnel spouse, relative policy 

Personnel policy for 
the Cottage Grove Police 
Department has been 
amended to allow an of-
ficer to directly supervise 
a relative or member of 
their household.

The policy is specific 
to the police department 
and does not pertain to 
any other department 
within the city.

Under Oregon Revised 
Statutes (ORS), public of-
ficials, with the exception 
of legislators, are prohib-
ited from directly super-
vising a person who is 
a relative or household 
member

However, an exception 

can be made if a pub-
lic body adopts policies 
specifying when a public 
official acting in an offi-
cial capacity may directly 
supervise a person who is 
a relative or member of 
the household.

The Cottage Grove 
Police Department has 
developed such a policy 
specifying when a ser-
geant may do so.

The policy describes 
the role of sergeants 
and limits their role and 
functions as a supervisor 
by prohibiting them from 
participating “in any in-
terview, discussion, or 
debate regarding the ap-
pointment, employment 
or promotion of a rela-
tive or member of their 
household; or regarding 
the discipline, discharge, 

firing or demotion of a 
relative or member of 
their household.”

Chief of Police Scott 
Shepherd presented the 
resolution to the Cottage 
Grove City Council for 
approval on Monday.

There are two brothers 
who currently work in 
the department, Shep-
herd told the council.

“And there are times 

when they work together. 
And the way our policy 
and procedure manual 
stands, the one with the 
most seniority in our de-
partment is the one that 
would be the lead in that 
circumstance,” he ex-
plained. “And so they’re 
responsible for leading 
the shift, making deci-
sions based on policy and 
procedure and offering 
support.”

The role, however, does 
not involve hiring, firing 
or promoting other em-
ployees, he added.

“And we don’t believe 
this is a conflict as far as 
if one of those brothers, 
both being eligible, un-
der our current criteria to 
be promoted, were to be 

promoted and supervise 
the other,” he said.

The police depart-
ment rank and command 
structure provides that 
the Chief of Police is the 
only supervisor having 
the responsibility to ap-
point, remove, discipline, 
promote or transfer po-
lice department employ-
ees.

“I will be honest. It 
does make me a little 
concerned,” said Coun-
cilor Mike Fleck. “I do 
support this, but I hope 
that if there are any issues 
that, it is something that 
we could review in the 
future.”

The council voted 
unanimously to pass the 
resolution.

Amended policy addresses situations in which officers directly supervise a relative or spouse

By Damien Sherwood

dsherwood@cgsentinel.
com

“There are times when [spouses or relatives] work together. 

And the way our policy and procedure manual stands, the 

one with the most seniority in our department is the one 

that would be the lead in that circumstance...”

—CGPD Chief Scott Shepherd


