
Local nonprofit youth 
theater organization 

CROW was saddened 
when its board of directors 

decided to cancel the 2021 
Scare-CROW Haunt-
ed Maze for the second 
consecutive year due to 
COVID safety concerns. 
Always looking for new 
and exciting ways to reach 
people, the organization 
has created a safe and cre-
ative new alternative event 
for families to enjoy this 
Halloween season. 

Throughout October 
(after the 7th), the pub-
lic is invited to come and 
enjoy CROW’s four highly 
decorated “Macy’s style” 
window displays, which 
will be co-designed by re-
tired Senior Art Director 

from Disneyland, Brian 
Sandahl, and CROW’s 
Artistic Director, Melanie 
Heard.  

“The displays will be lit 
up with spooky lighting 
and packed with tons of 
fun props you’ll have to 
see to believe,” said Heard. 
“They will be family 
friendly, with a big dash of 
seasonal humor added in.” 

Starting on Oct. 7, 8 
and 9, and continuing on 
Thursday, Friday and Sat-
urday nights from 5 to 8 
p.m. through the end of 
the month, CROW will be 
offering original parking 
lot radio programming. 

“Come and park your 
car in our lot, and tune 
into the station specified 
on the sign on the front of 
our building,” said Heard. 
“Our kids and adults will 
tell you some hair-raising 
stories, mixed with clever 
Halloween jokes, and per-
haps a few groaners. We 
will also be mentioning 
the names of some local 
sponsors, so let us know if 
you want to sponsor one of 
the jokes.” 

The deadline for spon-
sorship is Sept. 30, and 
sponsorships are $250 
each. 

The idea to decorate 
the CROW building 
for Halloween was sug-
gested by CROW Board 
Member Amy Owens. 

“It will be nice for fami-
lies and the general public 
to have a destination that 
they can go to and enjoy 
some Halloween fun,” said 
Heard. 

CROW’s Technical Di-
rector Chris Owens of-
fered to figure out the ra-
dio broadcasting logistics. 
And from there, the idea 
took off.

“CROW hopes you’ll 
bring your friends and 
family to see the window 
displays, and to tune in to 
“K-R-O-W” in the parking 
lot,” Heard said.

The CROW Center for 
the Performing Arts is 
located at 3120 Highway 
101. 

The radio program will 
be about 30-ish minutes in 
length.  

“We may not be able to 
do our big Haunted Maze 
this year, but this IS some-
thing we can do, and we 
hope it will make you grin 
like a Jack-o-lantern.” 

For more information, 
follow CROW on Face-
book or visit crowkids.
com.

CROW plans something spooky to fill the air(waves)
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Drift wood Shores Resort

88416 1st Avenue, Florence

Surfside Restaurant 

at Drift wood Shores Resort 

Is Open for  take out Only 

from 5pm - 9 pm
Tuesday - Saturday

Call 

541-902-6447

Faith – Friendship - Fellowship – Fun

CHURCH DIRECTORY
To include your organization in this directory, 

please call us @ 541-997-3441

BAHA’I FAITH OF FLORENCE

Ongoing Devotions, Study Circles, Services to the 

Community, Join us on Facebook.

Join your friends via zoom, Monday’s 7:30-8:30p.m.

“SPIRITUAL CONVERSATIONS”

Florence Baha’i Community For info: 541-590-0779

THE CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST

OF LATTER-DAY SAINTS

2705 Munsel Lake Road, All are welcome!

Sunday Worship Services are at 10 AM & 11:15 AM.

Bishop Larry Farnsworth 541-999-1979

COMMUNITY BAPTIST CHURCH

4590 Hwy. 101, Across from Fred Meyer –- 997-7418

Sunday School, 9:30a.m. – Worship, 10:45

Wed. Prayer - 6:00 p.m. –

Wed. Ministries 1-8 Grade 7 p.m.

CROSS ROAD ASSEMBLY OF GOD

Corner of 10th & Maple- 541-997-3533

Sunday 9:00

1st Service in person

 Sunday 11:00

2nd Service in person & Online

Children’s Church (0yrs-12yrs) in person & Online

Wednesdays at 7pm

https://www.fl orencecrossroadag.org/church-online

Other platforms update after the service.

fl orencecrossroadag.org 

offi  ce@fl orencecrossroadag.org

FLORENCE CHRISTIAN CHURCH

2nd & Ivy  -  541-997-2961  -   Non-Denominational

Service is on Sunday at 10:00 a.m.  

Sunday Service also streaming live at 10:00 am 

at fl orencechurch.com

FLORENCE CHURCH OF CHRIST

Pre-Denominational (Romans 16:16)

1833 Tamarack Street

 (2 blocks east of Hwy. 101 on 18th St.)

Bible Study: Sunday 10 a.m.; Worship: Sunday 11 a.m.

www.churchofchristfl orence.org

FLORENCE EVANGELICAL CHURCH

1318 Rhododendron Dr. • 541-997-2523

Sunday Service 11am ( Children Sunday School)

Mid-Week Activities, all ages.

FLORENCE SEVENTH-DAY ADVENTIST

4445 Hwy 101 (South of Fred Meyer) – 997-3951

Worship on Saturday 11:00 A.M.

Adult/Children’s Sabbath School 10:00 A.M.

FLORENCE UNITARIAN UNIVERSALIST FELLOWSHIP

87738 Hwy 101 at Heceta Beach Road

RUAUU?  All are welcome to explore the answer.

Until it is safe to meet in person, Sunday Worship Services

are available 24/7 on our website: www.florenceuuf.org

FLORENCE UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

2nd & Kingwood • (541) 997-6025

Link to Sunday services at

www.fl orenceunitedmethodist.org

or fi nd us on Facebook.

FOURSQUARE CHURCH

1624 Highway 101 (next to A&W) –- 997-6337

Pastor George Pagel – Something for the entire family.

Sun. Services: 9:00 a.m. & 10:45 a.m.  

Wednesday Bible Study returns this Fall.

Website: fl orence4square.com

NEW LIFE LUTHERAN E.L.C.A.

21st & Spruce Streets—997-8113

Pastor, Paul Strike • All are welcome.

Sunday in-person worship service@ 10:30.

Also available to you on website

www.fl orencenewlifelutheran.org.

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH OF THE  SIUSLAW

3996 N Hwy 101       541-997-7136    

Internet and in person Sunday services at 10AM,

 Call the church for details. 

Reverend Greg Wood

All Welcome. Come as you are.

RELIGIOUS SOCIETY OF FRIENDS  (QUAKERS)

“War is still not the answer.” FCNL

We meet Sunday’s at 11am in our homes.

Call 408-482-1141 or 541-997-4237 for locations.

RESURRECTION LUTHERAN CHURCH, L.C.M.S.

Worship Services 10 am  •  Bible Study 9:00 am

Pastor Steve Waterman

85294 Hwy. 101 S.  –  997-8038 

DVD of Weekly worship service available.

www.puppro.wixite.com/rlcfl orence

ST. ANDREW’S EPISCOPAL

Church Welcomes You

Worship Sun. 9am Wed 11am 2135 19th St.

541-997-6600 standssecretary19@gmail.com Labyrinth & 

Garden daily 8am-5pm

“Be the change.”

SAINT MARY, OUR LADY OF THE DUNES 

CATHOLIC CHURCH

1.5 miles south of river on Hwy 101 –  997-2312

COVID-19 Compliant Masses have been scheduled.  

Please call our offi  ce for details.

Give us a call 541-997-3441

to get us your updates or email to:

mberg@thesiuslawnews.com

We are open and 
ready to assist you!

Johnston Motor Company 
Since 1939

2150 Hwy. 101 • Florence
(541) 997-3475 • 1-800-348-3475

LEGACY 

PORTRAITURE

Portraits that will show 
your innermost self.

RODGER BENNETT 

PHOTOGRAPHY
1234 Rhododendron Drive #7 | Florence, Oregon 97439

541-991-0777 | www.photobyrodger.com

1285 Bay Street, Old Town Florence 

(541) 902-8338

We are open for dine-in, take-out, 

sidewalk & patio seating

www.1285Restobar.com

FLOREN
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E
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20
20
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D

We are doing everything 
we can to safely 

serve our community.

We are open:

Noon to 8pm every day

2157 Royal St Georges Dr – A beautiful Tudor 

style home with 4 bdrms, 2.5 baths, plus office, in 

a gated golf course community. Extra tall interior 

doors and high ceilings, granite slab with new SS 

appliances, custom cabinets and backsplashes. 

New vinyl plank flooring, fenced backyard and 

“tree house”. $594,000. #3262-21328970

1749 Highway 101 • 541-997-1200

Let me Showcase your property.

Mike Blankenship

Broker

541 991-7826

New Listing

WatchWatch
“In Search of the Lord’s Way”“In Search of the Lord’s Way”

Sunday, 8:00 AMSunday, 8:00 AM

KMTR Cable Channel 12KMTR Cable Channel 12

Western Lane Translator Channel 16.2Western Lane Translator Channel 16.2

Then visit theThen visit the

Florence church of ChristFlorence church of Christ

1833 Tamarack1833 Tamarack

Florence, OregonFlorence, Oregon

and experience the joy and simplicity ofand experience the joy and simplicity of

pre-denominational New Testament Worship. (Romans 16:16)pre-denominational New Testament Worship. (Romans 16:16)

Bible Study: Sunday, 10:00 amBible Study: Sunday, 10:00 am

Worship: Sunday, 11:00 amWorship: Sunday, 11:00 am

www.churchofchristfl orence.orgwww.churchofchristfl orence.org

Community Foundation 2022 grant applications now available
Western Lane Commu-

nity Foundation (WLCF) 
has announced the open-
ing of its 2022 grant cycle. 
The grant application has 
been updated and can be 
found at wlcfonline.org. 

Each year, WLCF 
awards grants to local 
non-profit organizations 
for projects/programs in 
its target area of western 
Lane County. Grants are 

awarded in the areas of 
education, medicine and 
science, the arts, and so-
cial and civic services. In 
2021, over $89,000.00 was 
awarded to many of these 
worthy causes. The annu-
al amount to be awarded 
is determined by the per-
formance of the invested 
portfolio of discretionary 
funds during the current 
year.

The deadline for 2022 
grant requests is Jan. 15, 
2022. The application may 
be downloaded from WL-
CF’s website. It is highly 
recommended that appli-
cants review the updated 
Grant Guidelines. 

People can submit ap-
plications to Western 
Lane Community Foun-
dation, P.O. Box 1589, 
Florence, OR, 97439 or by 

email to wlcf@wlcfonline.
org in PDF format. 

Completed applications 
must be postmarked or 
emailed no later than 
close of business on Jan. 
15. 

Applications will be re-
viewed by the Board of 
Directors and each appli-
cant will be contacted by 
a Board Member for an 
interview regarding the 

request for funds. Grant-
ees will be selected in 
February and awarded in 
late March. Selected grant 
recipients will be required 
to submit a grant report 
due by Sept. 30, 2022.

Grant requests and 
awards will be selected 
based on merit, need and 
benefit to the community 
at large. Grant requests 
and award amounts vary 

greatly, but are usually 
between $100 and $5,000, 
depending on the nature 
of the grant project and 
funds available for distri-
bution. 

If applicants have ques-
tions or concerns about 
the new grant application, 
they are encouraged to 
contact WLCF at wlcf@
wlcfonline.org or 541-
997-1274.

TheSiuslawNews.com

The fall outdoor burn-
ing season will open on 
Friday, Oct. 15, for many 
Lane County residents. 
The season, originally set 
to start Oct. 1, was delayed 
by the Lane County Fire 
Defense Board and the 
Oregon Department of 
Forestry (ODF) due to a 
dry and warmer than av-
erage weather outlook.

“Recent rain has been 

beneficial to reducing 
wildfire danger across Or-
egon,” said Lane Region-
al Air Protection Agency 
(LRAPA) Spokesperson 
Travis Knudsen. “But the 
current forecast is dry, 
sunny, and warm.”

Yard debris may not 
be burned while the sea-
son remains closed. Lane 
Forest Products, Rexius, 
or Lane County’s transfer 

stations and dumpsites 
are resources available to 
those who wish to dispose 
of woody yard material 
ahead of the burn season 
on Oct. 15. Residents who 
burn during the closed 
season are subject to viola-
tions ranging from $50 to 
$2,500 or more.

LRAPA has published a 
factsheet providing infor-
mation on non-burning 

disposal alternatives for 
natural vegetation in Lane 
County.

The Lane County Fire 
Defense Board and ODF 
will decide to open the fall 
burning season or delay it 
further closer to Oct. 15. 
People can check on the 
season’s status by going 
online at www.lrapa.org, 
Coastal residents may call 
541-997-1757.

Fire season delays opening of fall outdoor burning until Oct. 15
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