
ANNOUNCEMENTS

Lost & Found

Lost gray and black Tabby cat. 
4-white paws, white chest. 
North Seapines Drive area. 
541-997-5686. 

SERVICES

Cleaning Services

Florence Cleaning LLC– 
Licensed bonded & insured, 
is now providing professional 
residential cleaning. Call 
today 541-999-5033 or book 
at www.fl orencecleaning.
com. 

Road and Driveway 

Services

Duman Inc. Excavation & 
Hauling – Local Business. 
Will work anywhere. Rock 
and Sand Delivery available 
Now! 541-999-9464. 

EMPLOYMENT

Help Wanted

Auto Body Technician – 
Johnston Motor Co seeking 
full-time experienced 
collision repair Auto Body 
Technician. Frame & struc-
tural experience required. 
2-plus years journeyman 
experience. Quality minded & 
results oriented. Contact Pat: 
541-997-3475. 

Bookkeeper/Secretary 
– Mapleton Fire Board is 
looking for a bookkeeper/
secretary. Can work at home, 
PT hours. Send resume to: 
Mapleton Fire Dept., Attn: 
hiring committee, PO Box 
362, Mapleton, OR 97453. 

Bus Driver -�Triangle Lake 
school district - needed 4 
hours/day AM & PM. Small, 
school-based team. CDL 
required, drug test and 
background check. See 
Employment at�www.blachly.
k12.or.us. 

Caregiver or CNA – NEW 
COMPETITIVE WAGE SCALE 
$15 per hour, lots of hours 
& shifts! Paid Training. New 
Horizon’s In-home care. 398 
Hwy. 101. 541-997-8115. 

Caregivers –�Spruce Point 
–�Looking for people who 
have a passion for working 
w/seniors.�Wage DOE.�Please 
apply in person @ 375 
9th�Street, across from the 
hospital. 

City Lights Cinemas - cur-
rently in search for a new co-
star! We are seeking a highly 
organized individual with a 
winning personality who has 
experience working in the 
arts to handle day-to-day front 
of house cinema operations 
for fi lms and special events. 
Dedication to the goals of 
excellent customer service 
and outstanding fi lm presen-
tation are essential. Candi-
dates should be self-starters 
who can work collaboratively. 
We are creating a high-quality 
movie-going experience at 
City Lights, and your dedica-
tion to delivering this to our 
customers is critical. Shifts 
are primarily evenings and 
weekends. Approximately 20 
hours per week— a fl exible 
schedule is a plus. Starting 
wage is $11.50 per hour. 

Driftwood Shores Resort is 
now hiring! - We are cur-
rently accepting applications 
for experienced housekeep-
ers, house persons (janitorial 
& housekeeping duties) and 
window washers. An overall 

Office Hours:  

8 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Monday through Friday

Phone: 

541-997-3441

Fax: 

541-997-7979

Address:

148 Maple St.

PO Box 10

Florence, OR 97439

DEADLINES:
Wednesday Issue: Reg-

ular classified ads, Mon-

day 1 p.m.; Boxed, Display 

Classified Ads & Vehicle/

Boat Promos, Monday 12 

p.m.; Service Directory - 

Friday, 5:00 p.m. 

Saturday Issue: Regular 

classified ads, Thursday 

1 p.m.; Boxed, Display 

Classified Ads & Vehicle/

Boat Promos, Thursday 12 

p.m.; Service Directory - 

Wednesday, 5:00 p.m. 

ADJUSTMENTS:
 If your advertisement ap-

pears incorrectly, notify us 

immediately.  We will not 

be responsible for more 

than one incorrect inser-

tion.  Such responsibility 

is limited to correct inser-

tion of advertisement.  No 

information on the classi-

fied pages will be released 

prior to publication.

Ads are in Area Code

(541)
unless otherwise 

indicated in ad.

SERVING: FLORENCE - MAPLETON - DUNES CITY - WESTLAKE - GARDINER - REEDSPORT

INFORMATION

Classifi ed

understanding of hotel clean-
ing procedures is preferred. 
Must have reliable transporta-
tion. Se habla espanol. Please 
apply in person. 

Driftwood Shores - The 
Surfside Restaurant at is now 
accepting applications for a 
full-time Bartender, part-time 
bar staff and dishwashers. 
Please apply in person to 
the Surfside Restaurant any 
day between 10:00am and 
4:00pm. 

Maintenance Position 
Florentine Estates - FT with 
benefi ts include PTO, health 
insurance & paid holidays. 
Duties include landscap-
ing, painting, custodial, 
monitoring pools & general 
maintenance.�Job requires 
valid ODL, criminal history 
check and pre-employment 
drug testing.�Heavy lifting, 
carrying & ability to work with 
cleaning chemicals & outdoor 
pesticides is necessary.�Call 
541-997-1762 M-F 8-4 for 
application/Resume informa-
tion. Salary DOE. �

McDonalds Crew –�Seeking 
enthusiastic & outgoing in-
dividuals looking for fl exible 
schedule up to 30hrs/wk. 
Apply in store or online @ 
restaurantjobs.mcdonalds.
com. 

Permit Technician - The City 
of Dunes City is accepting 
applications for a full-time 
Permit Technician. Salary: 
$12.00 to $14.00/hr., 28-
32 hrs. per week. Position 
requires data entry, strong 
time management skills, and 
attention to detail. A success-
ful candidate will accept and 
review building plans and 
permits, review compliance 
with codes and state law, and 
issue and track building per-
mits. Must have a minimum 
of 1 year of offi ce employ-
ment experience. A full job 
description is available on 
our website: www.dunesc-
ityhall.com. Building code 
experience is a plus. Resume, 
application & cover letter may 
be emailed to: recorder@
dunescityor.com.  Questions 
may be directed to: Jamie 
Mills, 541-997-3338.  The 
City of Dunes City is an equal 
opportunity employer & 
service provider. 

Planning Tech - The City 
of Dunes City is accepting 
applications for a part-time 
Planning Tech. Salary: $12.00 
to $14.00/hr., 25 to 28 hours 
per week. Position requires 
evening meetings twice a 
month. Must have excellent 
spelling and grammar skills 
and enjoy attention to detail. 
Must type 60+ wpm. Position 
involves transcription of 
minutes for City Council 
and Planning Commission 
meetings and preparing 
materials for Planning Com-
mission Meetings. A full job 
description is available on our 
website: www.dunescityhall.
com. Resume, application & 
cover letter may be emailed 
to: recorder@dunescityor.
com. Questions may be 
directed to: Jamie Mills, 541-
997-3338. The City of Dunes 
City is an equal opportunity 
employer & service provider. 

Pool Attendant - Help 
needed at Coastal Fitness. 
Part-time Pool Attendant. 
Please apply in person 2285 
Hwy. 101. 541-997-8086. 

Siuslaw Public Library - is 
hiring for part-time and 
on-call positions. More infor-
mation is available at�www.
siuslawlibrary.org.

MERCHANDISE

Garage Sales

Estate Sale
Fri. 2/21-Sun. 2/23

9am-5pm
1713 2nd & 1705 30th Street
Furniture, Housewares, Décor. 

Priced to sell.

Medical Equipment

Portable Oxygen Concen-
trator May Be Covered by 
Medicare! Reclaim inde-
pendence and mobility with 
the compact design and 
long-lasting battery of Inogen 
One. Free information kit! Call 
855-792-9764. 

Miscellaneous

Beer Brewing Equipment – 
2-Carboys, bottle cases- 22oz., 
5-kegs, CO-2 bottles, regula-
tor, double sink, much, much 
more. Asking $250. Call Ken 
541-999-2140. 

Concrete Pavers – Red 
12”x12”. $1.15/ea., up to 500 
available. 530-409-4274. 

Kym Prater Local AVON ISR 
– Buy or Sell. Free sign up. 
www.youravon.com/kymprat-
er. 541-999-7984. 

Musical Instruments

Wurlitzer Organ – $100/obo. 
541-997-1588. 

Sporting Goods

40 caliber pistol ammunition. 
500 rounds. By all or part. 
Good price. 541-991-0276.

To Give Away

Queen bed + Frame – Not too 
used. Plastic wrapped in dry 
storage. You take away. Free. 
541-729-1206.

REAL ESTATE

Apartment For Rent

$700/mo. -�450sq.ft. apt 
above Lovejoy’s, Old Town. 
NP/NS of anything. New fl oor-
ing. Laundry facility. Electricity 
by Tenant. Garbage, water, 
sewer by Landlord. Debbie: 
541-999-1913 VM/text. Last 
months, plus $600 deposit, 
1-yr commit, then month to 
month. Avail. 3/1 or sooner. 

Wanted To Rent

Wanted - furnished room/
apartment for 2-3mos. from 
June 15-Sept 15, 2020.�Sin-
gle mature lady and 13-yr. old 
Golden Retriever.�References. 
760-920-7210.�

AUTOMOTIVE

Vehicles 

1985 BUICK 

 30K mi., always 
garaged. New tires, 

wiring harness, 
fuel tank, fuel filter, 
spark plugs & wires, 

distributer, 
runs great. 

$1,700
541-228-0973

2014 MERCEDES 

SMART CAR “2”

 27.5K mi., exc. 
Cond., A/C, heated 

seats, garaged, 
great gas mileage. 
Leather int. $8,000

541-902-0202

S
O
L
D

2008 TOYOTA MTR
 

4dr, 130K miles, 
auto trans, A/C. 

Real Sharp!
$5,995 obo

541-902-1368
or

541-991-2274

S
O
L
D

2008 CHRYSLER 
300 

Very Nice. $7,995
Stk#19T67B

2015 KIA SOUL
Low Miles.

$13,995 Stk#19T28A

2016 SUBARU 
OUTBACK

Low Miles.

$20,995 Stk#19T69A

2011 FORD ESCAPE
AWD, Low Miles.

$10,995
Stk#19U64A

2013 HONDA 
ACCORD

Clean, 1 Owner.

$10,995 Stk#19U39A

2015 FORD TRANSIT 
CONNECT
Extra Clean.

$16,995
Stk#19T18A

2016 FORD EDGE 
$17,995
Stk#19U63

2150 Hwy. 101. Florence

(541) 997-3475

1-800-348-3475

ON

SALE

1999 BUICK 

CENTURY LTD
 

4dr, sun roof
$2,900

541-999-9301

541-997-7653

1870 HWY 126, SUITE A

PO BOX 3040

FLORENCE, OR

FAX 541-997-7654

VISIT US ONLINE AT 

WWW.JIMHOBERG.COM 

RESIDENTIAL

LAND

COMMERCIAL

PROPERTY

MANAGEMENT

Brand new home in the upscale 

Shelter Cove neighborhood. 1793 sq. 

ft. of living space, 3 bdrms, 2 baths 

& open style kitchen living and 

dining room. Oversized windows, 

high ceilings, spacious master. 

Attached 2-car garage. $424,500 

List #915/19076643
Spacious 3 bdrm, 2 bath home with an 

attached 3 car garage.  Located in-town 

near shopping & schools.  Open kitchen 

& dining area.  Split bdrm style fl oor plan.  

Fenced yard with storage shed, garden 

space & RV parking.  $368,500 

List #951/19558310

Double wide MFD home with 1536 sq. ft. 

of living space on nice sized corner lot.  3 

bdrms, 2 baths, circular driveway w/RV 

parking. Oversized living area & slider to 

front porch. Master suite w/dbl w-i-c & 

soaking tub. $199,900 List #938/19662511

Come check out this great Commercial 

property in Glenada with 200 feet of HWY 

101 frontage! Ready to house your venture 

or be a piece of your investment portfolio. 

.54 Acre lot.  Property has septic & well on 

site. $199,500 List #942/19417936

Three bdrm 2 bath home in Greentrees 

Village located at the top of the hill in a 

cozy cul-de-sac location.  Kitchen & din-

ing room have great storage.  Master suite 

with jetted tub & double vanity.  Laundry 

room with W&D.  $219,500 

List #935/19295737

1.79 Acre lot in Dunes City is leveled and 

approved for a 3 bdrm home. Located 

south of Florence along Clear Lake Road. 

Come take a look & see what this site has 

to offer! $160,000 List #934/19477935

Commercial project property on the 

Siuslaw River. One commercial building 

started, with approval for 3 additional 

2-story buildings plus observation decks.  

Second story could be riverfront 

residential. $735,000 List #833/18686220
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COAST REAL ESTATE
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PO BOX C

FLORENCE, OR 97439

Follow us 

on Twitter

@SIUSLAWNEWS

2014 DODGE 

JOURNEY
 

Black, AVP Sport 
Utility, 54K mi., 
tinted windows.

$12,500
1-310-913-4987

1933 CHEVROLET MASTER 

EAGLE TOWN SEDAN

 With intergral 
trunk. Independent 
front ends, rack & 
pinion steering. 
541-747-3269 

Call Don for price.

15’ HYDRA SPORTS BASS BOAT

 As stable as a barge, 
as fast as the new boats 
at a fraction of the cost. 

Package comes with 
30hp motor, a 2001 

Honda 2hp 
4 stroke motor and a 

perfect fi t trailer. $1,800. 
541-991-6677

2004 CHEVY 

1500
 

134K mi., V8, 
asking $8,200

Call Randy
541-991-9822

2010 KEYSTONE 

HIDEOUT 21’
 

Very good shape. 
$9,900 obo. 

Located in Florence, 
OR. Call or text 
559-994-6294

 

1990 MAZDA MIATA
 

Newer paint, 
top & wheels. 

Additional 
accessories.

$4,995
541-997-3356

S
O
L
D

1972 VINTAGE 

HOLIDAIRE TRAVEL 

TRAILER 22’
 

Restored & 
beautiful 

$7,000 obo
call/text:

541-999-7524

REDUCED

DRIFTWOOD SHORES CONDOS 

FOR SALE

Great investment opportunity & vacation 
destination at Drift wood Shores. 

3-bedroom, 2 bath units. 
Priced at $286,000. 

Units are currently in the rental pool. 
Visit www.drift woodshores.com 

For photos and amenities. 
For further information

Contact Miriam Bolton at 541-729-1096

Combined Realty Services 541-485-2915

2003 MONACO 

WINDSOR
 

★★REDUCED★★

40ft., 2 slides, 
Low mi., No smoke, 

No pets. 
Lots of extras. 

$49,900
Local 916-761-4151

1952 MILITARY JEEP
 

Needs full 
restoration, 
clear title, 

great project. 
$1,500 obo

541-999-4175

2011 ROADTREK
 

190 Popular, 
14,555 mi., 

AC/heat pump, 
fully contained, 
upgrades, like 
new. $52,995
541-997-5393

2006 CHEVY 

COBALT
 

5 speed, 
35+ MPG

$3,200
425-772-4395

PUBLIC 
NOTICES

IN THE CIRCUIT 

COURT FOR THE STATE 

OF OREGON

COUNTY OF LANE

In the matter of the 

estate of,

GLADYS P. WILDS

DECEASED

Case No.: 20PB00912

NOTICE TO 

INTERESTED PERSONS

NOTICE IS HEREBY 

GIVEN that the under-

signed has been ap-

pointed personal rep-

resentative. All persons 

having claims against 

the estate are required 

to present them, with 

vouchers attached, to 

the undersigned per-

sonal representative 

at P. O. Box B, Florence, 

Oregon, 97439, within 

four months after the 

date of fi rst publication 

of this notice, or the 

claims may be barred.

All persons whose 

rights may be aff ect-

ed by the proceedings 

may obtain additional 

information from the 

records of the court, the 

personal representa-

tive, or the attorney for 

the personal represen-

tative, Scott T. Bailey, At-

torney at Law, P.C. at P.O. 

Box B, Florence, Oregon 

97439.

Dated and fi rst pub-

lished February 22, 

2020.

/s/ Lynn Twombly 

Personal Representa-

tive

Publication Dates: 

February 22, 29, & 

March 7, 2020

PUBLIC NOTICE

TOMASI SALYER MAR-

TIN PC v. DORIS LUTZ; 

SELCO COMMUNITY 

CREDIT UNION; CAVAL-

RY SPV I, LLC; WESTERN 

MERCANTILE AGENCY, 

INC.; STATE OF ORE-

GON DEPARTMENT OF 

REVENUE; STATE OF 

OREGON DEPARTMENT 

OF HUMAN SERVICES, 

SENIOR AND DISABLED 

SERVICES DIVISION; and 

DEPARTMENT OF TREA-

SURY - INTERNAL REV-

ENUE SERVICES OF THE 

UNITED STATES

SUMMONS - Case No.  

19CV53362

IN THE CIRCUIT 

COURT OF THE STATE 

OF OREGON FOR THE 

COUNTY OF LANE

TO: DORIS LUTZ, one 

of the above-named 

defendants

You are hereby re-

quired to appear and 

defend the complaint 

fi led against you in the 

above entitled action 

within 30 days from the 

date of the fi rst publica-

tion of this summons, 

and in case of your fail-

ure to appear and an-

swer, plaintiff  for want 

thereof will apply to the 

above entitled court for 

the relief prayed for in 

its complaint, to-wit:

Permit Plaintiff  to 

interplead Surplus 

Funds from the trust-

ee’s of 4793 Treewood 

Dr, Florence, OR 97349 

into the registry of the 

court; Discharge Plain-

tiff  from any and all 

claims and liability with 

respect to the Surplus 

Funds; Award Plaintiff  

its reasonable and nec-

essary attorney’s fees

and court costs from

the Surplus Funds; and 

for such other and fur-

ther relief as the court 

deems just and reason-

able.

NOTICE TO 

DEFENDANT: READ 

THESE PAPERS 

CAREFULLY!

You must “appear” in 

this case or the other 

side will win automat-

ically. To “appear” you

must fi le with the court 

a legal document called 

a “motion” or “answer.” 

The “motion” or “an-

FREE! Sell your household items for free. 
Total value of item must be $300 or less. Free 

ads include 20-words or less and run 4 times.


