
In addition to the camp-
ing, hiking, tidepooling, 
and picnicking, visitors to 
the Cape Perpetua Visitor 
Center can choose from an 
array of activities this sum-
mer.

Events kicked off June 1 
and continue throughout 
the summer. 

Ongoing events this sum-
mer at Cape Perpetua:

• Mondays through Sept. 
2 — Walk with a Ranger. 
Begins at noon at the Visi-
tor Center.

Join, retired Chief Park 
Ranger, Michael Noack, for 
an easy to moderate hike 
where he will be sharing 
information about the local 
flora and fauna. 

Hikes will last 75-90 min-
utes.

• Wednesdays through 
Aug. 28 — Under the Sea 

(10 a.m. to 3 p.m. at the Vis-
itor Center).

Oregon doesn’t stop at 
the beach. Take a deeper 
dive into the Cape Perpetua 
Marine Reserve by joining 
Tara DuBois, Communica-
tions Coordinator for the 
Cape Perpetua Collabora-
tive, for interactive exhibits 
at the Visitor Center. 

At 3 p.m., DuBois will 
lead a stroll on the Captain 
Cook’s Trail to explore the 
rocky shoreline and marine 
reserve.

• Thursdays through 
Aug. 29 — Lunch with Dr. 
Jim Nechols, beginning at 
noon at the Visitor Center.

Dr. Jim Nechols, retired 
professor of Entomology 
from Kansas State Uni-
versity, will present “Alien 
Invaders: Invasive Plants 
of Siuslaw National For-

est” and “Self Defense 101 
for Insects: Insect Defense 
Mechanisms.”

• Saturdays through Aug. 
31 — Ranger F.E.D Talks, 
beginning at noon at the 
Visitor Center.

Join Siuslaw National 
Forest Field Rangers for a 
fun and informative “For-
est, Explore, Discover” 
Siuslaw National Forest 
presentation in the Cape 
Perpetua Visitor Center 
theater.

• Tuesdays, Wednesdays 
and Thursdays through 
Sept. 5 — Walk with a 
Ranger, beginning at noon 
at the Visitor Center.

Explore a variety of nat-
ural history topics on The 
Giant Spruce Trail, Discov-
ery Loop or Captain Cook 
Trail on a guided hike lead 
by Siuslaw National Forest 
Field Rangers.

All events are free, but a 
Northwest Forest Pass, Ore-
gon Coast Passport, federal 
recreation pass or $5 day-
use fee is required within 
the Cape Perpetua Scenic 
Area and at some trailheads 
and day use sites. 

For more information on 
these events, contact the 
Cape Perpetua Visitor Cen-
ter at 541-547-3289. 
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Sat.-Sun. 6/22-6/23

10am-4pm
89271 Hwy. 101
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fishing will continue to be 
good through the sum-
mer and into the fall.

Siltcoos also gets 
stocked rainbow trout, 
check the stocking sched-
ule for numbers and dates 
of stockings.

TENMILE LAKES: 
Trout, warmwater species, 
largemouth bass 

Conditions should be 
prime for bass, crappie, 

bluegill, and brown bull-
head catfish angling at 
this time. Anglers also use 
small jigs or a worm on a 
hook fished near the bot-
tom to catch yellow perch.

The Tenmile Lakes 
have been stocked with 
legal-size rainbow trout. 
Tenmile Lakes provide 
some nice holdover trout 
this time of year, and 
some can measure over 
17-inches long. Try troll-
ing slowly with a spinner 
tipped with a worm.

Fishing from 1B

SCORES & STANDINGS

SENIOR TRIO  6/12/19

TEAMS WINS LOSSES

GUMDROPS 17 3 

NEVER SAY DIE 16.5 3.5 

STORM 14.5 5.5 

SUMMER FUN 10 10 

NO TEN 9.5 10.5 

3 TRAVELERS 5.5 14.5 

GREAT PUMPKINS 4 16 

TEAM 5 3 17 

HIGH GAME SCRATCH  

MEN  

LARRY LAVIOE 237

WOMEN  

LINDA SPECHT 183

HIGH SERIES SCRATCH  

MEN  

CAL HILKEY 588

WOMEN  

PAT EDDY 455

HIGH HDCP GAME  

MEN  

DUANE CUNNINGHAM 253

WOMEN  

PHYLLIS LOTTON 234

HIGH HDCP SERIES  

MEN  

MICHAEL MACDUFFEE 635

WOMEN  

SALLY JORDAN 621

BOWLING

OCEAN DUNES GOLF LINKS — 2P BEST BALL  6-13-19                                                      

FLIGHT 1

1ST LOW GROSS: JOE WRIGHT & GARY KADEL — 74

1ST LOW NET: BILL GILLETTE & RICK LANASA — 60

FLIGHT 2

1ST LOW GROSS: JACK KAY & DAN PEASE — 80

1ST LOW NET: HERB SWAIN & DICK KAPRIELIAN — 59

FLIGHT 3

1ST LOW GROSS: LLOYD BAKER & RICK HARDWICK — 84

1ST LOW NET: DAVID RIPLEY & BOB GRAVES — 59

GOLF

The Oregon Coast 
Aquarium is inviting the 
public to explore Oregon’s 
coastal waters this summer 
while helping local scien-
tists for the annual Marine 
Reserve Bioblitzes.

The aquarium and part-
ners are hosting a series of 
“Bioblitzes” along the coast 
during the months of June 
and July in order to survey 
the plants and animals of 
the region.

A Bioblitz is an intensive 
survey of a defined area on 
a single day with the goal 
of identifying all the spe-
cies to be found in that 
area at one time — it is a 
snapshot of biodiversity.

Bioblitzes are free, open 
to all ages and are a great 
way to explore Oregon’s 
tidepools during the lowest 
tides of the year. 

Participants can down-
load the iNaturalist app to 
contribute their findings to 
the Bioblitz. This is a use-
ful tool (for smartphones) 
which enables any observ-
er of the natural world, of 
any skill level, to contrib-
ute information to a vast 
national database.

The first round of 
Bioblitzes was June 1-7 at 
multiple Marine Reserve 
locations, and the second 
round is in the first week of 
July. 

For a complete list of 
dates, locations and times, 
visit www.aquarium.org/
bioblitz.

The State of Oregon has 
five marine reserves: Cape 
Falcon, Cascade Head, 
Otter Rock, Cape Perpetua, 
and Redfish Rocks. These 
areas in our coastal waters 
are dedicated to conserva-
tion and scientific research, 
where all ocean develop-
ment and removal of spe-
cies is prohibited. 

Oregon created the 
marine reserves to con-
serve marine habitats and 
biodiversity while serving 
as living laboratories to 
learn about Oregon’s near-

shore ecosystems and the 
potential effects that pro-
tections can have over 
time.

In order to understand 
the effects of the reserves, 
key information is needed 
on the original species 
compositions of each area 
to establish a baseline i.e. 
what and and plant species 
are there and how abun-
dant are they? 

The Bioblitzes, along 
with dive surveys and 
SMURFing (Standard 
Monitoring Unites for the 
Recruitment of Fishes), 
serve as methods for col-
lecting this key informa-
tion.

EXPLORE COAST, HELP SCIENTISTS DURING LOWEST TIDES OF YEAR

Special summer programs continue at Cape Perpetua


