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Saturday, August 25, 2018
FLORENCE EVENTS CENTER

FREE ADMISSION
LIVE DEMOS, VENDORS, PRIZES! 

DOORS OPEN AT 10AM

READY Expo
STORM

IDENTIFY  •  PREPARE  •  SURVIVE

FREE HOT DOG LUNCH
SPONSORED BY KIWANIS

OREGON COASTOREGON COAST

BEBE

READYREADY

FIRST 300 GUESTS WILL RECEVE ONE 2.5 GALLON WATER CONTAINER

PRESENTED BY:

Sponsored by:

Always Something HappeningAlways Something Happening

541.997.1994  |  888.968.4086541.997.1994  |  888.968.4086
715 QUINCE STREET 

FLORENCE, OR 97439  

 WWW.EVENTCENTER.ORG

1749 Highway 101 • 541-997-1200

Buying or Selling? I can help.

Richard Beaudro

Principal Broker

541 991-6677
Chets Trail #2100 – Rare 5 acre secluded par-

cel in the woods. Septic approved, well in place, 

power to the lot. Fantastic lake frontage with 

two potential building sites and Woahink Creek 

running though the lot. Bring your home plans! 

$200,000. #2371-14010831

2150 Hwy. 101 • Florence
(541) 997-3475 • 1-800-348-3475

See Jim for your auto sales needs!See Jim for your auto sales needs!

OSAAtoday will be an 
additional platform in Oregon 
to promote the benefits of 
interscholastic activities. 

 “The OSAA is extremely 
excited to partner with these 
two exceptional writers that 
have such extensive experi-
ence in the Oregon prep 

space,” said Peter Weber, 
OSAA Executive Director. 
“We are also thrilled to be 
able to provide an educational 
component to this initiative 
with our student contribu-
tors.  We feel this will be a 
great resource to get journal-
ism and yearbook classes 
involved in their local com-
munities.”

Key to Siuslaw’s rally was the defen-

sive efforts of freshman libero Hayden 

Muller, who dug up 19 attempted kills 

against the Bulldogs, along with serv-

ing up 3 aces.

“Hayden was an animal out there,” 

Hornung said of Muller’s work on the 

court. The talented freshman fills 

what was a potentially worrisome void 

after the graduation of all-league libe-

ro Maci Wells last June. The Viks 

opened the match with a narrow 25-20 

win, in a set that Siuslaw rallied from 

behind to tie at 8-8. 

The game was tied three more times 

before kills from junior Mia Collins 

and seniors Alyssa Richards and Falon 

Borgnino helped secure the win. 

However, in the next two sets North 

Bend was able to edge out the Lady 

Viks 25-20, 25-20, taking a 2-1 lead in 

the match that put the Lady Bulldogs 

in a position to end the match in four 

sets.

“But we came back strong,” said 

Hornung, who credited Richards’ 

leadership with helping keep the 

team’s momentum going. “She was 

very vocal and helped keep everyone 

focused.”

In addition, Collins was steadily 

hammering away at North Bend, par-

ticularly in game four, before eventu-

ally finishing the night with 17 kills, 

along with 10 from Richards.

After winning the fourth set 

decisively 25-16, Siuslaw contin-

ued its march to victory, moving 

ahead 6-0 on errors from North 

Bend and aces served up by junior 

Aylenne Vazquez.

The Bulldogs had a short-lived 

rally late in the game, pulling 

within 6 points, but kills from 

Collins and Borgnino kept the 

Lady Viks rolling toward a 15-8 

win to take the match, 3-2.

The victory bodes well for 

Siuslaw as it enters the newly-ad-

justed Sky-Em League along with 

Cottage Grove, Marshfield and 

Marist, which are ranked No. 3, 

No. 5 and No. 8, respectively, by 

the Oregon School Activities 

Association (OSAA).

The Sky-Em also includes 

strong programs from Junction 

City and Elmira.

The Lady Viks will get a short 

break before participating in the 

Bandon Jamboree, Sept. 4, when 

Siuslaw will get a chance to volley 

against Bandon and North 

Douglas.

The Viks will return to Glenn 

Butler court Sept. 6 to host 

Pleasant Hill for a non-league 

match beginning at 6:30 p.m.

Siuslaw will open the league 

season Sept. 13, at home, against 

Cottage Grove. 

OSAA from 1B

Viks from 1B
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Viking junior Mia Collins (far right) checks the scoreboard in game four during Siuslaw's rally against North Bend.
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