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Back to Hospital "Wander

Interviews Slated Evelyn
Merry Scenes from Austria presented at Willamette univer- -

sity Tuesday evening by the Austrian Goodwill tour group of
Vienna. Attendance crowded Waller hall to hear songs and
observe dances of Austria presented by performers in native
costumes.

Austrian Students
Enjoyed in Salem

By EILEEN SCOTT ROSS
As a goodwill gesture and as pleasant entertainment, "Merry

Scenes from Austria," presented at Willamette university last
night, was a hit.

The warm audience response was largely due to Dr. Susanne
Polsterer, mistress of ceremonies and in charge of production.

iler contagious gaiety caught up

provided for continued regula-
tion.
Madison Street Discussed

Attached to the report is a
detailed statement relative to the
Madison street route. It says:

"This route at one time made
a loop through Lansing avenue,
Sunnyview avenue and Fisher
road. This was eliminated in
the . last route change, and
part of Fisher road is served by
the present Swegle school oper
ations. The present Madison
street route splits at 24th and
Market, making one trip south
on 24th to D street; D street to
Park avenue; Park avenue to
Sunnyview; and then return to
the city center. The alternate
route proceeds to Market street,
to Evergreen; to Sunnyview, to
Park streeet; thence back to
Market and then return to city
center. It is believed that such
route should be extended to Lan
sing and Sunnyview, and the en
tire area should have a half
hour bus service. An effective
way of developing a 'loop' route
and keeping as many right-han- d

turns as possible, would follow
a route to Market, Evergreen,
Sunnyview, Jelden avenue,
Brenna, Lansing, back to Sun
nyview, Childs or Park avenue;
thence to Park and on to Mar
ket street and then south on
Park to D street, west on D
street to 24th, north on 24th
street to Market and return to
town along the regular Mad:
son street route. This schedule
would serve about 700 homes
within a three block walk of the
entire 'loop.' "

Thomas Speaking Here Nor
man Thomas, leader of the soci
alist party, will speak at a pub-
lic meeting here next Tuesday
night under the sponsorship of
the Willamette university Philo
sophy club, according to Wen-
dell Barnett, county socialist
leader. He is scheduled to dis
cuss "Christian Ethics and Pri
vate Enterprise."

Grange Club Guest Mrs
Denver Young will entertain
members of the home economics
club of the Roberts Grange at
her home Wednesday night at 8
o'clock with Mrs. Chet Nelson
assistant hostess. Speaker of
the evening will be Steve Ander-
son. .

Movies for Club Reynolds
Allen of Salem, will show mov
ing pictures taken during the
war at the Friday night meeting
of the Popcorn community club.
The program will be preceded by
a 6:30 o clock covered dish din-
ner at the school.

Linn Couple Licensed Ob
taining a marriage license at
Vacouver, Wash., were Chester
W. Oakley, Lebanon, and Alma
R. Walton, Albany.

Educators Coming A dinner
meeting of Alpha Tau field chap-
ter of Phi Delta Kappa, profes
sional education fraternity, is
expected to bring many Willam
ette valley educators here Sat-
urday night. Dr. G. Herbert
Smith, president of Willamette
university, will speak on federal
aid to education. Members are
expected from Salem, Sllverton,
Woodbum, Monmouth, Albany,
Corvallis, McMinnville and Port-
land.

Explains Co-o- p Store John
Bollinger, new manager of the
Farmers Union cooperative store
here, will describe the operations
of the store at a meeting of the
spring valley local No. 242 at
the school house Friday night at
8 o'clock. This will be the first
meeting at the North Spring
Valley school as all previous
ones have been held at the Zena
school.

performers and spectators alike
and carried the show along in a
festival mood,

Under the local sponsorship
of Willamette's International
Relations club, the "goodwill
tour of the United States" is a

project of the UNESCO commis
sion for Austria. Thirty students
and teachers form the company
which is bringing to American
audiences the folklore of Aus
tria in song and dance.

Although all the dancers wore
authentic costumes of various
sections of their native land.
perhaps the most colorful were
the leather breeches of the
young men dancing "Der Kreuz- -

polka," a lively number suggest-
ing a slapping battle.

Accompaniment included pi
ano, accordion, guitar, violin and
harp. There was a great deal of
yodeling, with Vroni Stoeckl of
fering the familiar "Archduke
Johann" yodel of Styria.

The closing shifted from the
quaint scenes of the Alps to the
dreamy atmosphere of Vienna.
Linda Zamponi danced a Vien-
nese waltz to the "Blue Danube"
in the finale.

Dr. Polsterer expressed grati-
tude for the
of the people of Salem as she
spoke to the capacity crowd in
waller hall after the show. Mem
bers of the tour were enter-
tained in the fraternity and sor
ority houses on campus during
meir siay nere,

Tnor Lodge to Elect TJip
regular monthly meeting of
rnor Lodge, Sons of Norwav
will be held in the Woman's
Club house, 460 North Cottaee
Deginning at 8 o'clock Saturday
night. Business to be transacted
at the meeting will be election
of officers for the ensuing year,
initiation of new members and
adopting plans for a special so
cial meeting to be held in May-
flower hall beginning at 7:30
Friday, March 24. Canasta will
be played after the business
meeting Saturday night. Mrs. A.
J. Sholseth and Mrs .Elmer
Amundson will have charge of
refreshments.

Power Bids Wanted Bids for
the construction of eight miles
of electric line in Marion coun
ty as part of the net operated by
the Benton-Lincol- n Electric co
operative, will be opened April
5. The line will be erected above
the Detroit dam generally along
tne line of the Santiam river.

(Continued from Page 1)

In a major foreign policy
speech prepared for San Fran-Cisco- 's

Commonwealth club.
Acheson also:

1. Declared the United States
stands ready to trade with China
on a fair basis but not to sell
the Chinese "goods which may
be used to harm us."
Russia Accused

2. Accused Russia of shipping
food from China to the Soviet
union at a time when 40,000,000
Chinese face possible starvation;
also accused Russia of having
robbed Manchuria of industrial
equipment with $2 000,000,000
worth of productive capacity in
1945.

3. Described the new Soviet
$300,000,000 five year program
of aid to China as falling far
short of "China's real needs and
desires."

4. Said the major threat to
freedom and progress through-
out Asia today is "the attempted
penetration of Asia by st

imperialism and by
the colonialism which it con-
tains."

5. Declared the American peo
ple are the real leaders of a "re
volution by the common peo-
ple" and that communism as a
"tool of Soviet imperialism" per-
verts the real democratic revo-
lution.
Explains Plan

In discussing American assist-
ance to countries opposing com-
munism, Acheson summed it up
this way:

"In some situations it will be
military assistance. In others, it
may be grants or loans, such as
the recent one hundred million
dollar credit to the republic of
the United States of Indonesia.
In still other cases, the need may
be for technical assistance.

"These are not new principals
nor is the application of them
to the Far East a new departure.
In Japan, Korea, the Philip-
pines, Indonesia, and Thailand,
for example, we have been
demonstrating our desire to help
where such help can strengthen
the cause of freedom.

"It has been a great disap-
pointment that the help which
we rendered on a massive scale
to China did not result in bring-
ing peace and economic recov-
ery to the Chinese people as we
had hoped. That does not mean
that the attempt to help was
wrong, nor does it mean that
we should not help others who
seek to maintain their freedom
and independence. It merely un
derlines that our help can only
reinforce the efforts which oth-
ers are prepared to make on
their own behalf."

Star Route Bids The post of-

fice department is calling for
bids for the operation of a num-
ber of star mail routes. None of
the three routes operating out
of Salem is effected although
the route from Sllverton to Hult
is involved. Proposals will be
received by the postal service in
Washington, D.C., up to May 11
for operation of the routes from
July 1, 1950 to June 30, 1954.

John Wenger First John
Wenger, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Karl Wenger, and a pupil in the
fourth grade at McKinley school,
placed first in the KOAC pro-
gram "Land of Make Believe"
picture contest for the week of
March 6. The story illustrated
that week was "The Pert Fire
Engine."

Ziegler Pledged A student
from Salem, Sid Ziegler, has
been pledged to Delta Sigma
Phi, national social fraternity at
Oregon State college He is the
son of Mr. and Mrs S. Ziegler.
6830 Southwest Capitol, and Is
a junior in forestry.

AT CENTER

Dr. Sam Hngheg

with your STRATFORD

by Colello. A medium

wedgie with ankle strop.

Flexible platform sole.

Red or Green Calf.

2. A downtown office of the
carrier should be made conven-

iently available to the public
for information concerning
schedules, routes, charges, etc.

3. Evening and Sunday bus
schedule needs should be thor-

oughly studied and necessary ac
tion taken to supply the public
needs now being inadequately
served.

4. Consideration ought to be
given to reduced transportation
rates during the middle of the
days as a shoppers' service to
create patronage. Such action
should tend to relieve rush hour
congestion and prove profitable
to any carrier.

5. Consideration should he
given to adopting early morning
schedules that will more ade
quately meet the needs of trans
portation users employed down
town. "A typical example comes
from the Fruitland-Swcgl- e area
which has only four schedules
daily. The first schedule com
mences at 7:15 a.m. for the
downtown centers. Such sched
ule is satisfactory for persons
whose work commences at 8
o'clock a.m., but is wholly inade
quate for those whose work
begins at 9 o'clock, although the
next arrival in the downtown
area is not until 10:30 a.m.
12th Street Liked

Similar criticism is made of
the evening schedule. "Any an-

swer," says the report, "that a
better schedule would be un
profitable is ineffective. No
public transportation system
should be permitted to serve
only the profitable areas on pro-
fitable schedules and entirely
omit such presently marginal ar-
eas as are not quite so remu-
nerative'. . . improved sched-
ules at such outlying points
would undoubtedly tend to
prove an increase in the profits
of the carrier in due time if
properly carried out."

6. Rerouting the various
schedules throughout the city
and the outlying area should
emphasize the need of more cir-
cuitous runs. "The present 12th
street route is relatively good
and might be cited as an exam
ple. It is suggested, however,
that a 15 or 20 minute schedule
on that route is believed justi-
fied by the patronage.

"Examples of the various
routes where better service to
the public is demanded," the re
port says, "are the Capitola bus
route, the Mill street schedule,
the Madison street route, and all
schedules in the suburban are
as." It is suggested "that the
use of parallel streets on return
trips . . . would bring the car
rier to the doorsteps of more of
its prospective customers.

7. No bus runs or schedules
should be changeable without
approval of municipal authority
either the council or an author
ized standing committee. Chang
es should not be made witnout
hearing for the public.

8. Any public bus system un
der a franchise from the city
council ought to be required to
develop improvement between
its personnel and the public.
Carrier Benefit Claimed

9. If no requirement be made
within the terms of a franchise
that the carrier adequately serve
the populated area adjacent to
the city limits, then considera-
tion should be given to prohibit-
ing such system from invading
such outlying districts at all,
that some other type of facilities
can be created.

The committee believes that
any or all of the recommenda
tions would benefit a bus sys-

tem, so much so that it should
not be necessary to make the
recommendation, but that the
company should initiate them on
its own accord.

"However," it concludes, "this
committee believes that the
many inadequacies of the pres-
ent carrier . . . cannot be com-

pletely solved under absentee
management such as now ex-

ists."
The committee believes some

authoritative control should be

LOST!

AMisunv skew iviy dug?
I brought this Pox Terrier back
from Germany with me after
the war. He disappeared wearing
a collar and dog tag No. 0787. If
you know the whereabouts of
"Pop-Eye- " the dog,
please phone 4 2 6 2 0 Reward.

j DANCE
j Tonight
I CRYSTAL

GARDENS

Old Time
and

Modern
74c Including tax

Unit Meets Thursday The
unit of Liberty.

Salem Heights and Prospect
communities, will meet at the
Salem Heights community hall
Thursday, starting at 10 o'clock
with a sack lunch at noon and
coffee served by the club. The

project is making lampshades
with Mrs. William Gardner and
Mrs. Harry Knepper leaders.

. Mrs. Church Dies John
Church, 1143 Sixth street, re-

ceived word Monday night of
the death of his mother, Mrs.
TTlrtfQ fhiirnh. at SinilX CitV. Ia..
and left immediately for the
mid-wes- t. Mrs. cnurcn is sur-

vived by six sons, three daugh-
ters and several grandchildren
and

Skit Are Prepared Two
skits will be given by men and
women at the Friday nignt pro-

gram of the Salem Heights Com-

munity club under the direction
nf Mrs Leon Frahm and the pro
gram in charge of the Mother's
club. There will also be a dis-

cussion of the teen-ag- e activity
night. Refreshments will be sold
by the committee.

Hoven Now Auditor Ronald
Hoven of Talbot, has assumed
his duties as junior auditor for
the state tax commission and as
tigned to the withholding de
rpartment of the income tax divi-

sion. Hoven graduated from
Jefferson high school and also
attended Willamette university
and the school of commerce in
Salem.

Meetings Cancelled The
Chamber of Commerce

that the March meeting
of thp hoard of directors, and
also the March meeting of the
long-rang- e planning commis
sion have been cancelled.

L'eave Salem General Leav-

ing the Salem General hospital
with recently born infants are
Mrs. James Marx and daugh
tpr. Triangle drive: Mrs. Murray
Baker and daughter, 1030 Hoyt
and Mrs. William Huhta and
son, 1315 North 15th.

Vikings Win
(Continued from Page 1)

Scappoose had a very poor
shooting average, missing re
peatedly.

Jim Rock did not start for Sa-

lem and was in the ball game
only a couple of minutes. He
has been nursing a cold and
Coach Hauk did not deem it wise
to use him to any great extent.

Salem will have a height ad
vantage over Jefferson but the
Vikings have their work cut out
for them in keeping Ron Fund
lingsland under control.

Ralem (481 ScaPPOOie (43)
Ig ft pf tp fg ft Pf tp

Walling.' a 1 3 5 Hlnkhuse.f 4 3 4 10

Rogers.! 5 B 3 15 Brown.I 7 1 1 IB

Gllson.c 3 1 2 7 Heller.c 3 0 3 8
chmbrln.K 4 14 9 Baker.B" 1 3 1 S

airod.i 13 2 8 Pattersn.g 10 2 2

Rock.f 0 0 10 Johnson.g 2 0 10
Norton.! 2 0 3 4 Darron.g

Totals 19 10 17 48 Totals 18 6 14 42

Free throw missed: Salem 9 Walling
2, Rogers 4, Gllson, Olrod 2. Scappoose
14 Johnson, Hlnkhouse, Brown 2, Heller
8, Baker 4. officials: Wellnltz and Plluso.

Eugene, March 15 W) Jeffer
son of Portland swamped Dallas
51-3- 4 opening today's play in
the state high school class A
basketball tourney.

Jeff joined Corvallis and
Marshfield who won last night's
openers, in advancing to the
second round.

The Jefferson-Dalla- s game
was all Ron Fundingsland, the
Portland scoring record holder
He paced the Jeff attack with 25

points and his smooth ball hand-

ling made his tourney - jittery
teammates and the Dallas play-
ers look very rough in com-

parison.
The first quarter was close

and ended with Jeff in front
11-- but the Portlanders then
began to pull away. The score
at the half was 22-1- 5 and the
margin in the third quarter
38-2- 3 was even more pronounc-
ed.

The game was in contrast to
last night's thrillers, each de-

cided by only two points with
the winners' margin coming on
free throws.

Jefferson (81) (34) Dallas
fit ft Pf tp 18 ft Pf tp

Scott, I 2 3 4 Flsher.f 0 14
Jackson, f 3 12 7 Janzen.f 2 2 0 8

Brethuer.f 0 4 3 0 Edlger.f 3 3 18
Zapp.f 2 0 14 Olson.o 2 0 B 4
Andersn.e 2 3 0 7 Read.c 0 0 0 0
Bagley.c 0 0 0 0 Clark.g 3 4 2 10

Raymnd.r 1 2 3 3 Bese.g 0 0 0 0
Bogue.g 0 0 0 0 Cook.g 2 13 5

Fdgslnd.ff 12 1 5 25

Totals 31 9 18 51 Totals 12 19 IS 34
Halftlme: Jefferson 32. Dallas 15. Free

throws missed: Jefferson 11, Dallas 7.
Officials: Ed Wellnits and Bus Blgham.

(Tuesday night games on
sports page)

BORN
The Capital Journal Welcomes

the Following New Citizens:
MORTON To Mr. and Mrs. Charles

Morton. 240 Mab1, it the Salem General
hospital, a boy, Mar. 14,

BRICKEEN To Mr. anJ Mr. Harold
Brickeen, 1820 Ferry, at the Salem Memo-
rial hospital, a boy, Mar. 13.

LULAY To Mr. and Mra. Donald
Scto Rt. 1, at the Salem Memorial

ho Ital. a. Klrl, Mar. 13.

KIHS To Mr. and Mrs. Fred Kiln, Rt.
3. Box 854, at the Salem Memorial

a ttrl, Mar. 11.

CUMMINS To Mr. and Mr. Donald
Cummin. Fall City, at the Salem Memo-
rial hospital, a boy. Mar. 13.

CAMPBELL To Rev. Olenn Campbell
and Mrs. Campbell of Woodbum, a
daughter March 13 at Sllverton boapltal.

FANOAR To Mr. and Mra. Carl (Bar-ba- r
Fintar, Portland, at the Emanuel

hospital, a sir. Mar. 13, named Karrllou
Ann. Mrs. Fannr Is the dauchter at Mr.
an,; Mrs. Brook Sweeney, Day ton.

ing in a waggish manner" re-

sulted in returning an inmate to
the custody of a state institu
tion Wednesday. A Salem pa-
trolman spotted a man, later
identified as Vernon H. Pollock,
strolling in the 400 block on
High street. The "waggish man-
ner" aroused the officer's sus-

picions. He found Pollock had
left the Cottage Farm. He was
returned to Oregon State hospi
tal.

More Cars Prowled Reports
of two new car prowlings were
filed with the Salem police
Wednesday from owners. W. T,
Bates, 157 South Winter street,
reported the theft of a car robe,
wrench, pliers and screw driver
from his car while it was park
ed in front of his home. Roy
Mangis, 419 East Birch, report
ed the theft of a radiator cap.

Patrol Sponsors Dance Mem
bers of the Salem Police Aerial
Patrol announced Wednesday
they would sponsor a dance on
the night of the city s spring op
ening festival, March 23, at the
Crystal Gardens.

Pleads Innocent Doris Faye
Wayman, held an several charg
es involving bogus check opera
tions in Salem, McMinnvillle and
Corvallis, pleaded innocent
Wednesday in district court,
Hearing on the charges was set
for March 20. Bail on the five
separate charges against her to
taled $5,500.

Sentence Suspended Herbert
E. Kucera, 1940 North Front
street, pleaded guilty Wednes-

day to charges of petty larceny
in the theft of a revolver. Sen-
tence was suspended in district
court until afternoon. The theft
of the gun took place two years
ago and came to police attention
as the weapon was sold.

Office Burglarized Salem po-

lice reported Wednesday that
the office of Jack C. Neer in the
Oregon building had been burg-
larized and $8 in cash and $20
in stamps was missing.

Selling Linn Schools Two
old Linn county schools left va-

cant in the Lyons community by
the construction of the Mari-Lin- n

grade school, are offered
for sale by Vernon James, chair-
man and Alice Huber, clerk, of
district 29-- Linn and Marion
counties. The schools are Twin
Cedar and Fox Valley with the
sale to include fixtures. Bids
will close at 8 o'clock the night
of April 6.

Mothers Taken Home Dis-

missed from the Salem Memor
ial hospital with recently born
infants are Mrs. James Dey and
son, Dayton route 1; Mrs. Vin-
cent Brus and daughter, 695

Waldo; Mrs. Harley Cordray and
son, 2560 Cherry; Mrs. Maurice
Briggs and daughter, Sweet
Home; Mrs. James Baker and
daughter, 1775 N. Front; Mrs.
Francis Mack and son, 539 W.
Water, Stayton; Mrs. Thomas
Shelton and daughter, Mill City:
Mrs. Julian Nixon and son
Aumsville; Mrs. Hobert Kent
and daughter, 1245 Mill; Mrs
Clarence Fetrow and son, 738
North Cottage and Mrs.. Rich
ard Gorman and son, Stayton.

Legion Plans Party An anni-

versary party will be held by
Kingwood Post No. 81 of the
American Legion at the Legion
hall in Kingwood Heights Thurs
day evening. A no host dinner
will be served at 7 o clock fol
lowed by a program.

Food Sale, Sat., 10 a.m., at
Broadway Appliance, 453 Court
St. Junior C.D.A. 65

Wall to be rebuilt. Will clear
quality merchandise at lowest of
low in the next two weeks.
Olive's Dress Shop, Pen Four
Corners. Phone 20029. 63

Eola Acres Florist. Ph.
63

tickets, Kugel,
153 North High, Ph. 63

Window screens deluxe either
roll-awa- y type or frameless.
Prices are satisfactorily low. Ph.

for estimates. Reinholdt
& Lewis: 63

Benefit ham dinner at Lin-
coln school Thurs.,
March' 16, 5:30 to 7:30 p.m. 63

Auburn Mothers club rum-
mage sale over Greenbaum's.
Thurs., March 16. 63

Sawdust by tube from truck
to basement. Highway

63

Vision - Aid means Semler
made. For glasses ground to
your optometrist's prescription
get Vision-Ai- d glasses at Semler
Optical Offices, Waters-Adolp- h

Bldg., State & Com'l. Ph.
63

A few "dropped" patterns oi
Cabin Crafts, Neddletuft bed-

spreads are available at 25
less than regular prices, new
spreads, not seconds. The Bet-
ter Bedding Store, 512 State St.

64

Exclusive presentation Imper-
ial wallpapers. R.L. Elfstrom Co

Want qualified cafeteria man-
ager. Nohlgren's, 440 State

63

Sainsbury, of Salem, state junior
leader for the Farmers Union,
will interview several young
people over KOAC Wednesday
evening at 7 o'clock on the re-

cent state convention. Appearing
on the program will be Robert
Beutler, state junior president;
Martha Williams, torchbearer
last year; Donna Lee Taylor,
Benton county junior; Dean
Way, Central Kowell junior and
Marion Flux, junior leader ot
the Central Howell local.

Dental Clinic Set A pre
school dental clinic will be held
at the Hayesville school from 9

o'clock until noon Thursday for
children over three years old
and up to the second grade. A
child hygienist will be present
to confer with parents, who must
accompany the children. Help-
ing with the clinic will be Mrs.
W. Powers, Mrs. R. Hall, Mrs.
A, Richardson and Mrs. H.
Christenson,

Salem Lions Club H. R. Ran
dall, director of parole and pro-
bation for the state, will talk on
the subject "Discovery, Treat-
ment and Control of the Sex Of
fender'' during Thursday's
luncheon of the Salem Lions
club.

Caseworkers Needed Begin
ning caseworkers are needed for
state and county public welfare
commissions according to a re-

cent announcement of the state
civil service commission. All
persons interested in these posi
tions are urged to make applica
tion for the examination. Start
ing salary is $200 per month,
and provision is made for annual
merit increases. The duties of
this position are of a beginning
nature in the study and determi
nation of eligibility of persons
requiring public welfare assist
ance. To be admitted to the writ
ten test, an applicant must be a
college graduate with courses in
the social sciences.

Manchester Speaker Max W
Manchester, office manager of
the public employes retirement
board, will be the discussion
leader at the meeting of the pub-
lic service forum, 7:30 p.m., Fri
day, March 17, in the conference
room of the State Library build
ing. Manchester, will discuss the
contributions, benefits and man
agement of the public employes
retirement system.

Scheufele Rites Set Funeral
services for Gottlich Scheufele
85, resident of Cottage Grove for
the last 42 years and father of
Mrs. Dorothy Hunt, of Salem
will be held at Cottage Grove at
10 oclock Thursday. He was
born in Wurembury, Germany,
Nov. 4, 1864 and came to this
country in 1882, becoming a citi-
zen in 1898. He married Seba
Coats in Fox Valley in January
1902 and they moved to Cottage
Grove in 1908 where she died
in 1936. He is also survived by
three sons, five other daughters,
17 grandchildren and two great-
grandchildren.

Probate Court
Appraised at

Ec'- -a Cecilia McKay guardianship: Or-
der approve first annual account.

Beulah S. Mill estate: Order author-
ize sale of certain personal property.

Nancy E. Boydston estate: Addle
Senter appointed administratrix.

Hugh Bllyeu conservatorship: Jack u

appointed conservator.

Joslah M. Blxler estate: Order close
etate, discharge executrix.

Oeorge E. Shaw estate: Order closes
estate, discharges executor.

District Court
Fugitive: Curtla R. Fulmer. held

California authorities to March 34.

Obtaining money by falae pretenses:
Doris Faye Wayman. pleaded Innocent,
hearing set for March 30.

Larceny: Herbert E. Kucera, pleaded
guilty, sentence suspended until afternoon.

Aiding Inmate to escape from Oregon
state hospital: Mary E. White, pleaded
guilty, lall term suspended, placed
on probation for one year.
Police Court

Vagrancy: Edwin D. Pundsak and Rob-
ert Miller, both transients, sentenced lo
five days In Jail, lall term suspended to
leave town.

Soliciting without a permit: Aubrey
Clare Jolly. 1470 McCoy, 135 ball: Edward
J. Burnslde. 735 North Summer, released:
Melvln L. fitahlman, fined 135.

Marriage License
Marlow Ray Latourell. 31, warehouse-

man, 4135 Oary. and Evelyn Esau, 33,
file clerk. 3070 Kelly.

Richard Beat. 65, laundry employee. Sta-
tion "A," and Jennie Katharine Irwin,
50. night attendant. Station "A."

tJelmer L. Kuns, 31. student, Woodbum,
and Virginia Carol Yoder, 33, bookkeeper,
Hubbard.

Oeorre Clifford Buell, Jr.. 20. laborer,
3314 South 19th, and Barbara Joan Stand-le-

1ft, student, 3314 South lsto.

Petition Asks
(Continued from Page 1)

The grade approaching the
proposed Marion street grade
separation structure will be le-

vel from the west with an as-

cending grade of 7 per cent from
the east.

The grade approaching the
proposed Center street grade
separation structure will be on
a descending grade of 6.39 per
cent on the west and an ascend
ing grade of 7 per cent from the
east.
State to Bear Costs

The state is to finance the
construction of the overall pro-

ject with state and federal funds
without financial participation
by the city of Salem or the rail-

roads.
Under the terms of the peti-

tion the railroads must maintain
watchmen during the period of
construction of the project and
maintain service on Water street.

The city of Salem must pass
appropriate ordinances approv-
ing the construction and exis
tence of the proposed grade
crossings.

Water Rights Filed Water
rights have been filed with the
state engineer by the Mt. jet-
ferson Lumber Co., and the
Freres Lumber Co., on the North
Santiam river and tributaries in
Linn county mainly for supply
ing log ponds; the West date
Lumber Co., for similiar pur-
poses on the South Santiam and
tributaries and by Kenneth El-

lis on the North Santiam and
George M. and Myrtle A. Long,
on the South Santiam, for do-

mestic purposes.

Woman Prowler A woman
prowler, seen lurking at win
dows in the 2200 block on Lee
street, was reported to Salem
police Wednesday.

Gordon Gets Post Leon Gor-

don, Salem student at Oregon
State college, has been elected
treasurer of the student chap
ter of the American Pharmaceu
tical association.

Ringlet Perm. Waves. Comp.
$2.50 up. Ph. 34844. 63

Rummage Friday 193 N. Com'l
64

Rum. sale Fri., Sat., 9 a.m.
Junior Guild, 560 Chemeketa.

64

Regular meeting Salem chap-
ter No. 6, Disabled American
"eterans, Thursday, March 16th,
8 p.m. at Salem Woman's club,
460 N. Cottage street. 63

Now at Shattuc's, tender, de
licious Broiled Lobster served
with drawn butter. 63

Rummage sale, Hollywood
Lion Aux., Friday and Saturday,
Mar. 17 & 18, over Greenbaum.

65

Phone 22406 before 6 p.m. If
you miss your Capital Journal.

Macleay School Benefit, fam
ily style baked ham dinner, 6 to
8:30 p.m. Entertainment & danc
ing, March 17. Adults $1, under
12 50 cents, 64'

Ben's Rummage store, 2085 N
Commercial. 67

Phone 22406 before 8 p.m. If
you miss your Capital Journal.

New .soilproof washable
Glendura famous wallpaper. R.
L. Elfstrom Co.

Cafeteria luncheon, First Me-

thodist church, Thurs., 11-- 1 p.m.
63

Dr. Ray Pinson, chiropodist,
foot care. 428 Oregon Bldg. Ph

Eola Community club benefit
dinner, March 17, 5:30 to 7:30
Entertainment and movies. Ad-
ults $1, under 12 50c. 63.

Phone 22406 before 8 p.m if
you miss your Capital Journal.

SALEM COURT NEWS

See Us - See the World
Can you see clearly or is it a blur before you? Let
us examine your eyes, carefully. And, if you need
glasses, choose them from our wide assortment of
handsome and glamorous styles.

USE YOUR CREDIT

Optometrists
AT BORING OPTICAL

Now in Our New Modern
Office and Laboratory

Circuit Court
Edward R. Wegner vs. Milton Van n

and other: Plaintiff reply admit
and denie.

Ralph W.
W. Baker:
prejudice.

John W. Merrlfleld v. Alta L, Merrl-fiel-

Complaint for divorce allege cruet
and Inhuman treatment: seeks ettlement
of property right. Married Nov. 30,
1913, in Salem.

State v. William H. Sander: Order re-
voke probation for defendant who is or-
dered committed to state prLson for one
year on charge of

State v. Donald J. Barker and other:
Defendant given uspended state
prison sentence on larceny charge: placed
on probation three years; ordered to make
restitution.

Wlllard Shelley vs. Mary L. Shelley:
Defendant demurs to complaint or
gro. ds that it doe not contain suffi-
cient facts to constitute cause of action.

Elma Edsall vs. Harold Edsall: Com-

plaint for divorce alleges cruel and in-

human treatment. Married Nov, 13, 1B40,
at Coqullle.

Anelta Taylor v. state Industrial acci-
dent commission: Order overrule defend-
ant' demurrer: defendant granted 10

days In which to enter further plea.

Burl 8. Arthur vs. state industrial ac-
cident commission: Plaintiff's amended
complaint seeks compensation for alleged
permanent total disability.

State of Oregon ex rel w. IT Klmsey
s. Loul R. Harvey: Order dismisses suit.

Robert Cable v. Moe Cable: Order of
default against defendant.

Russell and Oeorge Hatlowell vs. Claude
Bird and Oall Zysset: Order extends time
for defendant' filing of bill of exception
and transcript on appeal to April 1, 11)50.

Ronald Bllschke vs. D. M. Macklln and'
Andrew Creech: Order that plaintiff shall
recover ,39 .35 general damages from de-
fendant Creech.

William Wilson vs. Betty Jean Wilson:
Complaint for divorce allege cruel and
Inhuman treatment: seeks custody of mi-

nor child. Married March 8, 1940, at Sayre,
Okla.

(CORNER 12th
DialDr. E. E. Boring

12.95


