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Church Cradle Roll Little Stayton GirlTURNER OPENS

CLD MEETING

EXHIBIT HELD

FOR CLUBBERS

Liberty Community
Club Meets Friday

Liberty The Liberty Community
club will hold Its first meeting of
the season Friday night at the com-

munity hall. After a short business

DRIVE STARTS
Stayton A book drive, which Is to

BE SIC EVENT
Woodburn Plans are being made

for a. big night at Woodburn high

"Water Witch" Is
Hospital Patient

Monmouth C. H. Gwin, well
digger and water witch, is In the
Corvallls hospital with severe In-

juries sustained when thrown to
the pavement from a car In which
he was a passenger. The car was
crowded off the highway when close
to Corvallls, by an automobile and
trailer loaded with wood. Gwiti who
suffered a fractured pelvis bone and
crushed right hip was the only oc-

cupant of either car to be hurt.

COMING ACTIVITIES

MILL CITY LISTED

Mill City At a student body meet

meeting at which several Important
matters will be taken care of the
following program will be rendered.
Community singing, piano solo,
Francis Shogren; health talk by Dr.
Vernon Douglas; solo, Dorothy
Browning. Dr. A. A. Vazakas, who
has traveled extensively in European
countries and who has Just return-
ed from Mexico this summer will
given an address on European af-

fairs. Duet by trumpeters from the
Philharmonic choir of Willamette
university.

PARISH SPONSORS

TWODAYBAZAAR

Silverton Two unusual attrac
tions of the Catholic bazaar to be
sponsored by the members of St.
Paul's parish, Sunday and Monday
are the New England dinner early!
Sunday afternoon and the series of
amusement booths specially arrang-- ;
ed for the pleasure of the children,
Definite plans were completed for
the annual event, during the week,
and actual work of preparation In
wen under way.

The dinner committee has prom
ised such New England dishes as
roast pork end apple sauce, baked
beans, and a finale of home made
pies, with salads, pickles and other
vegetables as Intermediary courses,
with the side dish of spaghetti and
hamprger for those not of Boston
appetites. Cafetria lunches will be
served Sunday and Monday eve
nings.

The children will be provided for
with various entertainment features
arranged by Mrs. Lillian DeRyke
and Mrs. A. Cole, and special booths
in one end of the hall will be set
aside for this purpose. Programs
will also be given both Sunday and
Manday evenings as added attrac
tions.

GRAND PATRIARCH

VISITS MONMOUTH

Monmouth Grand Patriarch Joe
Schwelzer of Portland gave the
main address for the opening meet
ing or Model Encampment Tuesday
evening. In his talk he stressed
strongly the junior organization.

Other speakers, who spoke brief
ly, were G. J. u. Harris of Ger-
vals; Robert Henderson, Chemawa,
who ls secretary of the I. O. O. F.
home; p. G. R. Mendell, Portland;
P. G. R., F. K. Sickafose, Mon
mouth; and P. G. R. Pratt of Mc-

Mlnnvllle. Somewhat of a record
was established with seven P. G. R.
In attendance.

Sixty people were present, which
included visitors from Albany, Sa-
lem, Portland, Gervais and

In conclusion refresh
ments were served and the women
Joined the men for dancing.

Quilting In Order
At Home in Lyons

Lyons Mrs. Erne Malnes was
hostess to a quilting party honor-
ing Mrs. Jim Tombs Tuesday af-

ternoon. Mrs. Tombs was present
ed with a quilt with 50 friendship
mocks. Refreshments were served
by the hostess, assisted by Mrs.
Etnel Hlnkel.

Those present were the honor
guest, Mrs. Jim Tombs, Mrs. Mar-
tin Keukin, Mrs. Elva Keukin, Mrs.
Freda Keukin, Mrs. Effle Nydlgger,
Mrs. Helen Nydlgger, Mrs. Inez
Ring, Mrs. Nellie Hiatt, Mrs. Stacy
McCall, Mrs. Alta Bodcker, Mrs.
Alice Huber, Mrs. Effle Monroe,
Mrs. Minnie Nlegll, Mrs. Anna Wil-
liams, Mrs. Fannie Malnes, Mrs.
Ethel Hinkle and the hostess, Mrs.
Effle Malnes.

Birthday Celebrated
Zena Mr. and Mrs. James A.

French entertained at a dinner par
ty Friday night in honor of their
son Harold who celebrated his 31st
birthday anniversary. The affair
was arranged as a complete surprise.
Present were the honor guest,. Har-
old French, three ot his chums,
Chester Langtree and Clyde French
of Salem and Robert Crawford, and
Mrs. Chester Langtree, Mrs. Nellie
McClaln, Harold's grandmother, Mrs.
S. A. Judson, and Mr. and Mrs.
French.

ROSEDALE CLUB MEETS
Rosedale The Rosedale com

munity club will hold its first meet
Saturday night with a pot luck

pper.

Inst until the end of October
being sponsored by the high school
under the supervision or miss

the school librarian. The pur
pose of the drive is to replenish the
library with reference, fiction and

books from which the
students will be able to secure ample
material for school work and whole
some occupation during leisure
hours.

Books of fiction, history, science,
travel, adventure, biography, essays
and others will be glady accepted
from anyone who wishes to donate.
Books of fiction are the greatest In
demand.

Although it has been requested
that the better class of fiction be
donated so that the reading stand
ard can be kept as high as possible,
a few more popular authors that are
of special appeal to the adolescent
may be included.

The first to contribute to the drive
was Felix Wright who donated short
story books, poetry and drama. The
high school wishes to state that any
contributions, from Individuals even
one or two books, will be gladly ac
cepted.

CHEMAWA GRANGERS

TO OFFER PROGRAM

Chemawa Saturday evening the
Chemawa grange, with Mrs. D. B.

Kleihege In charge, will present the
following program at their fair in
the grange hall:

Community singing; piano duet,
Miss Irma Keefcr and Mrs. Klei-

hege; recitation, Eileen Holden;
music, Glenn Savage; reading, Ca-

therine Bailey; words of greeting by
the grange master, Lester Evans;
reading, Mrs. S. H, Van Trump; pi-

ano solo, Miss Erma Kecfer; speaker
of the evening. S. H. Van Trump;
music, Master Evans. Subsequent to
the program the exhibits that were
donated will be auctioned.

The Chemawa community Is

proud of the fact that Oregon's
senator, Charles L. McNary was born
here. The senator has promised that
in case he is not too busy with af-

fairs of state, he will look in on his
friends and brother grangers Satur
day evening and give them a word
of greeting.

GASOLINE DEALERS'

FIGHT HIGH COSTS

Albany Independent gasoline
dealers of Linn county met Tuesday
to form an organization to fight the
high price of gasoline and to estab
lish a uniform standard of doing
business. C. P. Tedlook of Albany
was elected president and Walter
Reitz of Tangent, secretary-treasu- r
er. Another meeting ls to be held
Wednesday night to perfect the or
ganization. A similar plan is being
followed In other counties of the
state and In Washington and Cali
fornia.

Honor Mrs. Cline
Mill City A group of women met

at the home of Mrs. R. F. Saucier
to honor Mrs. C. M. Cline with a
birthday party. The afternoon was
spent in playing contract bridge,
with Mrs. Saucier receiving a prize
for high score and Mrs. Holthouse
a consolation prize. Those present
were Mrs. Arthur Hoenlg, Mrs. F.
R. Olln. Mrs. A. A. Holthouse, Mrs.
R. F. Saucier and the honor guest,
Mrs. C. M. Cline.

Divorce Is Sought
Albany Audra Bryant filed an

action for divorce in circuit court
yesterday against Floyd M. Bryant,
alleging desertion as the grounds
for the action. The Bryants were
married in Marion county Sept. 12,
1930, and are the parents of a son.
Floyd Delmer Bryant. Thc plaint-
iff ls seeking custody of the child
and also support money as well as
tne divorce decree from the defend-
ant.

DEPARTMENT CALLED
Stayton The fire siren blew

Wednesday afternoon when a small
fire broke out at the Roy building.
The blaze was caused by a "blow
torch being used to repair the roof
of the building, but was soon ex
tinguished.

Chemawa Mrs. W. A. Sherman
entertained her aunt, Mrs. Oeorge
Brenzel and friend. Miss Nell Tuhr.
of Kqukauna, Wis., this week.

school Friday evening when a car
nival will be put on by the student
body. A wide variety of amusements
is to be offered and the affair will
begin at 7:30 o'clock with a free
program in the auditorium. The
main feature of this program will
be a one-a- comedy by the senior
class.

Booths with popcorn, candy, ser
pentine, paper hats, balloons and
other carnival novelties will be ar
ranged about the building and
there will also be a "nigger" baby
stand, minstrel show, beauty par
lor, beano game, style shows, grab
bag. circus, fortune telling and box
ing. Each high school organization
is in charge of a concession and
each will get 5 per cent of the prof
its arising from its department with
the best concession receiving 10 per
cent of the profts. The balance of
the profit will go to pay off student
body debts.

John Esdv ls general chairman
of the carnival and Blaine McCord,
Jr., Is publicity chairman. Every-
one is invited to attend the evening
of fun and assist the young people
in their worthy eitort.

INDEPENDENCE HI

CLASSES BALLOT

Independence Class officers were
recently elected in the local high
school and class activities outlined:

Freshman class President, Clif
ford Bowler; Vance
Smith; secretary. Dean Smith
treasurer, Kenneth Houseley; courv
ell member, Beatrice Barton; yell
leader. James Brown.

Sophomore President, Joyce
Johnson: vice president, Helen Ma-

land; secretary, Sumilo Inoyc;
treasurer, Katherme H a r tman;
council member, Ray Dunckel; yell
leader, Ronald Busby; song leader,
Irene Hurley.

Junior President, Magnus sy-
verson; vice president, Jack Wat-

tenberger; secretary, Ruth Ramey;
treasurer, Gladlola Newton; yell
leader, Robert Farmer; council
members, Zora Berry and Magnus
Syverson.

Seniors President, Henry WalK
; vice president, Ralph Beech;

secretary, Paul Carey; treasurer.
Edward Dunckel; yell leader, Beryl
Kelly.

GRANGER ELECTION

DATE IS POSTPONED

Woodburn A meeting of Wood-
burn grange was held Saturday with
a business session In the morning,
dinner at noon and an open meeting
In the afternoon. Election of officers
announced for that date was post-
poned until the first Saturday In
November on account of the busy
season. The members voted on those
they desired for state officers and
announced Ray W. Oill as their
choice for state master. Three new
members were voted In. Visitors
present were Mr. White, Miss White,
lecturer, and Mrs. Kingsley, all of
the ButteviUe grange. An Impromp-
tu program of music, reading, co-

mic stories and games was enjoyed
in the afternoon.

Celebration Held
By Monmouth Lodge

Monmouth Agate Rebekah lodge
observed the 62nd anniversary of
the founding of the organization
Tuesday evening with a celebration
in the lodge rooms.

Two vocal numbers by Mrs. T. E.
Chambers with Mrs. R. D. Elliott
at the piano, opened the program.
A snappy contest afforded much in-

terest.. The losers, under Mrs. E.
Staats, were required to conclude
the meeting by washing the dishes.
The winners were led by Mrs. Cora
Rlddell. A benefit gome called
"Chinese laundry" dominated the
supper hour. The supper was serv-
ed In the dining hall under the su-

pervision of Mrs. Valma Smith.

BUDGET IS OFFERED
Wlllamina The Wlllamina city

council met In regular session re-

cently and after transacting regular
business, met with the budget com-

mittee, composed of Johnnie Durst,
O, C. Yocum, K. Shetterly and Earl
Smith and Frank Smesler who pre-
pared the budget for the city.

FLAX IS HARVESTED
Hopmere A 104 acre field ot flax

was harvested here and on Tuesday
the flaxstraw stacks were burned.
The oily straw made a bright fire.
North Dakota farmers say that in
Dakota they bale It and that It
makes fine food for th ostock.

Bltttr rietoHl Pirfict Bonol

Turner Several hundred people
attended the firt fall meeting of'
tne Turner community club in tne
High school auditorium. In the ab-

sence 'trf the president and vice-

president, Henry Ahrens, and Earl
S. prathcr, the business session was
presided over by a former president
or the club, Wallace Riches. Mrs.
Helen Hamilton of 6alcm, of the
Red Crass relief work organization
was present and spoke briefly on
cooperation for the winter, an
nouncing J. E. Whitehead, as local
chairman In this district with Earl
S. Prather and Mrs. Earl C. Bear,
assistants. The general committee
members representing the various
districts of the community ore Mrs.
Ivan Hadley, Mrs. W. C. Morris,
Douelas B. Parkcs, Mrs. Carl Wil
liams, Mrs. Thomas Little, Donald
S. Riches, Mis. Gayette Barnett,
Mrs. Nellie Hamilton and Mrs. J.
G. Greenlee.

Mrs. Stanley A. Riches outlined
the winter programs as follows: In
November the Home Economic
club of Turner Surprise grange will

sponsor the cntlro program, and
the December program will be de-

voted to the children under the
auspices of the Turner schools and
district schools. Voluntary talent is
asked for the January club meet-

ing. Miss Helen Peetz announced
the following program numbers:

Instrumental selections by Miss
Marv Miller: piano duct, Lois Gun
ning and Kathleen Sparkes; playlet
by the Crawford district scnooi.
with Gayla Vcrsteag portraying the
busy housewife, and way uoawin
the persistent salesman. Vocal solo
by Mrs. Louis Hennios, responding
with an encoro number, Mrs. Ivan
Hadley piano accompanist; reading
by Betty Jean peetz; vocal soio
Miss Mildred Bones; planologue, by
Fernel and Ruth Gllstrap; vocal
trio, Helen Wltzel, Ellen Versteag
and Helena Wltzel; piano duct,
Ruth, and Fernel Gllstrap; readings
by J. G. McCune; comedy play
"Courtship Under Difficulties," with
the characters as follows, Prudence
Angellne WInterbottom, LaVerna
Whitehead; Mr. Snobby, Rachel
Riches; and Mr. Jones, Kathryn
Sparkes; violin and guitar duet by
Kenneth Barber and Norman
Whitehead, with Mrs. Lee Barber,
piano accompanist.

During the evening home made
candy was sold by the Willing
Workers club to finance the school
soup kitchen during the winter
months, netting the treasury $8.60.
Girls selling the candy were Ruth
McCoy, Evelyn Jensen, Mabel Schif-fere- r,

Oeneva Barber, Francis Clark,
Aleta Bones, Rachel Riches, Ruth
Gllstrap and LaVerna Whitehead.

FOURTEEN TABLES

PLAYED AT BENEFIT

Mt. Angel Fourteen tables of
500" were in play at the first of

the series of card socials which arc
be In ft Riven by the St. Ann's socie
ty during the winter months. The
social was held Tuesday evening In
the auditorium of St. Mayr's school.
Miss Mnry E. Wachter was awarded
ladies' high score prize, and Leo
Barr received the men s high score
prize. Other prizes were awarded to
Mrs. J. Forrest sauvain ana Henry
Wetland. Luncheon was served at a
late hour by the committee In
chargo which Included: Mrs. Lena
Unger, chairman, Mrs. Henry Wet-

land, Mrs. Chas. Ullman, Mrs. Ed-

ward O. Unger, Mrs. William A.

Worley, Mrs. Helena Wachter, Mrs.
Bertha Seller, Mrs. Steve Schmidt,
Mrs. Anton Schaeffer, and Mrs.
Magdalene Schmidt. The next so-

cial will be given in two weeks.

Stay ton Will Play
Jefferson Friday

Stayton The Inter-cla- Indoor
baseball tournament now in pro-
gress at the Stayton high has re-
sulted as follows: Otrls have played
thrco games with the freshmen
winning 2 games; sophomores lost
one game; Juniors won one game
and the seniors lost two games.

Boys: Freshmen won one game;
sophomores lost two; juniors won
ono and lost one; the seniors won
two games.

The Stayton high school team will
piny Jefferson at Jefferson Friday
at 2 p. m.

The students are working on a
play, "The Blue Bag" which will be
given November 9 and 10. The cast
Includes Milton Bell, Fred Daven-

port, Eunice Jordon, Elenoro Stay-to-

Olin Davis, Marvin Lnup, June
Keys, Wick Calavin, Lorraine Space.
Margoret Klmbrough and Dale
Crabtrce. Miss Martha Jindra Is

coaching the play.

WOMAN HAS FAIX
Lablsh Center Mrs. Eula Bennett

was the victim of n unique accident
recently white visiting at the home
of her slater, Mrs. Hugh Mason, at
Camas, Wash. Mrs. Bennett fell
down a flight of 14 steps, landing
on her back. Aside from bruises and ashock from the fall she escaped
without serious Injury. Mrs. Jennie
Oarbarlno was also a guest at the
Mason home along with Mrs.

Pupils Entertained
Woodburn The Presbyterian Aid

society entertained the cradle roil,
beginners and primary children of
tne Sunday school and their moth'
er at the regular meeting held in
the xhurch Wednesday afternoon,
A brief business meeting was held,
followed by a program which feat
ured songs familiar to the small
guests. Miss Vera Culp sang "When
He Cometh" and devotionals were
led 'by Rev. Katherlne Powell, who
also gave a talk on "The Two Grea
Gifts for a Child." Mrs. Donald Orr
sang. Refreshments were served by
the hostesses, Mrs. L. R. Tweedle
and Mrs. Mayme Cochran.

DALLAS BUDGET

HAS INCREASE
Dallas The city budget, which

comes up lor a public Hearing on
November 2 calls for an estimated
tax levy in 1934 of $2,501. this
amount showing a slight increase
over the sum levied in 1033.

Despite this increase the finan
cial condition of the city is remark
ably sound and should be still more
so. by. the time 1935 arrives. One
reason for this statement Is that, at
least two of the city's obligations,
the 1024 Fire Apparatus bonds and
the 1024 Street Intersection bonds,
will be fully retired by the end of
1934. Another important reduction
is that of the Water Works bond
ing Issue. Here fourteen one thou
sand dollar bonds have been retired
and that before even one fell due.

No increases have been called for
in any department and incidentally
mere are no decreases.

WMU HUNTER

BUCKSHOT VICTIM

Wlllamina As usual at this time
of year many sportsman of Wllla
mina have been taking their annual
vacations with varied result". Char-
les Kennedy and E. M. Huntley.
owners of the Wlllamina Hardware,
wno were fishing on the Ncstucca.
returned home with five big salmon
wnicn averaged better than 35
pounds each.

Albert Turppa shot a large black
bear which he brought Into town
sitting in the rumble scat of his car,
presenting a very life-li- appear-
ance. The bear was presumed to be
between three and four years old
and weighed 2G8 pounds. Many deer
were proudly displayed on . the
streets.

Along with the pleasure of hunt
ing comes the usual disaster of the
season. James Lawrence, a young
man of Orande Rondc, was acci-
dentally shot by a hunting compan
ion last Sunday In the mountains
south of Old Grand Rondc, where
tney were hunting deer. They were
using shot guns loaded with buck
shot. The charge struck Lawrence
in the back, about 25 pellets lodging
in his back and neck. His condition
was reported as serious. After sev
eral hours of getting the young man
out of the woods he was taken to a
hospital and Is reported recovering.

STAYTON AUXILIARY

COMMITTEES NAMED

Stayton The American Legion
Auxiliary met at the home of Mrs.
Earl Allen in Lyons Monday eve-

ning. The president, Mrs. Virgil Tucl
named her committee chairman for
the year. Membership Ls to be stress
ed this month with the quota reach-
ed and over the top by Armistice
day.

Mrs. w. V. Adams has been ap
pointed as membership chairman:
rchabilation and chief welfare, Mrs.
J. L, Jordan; Americanism, Mrs.
Zlm P. Etzel; community service,
Mrs. Harry Humphreys, and poppy
sale chairman, Mrs, Dave John,

Mrs. W. V. Adams, Mrs. Earl Al
len and Mrs. Floyd Fleetwood have
been appointed to assist the Legion
committee with the Armlstlco pro-
gram and banquet,

Tho following delegates wore
elected to the county council meet-

ing to be held In Woodburn Friday:
Mesdames George L. Duncan, V.
Tucl, W. V. Adams, 8. F. Etzel and
E. Allen. Alternates, Percy Hiatt,
Dave John and J. L. Jordan.

The honor guest of the evening
was Mrs. Moorhead of Junction City.
Mrs. Moorhead Is a member of the
Junction City auxiliary.

Furnace In Place
Mehama A furnace was installed

in the Mehama church Wednesday.
The work was under the direction
of the Willing Workers' Quilting
club and Is paid for by the money
earned from the quilts. The club
has also had a new floor put In the
church, has had the building paint-
ed on the Interior and all the furn
ishings painted.

TAKING. IN FAIR
Hubbard Hubbard ls renresented

at the world's fair by Albert Foster,
one of the saxophone players of the
band whose mother, Mrs. Lcttlc Fry,

a icacner in tne Hubbard school,
faster Is demonstrating shorthand
writing methods and equipment at
tho fair, This week two more rep
resentatives go to the fair. They are
miss Mazcn wens and tier mother,
Mrs. B. O. Wells. The women left
Wednesday evening by rail. They ex.
peci 10 dc gone lor a number of
weeks as a visit with relatives In
Minnesota will also be made.

MRS. MASSIE BACK
Hazel oreen Mrs. Robert Mas-s- ie

has returned to her home after
spending tho past week In Toledo,
where she was the house guest of
her and daughter, Mr.
and Mrs. Raymond Boone. Mrs.
Massie announces the arrival at the
Boono home of a nine pound son,
who will bo called Charles Deane
Boone. Mrs. Massie also enjoyed a
visit wltli her daughter Doris, who
Is a student In Uie Toledo high
school.

Mehama Mr. and Mrs. Kleth
Phillips have moved to Hammond
lumber camp No. 36 where hi b
employed.

Birthday Hostess
Stayton Mrs. Claude Darby en-

tertained a group of young girls In
nonor or ner youngest daughter,
La Verna Mav.

Various games were played and
those wining prizes were Vivian
Waller, 'Zelpha Carter,' Shirley
Freldle and Virginia, Shelton. Re- -'

frcshments were served.
Those present were ' La Verna

May Darby, Betty- Ann Goode, Viv-

ian Waller, Virginia Shelton, Doris
Crabtree, Marian Follis, Josie
Thorpe, Zelpha Carter, Shirley
Freele, Helen Hughes, Leona

Barbara Walters and Fran
ces Rider.

IVING

PAIR IN JAIL
Woodburn Charges of driving

while drunk were filed in justice
court Wednesday against William
Snapoff and a charge of beine
arunK on a puonc nignway was
filed against Frank Sedlack, who
accompanied Shapoff.

xne two created considerable ex
citement on the hiffhwav Wednes
day morning when in some manner
one of the front wheels came off
their car just in front of the Stan- -
ard residence, careened across the
highway, jumped a wire
fence, crashed through the window
of the Witham implement house
and came to rest against a post on
the inside of the building. No one
was injured although traffic was
very heavy at the time. The two
offenders were brought to town and
placed in the city jail for safe keep
ing by a state police officer.

The case of six truck drivers, ar
rested for operating trucks as motor
carriers without permits from the
utilities commissioner, which was
to have been heard Tuesday nfter- -
noon, was postponed to Friday af-

ternoon at 2 o'clock.

HAS BOOSTER NITE

Rlckreall A Grange tester night
program, beginning with a 7 o'clock
dinner, is being prepared by the
local order for Friday night at the
hall.

"Dr. Cureall" a short play will be
given by the following cast of char-
acters: Dr. Cureall, W. W. Rowell;
office girl, Mrs. Grace Pence; pa-
tients, Mrs. Anne Dulaney, as Mrs.
Brown, Mrs. Alice Wilson as Mrs.
Sorawney; Mrs. Mary Adams as
Miss Jane Scrimpklns; H. A. Demp- -
sey as Alphonso De Jones; Mrs. Ida
Ragsdale as Mrs. Rotchkins;' Ellea- -
nor Betchel as Kate Rotchkins
Mrs. Forrest Martin as Seraphlna
Paddlngton; Elizabeth Rowell as
Mrs. Blooming.

Arrangements are being made for
a speaker and Ankeny Grange will
furnish musical numbers during the
evening.

linnImjntyWa
BOARD IS CHOSEN

Albany Mark V. Weatherford,
NRA advisor for Linn county has
appointed a compliance committee
whose function It will be to see that
all NRA laws and codes In the coun-t-

are complied with. A. K. McMa-
lian was appointed chairman and
D. a. Smith the other member from
Albany. Other members are W. R,
Alvin of Lebanon, Aubrey S. Tuss- -
lng of Brownsville and Ed Mycr of
scio. concerns wno flout the blue
eagle and are not living up to the
requirements of the code are to be
investigated, Weatherford said.

Silverton Women
Victim Of Falls

Sllverton Mrs. Sarah Jorgenson
of tne East Hill addition was taken
to the local hospital Wednesday
morning In the Ekman ambulance,
suffering from a fractured right
arm ana an injury to ner knee sus-
tained when she well on the base-
ment floor of her home late Tues-

day evening. Mrs. Jorgenson had
been able to use her left arm for
about a month that has been brok-
en three years ago, when she had
this accident. She Is past eighty
years of age.

Miss Ardls Aarhus who sustained
a broken arm In a fall on the steps
leading Into the basement social
rooms of the Immanuel Lutheran
church last Wednesday ls reported
Improving though she will wear a
cast for some time yet. Miss Aarhus
had only recently organized a class
In piano, and the accident comes
as a double disappointment.

PLAY CAST BUSY
Rlckreall The high school stu

dents have selected a play In three
acts entitled "The Blue Bog." Char
acters are chosen and practicing
Degan Monday. Tne play will De

staged November 29.

FINE TEAM PURCHASED
Bethel Prank Kunciter drove to

Monmouth Tuesday. He purchased
a fine team of heavy horses from W.
R, Adams. The team weighs 3200

pounds and is fitted with new
harness making a fine outfit.
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Elsinore Theatre

Macleay Members of the
club recently entertained members
of the Bethel Dorcas club with a
luncheon and a handiwork exhibit
at Macleay hall.

In the afternoon a short program
was given which included a read-

ing by Mrs. Stella Culver; a read-

ing by Mrs. W. guitar
solo by Mrs. Marvin Wells; reading
by Mrs. J. F. C. Teckenburg; gui-
tar solo, Mrs. W. Welch; and read-

ing by Mrs. H. E. Martin.
Articles for the handiwork ex-

hibit were brought by both
club members and Dorcas club
members. Many antiques were on
exhibit, among those being a wool-
en blanket spun and woven by Mrs.
J. F. C. Teckenburg at the age of
12; a key wind watch 100 years old
and a watch 75 years old, of almost
wafer thickness, belonging to Mrs.
C. Baker; a hair chain made 42

years ago by Mrs. Matten from hers
and her mother-in-law- 's hair; a
bible belonging to the Harris fam
ily dated 1860; a Testament earned
in Sunday school by the late Augus-
ta Wedierman Harris, mother of
Mrs. M. M. Magee; a quilt made by
the Dorcas club when it was
known as the Bethel thimble club;
a daguerrotype exhibited by Stella
Culver, of her mother taken many
years ago; a silk quilt and' a fan
quilt made by Mrs. Anhock, mother
of Mrs E. Tooker. and pillow "cases
trimmed with lace made by Mrs.
Tooker's grandmother, were ex
hibited by Mrs. Tooker; and a tap-
estry made in England over 100

years ago by her grandmother, was
exhibited by Mrs Henry Phillips.

Many articles made from flour
sacks were on display. Among these
were a shirt, dress, aprons, table-
cloths and a quilt.

Those present were Mr. and Mrs,
W. Farr, Mr. and Mrs. W. Welch,
Mr. and Mrs. J. L. C. Teckenburg,
Mr. and Mrs. E. Matten, Mr. and
Mrs. M. M. Magee, Mr. and Mrs. A.
H. Feustman, Mr. and Mr3. J. l,

Mrs. C. Baker, Mrs. R. Clark.
Mrs. Stella Sulver. Mrs. W. Frlnk,
Mrs. A. F. Lewis, Mrs. H. E, Mar-

tin, Mrs. Harry Phillips, Mrs. M. A.

Wells, Mrs. E. Wilson, Mrs. O. A.

Tumberson, Mrs. E. Tooker, Mrs.
W. H. Humphreys, Mrs. John Bucu-renc-

Mrs. W. F. Brinkley, Mrs. J.
Nichols. Mrs.- - Cass Nichols. Gladys
Eoff, .Mrs. A. Sprnnger, Mrs. John
Sprangcr, Mrs. H. Utter, Mrs. Julia
Grant, Mrs. M. Brinkley, Mrs. A. L.

Sundberg, Mrs. H. Bales, Mrs. J.
Lauderback, Miss Alice Brown and
Miss Margaret Magee.

GANBY ENTERTAINS

LUTHER LEAGUERS

Sllverton The Oregon circuit of
Luther League, a society of young
people, meets from Friday through
Monday at Canby Lutheran church
of which Rev. Osmund G. Salve- -
son ls pastor.

Jonas Byberg, Sllverton, ls presi-
dent of the circuit and will preside
at the sessions. The theme of the
program is "What Shall I Do With
My Life"? Founded on 2 Corln
thians, as a text.

Large delegations from both the
Trinity and Immanuel Lutheran
churches of Sllverton plan to at
tend, and several special numbers
will be contributed by local resi-
dents.

R1CKREALL LODGE

HONORS SALEM MAN

Rlckreall A 50 year Jewel was
presented to H. C. Fox of Salem at
a meeting of Rlckreall lodge No. 110,
A. F. & A. M. of which he Is a
member, here Saturday night. The
presentation was made by W. W.

Rowcll, local postmaster. Fox has
been a Mason 09 years, having been
raised at Bolllver, Mo., In 1874.

visitors Included
Frank Oibson and Leo Abby, both
of Salem, and Mclvln Hartley of
Hlllsboro.

At the close of the meeting lunch
was served In the tea room of tho
Blackbird inn.

Mehama Minister
Is Given Farewell

Mehama A surprise farewell par
ty was given for Rev, James

and family who are moving
to Mill City, by their many friends
here. The evening was spent with
gamos and singing and refreshments
were served late In the evening.

Those attending were Miss Anna
Sout, Mrs. Luther Stout, Mrs. Ever
ett Phllllpl, Mrs. Arthur Landers,
Mr. and Mrs. Chester Blum, Mr.
and Mrs. James Blum, Mrs, Earl
Woelfklel, Mrs. Lee Dickson, Mrs.
Floyd Boyington, Mr. and Mrs. Isaac
Dixon, Mrs. Floyd Monroe, Mrs.
Rillie Wilson, Mrs. Joe Moe, Harvey
Monroe, Jack and Clarence Ooodell,
Lorene, Ardys and Orval Landers,
Jessie and Ruth Moe. Gladys and
Chester Blum Jr., Harold Stout, Es
ther, Wilbur, Leonard and David
Blum, Roy Phllllpl, Ara Purser and
the honored guests, Rev. and Mrs.
McAuley. Pat. Phillip, Ruth and
Besslo. Tho McAuleys will be great-l-

missed by their friends.

MOVE TO BETHEL
Bethel The Oeorge Haln family

of Turner moved here the last of
the week, taking possession of the
Marshand farm which Mrs. Haln
(Ida Marshand) received from her
tamers estate, cnariotie Ham ent- -
ered school at Bethel on Monday.

II warf J! I " it

lontlmirmn nboir, 1 P.M. It P.M.

ing of the Mill City high school tho
student council announced the fol-

lowing program of activities:
October 13 Girls League Frolic,
October 27 Annual Halloween

dinner.
November 17 Variety show and

carnival.
December 21 Annual Junior Prom.
February 13 Annual Senior class

night.
March 13 Girls' program.
March 30 Annual April frolic and

basket ball banquet.
April 13 Boys' cnorus show.
May 11 Annual play.
May 18 Annual school exhibit.
May 30 Annual Junior-Seni-

banquet.
This program does not include

athletic activities, nor the Honor
society and commencement events.
It will likewise be noted that the
number thirteen has no terrors for
the school.

SPECIAL VENIRE

DRAWN AT DALLAS

Dallas Another special venire of
jurymen to serve during the pres-
ent term of circuit court was drawn
Wednesday morning by Sheriff
Hooker and County Clerk Carl
Graves. No court was held on
Thursday as It was a legal holiday
but It will resume Friday morning.
The latest list of Jurors ls as fol-
lows:

Aebi, John, Dallas, Rt. 1, farmer:
Alderson, R. A., Independence,
farmer; Bailey C. M., Dallas, Rt. 2,
farmer; Barker, R. E., Salem, Rt. 1,
farmer; Conlee Homer, Dallas, Rt.
3, farmer; McCaleb L. E., Mon-
mouth, farmer; Deter, c. C, Rlck-
reall, Rt. 2, butcher; Frey Elmer,
Inn keeper, Independence; Grant,
D. J., Falls City, janitor; Guthrie.
Jas. c, Dallas, Rt. 2, farmer; Hols- -
ington, Ernest D., Monmouth. Rt.
2, farmer; Larkln, Jno., Rlckreall,
laborer; Lamond, T. M.. Monmouth,
Rt. 2, poultryman; Smith, Edw. M
Fans city, poultryman; Tharp, A.
G., Willamina, farmer; Talgner,
John C Dallas, Rt. 2, farmer: Unl- -
cume, Chas., Willamina, farmer;
Van Santcn, Albert, Salem, Rt. L,

farmer.

Guild Group Guest
Woodburn Mrs. T. C. Poorman

entertained the members of St.
Mary's Episcopal Guild at her home
on Settlemler avenue Tuesday aft-
ernoon. The regular devotional and
business session was held with Mrs.
H. L. GUI presiding followed by a
social hour during which the mem-
bers were busy with sewing. Re-
freshments were served with Mrs.
Blaine McCord and Mrs. Cecil Espy
assisting the hostess.

DONALD WINS
Donald The Donald school's

football team, working under a new
system of plays, opened Its season
with a 65-- 0 victory over the

Butteville team at Butte-
viUe Tuesday. Although slightly
outweighed, the Donald boys smash-
ed through their opponent' defense
for 10 touchdowns.

Bethel Mr. and Mrs. John Haln
have moved from the Frultland
road to the farm of Mrs. Leo Schulz.
Jean has been staying with her
grandmother, Mrs. J. M. Nichols,
to attend school until her parent
moved here.

A HiroOwied Theater tH OtLYWOoUl
Tonite is Dime Nile

Except
Seats Httf Luges

ALL AMERICA
FOOTBALL TEAM

with
RICHARD ARLEN

Oehie,- -

jomet uoa
Oltrtm (laort, Ju, Clyde,Freitwi foiMr, Jmhm Borrow.

Coming Friday and Saturday
Man Against Beast

in the Screen's

Supreme
Thriller!

CASE
wllh

CLYDE BEATTY
ITA PAOR, Andy Devtae,Ince Barnett, Mlrkcy Rooney,

Wallace Ford

PTl 3j M linTll 3j L&et Time Today

1 1 FRIDAY AND SATURDAY 1 1

I "THAT'S MX I
k ' I with Richard I
I I Cromwell I
P World's Fair I

If First Salem ShowingU WITH

I "THE
I CRUSADER"
I Evelyn Brent

Ned Sparks
H. B. Warner a

VISIT JEFFEBSON LODGE
Stayton Several members of the

Stayton Eastern Star lodge paid a
surprise visit to the Euclid chapter
at Jefferson Ttwsday night. After
the regular session a lunch was
served. Those attending from here
were Mr, and Mrs. Willis Brown,
Mr, and Mrs. Hugh Hunt, Mrs. Vir-

gil Tuel, Mrs. E. Bush, Mrs. J. Fish-

er, Mrs. Hal Shelton and Mr. and
Mrs, Sprungman.

WCTU WILL MEET
Woodburn Tie regular mretlng

of the Woodburn W. C. T. U. will
be held at the home of Mrs. Car-

rie Young and Miss Ina Bonncy
Friday afternoon at 8:30 o'clock.
Plans for the year's work will be
discussed and delegates will be
elected to the state convention,
which will observe the golden


