

LOCALS

W. E. Hansen has returned from an extended motor trip through the southern and eastern states. Mrs. Hansen and their son Reed, who accompanied him, are spending several days with relatives in The Dalles before returning to Salem. While they were driving through Florida they were stopped by a Floridian who noticed their Oregon license and their Salem marker. He said he had friends in Salem and wondered if they knew them. When Hansen asked who these friends were, the Floridian replied George Griffith and Clifford Brown. His grief when he was informed that both these friends had passed away within the last few years, was unmistakable.

Cut down on eating meat, it contains too much heat. You should eat more salads and vegetables. We have a counter full of salads and vegetables. State Cafeteria.

Lou Aldrich and Frank Doerfler, Salem bankers, and Mrs. Gertrude J. M. Page, will celebrate their birthday anniversaries together Friday with a dinner party at a downtown restaurant. This has come to be an annual affair.

Refinance your car. Pay monthly. See P. A. Eker, Liberty and Perry.

Pred Wolf, the new principal of Salem high school, started his duties Thursday morning, August 1. Mrs. Wolf is in town also. They have two children, and their little daughter, who is just six years old, will start school in Salem in the fall. The Wolfs have come from Baker where Mr. Wolf was principal during the last year.

Old time dance Crystal Gardens every Wednesday and Saturday.

Sixteen senior high school pupils have earned full time credits by taking summer school work according to the report made to J. C. Nelson, principal emeritus, by the three teachers who conducted the special classes. Miss Leah Ross had an enrollment of six in her English class, Miss Ola Clark taught four mathematics pupils and Miss Mabel Robertson taught a history class of five pupils.

25 percent off seat covers. While they last. Complete stock to be sold. Wood's Auto Service Co. 545 Chemeketa. Phone 809.

Mrs. J. W. McCune, and her daughters, Misses Vera and Jessie, have returned from a month's visit with friends and relatives in Salina, Kansas. Salina was Mrs. McCune's former home and during their stay a big birthday party was given in her honor.

Quality used cars. Wood's Auto Service Co. 545 Chemeketa St.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles E. Wagner have returned from a 10-day motor trip to Mt. Baker lodge, Harrison Hot Springs, Vancouver, B. C. Seattle and Everett. They were accompanied by their children, Margaret, Anita and Roger.

When you think of that picnic think of Lee's fancy mill, teddy bears. Then call 1332. Free delivery.

Mrs. R. A. Furrow and little daughter, Jane, left Wednesday for Astoria where they will visit with Mrs. Furrow's parents.

Old time dancing, old time music, Salem Armory every Wednesday and Saturday nights at 8:30.

Mrs. D. C. Roberts and little daughter, Georgia, are spending a few days in Astoria visiting with Mr. Roberts' parents and Coe Roberts, who is spending the summer with his grandparents.

Miller's annual bedspread sale tomorrow.

Mrs. Frank G. Deckabaugh, who recently underwent a major operation at a Portland hospital, is reported as steadily improving.

Bring your hydraulic brake troubles to us. Fitzgerald-Sherwin Motor Co., N. Liberty at Chemeketa.

Sam Malsels and Edwin Johnson, both of the 1928 graduating class at Salem high school, have asked to have their high school credits transferred to O. A. C. where they will enroll in the fall.

For sale, one ton heavy duty Ford truck, white transmission, new tires \$125. 2095 S. Winter. Phone 2735. 182

Mr. and Mrs. E. A. Colony, with their guests, Mr. and Mrs. C. H. Porter of Choteau, Mont., left Thursday for a two day "loop" trip through Newport and Neskonawin. Mr. Porter is an employee of the Great Northern railroad.

Why Get Up Nights?

Do you have to get up nights for bladder relief—do you suffer backaches, headaches, and loss of weight—are you all tired out even in the morning—are you constipated—do you have rheumatic pains or neuritis jabs due to faulty kidney or intestinal elimination?

Why continue to put up with so-called remedies that fail to give results?

The druggists below have just secured a fresh supply of the famous Mexican compound, Matamel, and offer it to sufferers on the sincere plan that it must give you better results than any medicine you ever tried—or your money back. To all those calling at once, a valuable diet book will be given FREE in every package of Matamel. Get yours today from Capital drug store. adv.

Frank Perket received a severe shaking up but no broken bones when he fell from a ten foot ladder Wednesday afternoon while he was washing woodwork at Lincoln school. Perket did not return to work Thursday.

Miller's annual bedspread sale tomorrow.

For rent, close in, modern apts. pleasant, light, clean and well furnished. Reasonable. 340 Union. 182

500 yards of concrete blocks for the hauling. Located at Trade St. between Com'l and High. Phone 2975J. 183

Confirmation of sale of real property has been filed in circuit court in the case of W. W. Kinney against Vera E. Hill.

Last time today for the natural color, singing, dancing success "On with the Show." Bligh's Capitol. 182

Bush & Lane piano for sale very cheap. Inquire at State hotel annex any time before Sunday night. 182

Eva Mae Lebengood has filed a new complaint for divorce against Carl W. Lebengood, alleging that he associated with other women. She filed a similar complaint in 1928 but withdrew it after a reconciliation. She asks custody of two minor children and \$40 a month for their support.

Miller's annual bedspread sale tomorrow.

Fresh loganberry juice, Puritan cider works, West Salem. Phone 3744J. 182

Caroline B. Martin alleges her husband, Carl A. Martin, has been cold and indifferent and that she has been compelled to support herself and the kids a divorce and custody of a minor child in a complaint filed in circuit court.

Dry planer wood, fine for summer use. Prompt delivery. Fred E. Wells, Inc. Phone 1542. 182

B. P. Taylor has filed a complaint in circuit court against Mabel A. Lockwood as executrix of the estate of Chauncey M. Lockwood to collect on a note.

Mill wood, 5 loads \$18.75. Salem Fuel Co. Phone-13. 182

Charged with the theft of an automobile, the property of Orville Breville, Robert K. Baker, 18, of Port Worth, Texas, a deserter from the navy, was returned to the city jail Thursday after a hearing before Judge Brazier Small. Bail was fixed at \$1,000. Baker was arrested Wednesday night when Don Nicholson, day traffic officer, recognized the number on a car as having been reported earlier in the day as stolen from a parking place near the paper mill. Nicholson was not on duty at the time. Baker admits having deserted from the navy while his ship was stationed at Tacoma.

Dr. H. J. Clements of the Salem Clinic will leave Salem about August tenth for several months of post-graduate study in the hospitals of London, Paris, Vienna and other European cities.

Mrs. C. W. Fox of Oakland, Cal., is expected to arrive in Salem Sunday on the Southern Pacific Shasta. While here she will be the guest of Mrs. Myra L. Shank. Mrs. Fox will visit relatives and friends in Albany and Eugene before returning to her home.

John Knight, first exalted ruler of the Salem Elks lodge, Wednesday opened the district federal court in Portland and launched himself tyro in his 20th year as court crier. Knight was a blacksmith here about 30 years ago and celebrated his 80th birthday last January. Knight was first appointed bailiff by U. S. Marshal Caldwell in 1910 and served in this capacity until the administration of President Woodrow Wilson. He might have lost out had not Federal Judge Bean appointed him court crier, a position filled directly by the court and not by the marshal.

The Women's Christian Temperance Union of Salem has filed suit in circuit court against Emma Sturgis, George Alvin Sturgis and Marie Ramp to clear their title to the property which they hold at the corner of South Commercial and Perry streets.

Funeral services will be held Friday afternoon at 1:30 in the Clough-Houston chapel for Augustus M. Humphreys, Marion county pioneer, who died Wednesday at the age of 72 years at the home of his daughter, Mrs. E. L. Herrel at Eola. He had been ill for five years. Interment will take place in the Rock Point cemetery in the Waldo Hills at the side of his parents, and a daughter and son.

His widow Anna Welch Humphreys and five daughters and a son survive him. The children are Harry of Hermosa Beach, Calif.; Miss Claudine Humphreys, Mrs. R. J. Abbott and Mrs. M. R. Laurer of Portland; Mrs. C. F. McGraw of McCoy; Mrs. Herrel of Eola. W. H. Humphreys and Mrs. J. B. Ashley of Salem are brother and sister of the deceased.

Seven grandchildren and one great-grandchild also survive him.

Augustus M. Humphreys was born on the old donation land claim in the Waldo Hills and was the third oldest of 11 children. He lived on the Humphreys farm until he was 30 years old when he went to Spokane. He married Anna Welch there and 10 years later he and his family returned to Salem where he entered the warehouse business. His first warehouse was at the river's edge at the foot of Union street. In 1905 the family moved to Portland where they remained until June, 1928 when they returned to Salem. He was a member of the Montavilla Methodist church in Portland.

In addition to a crack squadron of army fliers from Grays field at San Francisco ordered here for the dedication of the municipal airport Thursday during the American Legion state convention, a number of ships from Pearson field at Vancouver, Wash., will also be present.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

The family of cats was put into a cell at the station to prevent them from running away, while a policeman was sent in search of food.

No more cats are wanted by the police, however, who say four members of the feline family is enough for any police station.

Bid for all remaining assets of the Citizens' State bank of Metolius, which was closed October 18, 1928, were opened Thursday by A. A. Schramm, state superintendent of banks. The highest lump sum bid was made by Elton Watkins of Portland, but no bid has yet been officially accepted by Schramm.

Watkins' total bid was \$751 for assets which include notes for \$23,006.73, 160 acres of land and six shares of stock in the Metolius Improvement company. Watkins made two other bids on various assets. The only other bid on all assets was from Ray Cunningham of Madras, bidding \$411. There were three other bidders on various assets. The bank superintendent will calculate what combination of bids comprises the best offer before making the award.

On the date the bank was closed its resources were listed at \$73,000.

Marion receives \$26,300 school fund

Marion county receives \$26,300.84, the largest of all counties in the state except Multnomah, in the annual distribution of interest on the state irreducible school fund made Thursday by Hal E. Hoss, secretary of state. This is on the basis of 16,732 persons of school age, between 4 and 20 years, in the county. Polk county receives \$484.88 on a basis of 5,445 persons of school age.

The rate per capita is \$1.57, the same as last year. The total amount of money apportioned among the 36 counties this year is \$408,479.46 and the total number of persons of school age was 258,701.

A number of complimentary letters have been received by J. F. Ulrich, president of the Salem realty board from realtors who were guests in Salem last week during the Pacific northwest convention.

Elaborate praise of the dignified tone of the meetings, enjoyment of all the entertainment offered, is expressed in every one of the letters.

The letter from the Tacoma real estate board was particularly enthusiastic. Salem, said the letter, is undoubtedly one of the most progressive cities of the northwest and the trip here was particularly enjoyed because of the knowledge it brought of the rich agricultural community surrounding the city.

Something unusual happened here when the body of D. H. Talmadge, Jr., was being escorted to the cemetery by a cortege of friends. The Salem band led the funeral procession and at the grave played as a last tribute to their former comrade. For in addition to being a printer—and a good one—for the past 20 years—the younger Dave was also for many years a member of the Salem band—a drummer—and a good one too.

Once in a while the "band is out" in Salem for some celebrity. Should Lindbergh come here it might be out for him, and perhaps it would play for the president or a hero home from the wars. But it has been many years since it led a funeral procession here and this time it was for a boy so beautiful and rotund that only a few people knew him and only a few of his associates and his parents knew him really well.

Governor Patterson Thursday issued a requisition on the governor of Idaho for the extradition of C. C. Carlin and C. E. Wilson, who are wanted at Pendleton to answer to a charge of obtaining money by false pretenses. Sheriff Gurdane of Umatilla county will go to Idaho to return the men to this state.

The application of the Southern Pacific company for authority to acquire control of the Nevada-California-Oregon railway has been set by the interstate commerce commission for hearing on August 9, says a letter received from the I. C. C. by the Oregon public service commission.

State officials will leave Friday for Lake county where they will inspect a 24,000 acre tract of swamp land which the state land board proposes to lease to an eastern Oregon cattle man for grazing purposes. The land is near Lakeview. The lease price has not been fixed, but may be set at 10 cents an acre annually. Sunday the state officials will attend the annual field day in farm demonstration at the Burns experiment station of Oregon Agricultural college. Governor Patterson, Secretary of State Hoss, Budget Director Komer, and James Stewart, investigator for the land board, will make the trip.

A. F. Campbell of Eugene, was arrested Wednesday night, charged with speeding.

Harold C. Jones of Portland, secretary-treasurer of the Pacific northwest district of the Kiwanis International, will be in Salem Friday to meet with the Salem Kiwanians who are chairmen of committees appointed to take charge of the district convention here the third week in August. Scott Page, general convention chairman, says that Jones will meet with the committees at luncheon at the Marion at noon.

A. M. HUMPHREYS PASSES AT EOLA

Funeral services will be held Friday afternoon at 1:30 in the Clough-Houston chapel for Augustus M. Humphreys, Marion county pioneer, who died Wednesday at the age of 72 years at the home of his daughter, Mrs. E. L. Herrel at Eola. He had been ill for five years. Interment will take place in the Rock Point cemetery in the Waldo Hills at the side of his parents, and a daughter and son.

His widow Anna Welch Humphreys and five daughters and a son survive him. The children are Harry of Hermosa Beach, Calif.; Miss Claudine Humphreys, Mrs. R. J. Abbott and Mrs. M. R. Laurer of Portland; Mrs. C. F. McGraw of McCoy; Mrs. Herrel of Eola. W. H. Humphreys and Mrs. J. B. Ashley of Salem are brother and sister of the deceased.

Seven grandchildren and one great-grandchild also survive him.

Augustus M. Humphreys was born on the old donation land claim in the Waldo Hills and was the third oldest of 11 children. He lived on the Humphreys farm until he was 30 years old when he went to Spokane. He married Anna Welch there and 10 years later he and his family returned to Salem where he entered the warehouse business. His first warehouse was at the river's edge at the foot of Union street. In 1905 the family moved to Portland where they remained until June, 1928 when they returned to Salem. He was a member of the Montavilla Methodist church in Portland.

In addition to a crack squadron of army fliers from Grays field at San Francisco ordered here for the dedication of the municipal airport Thursday during the American Legion state convention, a number of ships from Pearson field at Vancouver, Wash., will also be present.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

The family of cats was put into a cell at the station to prevent them from running away, while a policeman was sent in search of food.

No more cats are wanted by the police, however, who say four members of the feline family is enough for any police station.

Bid for all remaining assets of the Citizens' State bank of Metolius, which was closed October 18, 1928, were opened Thursday by A. A. Schramm, state superintendent of banks. The highest lump sum bid was made by Elton Watkins of Portland, but no bid has yet been officially accepted by Schramm.

Watkins' total bid was \$751 for assets which include notes for \$23,006.73, 160 acres of land and six shares of stock in the Metolius Improvement company. Watkins made two other bids on various assets. The only other bid on all assets was from Ray Cunningham of Madras, bidding \$411. There were three other bidders on various assets. The bank superintendent will calculate what combination of bids comprises the best offer before making the award.

On the date the bank was closed its resources were listed at \$73,000.

Marion receives \$26,300 school fund

Marion county receives \$26,300.84, the largest of all counties in the state except Multnomah, in the annual distribution of interest on the state irreducible school fund made Thursday by Hal E. Hoss, secretary of state. This is on the basis of 16,732 persons of school age, between 4 and 20 years, in the county. Polk county receives \$484.88 on a basis of 5,445 persons of school age.

The rate per capita is \$1.57, the same as last year. The total amount of money apportioned among the 36 counties this year is \$408,479.46 and the total number of persons of school age was 258,701.

A number of complimentary letters have been received by J. F. Ulrich, president of the Salem realty board from realtors who were guests in Salem last week during the Pacific northwest convention.

Elaborate praise of the dignified tone of the meetings, enjoyment of all the entertainment offered, is expressed in every one of the letters.

The letter from the Tacoma real estate board was particularly enthusiastic. Salem, said the letter, is undoubtedly one of the most progressive cities of the northwest and the trip here was particularly enjoyed because of the knowledge it brought of the rich agricultural community surrounding the city.

PLENTY OF CATS AT CITY HALL

"We heard you lost your cat, Uncle Walt, so we brought you our old cat and her three kittens," piped a shrill voice at the police station early Thursday morning. Sergeant Thompson, on duty at the time, turned around and saw two eager faces, that barely came to the top of the counter, beaming at him.

Dorothy and Eldon McCullah, little daughter and son of Mr. and Mrs. John D. McCullah, 1255 Nebraska street, had heard of the death of the police cat Wednesday.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

The family of cats was put into a cell at the station to prevent them from running away, while a policeman was sent in search of food.

No more cats are wanted by the police, however, who say four members of the feline family is enough for any police station.

BID FOR ASSETS OF METOLIUS BANK

Bids for all remaining assets of the Citizens' State bank of Metolius, which was closed October 18, 1928, were opened Thursday by A. A. Schramm, state superintendent of banks. The highest lump sum bid was made by Elton Watkins of Portland, but no bid has yet been officially accepted by Schramm.

Watkins' total bid was \$751 for assets which include notes for \$23,006.73, 160 acres of land and six shares of stock in the Metolius Improvement company. Watkins made two other bids on various assets. The only other bid on all assets was from Ray Cunningham of Madras, bidding \$411. There were three other bidders on various assets. The bank superintendent will calculate what combination of bids comprises the best offer before making the award.

On the date the bank was closed its resources were listed at \$73,000.

PLENTY OF CATS AT CITY HALL

"We heard you lost your cat, Uncle Walt, so we brought you our old cat and her three kittens," piped a shrill voice at the police station early Thursday morning. Sergeant Thompson, on duty at the time, turned around and saw two eager faces, that barely came to the top of the counter, beaming at him.

Dorothy and Eldon McCullah, little daughter and son of Mr. and Mrs. John D. McCullah, 1255 Nebraska street, had heard of the death of the police cat Wednesday.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

The family of cats was put into a cell at the station to prevent them from running away, while a policeman was sent in search of food.

No more cats are wanted by the police, however, who say four members of the feline family is enough for any police station.

BID FOR ASSETS OF METOLIUS BANK

Bids for all remaining assets of the Citizens' State bank of Metolius, which was closed October 18, 1928, were opened Thursday by A. A. Schramm, state superintendent of banks. The highest lump sum bid was made by Elton Watkins of Portland, but no bid has yet been officially accepted by Schramm.

Watkins' total bid was \$751 for assets which include notes for \$23,006.73, 160 acres of land and six shares of stock in the Metolius Improvement company. Watkins made two other bids on various assets. The only other bid on all assets was from Ray Cunningham of Madras, bidding \$411. There were three other bidders on various assets. The bank superintendent will calculate what combination of bids comprises the best offer before making the award.

On the date the bank was closed its resources were listed at \$73,000.

Marion receives \$26,300 school fund

Marion county receives \$26,300.84, the largest of all counties in the state except Multnomah, in the annual distribution of interest on the state irreducible school fund made Thursday by Hal E. Hoss, secretary of state. This is on the basis of 16,732 persons of school age, between 4 and 20 years, in the county. Polk county receives \$484.88 on a basis of 5,445 persons of school age.

The rate per capita is \$1.57, the same as last year. The total amount of money apportioned among the 36 counties this year is \$408,479.46 and the total number of persons of school age was 258,701.

A number of complimentary letters have been received by J. F. Ulrich, president of the Salem realty board from realtors who were guests in Salem last week during the Pacific northwest convention.

Elaborate praise of the dignified tone of the meetings, enjoyment of all the entertainment offered, is expressed in every one of the letters.

The letter from the Tacoma real estate board was particularly enthusiastic. Salem, said the letter, is undoubtedly one of the most progressive cities of the northwest and the trip here was particularly enjoyed because of the knowledge it brought of the rich agricultural community surrounding the city.

PLENTY OF CATS AT CITY HALL

"We heard you lost your cat, Uncle Walt, so we brought you our old cat and her three kittens," piped a shrill voice at the police station early Thursday morning. Sergeant Thompson, on duty at the time, turned around and saw two eager faces, that barely came to the top of the counter, beaming at him.

Dorothy and Eldon McCullah, little daughter and son of Mr. and Mrs. John D. McCullah, 1255 Nebraska street, had heard of the death of the police cat Wednesday.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

The family of cats was put into a cell at the station to prevent them from running away, while a policeman was sent in search of food.

No more cats are wanted by the police, however, who say four members of the feline family is enough for any police station.

BID FOR ASSETS OF METOLIUS BANK

Bids for all remaining assets of the Citizens' State bank of Metolius, which was closed October 18, 1928, were opened Thursday by A. A. Schramm, state superintendent of banks. The highest lump sum bid was made by Elton Watkins of Portland, but no bid has yet been officially accepted by Schramm.

Watkins' total bid was \$751 for assets which include notes for \$23,006.73, 160 acres of land and six shares of stock in the Metolius Improvement company. Watkins made two other bids on various assets. The only other bid on all assets was from Ray Cunningham of Madras, bidding \$411. There were three other bidders on various assets. The bank superintendent will calculate what combination of bids comprises the best offer before making the award.

On the date the bank was closed its resources were listed at \$73,000.

Marion receives \$26,300 school fund

Marion county receives \$26,300.84, the largest of all counties in the state except Multnomah, in the annual distribution of interest on the state irreducible school fund made Thursday by Hal E. Hoss, secretary of state. This is on the basis of 16,732 persons of school age, between 4 and 20 years, in the county. Polk county receives \$484.88 on a basis of 5,445 persons of school age.

The rate per capita is \$1.57, the same as last year. The total amount of money apportioned among the 36 counties this year is \$408,479.46 and the total number of persons of school age was 258,701.

A number of complimentary letters have been received by J. F. Ulrich, president of the Salem realty board from realtors who were guests in Salem last week during the Pacific northwest convention.

Elaborate praise of the dignified tone of the meetings, enjoyment of all the entertainment offered, is expressed in every one of the letters.

The letter from the Tacoma real estate board was particularly enthusiastic. Salem, said the letter, is undoubtedly one of the most progressive cities of the northwest and the trip here was particularly enjoyed because of the knowledge it brought of the rich agricultural community surrounding the city.

PLENTY OF CATS AT CITY HALL

"We heard you lost your cat, Uncle Walt, so we brought you our old cat and her three kittens," piped a shrill voice at the police station early Thursday morning. Sergeant Thompson, on duty at the time, turned around and saw two eager faces, that barely came to the top of the counter, beaming at him.

Dorothy and Eldon McCullah, little daughter and son of Mr. and Mrs. John D. McCullah, 1255 Nebraska street, had heard of the death of the police cat Wednesday.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

PLENTY OF CATS AT CITY HALL

"We heard you lost your cat, Uncle Walt, so we brought you our old cat and her three kittens," piped a shrill voice at the police station early Thursday morning. Sergeant Thompson, on duty at the time, turned around and saw two eager faces, that barely came to the top of the counter, beaming at him.

Dorothy and Eldon McCullah, little daughter and son of Mr. and Mrs. John D. McCullah, 1255 Nebraska street, had heard of the death of the police cat Wednesday.

Clutching tightly in their arms, each youngster had a box in one hand and a cat in the other. They had trudged all the way from the Englewood district to present their offering to "Uncle Walt," a friend of long standing.

The family of cats was put into a cell at the station to prevent them from running away, while a policeman was sent in search of food.

No more cats are wanted by the police, however, who say four members of the feline family is enough for any police station.

BID FOR ASSETS OF METOLIUS BANK

Bids for all remaining assets of the Citizens' State bank of Metolius, which was closed October 18, 1928, were opened Thursday by A. A. Schramm, state superintendent of banks. The highest lump sum bid was made by Elton Watkins of Portland, but no bid has yet been officially accepted by Schramm.

Watkins' total bid was \$751 for assets which include notes for \$23,006.73, 160 acres of land and six shares of stock in the Metolius Improvement company. Watkins made two other bids on various assets. The only other bid on all assets was from Ray Cunningham of Madras, bidding \$411. There were three other bidders on various assets. The bank superintendent will calculate what combination of bids comprises the best offer before making the award.

On the date the bank was closed its resources were listed at \$73,000.

Marion receives \$26,300 school fund

Marion county receives \$26,300.84, the largest of all counties in the state except Multnomah, in the annual distribution of interest on the state irreducible school fund made Thursday by Hal E. Hoss, secretary of state. This is on the basis of 16,732 persons of school age, between 4 and 20 years, in the county. Polk county receives \$484.88 on a basis of