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This is a frequent late winter
and early spring tendency. But
its esrly flowering this year is
particularly encouraging to
those who hope the economy
can keep moving ahead under
its own power although any
outside assets will be appre-
ciated.

Housing starts in February
are put at an annual rate of
1,280,000, or 4 per cent from
January. The tpurt encourages
the Department of Commerce
to stick by its earlier predic-
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housing units started. This will
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one of the best.
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tion of Securities Dealers, Inc., do
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They are a guide to the range with-
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compilation.
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63RABJBXER ENGLAND FUNERAL HOME the National Association of Securi-
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specifications now on file In the
County Clerk's office and at the
Lane County Highway Shops at
1820 Roosevelt Blvd., Eugene,
Oregon. The Bids will be pub-
licly opened at 10:00 a.m., April
3, 1963 In the County Commis-
sioner's Room, Lane County
Courthouse. Eusene. Oreson. The
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and polls showing- consumer
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ing thereof, or before award of
the contract, unless said award

name, nay tiascue. Reward for
return, pleate call DI

cussions at the Weat Coast Lum-
bermen's Assn. meeting Thurs-
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figure. Earnings of all employes
and self employed persons, up
$1 billion on an annual rate in
January, spurted by $2 billion
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merce Department, told the
lumbermen Wednesday that the
price might drop as much as
$4 per thousand feet.
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male. V ic 1 n 1 1 y Springfield
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mission that will go to Europe
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2Btn ana Aider, - (collar with
bell) answers to Sissy. DI 1152 Olive VI fice or tne Lane county High
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It la out of such earnings that

moat mortgages are sought and
payments made. And It is the
personal income total, now at
an annual rate' of $450.8 bil-

lion, that takea care of house-
hold furnishings, whether on a
cash or instalment basis.

. And when total incomes rise,

One Wm. St.
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Board of Commissioners: By for a month next summer.LOSt in Royal Delle Mondsy,
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$4 Chev Automatics $ 795;

Junction City Harrlsburg
Phone Junction City WY Frank unott, jets Hiu, and Ken My own belief is that Eu rumara r unci .
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rope Is a tremendous market
for lumber. People there are 25 Vi United Accumsunset
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United Income '
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: 33 V4 4.14NOTICE Is hereby alven thatmale. Vicinity Horn Lane. Cottage Grove WH ard of living , . . They . . .hope Wellington Fund 14.04

so does confidence and family
planning.

vest. Nat. Gaa . 13

Weyerhaouaor ...... 29V4
14
31FAMILY PET. DI Drain, TEmplo mi WeUlngton Equity 13.10to have homes ot their own in

the undersigned has been ap-
pointed by the Circuit Court of
the State of Oreson. Lane Coun980 The University of MichiganDeoth NoticesPersonals 905

SB Volkswagen $1,095
44 Ford, Floor Stick $ $95
Si Ford '6' Automatic $ 193

the near future, we must goSurvey Research Center says aty, to act as the Administrator ofSftMURfiMAM Earl SchuremanHELP WANTED IMMEDIATELY alter this Business," he saidnationwide poll just completedthe estate of OSCAR at. huet-TER- .

Deceased. All persons havfor employment by Home of 1848 Jefferson, passed away
March 10, 1963. He waa bornCoupes Stock Market Ends DavFORMaker Service. Help manage shows plans are more wideJune 18. 188B at Allan. Kansas, ing claims against said estate are!

hereby notified to present the41 Ford Galaxle $2,595
41 Chev Nova. One With He waa a veteran of Worldana care for nomes during ill-

ness or disablement of parent.
Hourly wase. 12 evening les

spread now than a year ago to
buy houses for owner occusame, amy veniiea. ana wiinWar I, and had lived In the Sa?lttPnSoftNote)Lower VolumeKueene area for over 20 years.

Automatlo : $2,295
40 M.G.A. Roadster $1,695
54 Plymouth $1,195 pancy or to make improvements

proper vouchers to the Adminis-
trator at 641 Pearl Street,

Oreson. within six (6)
sons In 4 weeks, starting March
25th, required at a fee of $10.
For further information call and repairs on old ones. But

Survived by his wife, Gertrude;
a son, Howard of Riverside,1
California; a daughter, Margie

A VUI1UUUU11months of the date of the first NEW YORK tffl The stockthe survey cautions that con
54 Chev Convertible $1,495
55 Pontiac, Good $ 345
44 Dodaa. Sharn $ 445 publication of this notice, thedi 1074 Willamette,

Room 211. of San Francisco; a brother, WASHINGTON Ml Presidentsumer confidence in the futureWalter of Amorlcus. Kansas: 28th day of February, 1963,
H. V. JOHNSON.

market closed irregular Thurs-
day with a number of leading

41 Chev, Nice $ 175 It Vou Wan Something to Help Kennedy selected Leland J. Ha

Among fractional losers were
U. S. Steel, Ford, Chrysler, Con-

solidated Edison, Eastern Air-
lines, Scherlng and Zenith.

Prices on the American Stock

sister, Mrs. Gertrude Smith of hasn't gained any since its preAdministrator of the EstateWagons worth Thursday to be director issues clipping their prices.vious poll in November and DeYOU

STOP SMOKING
Miner, Kansas, rrivate runerai
services will be held Friday,
March 22, 1943 at 10:30 a.m. in40 Olds. Power ..$2,395 It was a day of minor fluctuof the National Science Foundacember.

Large Backlog Reported
tion. ations. The market was upSS Dodge, Power $1,395

57 Ford, Automatic $1,095 Exchange were Irregular inSee Gene, once again He Has The the England Funeral Home,
Pearl at 18th. Pastor Harold

Of OSCAR M. HUETTiSK,
Deceased.

JOHNSON, JOHNSON St
HARRANO
Attorneys for Estate
641 Pearl Street , -
Eugene, Oregon

sngntiy at the start, tradedHaworth now is s member of slow trading,fteske officiating.44 Ford, Overdrive $ 595
44 Chev. Automatic 4 795 A more optimistic finding Is

Help That Will Stop The
For A Cigarette: GENE'S

FAIRFIELD PHARMACY, 1101
about even at midday, declinedthe Atomic Energy Commission. corporate Donas were irreguST Chrysler, Power $1,295 reported by Martin B. Galns- -HoTFMANeatrlceA7Hoffman

of 4824 4th Avenue, Tacoma,l
Washington, passed away

in the afternoon, recovered, lar; U. S. governments were unThe White House announced hisr airiiein. vi No. 1318 Date last Pub.
then softened again. . .March 26. 1963. changed to easier..place there will be taken byTrucks

4 TJodee. Long Wheel
brugh, chief economist oi tne
National Industrial ConferenceTHAT BETTER JOB? N0TICEPNAl7"aETrra Volume for the day waa esti

Employers will hire the girl that Gerald Tape, president of the
Associated Universities, Inc., of mated at 3.3 million shiresMCNT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN,
Base, Shift ....$1,495

Sa G.M.C. Carryall with
Board. His nonprofit research
group's latest survey show moreis well groomed,- poised and

March IB, lima at ner resiuence
In Tscoma. She was born May
7, 1914 In Marcola. She was a
member of the Methodist
Church In Springfield. She Is
survived by her husband, David

Red Chinesecompared with 3.69 millionthat the Administrator of the Es New York City. Haworth will beself assured. Glorea La Vonne
trelnlng will give you this. It
you want to be a success, call

than 45 per cent oi tne --nun Wednesday.the second director of the
dreds of households contacted Lossea of key atocks wentul for details.

$1,495
14 Dodge Long Wheel Base,

$ 895
15 Chev, Long Wheel Base,- .... . 745
44 Jeep, 14,000 Miles $1,395
S4 StxrfA nvrririv t 595

List Critics
tate or CLYDE MURUAJN nil
filed his Final Report In said
estate In the Circuit Court of the
State of Oregon for Lane County,
and the Court has appointed
April 9, 1963 at 10:00 a.m. of said

during the past two months ex from fractlona to about a point.
M. Hoffman or racoma; one
son, John M. Hoffmsn of Tsco-

ma; one daughter, Ann Elisa-
beth Hoffman of Tacoma; one

FOR INFORMATION and services
Chemicals were off fairly TOKYO WT Communist China

Science Foundation, succeeding
Alan T. Waterman, who is re-

tiring. Haworth, 58, is a physi-
cist, and former director of the
Brookhaven National Labora-

tory, a government atomic

pect the business situation to
improve by midyear." Gains-brug- h

says the survey shows

P
R
o
F
I
T

for problems of mental retarda-
tion of children and adults call
the Assoclstlon for the Help
of Retarded Children. DI

day, In the Courthouse In Eubrother, c. Dale carton ot
one sister, Mrs. Olen

Complete Financing Available
reported Thursday that in the
past five months 44 of the
world'a 81 Communist parties

sharply. Down about a point
were Du iont and Eastman Ko-

dak. Anken Chemical was off
about 2.

Brougher of Eugene; her moth-r- .

Mrs. Ethel Carson of Eu
gene, uregon tor tne neanng ot
objections to such Pinal Report
and settlement of said estate. home purchasing plans are enRoom 109, Empire Building,

1074 Willamette. Eugene. couraging and consumer ae- -gene. Funeral services will be
announced later by Buell Chap- -BRlfiiGgood used clothing, fur- - have attacked Chinese commu-

nism with epithets ranging fromEUGENE U.S. Smelting held a gain ofnlture. household goods to Eu Haworth also is a formermand in general is strong with-

out signs of faltering.gene Mission Store at 484 Wil ZERO Allan E. Zero of LaSalle

First Publication: March 7, 1963

Roy S. Morgan,
Administrator of the
Estate of CLYDE MORGAN.
BARBER COTTRELL
1260 Pearl Street
Eugene. Oregon

warlike" to "Trotakylte."president of Associated Univer-

sities, Inc., from which he reAs briaht ss the spurt in aclamette. Newspapers to 1925
Roosevelt Boulevsrd. For free

about a point. IBM lost about 3
and Polaroid around 2. Xerox
declined more than s point.

Auto Center It was the first time an exact
DI435 East Broadway pickup of any above Items, call signed to go to the AEC in 1901.

Street, Harnsburg, pasted away
March 20, 1993 at the age of 91.

Complete obituary and funeral
a r r a n 4 e ments will be an-

nounced later by Murphy Fu-

neral Home, Junction City.

figure has been given of the
number of Communist antag

Ul 9.S7H9. A number of oils, nonferrousNo. 1340 April 4, 1963,

INTHEXPECTANT mothers wanting
confidential advice and help onists publicly ranged againstmetals and selected Issues of-

fered resistance to the retreat.

Tape, 47, also is a physicist and
a director at Brookhaven, suc-

ceeding Haworth there as he
will be doing at the AEC.

THE STATE OF OREGON FOR

tual home starts in February
is the rise recently in local per-
mits issued for new housing
construction. The Commerce De-

partment also reports a large
backlog of unused construction
permits. Much of this is for

AUTO TRUCK
WHOLESALE

aae n amri.fr 4 door sedan
Funeral Notices 985may phone or write the Boys

and Girls Aid Society of Ore-- ! Peking In the great debate over
how to bury Western capitalism.Up fractionally were StandMARKS Francis M. Marks ofgon, co Mrs. Mery Fine, Z301

2431 Adams street, runerai The official Peking People'sStick, very sharp 1777 ard of Indiana, Texaco, Ameri-
can Smelting, Homestake,

THE COUNTY OF LANE
li. the Matter of the Estate

of
JAMES ADRIAN TRAPMAN,

Deceased.
No. 14430

CITATION

N.W. Gllssn, Portland tu, ore.
on. CA aervlces will be held Friday,

March 22, 1963 at 11 a.m.aaa rnnn V8 Ranch wagon "ALCOHOTTCS ANONYMOU-S-
Phelps Dodge and Generaltn SImon.Lounsbury FuneralALANON FAMILY GROUPS

Chapel. Rev. Ray O. Marks
INFORMATION and HELP with

officiating. Interment Gains of a point or so were
TO: DOLORES BANTER, JUDITH
C. GREGSTON, AND THE UN-

KNOWN HEIRS OF JAMES

;Full power, automatic 4977

17 PLYMOUTH V8 Belvedere
Hardtop, a good one 4677

' Ai-- From Bltf Y Market

family drinking problems day

apartment buildings, wnicn us-

ually get under way later in the
spring,

On this backlog, and on con-

sumer intention polls, the de-

partment bases its prediction

Mwmnrlsl Gardens.
RICHMOND-Fay- e Alford Rich-

Daily recalled Peking's agree-
ment with Moscow two. weeks
sgo to halt the public name-callin- g

whioh has embittered the
great debate In the Communist
camp. It noted, however, that
the Chinese party reserved its
right to make public answer to
every srgument which openly

made by U.S. Gypsum and
United Air Lines. ,

TRAPMAN. Jr:mond or 1314 "V" street, You are hereby commanded
Springfield. Funeral services1190 West 7th DI and cited to aooear in the above-

Blaze Levels Huts
SAIGON, Viet Nam Wl Fire

swept through s Saigon slum
area, destroying 3,400 thatched
roof shanties and leaving 25,000

persons homeless before it was
finally brought under control
early Thursday. Hundreds of
the slum dwellers plunged into
the Ssigon River to escape the
blaze. More than 100 were in-

jured, police said.

or night.
TELEPHONE DI

40th Annlverssry Sale
Now At Tiffany's

You Save On Prescriptions
64 H GREEN STAMPS

TIFFANY'S SUPER DRUGS
4 Convenient Locations

will be held In the Poole-Le- r

sen Chapel. Friday. March 22,LOCAL 1990 MER'
runv MONTCLA1R fordor se-

entitled Court within ten days
from the date of service of this1963 at 10 a.m. Rev. Murray

that a lot of new housing units
will go up this year. And that
ia good news for the building
trades snd for their suppliers

Portland Marketsanddan. Like new condition. Power
3 .rlnff and brakes, white- - McLees officiating. Interment Citation, If served within Lane

County, Oregon, and within twen-
ty days If served within anyat west Lawn.' walls, radio, heater, 21,000 singled out the Chinese regime

by name.FTZlHENCE"- - Jessie Belle FlorAWTJ fRLihDTFFlCULTVOTl other countv of the State of Ore- actual miles. 41395. Will tske
' trsde and. arrange financing. ence of 1230 West 10th Avenue. PORTLAND Ul ButtarfatFuneral services will be held

and for all the appliance and
home furnishings makers snd
dealers.

gon, and personally served, or
If served by publication within
twentv-elah- t days from the date

nt A.7!t!Ul Tentetlve, eubjeet to Immediate
In need of counseling shouia
contact The Salvation Army or
White Shield Home, 1261 N.W.

Mayflower Avenue, Portland.
Friday. March 22. 1963 at 2 p.m.

L?M0t)TH. 1S57 Savoy: NeW Morse Pusheschange Premium quality deUvered
In Portland. 44 cents lb.i firstminm whltewalls. Low mile- In Funeral

Chapel. Rev. Arthur Hyland of
of the first publication of thla
Citation, to show cause, .If any
exists, why an Order of Sale of
real property of aald estate sit

age. Very nice condition, 4495.

will accept partial trade. RI ficiating, intarmeni west laws. Research Labquality 41i aecond quality 96.
Butter Prints per lb. to retailer!
Grade AA, 94 score, 44t A grade.Leaals

Telephone CApltol

SALEII
Store Wide Savings

U Price Jewelry Table

IsIitlKV Imnala fordor. WASHINGTON (OTD Stn.Salmon Research ProposalIN THE CIRCUIT "COURT--
oT uated In the City of Eugene, Lane

County, Oregon,
H score, 40; n grade, eo score, eo.

Cheese To retsllers 6lnaleTHE STATE OF OREGON
FOR THE COUNTY OF LANE parcel i; Beginning at tne

Northwest corner of Lot 7.
Power brakes, steering. Auto-

matic Radio, heater, white-wall-

Too condition. 19,000
daisies, processed Amert-een- ,

4444.
Wayne Morse, urged
Wednesday that funds be appro-
priated for a range and wildlife

PARAMOUNT DRUGS 1100 Main CASE NO. SUMMONS Block 1. Cosmopolitan Homes,RORF.RT M. P1II.I.IAM. Plaintiff Opposed at Senate Hearingm SUR79. as platted and recorded inThrift v IpntnrA habitat laboratory at La uranoe,IS4 FORD COUPE. Stock. New

iM.tric svstem. brakea and

10 retsllers orode aa,
extra large, 4349; AA large,
A Urge, 4044; AA mediums,
AA small, Cartons 14 cents
additional.

iravir.1 LABORATORY UNITED STATES NATIONAL, The bill would transfer sal
Book 28, Page 15, Lane County;
Oregon Plat Records; running
thence South 009' West 80.0

SALEM I A measure to Ore.. - - .... UIU. ssns UP runiuinu, a nauon-hocks. 15 Inch tires. 5250.
The request was made in prefeet to the North line of 37th

' btnkinf Mioclatlon; WIN!- -

1 N.7sS !
Springfield RI ED ENSIGN, - widow; HAZEL Avenue East: thence North 89 pared testimony, submitted to

MAXWELL, a widow: BERTHA
Eggs To producers, at farm

AA eatra large, AA large,
A lane. AA mediums.TOOMANY BILLS? Let ui help S3 West 120.0 feet to the East

line of Hllyard Street; thence
North 009' East 60.0 feet;you with our piannea ueoi ne AA .mall.

the Senate Appropriations com-
mittee while Morse wss in Costa
Rica.

PHAIR and W. C. PHAIR, her
husband; BETTY BOOK and
JOHN BOOK, her huibandj

POWELL and VERDIE POW- -

dilution. No need to borrow.

turn over angler license funds
to the Fish Commission for sal-

mon research was opposed by
Rollin E. Bowles, Portland,
chairman of the Game Com-

mission, Wednesday.
Bowles appeared before the

Senate Fish and Game Commit

RI 7 9524;
fordor hardtop.

Automatic. Good condition.!
41J0O. Would take trade. RI !

2722.
JKMBLERS: i6t and WH.

overdrive. Excellent con-

dition. Make offer. Sell one.
DI 9. -

ftirifnpn PARhAR. . stick.

thence South 8953' East 120.0!

mon research funds from the
Game Commission to the Fish
Commission and direct that they
be used in coastal stream reha-
bilitation work.

The Game Commission con-

trols sports fishing and hunting.
The Fish Commission controls
commercial fisheries.

feet to the place of beginning.
Licensed ' Bonded

CREDIT EQUITY, INC.
338 W. 11th Ave. DI

ELL. hla Wife: HO SB K. fUWtLL, in Lane county, urcgon.
PARCEL 2: Beglnnlns ata widow; GEORGE D. POWELL

' Live poultry wumeo to growera
f.o.b. ranch No. 1 quality fryers,
ita-- lbs., light kens,
heavy nana, 12,

Turkeys Froxen, ready to cook,
to retsllers Hens 1741; toma

Rabbits Averege to growers

Financial Advisors and ROMA rUWKLLi nil wue:
mester K. POWELL and

THE PEOPLE YOU CAN TRUST
with your financial prooiema.

Phnn nr coma In todav

point 120.0 feet South of the
Northwest comer of Lot 38 of
H L. and T. B. Stewart's Plat
of Acreage Lots, as platted
and recorded In Book 3, Page
5, Lane County Oregon Plat
Records) running thence South
64.0 feet; thence East 188.7 feet

Vcrn Aycrs, Oregon Coast
Assn. president, urged passage

tee and said the bill would be

an "invasion of traditional
sources of revenue of the Game
Commission."

1247 WlUamette pi

EXCELLENT CONDITION, good
rubber. 4595. Call DI

154TTCAM BLER FORBOR station
wagon. Original owner. See at
1099 River RoadJDIl-J93- r

1M fifiriflE TOtrRIrTa CAR

R
E
S
U
T
L

S

aome down to 20; colored pelts
cent, less; fresh killed fryers to

CLARA POWELL, hli wife; MAR-

IAN E. ROBLYER and RAY M.

ROBLYER, her husband; MIL-
DRED E. LEPAGNOL and PETER
LEPAGNOL, her husband; J.
FRANK POWELL and PHYLLIS
POWELL, hla wife; the unknown
heirs of D. F. POWELL, Decoased

YOUNG WOMEN of any fatth In of the bill. He said the originalneed of confidential aavic retailers few at as; cut up,
idea in earmarking the aalmon
money for research was thatto the West line of 18th Streetmay contact Catholic C ha lit lei

278 West Broadway, Eugene,
Phnne DI

Wholesale Dressed Meats

Research which could be car-

ried out at the laboratory would
be "of Importance to the whole
Pacific Northwest," Morse Mid
in the statement.

He said the La Grande lab-

oratory had been programmed
for aome time and that four
acrei of land had been set aside
for leasing to the government
for $1 year.

Portland Lawyer
Joins Committee

SALEM Oft Sen. Don. Win-

ner, a lawyer, waa appointed to

Completely restored, drive any thence North S4.0 feet along it would be spilt witn tne risnand SUSAN C. POWELL, de-

ceased, if any there be; FRANK- the west line of iflth street, Legal Beef cuts (cholco steers) Hind
qusrters, 46.0044,00; rounds 44.00- -

wnere. sau. van """';, mi 1MV KM FAFtn
nt COtttfifGlTandVor Family Coun- -

cling: Profeaalonally qualified Commission,Notice is hereby alven thsfChIE BEESON ADAIR end OWEN 44.00: trimmed full loin. 62.0M4.00ithence West 188.7 feet to the
point of beginning. In Lane
County. Oreion.

hardtop. 311 stick. Black, Call
fit stiff; call Catholic Charities of u ADAIR, her husband; also all

Lane County at Diamond other persons or parties unknown
7 , . 1 . i.ils. kHU rtrrht till, tat to pay the expenses of ad m In Is--BJTMERCtJRV Tudor.

forequartars. chucks,
34.40.30.00l ribs, 44.0044.00.

Lembs Choice and prime,
lbs, 38.7542.00; 40.70 lbs., 14.0040.00.

Veel - Choice, lbs. 68.00- -

ior appoints.!. T." " in th. ;i t tratlon of and the claims aiatnai Eugene Marketstransmission tow
i 7. .ii ntstaoa. NEEDED inmeouMiy, i x - 'ZL i. - mn .int hr. said estate br Betty May Trap--I

lTOnDe""SotrSporUman Flreillte
EUOENE EGO PRICES

99 0; good, 46.00 - 44.00; standard,
.

Produce

SKrtrt with other children rn. Defendants, men, Administratrix of the
!i?i flS of KhOTl TO: UNITED STATES NATIONALiabove-entitle- estate, should not
!l!r BANK OF PORTLAND, a nation-- , be made as prayed for in the
t WtiVrPAiR-TrTJ- r !! banklnf association; WINI-- i petition of said Administratrix on

RD ENSI0Nt , widow; HAZEL file herein.

tudor nsrotop. u k1 -- c
RI

CONVERTIBLE, like new.
DI

46 Onions Yellow, 40 lb. sacks On.
Jumbo A
Extra Large AA
Extr Large A 43 med., l.2l.so; ige., Doners,

Willamette. Eufene,th and PMAIR and W. C. PHAIR. her susnt tn an order of the Hon
14 VAUJfHALL Wsgon. Oregon.

13 75; Red,
4.1 Potstoes Ore. Russets, No. A,
41 100 lb.., aome best, 4.O0;
41 bakers,

nfinmv.!? . , : j arr-r- nunana: dli i i nuvn .nu orsoie ww.iu ..7, .una u.
L. rse AA

A
Wfrtlum AA -
Medium A

undersigned, as Savlnga and Loan
Supervisor of the State of Ore-

gon, hae received from Homo
Savlnga and Loan Association, an
Oregon eorporetlon, an applica-
tion for an office to be estab-
lished in the vicinity of Pearl
and llth Streets, Eugene, Oregon.
Persons Interested In protesting
the application may contact the
Supervisor at the Corporation
Commissioner's office, 301 Labor
and Industries Building, Salem,
Oregon, In person or by writing
prior to midnight. AprU 4, 1963.
Dstcd and flrat published Msrch

7, 1963.
Date of second publication March

21, 1963.
Date of last publication AprU 4,

1941.
W. J. P. farrelt
SAVINGS AND LOAN
SUPERVISOR

No. 14(4-A- prU 4, 19SI.

Hester. Excellent 4x10 PORTHAR pins JOHN BOOK, her husband: Court, entered!v?iiicil Only SI. 14. POWELL and VERDIE March 4. 1443.adult or ehlld.
1959 CHEVROLET fTnct studio. 1045 wuisraetta, Smell A A '36POWELL, hla wl(e; ROSE K. WITNESS mr hand end the

POWELL, a widow; GEORGE D.jsesl of said Court this Sth dsy
ditlon. 11,150. PhoneDI4-ll44.- !

j--
, WATCH JaclTPaSi POWELL and roma ruwKM.,.af March, 1441,

ttnt m TV from

the Senate's Constitution Revi-
sion Committee Thursday, Re-

placing Sen. Ted Hallock. Both
are Portland Democrats.

Hallock aald he withdrew
from the committee because he
said he believes he should be
replaced by a lawyer..

The committee, meeting with
similar House committee, is

considering a proposed new
state constitution,

4

OLGA FREEMAN, Clerkhis wife! CHESTER K. POWELL
end CLARA POWELL, his wife;VAI-I.r- RENTAL.dsn, 400d shape, will take some

trsde. RI

istrii ifcu'ar:rv
of the Circuit Court for
the Stste of Oregon lorMARIAN E. KOBLYMl ana si44 West 4th di Ki:

Portland Livestock
PORTLAND ) Cattle

50; no early sales. Cslves 24; te-
heed mostly eholco 474 lb. steer
feeder eelves 14 on bought to ar-

rive bests. Hogs 11; no eerly sales.
Sheep 40; one lot slaughter lambs
yet to sell.

Portland Grain
' PORTLAND n White wheat

121V) nominal soft white no bid.
White club no bid. Hard red winter
no bid. Hard white heart no bid.

WATClCTIOClCJETOLRXT;&jM. ROBLYER, her husbsnd; MIL--

Irw mileage. 41.100. J10 Be4- - Lane county
By MAXINE BIGGS

Deputy
lUS-M- arcb 44, IW.

PAIR IB. oen ior sen, uncw . - -

Stoltes, watchmaker, NORTH-- I LEPAGNOL. her
GATE TIME SHOP. 1404 POWELL and PHYLLIS Oatt no bid. Barley 44.00

Mrd wav.

imuG TD
1434 East Uth POWELL, his wife; the unknown, No.

ket Street, Springfield.


