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LegoliLeo all Leg q Iflegolt SUBSCRIPTION RATES

By Junior Dealer monthly
Rv jitninp riftaler 6 months

men! with Mult Lumber Co., of
"ENGLAND FUNERALHOME

Formerly Veatch's
Phone DI 44255, Pearl St. at 18th

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
NATIONAL FOREST
TIMBER FOR SALE

Gibraltar Leave Strip
Oral auction bida will be reMunicipal Court Records STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE Junction City, Oregon. IN LINN

COUNTY. OREGON: O&C: All In advance 10.00 SCHWEK1NU St LNuliANU
CHAPEL

NOTICE TO
MINING CLAIMANTS

Published pursuant to section
5 of the Act of July 23, IMS (69
Stat. 367).

To whomever It may concern:

INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT: ORAL AUC Bv Junior Dealer yearly Intimber designated for cutting on

SWVt Sec. 35, T. 14 S., R- 2 W.J Creswell, 1st & C Sts. TWfMareh I. 1M2) S3; Merle Linus Towlerton, 290 TION: as hereinafter designated advance - 1900
DRUNK ON STREET Lou! McGAFFEY Swill be received by the district By motor route vearly In

manager, Bureau of Land Man advance - 21.00PROCEEDING NO. FS (Ore
Azalea Dr., Eugene, $15; Merrll Alva
Hoover, Rt. Box 20, Veneta, $5;
Bobby James Hasklns, 3320 Elmlra
Rd., Eugene, $5; Donald James

Steven Ogilvy, no addrcas given,
S50 or 10 davi: Jiv Thurman Alkire.

EUGENE MEMORIAL CHAPEL
Personal and Dignified Service

win. Mer., estimated ior ine
purpose of this sale to be 358 M

b.f. Douglas-fir- , 31 M b.f. West-
ern redcedar, 29 M b.f. Western
hemlock. No bid for less than

agement. 1235 r'ean street, tu gon 011868).
490 East 13th Ul

ceived by the Forest Supervisor,
or his authorized representative
at the office of the Forest Su-

pervisor, Room 215, Post Office
Building, Eugene, Oregon, be-

ginning at 10:00 an. April 23,
1962, for all merchantable timber
marked or designated for cut-

ting on an area embracing 99
acres, more or less, within sec-

tions 17. 18. 20. T. 18S.. R. 3S..

gene, Oregon, at 10:30 a.m., PA-

CIFIC STANDARD TIME, on Notice Is hereby given In purBumgarner. 256 Allen Ave.. Spring-
667 Willamette St., Eugene, 850 or
10 davs.

DRUNK IN AN AUTO John

By mall in Oregon 1 mo. t.75
By mall In Oregon 3 mos.... 4.50
By mail In Oregon 6 mos.... 8.50
By mail tn Oregon 1 year.. 15.00
By mail out of slate 1 mo. 2.00

$21.25 per M b.f. for the Doug- - SIMOliXOUNSBURY Mortuary
"Parking Adjoining Mortuary"field, no fine; Kenneth Harold Cat-- suance of a proper request for

publication heretofore filed ln ac-

cordance with section 5 of the
Thursday, April 19, 1962, for all
timber marked or designated forlett. 1336 Agate St.. Eugene. $5.Gourlv. no addreu given, wo. 1152 Olive DI

, sji.29 per M b.f. for the
Western redcedar, $11.10 per MWRONG WAY ON cutting. Before bids are submit CHAPELb.f. for the Western hemlock, or Act of July 23. 1953 (69 Stat.STREET Thelma Irene Byrne, 2171 Mall subscriptions ln Juniorted, full Information concerning 1100 Charnelton DI

DRUNK IN PUBLIC PLACE
Ira Estea, 3471 High St., Eu-

gene, 8100.
VAGRANCY Charlea Douglaa

a total purchase price of $8,278.15 367), and the regulations there Dealer delivered zones arethe timber, the conditions of sale Off Street Pantingwill be considered. Minimum de under (43 CrR
Madison St., Eugene, $t; Georgette
Elaine Clapshaw, 1290 E. Bailey
St., Eugene, $5; Steven Crocker! charged same rate as that of

W.M., surveyed, ln the Wil-

lamette National Forest, Oregon.!
The estimated volumes are: 5,0001. That on August 21, 1961. the Junior dealer delivery. All localposit with bid $850.00. Access is

provided by roads controlled by Florists Cut F lower. 115
rrORATTXRRGEMENTS

Simmons, 3505 Kincald St., Eugeno,
five rilVL engravings oy wntsnire.M board feet of Douglas-fi- r and:

and submission of bids should be
obtained from the above district
manager. The right is hereby re-

served to waive technical defects;
In this advertisement and to re-

ject any or all bids. The Uulted

Chief, Forest Service, Depart-
ment of Agriculture, whose ad-

dress Is Washington 25, D. C,
MINOR IN POSSESSION Peter the blm and roads covered un-

der Agreement with Tim TOMMY WILLIAMS FLORIST
Grier, 920 E. 16th Ave., Eugene, $19;
George Edmond McCavley, Belling-ham-

Wash., $15.
IMPROPER LANE USAGE Ern-

est Fred Schulke, 11 TumbuU Ln.,
Fi,ffn. 116: Charles Edward Dodd,

700 M board feet of Western!
hemlock and other species. The
minimum acceptable bid per M

DI 2088 E. 15th Ave.filed ln the Land Office of theAlbert Donlon, 1454 tmeraio t.,
Eugene, 50; Richard Allan Stark
uu trmralH St.. Eugene. S50.

CLASSIFIED
ADVERTISINGBureau of Land Management. De 120

ber Products Co. of Oregon. A
road use fee of $0.50M b.f. la
cited among other conditions. IN
LANE COUNTY, OREGON: O&C:

Crematoriumsstates reserves tne rignt to waive
any Informality In bids received

board feet is as follows:
$27.15 and Western hempartment of the Interior, at 710DRIVING WITH SUSPENDED LI-

CENSE Donald Lee Stone, 150 King Gilchrist, $15; Charles McLaden whenever such waiver Is In the lock and other species $5.75. This Eugene Crematorium
1100 Charnelton DlPannaee. Great Falls. Mont.. $15.

N.E. Holladay, roruano iz, ure-
gon, a request for publication of
notice to all mineral locators or

Interest of the United States. includes the following rates, perSt., Eugene, dlmlea; Ervin ru-.n-

9ann Powell St.. Eugene. $25. DRIVING WITHOUT LIGHTS
All timber designated for cut-
ting on NEW. Lot 1 (NWVNWV),
EV6NWM, NEV4SEH, Sec. 19. T,

IN LANE COUNTY. OREGON:
M.liln nharlea Wardrlo. 640 W. M board feet for stumpage in-

cluding deposit for sale area betO&C: All timber designated forVIOLATION OF BASIC RULE
First Ave., Eugene, $5; Robert 16 S., R. 6 W Will. Mer., esti any person claiming under them

Involving a mining claim or
claims located on lands owned

terment: $18.90 base rate plusMiehanl Ordlnff. 1009 Patterson St. cutting on swu, sec. i
and WW NEW, E!4 NWV, Sec.Virgil Wiley Caldwell, izii .

aid: Rernlce Hellen Cox. an additional $7.40 for Douglas-- 1mated for ine purpose of this
sale to be 2,773 M b.f, Douglas- -

Read for Profit ... Use for
Result!

Phone Dl 1

For A Friendly and Helpful
Classified

Minimum number of words 13

on Accommodation Bill or

Monuments 135
EUGENE GffXNlTETCO.

Established 1891

Rock ot ages family monuments
and markers guaranteed. Every
stone made ln Eugene.

3860 W 11th Dl

by the United States In the CounEugene, $5; Richard Seth Burdlck,
m Rn 444. Eueene. 88. 30. T. 20 S.. R. 1 , Will Mer. nr, az.uu base rate pius an ad1227 Morae St., Eugene, 810; Floyd

l.inrinn rrn. Rt. 2 Box 354. Veneta, fir, 143 M n.f. western redcedar,estimated for the purpose of this ties of Linn and Lane, State of
Oregon, described as follows- - to68 M b.f. Western hemlock. NoPROHIBITED U TURN Dale ditional $2.90 for western nem-loc-k

and other species and $0.85sale to be wo m d.c. uougias-nr- .
b...ia lun w. 22nd Ave.. Eu wn:8 M b.f. Western redcedar, 422

10; Albert Cloyd Jagger, 2975

Bailey Hill Rd., Eugene, $10;
Charlea Lee WUaon, 1400 W. 12th

bid for less than $17.30 per M b.
f. for the Douglas-fir- , $9.65 per
M b.f. for the Western redcedar.

gene, $5; Robert Eugene Davis, 09

USE

THE

W
A
N
T

Oregon 011868 (FS theM b.f. Western hemlock. No bid
for leu than S18.65 per M b.f.Lariat ur., r.ugene, ao. cash rates per word

per dayBlue River Area, Wil$9.20 per M b.f. for the Westernfor the Douglas-fir- . 19.60 per M
BLAESlNG GRANlTg CO.

Established 1896
769 Highway 99N DI

lamette National Forest. Linn
Ave., Eugene, am; otepnen n,
Perls, 2058 W. 17th Ave., Eugene,
110; Carl Schmltt, Rt. 1 Box 1170,

T.iiffn. SIO: Dale Martin Nygren,
altLet hemlock, or a total purchase

price of $49,976.45 will be con and Lane counties, Oregon:
9c)
9c
8cNOTlCii lb MINING. The unsurveyea sections listed

b.f. for the Western redcedar,
S7.80 per M b.f. for the Western
hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $21,458.90 will be con-- j
sidered. Minimum deposit with

CLAIMANTS240 E. 30th Ave., Eugene, 125; James Lost & Found 155
U)STTLADY'S ELGIN WRIST

are those which would probably
embrace the lands when the pub-
lic land suvreys are extended to

6c
6c
6c

1 Time ..y.
2 Times
3 Times
4 Times
5 Times
6 Times
7 Times
8 Times
9 Times -

Robert Aiken, 2155 Font St.,
V Ann Marcella Paschke. 2945 Wll-

for slash disposal for all species.
In addition there Is within the
sale area an unestlmated volume
of pine logs to be paid for at
$26.30 per M board feet and an
unestlmated volume of cedar logs
which will be paid for at $3.20
per M board feet which Includes
required deposit for sale area
betterment, plus $0.85 for slash
disposal. The prices bid for!
stumpage shall be considered as
tentative rates subject to quarter-
ly calendar adjustment upward
or downward by 0.5 of the dif-
ference between the average of
the monthly Douglas-fi- r region
indices, as calculated by the
Forest Service for the three

bid S2. 200.00. Access to the salelamette St.. Eugene, 10; Bruce sucn lanas.

sidered. Minimum deposit with
bid $5,000.00. Access is provided
by BLM Road. AU timber desig-
nated for cutting on E44,

NWSWV, SEV4SWV4, Sec.
25, T. 16 S., R. 7 W WiU. Mer.J
estimated for the purpose of this'
sale to be 3,481 M b.f. Douglas-fi- r.

109 M b.f. Western redcedar.

area la provided by BLM roadsrharlei Stanafleld. 320 E. 46th Ave.

WATCH, yellow gold, douoie
strand bracelet. Wednesday at
or near Mc Arthur Court.. RE-

WARD. Call Salem
COLLECT, days.

Willamette Meridian, Oregon
T. 14 S.. R. 5E.: S"A Sec. 23:ana u. s. roresi service roaa,Eneena. 110: Richardson Wll banks,

5V.C
5V.C
5WC

5c
4Wc

1657 E. 13th Ave., Eugene, 810; Julia Purchaser must execute License
Agreement with U. S. Forest 10 TimesSees. 26, 28, 29; Sees. 30 to 38

Incl. T 15 S R. 4 E: Sec. 1; Sees.; COST. Junction City area. 10- -lone Huff, 795 mgnway
Grant Svlvester Jones, Rt. 30 Times ,aervice pertaining to road main 11 to 13 incl: Sees. 22 to 25 incl.:93 M b.f. Western hemlock. No months-ol- black Labrador,

"Nick" Reward. Call RI 0--tenance. No road use fees reS Box 312, Eugene, 610; Don Lee Sec. 36, T. 15 S., R. 5 E; (Unsur- -bid for less than $22.40 per M b. ADVERTISING rates for contract
advertisers and rates for out-of- - 2804.quired. All timber designated for

cutting on SMjNVi, NWWSWVi,Kayser, 539 w. mn Ave.,
at ft. Kirk Alva Blackerbv. 1332 Law

f. for the Douglas-fir- , $11.90 per
M b.f. for the Western redcedar. state advertisers and advertisingveyed) Sees. 1 to 36 incl. T. 16 S.,

R. 2E: NEVi, E Mi NWV..
N'SWVi. NWVi SEVi, Sec.

LOST. Ladles yellow gold watch.lou 3 ana 4 (Sttswyii, bee. so,rence St., Eugene, 815; David Hugh asencles submitted on request.$10.45 per M b.f. for the West prevloua months, and the followT. 17 S. R. 1 W.. Will. Mer.. esti ALL Rates for more than oneern nemiocK, or a total purchase ZS, T. 16 S., K. 3 E: SttStt,
wire mesh hand, downtown Eu-

gene. Reward. RI after
5:30 p.m.

Pierce, 24 Mountain view ur., .

110: Edward Albert Hutchena, ing base indices: uougias-nr- :
day are for consecutive inserNWVi SEVi Sec. 10: SV4SV4, NEVimated for the purpose of this

sale to be 1,122 M b.f. Douglas-fir- ,
34 M b.f. Western redcedar.

Rt. 1 Box 948, Eugene, 110; Roy Lee tions without change or copy.
price of $80,243.35 will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with
bid $6,100.00. Access to the sale

LOST Six weeks oI3 female125.24(F) and Western nemiocK
and other species 89.54(A). Such
adjustments in the price for

SEVi Sec. 11: Sees. 14, 15;
SEViNWV, SVfc Sec. 17;)Anderson, m. z fox vro, cugene,

tin: Turn Ann Alrd. 1622 Escalante
The latest hour for Sunday's
paper la 5:30 p.m. Friday, except66 M b.f. western hemlock, 4 M black Labrador. REWARD. Vi-

cinity 1473 Walnut Street. Dt
after 6 n.m.

SEVi NWVi, SEVi SEVi Sec. 18;
Lots 4. 5. 6. 7. NEViNEVi NEV4-

o.r. urana nr. no ma for lessSt., Eugene, 85; Ronald Paul Stras- - ads of one incn or less taxen
until 10 a.m. Saturday: Mondaythan 122.15 per M b.f. for the

area is provided by BLM roads.
A road maintenance fee ot $847.-1-

la cited.
No. 262 March 28, 1962.

SEVi Sec. 19; Sec. 20; NV& Sec. LOST Black and tan hound,sen, 1454 Emeraia at., cugene, viu;
William Frederick Ringnalda, 2680 uougias-ftr- . sia.va per M n.f. 21: Sees. 22. 23. NV. NVSV&,

stumpage shall be applicable to
timber scaled during the three--;
months period following the
quarter for which the adjustment
is computed. In no event, how-
ever, shall the adjusted stump-
age rates for each quarter be

ads will be accepted between 8

and 9 a.m. for "Too Late To
Classify " The deadline for

Floral Hill Dr., cugene, azD, micnaei for the Western redcedar, $13.00
per M b.f. for the Western hem SE'iSEVi, Sec. 26; NV4 NEVi,

with collar. FEMALE, Elmlra-No-

vicinity. REWARD. WEINVITATION TO BID
The Housing Authority and aE.y4nE.y4, &ec. z: juois i. z. s,Richard Curtis, eie rair uaas ur.

Eueene. S10: John Alex Fltzpatrlck 6, 7 Sec. 30; ENEVi, SWViNEVi, weekly ads is 5:30 p.m. cancel-
lations and corrections acceptedUrban Renewal Agency of Lane LOST Black leather key case.

SVa Sec. 35. T. 16 S.. K. 4 E: less than the base rates as stat
lock, $10.10 per M b.f. for the
Grand fir, or a total purchase
price of $26,218.20 will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with
bid $2,700.00. Access to the sale

between 8 and 9 a.m. for the
1825 Harris St., Eugene, 16; Grant
Jay Coster, 1158 Lawrence St., Eu-

gene, 110; Raymond Paul Knight
Seven keys. Downtown uroao
wav. Mondav. DISVfeNEVi, SEViSWVi, Sec. 13; Lots

8, 7, 8, SWViSEVi Sec. 23; Lots same days paper except Sunday,ed above. Sealed bids will be
publicly opened and posted, at HOST One year old, femaleto 8 incl., NttSVfe. SWViSEViJr., 305 Mowara Ave., cugene, aiu;

Edward George Peck, address un the Post Office Building. Eugene,area la provided by road under

uouniy, Oregon, win receive
sealed bids for the e re-
moval of one (1) residential
structure within the Third Street
Urban Renewal Project area, No.
ORE Springfield, Oregon,
more particularly described as
follows:

when the deadline is 10:00 a.m
Saturday
Death Notices 100

Sec. 24; SW"4SWVi Sec. 25; S!4- - Golden Retriever. Near istn
and University. D IUL.M Jurisdiction. No road use sev sec. 26: aWvisEVi sec. 30:known, $25; Irvine P. Hinds, 1991

Columbia St., Eugene, $10; Allen
Oregon, at 10:00 a.m. on April
23, 1962.

All those who submitted a satis REWARD. Two row boats, lostfee is required. All timber des-
ignated for cutting on NWVi- - SVSSEVi Sec. 32! S'aSIA, NEVi' HANNA Charles A. Hanna ofClarence Taylor. 2905 Ferry St., B.U SEVi Sec. 33; SVSEVi Sec. 34; factory sealed bid will be per during floods on Fall ureeK

near Jasper. DIINlV4. JNWM.. NWttSWtt, Sec. 15.
INEvi Sec. 33, T. IBS., K. 5 E: mitted Immediately to continueParcel No. One (1) wood- -

EOST Sealpoint male Siamese.Sees. 13 to 17 Incl.; Sees. 19 to
gene, dismissed; Edward Klnsella
Montgomery,, 83 Lydlck Way, Eu-

gene, $10.
TRAFFIC LIGHT VIOLATION

auction bidding, A money order,
bank draft, cashier's or certified

T. 23 S., R. 2 W., Will. Mer., es-
timated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2,739 M b.f. Douglas-- j
fir, 6 M b.f. Incense cedar, 7 M
b.f. Grand fir. 125 M b.f. West- -

frame constructed house located
at 334 "F" Street, Springfield,
Oregon.

24 Incl.; Sees. 27 to 32 Incl.;
Partly surveyed Sees. 12. 18. 26:

Vicinity 1572 City View.
pet. REWARD. DI

Route 1, Box 447, Veneta died
March 20, 1962. He was born
July 1, 1892 ln Elkhead, Oregon
and had been a resident of this
area for the past 5 years. He
is survived by his wife.

2 sons: Claude C. of
Seattle and Donald L. of Flor-
ence; 1 daughter, Mrs. Clinton

check ln the sum of $9,000.00
must accompany each bid, to beunsurveyed Sees. 1 to 11 incl.; COST LARGE SIAMESE, male.Charles J II Hon Williams, duo Keny

St., Eugene, $20; Shirley Elving Bids will be accepted until
10:00 a.m. on the 6th dav ofern redcedar, 228 M b.f. Western Dark brown, blue eyes. Collar.

Vicinity Chefs Foods. DI
&ec. za; sees, as to ao inci.
T.17S., R.3E: Lots 5. 6, 7, 8,
SVa Sec. 1; NWVi NEVi Sec. 2;

Kronnke, m. i uox resweu,
115: Walter Granville Berry. Rt. 1

A
D

S

applied to tne purcnase price,
refunded, or retained for ap-

plication to anv claim for dam
nemiOCK. NO bid for lea than

Personal 160
April, 1962 at 300 Falrvlew Drive,
Springfield, Oregon, at which
time all bids will be publicly
opened and read aloud.

ages, according to the conditions Barnett of Seattle; 1 brother,
Box 340, Cottage Grove, $5; Ronald
Frank Taylor, 2494 F St., Spring-
field, $5; Marvin Laverne Gooch,

NEVi, EViNWVi, NVfcSEVi Sec.
12; SWViSWVi, NEVi SEVi Sec.
13; Sees. 23 to 26 Incl.; SViNEVi,

THRIFT & GIFT SHOP consign- -

$15.85 per M b.f. for the
$6.85 per M b.f. for the

Incense cedar, $6.80 per M b.f.
for the Grand fir, $6.55 per M
b.f. for the Western ridriF

W. J. Wltte of Tlgard; also 5of sale. If requested by the pur-
chaser, contract terms will per-
mit felling of timber ln ad grandchildren. Graveside servContract documents, including

Published pursuant to section
5 of the Act of July 23, 1955

(69 Stat. 367).
To whomever It may concern:
PROCEEDING NO. FS 62-- (Ore-
gon ' '011856).

Notice U hereby given In pur-
suance of a proper request for
publication heretofore filed in
accordance with section ft of the
Act of July 23, 1935 (69 Stat.
367), and the regulations there-
under (43 CKR

1. That on August 7. 1961 the
Chief, Forest Service, Depart-
ment of Agriculture, whose ad-

dress la Washington 2d, D. C,
Hied In the Land Office of the
Bureau of uand Management,
Department of the Interior, at
710 N. K. Holladay. Portland 12,

Oregon, a request for publica-
tion of notice to all mineral lo-

cators or any person claiming
under them Involving a mining
claim or claims located on lands
owned by the United States In
the County of Lane, State of
Oregon, described as follows,

Oregon 01 1858 (FS the
Lowell Area, Willam
ette National Forest. Lane Coun-
ty. Oregon:

Willamette Meridian, Oregon
T 18 S R 2 E; bees. I to 38

incl. T. 18 S R. 3 E: Sees. 1 to 36
incl. T, 18 S., R. 4 E; SWV Sec.
6; WW, SEV4 Sec. 6; Sec. 7; W
SEW Sec 8; SV4 Sec. 9; SWVi Sec.
10; WMi Sec. 15; Sees. 16 to 21

Incl.i WV'j Sec. 22; Sees. 27 to 33
Incl. T. 19 S., R. 2 E; Sees. 1 to
36 incl. T. 19 S., R. 3 E: Sees.
1 to 11 Incl.; Sees. IS to 21 .!.;
Sees. 30, 31. T. 19 S R. 4 E:
Sees. 5, 6. T. 20 8., R. 1 E: Sees.
1 to 18 Incl.; NVfe, Sec.
20; Sees. 21 to 26 incl.; Sec 36;
those parts of Sees. 27, 28, 33,
34, 35 within the boundary of
the Willamette National Forest
T. 20 S., R 2 E: Sees. 1 to 36 Incl.
T 20 S., R. 3 E: WV4 Sec. S; Sees.
6, 7; WV4 Sec. B; WMi Sec. 18;
WV4 Sec. 19; WV4 Sec. 30; WW
Sec. 31. T. 21 S., R. 1 E. Those
parts of Sees. 1, 2, 12 within the
boundary of the Willamette Na-

tional Forest T. 21 8., R. 2 E.
Sees. to 6 Incl.; Sees. 8 to 11

Incl.; Sees. 14 to 16.; Incl. Sees. 21

to 23 Incl.; Sec. 27; those parts of
Sees. 7, 17, IB, 20, 28. 2U, 33 with-
in the boundary of the Willam-
ette National Forest. T. 21 S., R.
3 E: WW Sec. 6.

2. That If any person claiming
or asserting under, or by virtue
of, any unpaid. ted mining claim
located prior to July 23, 1955,
any right, title, or Interest in the
vegetative surface reso rces and
other surface resources, under
such mining claim, contrary to
or In conflict with the Umlta
ttons or restrictions specified In
section 4 of aald act as to the

lands or any
part thereof, shall fail to file In
the Land Office of the Bureau
of Land Management at 710 N.E.
Holladay, Portland 12, Oregon,
and within 150 days from the
below-state- date of first pub-
lication of thla Notice, a verified

3698 Franklin jsiva., &ugene, eioi
Fredrlc Alonzo Moon, 1782 Hem-
lock St.. Eugene. $5: Ernest El

ices will be held Friday, March
23, 1962 at 2 p.m. at West Lawn
Memorial Park. Rev. Robert1

$4.45 per M b.f. for the Western

SEVi NWVi, ESWVi Sec. 34; Sec.
35. T. 17 S., R.4E: Sees. 2, 3;
Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, SWViNEVi,

El6SWVi Sec. 4; Lots

vance of payment up to the
value of the performance bond.1
If an oral bid is declared to benemiocK. or a total ourphnsbert Bryant, Portland, $15; Gene

technical specifications, are on
file at the office of the Housing
Authority and Urban Renewal
Agency of Lane County, Oregon,
300 Falrvlew Drive, Springfield,
Oregon.

Powell officiating.
In charge.2,SWy4NEVi Sec. 5; Lot 7, high at the closing of the aucvieve UJga Jones, eio uiioen at.,

Eugene, 85; Don O. Cox, Rt. 1,
$5; Lester Albert Clark,

Ing resumes Monday, March
26th, with spring clothing, gift
Items, china, antiques, furni-
ture, silver, draperies, mtscel- - ,
laneous household items need-
ed. Open Monday through
Thursday, 10 a.m. till 4 p.m.
Consigning Monday, Tuesday,
Wednesday 10 a.m. till 2 pan.
2839 Willamette.

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS""
ALANON FAMILY GROUPS

EV&SWVi, SWViSE'i Sec. 6; Lots HUUSEArthur W 1Tb urn House
2, 3, 4, 9, 10, 11, 12, EVa Sec. of 1551 North 7th Street. Springcertified check nr bank SWViNWVi. WVaSWVi, SEVi- -

tion, the bidder must Immediate-
ly confirm the oral bid by sub-
mitting it ln writing on a For-
est Service bid form. The right
to reject any and all bids Is re-

served. Forest Service bid forms

price of $45,335.20 will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with
bid $4,600.00. Access to the sale
la provided by a Federal Access
Road. A road maintenance fee of
$0.10Mmi. is cited among other
conditions. All timber designatedfor cutting on SEMNWM. NEW-S-

Lot 2 (NWMSWK), Lot 1

swy sec. u; sees, lu, n, vi,
field, passed away on March
19, 1962 at a local hospital. He
was born December 13, 1891 In
Alnsworth, Nebraska, and was

13. 15: Lots 1. 2. 9. WViNEVi

draft payable to the Housing!
Authority and Urban Renewal!
Agency of Lane County, Oregon,)
or a satisfactory bid bond exe-
cuted by the bidder and accept-
able surety In an amount equal

Sec. 18; Lots 4, 9, 10, 11 Sec.
31. T.17S., R.5E: (Unsurveyed)
Sees. 1 to 36 Incl. T. 17 S.. R. 6 E:

INFORMATION and HELP withretired from the city mainte

683 Norkenzle Rd., Eugene, $5; Don-
ald Duane Denny, 5375 Fox Hollow
Rd., Eugene, $5; Phlllls Ann Thomas,
3285 Willamette St., Eugene, $5;
Ethel Josephine McNeil, 900 Hwy.
99E, Junction City, $15; Leroy A.
Mitchell, 3822 S. F St., Springfield,

3; John Claude Mullen, Big Fall
Creek Rd., Fall Creek, $5; Gilbert
James Carter Jr., Rt. 2 Box 436 F,
Creswell, $5; Phillip Clinton Reevea,
Medford, $5; Naomi Allda Nelson,

nance crew. He was united in
marriage to Eva Klrkpatrick on(unsurveyed) sees. 7, u, v; sees. family drinking problems day

or night.
TELEPHONE Dl

sti to i yf, oec. iv, I . Tt 5.,R. 3 W., Will. Mer., estimated for
the Durnose of thl tn k.

to ten per cent (10) of the esti

for use ln submitting sealed bids
and full information concerning
the Umber, the conditions of sale
and the submission of bids
should be obtained from the Dis-

trict Ranger, Lowell, Oregon, or
the Forest Supervisor, Eugene,

la to zz inci.; sees, 27 to 34 inci.mated value for the e re rebruary zs, mzu in Ainswortn,T. 18 S., R. 4 E: Sees. 1 to 4 incl.;2,460 M b.f. Doufflas-flr- . a M h r BRING good used clothing, fur- -and had been a resident of this
community and of the state for

moval, shall be submitted with
each Bond. NV4, SEVi Sec. 5; NEVi Sec. 6;western reuceaar, 34 M b.f. In- - NEVi Sec. 8; NVfc Sec. 9; NV&.IFOR The successful bidder will be uregon before bids are subceaar, o m b.f. Western

hemlock. 44 M b.f. r.mnri fir
tne past zi years. He was a
veteran of World War I; a
member of the American Le

664 Pheasant Blvd., Eugene, $15; required to furnish and pay for
satisfactory manufacturers and mitted.

No. 263 March 21, 1962.
No bid for less than $22.05 per

SEVi Sec. 10; Sees. 11, 12, 13,
14; EMi Sec. 15; EV Sec. 22;
Sees. 23, 24. T. 18 S., R. 5 E:: (Un-
surveyed) Sees. 1 to 29 incl.;
Sees. 33 to 36 Incl. T. 18 S., R. 6 E:

contractors public liability insur
Merle Maynard Keeney, mgnway 30,
Cheshire, $16: Patrick C. Wright,
Blue River, $15; Robert Gale Boyd
4750 Franklin Blvd.. Eugene. 115

w.i. iur Lua uougias-iir- , S13.05
per M b.f. for the Went CALL FOR SEALED BIDSance with limits of not less than

gion, and the Independent Or-

der of Foresters. He la sur-
vived by his wife, Eva; one son,
Gary D., ln U.S. Army In Fort

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN50100.000.cedar, $13.00 per M b.f. for the!
that sea,ed bids for site prepareThe Housing Authority andPhillip Nelsen Gillette. 350 S. 43rd (Unsurveyed) Sees. 2 to 11 Incl.;

Sees. 13 to 36 Incl. T. 19 S., R. 5 E:
Sees. 1, 2. 11. 12. 13. 14. 23. 24,

incense ceaar, 10.95 per M b.f.
for the Western hemlock, to on Ord, California: two daughters:St., Springfield, 65: Cecilia Marie

Denny. Rt. 3 Box 303. Eugene. $5:
tion, brush clearing,
granular fill and compaction for
the Edgewood Elementary School

Urban Renewal Agency of Lane!

County, Oregon reserves the
right to reject any and all bids

Her m u.i. ior me tirand fir, or
a total purchase Hr nt .

T. 19 S., R. 5V& E: (Unsurveyed)Andrew McDuffle Vincent Jr., Port Sees. 1 to 5 inch; Sees. 8 to 17236.00 will be considered. Mini located at 577 East 46tn Street,land, no fine: Charles Lee Brown,
Eugene, Oregon, according to210 Main St., Sprlmfleld, $15; David

or waive any informalities in the
bidding. Bids may be held by!
the Housing Authority and Urban.

Esther Lake of Seattle, Wash-
ington, and Bessie Odell of
Springfield; six grandchildren;
his Llllle House
of Washington D.C; a step-
brother, John House of Wash-
ington D.C; numerous nieces
and nephews. Funeral services

mum aeposit with bid $5,600.00.Access to the ar ..,.11..
Incl.; Sees. 20 to 29 incl; Sees,
32 to 36 Incl. T, 19 S., R. 6 E:
(Unsurveyed) Sees. 7 to 9 Incl.; plans and specifications which

niture, household goods to Eu-

gene Mission Store at 484 Wil-

lamette. ' Newspapers, maga-
zines to warehouse at West

NOW I I An Enlarged & Modern
Prescription Department to
Serve You Better and Faster.
Open Dally From 9 a.m. to
p.m. PARAMOUNT DRUGS,
2100 Main.

ANY GIRL IN DIFFICULtYOnV
In need of counseling should
contact The Salvation Army
or White Shield Home, 1261
N. W. Mayflower Avenue, Port-lan-

Telephone CApltol
FOR Information and facilities in

problems of mental retarda-
tion of' children and adults,
call the Association for the
Help of Retarded Children, DI

210 West 14th, Eugene.
TfiFifty Denture

SERVICE LABORATORIES

Arnold Kucera, 2535 Van Buren St,
Eugene. IS. bis by .or..m.ni. may De secured oy qualified OldKenewai Agency of Lane coun-

ty, Oregon or a period not to Sees. 16 to 21 Incl.; Sees. 28 toSTOP SIGN VIOLATION Ken- - iwih wun
Company. A rnnrf ii A

aa inci.exceed tnirty (301 davs from tne
ders from Balzhlser, Seder &
Rhodes, Architects, 725 Country;Club Road, Eugene, Oregon, will
be received by the Clerk of

nam McHlgnt Norneaa, 1421 Cham-
bers St., Eugene, IS; Fay William 2. That If any Person claiming win De neia on Thursday,4o.w ciiea. ah timber des-- l opening date of bids for the

purpose of reviewing bids and
Investigating the qualifications

m ii aica i or ciunnir An mr i . March 22. 1962 at 2um ln Buellwnson, 140U niaclay Dr., Eugene, $10;
Frederick Braatz. 300 Frederick Ct.. school District No. 4. Lane Coun Chapel. Rev. Ross Knotts offi

or asserting unaer, or oy virtue
of, any unpatented mining claim
located prior to July 23, 1955,
any right, title, or interest In the

ty, Oregon, at the office of saidof bidders prior to the awarding! ciating with interment In Lane20 S., R. 4 W., Will. Mer.. Wlmated for the mimr, nf ki.
Eugene, $5; David James Bodle, 2385
Friendly St., Eugene, $5; Frank Lee uierk until the hour of 10:00 a.m,01 contracts. Memorial Gardens.

McCULLOCH John Wesley Mcon the 6th day of April, 1962.vegetative surface resources and' " i,OiB M D.f. DOUglas- - LELAND R. ANDERSON
Acting Executive Director
March 2. 1962

Culloch of Route 5, Eugeneother surface resources, under
such mining claim, contrary to

nans win do avauaDie to quali-
fied bidders on March 27. 1962.

incense ceaar, 3
M b.f. Western hemlock, 39 M
b.f. White fir. No hiri tn. i...

died March 21, 1962. FuneralBids are to be unconditionalNo. 228 March 21, 1962 arrangements entrusted to sior in conflict wun tne limita-
tions or restrictions specified ln
section 4 of said act, as to the

than $23.65 per M b.f. for Doug- - and a bid bond equal to five percent (5) of the bid must ac
INVITATION FOR BIDS

Notice Is hereby given that Repairs & rellnes, prices you canstatement which shall set forth
as to such mining claims: SMlTRRuby Jean Smith of ldlo.o.-,,- fii.du per m D.r. for theIncense cedar, nasn m ur lands or any company each bid which deposit

shall not draw Interest and will(1) The date of location;
(2) The book and page of

Washington Street died March
20, 1962. She was born Nopart thereof, shall fall to file in

sealed bids will be received by
Olga Freeman, Lane County
Clerk, at the Court House, Eu be forfeited to the said School vember 3, 1926 In Pleasant Hillthe Land Office of the Bureau of

Land Management at 710 N.E.

for the Western hemlock, $11.45
per M b.f. for the White fir. or
a total purchase price of

will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $3,800.00.

District as liquidated damages
should the successful bidder Oregon. She was employed as agene, Oregon until 10:00 a.m.

March 30. 1962 for 33,000 Repub Holladay, Portland 12, Oregon,

uiark. Jit. 3 Box 269, Eugene, glo;
Jean Lavelle Nasura, 720 Maxwell
Rd., Eugene, $16; Richard James
Werner Jr., 2260 Arthur St., Eugene.
$5; Jackie Lorraine Mather, 4435
Fox Hollow Rd., Eugene, $20; Dean
Willmore Ramsey, 70S Highway BON,

' Eugene, $5; John Forrest Uggen, 225
Santa Clara Ave., Eugene, $5; David
Richard Moore, 10OO Alder St., Eu-

gene, $15; Walter Emll Cox, 110 A-
lberta St., Eugene, $15; Donald Wil-
liam Holley, 205 E. Sixth Ave., Eu-

gene, $5; John Alex Fltzpatrlck, 1825
Harrla St., Eugene, $5; Julie Anne
Hampton, Portland, $15; Theodore
McClelland Natt, 1000 Alder St., Eu-

gene, $5; John Mark Vlcenze, Box
102, Veneta, $5.

FAILURE TO YIELD RIGHT OF
WAY Clarence Norman Andreessen.

recordation of the notice or cer-
tificate of location;

(3) The section or sections of
the public land surveys which
embrace su h mining claim; or if

teller at the First National Bankwithdraw his bid or fail or negana witnin iau aays from tne be She was a member of the Firstlican Ballots, 40,000 Democratic
Ballots, 74,000 Judiciary Ballots lect to complete his contract Into ine sale art- - nrn. Christian Church of Eugene.accordance with the termsvlded by nubile mad. All tlmhr

date of first publica-
tion of this Notice, a verified!
statement which shall set forth;

and 74.000 Measures Ballots, all Survived by her mother, Marythereof.designated for cutting on Lot 2 tn accordance with specifications as to such mining claims:itwvtnr.Vi), swWNEVi. Lota 3 now on file In said Clerks Of

atioro:
122 N. 5th. Springfield RI
YOUNG WOMAff of any falthTh

need of confidential advice
may contact Catholic Charities,
278 West Broadway, Eugene
Phone Dl

MARRIAGE andor Family
Professionally qualified

staff; call Catholic Charities of
Lane County at Diamond
for appointment.

D"ENTAL PLATETT2PAlrl Dr.
Harry Semler, dentist, corner
8th and Willamette, Eugene,
Oregon.

Ladles' Wool Coats 96c
Sullivan's Victone Cleaners

315 13th Ave. E. DI
Schools-Colleg- 1 75

If 4 (NUNWUI. SUNWU. mwu. (II The date of location:fice. The bids will be opened!

Belle Smith of Eugene; a sis-

ter, Marjorie Belle Smith of
Albuquerque, New Mexico;
many Aunts, Uncles and Cous-
ins survive. Funeral arrange

The School Board of said Dis-

trict reserves the right to reject!
any and all bids, and also to1

waive any and all Informalities
in the bids. Dated thla 21st day

publicly at 10:00 ajn. March 30,SEVi, Sec. 3, T. 18 S., R. 7 W.,Will. Mer., estimated for the
(2) The book and name of

recordation of the notice1962 in the County Commission
ers' Room, Court House. Eugene, or certificate of location: ments, entrusted topurpose or this sale to be 2,031

M b.f. Douglas-fir- . 17 M b.f. West- - Oregon. The County reserves the (3) The lection or sections of
ern redcedar, 51 M b.f. Western the public land surveys which TALLER DAY Fredrick "Tec!right to accept bids with minor!

deviations from specifications or!
Pendleton, $25 (accident Involved);
Walter Aubrey Welch, 115 W. 30th
Ave.. Eugene. $25 (accident In

nemiocK. jno bid for 1m than embrace such mining claim; or

of Marcn, iwz.
MILLARD Z. POND.
Clerk, School District No. 4,
Lane County, Oregon.

No. 264 M a reh 28. 196 2.

NOTICE OF FINAL ACCOUNT

$25.10 per M b.f. for the Douglas- - to reject any or all bids. No bid' if such lands are unsurveyed
Tallerday of 420 North 19th
Street, Springfield, passed away
on March 19. 1962 at his home.

sucb lands are unsurveyea either
the section or sections which
would probably embrace such
mining claim when the . ibltc
land surveys are extended to
such lands or a tie by courses
and dlstancea to an approved
United States mineral monument;

(4) Whether such claimant la a
locator or purchaser under such
location; and

(5) The name and address of
such claimant and names and ad-

dresses so tar as known to the
claimant of any other person or
persons claiming any intereat or
Interests In or under such un-

patented mining claim; such fail-
ure shall be conclusively deemed
(1) to constitute a waiver and
relinquishment by such mining
claimant of any right, title, or

volved): Roy George Arnold, 6784 either the section or sections
which would probably embraceMcKenzle Highway. Springfield. 19. nr, n.j3 per M o.f. for the

Western redcedar, $13.10 per M
b.f. for the Western hemlock, or

He was born August 7, 1903 ln
der may withdraw his bid after
the hour set for the opening
thereof, or before award of the
contract, unless said award is

FAILURE TO YIELD RIGHT OF sucn mining claim when the pub nnoxvuie, lowa. He wasNOTICE Is hereby given that
the undersigned has filed her
Final Account with the Court

a loiai purcnase orlce of 151 SUPERWAY TO PEDESTRIAN John How-
ard Blair, 2750 Portland St., Eu-

gene. $25 (accident Involved).
plasterer for a construction!
company. He was united inio wiu oe considered. Mini. delayed for a period exceeding

lic land surveys are extended to
such lands or a tie by courses!
and distances to an approved!mum deposit with bid S5.200.0fl. in the Alexander Workman, De3i days, ah envelopes should be MARKET TRAININGmarriage to Alice Burke onFOLLOWING TOO CIXISE Robert Access to the sale area Is provld- - plainly marked "BIDS" on the united states mineral monument:Lee Wehbcr, 2025 W. 17th Ave., Eu ceased estate and that Wednes-

day the 29th day of March, 1962,
Short day or evening courses, lowJuly 19, 1922 in St. Paul, Min-

nesota, and had been a resiea dv HWAMiu witn interna. outside, bach bid must be acconvgene, $5; John Louis McCain, 361 (4) Whether such claimant Is
a locator or purchaser under at 10:00 o'clock A.M., of saidpanted by a certified check oruonai I'aper Co. Among condi dent of this community for the

past seven years, and of the
N. Ninth St., Springfield, $25 (ac-
cident Involved). tions cuea are a roaa use nav- such location: andDid bond for 10 of the bid

price, to be forfeited if the bidment of $545.74. All timber des
day, In the Circuit Court of
the State of Oregon for Lane
County, has been set as the

(5) The name and address ofIMPROPER PASSING Flov Ellen
Wells. 1201 Maxwell Rd., Eugene, dis

luuion, steady worn 1,000's of
our graduates working. No high
school diploma required. Call
or visit M. T. I. Schools, 72A

Southeast Grand, Portland. BE

Private Instruction T66

is accepted and contract not Per
state for 20 years. He is sur-
vived by his wife. Alice; two
sons: Tom and Joseph both oftime and place for hearing obmissed on motion of police formed. BOARD OF COUNTY

COMMISSIONERS, By Jess Hill, jections to said Final Account

ignated for cutting on E'i,
SKMSWiA, Sec, 15, T. 19

S., R. 6 W Will. Mer., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
2.860 M b.f. Douglas-fir- , 42 M

such claimant and names and
addresses so far as known to the
claimant of any other person or
persons claiming any interest or
interests in or under such un

springfieid; two daughters:and for settlement of saidFAILURE TO LEAVE NAME AND Joan Zumbuhl of Seaside, andrranK r.111011 ana nennetn Niel-
sen, County Commissioners. CESSSES IN tEATHERCEAFT:ADDRESS AT SCENE OF ACCIDENT

Rudolph Louis Folk, 138 W. 17th ROMA HANSEN WORKMAN,n.t. western redcedar. 196 M b.f. patented mining claim: such failINO. 231 March 23. 1962
Mary Ruth of Alderwood,
Washington; 13 grandchildren;
one brother, BUI of Des Moines,NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Pursuant to ORS 477.045. notice
Ave-- hugene,

IMPROPER LEFT TURN Martha

The Hobby Corner. 18 West
17th. OI evenings DI 1--
9909.

Eugene DftlVER TRAtNtrJfl

Western hemlock. No hid for
less than $16.70 per M b.f. for
the Douglas-fir- , $9.30 per M b.f.

ure shall be conclusively deemed
(1) to constitute a waiver and
relinquishment by such miningLee Mills, 795 E. 15th Ave., Eugene, is hereby given that a public

hearing will be held at the of

towa; numerous nieces and
nephews. Funeral services will
be held on Thursday, March
22, 1962 at 10am In Buell Chan

claimant of any right, title, or DI
Licensed Bonded Teacher

P
R

O
F
I

T

and

R

E
S

U
L

T

S

interest under such mining claim
contrary to or In conflict with
the limitations or restrictions

Executrix of the Estate
of Alexander Workman,
Deceased

JOHNSON. JOHNSON &
HARRANG
641 East Broadway,
Eugene, Oregon
Attorneys for Estate

No. 205 Mar. 281962
NOTICE OF HEARING OF

FINAL ACCOUNT

el. Father Louis Sohler offi

tor tne western redcedar, 8.05
per M b.f. for the Western hem-
lock, or a total purchase price of
$55,450.40 will be considered. Min-
imum deposit with bid $5,600.00.
Access to the sale area Is nro- -

Real Estateciating with interment in Mt,
Vernon Cemetery.specified in section 4 of the Act

of July 23, 1955 (69 Stat. 367), "203Homes for SaleV AG ONeTCG eorg e Ira Wagoner

RESIDENTIAL
HONE

AriNANCING
as to unpatented claims locatedvlded bv road covered under

Agreement
ot 453 south 43rd Place. Snrlne-

fices of the Eastern Lane Forest
Protective Association, Spring-
field. Oregon, on Wednesday,
March 28, 1962, at 2:00 p.m., for
the purpose of providing alt
owners of Isnda an opportunityto be heard on matters pertain-
ing to the budgeting of moneys1
required to defray the cost of
fire protection and suppression
within the boundaries of the
Eastern Lane Forest Protective

WEST5T0Eafter that date, and (11) to con
Spacious 2 bedroom, hardwoodNOTICF. ic urnyov r.i;rv

fleld, passed away on March
20, 1962 at his home. Funeral
services will be held at the

stitute a consent by such mining
claimant that such unpatented that the undersigned adminis

Hill Mortuary ln Alva. Okla
floors, close to Whitaker
School. Will trade for 3 bed-
room in Adams School area.
NEAR UNIVERSITY

tratrix of the Estate of George
C. Vaughn, deceased, has filed

witn international Paper Co. A
toal road use fee of $371.76 Is
cited among ot her conditions.
All timber designated for

on SWV4NW14,

S. Sec. 23, T. 18 S., R. 8 W.,
Wll). Mer., estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 807 M

homa. Buell Chapel In charge
mining claim shall be subject to;
said limitations and restrictions,)
and (ill)) to preclude thereafter,!
prior to Issuance of patent, any

her final account of the admin
Association District and for

ot loca ia rrangements.
Funeral Notices 165 3 bedroom, separate dining room.assertion by such mining claim

istration of said estate tn the
Circuit Court of the State of
Oregon, for Lane County, and

If you are building or
buyip-- a home see us
for money.

Conventional or F.H.A
Home financing to suit
vour needs.

ant of any right or title to or) ELLIOTT MagBie Ancle Elliott
privately owned lands in East-
ern Lane County within the
boundaries, of the Umpqua and interest in or under such mining of 680 East 40th Avenue. Fu

claim contrary to or In conflict!
with said limitations or restric

Willamette National Forests. A
copy of the tentative budget for

b.f. Douglas-fir- , 9 M b.f. West-
ern redcedar, 239 M b.f. Western
hemlock. No bid for less than
$21.15 per M b.f. for the Douglas-

-fir, $9.70 per M b.f. for the

neral services will be held on
Thursday, March 22. 1962 at 2

p.m. in the England Funeral
Home, Pearl at 18th. Dr. Vance

the fire district may be inspected tions. Section 4 provides, gen-
erally, that unpatented miningat the Eastern Lane Forest Pro

aiso oreaKiast area, inside
utility plus storage. The yard
Is beautifully landscaped &
covered patio for summer liv-

ing. The price la only $11,000,
pay owners equity tt assume
loan. Consider pickup or boat
& trailer as part down pay-
ment. Eve Astrld Lindsay, DI

Pruden Realty
1200 High DI tints

western redcedar. s60 per M claims located after July 23,tective Association Office, Spring H. Webster officiating with in
b.f. for the Western hemlock, or ivm snail not be used for pur terment In the Mulkey Cemefield, uregon.

OREGON STATE DEPARTMENTa total purchase price of $19, tery.
OF FORESTRY, K ERNS Mattte Agnes Kerns ofD. L. PH1PPS, State Forester 735 East 36th Place, Eugene.

Funeral services will be held

210.75 will be considered.
deposit with bid $2,000.00.

Access to the sale area Is pro-
vided by a road covered by
RiBhtof-Wa- Agreements

NO. 244 March 21. 1962.

poses other than prospecting,!
mining, or processing operations,)
or uses reasonably incident!
thereto; that such claims will be
subject to the right of the Untt-- I
ed States to manage and dispose!
of the vegetative surface re

NOTICE TO R EC, .STORED Thursday, March 22. 1962

that the 16th day of April, 1962,
at the hour of ten (10:00) o'clock)
In the forenoon of said day, in
the Circuit Court Room of the
Lane County Courthouse, at Eu-

gene Lane County, Oregon, has
been fixed by the Circuit Court
of Lane County, as the time and
place of hearing objections to
said final account.

VIOLA C. VAUGHN,
Administratrix of the
Estate of George C. Vaughn,
Deceased.

THOMPSON, MUMFORD &

WOODRICH,
Attorneys at Law,
874 Willamette,
Eugene, Oregon.
No. 221 April 4, 1962.

N OT I C E 15 HE R E &YG IVEN
that the undersigned, MARY ANN
MAYES. Administratrix of the
Estate of William J. Maye, also

CLOSE IN"HOLDERS OF DEBENTURE 2:30 p.m. in the Church of

Interest under such mining claim
contrary to or in conflict with
the limitations or restrictions-specifie-

In section 4 of the Act
of July 23, IU55 (69 Stat 367),
as to unpatented claims located
after that date, and (ID to con-
stitute a consent by such mining
claimant that such unpatented
mining claim ahall be subject to
said limitations and restrictions,
and (ill) to preclude thereafter,
prior to Issuance of patent, any
asertlon by such mining claimant

of any right or title to or in-
terest tn or undo- such mining
claim contra r to or in conflict
with said limitations or restric-
tions. Section 4 provides, general-
ly, that unpatented miring claims
located after July 23, 1955 shall
not be used for purposes other
than prospecting, mining, or
processing operations, or uses
reasonably Incident thereto; that
such claims will be subject to the
right of the United States to
manage and dispose of the vege-
tative surface resources thereof
and to manage other surface re-
sources thereof; and that, except
to the extent required for mining
operations and uses reasonably
incident the. to or to provide
clearance for such operations or
uses, claimants of such claims
shall not use or dispose of vege-
tative or other surface resources
thereof; and that, except for
clearance for such purposes, any
permitted severance or removal
of timber must be In accordance
with sound principles of forest
management Said section 4 also
provides that uy use of the sur-
face of any such mining claim
by the United States, tta permit-
tees or licensees, shall be such
as not to endanger or materially
Interfere with the prospecting,
mining, processing or reasonably
incident uses by the mining
claimant

The date of first publication
of this Notice shall be Mterch 7,
1961.

Dated: February 13, I Mr
STANLEY D. LbSTER
Chier, Minerals Section
Bureau of Land Manage-
ment Department of the
Interior, Portland, Oregon

First publication- larrh T 1962
119 Ust date of publication

M ay 1, 1962.

Register-Guar- d

CLASSIFIED
ADVERTISING

Phono 01 1

and with International Pa BONDS DATED OCTOBER 1 Christ, 10th and Washingtonper Co. A road use fee of $422.00 sources thereof and to manasc1957 OF SNKl.I.STROM LUMBER

V Commerce 4
6 Investment

fr lost Charnelton 3PI Dl M387 Jj

COMPANY
streets. Rosse Long officiating
Interment West Lawn.

In charge.
other surface resources thereof;
and that, except to the extent

Is cited among other conditions,
All timber designated for

on Lot 3 (SWNWi-4)- Ely
NWU, Sec. 19. T. 15 S.. R. 8 W.,

Notice Is hereby given that
Snellstrom Lumber Co., pursuant required ror mmine operations 110and uses reasonably Incident Funeral Directors

Mills mortUa
to terms of debenture bonds
dated October 1. 1957, exercises)

BUT

EXCLUSIVE
Rambling ranch type home on

acre just 5 minutes from cltv
center. 2.000 square feet ot
gracious living. Out of town
owner says sell at less thsn
replacement cost. Good terms
and will consider some trade.
If you are ready to move upto better living call

L4R ENTERPRISES

Wilt. Mer., estimated for (he
purpose of this sale to be 153 M

inereto or to provide clearance
for such operations or uses.Its right to purcnase an said Cottage Grove WH

Drain. TEmnleclaimants of such claims shallbonds and hereby fixes Aprilb.f. Douglas-fir- . No bid for less
than $25.70 per M b.f. for the 1962 as the oate for purchase mJRPrlYTTlSERAL HOMEnot use or dispose of vegetative

or other surface resources therethereof, for cash in the prtnetDougias-rtr- , or a total purchase Junction City Harrlsbure
of; and that, except for clearprice of W ,9.12.10 will be con sometimes known as W. J. Mayes, Phone Junction Cltv WYpal amount thereof, together!

with Interest through March,sidered. Minimum deposit with
1962. deceased, nas filed ner final Ac- - BUELL CHAPEL

count as such Administratrix ln Parking Adjacent Chapel
bid $400.00. Access is provided by 1758 West Uth DI M179SNELLSTROM LUMBER CO.supplement 3 to tne Ltrcult court of tne Mate of Springfield. 8th & B RI239 March 31. 1962

ance for sucn purposes, any per-
mitted severance or removal of
timber must be In accordance
with sound principles of forest
management. Said section 4 also
provides that any use of the
surface of any such mining claim

Agreement with Hull Lum uregon ior ijne Loumy. ana SMITH FUNERALCHAPELnoticeishereby;.venber Co. which requires a road saia naaiura tna .rem aay n5 N slxth WH w511use fee of 10.75 M and a mainte

8 YEARS STOTOO-O-

1 BEDROOMS, GAMEB1RD
VILLAGE

Large lot. Call Luclla Johnson
DI Gordon Brunton
Realtv.

HI 874 Pearl St.

that the undersigned has beeenl
appointed Administratrix with:
the Will Annexed of the estate by the United States, Its per

nance fee of $0.15M. All timber
designated for cutting on

SEUSWW, Sec. 33, S- - n.uin. ..h , hi SUnsetof Cora A. Mason, deceased, by
Oakrldge, Oregonthe Circuit Court of the State ofSWV-4- Sec. 36. T. 15 Se It. W House of Lane County, In Eu-- jfJlMlWTliTt-- i Lot 1 iNWtNWtl Sec. 1. T. 16 Oregon for Lane County. All

persons having claims againstS., R. 8 W., Lot 28 (SW4SWV,
Sec. 31. T. 15 S.. R. 7 W.. Will.zmi said estate are hereeby notified
Mer., estimated for the purpose to present the same to the un

dersigned at 877 Willametteof this sale to be 241 M b.f

gene, Oregon, as the date, time
and place for the hearing of said
Final Account and of objections
thereto, and for the final settle-
ment of said estate.

MARYANN MAYES,
Administratrix.
Bailey, Hoffman. Spencer &

Morris. Attorneys.
No. 4985 March 21. 1962.

mittees or licensees, shall be such
as not to endanger or materially
interfere lth the prospecting,
mining, processing or reasonably
incident uses by the mining
claimant.

The date of first publication of
this Notice hall be Mar. 14, 1962.

Dated: Feb. 23. 1962.
STANLEY D. LESTER
Chief. Mineral Section
Bureau of Land
Management. Department
of the Interior
Portland, Oregon.

First publication March 11 1961

Douglas-ftr- 59 M b.f. Western
hemlock. No hid for less than

Street. Eugene, Oregon, duly ver-
ified and with proper vouchers,

$22 80 per M h.f. for the Doug within six months from the date
of the first publication of this

S4.500
3 BEDROOM near Irving. Garden

space and well. Eves call Fran-
cis Shrode. DI

THOMPSON REALTY
2587 Willamette Dl
FOUR BEDR05M HOWE Tn

Brownsville. Newly remodeled.
Corner lot. Sweet home,

Homes from $15,800
ARTHUR M. GILBERT SONS
RI BuUders RI

Register-Guar- d

CLASSIFIED
ADVERTISING

Phone DI

. $9 40 per M b.f. for the
Western hemlock, or a total pur-
chase price of $6.049 40 will be
considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $650.00. Access to (he

3
notice, said date of first publica-
tion being Februarv 21, 1962.

RUTH A. CLARK.
Administratrix c.t.a.

r Bailey, Hoffman, Spencer &sate area Is provided by BUM

Whatever You Need
From real estate to a harrow or,

rake you'll find It fart In the1

Classified Section!
243 La.t dale of publicationroads and roads covered by arm i Morris, Attorneys.

NV 4986 March 21, 1962.t rat Ion and negotiation agree- - way ivm.


