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Sealed b(ds will be received
by the County Clerk for Lane
County, State of Oregon, until
It o'clock a.m., August 3, 1954,
when Ihey will be opened in
the County Commislsoners Room,
Court House, Eugene, Oregon,
for Ihe following projects:

Improvement of Talum Lane,
Dalton Drive, Maclay Drive, and
Laurclhurst Drive.

No bid will be received or con-
sidered by the County unless it
Includes a statement that bid-

der, If awarded the contract, will
pay not less than the prevailing
rato of wages as of the date of
his bid to each and every one
who may be employed in the
performance of the work.

Bids shall he accompanied by
certified check or bid bond to
the amount of 10 per cent of
the amount of the bid.

No bidder may withdraw his
bid after the hour set for the
opening thereof or before award
of the contract unless said award
Is delayed for a period exceed-
ing 30 days.

Tho Counly Commissioners re-
serve the right to reject any or
all bids and to overrule any
slight irregularity which doc's
not affect the amount of the
bid.

Plans and specifications may
he secured at the office of ihe
County Clerk or County En-

gineer.
BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS
By Robert D. Maclay,
Kencth Nielsen, and
Ralph Petersen,
Co. Commissioners.

No. 935 July 27, 1954.
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Live chickens No. 1 quality, f.o.b,
nianis-Frv- nrs and roasters. 25; at

j:',).J imp.
The referendum, according to

H. H. Myers, Chairman of the
Lane County Agricultural Stabil-

ization and Conservation Com-

mittee, will determine whether
or not the quota program now in

effect will continue for next

year's crop.
s of those who vote

must approve quotas before they
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41"
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Furniture & Refrigerator

DOLLY
EQUIPMENT RENTAL CO.

Eugene's most complete line of
Rental Equipment for the Home

Phone 19011 w 6th
Back of Bev's Barbecue

vlvcd hv ? llS.MacklO'i 19
25':

hens, 14; old roasters, 'Armour
Turkevs To producers, for breeder Asoc DG

types, heavy hens, 30 f.o.b. farm, New Atchison
York dressed basis. Avco

Rabbits Average to growers, live Baldwin
white, SMMVa lbs, lbs, Bal Ohio
Old does, few higher. Fresh Bendix Av
dressed fryers to retailers, cut Beth Stl
up, Boeing

Wholesale Dressed Meats Borg War

Zllka, Smlther & Co., Eugene.
Bid Asked

Bank of Amer 36W STM

Bank of Calif 62'i 66

Cascade Ply - 23"4 25'4
Consol Ftwys 15'. 1714

Copco, Com 29'4 31

Copco, 4.7 Pfd 96
First Nat'l 54li 5744

Jantzcn, Com 22V4 24

Jantzen, Pfd 95V4

Bid Asked
l 16' 1814

PP&L, Com 2314 2444

Pope 4 Talbot 11 12V4

Port Gas, Coke 22 2344

Port Gen Elec 2014 2114

Seattle 1st Nat'l 89'j 94

U.S. Nat'l Bank 76
West Cst Tel 18'4 20V.

Weyerhaeuser 811, 93V4

MUTUAL FUNDS
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lor Sherman
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39. Pan Am AirBeef cuts, choice steers, nine, quar- -
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can be put into operation, ine
current program, which was vot-

ed on a year ago, was approved
by 87 per cent of the voters.

ELIGIBLE TO VOTE

Chairman Myers urges every
eligible wheat grower in Lane
County to vote. A producer is

eligible to vote if he will have
more than 15 acres of wheat on
his farm for harvest in 1955. In
other words, he can vote if he
would be affected directly by
quotas, which apply only to farms
with more than 15 acres of
wheat.

"There still seems to be a

good deal of misunderstanding
among farmers regarding the ef-

fect of the coming referendum
on acreage allotments," Myers

(llencoe, Minn,, ad
Cont Mtrs
Corn Prod
Crane

Pork cuts Loins, choice, lbs,
61 00.65 00: shoulders. 15 Ih.

Canada FundCro Zell
Curt Wrl

Sparcrlbs, ; fresh hams, 10- -

14 lb.,
Veal and calves, good, choice, all(ADVERTISEMENT)

Douglas Dlv Shs
Eaton 4 H
Equity Fund

3344weights, 33.0040.00; commercial, 28,00- - row chem

Legali
T i M bEr-f- o rs a le ursfiTEf)

STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE

INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. Oral auction
bids as hereinafter deslgimted
will be received by the OWrlct
Forester, Bureau of Land Man-

agement, Room 322 Hampton
Building, Eugene, Oregon, be-

ginning at 10:30 a.m., Pacltlc
Standard Time, on August 12,

1954, for all timber marked or
designated for cutting. Before
bids are submitted, full infor-
mation concerning the timber,
the conditions of sale and sub-

mission of bids should be ob-

tained from the above District
Forester. The right is hereby re-

served to waive technical de-

fects In this advertisement and
io reject any or all bids, The
United States reserves Ihe rlrht
to waive any informality in bids
received whenever such waiver
is in the interest of the United
States. IN LANE COUNTY, ORE-

GON: SIUSLAW RIVER MAR-

KETING AREA: O&C: ORAL
AUCTION: SALVAGE: All tim-

ber designated for cutting on
NWU, Sec. 27, T. 16 S., R. 7 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 2.2G9 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fir- , 23 M bd. ft. Western
Hemlock, 5 M bd. ft. Western
Red Cedar. No bid fot less than
$16.95 per M bd. ft. for ihe Douglas-

-fir. $5.60 per M bd. ft. for
the Western Hemlock, $3.00 per
M bd. ft. for tho Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $38,603.35 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid, $2,
550.00. All timber designated for
cutting on Sec. 7. T.
20 S., R. 5 W., W.M.. estimated
for the purpose of this sale to
be 643 M bd. ft. Douglaa--f lr,
3 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 5
M bd. ft. Western Red Cedar.
No bid for less than $15.15 per
M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

$7.20 per M bd. ft. for the West-
ern Hemlock, $4.25 per M bd. ft.
for the Western Red Cedar, or
a total purchase price of

will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid, $1,100.00.
All timber designated for cutting
on Lots 3 and 4 (NViNWVi),
Sec. 5, T. 20 S R. 5 W W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 100 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fir- , 1 M bd. ft, Westorn
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$10.85 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fir- , $3.45 per M bd. ft.
for the Western Red Cedar, or
a total purchase price of

will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid, $250.00.
AH timber designated for cutting
on SViNE'iS Wli, SE'4SW4, SVi
NESEiA.S'fcNWttSE, SEASE

Sec. 3, T. 19 S., R. 7 W
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this .sale to be 922 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fir- , 43 M bd. ft. Western
Hemlock, 46 M bd. ft. Western
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$17.95 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fir- , $7.60 per M bd. ft.
for the Western Hemlock, $7.10
per M bd. ft. for the Western
Red Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $17,203.30 will be con-

sidered. Minimum deposit with
bid $1,500.00. All timber desig-
nated for cutting on NWiNW4,
N'SWUNW, Sec. 27, T. 19 S.,
R. 4 W., W.M., estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
84 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- . No bid
for less than $12.50 per M bd.
ft. or a total purchase price of
$1,050.00 will be considered. Min-

imum deposit with bid, $250.00.
UPPER WILLAMETTE MARKET-
ING AREA: O&C: ORAL AUC-

TION: SALVAGE: All timber des-

ignated for cutting on NVSW'j,
Lot 3 tSEV4SWii), Lot 4 (SWV
SWi), NVifSEi4, Lot 1 (SEWSE

'), Lot 2 (SWWSEi), SWNEV,
NEViNEVi, Sec. 35, T. 22 S., R.
3 W W.M., estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 1,144
M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 152 M bd.
ft. Western Hemlock, 88 M bd.
ft. Western Red Cedar, 59 M bd.
ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for
less than $11.60 per M bd. ft.
for the Douglas-fir- , $3.65 per M

bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock,
$3.00 per M bd. ft. for tht West-
ern Red Cedar, and Incense Ce

63i. i'aramoum
52' Penney
14' a Penn P.R

9!'s Pepsi
77',3 Pfizer
33'a Phllco

. P Morris
ill, Phillips
89sji Proc Gam
42 Radio

1363. Rayonler
Rem Rand

60'. Rep Steel
12 Rexall
17!ls Reynolds
80- Richfield
54. St. Regis
44 Safeway
77 Schenley
793,4 Sears

Member m the afiuAffl
and had lived In F,..
past years. Beside,

'
he Is survived Jl2
Dan and Hugh ot'sife
Turner or Gr" il
Sarct Hall of OtaSTsB
lanlee Halleran, L7

Bid Asked
5.44 5.89

13.21 - 14.30

7.59 ' 8.25
2.13 2.34

15.03 16.07

5.87 6.08
23.10 25.32

9.84 10.78

12.54 13,56
11.33 12.37
10.21 11.15
23.46 25.36
6.03 6.59
8.99 9.80

22.51 24.54

Fund Inv
Grp Sec Com

PILES SHRUNK
without surgery!

IN CASE AFTER CASE PAIN STOPPEDI

35.00. ;Du Pont
Lamb, choice, prime spring lamb. Kast Airl

under 50 lb., Eastman
Wool Grease basis, Willamette Val- - Emerson

ley, lb; Eastern Oregon mixed Erie
cross bred range wool, fine and,Firest0ne
half blood, Gen Dyna

Keystone
Keystone .

40
20'4
6n,
fi'

35'U
5314
301a
455s
19
66

For amazing re-

lief from mis Country-dresse- meats, 1.0.0. ran- - r,en Elec
Telv & Elect

ONLY PILE
REMEDY THAT'S

ABSOLUTELY
STAINLESS

Jhn and Alex, 'both ftnesota; a nleee, Mn SJane Terry et Eu!e,-(-

Gen Foods
Gen Mtrs Wellington -Beef Cows, utility, lb; canners- - said Tuesday.

eries of simple
piles, get new
Stainless Pazo. Piiitnra. 21.22.

REQUEST FOR BIDS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN,

that sealed bids for the appoint-
ment hereinafter mentioned will
be received from residents only
of School District No. 139, Lane
County, Oregon, by Mrs. Leonard
Rust, Clerk of said District, at
her residence In Elmlra, Oregon,
until the hour .of 11:00 o'clock
P.M., on tho 26th day of July,
1954, The appointment for which
bids will be received Is for the
supplying of labor for all mainte-
nance and janitorial services re-

quired in and about the two
school plants operated in said
District, during the period com-

mencing August 1, 1954, and end-
ing June 30, 1955. Bids shall be
in gross lump sum only. A con-
tract will be entered into with
the successful bidder, which
among other things will provide
that work In excess of eight
hours In any one day and In
excess of forty-fou- r hours In any
one week will not be allowed.

A copy of the proposed con-
tract and the keys to the build-
ings may be seen and had from
the District Clerk.

The right lo reject any and
all bids Is reserved.

Dated this 17th day of July,
1954.

MRS. L. W. RUST
Clerk of School District
No. 139, Lane County,
Oregon.

No. 929 July 23, 1954.

Whether quotas are approvedVeal Top quality, llflht weight,
roueh heavies,

Ine In .Minnesota The faj!
will be held at SI K
Catholic Church FrUiy iS
23, at 3 a.m.. Rev. FithwfcJ

EUGENE MARKETSHogs Lean blockers sows,

Acts to relieve pain, itching in-

stantly. Soothes inflamed tissues,
helps prevent cracking, reduce
swelling without surgery! For fast
relief get new Stainless Pazo. Look

Heht.

or not, the wheat allotment pro-
claimed by the secretary of ag-

riculture will be in effect for
the 1955 crop. The controlling
legislation requires the establish

Lambs Best light springers, 36- -

.18: vearllnes. BUTTERFAT
PremiumMutton Best, iimz; cuii uumy, 58c

57c
lor word stainless on oox. sup-
positories or Ointment, at drug-
gists. Regular Pazo available too.

the Rosary at the Paolm
sen Chapel on Thurday, jSFirst Quality

Frrsh Produce Second Quality 52o ment of wheat acreage allot
Onions 50 lb. sacks, Calif, yellow,

; Wash.. Walla Walla yellows, Funeral Notices Ql
ments every year, unless they
are suspended because of emer-

gency conditions.
med. : arce. 2.50-7-

SHAEFERPotatoes New crop Calif, long
whites. No. ; special crs,

nora
iruiameiH at. r,

il will be held ,i t."Allotments are the basis formarks, bakers, No. 2.
100 lb. : round reds. . rv's ftathnll 31Ma

wil
uirsday, July 22, j .. IHay U.S. No. 2 green alfalfa,

ba cd. r.o.h. 1'ortiana, nominally z.uu-

POULTRY (Swift's Buying Price)
No. 1 colored hens, all weights 14c
No. 1 Leghorns, all weights 12c
No. 1 colored fryers, lbs 24c
No. 1 colored roasters, 4 lbs. up..24c
No. 1 Leghorn springs, 2 lbs. up ..21c
Cocks and Stags 10c
No. 2 poultry, 4 c under above prices

No. 3 poultry. Va of above prices.
i'OULTRY (NW buying prices)
No. 1 colored hens, all weights 14c
No. 1 colored roasters 24c
No. 1 coiored roasters 24c
No. 1 colored spring fryers 25c
TALLOW
Tallow 2c
Grease 2c
BARKS
Cascara, lb, dry 15c
HIDES AND WOOL
Heavy Beef 2'4-3-

Light Beef
Bull
Calf
Kip
Mohair, 12 mo. clipped 65c

quota administration when quo-
tas are in effect, but when there
are no quotas the allotments are
still in operation.

nUTTEK (vnolesaie prices)
A A Prints .. 84c
Quarter-poun- cartoru 66c
EGGS (Buying Price)
Lareg AA 53c

Large A 46c
Medium AA 45c
Medium A 44c
Small A 26c
F.UGS (Ore Wholesale)
Jumbo A 67c
Extra Large AA 64c
Extra Large A 62c

Large AA 60c

Large A 55c
Medium AA 52c
Small A 33c

Large Checks - 43c
EGGS (Public Market, retail)

28.00 ton; U. S. No, 1 timothy mixed
hay, Portland and Seattle,

v..it.aiinK. internet I
follow at Mt. Calvary.

O.S
to
tatiton, baled, f.o.b. cars.

"Producers must comply with
21a.Li, ii:,U u ,

neQi j

omitted and thnte wh.
acreage allotments in order to
be eligible for price supports
with or without quotas."
PRICE SUPPORT

may
Amerli Pflnenr Snl.,,-

BOGGESS

Portland Livestock
PORTLAND (in Hog prices were

down today.
Cattle 500; market fairly active;

steers and heifers fully
steady with Monday; other grass cat-

tle generally steady to weak; load
874 lb. fed steers 25; sort-c-

4 head at 24; good 800-l- grain on

Jumbo "5c
Extra Large AAA 71c If quotas are approved, Myers

gess, 80 years, of Marcoli,0r
gon. Funeral services vlll a
held at the Bartholomew BadExtra Large A DSC

lhanpl Thurul.v .li.lvErm added, there will be marketing
penalties on any "excess" wheat

45c
55c

Large AA 68c

Large A 66c
Lamb & snort wool .

Long Wool

NOTICE OF PROPOSED FORMA-
TION OF SPECIAL ROAD DIS-

TRICT OF HOLLIS PLAT,
LANE COUNTY, OREGON

Notice is hereby given that
the Board of County Commis-
sioners of Lane County, Oregon,
has fixed the hour of 10:00
o'clock a.m. on August 11, 1954,
as the time and the offices of
the said Board in the County
Courthouse of Lane County, Ore-

gon, as the place for a hearing
on the matter of the formation
of a special road district to be
known as Special Road District
of Hollls Plat, comprising the
territory within the following
described boundaries,

Commencing at a point 481.18
feet North of the Southwest
corner of Joseph Davis Dona

2 p.,,,, .million ulna

produced outside the acreage win oiiiciaie. interment JMedium AA i"c
Medium A 59c West Lawn Cemetery.
Small A - 40c allotment and the full level

of price support authorized for Funeral Supplements 111 j

grass steers 23; few
steers few good feeders 17.50-1-

truck lot good 76B lb. heifers 21;
cows mostly few 10.50;

utility cows some held higher; Portland Grain FUNERAL HOME

Prices Climb
In Log Mart

Sawing prices in western Ore

bulls

1955 will be available for those
who comply with their allot-
ments. If quotas are not ap-

proved, there will be no quotas

Junction City HarrLjnJ.PORTLAND Soft White, softCalves 150; market steady; good- - I'none pnonelWhite, no rex, White Club 220t4.
VEATCH HOLLlNflSWOtiilchoice vealers and calves up to 350

lb. mostly few to 20. ENGLAND FUNERAL HOMEor marketing penalties, and price tion Land Claim No. 43 in
Hard Red winter, orainary z.zuva.
Oats, No. 2 white no bid.
Hard White Baart, ordinary, no hid.
Barley, No. 2, West, no bid.

Phone Pearl SI. il II)

SCHWERING k ENGLAND

Hogs 100; market around 50c lower
for two days; choice lb. butch-
ers : few choice lb.
sows

CHAPEL
PlIiMCreswell, 1st & "C" SI.

BARTHOLOMEW BUEUSheep 1000; early sales spring lambs
fully 1.00 and more below Monday

Township 17 South, Ran-j- 4

West of the Willamette
run thence south 1946.5

feet to the center of Howard
Avenue, thence South 8044'
East 330.0 feet to the begin-
ning point of said tract, thence
South 660.00 feet, thence South
89s44' East 330.0 feet, thence

gon were somewhat stronger last
week, according to the Oregon
State College weekly farm forest
products market report. Demand
for logs was high generally, and
some price increases were noted
in the Coos Bay and northern

CHAPELdar, or a total purchase price of
Sprlnctleld, 6th & B Ph.

UNUSUAL CAT
SPRINGFIELD, Mass. IIPI In

reporting her white cat missing,

Betty Jane Yvon, 11, who is deaf,
told police the cat understands
sign language.

S .MON-l.- U S'SBURY Mortal!!
$H,2ti6.;jii win De considered.
Minimum deposit with bid,
350.00. Ail timber designated for

wltn extreme early top z.oo off: choice
springers mostly latter with
some prime grades; feed-
er lambs steady at few
good yearlings ewes

"Parkinc adiotnuu Mortjin
1152 Olive SI. Dill smNorth 660.0 feet to the centercutting on WWSWW,

SE!SWV4, Sec. 5, T. 23 S., R. 3

W., W.M., estimated for the pur
' FtJSERALWillamette Valley area.

Prices listed in the report HOME
of said road, thence North 89

44' West 330.0 feet to the place
of beginning, in Lane County,
Oregon.

pose ot tms sale to ne h.u ai do.
ft. Douelas-fir- . 2 M bd. ft. WestSAWLOGS: No. 2 second growth

1100 Charnclton Phone Htt '

'EUGENE CREMAtO-i-

110 Charnclton Phoni MMDouglas fir sawlogs at Willamette
excepting therefrom Lot 1,Valley mills were mostly $40 to $42

ern Hemlock, 1 M bd. ft. West-e-

Red Cedar, 3 M bd. ft. In-

cense Cedar. No bid for less

support for those who stay with-
in their allotments will be at 50

per cent of parity.
Farm allotment notices, as well

as an explanatory leaflet giv-

ing the essential facts of the 1955

program, were sent out on July
14 to Lane County wheat grow-
ers of record. The following vot-

ing places in the county will be
open from 9 a.m. to 8 p.m. on

Friday, July 23:

For voters of Cottage Grove,
Etmira, Eugene, Lorane, Pleas-
ant Hill, and Springfield com-

munities, the Lane County ASC
office, Osburn Hotel, Eugene.

For voters of Junction City
community, the Grange Hall at
Junction City; Irving community
voters will vote at the Junction
City Grange Hall or at the ASC
office in Eugene.

thousand hoard feet. No. 3's were BIOCK 2 Of HOlllS jiai.
LAURITA PAGE Florist.

$25 to $34. Long camp-ru- logs were Clerk of the Board ofthan $13.50 per M bd. ft. for the
Douclas-flr- . $3.05 per M bd. ft.$35 to $45, mostly $38 to $42. Logs FUNERAL WORK Our Sped.

Flowers by Tommy WiWiK.1for Ihe Western Hemlock, $3.00less than 24 feet long were $2 to $4
County Commissioners
of Lane County, Oregon,

No. 915 July 21, 1954.
Ph. Z0H6 fc. Iainper M bd, ft. for the western

Red Cedar and the Incense Ce 1UPersonals
less, Eight-foo- t logs down to
tops were $14 to $16.50 n cord, or
$30 to $38 a thousand. Nn. 2

sawlogs hrought $38 to $45 a
thousand. No. 3's ranged from $25

dar, or a total purchase price
of $8,617.60 will be considered. liinrinirn R n T if"RID your attic of things you no

longer need by placing a
r-Guard Classified Ad.

Minimum deposit with bid,
All timber designated for

cutting on Lot 7 (SW4NE'i),

WEATHER PERMANENT OS

machlnclcss cold wave insrw

vour cnmfnrt even in the Bits

est weather. Choose sob io
to $40. Peeler logs were mostly $75,
585, and sion al ihe Northern Wil-

lamette Valley mills still operating.
In Douglas County, long camp-ru-

and time.
flMnmneic dcaiITV sTOO

logs were $3.1 to $3fl a thousand, most
ly $34. Short logs were $1 to $2 less.
No. 2 hrought $35 to

Studio BR. Free parkinsWI
RSNTINI?" TRY RENTE

Power mowers, Sickle bin
fire hazards) Guest, PnJ,
valid needs. All avail it VJ
LEY RENTAL SERVICE, ft

$38. No. 2 was $40. All
No. 3 sawlogs were $26 to $30. Eight.
foot logs were $14 and $14.50 a cord. .1.2115. .Ill Van Buren at.
Sixteen-foo- t logs were $13 and $13.50

Lot 6 SEV4NE14), Lot 9 (NB'4
SEj), Lot 10 (NWV4SEV4), Lot
11 (NEI4SWI1), Lot 12 (NWV4
SWVi), Lot 13 (SW4SWV1), Lot
14 (SEV4SWV4), Lot 15 (SWViSE
W), Lot 16 (SEViSEm, Sec. 13,
T. 18 S., R. 1 W W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
493 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 50 M

bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 82 M

bd. ft. Western Red Cedar and
Incense Cedar. No bid for less
than $10.85 per M bd. ft. for
the Douglas-fir- , $3.60 per M bd.
ft. for the Western Hemlock,
$3.00 per M bd. ft. for the West-
ern Red Cedar and Incense Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
$5,775.05 will be considered. Min-

imum deposit with bid, $700.00.
No. 919 July 21, 1954.

PUBLISHER "b NOTICE
MEMBER OF

THE ASSOCIATED PRESS
The Assoclateo Press Is entitled
exclusively to the use of re-

publication of all the local news
printed In this newspaper ai well
as all news dispatches

SUBSCRIPTION RATES
By carrier, monthly 11.50
By carrier, b mos. In

advance .. . .O0

By carrier, yearly la
advance . W.00

By mall in Oregon, t mos. 3.75
By mall in Oregon, ft mos. 6.50
By mail In Oregon, 1 yr. 12.00
By mail In Oregon, 1 mo. 1.50

Mall subscriptions in carrier de-

livered zones are charged same
rate as that of carrier delivery.
By mail, out of state, 1 mo. 1,75

by the cord.
AL Coos Bay, No. 2

CHIROPRACTIC has ooo

fight asalnst polio. Both IBM

and chronic phases el

disease respond lo train
For polio consultation till

r W nnvts 3.1011.

logs were $33 to $35 a thousand. No.
3's were $28 to $30. Long camp-ru-

logs were ahout $1 higher at $34 to
$36, mostly $35. Short logs were $2
less. No. 1 sawlogs were
$43 to $45. No. 28 were $36 to $38.
and No. 3's were $26 to $30, Peelers

SNY GIBI. in trouble "W
a friendly adviser
Salvation Army While SIM

Home, P.O. Bo 3916. Port"

3, Oregon, or telephone vwore $60, $70. and $80 to 85 a thou-
sand. Outlying areas paid $2 to $4
below Bay prices. con 1632. ;

TpTTTltlPOLES AND PILING: Kortv- - to 50- - ncflnni .
.. umffnll, RATESRichard Lingtonlack Danby

Manager,
Eugene Office SPECIAL .Ma'nipulalivs IJ

foot barklc poles were In fair to
good demand in the Wallamette Val-

ley and at Boschurg. Poles down to
20 feet were in good demand at Port

& pnyslcai ineraw-
610 Willanietle, Jg

toiB.,Jlin1216inySTOLTCsTWOTSro
land. barktes ranged
from 14 to 21 cents a lineal foot, de

INVITATION FOR BIDS
Notice Is hereby given that

sealed bids will be received by
Harry L. Chase, Lane County
Clerk, at. the Court House, Eu-

gene, Oregon, until 10:30 a.m.,
August 3, 1954, for three auto-
mobiles, one sedan delivery, one

pickup; 2,940 lineal feet
concrete culvert, steel asphalt
dipped culvert, 400 kegs of
spikes and nails, all in accord-
ance with specifications now on
file In said Clerk's office. The
bids will be opened publicly at
10:30 a.m., August 3, 1954, In the

pending on diameters. A few yards Beginners croup iut.--

Dougnt long piling. 3ZV1 w. din, uu,.- -

Pl'I.PWOOD: Hemlock, spruce and

Legajj
NOTICE OF

FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the

Circuit Court of the State of
Oregon for the County of Lane
has fixed Wednesday, the 28th
day of July, 1954, at the hour
of 10:00 a.m. o'clock at .h Cir-

cuit Court Room in the court-
house In Eugene, Lane County,
Oregon as the time and place
for hearing objections, if any
there be, to the final account
filed by the undersigned in the
estate of Ida May deBra, de-

ceased, and for settling said es-
tate.

Dated this 23rd day of June,
1954.

EUGENE deBRA
Executor

C. X. Bollenback and Robert H.
HollUter

825 Failing Building,
Portland, Oregon.
Attorneys for the Executor.
No1J73- -- July 21 1954;

NOTICE OF
FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
that Emmet Wlthrow, u Execu-
tor of the Estate of Lucy ,

deceased, has filed his Fin-
al Account as such Executor and
the Circuit Court of the State
of Orecon for Lane County has
fixed Frldav the 23rd day of
July, 1954, at the hour of 9:30
o'clock in the forenoon of said
day in the Circuit Courtroom of
the senior Judge nt the County
Courthouse in Eugeno, Lane
County, Oregon, as the timo and
place for hearing objections to
said Final Account. All persons
having objections to said Final
Account must file the same on
or before said dale.

EMMET WITHROW,
Execulor

No. 874 July 21, 1954.

white fir were $15 a cord at St. Hel-
ens, The same species were $15 a cord
or $28.50 to $30 n thousand at Coos

r.usen.
Alcoholics only
" RUST DETECTiVrsEBVra

24 Hours a Dy
Confidential Investigation'

210 Ransome

LWoucs-A;w-
rr

Bay. Hemlock and true firs were $17

County Commissioners' Room,
a cord at Oregon City.

HARDWOODS: Alder, ash and mapleat Portland brought $36 a thousand
for diameters. Eleven-inc-

Robert J. Wise Bruce Bales Meeiings ra 'TmiM
Thursday, Eocene, WSJlogs were $35 and eight-Inc- logs

were $30. alder brought $32

These men are qualified Investment representatives,
each experienced in the financial field. Their work is
devoted to bringing you financial information based
on the complete facilities of the Zilka, Smither and

Company organization. They are interested in work-

ing with you to establish and carry out a
investment program . . . based on an understanding
of your needs and desires.

Our supplying you information about stocks and
bonds is the work of a team of experi-
enced men, working efficiently in different depart-
ments to wisely handle the investment of your money.
In addition to a fully staffed office here in Eugene,
your representative at 'Zilka, Smither and Company
has the complete facilities of the Portland office at his

command through a private wire service. This enables
him to get quotations and information of interest to

you from our Portland research, programming and

trading departments, and statistical files . . . just as
readily as if they were in Eugene.

Phone Eugene
and we will make an appointment (or an experi-
enced investment sccurilies man to meel with you
either at your office, your home, or Zilka, Smither
and Company's nearest office. Out of town resi-

dents please call collect.

Emploif (four iiioiifij . . . keep if icorking

Mondays, spun., ,lel",',"'
Phone

DRIVER .TRSot
ai wiuamina.

OTHER FGOREST PRODUCTS: Dry
cascara bark was 15 to 18 cents it

pound. Swordfern was 12 cents a EUGENE DHIV1.hu
office St ....

CLASSIFIED

ADVERTISING
tin fores wittitn the state of

Oregon, Advertising Agencies
excepted. Special rates for out.

advertisers and busi-
ness and professional men In
Lane County and immediately
adjoining areas will be fur
nlshcd on request.)

CASH KATES
2 lines 30 times - W.00

($.13 a line a day)
2 lines 7 times 12.311

(1.17 a line day)
I lines 3 times II 0t

11.19 a line a day)
1 lines 2 times M

($.21 a line a day)
2 lines one time I 62

(9.31 a Unt a day)
NO e ada accepted.

CLASSIFIED O'SPLAY deadlines
are 48 hours before publication
dally and 5 p.n. Thursday for
Sunday i

CORRECTIONS for the next
day's ads may he phoned tn
until 7 p.m. On MONDAYS
only they may be phoned tn

a.m. for the aame day
WE WILL NOT be responsible

for more than one Incorrect
Insertion.

CLASSIFIED DISPLAY, which
Appears at the head of the

bunch. Al Coos Bay, natal was 18
TED REED NASHFTLii- -cents a nuncn ana husklebetTy bush

was 20 cents.

Louri House, hugenc, Oregon.
The County reserves the right to
accept bids with minor s

from specifications or to
reject any or all bids. No bidder
may withdraw his bid after the
hour set for the opening thereof,
or before award of the contract,
unless said award is delayed for
a period exceeding 30 days. All
envelopes should be plainly
marked "bids" on (he outside.
Each bid must be accompanied
by a certified check or bid bond
for 10 of the hid price, to be
forfeited if bid is accepted and
contract not performed. Board
of County Commissioners bv Ken-
neth Nielsen. Robert D. Maclay,
and Ralph Petersen, County
No. 934 Julv 27. 1954.

BENTAL plate w
Denlisl, corn"

Willamette. Eusene, 0",
JOEL'S reasonable

Jewelry repair. "JVj.M
teed. Across from P"ffi-- ,

SERVING EUGENE

CONTINUOUSLY

FOR OVER

15 YEARS.

I I OIIMII
SHOES

For MEN and WOMEN

B U R C H ' S
1060 Willamette

your home, work

REBUILT 'mtrs;
Motors. l'nonc:r --

j
Lost & found J&

Classified Display a5STTTn-Te-
trSl

Roosevelt Bivn., '"' .tJrt
P".P. 5 "nehble"
....Ho,. Named
ward. Ph. MWij
WTi MiJoM? ;7tr3S
Stamps, tune y"lfl

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN:
That I, Mr. or Mrs. J. L. Smith
of 552 W. 5th Avenue, Eugene,
Oregon, am the legal owner of
that deposit heretofore
in custody of the First National
Bank of Eugene, of Eugene, Ore-
gon, in the amount of $1,009.35,
which was declared abandoned
under the provisions of Chapter
587, Oregon Laws nf 1947, and
turned over lo the State and
Board or the State nf Oregon
as abandoned mnnev under the
date nf July 1, 1951; and that I
have pelittoned the said State
Land Board for the recovery
thereof,

MR. or MRS. ,1. L. SMITH
No. 940 July 21, 1954.

classified section, allows euta
and plain border Charges are
lc a line above regular classi-
fied rates

ward. Ph. JSrrai
LOST, wailrl "','1.

ADS will De taken until 5:30
Ph.

INVESTMENT SECURITIES

p.m. on tne day bofore puoll
cation, except that SUNDAY
ADS are due FRIDAY at 3:00
p.m and MONDAY ADS may
se phoned In 8:00 B:00 a.m.
Monday morning to appear tn
TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY

RESIDENTS of CRESWELL may
place ads through MRS C. L
KENT, 1st St. Ph 337

CANCELLATIONS and CHANGES
will be made the day after
they are ordered, except when
Bhoned In a.m

when they will be made
the tame day

DIAL 51551

rffsTf-LadV-
s I than! s

walch. Vic. W J
Broadway
hod-- s Drue. " F(sr&s

rosTrBoddlnc roll- gt.

on Rlv. Rd. 1" ,
PhM61?-

LTJSTrMdunlcoTJJ'1, JW

Finder please I"",
Club and get J?&
& "B" si.., spnJjt--- jjj

Trinsportatior. rtfi
sTUDTNTrSf. "'""'Help

feur. can ell

your car, "J'irr' ?
midwest,
rsr from the w
15.

CHECK YOUR AD!

Phone CORRECTIONS

up to 7 p.m. for next

day MONDAY thru FR1-da-

"CLASSIFIED"

TIBany Building Eugene. Oregon
Phone

Also offices in Portland Salem Medford Hood River and Vancouver, Wn.

RETIREMENT SPECIAL
2 BR. HOME WITH LARGE ATTACHED 4 RM DEN A- WORK-

SHOP. LOCATED ON 4 CHOICE ACRES ON
HWY BARN. GREENHOUSE. ORCHARD. BERRlS

BARGAIN AT $11,500. Call Roy Nelson or

HANSEN & GLASS, REALTORS
382 EAST 6th aii


