
Legale Ugali
fffSa. at the hour of 0:1b A.M. nf

Register-Guard- , Eugene, Ore.

gB Wed., Jan. Zl Portland Markets ;Whqs Doing? M.5 "rii.l
la X""

FARM BUSINESSRevision Eyed PORTLAND fl Bufterfat tents-
live, subject to immediate chance
premium qualltv, maximum to .35 to
nni per rent arldltv; delivered In port-

land. lb: first quality M.7lc:On Milk Prices second quality fiPc. Vallev routes and ERNEST "CHET" Lawrin. 4444
fith Avr. Infal rprirpspntativpcountry points cents ie.

r:..'.--" Ail
'uard, , :;'hiW',

01 ,np innnnpniai usually tn..hnlesalers-i!ra- de AA, S3 sre.re. S9V

Board of. Agriculture wanls milk In h. 92 srnre. fifir; B, M "ore, ssc; i' y una"; bppn naniprl
cost less whPnpurrhasH in StnroSlVh;r,'"H,,nC r.rP t. r...d 'siffc J""' p"than when delivered to homes if it wtioinwiprn-Orps- on .Ihkim 4.v4.r ih J? 'm loasi

n 5lb ''Mr. t agents in the salecan finrl farts In iustifv the dif- - t
K ., hoie,alersrandleil etc F nf and

ferential, Marshall Dana, a board rn,a,,inc i, rases inriuded. "t V "cclnc.m

member, said Tuesday. .Portund-- A targe. A medium. 1iwrTJRs,ckn'M 1 n ' u r"

Prices Irregular

On NY Market
NEW YORK OP Prices moved ir-

regularly on the slock market Wed-

nesday in one of the dullest sessions
in weeks. .

Price movements were extreme-

ly small either way. A number of
stocks held at their previous close.
Some specialty issues, however,

managed to move out of the narrow
range.

There was very little In the day's
news developments to sway prices
either w ay. Investors generally took
the "wait and see" attitude on de-

velopments in Washington. They
held off making any further com-

mitments until President Eisen-

hower gives his state of the union

message which is expected next
week.
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for the year 1952
placed him amonp
the top 10 in the
nationwide sales

made up of producer, distributor plants rrvers. 2'ii lbs .n ib.
and consumer interests, was ,p- - j&Sr,SS&' SU?
pointed hy the board recently to ur. NOTrrr . CitsJ

force of Contin
' 'fry M Eui,.S". J"e,p. 'Z Z 2r. 5.Slb,; 2o:24o;,d( Chrt l.awson ental's railroadrnonts states milk control

?nM ,.,, , , h , h rf , Thjs
Jaw. to retailers. rut up fi.vficl

. . ,.te Fresh dressed meats wholesalers to spctmve year in which Lawsnn has

tial Jong has horn a point of rf.rio;: uZ'r prrsonal sales achievement and
nn p he! wren consumers and cer- - commirciJii , ,

""MiialiiiM'Ht

""" '" h frt !'"'
?"1 '"cm'". 'Hh ih. .

.w.nn; titiitiv. n.i.no.afi.on; cows, commer- consisieni icaner?nip. Lawson nas
rtai .in on: mllitv. 23. Ort: ran- - rn .r, .VAi,.Pi...tain distrihulors. So far the board

nas reiu.rn hi diimv a mjw n miph- nirwinirrs. a '"!."".
price on the eround that retailers' '.:''' '"Sr."'"'".'"'!"':. ,'.,"u nwn w ,n" "ar , iprs. S2.ti..'ih.iHi; rn'ina, .b.iHi-- ,mi: unit since xtfto.
and distributors handling prices ni,, trimmpd. trianeips,,
are similar. iMt rltw. s.wi.iKi: foriuartpr. ....,,. .

4n,nn.4.,.on: rhurks. of Incorporation
' Pnrk nils lnln. rholpp. lb. 47.no. iwprp filpd in Salpm this wppk for

'""hand,
7! (m i ".."'to..!

Sl.nn- shouldprs. IS lb, ,H.on..lfi.nO:
b,.Mh I mted Pipe and Supply Co.,rib.. 4.i.nn.4B.nn. wh hm.

.wnn..w.on. tucene. listing 5000 shares of no
Vpal and ralv cond rholrp. all par vale stock. SigninE the

45.no.S5. commprclal, SR.OO-00; ..- - lnr;rnH

Associated Oil Sets

Eugene Sales Meet
4a oo.

Mel C. Coleman, Oregon district l.amh . 4.1.00. Wilk and Genrce T. Langfnrd. Also
filpd were articles for the Pheiffer- -t.la, mqnqrrflp. Inr Iria Tirlft U'afpr ,,.... i i

'
, t nn ti nn

Wooi-t- p b i, 4Sr lb to itr'oir.ri. Wi nsd Lumber Co., Inc..
Oil Co., has announced i(.aMa wi(h!ome fapitaiiM,jon set st

plans for Associated sales meetings; couniry-drpssp- mpai... S30.000. Signing the articles were
Bppi iitilitv rows, lb; pannpr.- - f".to he held in Tortland and Eugene, ,., 23 25c. Herman K. Pfeiffer, and Reese and

Thursday and Friday. Vpai lop quality, lb; rough irrna Wingard.

"V..".'.. I).

h"v. 'nmw'juR

,"!""" "

Adminlsiralerlfc,2
at ISM ij.,.,. ,'1--'

AN ACCELERATED tax amor
The sales meetings to be con-- , noSflip,'n Wockpra, lb; owa.

ducted by Coleman will bring ilain.
cether 85 members of the oreani-- l Urn!. lsl. JMOe lb. fixation program has been approv- -

.Minion npsi, r 10. . , ..
rations sales personnel and dis- - onions ckj Wpt Orcnn vt- p" lor '"e tugene lrucK and
trihlllors 'Iowa, medium, aomp name Machine ( o., , which is doing rie- -

ihranda blcher: 3ln., 3 .75- - 4.no; No. 2i.'rcn5(, wor. The US DenartmentAssisting Coleman will be Mar- - 2.00.25; boiiera, 10 m aapkj. .ia,40p;."'
shall S. Pease, retail sales man- - W""" v"'""?- mi,;'m, rT,7,"r"J'lw ..m.muCe . reported Wednes-..-r

3 No. rlay firm hasand E. C Heinz, wholesale ,,, 4 o.25. fe- 10 4.50. rt a nenem ot si.u.Ht, at 50sales manager of the company. Russets. No. i.j"w
. ; fpiv name brands to 5 25; r cent, lor expansion of its elec- -

The plans for the two Sessions pr,. 5.75.0.110; No. 1A. 25 lb. I.2533; 10 trip fnrnarp nart. nlnl
...... 11. non al ihl, ,.1

VF.IT VORK STOCKS
(Wednesday. .Ian. 21, IS51)

Reported by
Foster Marshall. Eueene office

HOW JONFS CLOSING AVERAGES:
3n Industrials. 27.n. off .40
20 Ralls. 109 06, oft ,2
IS Ulllllles. 51.93. off .IS
Volume. 1,300.000 sharea

NYSF, SELECTED LIST:
Admiral 30a'4 Lib Owens 4m
Air Redn 2SI Lockheed 221
Al Ludlum 3STs Loews 12'
Al Chem 7t Lorrillarrt 2fi
Al Stores 3S(, McKesson 3S
Allls Ch 57J, M4M wg ui.
Am Alrl 14 M,rk tjs.Am Can 34 Magnavnx 2IVs

m Cyanmd M'i r,L Martin 14'
Am Gas S5' Mont Ward S2'i
Am Rdtr 15 N,,h IVi
Am Smelt 41',4 Nat Bis 3fi'a
Am Tel 153 Natl Dlsl 22i
Am Tob SBTa Natt Gpsm 22
Am Wool 257'. Nail Lead 30"a
Anaponda 43V Nil Steel SOI
An Prlch 45" N Y Cent 23'4
Armcn 4Hi No Pap BO'
Armour ll'.i. par Gaa 3R7s
Asnc DC, 201. Packard 5
Atchison 90i p,n Am Air 9T

Avco m', paramount 27V
Baldwin 101'. rpnnpv S8'
Bal Ohio 27i pent, RR 22k
Bendix Av Sis ppp,j tisj,
Rath Sit SStii PftTer
Boelntr 43st Philrn 34l,7
BorK War j prop Gam SB

Rupynis 25i. Pure Oil 82
FurluiRlon ISii Radio 27',
Cdn Par 32i,i Rem Rand 19
Celanese 3.5'-- , Rep Sleel 4sjChes Ohio 39', Roxall S",
St. Paul 2n". Reynolds 424
SI. Paul Pr 50s Richfield S1V

Chrysler 92? St. Reela 19H
Climax 7714 Safeway 32'.
Colli Gaa 14Afc Sphenley 27
Vultee 2m4 Sears 59a
Cont Mtra ini, Sinclair 40a
Corn Prod 7ns. Socons Sfit's
Crane 31 1, Sou Co. I5'a
Cro 7,ell S2a Sou Pec 44'.
Curl Wrl as. Sou Ry 77'.
Pouelas fi3i7 Sperrs- 42
Pow Chem 421 Spiecel R1.7

Pll Pont 95 Sid O Cat 5.East Alrl 27'fc std o N.I 7ft
Eastman 44'. Sludehkr 411'
Erie 2?i. Sunrav 2na
Plreslnne 701 Sylyanla 371
Gen Pyan 42 Texas 31i
Gen Eler 701' Textron It"
Gen Foods S3'k Tidewater 23k
Gen Mtrs SB Transam 2fi'ii
Oa Paplfle 17'., T W A IBH
Glldden 35a. T Cen Fox 13j,
Goodyear 52ii Un Bag 4B'
Greyhound I2'a Cn Carhlda 7!'a
Gillh Mob 37 fn Oil 3BI,
Gulf OH 4S l.n Pap 121 3

Homestake 37i lintd Aire 37Sj,
Snd 19'. Unld Alrl 30.

Hudson lfil llntd Fruit 50'.
HI Cent Rftla US Rubber 30V,
tnt Harv 32'. US Sleel
Inl Nleket 45 H. Walker 45V.
Int. Paper 55 Wea Union 4!Vx
tnt Tel 19W Weatlnirha 47fc
Johns Man 71'. Willys l!i
.Johns La 23li Woolworth 45s
Kennecolt 77'a Zenith SO
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s'pMini crlces. No. ka will assemble for their annual

man said.
larjje Barceionas, lb; grower convention in Seattle. Wash., Feb.

prices, orchard run. 1415c lb. 12 and 3 to R
Walnuts wholesale selllnK prices, ' ,ccnrnlnS ,A- -

first (inaiiiy larse. Frannuettes, imp Ort, Springfield, a member of the
grower prices, orchard run, hoard of directors of the sponsor

Let Skpie'j check the selling of
3'onr diamond. No charge ing organization, the North Coast

Retail Hardware Assn.
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llvcred zones ire

REDS DENOUNCE JEWS
RERLIN East German Com-

munists lashed out against alleged
"Zionist agents" Tuesday night
amid growing signs of an t

drive against .lewish communities
in the Russian zone.

U.S. Counters
Spy Trial

Propaganda
PARIS npi--Thp V. S. State

Doparlnipnt is making a vigor-

ous campaign to blnck

efforts In pin a propa-

ganda label nf

on the Rosenberg atomic spy

case.

French and other European
Communists had hopped on
the death sentencing of Ethel
and Julius Rosenberg for be-

traying American atomic se-

crets to the Soviets as a
smoke-scree- for Red

which came to light
in the recent Communist
"show trials" in Trague.

The Stale Department was

alarmpd by the way the Com-

munist campaign against the
"American hangmen" was

catching on even in

quarters.
FACTUAL ACCOUNT

Their answer has been the
distribution in 41 countries of
a factual, account
of the trial and the verdict,
setting forth all the facts and

arguments developed by both

prosecution and defense.

Particular stress is placed
on the absurdity of the Com-

munist charge that the trial
was It is point-
ed out that the judge who or-

dered the pair sent to death
In the electric chair and the

prosecutor who asked for the
death penalty both were Jews.

In Paris, the results of the
American counter propaganda
drive were

PROMINENT ACCOUNTS

Following receipt of the
Slate Department's
French-languag- pamphlet on
the case, almost every

newspaper carried
prominent, front-pag- accounts
of the trial giving the lie to
many of the false assertions the
French Communists had suc-
ceeded in planting in the pub-
lic mind.

Credit for thp U. S. a

drive belongs to
Ambassador James C. Dunn,
who ordered his press attache,
Benjamin Bradlee, home last
month on a special flight to
acquaint himself with the facts
nf the case to answer an out-

cry in France against the trial.

Legafj
"

SUMMONS
IV THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE
COUNTY OF LANE.

BERT W. UDELL,
Plaintiff,

vs.
BLUE RIVER CONSOLIDATED
GOLD MINING COMPANY, a

JOE CLARK and .IANF,
noE CLARK, his wife: P. A.
WASHBURN: HENRY HOLCOMB
and BERTHA M. HOLCOMB, his
wife; JANE DOE BR ATTAIN, wife
of William C. Brattain. deceased:
FANNIE WORTHINGTON and
JOHN DOE WORTHINGTON, her
husband; Rns nR ATTAIN and
OTT1LIE BRATTAIN, his wife;
PAUL BRATTAIN and JANE DOE
PRATTAIN. his wife; LESLIE
BRATTAIN and JANE DOE BRAT-
TAIN, bis wife; PAUL J. BRAT-
TAIN; VIRGIL RRATTAIN and
JANE DOE BRATTAIN. his wife;
ELDON M. BRATTAIN and JANE
DOE BRATTAIN, his wife; RER.
NICE SMALL, wife of Ross M.
Small, deceased: CLARA ELAINE
SCALLON and JOSEPH SCALLON,
her husband; BERN ICE L. HUTCH-
INSON and DIANE HUTCHIN-
SON, her husband; HOMER E.
CARLO N and AL'STA CARLON.
his wlt: ROV R. CARLON and
LOR A CARLON. his wife:

M. CARLON and ALICE
CARLON, his wife; orHIR
BROWN, husband of Flva M.
Brown, deceased; A LENT- JONES
and PETE JONES. hr husband:
ALBERTA RICE and OTTO RICE,
her husband; EVA COUNTS and
GEROLD COUNTS, her husband;
CREED V. BRATTAIN and BE-
ATRICE B. RRATTAIN. his wife;
ESTHER COOPER and DAN
rooPEn. her husband; RUTH Mr.
CULLOUGH and SAMULEL

hr husband; HELEN
RILEY; BESSIE BRATTAIN

and DONALD
her htishand: HAZEL

GARDNER and CLAUDE D. GARD-
NER, her husband: EDGAR H.
BRATTAIN: MOLL1E B.

HADLEY and PEARL H
his wife. ARTHUR L.
and JAN'K r.OE BRATTAIN,

his wife: JOHN S. MILLER and
JANE DOE MILLER, his

O L S E N and
JANE DOE OtSON. hh

E WREN and JANE DOE
WREN, his wife; J. S. MILLER and
LILLIAN E. MILLER, his wife;
G CILLINGHAM: E C .tOURERT
and J ANE DOE JOURERT. his wife;
FANNIE OLIVER GLOVER: LANE
COUNTY; C. RUNY RD and JANE
DOE RUNYARD. bis wife; R c
WRIGHT and JA NE DOE WRIGHT
his wife; also all other personsor parties unknown claiming anv
Tight, title, estate, lien or Interest
In the real estaie described in the
Complaint herein; and the

heirs of any deceased De-
fendants,

Defendants.
Tn: BLUE RIVER CONSOLIDATED)

GOLD MINING COMPANY a
JOF, CLARK and JWEPOE CLARK, his wife; J'F.POE BRATTAIN. wife of William

C. Rrattain. deceased: FANNIE
WORTHINGTON and JOHN DOEttftBTUIVr.Tfiv .

classif;:

adyertisd

Portland Livestock
PORTLAND ('())

Mlahlf .inn; market rather xlow. gen-
erally ; few high Kiod 1.0.W
lb fed steers 2.V50; nlher Rood .(eers

IneludlnK 1.344 ths at. 2.1.00;
several lols rommerclal grades

fpw commercl-il-lo- znt hricanner-cntte- r cowi mostly
. SO; scattered lou uni-- tu.,a

rommerclal rows to 17.00;
hulls glow; few commercial grades

Calves salable SO; market steadv;
vealers urattered

lots commercial-good- , slaughter ralves

Hogs salable 50A: market fairly active,
strong to 25 cents higher than Tues-
day; choice 1 and 2 butcher
lbs Jt.fln.S0; choice lb rawi

!W; t feeder plga aalable
around .

Sheep salable 100; few sales steady;
on lot Aft lb fed No. pell
lambs 22. .10; rholce-pri- wooled lamhs
salahl to 2.100; feeder sal-

able 17 ewe nom-

inally

2 lines 3n time,

WARD'S
SAW SHOP

1703 W. 71h Ave. Th. 5 4101

J CIRCLE SAWS Filed &
Gummed
HAND SAWS Filed &
Retoothed
DRAG SAWS Filed &
Hammered
CHAINS FILED

J TOOL GRINDING
0 TFTtsl Fast

F.xPFRIKS'rr . rourlenos
Free Parklnc Serrlpp

11.14 1 Ihl ill
2 lines 7 lime

l.H 1 lint 6'
z lines times

III 1 limit

Lfafs
RMbwing described real property
iltuated In Lem County, Oregon,

t0'Th. Sunset and Ytnk Girl

lode mining claims. PJdesignated by the Surveyor
ai Survey No. 724, n.h"e-in-

a portion of Section M m

Township W Smith of

EWM. In Ihe Blue River
Mining Dlslrlrl.

44.fi79 acres more or

es- - according to the official

Ihcrcof a more fully ami
cdmpietely described In Uniled

Stales nnlent Ihercrnr, npueai-In- g

nf record In Volume 107

. page m of tha Peed Record.
of Lan County.

AI50 the Sun lode mining
claim, palenled. deslgnaterid by

the Surveyor General as Sur-

vey No. 723, embracing a por-

tion of said Section .12 In Ihe
same district. Township and
Range, containing 7.IR5 acres
more or less according to the
official survev thereof and be-

ing more fullv and completely
described In Uniled Stales pat-

ent therefor appearing of record
In Volume. 1015 al, page 292 of

said Deed Records,
and that plaintiff is In possession
of a fee simple title therein and

for nuieilng plaintiffs title to said

propertv against the claim of each
and everv one of the defendants
and anv other persons unknown to

plaintiff claiming any Interest In
said land; and for such other and
further relief as to the Court may
eem just and equitable.
Pursuant lo the Order of De-

cember 2,1, W52, duly made and
entered herein hy the Honorable
G F. Skipworth. presiding Judge
of (he Circuit Court, of the Stale
of Oregon for the County of

Lane, this Summons shall hp pub-

lished once a week for four (4)
.successive and consecntlv weeks.

Date of first publication of this
Summons. December 24, 1!52.

HARRIS. BUTLER r HUSK
and DONALD A. DOLE
Rv DONALD A. DOLE,
Attornevs for Plaintiff
Post Office address:
207 Eugene Medical Center
Rtdg.. Eugene. Oregon.

Nn. R94 Ian 21, NM. .

NOTICE" O'F SA'I.rT
In the Circuit Court of the state

of Oregon for County of Lane, In
the Matter of the Guardianship of
Frank Wilson Ross a Mentally 111

Terson.
Notice Is hereby given Stella G.

Ross, the Guardian In the above
entitled Matter hv virtue of an
order of sale made. In the above
entitled Matter dated January 301 h.
19.V1, bv G. F. Skipworth. Judge of
said Court, will from and after
Friday the 27th day of February,
1953, "offer for sale and sell for
cash the following described prem-
ises:

The Easl half of the southeast
Quarter of Seclion 25. Tp. ifi. S., R.
A W., of Willamette Meridian in
Lane County. Oregon, and as ap-

purtenant thereto a roadway 30

feet wide, as specified and de-

scribed In that certain deed, re-

corded on pages 2L2-- in Vol 24i
of the County Deed Records,

Said sale to he marie al the Law
Office of C. A. Wlnlermeier at lfil
Lincoln St., Eugene, Oregon. Title
lo be Insured, and will Include the
entire eslale of entirety held hv
Frank Wilson Ross and .Stella G.
Ross hushand and wife.

STELLA G. ROSS, Guardian,
C. A. Wlnlermeier, Attorney,

No. 947, Feb. IB. IBM.

m THE CfRCUIT'COUR'f OK THK
STATE OF O BEG ON FOR LANE
COUNTY
NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Case No. 110R2

IN THE MATER OF THE ESTATE
OF ELEANOR C. JACOBSEN,
Deceased.
NOTICE IS HERRY GIVEN, that

Betty Jackson and J. F. Jacobson,
Administratrix and Administrator,
respectively of tht Estate of Elea-

nor C. .lacohsen. Deceased, have
filed their Final Account In the
above, entitled Court and that nn
the 27th day of January, 195.1, at
the hour of 9:3ft A.M., has been
Mt as Ihe time and the Circuit
Court room of Ihe Lane County
Court House In Eugene, Oregon,
has been set as the place for the
hearing of any obleclions therein.
Any such objections shall be filed
In the above entitled Court within
four (4) weeks nf the dale of the
first publication of this notice.
This notice Is puhllshed pursuant
to an Order riulv made and enter-
ed hy the Honorable William G.
East. Judge of the above entitled
Court and that, nn the 24th dav
of December. 195?, Is the dale of
the first publication thereof.

BETTY JACKSON,
Administratrix.
in Lumbermen's Building,
Eugene. Oregon.
J. F. JACOBSEN,
Administrator,
1W Lumbermen's Building,
Eugene, Orecon.

EVANS. THWING JAQl'A
By EDWARD V. O'REILLY
Of Attorneys for Administra-

trix and Administrator.
1fW Lumbermen's Building,
Eugene. Oregon.

No. R97, Jan. 21. 195.1.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR LANE
COUNTY
NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

cse No. 10971
IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE

OF MILDRED KRUSE, Deceased.
NOTICE IS HERBV GIVEN, that

Orvllle Kntse. Administrator of
the Estate of Mildred Krue. De-

ceased, has filed bit Final Account
In ihe above entllled Court and
that on he ?7th dav of Januarv,
19S.1. at the hour of 9 in A.M. has
hern set as the time and th Cir-
cuit Court room of the Lane Coun-
ty Court Hoitse In Eugene, Oregon,
has been set as fbe place for Ihe
hearing of any oblections Ibereto.
Any such oblections shall he filed
In the above entitled Court within
four (4 weeks nf the dale of ihe
first publication of this notice.
This notire Is ptihhod pursuantto an Order dulv made and en-
tered hv th Honorahl William G.
East. Judge of the above entitled
Court and that on the ?tth dayof Derember. 1957. Is the date of
the ftrt puhlirahon thereof

ORVILLE KRUSE,
Administrator.
IOH Lumbermen's Building,
Eugene. Oregon

EVANS. THWINC, JAQl'A
Bv EDWARD V. OTiE'LLY.
Attfirnevs for Administrator,

Lumbermen's Building,
Eugene. Oregon

No. SiW, Jan. 21, 19.V1.

CITATION
Number 13. im

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF ORFGON FOR THE
COUNTY OF MARION

Probate DepartmentIn the matter of the Eslale ofFllraheth Dineharl Brash, deceas-- fd.
To iiar, ninehart. Jr.. Mason

nlnehart, Mo7eMe Rritton .
and to all heirs, devisees

legate, unknown of said dece-nn-
If ajvy such there he. andothers unknown claiming anv titlenterest or right In and to thelands and premises herein deserlb- -

WHEREAS. appUealinn havingneen made in proper form to thehove entitled Court on ihe 3i,tday of December, 1952, hv RenhaT. hafer. ihe dulv appointed
S'l'th'Vh'1 T,? rMn "'"'"ratrU?J "wd of the estate
Sir JL

w

uV rtpf-- " tnt an or--"' author.
licensing and empowering hersuch administratrix to sell all' lh right, line, estate and In

cedent m and to the real proptv
erlbed in the im enters- and an

s. d , app1(rM)ftn
"

ff,hM n1 'w,t -
l ot, , ,M nf )h

o' Otv ,ew P.rk Addition to

edA-o- r'M:f'1 "M
P,c. 7? nf

xt: t,v- nr"nn-

WHEREAS, said Court
Monday, ,he ith day of KhnVfr?.

2 lines 2 timet

said day, aa the time, and the
Circuit Court Room In the tem-
porary Court Houae, at Salem, In
Marlon County, Oregon, aa the
place for Ihe hearing of said pe-
tition and application, and all ob-

jections thereto, and the granting
of an order and license to sell,

NOW, THEREFORE, IN Tlffi
NAME OF THE STATE OK ORE-

GON, You and each of you, are
hereby cited and directed and

lo appear at snid time and
place ihen and there lo show
cause, IT any should exist, why an
order of sale should not be mado
and In said petition and applica-
tion prayed for, and why said ap-

plication and petition should not
he granted, and why said order
and license should not Issue, Such
appearance la to be made by you,
If citation Is served upon you In
Marlon County, Oregon, within ten
days of such service; and within
twenty days of such service If
served upon you In any nlher
County of the. Slate of Oregon
from the date nf such service, if
personally served: or If served
tipon you hy publication thereof,
or hy personal service, without the
Stale o( Oregon, then within twenty-e-

days of the first publica-llo-

thereof, or of such personal
service upon you outside of tho
Slate of Oregon, to show cause, if
any you have, or If any such ex-

ists, why the order and license of
sale should not be made as prayed
for in saidipetllion and application.

W 1TN ESS THE HONORABLE
REX KIMMELL. ONE OF THE
JUDGES OF SAID COURT with the
seal of said Court affixed this 31st
day of December, 1952.

H. C. MATTSON
County Clerk, pro tern.

(Circuit Court .Seal)
No. 913. Feb. 4. 1953.

NOTICE TlV CREDITORS "

NOTICE Is hereby given that
Kenneth 1L Wylle has been

executor of the EstatP and
Last Will and Testament of Henry
E. Wylle tsame person as H. E.
Wylie) deceased, by ihe Circuit
Court of the Stale of Oregon, for
the County of Lane. All persons
having claims against said estate
are hereby notified lo present
the same, duly verified with proper
vouchers 1o Ihe Executor at 207

Eugene Medical Center, Eugene,
Oregon, within six months from
Ihe date of this notice.

Dated this 29th Hay of Decem-
ber, mi.

KENNETH H. WYLIE
Executor.

HARRIS. BUTLER ft HUSK

Attorneys.
No. SOftJan. 2R. 19r.3

TIMBER" FOR
"

SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. Timber marked
or otherwise designated for cutting,
as noted hereafter, will be offer-
ed for sale bv ORAL AUCTION
BID starting at in;on A. M., PA-

CIFIC STANDARD TIME, on
19, 195.1, at the office of the

Bureau of Land Management, lo-

cated at Room 212. Post Office
Building. Eugene. Oregon. Infor-
mation concerning conditions or
the sale Including such Hems as
qualification of bidders, procedure
for submitting bids, road access,
marketing area requirements, pay-

ments, and type of bond required,
should he nhtained prior to the
sale, from the above mentioned of-

fice. The right is hereby reserved
to waive technical defects in this
advertisement and in reject any or
all bids. .All volumes given are
esiimates and may be more or less
than the actual amounts. IN LANE
COUNTY: OREGON: SIUSLAW
RIVER MARKETING AREA: All
timber designated for cutting on

E?SWU, WWSF.". Sec. 1. T. 19 S.,
R. 8 W., W.M., estimated for the
purpose of Ihis sale to be 40ftfl M

hd. ft. Douglas Fir, 30 M hd. ft.
Western Hemlock. 4n M hd. ft.
Western Red Cedar. No bid for
less than $19.75 per M hd. ft. for
the Douglas Fir. S5.40 per M hd,
ft. for the Western Hemlock, $4.5"
per M hd. ft. for Ihe Western Red
Cedar, or a tolal purchase price of

79,342.fin, will he considered. Min-

imum deposit with hid M.fiflO.on.

SALVAGE SALES: All timber des-

ignated for culling on Si?SW'i.
SW'.iSE'i, Sec. 27, T. 19 S,, R. fi

W., W.M.. estimated for the pur-
pose nf this sale lo he R25 M hd. fl.
Douglas Fir. No bid for less than

lfl.95 per M bd. ft. for the Doug-

las Fir. or a total purchase prlre
of S15.R3.1.75. will he considered.
Minimum deport with bid l. 40n.no.

All timber designated for culling
on S'.jS'iSE1 1. Ser. 29. T. 19 8.. R.
4 W., W.M.. estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 315 M bd. ft.
marked Douglas Fir. 1ft M bd. ft.
marked Incense Cedar. No bid for
less than 2ft .10 per M bd. ft. for
the marked Douglas Fir. $7.30 per
M hd. ft. for lb marked Incense
Cedar, or a total purchase price of
$fi.1fi".50, will he considered. Mini-

mum deposit w ith hid $750 nn. UP-

PER WILLAMETTE MARKETING
AREA: SALVAGE SALES: All lim-

ber designated for cutting on S'
SE'. Sec. 9. T. 17 S R. W.. W.M .

r Mima led for the purpose nf this
sale to he 2fll M hd. ft. marked
Douglas Fir. 1ft M bd. ft. marked
Western Hemlock, 5 M bd. ft. mark-
ed lncene Cedar. No hid for less
lhan $19.70 per M hd. ft. for the
marked Douglas Fir, 7.R0 per M

bd. ft. for the marked Western
Hemlock. fi.5ft per M bd. ft. for
the marked 1nrene Cedar, or a

Intal purrbase prtce of $5.fi24.7.
will he considered. Minimum de-

posit with hid S700.00. All timber
designated for rutting on Lot
iNE'iNE'.t. Lot 2(NWi4NE'i. Lot
3 N E ' N ' , . Lot 4 N W N W ' ' ,

Ni,SWi,NWi(. Ser. 1. T. 1ft S.. R.
'

7 W., W.M.. estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to he 27ft M hd.
ft. marked Douglas Fir. No bid
for less than $22 9ft per M bd, fl.
for the marked Doughs Fir, or a

total purrhase price of Sfi.lR3.on,
will he considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid $750.00.
No. 911. Jan. ?a. 195.1.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
NOTICE IS HERBY GIVEN tba

Ihe undersigned has been appoint-
ed Administratrix of Ihe Estate of
LFO R. WOODS, derea-rd- . by he
Cirrtiit Court of Lane County, Ore-

gon.
All persons having claims acain!

said estate are hereby notified to
present the same duly verified and

1th Ihe proper vouchers to the
undersigned at Suite Hamp-
ton Building, filft Willamette street,
Eugene, Oregon, within six months
of the date of Ihe first publication
nf thts notire.

Date of the first publication of
Ihls notice Is Januarv 21. 1953.

JOAN WOODS
Administratrix as aforesaid.

S. A. SORENSON.
Suite Hampton Building,
filO Willamette Street,
Eugene, Oregon,
Attornrv.
No. 94fi. Feb. 1ft. 195.1

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR LANE
COUNTY

No. 42.1HR

Suit In Equity
ARVHJ.A WEN DEL,

Plaintiff
-

HERMAN WEND EL,
Defendant

TO: HERMAN W'ENDEL. Defend-
ant, and C. E. Lurkey. District
Attorney for Lane County, Ore-

gon.
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE

OF OREGON: You are hereby
summoned and required to appear
and answer the Amended and

Supplemental Complaint filed
against you In the above entitled
suit, on or before the last dav of
toe time prescribed In the order of

publication, On or before
Ihe th dav of Feb. 195.1. and If
vou fail to so appear and answer
for want thereof, the FlatnHf will
apply to the above entitled CuM
for the relief praved for In the
Complaint,

For a Decree granting Plaintiff
an absntute divorce from the Pe.
fendam. and granting to plaintiff
lh rustodv and control of the
minor child of the parties,
Gloria Jean Wandel, and ordering
he Defendant to pav the Plain-

tiff for the support of said minor
child the wm of I50.W per month,
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Copies of Schools
Report Available

Copies of the stapled, mimeo-

graphed annual report of the Eu-

gene Public Schools are available
either at schools in the district or
at the administration building,
school officials said this week.

This year, the report is divided
Into a spr)inn of statistical inform-
ation to provide comparisons with
other first class districts nf the
state, a section of the basic story
of what the schools are doing and
attempting to do through academic
work and other activities, and a
financial report of the district.

Interspersed with text material
are pictures nf school activities.
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u(lw down payment
v'l'.le, M.4,a. err
na. and hlV. 7l.(

el E..Cene(-- r

mTTFlRFAT
Premium . . 70.
Ftrt Oualltv ,v
Second Qualltv . .. mr
BITTER (Wholesale Prices)
A Prints " 7
A. Prints TV
EGG (Rut In Price)

AA Sir
Large A

" 47,.
Medium AA 4A-"Medium A . 45r
Smll A S5r
Large Thccks , . .tne
FOGS (Wholesale In Retailers)
Fxtra 1arg AA . nyf
Extra lrge A . . . . -

Large A A or
Large A ... jmP
Medium AA ... 57,.
Medtiim A . . .

50c
FGGS (Pnhllr Market, retail)Fxtra Larse AA 7?e
Large A A 7
Lrse A Jr
Medium AA .. " H7c
Medium A ........ . " (Wp

mal A nc
POI t.TRV (Swifts RiiTlng Price)
No, colored hens. 4 lh and tip 2V
No. Leghorn hens, .1'i lh and up IV
No. I colored friers, lbs. 7jrNo. colored roasters. 4 lbs. and itr- 2rNo. colored springs. 3 lbs, and tip 2f
rocks and Stags ,v
No. 2 pnuim, 4c under above pricesNo peultrv. of ahoe prices
POVt.RTV (NW httlng prices
No. I colored hens, at tvjght 2.V
No. I Lechorns. all weights
No colored spring frvers ,Mc
TU.I.OTV
TMow ....... Jc
Greate .

BRK
Csrrara, Ih, drv .. " ivHrv (",ra pe Root !h c
HtPFS vn wool.
Lamb r Short Wool . " " 1Sc

on Wool 4"Mohair. 12 mo. clipped . v
... ir

W Rrf
Light Reef '

K'p (Ir"

ihireail M y?l,was a mell; J ,t

Sh

?Cene: M,and Wr. T

'A;
and nelhert S ...

.m ires
,.

)r, rarrell
'
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. nrr nutnann;ROSS BRATTAIN and OTTILIE
PRATTAIN. his wfr: pA,UL
BRATTAIN and JANE D O F

wash each piece with "hand-done- " perfection

Famous G.E. Activator washing action washes

clothes piece by piece . . . fast spin out drying
. . . Fabri-Fle- x control . . . Small load selector

1 year warranty plus 4 years on transmission.

open n rliargt m'ouiit
& use our easy payment plan.

n ine

Funeral IWg-- ,
Funeralfc...

Portland Grain

pn,ii iai, nis wife; LESLIE
BRATTAIN and JANE DO F,
RR ATTAIN, his wif,: VIRGIL
BRATTAIN and JANE DOE
PRATTAIN. his wife; EDGAR H
BR ATT MN; ARTHUR BRAT
TAIN and JANE DOE BR ATTAIN
?4,vS,ri0HV FILLER and
NIKOLAI OLSFN and JANE DOE
OLSKN, his wife; CHAS E
WREN and JANE DOF. W RF.n'
J11' tVIr; J' s MILLER a'nd
Vi'i'l I MILLER, hi. wife;

OLIVER GLOVFR- C
Rl NYARD and JANE DOE

his wtfe; R. r. WRIGHT
and JANE DOE WRIGHT, his
wife; and all other persons or
parties unknown claiming anv
right, title, estai. 1P or )r,trM,In (be real tte described Inthe Complain herein; ,dunknown heirs of anv deceaseddefendant.

Defer, rl,n
IN THE NAME OF THE STATEOF ORFGON, , h,to TZ

quired to appear and answer 'h
Complaint f,ifrt against vo., m theabove entitled nut (thin fourMl Weeks frorr, ,nf rt, ftf ,hi

1 PfbHrition of summons.
If olt f,, to n appearanswer, fe.r tt,nt

tiff Mlt. pplv to thMhMsS

Hd'siR-'V- l

nti mm m mfi ftMirif"'- - j

(r

PORTLAND (P) Wheat hid lo
msrket. hast No. ( bulk, rtrlh "rcriroat. soft white 111 7. mft hiti tfV
eluding Rex ? it'i. Whit "tiHard Red Wlrt'.r
pr cnt 2.42; 11 per rent J J, ij p rcent 7.41

Hard White Paart orrjinn 74; to
pr cot 3 J, M pr rem ? M 'rcent 2M

Or receipts: heat j. flour J. corn
4; rats J; mill feed S.

U mJJJlHU W nJM
1203 willmt W W W ooen M. .ve.

your GENERAL EUCTRIC deolcr Sanlton nvf rirfufs that
nf w (pf, new sheep,

ELECTRIC CLEANERS
1210 Willimptte Pl.int.ff',.-
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