
f tent fifty sewins kits tn t-- i.
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Wed., Nov. 21, 1951 Page 1 1.ifOfS I nQnS Air Base in Calif., one of the last

y ,. received at the stopping points for men leaving
said Executor at 415 Medical Center
Building. Eugene, Oregon, within six
months from November 21. 19M,

HANS C. NIELSEN.
Executor of the Last Will and

nfl o.j Pross office, for overseas. Several r,,,.
Bethel Water
Election Set

BETHEL The annual Bethel
WntAf nietri.t ...ill Un

Planning Play Lost & round 150

SMITH Joan Rae Smith. Funeral
services will be held at

Chapel Friday,
Nov. 23. 1951 at 1 p.m. Rev.
Ellsworth Tilton officiating with
interment in Laurel Hill

. reUH'. . M tarv in- -! j. t ...

NEW YORK STOCKS

SELECTED LIST
Beporud bv Paattf A UarihftB

Not. 1. 1931

H.
COTTAGE GROVE The three- -PJrit from Vn maQe Dy lne volunteers were sent

rnar"mentTr 7temV Ft- - fvton, Wash. Military
r;:jcii personnel sent the letters of

Testament of DORTHEA
NIELSEN. Deceased.
RAY AND PENNINGTON
Attorneys for Estate.

No, 177 Dec. 19. 1951,

LOST: Tan male Pekingese.
White chest, white front feet.
Named Snuffy. Please call

2695 Chambers St.
Reward.

act comedy, "Cheaper By the Doz-

en." will be Drespntprt h held Monday, Dec. 3, at the BethelU Jgn ..niimteers made and' thanks. tin U.. u u:i , . .

DOW JOKES CLOSING AVER AGESl
30 Industrials 158 32 oti .56.
2ft Rails 79.97 off .27.
15 Utilities 46.50 off .OS.

NYSE SELECTED LIST:
uj uic mgn scnooi junior Class.

The play is dramatized from a
bOOk WrittPn hv rrnma fill- -

LOST: female Siamese cat. Re

WICAL Ward D. Wical. The fu-
neral service will take place at
the Poole-Lars- Chapel Friday,
Nov. 23, at 11 a.m.. Dr. Vance
H. Webster officiating. Inter-
ment at West Lawn.

, cent abdominal surgery. Im-

portant return to 1970',4 Co-
lumbia. Ph.

breth Carey and' Frank Gilbreth,Jr. Mrs. Ethel Krauss is directing

tire Station.
Two water commissioners are to

be elected. One commissioner will
fill out the two years unexpired
term of C. H. Strong, who has
moved away from the district. The

.second commissioner will serve
five years, filling the expired term
of J. H. Sorensen. Petitions are
available at the water district
office for anyone wishing to file

FOUND: Big Sorrel work horse.me piay, wnich includes a cast of
wnite strip on lace, owner may
have by paying for feed. Ph.

eves.

ID.
The cast includes Bill Veatch,

Catherine Heath, Carmen Grew- -

FORE Robert John Fore. Funeral
services will be conducted at 2
p.m. Friday, Nov. 23 at Veatch
Hollingsworth England Funeral
home with interment in West
Lawn Cemetery.

FOUND Brown leather wallet.fraight Kentucky Bourbon
in nil its fflnw f

elle, Bob Tank, Warren Wilson,
Neal Hoeate. Ha

Admiral
Air Hcd
Al Chem
Al Stores
Am Airl
Am Can
Am Car
Am Gai
Am Loco
Am Rdtr
Am Smelt
Am Tel
Am Tob
Am Wool
Anaconda
An
Annco
Armour
Asoc DO
Atchison
Avco
Bal Ohio
Rendix AV
Beth Stl
Boeing
Borg War
Bucyrus
Bur Ad M
Cdn Pac
Celanese

Owner's initials ar? A. O. F.
Identify & claim at Richfield
Truck terminal or Ph.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN. That

the Administrator with the Will Annexed
of the Estate of John M. Hams, de-
ceased, has filed his Final Account in
said estate in the Circuit Court of the
State of Oregon for Line County, and
the Court Ji.is appointed the 3rd day of
January. 1952. at 10:00 o'clock a.m. of
said day in the Circuit Court Room in
the Court House in Eugene, Oregon, for
the hearing of objections to such Final
Account and settlement of said estate.

JOHN L. BARBER, Jr.
Attorney and Administrator

of said Estate.
No. 178 Dec. 19, 1951.

"NOTICE" OF SALE
NOTICE la HEREBY GIVEN That the

undersigned Administratrix, by virtue
of an order ninde by the Circuit Court
of the State of Oregon for Lane County,
in the matter of the estate of VERNON
P. BACKEBKRtl, Deceased, on the 23rd
day of October. 19.il, will, from and
after the 3iMh day of November. 1951.
sell at private sale all of the following
described premises,The Lots Numbered Three (31 and
Four (41 in Block Numbered Four
i4) of Dixon and Jarnagm's Addition
to the City of Coburg. Lane County,
Oregon.
The terms of said sale to be either

cash or part cash and part credit.
Bids may be submitted to the under-

signed at the office of Husband. Fort &
Johnson, 72 West Broadway. Eugene,Orecon.

Dated this 30th day of October. 1951.
LELA F. OLSEN. Administratrix

Funeral Directors 125
Powell, Betsy Woodard, Joyce
Thun, Phyllis McKay, Ruth Cos-to- n,

Jerry Harrison, Marvin Hayes,
Rosemary Rickard and Joel Pynch.

LOST: A ladies brown billfold

for the office.
Also appearing on the election

ballot will be a two mill levy to
finance the fire department re-

building program which will ex-
tend over a five year period;

FUNERAL HOME
Junction City Harrlsburg

Ph. Ph. 42

Nov. 16 betw. 19th & Mill St
Park Ave. Papers badly needqd.
Phone or

x.ioise irosoy is assistant
and Ida Coston is prompter. FOUND: YOUNG EWE. Call forEUGENE CREMATORIUM

1100 Charnelton PhoneIT'S LIRE HAYING at T. Frastad, Rd. 4, Box 352
on Fox Hollow Rd.

The Mount Cenis tunnel from
Italy to France under .Col de Fre-j-

is eight miles lone and was STRAYED from my pasture,
SIMON - LOUNSBURY Mortuary

"Parking Adjoining Mortuary"
1152 Olive St. Dial white lace cow. none

completed in 1871.
200Business PropertyVEATCH HOLLINGSWORTH

ENGLAND FUNERAL HOME
Ph. Pearl St. at 10th YOUR TERMS .

23j Lockheed 20i
251! Liiews IS1
P9. Long-Be- 37
3d't Lor Hard 22
15's McKMon 39T

107 M & M Wood U',
35 M.ick IS.!
56i Gl Martin Ulj20 Mont Ward fiP'i,15'i Nash 19
93l Ntl Bis 30 l.

lftci' Ntl Dist 31l
60J4 Ntl Gpsm 4
AQ Ntl Lead 2B1

M'i Ntl Steel 53l4
NY Cent IB1

384 No Am AV IB
IV u No Pac S91
20 Oliver 34ai
731' Pac Gas 34

7 Packard 4'i
18'i Pan Am Air H1
53s Paramount
49la Penney fl6Ji
43 Pcnn RR 17' 4
62' Pepsi 9'a
24J4 Pfner 36J
17J Pro Gam 65

30, Pure Oil 54'.
47 Radio 21Ta
3.V. Rep Steel 43
13 Rexall 6'
42st Reynolds 33
fiti'a Ritchfield S6
36' Rbtshw Fl I7S4
33l St. Regis 16si
22 1 Safeway 3P
15i Schenley 32'4
16a Sears SB1!

fiJg Sinclair 40.
69' 4 Socony ' 34
40'g Sou Co 12
4834 Sou Pac xd 5yilOi Sou Ry 49'a
.SS'a Sperry 32la

101 i, Spiegel 10a.
R4 Std O Cat 504
2fl Std O NJ 69V,
4(is, Studcbkr SPi.
241! Sunray 20j14 Swift 331,
17', Texas 52'a
ST1 Textron IB1
S5r$ Tidewater
40 Transam 20 s,
49s, TWA 22
42i Tw Cen Fox 20',
1834 Un Carbide 54',i
1U, Un Oil 3BL3
351 Un Pac 98 U

Untd Aire 30
Xd 53' 4 Untd Airl 30si

5(l, Untd Fruit 6P,
33 US Rubber B9
40', US Steel 39'
4fi', H Walker SP4
157, Wes Union 39T,
B81 Westinsh 38la
23'3 Willys 81,
88', Wilson IZ'i
33'4 WoolwQTth 43'4

St. Paul
1st. Paul Pr
Chrysler
Climax

ICluett
:Col Fuel
Coht Gai
Vultee

jCont Mtr
Corn Prod
Crane

INSURED SAVINGS

Save or Borrow

mveats
tlXi J) AGAIN

YOU name the down payment.
oi tne wiate of vernon .

Deceased.
No. 150 Nov. 28. 195L

POOLE-LARSE- N FUNERAL
HOME

1100 Charnelton PhoneNOTICE OF FINAL SKTTT.F.MP.VT
Notice is hereby given that Barbara

Brown and Roherta .Te.in Rrown. as

WITH A

LOCALLY
OWNED

INSTITUTION
SCHWERING & ENGLAND

CHAPEL
Creswell 1st & C St. Ph. 317itj i

joint executricea of the estate of Mar-
garet M. Grown (same person as Mar-
garet Merrill Brownl. deceased, have
filed their Final Account, and the Cir-
cuit Court of the State of Oregon for
the County of Lane has fixed Thursdaythe 29th day of November. 1051, at the
hour of 9:;0 o'clock in the forenoon of

Per
Annnm

BARTHOLOMEW-BUEL- L

CHAPEL
Springfield 6th & B Ph.

Total price is sie.buu. .Down-
town Eugene Willamette St.
business lot. FULL DEPTH. One
of the last CLOSE-I- sites
available. Investigate NOW. Ask
for Dave Van Fossen. '

"It must be good if
we recommend it."

EUGENE COMMUNITY
BUILDERS, Realtors

259 East 10th. Dial
RESTURANT & RECREATION

for lease or for sale. Near Meri-
dian Dam Site. Gd. deal. E. J.
Eckes, Box 73, Lowell, Oregon.

msmr imgi DirectedVEs. SIX. S said day, in circuit court room no. i at
the Conntv Court House in F.ucene.MEN YOU KNOW I Florists 130Lane County, Oregon, as the time and
place for hearing of objections to such
Final Account, and the settlement there
of. All objections must be filed on or

FUNERAL WORK Our Specialty.
Fiowers by Tommy Williams,
Ph. 2088 7. 15th Ave.

Cro ZCH
Curt Wrl
Douslas
Dow Chem
DuPont
East Airl
Eastman
El Boat
Emerson
Erie
Firestn
Gen Elee
Gen Foods
Gen Mtrs
Glidden
Goodyear
Gt Wes Sug
Greyhnd
Homestk
Hudson
III Cent
Inland
Int Harv
Int Nick
Int Paper
Int Tel
Johns Man
Jones La
Kennrscott
Lib Owens

oeiore sain aate.
Dated this 24th day of October, 1951.

Personals 140

m jj fio Button Sbou-- m Ear

ImfKWlU! No tffort-- no slrain- -

MONO.PAC ing Write, phone or
Om.Unlt come in for full infor

tawing Aid mation.

S. C. MITCHELL
LOCAL DEALER

75 W. Brdwr. Dial
Sir. Mitchell la with J. N. Tait itAssoc. of Portland.

Fresh Batteries and Cords
for all hrarlna atds.

Hear Gabriel Reattrr OTer
KOBE Mondays at d p.m.

naruara urown
Roberta Jean Brown

Joint executricea
HARRIS. BUTLER it HUSK
Attorneys Rental Property for Sale 205BRAKE SPECIAL
No. 142 Nov, 21. lfl.M. APT. HOUSE BY OWNER

Using "Brake Doctor" equipmentADVERTISEMENT FOR SALE OF CITY 4 large 2 bdrm. apts. each hasOf S.U Li r,?i t, HAKfKUrr li.IH.UVt.'
MF.NT BONDS. SERIES "F"

Written sealed bids will be received
for the purchase of $ifi3, 527.13 or nan
croft Improvement Bonds. Scries "F". A

148 EUGENE MEDICAL CENTER

tne LAitsi in Draxe reiin-in- g

equipment.

Hydraulic Brakes $14
(includes labor, lining,

bleeding, & adjustment)
LOAN CAR !

Dependable Auto Service
905 West 1st Ph.

firepl., hdwd. lirs., dining rra.,
own heating system, hot water
tank, large store rm. & gar.,
new wash room. All bldg. In
good cond. Excel, downtown
business location. Present in-

come $290 mo. Price $28,750,
terms. Phone

Legals
TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED STATES

the office of the City Recorder In the
City of Eugene. Oregon, until 10 a.m.
on Monday. December 10. 1951. at which
tmie and i!ace said bids shall be opened
publicly and at 7:30 p.m. of said day
will be considered and the bonds award-
ed by the Common Council of the City
of Eugene, Snid bonds will be dated
January 1. 1952. and shall be In serial
form and In denomination, of
each except U:zt the first bond shall be

UEPAHTMBNT Or THE INTERIOR.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT.
Timber marked, or otherwise deslanated
for cutting, will be offered for sale as TONI VAN ORNUM'S personal

counsel service is ior tn ais- -
criminating individual who

in an amount or $527.13 nnri which issue
of bonds Shall mature in numerical order
and In 10 succeeding annual Installments
as follows: A first installment in the

FOUR close-i- n rentals. Take In
$200 per month. Price $11,500.
Right on the edge of the busi-
ness district and within walk-
ing distance of the university.
Call or evenings.
Ask for John Vogcl. DOWN-
TOWN REALTY. 755 Willam-
ette St.

seeks to overcome his problem.
Ooen classes at 8 p.m. Mon.amount of $10,327.13 on one year

from date of issue, thereafter eight "Psycho-Analyzin- g for Happierannual installments In the amnunt
Tuesday, jnov. zu. "Are

you, a Pleasant Experience?"
Tuesday & Thursday, 1 to 3 p.m.
"Healing the 'Incurable.'" Ph.

2424 Charnelton.

oi si7.DO0.un each and and final
installment 'n .the amount of $17,000.00
and shall bear interest at a rate or at
rates not to exceed B'J- per annum, pay-
able and subject to re-
demption In numerical order on interest

dates on or after January 1.
a nnmiiitn nnii Inlnr.cl n.,ihl In

Enjoy the luxury
only in true Bourbon.

.;

iouows. btALJD bids win uo received
on tracts listed as (SEALED BID) until
3:00 p.m.. PACIFIC STANDARD TIME,
on December 11. 1051. by the Regional
Administrator. Bureau of Land Man-- n

cement, Building No. 1. Swan Island.
Portland 18. Orecon. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS will be received on tracts listed
ns l ORAL AUCTION! by an authorized
representative of the Bureau of Land
Management, located at Room 212, Post
Office Building. Eugene. Oregon, sale
starting at 10:30 A.M.. PACIFIC STAND-
ARD TIME, on December 13, 19M. In-
formation concerning the conditions of
sale, including such Items as the quali-
fications of bidders, the procedure for
submitting bids, the amount of the Ini-
tial deposit and subsequent payments,
the kind and amount of bond, operat-
ing restrictions and the availability of
access, should be obtained prior to the
sale from the Regional Administrator.
Portland, Oregon, or from the Bureau
of Land Management Forest District Of-
fices. The volumes Riven below are

Just completed, the most attract
lawful money of the United States .of

MINERS (Hard Rock)

WANTED

IN BUTTE, MONTANA

Apply to Your Nearest

State Employment Office for Information

Anaconda Copper Mining Co.

Butte, Montana

America at me omce of trie uity Trea-
surer. Eugene, Oregon. Said bonds will
be sold for the highest price obtainable
but not for less than par and accrued
Interest. A certified check eaual to 2

NOW you don't havo to wear Bi-

focals. Have smooth effortless
sight for all occupations with
Beach Blended Lenses. No di-

viding lines to confuse you.
Sold exclusively by Dr. Elliott,
Optometrist, 62 W. 10th.

of the price bid must accompany bid as

tive in tugene. neniea
now at $387.50 per mo. Ideal
for retiring, will sell or trade
for other property, Ph.
or

WHY PAY RENT? LET YOUR,
APARTMENTS DO IT! Ncvv

duplex tor sale. Close to stores,
bus, & school. $12,500. Oakleigh
Lane, off River Rd. Ph.

fo taste, lightness and
moothness Old Stagg
lisn't a rival! Aged Q years

And it' only

evmence oi gooa iaiin on me pari nr
the bidder. The bid must contain a no-
tation of the total interest cost of thestanding timber estimates. IN LANE

L'UUWIV: UKrJtiUiN: blUSUAW HlVtK
MARKETING AREA: SEALED BID: T.
19 S.. R. 5 W.. W.M.. See. 7. all timber

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS
Friendly house group meets Thuri,

8:30 p.m. Phone Willamdesignated for cutting on SE'SW1,, Lot

issue and the effective rate inder the
terms of the bids. The right is reserved
to reject any and all bids. Sale of bonds
authorized and directed by Ordinance
9897 of the City of Eugene. Oregon.

Dated at Eugene, Oregon, this 20th dayof November. 1051.
HEN It Y F. BEISTEL,

City Recorder,
No. 17ft Nov. 23, 1951.

ette St. Group, 657 Willamette Lots & Homesites 210
metis tn. :3u p.m. (Deginners)and Sunday 2 p.m. (open). Ph.

or

taw ',,sw '4ft esumaiea tor me
of this sale to be 3220 M. feet

Douglas fir, 15 M. feet Western Hem-
lock. 10 M. feet Western Red Cedar.
No bid for less than $26.00 per M. ft.
B.M. for Douglas fir. $8.45 per M.ft.B.M.
for Western Hemlock. $1.15 per M.ft.B.
M. for Western Red Cedar, or a
ft. B.M. for Western Red Cedar, or n

NATIONAL FOREST TIMBER FOR SALE
Oral auction bids will be received by the ANY GIRL In trouble needln a

total purchase price of $83.9 IB. 25, will
be considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $(,.395.00. ORAL AUCTION: T. 15 S.,

friendly adviser, write the Sal-
vation Army, White Shield
Home, P.O. Box 3916, Portland
3, Oregon, or telephone Beacon

regional loresicr or nis auinnrizen repre-
sentative at the office of the forest su-
pervisor, New Postoffice Building, Eu-
gene. Oregon, begginnlng at 2:00 p.m.,
Pacific Standard Time December 28. 1051
for all the live timber marked nr ries-,iw.nimniriieiiT iodkbon whisket. the suee cistiliins co., frankfokt. khiuckt n. w ., w.iyi.. ec. iif, an umoer

for cuttlna on Lot MNE'iNE1) 10.1Z.Lot 8(NWVNE'I, Lot 7 ISWUNEU) Lot
BiSE'NE'i, estimated for the purpose

ignated for cutting and all merchantable
dead timber located on an area em-
bracing about .Klfl nercfl within Sec (ionsnr. mis saie in do ju.iu m.icci uoutnas

fir, 30 M. feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet jj. i. 24 ana zh. t. 20 h.. m. 4
and section IB. T. 20 S.. R. 5 R. W.
Salmon Creek drainage, Willamette Nawestern itcd uedar. no old for less tn.m

$24.70 per M. ft, B.M. for Douglas fir.
$7.(13 Per M.ft.B. M. for Hemlock. IS. 90

WHY NOT
PLACE THAT AD

DIAL
tional r or est. Oregon, estimated to ne
23,970.000 board feet, more or less, of
Douglas-fi- 9O.000 hoard feet, more or
lexs. of Western white and sugar nine.
430.000 board feet, more or less, of West-
ern redcedar and 3.730.000 loard feet,
more or less, of weslern hemlock and
other species of sawtimber. No bid of
less than JlT.fln per M board Joct for
Douglas-fir- . J17.80 per M board feet for

"A REAL HOME COOKED
THANKSGIVING DINNER!"
PRICED FOR FAMILIES.

THE TOWN HOUSE
1811 Hwy. 99 N. Phone 4- 39

Buy Homesites Now
South, East and West of

Eugene and Springfield we have
a limited number of half-ac- re

and acre tracts still for sale,
when these are gone you never
again will be able to buy as
cheaply or on as easy terms. $23
Cash, $25 for 4 months then $15
per month until paid for will
buy you '.

80 X 242 N.E. of Springfield fqr
$600 to $750 with city water;

100X176 ONE & HALF miles Wes
of Willamette High School for
$500.

HALF ACRE ACROSS FERRV
Street B.ridge for $750. "

ACRE TRACT OFF ROUTE F, 7
miles West of Eugene for $500;

85 X 185 OFF 99 HIWY NORTfl
with city water for $750.

ACRE TRACT NEAR McKENZIjt
Highway rolling timbered for
$400;

5 ACRE LEVEL TIMBER TRACT
near Elmlra, $750;

9 ACRE TIMBERED TRACT
near Elmlra for $900.

We are headquarters for country"
homesites at prices and terms a
working mnn can meet, all are
approved for septic tanks. See
Mr. or Mrs. Eugene Florence or
Frank Kinney, Subdlvider, 910
Oak Street.

western wnlie and sugar pine. 34.3a per
M honrd feet for WMlrrn riHriH9r and

COME to our Rummage Sale at
25 W. 7th, upstairs. We have
men's warm coats & good shoes.
Sales continue during month of
Nov. St. Mary's Altar Society.Wl'iri me Type of ensinb.

THE. IMOUSmyt SMHQING TO I

$2.40 per M board feet for western hem-
lock and other speriea will be consid-
ered. In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage. a cooperative deposit of JO. 05
per M board feet to be used by the For-
est Service for paying a part of the cost
of slash disposal, and n cooperative de-
posit of 10.25 per M board feet, to cover
the cost of tree planting, seed sowing
and timber stand improvement work on
the area cut over, for the total cut of
sawtimher under the terma of the agree-
ment, wilt he required. As a qualifica-
tion for oral hfdding, all bidders must
submit a sealed bid accompanied by the
required payment to ihc forent super-
visor, prior to 2:00 p.m.. Pacific Stand-a-

Time. Decemhcr 2R, 10.M. Sealed bids
will be nofitrd at the beginning of the
auction for the information of all bid-
ders. $150,000.00 must accompany each
hid, to he applied on the purchase price,refunded, or retained In part as liqui-
dated damages, according to the condi-
tions of sale. If an oral bid Is declared
to be high at the closing of the .auction.
the hidrier mint Immirlfnldv confirm tl.

PERSONS interested in buying a
harpsichord, clavichord, virgin-
al, lute or psaltery, write Reg.
Guard Box 223. No sales ex- -
cept to qualified persons,

RUMMAGE CENTER
'YES, 3 MOKE MAKEA& .

IN THE PASTS YEARS!

YOUCAN paymohe...
OUT YOU CANT BU BETTER

'POM'S VS SELLS POt HUNOPEDS

less than most sores'

FRI. & SAT. Dates AVAILABLE
31 W. 7th Ph.MM REWEAVING'FOHDi BUILT NEAPLV

a MILLION tl

per M.ft.B. M. for Western Red Cedar,
or a total purchase price of $75,129.50.
will be considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $7,515.00. T. lfl S.. R. fl W., W.
M.. Sec. 19. all timber designated for
cutting on E'iSW". W'.iSE'. estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be 2160
M. feet Douglas fir. 55 M. feet Hemlock.
12.1 M. feet Western Red Cedar. No bid
for less than $25.40 per M. ft. B.M. for
Douglas fir. $B.95 per M.ft.B. M. for Hem-
lock, $8.15 per M. ft. B.M. for Western Red
Cedar, or a tota,l purchnse price of

will be considered. Minimum de-
posit with bid $5,640.00. T. 18 .S., R. 7
W., W.M.. Sec. 35. all timber designated
for cutting on Lot HNE',NE', Lot
2iNW"4NX,'). Lot 3NE'NW". Lot
4 N W i N W i , Lot 5 SW V.N W . Lot
B'SE''4.NWV4), Lot 7iSW'4NE'l. Lot R

fSE'.NES". Lot 10iN'iNW'SE.'l, Lot
estimated for the

purpose of this sale to be 7880 M. feet
Douglas fir 265, M. fret Hemlock. 225
M. feet Western Red Cedar, 1232 Lineal
feet Western Red Cedar poles. No bid
for loss than $30.00 per M.ft.B. M, for
Douglas fir, $0.40 per M. ft. B.M. for Hem-
lock, $fl.30 per M. ft, B.M. for Western
Rod Cedar, $.0.1 per Lin. ft. for Western
Red Cedar poles, or a total purchase
price of $240,820,10, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid $24,085.00.
T. 19 S.. R. 6 W.. W.M., Sec. 27. all
timber designated for cutting on EViE'i-NE'-

estimated for the purpose of this
snle to be 225 M. feet Marked Douglas
fir. No bid for less than $23.90 prr
M.ft.B M., or a total purchase price of
$5.377 50, will be considered. Minimum
depofit with bid $650.00. T. 19 S.. R. A

W., W.M.. Sec. 11. all timber designated
for cutting on SE'.iSEU. estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be $35 M.feet
Douglas fir, J5 M. feet Hemlock. 15 M.
feet Western Red Cedar. No bid for less
than $22.25 per M. ft. B.M. for Douglas
fir. $6.55 per M. ft. B.M. for Hemlock.

ri.B5 per M. ft. B.M. for Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price of $14.-- !
314.75, will bes considered. Minimum de-- !
posit with bid $1,435.00. T. 20 S., R. B

W W.M.. Sec. 15. all timber designated
for cutting on SW't, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 1585 M.feet.
Douglas fir. 20 M. feet Hemlock. M.
feet Western Red Cedar. No bid for lens!
than $26.95 per M. ft. B.M. for Douglas
fir. $7.95 per M.ft.B. M. for Hemlock,
$7.70 per M. ft. B.M. for Western Red Ce-
dar, or a total purchase price of

will be considered. Minimum de-
posit wllh bid $4,360.00, ORAL AUC-
TION: UPPER WILLAMETTE MARK

AREA: T. 22 S., R. 3 W., W.M.. Sec.
19, All timber designated for cutting on
E'NW4, Lot llNWi'.NWHI, estimated
for the purpose of thH sale to be 40A0
M.feet Douala fir. IK M feet Hxmlnrk

Burns, snags, tears, moth holes,i wan YErPOHD BUILDS THE ONLYV-- any tVDO Garment. Guaranteed. HOME PLANS ;

WE SPECIALIZE IN;
IN THE E FIELD I" 'irk THE TYPE OP ENGINE

YOUlL UNO IN THE
Erma Applewhite. 1060 High.oral bid by submitting It in writing onWW

WORKING DRAWINGS with deMOST EXPENSIVE CAPS I' a forest hid form. The right to
rejert any and all bids Is reserved. For-
est Service bid forms for use in submit-
ting sealed bids and full Information con
cerning the timber, the conditions of

NOT responsible for bills other
than those contracted by myself.

Wilma Inman.
DOROTHY'S DAY NURSERY

IN Spfld. Exp. child care. State
lie. Ph. 546 'F' St.. Spfld.

signing, drafting & specification
guides. F.H.A. & V.A. approved
plans.

STOCK PLANS available for
economical one, two or three
bedroom homes at a reduced
cost. Many to choose from. .

sale and the auhmlssion of bids should
be obtained from the regional forester.
Portland, Oregon, forest supervisor. Eu-
gene, Oregon, or the district ranger,

Oregon, before bids are
No. 17ft Dec. S, 1951.

DENTAL PLATE REPAIR. Dr.
Harry Homier. Dentist, corner
Bth and Willamette. Eugene, Ore. REAL ESTATE for those whoPUBLISHER'S NOTICE

2 BARBERS to serve you at CarlMEMBER OF THE ASSOCIATED PRESS
The Associated Press la entitled ex-

clusively tit thm of roniihllratlnn nf Hcrenaeens uarner Hnop. 2Utn
St. Super Mart. Free Parking.all the local news printed In this news- -

wish to buy or sell.
EUGENE DEVELOPMENT ;

CENTER i
Real Estate & Home Planning,

Service i
110 E. 12th St. Dial Day!

or Eve. & Sun,

pa pot wen as an news aisnatcnei. ST. MARYS' Rummage Sale at
25 W. 7th, upstairs, lasts until
Dec. 1st. We have everything.

suwauui'UOH IIA J t3
By Carrier, monthly .... 1.50
By Carrier. 6 mos In advance, ft 00
By Carrier, yearly tn advance 10,00
Bv Mail, in Oregon, one month M0
Ry Mall In Oregon, three months 3.75
By Mail, In Oregon, fl months . fl.50
By Mall. In Oregon, one year 12 00
Bv Mall, nut nf lUt. on month 1.7

PERSONAL & confidential ad "HOME" BUILDERS ivice on any problem you may
have. Phone for appt. ATTENTION fMail subscriptions In carrier delivered

lores are charged umi rate ai that for WE HAVE nice residential build.FOR ESTIMATES on reliable
rarrlei Hellverv ing lots, subdivisions, view lots.

Many to choose from. (,lira teoar. .m. ipci incense No
auto repair, phone Sun.
ft Eves, phone

June Hood free-han- d textile
115Death Notices

SEE US If you wish house plan!
JONES Eldon Jones of Orick,

nin tor less man sz.f.30 per M.n.tj.M.
for Douglas fir. $8.35 prr M. ft. B.M for
Hemlock, $R10 per M.ft.B M. for White
Fir and Western Red Cedar. $6.80 perM.ft.R.M. for Inren Crrlnr. nr fnlal

""XWATK MIVE IS TWO DRIVES

"""'ITSTHf
NEWEST, SMOOTHEST.

AUTOMATIC DRIVE OF ALU

painting. Jo order. Ph.ftirdomiTlk Drrn, optional al tifra corf, tmihblt vflfc V t onfn
tqwpmm, vceutorit end km to thaw wttneirf fiottm & Oregon State Football

made to order. :

EUGENE DEVELOPMENT '
CENTER '.

Real Estate & Home Planningtickets lor sale.
service

110 E. 12th Dial Day
Eve. & Sun!

purchase price of $95,156.73. will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with hid
$9.52000. SEALED BID: UPPER WIL-
LAMETTE MARKETING AREA: T. 23 S .
R. 1 W.. W.M.. Sec. 13. all timber designat-
ed for cutting on SW'NE1.. SE'NW"4
estimated tnr the purpose of this sale
to be 210 M. feet Marked Douglas fir,
30 M. feet Marked Hemlock. No bid for
less than $33.55 per M ft B.M. for Marked
Douglas fir. $13,70 per M.ft.B M. for
Marked Hemlock, or a total purchase

or
BUSINESS LOT " T

IN NEW AREA FULL OF NICE

A REAL opportunity for a com17ITH FOllDOMATIC DRIVE S iince oi win ne ronimerea.Minimum deposit with hid $850.00.
No. 175 November 2ft. J A.M.

Jfvn Convtrt., I
munity market, wult trying t
buck competition. Buy and bultit
your own store in a new area'
with 600 new homes and nq'
place to trade. Be first and renii
this harvest, See E. H. Peterson
Peterson Mtg. Co.

'MWMATIC HAS BOW

TREES top., trim., remove.
ExpL men. Phone

Loit & Found 150
LOSTf Blackr coin purse in Spfld!

with $30 cash. Phono
Reward
PLACE THAT AD TODAY?

REGISTER GUARD CLASSIF.ED
DEPT. Just dial.5-155- 1, ask for a
helpfuladtakcr.'
LOST: l'k yr. old Hereford heifer.

A. C. Holverson, Rt. 5, Box 211,
Eugene, Ore.

FOUND near McDonald theatre
lady's wrist watch. Sat, nitc.
Owner call and identify.

LOST Pair of ladies brown al-

ligator shoes. Please return to
1192 High St., Apt. 1. Reward.

LOST from 3430 Pattison. Lgc!
orange colored, long haired male
cat. Please ph.

LOST Leather, sheep-line- d

Jacket on St. Mary's playground
Nnv.9, PJJ-175- 4.

LOST: 750 x 20" truck "tire &

1 I

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
AH pemnnn having claims acnlnit theestate of JOHN DEXTER PATTEN, de-

ceased, are hereby notified that the un-
dersigned has been annolnted a the Ex-
ecutrix of the I,al Will am' Tentament
of sAld decedent by the Circuit Court
of the State of Oregon for Lane County,
and that nuh claims, with Oie proper
voucher, ihoiild be presented to in id
Executrix at 415 Medical Center Build-
ing, E'Jgene. Oregon, within tix month!
from Octnher 23. 171,1.

EMILY CORSON PATTEN, Ex-
ecutrix of the Lat Will and

nf JOHN DEXTER PAT-
TEN. Deceard.
PAY AND PENNINGTON,
Attorneys for Estate,

No. HI Nov. 21. 1MI.

ummiK mil linniJj jOstium Hotel Bldg. Ph.

Fordomatic Drive does more

things for you, more smoothly
than any other automatic drive.
Fordomatic is two drives in one,
combining the best features of
earlier automatics. You get the
smooth flow of power of Fluid

Torque Convener . . . the GO of
Automatic Mechanical Gears . . .

plus the savings of having the exact

power you need, when you need itl

HOME BUILDERS ;
ATTENTION .w 4

Lai., died as a result of a logging
accident at Areata, Cal., on Nov.
19, J951, at the ago of 35. He
was born Aug. 24, 1918, at Cot-

tage Grove. He married Eloise
Russum, June 26, 19.18, at Cot-

tage Grove. He is survived by
his wife and 2 children: Steven
Eldon and Paula Carolyn; his
father and mother, Mr. and Mrs.
Floyd Jones of Cottage Grove;
2 brothers and 3 sisters: Carlos
of Cottage Grove, Harold of
I.oranc, Celia Scott of Creswell,
Helen Thomas of Coos Bay,
Mary Ray of Cottage Grove.
Funeral servires will be held
Friday. Nov. 23 at 2:30 p.m. at
Mills Mortuary, Ri.v. Clark F.nz.

officiating, interment in Brum- -
baugh Cemetery.

PROTI1KRO Ruth Ann "Prothero
of 1290 Dalton Dr. died Monday,
Nov. 19, 1951 at the age of 45.
She was born June 25, 1906 in
Kansas City, Mo. and had lived
in Eugene for the past 16 years.
She was a member of the Evan-
geline Chapter of the Eastern
Star and the Zulcima Temple
No. 13. Daughters of the Nile,
and the Brotherhood of Railway
clerks. Surviving are her hus-

band, Vaughn D. Prothero; her
mother, Mrs. Jennie B. Creagcr:
1 brother, Jack H. Creaccr nf
of Eugene,. 1 brother, Jack H.
Creagcr of Medford, Ore. Funer-
al servjees will be conducted at
Veatch Hollingsworth England
Funeral Home Fri. Nov. 23. 1951
at 4 p.m. with the Daughters of
the Nile In chnrgo of final rites
and inlerment in Host Haven
Memorial Park,

WE HAVE nice residential build
ing lots, subdivisions, view lots..
Many to choose from.

SEE US if you wish house plans
NOTICE OF HEAR INC, ON flNAL

ACCOUNT
NOTICR lfl HKRCRY OlVEN that the

Administratrix with Will annexed, Helen
O. Camnbell, hai filed her Final Acrount
In the r.late of Karl S. Albert. flecfad.
In the eirrult court of the Slate of Ore
gon or Ln couniv, wnicn couri n'

Come In and 'TfSf DRIVE" it today!

made to order. r
EUGENE '

DEVELOPMENT CENTER 1

REAL ESTATE HOME I

PLANNING SERVICE '
110 E. 12th Dial Days oI

Eve. A Sun,.
CHOICE i.6fIN RESTRICTED'

PIONEER- PIKE FOR SALE I
City water A paved st. ,

Court room. Lane County Court Howe.
Eugene, Oregon, as the time and rilare
it will hear objections there'o and in
final aettlement of laid etate.

Rihert H. Goodwin,
Attorney for EMate.

No. 11 November 21. 19.M.

NrvrifF'. to rnF.TiTTrRQKENDALL MOTOR COMPANY

wheel, Wed. near Jasper. Call

LOST: 2 sm. yellow kittens "on
Park Ave. Childrcns pets. Ph.

STRAYED from 1045 W. 18th
Place Blue Cairn terrier. Ans.

Jo Mac. Reward. Ph.
LOST; Billfold at Copplngs, 7

p.m., Saturday. Reward, Phone

ljn. eves.AH perionn having claims againit the
estate of DORTHEA H. NIELSEN,

are herebv notifted that the
ha been annolnted j the"FORD SQUARE'

(Where Olive Crosses 13th)

CLOSE in lots. Wtr. A elec. Easy
terms. Inquire 1130 Mill St.
Spfld. Ph;7-231- 3.

LOT 70x110. Good loc. Water A'
sewer. $1000. Phono 1

r.xecutor or the ijsi will and i ei- -

iron) nf xnlti rterertfnt hv the Clrrufl'
Court oi the State ni Oregon for Ln
f'nwntv. and that mtrh elutms. With theEugene, OregonDial
proper voucher ihenM b prtatnttd to


