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AUCTIONEERSLISTEN IN
8:1V8:J0 KFJR.4 Buis talk iy
, Robert Mount. v
8:30-8:4- 5 KFJB. Radio code elass con- -

dncted by AshleyilMxon. .
8:43-9:3- KTBR. Ktndio program.
9 ;00-- 1 0 :00 K W. Tenet iaa hoar. ,
9:30-10-0- 0 KTBB. Dr. Hinckley's har- -

ntonisers.
10:-ia:0- 0 KOW. McKlroy'a orchestra.
10:OO-ll- : KTBR.: Studio program.

30f3lc; Pekia whita dacka 20e; eol-- l
ored nominal.; turkeys

4
liv nominal ;

d reused He. ;
. Onient steady ; . local $3.75 7.
' Potatoes steady; $1.50(31-8- 5 aaek.

CHICAGO WHEAT
CHICAGO, Mav 7. (AP) Whaat

acored an upturn of as much aa 3 3--

buKhel today after a suddau break at the
start. .

An unexpected setback in Liverpool
quotations caused the initial drop here,
btrf unfavorable crop advices from the
touthwi-k- t and adverte weather north-
west led to a quick right about faoo.

Wheat closed firm. o to le net
higher, corn 1-- to 5-- c off, and oats 5 8e
to lc up. .

'CALL FOR BIDS
- Notice is hereby given that the

Common Council of the City of
Salem.. Oregon, invites Bealed bids
for the rnaking ef an improvement
'on Warner street in the City of
Salem, Marion county. Oregon,
from the south line of Hunt street
to the south line of Progress Ad-

dition, with
6 inch cement concrete pave-

ment;
; 4 inch cement concrete baseband

2 Inch wearing surface;

f- 3 CALL FOR BUDS
Notice is hereby givW that the

Common Council of Tthe City of
Salem, Oregon, invitea sealed bids
for tte making of an fmprovement
on North 13th street; in the City
of Salem. Marion county, Oregon,
from f.he north line of Nebraska
Avenue-- to the south curb line of
Frickey street, with

6 inclv cement concrete pave-
ment; .

4-- inch cement concrete base and
inch wearing surface; f

4 inch cement cond-et- e base and
1,4 inch wearing surface; '

v x: 1 t li art -

cert; :43, Presbyterian ehnreh service.
CVCT Victoria (829). 7, organ recital;

7:35. cathedral service.
KFI Los Angeles (467). 6. trie; 7,

Aeolian orran concert; S, clauit hoar;
- 9. N. B. C. procrum; 10, orchestra. .

KUO Oakland (361).) 6:30 Little ym- -

phony orchestra ; 7 :30, Presbyterian
church service: 9, N. B. C. program.

KKX Hollywood (337). fi:30, Unitarian
ehnreh service; 7. concert oeehestra
and-orga- n recital; 1.

KMTK Hollywood (.170). 5:30,- - male
quartet; 6:15, 6:30, 7f -- dance orcbes- -

'tra f 8. -

KKWI San Francisco (2."). 7..VJ, Chrt
tian f8cience church service.

KOMO Seattle (30). .7.""", Christian
Science church ervic;; 9, N. It. C. pro- -

gram.
KTAB Oakland (303. 7:13. Baptist

chnrch service.
KYA Kan Francisco (400). 7:30 Meth-

odist church -- service.
KHJ I An-el- e (403). 7, Methodist

Vhorcb service : 8.
KFHfJ lios Ancelcs dir.). 6:30. hand

csncert and choir; H, revival bervice;
10, organ concert.

MONDAY MORNING'
10:00 1 1 :O0--K;- Household

help and ttiuhir.
10:00-11:0- KX1. (3a), .Morning my

sic.
19:00 ll'oo Kr'WV (1). IToidc Beau

STnTDAT
10:00-11:0- 0 JCXL (380). Morning mu- -

18. - . , "

10:55-12:3- 0 KOW (491). Services from
the First Presbyterian church.

11:00-13:8-0 KXU 8rfici from the
first Methodist choren

11:00-L2::M- ) KY.X (242. Service from
Westminster Presbyterian church.

12:OO-l;0- KFWV (Tip. Organ con
cert.

2:00-8:0- 0 KXL. Jlmnic.
4:O0-3:- 0 KXL. quartet.

- fcstndto program.
fi:0OV:0O KXL. Twilite music.' , - V SUNDAY NIGHT
6:00-7:0-0 KFW'V. Dancer orchestra.

' :00-7:0- 0 KOIN S1V). OrRati concert.
0:SO-J-a KKX. The REX trie.
7 Misha Pel orclie

trov- - - V'" ' . ..:
7:9e-:0- 0 KUW. tiorvice from Ilinson

Memorial Haftit rhorch.
7:MHr:O0 KOIN. Hervices from ' the

first Chtirch of Chrbt. Scientist.
H:OO-9:0- 0 .KKX. "Famuli Composers"

hour. ,

9 :'WU Ht Ml) KG W. X. B. C. program.
9.O0.1O:M KOIN. ; Mischa IVUorcl.es- -

tre. ' .
9:00.9:30 KKX. Catholic truth society

. . .
10:OU-1-1 : KOft'. Little symphony or

ehestra and Dorothy lewia, contralto.
10:H ll:00 KfUN. Philharmonic en

ml,h. .
- . -

Kk'WO A Talon (2tl). 6. ehiwtes; 6:30.
: orchestra and rebroadcastR ; 8, concert;

- t:r6- - - -- ..

K?KO Rant a Monica 238K 6:15, Lutb
t ei'en church services; 7, organ concert;

9. ra.
.

XPO-jjS- an Francisco (428)..6. orchestra;
s8:4o. orchestra: 8:35. orchestra: 9. N.

i

a 4lCV prorram.
XA Spokane (341). 7:30, Presbyterian

church service.
KroX Long Beach (832). 6, 6:15, con

cert orchotra; 7. 7:43. Christian Sci
ene church service; 9. frolic.

.KfWlh-vHollywe- od (23). 8:30, 9.
and soloists. "

KOA Denver (322). 5t30, dinner con

Chicken Dinners

it --.Wednesday and Saturday
at the

; Black Cat . Restaurant

ISO
Sontb, I V Half

I j . BlockLiberty Ci tfV from
Street State

tiful hour.
I 12 : KKX fjfi). Psttie CnWk ;

morning entertainment.
Il:oo !:(0 KOIN :M1. Housewife'

hour.
MONDAY AFTERNOON .

ir:00 KFKC 2."'J). Weather reports.
12:10 12:20 KKX. Popular orchestra

muftic.
12:30-1:3- 0 KCW. Xoon concert;
U:00-3:00- r KXU Music
2:00-3:0- KKX. Tea party.
3:00.-- 4 :00 KOIN". Xew, music.
4 :0O-- :O0 K Vr'A '. M us i.
4 :30-- :tn Twil.te hour.
3:1 6:0(prKKX. Postman Uill'e chil-

dren's program.
MONDAY NIGIJT

6:00-7:0- 0 KOIN (319). Organ couert.
0:10-7:00- - KTBR (tr,3). Music.. .

6:OOH:0O KFWV (2lff). --Vmuiement
guide.

6 :00-- fl0 KRW (291). Dinner concert.
6:00-7:0- ( KXI. (389). Music,.
o:0O-6:3- KKX 24'Z), News, markets

adn time signal.
6:30-7:3- 0 KKX. The KKX trio.
7:00-7:3- KXI-i- . Son hits.
7:00-7:3- KOIN. Amusement guide.
700-7:3- KGW. Concert trio and so

loist, r
7:00 7:30 KTBP Health talk! T
7:30-9- : 15 KFJ Ft f263). KveninJt 0

KXI.. Kllen Swearengen so- -

pruio.
7:30-8:0- KGW. I'tility service and
.talk.

7:30-8i0- KKX. Webfoot crier.
8;00-10:3- 0 KFWV. Studio program.
8:00-10:0- 0 KOIN. Studio program.
8:00-8:4- 3 KXU Janet Mansfield play,--

ers.
8:00 9:00 KGW. N. B. C. program.
8:00-9:0- KEX. Voice, violin and

piano rcfcital.

rWeT "( - J

slQsasfcSsssti

Electric Welding on the Job
If i& often quicker and
more economical to take
the Electric Welding Ma-

chine pictured here to
the job than it is to bring
the job to the shop. Ask
us or phone 372. We have
.the most complete weld- -
'ing service in the city, both electric and acetylene.

C D. OPPEN
695 Mill Street Phone 372 or 2086-- J

, An Oppen Weld Has Always Held

6 inch cement concrete base and
bituminous wearing surface; :

St-ndar- Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on file
in the office of the Citji Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th day of JJIity. 1927.
at or about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting in the tf ty hall in
Salem. Oregon. Each bqd submit-
ted must be accompaniead by a cer-
tified check equal in anvount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid.
The City reserves the right to re-

ject any and all bids, and no bid-de- tr

will be permitted to withdraw,
mckdify or' explain hisj bid.

This notice is published for five
successive days in a daily news
paper published in the City of Sa-

lem Oregon, the date of the first
publication being May ben, 1921.

MY POTTLSEN, City .Recorder
m

CALL FOR BIDS
Notice is htereby given that tie

Common Council of the City of
Salem, Oregon, invites seajed bids
for the making of an improvement
on South Cottage street in the City
of Salem, Marion county, Oregon,
from the south line of Electric
Avenue to the north curb line of
Hoyt street, wiih .

, 6 inch . cement concrete pave
ment;

4 inch cement concrete base and
2 inch wearing surface;

4 inch cement concrete base and
1 inch wearing surface;

6 inch cement concrete base, and
a bituminous wearing surface;

Standard Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on' file
in the office of the City Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after, the 16th day of, May, 1927,
at or about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
counail meeting in the city hall in
Salem, Oregon. Each bid submit-
ted must be accompanied by a cer-
tified check equal in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid.
The City reserves the right to re-
ject any and all bide, and bo bid-
der will be permitted to withdraw,
modify or explain his bid.

This notice is published for five
successive days in a daily news-
paper published in the, City of Sa-Je- m,

Oregon, the date of the first
publication being May 5th, 1927.

M. POULSEN, City Recorder,
m

NOTICE OF EXEClTTOIt'S
APPOINTMEVT

Notice is hereby givein that the
undersigned has been! duly ap
pointed by the County Court of the
State of Oregon for the'County of
Marion, as Executor of; the last
will and testament and. estate of
Fred G. Blumhart, deceased, and
that he has duly qualified as such
executor; all persons having
claims against the estate of said
decedent are hereby notified to
present the same, duly verified to
me. at the office of Ronald C.
Glover, my attorney, 203 Oregon
Building, Salem, Marion County,
Oregon, within six months from
the date of this notice

Dated at Salem, Oregon, this
26th day of April, 1927.

W. A. LISTON,
Executor of the last will and testa

ment of Fred G. Blumhart, de-
ceased .

Ronald C. Glover.
Attorney for Executor,

Salem, Oregon.
a27m4-8-18-2- 5

Exclusive

Mptoring
Business

F.N. Wood ry
ll J . NliD a laaili. .

and fnrnitur. taij1610 N. 511 "--XO KICK ON MY SERVICE"
' " 2epr22tt

H. F. Woodry & Son
" OT. Cash paid forfuraitura. Store 271 If. Com'U75. Agents for Lang Rsnrw.

AUTO TOPS
SEE US FOR TOP AND PAINT VKrT," " op i Paitfj.S. Commercial SalAit

BATTERY & ELECTRICIAN A

R. D. BARTON - - EXIDK BATTERIF.S
Starter and generator work; zwtsouth High.

Tel. 19
COURT BT.

JOK WILLIAMS
VIjEENER ELECTRIC CO. HOUR

wiring by honr or contract. Eatimate
'n'mshed Tl. 0 471 Oourt fH.

BTCYCLlES A REPARXQ 8
U)TD E. RAMSDEN COLUMBIA BI-cyel-

and repairing. 887 Ooart.

HELP WANTED 9
KI LL OR PART TIM K SAI.KSPKOPI.E

can make hs mnv sellins individ-
ually monoerammed Cliriktma& card to
all classes of busings, prof essi.nal and

people.. Write today! applying,
for free satniijef., ccuniilete infurrastion
and exrlusive territory. PROCESS-EN-

RAVING lOMl'A.NY, Troy, at 21st
street. Cliicaffo. "i 9mS

$100.00 OR BETTER PER WEEK TO
ladies and eentlnnen to demonstrsta
most Juarvelous invention. Every
home interested. Householders M""--

CLEOLI, 619 Olive Los Angelas.
Calif. 9'2 1

HELP WANTED Male It
SALESMEN NEW SALES PLAN

year . - round seller 10 to ?2o daily
possible. All stores will handle ev-
erybody uses. Realtv Bliij.,

Ky. Umayi
APPRENTICE WANTED HULL'S TOP

shop, 169 S. Com'l. )llmay3tf
WANTED A LIVE NEWSPAPER SUB- -

seriptton canvasser. Call Circulates
Manager. Ststesmsn office. : llmlltl

SALESMEN 12
TWO SUITS FOR 8U9.50 LARGE SAM- -

- pies, 10 by28 inches, douelpd: chev-
iots, ca'ssimeres. pencil stripes, pnwdi-- r

blues, fancy- worsteds, etc.. atUfactimi
Tuaranteed; collect ami k4a each

sale. .John Bond Co.. 710 W. Jk,n.. Chicago. H

SPECIALTY. SALESMEN gUAI.IEIKK
for position "making l.f'i niontliiy.
New electric siffn. Extt'lnl 4 f.ior
over sidtiwalk, Jllumin-iN-t- l letters nl
border. Sel'.ine on sicnt at K j
commission. ELAS11TKIP, U li llu,i-- .

son C!iicnzv - 12.-n-

HELP WANTED Female 13

FIRST CLASS STENOGRAPHER AN--

boakWeeper. Uox il0 c;ir tatmsh.
KSmavlU

LAHIES MAKE .2r. to WEEKLt
addressing cards at home experienm
unnecessary. '2c stamp lrin;s full
particulars! H. Lijlity, New Cat!--- .

In.lionH. i:ini

AGENTS WANTED 14

LAIIF:S $ 23 $50 WEEKLY' EASY. Ad
dressing mail at home. tjood oppor-
tunity. No canvassing oij xperi-n'- .

Particulars '2r. stamp. llcmin Huiic'S
Service liureau, i Jlvlluod, Indiana.

CHIROPRACTORS 15

R. H. B; 8C0FIELD P.j 8. 80(
First National Bank Bldg.;

OR. o. L. SCOTT. PSC CHIROPRACT01
256 N. High. Tel. 828-- or 87.

FLORISTS 10

CUT FLOWEK8. WEDDINO BOUQDETf
Funeral wreathe, aecoreuona, u. r.

Breithaupt. florist, 612 Bute St.
Tel. 880.

INSURANCE 18

TOR BALE FIRST AND SECOND Mort
gages. Trust Deeds, uoaireeta o

honsee Will net 6 to 80.
BECKE HENDRICKS

Heilig Bldg., 189 N. High St. Ji t!

FARM LOANS PLENTT OF MONK I
to loan on rood farm security.
CITT LOAN8 We sre loaning Pru-

dential Insurance Company money oa
city residence -- and business property
at 5H, prae a commission. Hswkioi
A, Roberts, Ine 205 Oregon BaiMmg

Insure
Tent home or ear new.

' ; Phone 11' BECKE HENDRICKS
HeiUg Bldg.. 189 N. High St.

II tf
WANTED Employment 18

MAN AND WIFE WISH RANCH WORK.
Man take- - work in or out m m"
437 S-- Com'l. (J. Waldron. 19mayll

JOB AS CHAUFFEUR OR TRCCK
driving. Box 966, care j Statesman

19may3

SEWING IS MY HOME OR YOURS
10-J8-- - 19may

CONTRACTOR ,' We specialise in repair, garages sna
out bu3dings. Oravaa. Tel. 1.

LANDSCAPE GARDENING ASD CON

etructioa work oontraete. Tel. 08:
Cook. 19May30

TOR GARDEN PLOWING.BA8EMENT
digging and teem work. TeL 1,

FOR RENT 2

STORE ROOM FOR ROT 0TER"
street, between Front
formerly occupied by W ithers
820 a month. Iaquire at Bf","
office.

v FOR RENT Apartment 23

rrRVisHKU ; 2 AND 3ROOM AITS
Heated. 444 S. Hisb- - 23m vi

OPPOSITE HUNT'SAPARTMENTS, 23mayl'canary. 110 Divjsion.

FOR- - RENT FOUR ROOM rL RNISH

Apartment $S0 Two room $-- 5. bev
room modern boM! 83. Fivero""'

Wood. -- 311 tM. ..20 F. L. 23m;i

MODERN. WELL ismv
Apt. Lerge and lojht. Ipr ' J

FOR RENT Itoonia

SLtEPINC .BOOMi.iu;e FRONT
day, week or month.

i . 2.may
N. Liberty.

. ll.TI.
ROOM8.WITH BOARD AT Jc.B.keta.

ender. TeL 1539; 10", 23,p,2itf

ROOM FOR) BEfITIMjiMD,E g1"!"
t ealy. Teiep"""" " . g;r i."

laemeaeve.

, FOR KXT--By

HOIJOm.,18 ROOM
'235 Division eL

190 S- - Church. a 27mayl

r ra sr r r sr X4 jt ji r jr

AOTICK JF SALK OF READ
KSTATK

Notice is hereby given that tfci
undersigned will receive sealed 2
bids up to 2 o'clock p. m. Thurs-
day, Juno 2, 1927. at his office in
the Capitol building for the sal
ofa tract of land adjoining Centei
street on the Booth and bounded a
by 21st and 24th streets. Saiem,
Oregon, containing approximately
13.7S acres, more or less. Said
property now owned by the State
of Oregon. . - '

The terms of the sale are cash
upon completion of. the transfer,
and all bids must be accompanied
by s certified check," payable to
Carle Abrams, secretary Oregon
Stale Board of Control, in the
amount of Jt,000. 00 as evidence
of good faith and guarantee of
performance by the bidder. The
right' is reserved to reject any or
all bids.

The legal ' description of this
property may be secured acd the
plat of same inspected at the office
of the undersigned.

, CARLE ABRAMS. Secretary,
Oregon State Board of Control,

a 24; m

CAMi-FO- R BIDS
Notice Is hereby given that the

Common Council of the City of
Salem, Oregon, invites sealed bids
for the making of an improvement
on Columbia street in the City of
Salem, Marion county, Oregon,
from the east line of Myrtle Ave-
nue to the east line of William-
son's Addition, with

6 inch cement concrete pave-
ment;

4 inch cement concrete bade and
2 inch wearing surface;

4 inch cement concrete base and
1 inch wearing-surface- ;

- 6 inch cement concrete base and
a bituminous wearing surface;

Standard Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on file
in the office of the City Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th day of May, 1927,
at or about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting in the city hall in
Salem, Oregon. Each bid submit
ted must be accompanied by a cer
tified check equal in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid
The- - City reserves the right to re-
ject any and all bids, and no bid
der will be permitted to withdraw,
modify or explain his bid.

This notice is published for five
successive days in a daily news-
paper published in the City of Sa-
lem, Oregon, the date of the first
publication being May 5th. 1927.

M. POULSEN, City Recorder,
m

HOTEL
GILMORE

By. the Sea
" -r -

Nye Beach
Newport, Oregon

;.:Neyvp6rt! Service Station
v i , , 'Hir Service"
At" junction ot Roosevelt and

Newport-Cbrvall- is Highway
KELLANbGlLKKY, PROPS.

CRANE COTTAGES
3 blocks K. of Postoffice

t Box; 43, Newport - -

REST COTTAGES
Furnhdiedr: Wood. Lights,

.. Water, Pre; ' ,
'

,. v iBo 456, Newport :

PANAMA COTTAGES
Sox 68S. Kewport.

4 inch cement concrete base and
1 V& inch wearfDji, surface;

6 inch cement concrete base and
a bituminous wearing surface;

Standard Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on file
in the office of the City Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th ray of May. 1927.
at or about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting in the city hall in
Salem, Oregon. Each bid submit-
ted must be accompanied by a cer-
tified check equal in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid.
The City reserves the right to re-
ject any and all bids, and no bid-
der will be permitted to withdraw,
modify or explain his bid.

This notice is published for five.
successive days in a daily news-
paper published in the City of Sa-
lem. Oregon, the date of the first
publication being May Eth, 1927.
r M. POULSEN, City Recorder,

m

CALL FOR BIDS
Notice is hereby given that the

Common Council of the City of
Salem, Oregon, invites sealed bids
for the making of an improvement
on Market street, in the City of
Salem, Marion county, Oregon,
from the east line of Eighteenth
street to the east line of city
limits, with
, 6 inch cement concrete pave
ment;

; 4 inch cement concrete base and
2 inch wearing surface;

4 inch cement concrete base and
1 inch wearing surface;

6 inch cement concrete base and
a bituminous wearing surface

Standard Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on file
iri the office of the City Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th day of May, 1927,
at or about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting in the city hall in
Salem. Oregon. Each bid submit
ted must be accompanied by a cer-
tified check equal in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid
The City reserves the right to re
ject any and all bids, and no bid
der will be permitted to withdraw.
modify or explain bis bid.

This notice is published for five
successive days in a daily news-
paper published in the City oinSa- -
lem, Oregon, the date of the first
publication being May 5th, 1927.

v M. POULSEN, City Recorder.
. m

--O
General Markets 1

LIVESTOCK
I'ORTIVXI). Ore.. May 7. (AP)

Receipts fur week: Approximately, U027
cattli-- , :70 calves, ;i"8.'i hogs, 36-1- ghecp.

buttle o m pari' ci week ago: Hec
htccrs and niont she stock 15 to 25c low
cr. Close, best kinds bulls and vealers
hteady; extreme top best fed steers
iMO.lo; load lots fat cows $7.75, with
heifers up to $.:0; hulk prices; slaugh
tcr steers $8. .(? lo : fat cows So.i'.jfiii
7.75: heifern. $7(n.25; low cotters, and
cutters $3.50 j 5.25 ; medium bulls $5 25

aod and choice vealers $ll(a'
12.50.

Hogs Compared week ago: Filling
classes li to Aoc higher; leeding P'S
25 to 50c lower; killing demand fairly
dependable throughout week ; late top
Iiht butchers $10.8.: bulk 150 to 190
ponnd averages $10. 50f; 10.75 ; 200 to
240 pound averages $10.2510.50: feed
ing pigs $11.50 down, most packers $7
61)7.50.

Sheep Compared week ago: Spring
Jambs ;0 to toe lower; other price lit-
tle changed; edge off market, however.
tsetit springers late .fI4.2.; shorn year
ling lamb up to few clipped ewes

PROVISIONS
PORTIAXI. Ore.. May 7. (.VP)

Hid v. to farmers. Milk steady, raw milk
(4 per cent I $2.25 cwt. f. o. b. Portland
Itutterfat 40e f. o. b. Portland.

Poultry hteady; heavy hens 25 (5 20c;
iigiit ;uw .lc; springs nominal broilers

Evening

Fabrics NOW-IN- I

i. uax ;
POKTL.VXD. Ore., May 7. (AP)

fay buying prices: Eastern Oregon tim
othy $JlfiJBf io vatly 1 7 Wll.a";
heat iSM.O; alfalfa HW !.:; "t

hay I4.S0; oat and vetch 16.jOW 17:
Rtraw $8.50 per ton. Kelliuz price
ton more.r Salem Market
OBAIN ...

No. 1,, wheat, white .: fi.oi
(. wheat, sacked 1 127

Oats, per bn. milling .53
PORK, MUTTON AKD BEEP

lop hogs ....... iv a

Sowa .o
Top etcers . .00
Cow f6
Bulla 03.05
1027 lambs, onder 66 lbs 12M
Top Uva veal , ,.073- -

llresaed veal .1'
Dressed pigs .IS

POUXTET
Light hens .18
Heavy hens .. .C2
Broilers i.. : ; 28
Roosters : 06.08

EGOS, BUTTER, BUTTEEPAT
Standards i .18
Pound . .12
Kutterfat i . .41
Cream b utter: - .431 .44

VXGETABIJJS . "
Vegetables, beets, sacked .05
Onions., dex. bunches .90
N w Cabbage .07

2.2S
California lettuce, crate $.50
Local onions . .4 14 .05

CALL FOR BIDS
Notice is hereby given that the

Common Council of, the City of
Salem, Oregon, invites sealed bids
for the making of an improvement
on Laurel Avenue in the City of
Salem, Marion county, Oregon,
from the north line of South street
to the south curb line of Highland
Avenue, with

6 inch cement concrete pave
ment; '

4 inch cement concrete base and
2 inch wearing, surface;

4 inch cement concrete base and
lYst inch wearing surface;

6 inch cement concrete base and
a bituminous wearing surface;

Standard Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on file
in the office of the City Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th day of May. 1927,
at or about S o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting in the city hall in
Salem, Oregon. Each bid submit
led must be accompanied by a cer
tified check equal in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid
The City reserves the right to re
ject any and all bids, and no bid
der will be permitted to withdraw.
modify or explain his bid.

This notice is published for five
successive days in a daily news
paper published in the City of Sa
lem, Oregon,, the: date of the first
publication being May 5th, 1927.

M. POULSEN, City Recorder
m

CALL FOR BIDS ,
Notice is hereby given .that the

Common Council of the City of
Salem Oregon, invites, sealed bids
for the making of an improvement
on Wilson street in the City of
Salem, Marion county, Oregon
from the west Iine.pf Commercial
street to the east curb line of John
street, with

6 inch, cement concrete pave
ment;

4 inch cement concrete base and
2 inch wearing surface;

4 inch cement concrete base and
1 inch wearing surface;

6 inch cement concrete base and
a bituminous wearing surface;

Standard Bitulithic pavement;
in accordance with the plans,
specifications and estimates on file
in the office of the City Recorder
which are hereby referred to and
made a part of this notice.

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th day ot May, 1927
at or about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting in the city hall in
Salem, Oregon. Each bid submit
ted must be accompanied by a cer
titled check equal in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid
The City reserves the right to re
ject any and all bids, and no bid
der will be permitted to withdraw
modify or explain his bid.

This notice Is published for five
successive days in a daily news
paper published in the City of Sa
lem, Oregon, the date of the first
publication beins Mav Eth. 1927.

m: POULSEN, City Recorder
m

CALL FOR BIDS
Notice is hereby given that the

Common Council of the City of
Salem, Oregon, invites sealed bids
for the making of an improvement
on Norway street in the City of
Salem, Marion county, 'Oregon,
from the west line of 5th street to
the east curb line of Broadway
street, with

- 6 inch cement concrete pave-
ment; -

4 in'ch cement concrete base and
2 inch wearing surface;

4 inch cement concrete base and
1V4 inch wearing Bur face;

- 6 inch cement concrete base and
bituminous wearing, surface;
Standard Bitulithic pavement;

in accordance : with the plans,
specifications and estimates' on file
in. the office of the City Recorder,
which are hereby referred to and
made 'a part of ibis notice.,

Said bids will be opened on or
after the 16th day of May 1927,
at pr about 8 o'clock p. m. in open
council meeting. In the city hall in
Salem, Oregon. . Each bid submit-
ted must be accompanied by a cer-
tified check eqrial in amount to ten
per cent of the amount of the bid.
The City reserves the right to re-
ject any and, all bids, and no bid-
der will be permitted to withdraw,
modify or explain.-hi-s bid. '
i .This notice is pabllahed for .five
successive days- - in a daily 'news-
paper pnblisted in tke. City-o- t Sa-
lem,' Oregon tb.d ate. of the-- first
publication being May 6th. 1927.

M,. POULSEN, City Recorder.
m ,

Spend Your Vacation at the

Newport Beaches

New First National

Bank Building
t

Directory
J

BASEMENT '

De Iitixe-SBJains- T' PsirJo- r-
Bxperte for Ladle, and Oentlamea.

EKTBAKCB

Ted Cigar Stand
Ted Irwin, Proprietor.

SECOND FLOOR

Coffey's Photo Service
Tel. 708. Over the Bpe

THIRD FLOOR

Morris Optical Co., 301-302-3-

or. Henry E. Morni, uptometrut.
Telephone 239

0. F. GUlette .Bolt Sli
Lawyer Telephone 1056

Bocolofskv It Son. TeL 970 . 304-30- 1

Real Estate. Loans, insurance
FOURTK FLOOR

Drs. O'NeUl fc Bnrdette, Opiomstrlsta
Phons 625

Onarflsa BnUdlng k lou Association
O. Bayford Ely 413 Telephone 7P7

Wlllaxd H. Wins and Paol T. Bnrrla
Attorneys. 410-4111- 2 Tel. 181

Lane Morley. 413. TeL 757; Bern. 1916--
Real Eatate Loana Inenraace

SIXTH FLOOR

deo. b. Vehrs, M. D, PnysleUa Sargec
Sntts 603. TeL 2378-237- 9; ea. 77

Bobln S. Day and Donald W. MUea
Attorneys st Law

Telephone 183. , 10-11-- U

E. F. Smith. New York Life.
Boom 613. Telephone 193

EIGHTH FLOO- R-

Dr. O. Ward Davis. General Dentistry
Telephone 816. Open Evenings. Boob 803

Dr. H. B. Scofleld : 1 .806
Chiropractor. Vearooalosaeter Bertloo

t. N. Sanders, M. D Physician ft Burgeon
Salt 810. Telephone o6; Bee. 234f

NINTH FLOOR

Dr. H. M. Brown. Eye, Ear, JTose Thro
Specialist. . - Butte 90.

TENTH FLOOR

Dr. W. A. Johnson,' Dentist
telephone 1286 ., .lot:

Chslmer Lee Ooorgs, D. D. B.
General Dentistry

B. M. Ortffln, D. D. 8., Orthodontia
Telephone 181. Butte 1002-10-

UNION ROSTER
HOD CARRIERS AND BUILDINO LA

borera Local No. 441, meets Wed., 8
p. m. Call 179 for men;

CAPITOL TYPOGRAPHICAL , UNI0
No. 210 President, O. P. .Evens; see
retary, M. D. Pilkenton. MeeU see
ond Saturday, 8 p. m.

CARPENTERS' UNION SO. 1065
Meets Than, evening. Berbers Hale
president; Wra. Pettit, secretary
bkilled mechanics furnished. TeL 179

SALEM UNION LABEL LEAGUE
Meets at Labor Hall on eall ot presi-
dent. F. W. Sears,' secretary B01
443, Salem. Ore.

I LODGE ROSTER
S
K.NIOHTS OP PYTHIAS MEETS AT

MeOoraack Hall, over Miller's Store,
every Saturday evening. P. J. Toose,
CO.; H. R. Burke, K. of R. 8. Tel
1319--

0REAU ESTATE 1

DIRECTORY 1

BECKE k HENDRICKS
189 N High. TeL 169.

LEE W. BELL
603 Bank of Commerce Bldg. TeL 484

BOHRNSTEDT PATNB
147 N. Commercial. Telephone 577.

P. W, GE1SER
441 Court. Telephone 2819.

W. G. KRCEGER
147 N. Com'l, Rm. 1. TaL I1T.

JOHN W. ORB
Naw Bligh Bldf. TeL 2485.

GERTRUDE J. PAGB
492 N. Cottage. TeU1185.

. TRIANGLE BEALTT CO.
421 Court St. TeL 661

ULRICH ROBERTS
129 N. CommerciaL TeL 1154,

VICTOR SCHNEIDER, Baltor.
147 N. Com'L TeL 577.

SQUARE DEAL BEALTT
0. 8.. Nat l Baek Bldg. , TeL 470

Local Rates
It For Classified

TWil-- r ar RandaT
One time 2 cents per word

hree time 5 eeata per word
Pix tunee R eaata Bar word, j.il asil Dull 0 unit nasr ward

In order to earn the snore than one
time rate, advertiaiog most run in
eonsocutive issues. - a.:

No Ad taken for If, than 5e.
'Ads. run Sunday ONLT charged at

o rat. - . ; ,

- Advertleements (eseept Persoaals
and SituetionA Wanted) arm be taken
ear the telepboae if the advertiser la
a sobecriber to phone.

The Statesman will receive advee-tieemea- ts

et say tian M the day or
night. - To Insure proper olaaaifica-tio- si

Ada ahenld be-i- a boforo 7 p. as.
TELEPHONE 28 r 588 .

The Oregon Statesman
Publiebed every asorniif (exeept Moa--v

day) at Balem. the eapifl ei Oregoau

. ADVERTISING v ;a HONKER ADVERTISING Tkeee
nms must be kept free frees aoytkmf

j, of a oueetionabie setere. Misreprevee-- -

tatioaa will not be tolacated. Jnior
aaation hewing any questionable 1- -.

test en the pert el the edvertlae ;

V ahonld he reported' t tkia newvpepei
or the Salem Ad. eUb,

t I

V!
J

L

i

m WHERE THE MILLIONS GO
I)ep Sea Fishing, Agate Hunting, Boating, Horseback Riding,Jtock Oyster Digging,
Clam and Crab Fishing, Golfing, Swimming, Bathing, Roller Skating, Trout Fishing,
Dancing, Hiking.: '

? ;'yTHE SAFEST BATHING BEACH ON THE COAST" :

3uhric$

--Golf

NEWPORT NAT
Swimming in" Warm' Salt

--r, . Water

.V:-"N-
at Grill. '

1 " Excellent Service

Nyc Beach Newport, Ore.

V 1 : iCbfcrry City Cottage's T

Vr .;: .Open All Yeaf -
and they are fabrics which long out-- ,

last the season in .which they, are first

SEA CREST COTTAGES
Right at the Beach

Furnished cottages, directly
fronting ocean.

Wood, Light, Water, Auto Shed

:' t : Open all the Year

Newport, Ore., Chris Arms

TENT CITY
Cottages aiid ' tnts, furnished
except top bedding. Water,
wood, lights, free.. , , -

;
" Box 5, .Newport v ,

t AGATE BEACH. INNi -

T 'ZVt Mllee Nortb of ywport ob
Booaewit Highway, Sear Light IIease.

. ,- - - - ' -

KATHABIirs GEORGE. Proprietor.

At Beck PMtpinet

PACinO VXEW-(- Mr. OlCm Hampton)
Board b4 Koom Famished Cottages -

279 High 8C - i v'.V..

Read The Statesman f

worn.
,: Well. tailbred.ancl precisely; cut--a-ny

mahiv,any 'where 'would be.proud Jto ap-
pear in a suit froni.r

I fJU9 ifViWI ic uJ- Hgntv swater. furnished
--ar nescn. -

- For Reervtitn Addresw ... .i,

Rc .Newport '
sBBammanSmshJ. -

Beach Garage'
STe Only vireproof Storage
1

. Caragez t Newport
EVERY Alfo SERUCKI

CrmU StWty - KewporC, OrtC

x p iii
f.'cw Locked Garages Free

" With clean "cetta&es at
Whittca Canip - Newport, Ore.

D. H. MQSHER
;.v;:The4MerchahC Tailor,

'
:474 Court Street

Hot Weather


