(Continued)

780 1st st. J. WALKER, 780 FRONT ST.

LIVESTOCK

POULTRY, PIGEONS AND 87

PET STOCK

THE PROGRESSIVE HATCHERY DAY OLD CHICKS

In order to clean up our last hatches te are making a special price of \$12.50

cockerel, 860 Thompson St. East 3366.

FOR SALE—Golden pheasants. 860 Thompson St. East 3366.

Tabor 4883. Box 279, Portland.

Woodlawn 2371.

DOGS, BIRDS, PETS, ETC. 46

IRISH water spaniel dogs for sale P. M. Boose, Multnomah, Or. Main

BEAUTIFUL orange colored canaries.

YOUNG St. Andreasberg singers from imported stock. Phone C-2294.

GARAGES

PORTABLE OR READY CUT
\$34 TO \$70

CALL FOR CATALOGUE,
SAM CONNELL LUMBER CO.,
BROADWAY 149. \$54 ANKENY ST.

FOR SALE - 1916 Chevrolet Baby

Grand model. In good condition. Run 3000 miles. Price \$700, terms. Phone East 4449. J. P. Claybaugh, 913

FOR USED CARS
Come to the Covey Motor Car Co.,
21st and Washington. Main 6244.

Mfg. & Repairs, 2000 guarant'd springs in stock, prices reduced. 34 N. 15th st.

BOSCH MAGNETOS - Presto tanks. STORAGE BATTERIES, ENGINES.

OREGON AUTO EXCHANGE, 129 Lownesdale. Main 1161.

model bug auto, cash or on terms o suit. Security Storage Co., 109 4th.

ATTENTION auto buyers! Have ma-chine for sale. See it at 987 1/2 Divi-

FOR SALE-1916 Maxwell, good as new; snap for \$395. Apply owner. 530 E. Lincoln st. WHITE delivery car for sale, \$275; in first class condition. Woodiawn 3436.

SIT DOWN

YOU GOOF

OR I'LL

HIRE SOME -

CORK UP

YOUR MAP

BODY TO

DONT PASTE

HIM TILL HE

GETS OUTSIDE

IT'LL SAVE

THE GROUND

KEEPERS

SCRAPING

OFF THE

SEAT

HIM

FROM

LAHER

Grand ave.

Exceptionally fine singers guaran-

100 on high grade Barred Rock ks. 1534 F. 12th st. N. Wood, 1485

507 Mississippi ave.

HELP WANTED-MALE

(Continued) MAN and wife with no children under 14 on ranch near Fortland, man to do general farm work at \$18 per week; wife to board from 3 to 10 hired men at \$6 per week each; must have own truniture; house only thing allowed Brick bldg., hot and cold water. furniture; house only thing allowed. CX-427, Journal. Journal.

enced door machine men, sander men, planer men and stock cutters: steady work and good wages. Henry McCleary Timber Co., McCleary, Wash. EXPERIENCED Weavers and spin ners. Good wages. Steady work. weaving and spinning. Apply Port-land Woolen Mills, St. Johns, Or. WANT several laborers not over 45 years. Can earn not less than 25

r hour. Steady work all year In-ire at store department, Southern Pacific Co., Brooklyn Shops. WANTED-Experienced billing ma-chine operator for shipping office, wanted—Experienced blinds chine operator for shipping office, wholesale house. Spiendid opportunity for advancement. J-462, Journal. Wanted — Wood chopper, middle aged, married preferred, good cabin, fruit and tools furnished, E. F. O'Dell, Box 83, Gresham, Or WANTED-Good all around printer to county seat newspaper, \$750 will handle, WX-913, Journal.

MAN—About 30, to sell wholesale sup-plies direct to farmers; expenses and salary guaranteed. Give all details in first letter. A-567, Journal. HELP WANTED-MISC.

TUTO MODELLE SCHOOL - Inst moved

into our new building; it's especially

Address Y. M. C. A. department of education, Fortland, Oregon, Divi-COLLEGE preparatory school; new classes just opening for summer term. all work fully accredited. For com-plete bulletin, address Division A. V M. C. A., department of education, Portland, Oregon.

ADCOX AUTO SCHOOL, 388 Burnside at. Call or write for full information about FREE TRIAL OFFER.

HINSDALE'S COMMERCIAL School, Broadway-Yambill bldg, Reduced Broadway-Yambill bldg. Reduced prices for the summer. Positions secured.

HAWTHORNE AUTO SCHOOL, SUMMER RATES, 462 HAWTHORNE AVE.

SPECIAL SUMMER RATES, MISS DECKER'S PRIVATE BUSI-NESS COLLEGE, ALISKY BLDG, UNCALLED for tailor made suits \$3.50 Taylor the Tallor 28914 Burnside LADIES, take work home, spare time, stamping Store, 733 4 Washington.

HELP WANTED-FEMALE 2 SALESWOMEN for women's waist department. Must be thoroughly ex-perienced and have first-class references. Apply superintednt's office, to 10 a. m., Olds, Wortman & King. NEAT intelligent woman as housekeeper and care of 3-year-old girl. Parents employed. Tabor 1572, East WANTED-Married couple, lady to do few hours' chamberwork in ex-change for 2 rms. 42214 Washington. WOMAN for general housework and cooking on farm, wages, \$30. East

WANTED A reliable girl to assist with care of 2 children and second work. 753 Hoyt near 23d. WANTED-Experienced feeders and folders. Apply in person. Crystal nundry Co., 21st and Sandy road. OPERATORS for power sewing ma-chines wanted, 167 1st. Utility Gar-

WOMAN, general housework; Hood River: family 1 lady; desirable po-tion. Marshall 6170. Room 421. WANTED-A girl to assist with children at beach for board and room. hone Sellwood 1478. WANTED—Girl for general house work. Tabor 1901. WANTED-A girl, 18, prefer a school sight small family, 312 Tillamook. GENERAL housework, 6 room bunga-low, \$30 per month, 460 E. 17th N.

HELP WANTED-MALE AND FEMALE 29

RTI'DY bookkeeping, snorthand, telegraphy, salesmanship. English branches, at an accredited school. Write or phone Main 590 for catalogue; graduates guaranteed positions. Behnke-Walker Business College, 167 4th st. near Morrison. EMOLER BARDER COLLEGE Est. 1893. 80 schools. Summer rates. Pay while learning 234 Burnside st. OREGON Barber college wants men and women to learn barber trade; paid while learning teed, 233 Madison. learning; position guaran-WANTED-Teachers or reliable persons for salaried traveling positions. Call at room 523 Northwestern Bank

MOHLER Barber school, men and women to learn barber trade frea-paid while learning 38 N. 2d. cor Couch

WANTED-AGENTS

watchman or boiler fireman; long experience and best of references. Phone Woodlawn 4325. EXPERIENCED engineer wants position; will furnish small tools; good references. A-568, Journal. \$1.00 Will repair your watch no matter how hadly broken. REINGOLD'S. Jewelers, 124 Fifth st. FIRST class machinist, capable of

taking charge, open for engagement. Z-795, Journal. WANTED-Position as timekeeper and office work, railroad and lumber ex-perience. A-566, Journal.

BOSS caulker in open wooden ship yard; 37 years experience. S-443, CARPENTERING, repairing and re-modeling. Phone Tabor 234,

WANTED, garden work. Tabor 389 !. SITUATIONS -FEMALE FIRST class choc. dipper wants posi-tion as manager or lead girl in candy shop. Address Erma Knott, 903

3d ave., Seattle, Wash, WOMAN will laundry curtains; 20c pair. Phone Broadway 5434. WANTED-Work by the hour, 25c. NURSES

EAST BIDE SANITARIUM - B-2632. 859 Hatwhorne ave and 28th St. Newly furnished, pleasant home surroundings, near business center, fac-ing Burrell Heights. Modern equipment for care of general surgical and medical cases, rates \$15 to \$35 per week: special rates and accommodations to maternity cases. wishes cases of any kind. Phone East 3154.

MRS: MARY CHAPELL, nurse, moved to 213 W. Park. Main 6827.

FURNISHED ROOMS

HOTEL OCKLEY, Morrison at 10th RATES 50c day up, weekly \$2 up-Running water. Free phones and bath SAN MARCO HOTEL, MODERN RMS., BATHS, PHONES, \$2.00 AND UP. TRANSIENTS 500 UP. 422 WASH. PALACE HOTEL, 446 Washington. Rates reduced for the summer. Come d see our rooms. and see our rooms.

REDUCED rates for the summer.

Rooms am clean, well furnished and clear. Palace hotel, 446 Washington.

ROOMS and apartments in modern hotel, \$1.75 week and up. 455 Alder.

FURNISHED ROOMS

(Continued) 12.00 Up. THE BRISTOLIS MONT Strictly modern. Under new manag WANTED-For second shift, experi- Main 9375. \$1 b0 WEEK up, clean, warm modern fur, rms., central. The King, 309 Jef.

THE HAZEL-Furnished rooms, steam

heat, running water. 285 3d st. FURNISHED ROOMS PRIVATE PAMILY

with board, walking distance; \$23 per month, 255 Halsey st. East 1383 ROOMS from \$5 a month up at 234 10th st. Phone Main 1715. NICE clean furnished rooms, 474 Yamhill, cor. 14th st.

UNFURNISHED ROOMS 10 LARGE unfurnished front close in. Telephone Sellwood 735.

ROOMS AND BOARD HE WEAVER, 710 Wasn., residentia hotel, reas, rates. Private bath and ROOM and board for business girls modern conveniences, walkin ance, \$3,50 week 12 E, 7th st. E THE MANITOU, 261 18th. Homelike

ROOMS AND BOARD PRIVATE PAMILY built for this purpose; the equipment is excellent; new class rooms, laboratories, shops, details given on request. BUNGALOW home, modern conveniences, good table, cheerful surround-iss, home privileges, 1099 Garfield ome privileges. 1099 nion. Woodiawn 2025. Union. OMAN would like to care for little very best of care. M-447,

> URNISHED housekeeping rooms for rent; free bath, hot and cold water. 3 N. 20th st. ROOM with or without board for gen tleman, 54 North 16th, cor Davis

HOUSEKEEPING ROOMS PURNISHED AND UNFURNISHED ROYCREST, 175 12th, Large first floor Gem Apt. Free bath, hot, cold water,

HOUSEKEEPING ROOMS 73 PURNISHED AND UNPURNISHED PRIVATE PAMILY LARGE furn, H. K. room. Clean and light, gas, electricity. Walking dis-

light, gas, electricity. Walking dis-ance. B-2065, 166 E. 12th and Bel-NEAT housekeeping suite; also sleep ing rooms, close in; phone, bath; dults, 21 N. 11th. clean, modern H. K. rooms, different suites. For particulars call oodiawn 530.

URNISHED housekeeping rooms, 1st floor walking distance. 325 12th st. NE. 2. 8 large H. K. rooms, first LARGE H. K. room, gas, light, phone bath, \$2.50 week. 201 16th st \$6-TWO room suites, furnished housekeeping, 492 Clay.
2 H. K. rooms, furnished with everything, 718 Sandy blvd, East 7666. 6-3 LARGE outside H. K. rooms, 232 Mili st., corner 2d.

FOR RENT-HOUSES UNFURNISHED PORTLAND HEIGHTS home, modern; suitable one or two families; sleeping porenes, fruit, roses, garage, grand riew, walking distance postoffice; only

NEARLY HALF ACRE, \$6 NEARLY HADE according small strong cottage, not modern small hicken house, land nearly all in gar-German Co., 732 Chamber of Com, NINE room house, Ladds addition, at 249 E. 20th st. Hardwood floors. ch all builtin conveniences. TOUTH TOUTH THE STORY OF THE ST

lawn, roses and fruit trees. Take "car. 941 Cleveland ave. Main 7516. FREE rent to 1st. Modern, newly decorated, near Park; cheap for family. Apply 60 East 32d st. MODERN 6 room house, Irvington; good condition, low rent. East 2320, 1284, MODERN 6 room house, newly close in, S. E., near cars, \$15. East

WEST side good clean 4 room house bath, basement, yard. 525 Clay st. \$8.00-Modern 5 room cottage, garden, Woodstock, Sellwood 1335. FIVE room house, close in; gas and electric lights. Woodlawn 3526. NEW 5 room bungalow, \$12. 642 E. 28th st., cor. Franklin.

FOR RENT-4 room modern tile cot-tage after July 1. Tabor 2440. FURNISHED HOUSES NICELY furnished 6 room bungalow, garden in, close to Rose City car on 61st st. \$25. Rental Dept. J. L. HART-MAN COMPANY. No. 7, Chamber of Commerce. Main 208.

st.—165 rooms; strictly modern; brick building; ideal location; popular brick buildin NICELY furnished 6 room bungalow. MODERN 5 room house, east side; nicely furnished; \$17 month; no children. Phone Marshall 3086. WANTED—Local agents for eastern mercantile house; commission or salary. Call at room 523 Northwestern Bank bldg. Thursday and Friday.

Bank bldg. Thursday and Friday.

AGENTS make money selling phonographs, Carr & Son. Glezen, Indiana.

FOR RENT—Furnished house. Neat and reasonable. Phone Woodlawn 3436.

SUMMER RESORTS

SUMMER RESORTS

SUMMER RESORTS

SUMMER RESORTS

MODERN 5 rooms, also 2 room cottage, everything furnished, reasonable. Particulars, Postmistress Twin able. Particulars, Postmistress Twin Rocks, Oregon.

MODERN 5 rooms, also 2 room cottage, everything furnished, reasonable. Particulars, Postmistress Twin Rocks, Oregon.

5 ROOM furnished bungalow at 542 E. 41st st. Kevs at 539 Marguerite ave. hone Sellwood 911. SIX room house; rent very reasonable

958 East Davis. Call next door, 959 FOR RENT-5 room furnished cot-tage Seaside. East 2725.

APARTMENTS

FURNISHED AND UNFURNISHED MAGNOLIA APTS., E. 3d and Belmont. Modern 1 and 2 room apts., \$1.50 per week up; sleeping rooms, East 212. ELEGANT 5 room apartment with sleeping porch and all modern con-veniences. Marshall 1793 DIEL APTS., 790 E. Ankeny st. Mod light, clean 3 room com. fur. apt., 1st floor front, lawn, garden. East 1808. FURNISHED apartments, lovely and cool for summer. Summer prices. 48 Clay, near 12th. THE ALCO, E. Couch and Union ave. Nicely furnished 2 room apis, strictly modern, reasonable, East 2403.

3-4-5 ROOM FURNISHED APTS. THE DEZENDORF 208 16th st., near Taylor. Marsh, 128. HISLOP HALL, E. 5th and Hawtnorne Modern 1, 2 and 3 room apts., \$12.50 up: walking distance. East \$82. THE WESTFAL, 410 5th st., 8 roc Turnished apartments, modern, building, walking distance, \$18.50 brick

UNDER NEW MANAGEMENT New York Apis., E. 7th and Belmont. Fur. 2 and 3 rooms, reasonable. E. 238. ROSE FRIEND APTS., cor. B'way and Jefferson. Elegant unfur apis, best service. Walking dis. Marshali 1413. EVELYN APARTMENT, 267 N. 21st st., 3 room furnished apt; low rent. Marshall 1323, BANNER APTS., 489 Clay, modern, 2 room furnished \$12 up. Mar. 2074.

AMERICAN and Marlhorough mod 4 6 rm, apts. Mar. 3360, M. 7516, A-2675 ROSENFELD (brick), 14th & E. Stark 3 rms. \$17, \$20, \$22.50, \$25. HANOVER APTS., 167 King-3 room fur, or unfur, with balcony. THE Ormonde, mod., 4 room front, 656 Flanders: Nob Hill. Main 8251. THE ALAMO, 494 Market—3 room un-fur., mod., brick, \$12-\$14. Main 2686. FURNISHED apt., light, phone; rea-sonable, 554 E. Madison, E. 8065.

GRACE APTS, 24th and Northrup.—
Mod. high class 5 room apt. Mar. 1079.

GLARKE APTS., 2 rooms, fur., dis.
beds, phone, lights, \$12 up. B'way 5054

Cheap. East 3384.

MARE, weight 1050, \$75. Roth, 271

Argyle st.

HORSE and wagon, \$1.25 day; 2 horses and wagon, \$2 day, 545 Front, M,2208.

APARTMENTS FURNISHED AND UNFURNISHED

The Cromwell Fifth and Columbia Sts. Firth and Columbia Sts.
Five min. walk to Meier & Frank's
store; good suroundings; strictly mod.
2 and 3 room fur, apartments, all outside, with French doors and balconies.
ATTRACTIVE RATES
PERMANENT OR TRANSIENT.

McKinley Apartments Modern 3 room apartments, \$15 per menth and up, private phone and walking distance. E. son. Phone East \$100. E. 7th and Morri-

AN IDEAL HOME. large porch, completely furnished; many desirable fixtures, two bei-rooms with large closets. Ideal location. 241 Montgomery st., cor. Broad-

VILLA ST. CLARA, 12th and Taylor. Modern, completely furnished apts. Walking distance. References

WICKERSHAM APARTMENTS, 18th and Flanders. Two room furnished or unfurnished apartment and a six room unfurnished. Convenient to car ine, walking distance, quiet esidential room unfurnished district, modern. Broadway 2201. PENRUSE APARTMENTS. Grand ave. bet. Morrison & Beimont; new 2 & 3 rooms, completely fur.; sol-

WANTED-Fresh heifer; state price and breed. S-451, Journal. id brick bldg; white enamel and ma-hogany finish; walking distance. GLENN MARY APARTMENTS Modern 3 and 4 room H. K. apt., arnished or unfurnished; heat, light, FRESH Jersey, gentle for lady to handle. Extra rich milk, Tabor 1877 bath and gas range; \$15 and up. East NORTHAMPTON APTS. 407 HALL. We have three 2 room apts. and one 2 room. All outside rooms, in clean-2 room. All outside rooms, in classified est condition. Ideal for newlyweds or small family. Reasonable, Main 4292. 325 10TH ST., near Clay-5 room apt. unfurnished, sleeping porch, fiveranda hardwood floors, heat and

water, gas range, refrigerator. Inlaid lineleum on kitchen and bath, floors, all mod, conveniences, 35 2 FOR SALE-Fullblooded Barred Rock nd 3 room suites; few furnished. Lawn, hade, flowers. Glizan st., near 23d st. CHICKS, White Leghorns, 10c, de-livered free, 743 E, 10th, Portland, Or. Sell, 3192. THE SHEFFIELD, 270 Broadway S. 3 and 4 room fur, and unfur, apts. walking distance, at very reasonable rent; best of service. Main 2506. LAYING Leghorn, young hens, \$10 dozen, 787 Oregon at R-C car. East CARMELITA APTS., 12th-Jefferson Nicely furnished and unfurnished 4 300 HIGH grade R. I. Red chicks, \$14 per 100; ready June \$0 and July 10. Maguire, East 1865. 787 Oregon Et.

and 5 room; reasonable rent; walking

JEFFERSONIAN APARTMENTS. 514 Jefferson. Two and three rooms, urnished, walking distance, adults \$10 and up. LARGE and clean 1 and 2 room furnished apt.; light, phone, hot and cold water; \$9 month up. 167 Stout, near 29th and Morrison. SUMMER rates, 2, 3, 4, furnished or unfurnished, hardwood floors. Port-omah, 200 E. 13th. ENGLISH bull pups, 3 months old, pedigreed, trindle male and female. COMPLETELY furnished 2 room apart-

ment, \$17. BELKNAP APART-MENTS, 187 17th near Yambill. THREE big rooms, big sleeping porch, outside, unfurnished; beautiful place, NORUMIS, 365 Marshall—Modern 2
room furnished, private bath, dressing room and phone; \$15 to \$22.50.

HADDON HALL, 414 11th st., 3 and 4 room modern apts., rates reasonable, Marshall 1163.

MACHINE CO. Phone C-2294,
DOGS boarded, Main 8165.

WANT home for kittens. East 6491

AUTOMOBILES-ACCESSORIES

THAYER, SHAVER-GULLY omelike. See this first. Woodlawn 16, THAYER, SHAVER-GULLY

MACHINE CO.

1 Ton, \$370 BUILDERS OF

1% Ton, \$420 EVERREADY TRUCK

2 Ton, \$470 ATTACHMENTS

Capacity Mfg. in Portland,

193 E. Water St. Phone East 7487.

JULIANA APTS, 45 TRINITY PL. Elegantly furnished 2-3-4 rooms, walk-ing distance, reasonable, Marshall 983 PENINSULA APTS .- C-1170, Concrete bldg.; 2 and 3 rooms; hot and cold water, baths, phone; steam heat, \$12 up. GRAND OAK APTS., corner E. Oak and Grand ave., strictly modern 2-3 room apts. First class service. E. 3302. TWO, three or five room apartments, furnished, cheap rent. 454 11th st.

FURNISHED FLATS 50 LARGE 6 room upper corner flat, lawn, porches, fireplace, etc. \$20, including water and removal of garhage. Walking distance. 444 Rodney. Woodlawn 1241. ern home, overlooking river, large lawn and porches, good neighborhood. \$15-3 ROOMS, modern, clean, com-pletely furnished, 574% Mill. Broad-way 3412. 9981 Commercial.
BEAUTIFULLY furnished 5 room flat,

424 Stanton. East 1868 or East 6177. HOTELS Hotel Australia

Two and 3 room housekeeping apart-Single rooms, \$1.75 per week Transients, 50c and up. Steam heated, hot and cold water in every room. Only white help employed.

203 1/2 1st., cor. Thylor. Main 4203.

202 CLAYTON HOTEL Per week FOR SALE, Cadillac, 5 passenger, electric lights, 5 tires, 4 new; good buy, 4214 67th st, S. E.
FOR SALE—1916 7-pass, Studebaker, Tires almost new, \$700. S-392, Journal. up CLATIUN HOILL week 105 1/2 12th near Wash, st. Strictly clean, respectable house under proprie-tor's management. Modern, homelike Transients, 50c up. Marshall 2790. HOTEL ROWLAND, 2074-2114 4th

hished house, \$20 month, \$50 season. SALTAIR has a cottage for rent

BEACH cottage, new, reasonable, modern. Main 4190. BEAUTIFUL Seaside cottage for rent Inquire at 344 E. 3d N.

STORES AND OFFICES 11 WAREHOUSE and factory building in South Portland for rent Modern, 2 story brick structure, trackage; well lighted, Apply R. W. Hagood, \$11 Journal bldg.

OFFICE space for rent in Journal building. Rent reasonable. No better service in city. Apply 311 Journal building. BEST location in Portland for first class talloring establishment; will give long lease at reasonable rental.

Apply R. W. Hagood, 311 Journal bldg.

WANTED-TO RENT WANTED—3 room houseboat near city; must be furnished. Call Wood-lawn 5381 after 6:30 p. m. for particulars. William James Williams.

HORSES, VEHICL: ETC. 18 \$275 BUYS good work team and harness, weight about 2800 ibs., 7 and years old. 506 Williams ave. near 1100 LB. MARE, sound, good traveler,

cheap. Five year old pony to trade for top buggy. John Marks, Aurora, Oregon. FOR SALE-Team of good serviceable gray mares, 7 and 9 years old; good young gelding, and others. Modern Feed Barn, Vancouver, Wash. DEAD horses and animals hauled away free: \$6 paid for cows, crip-pled and played-outs, Call Woodlawn 0. Portland Rendering Co. DEAD stock taken quickly. We pay the most for dead and crippled stock. Tabor 4203.

GOOD farm team, harness and wagon. George Walters, Kernsville, Esta-George cada car. \$14 INCH truck Studebaker wagon, in first class condition. 2d and Colum-bia, Mar. 4925. ONE rubber tired buggy and harness, cheap. East 3384. MARE, weight 1050, \$75. Roth, 271

HORSES, VEHICLES, ETC. 18 AUTOMOBILES-ACCESSORIES 44 TWO chunky horses 8 and 10 years; good workers; 2300 lbs.; \$125; one chestnut sorrel mare, 1250 lbs., well bred and good breeder, and gay horse mate; will sell separately if desired.

A. M. Ferguson & Co. PORTLAND'S LEADING USED CAR DEALERS.

J. WALKER, 780 FRONT ST.

MATCHED team, mare and horse, 6 and 8 years old; sound and gentle; 2600 lbs.; first class farm wagon, good double set of harness, light farm wagon; \$250 for quick sale; worth \$350.

FOR SALE—6 head of mares and geldings, weight 1100 lbs. to 1400 lbs., good workers and gentle; also light farm wagon, buggles and harness. 292 Union ave. S.

Used cars you will find in stock to-day:

CADILLAC eight, several 1916 and 1917 HARLEY DAVIDSON, tandem, speedometer, just run 1506 miles; terms. E. 4447.

1914 2-speed engine, electrically equipped and tandem, \$140; terms, line; several 1916 Chevrolets, 1914

Mitchell, electric starting and lighting system, 1916 Dodge Bros. touring car, light farm wagon, buggles and harness. 292 Union ave. S.

Detroit touring car, almost new at a sacrifice; Metz touring car, driven only 1200 miles: Studebaker roadster, fine FOR SALE—Cheap coaster brake bi-DAPPLE gray mare, 5 years old, sound, gentle, with nice two months mare colt; will trade.

780 FIRST ST. S. condition price \$250; two Ford ton trucks, as good as new; 1916 Hudson, 7-pass, fine condition and a ba; gain; several Fords, including 1913-1914-1915-1916 models, also Ford de-livery cars, in fact we have most every WANT to buy from 10 to 20 good dairy cows; must be tubercular tested. F. Kosher, Route 1, Box 985, Portland, Or. Phone Woodlawn 2424. standard make in late model auto FOR SALE-40 head of extra fine shoats, ranging from 60 to 100 lbs. each. Phone 21F4, Mrs. G. W. Louden, Vancouver, Wash. Route 2.

WANTED-Duroc Jersey sow. mobiles.
Itemember we are the largest deal-

STOCK. SEE OUR ANTED—Duroc Jersey sow and pigs.

G. D. Richey, Ravenswood Ranch, PORTLAND LEADING USED CAR DEALERS.

Main 2968. HOLSTEIN cows and heifers. Terms. Bruce, Stockyards, Phone Wdln. 2400 514 Alder st Main 2966.

FRESH, large Jersey, just tested, \$65. 3 Months' Free Service The used cars we sell are in good running condition and look like new. Eight years' practical experience in FINE family cow and 1 dairy cow 274 E. 7th st., near Hawthorne. used car business.

1915 Studebaker, run 3000 miles. 550 1916 Grant Six, in fine condition. 650 25 other fine buys. Conley's Used Car Center 15th and Washington and Burnside. Brick building



NEW TIRES.
What brand of new tires
do you prefer? We have
them. Also we make the
famous O-V-C Double Tread 6 (sewed) tires and do manner of tire repair Oregon Vulcatizing Co., 332-335 Burn near Broadway.

BRAND new 2 ton GARFORD TRUCK at wholesale price; this is an ex-ceptional opportunity to buy a standard well known truck at a lower brice than you will ever buy one again.
W. H. WALLINGFORD Authorized Ford Agent

LIGHT car with electric lights and starter; nearly new Chevrolet; starter; nearly new Chevrolet; speedometer; tire change and spare tube; excellent shape; \$475. SEE JAMES, at BROADWAY Garage, E. 74th and Broadway.

AUTOMOBILES WANTED 78 WILL PAY SPOT CASH FOR LIGHT

BROADWAY GARAGE. East 2516. 24th and Broadway.

HURRY.

Will pay cash up to \$800 for good roadster, for two days only. Conley's writer Co., 86 Broadway. Phone Broadsed Car Center. Phone Main 3843.

A-2445.

wE pay highest cash price for late model used cars. Call us up,

A. M. FERGUSON & CO.,

514 Alder St. Main 2955

I HAVE 160 acres of timber land in worth \$2500; Lincoln county worth \$2500; Will trade for good late model auto. Call UNIVERSAL STARTER FOR FORDS.
(Improved Jiffy) 30 days trial to
responsible parties. A. L. Breckenridge,
836 Halsey et. East 5095, C-2260. Marshall 4169 after 5.30 p. m.

I WILL PAY YOU SPOT CASH FOR YOUR FORD.
FRANCIS MOTOR CAR EX..
E 1199 East 13th and Hawthorne ave. LATE model light car wanted in trade for a choice acre at Linneman sta-ion. Value \$459. Box 36, Salem. GARAGE to be moved. For sale very cheap. 249 E. 46th st. S., near Hawthorne car. VILL trade \$3000 equity on west side property for a good automobile, Call WANT late model light auto as part payment on 10 acres land near city. Woodlawn 3873 LARGE lot facing river at Mt. resort; will take good 2 or 5 pass, car in exchange. Sellwood 1596.

WANTED—Used Ford touring car, J-498, Journal.

LATE series Franklin for spot cash.
Marshall 6159.

Marshall 6159.

Wallshall 3360, A-2294.

FURNITURE for sale—Roll top desk, chairs, tables, filing cabinet; must sell this week. Broadway 703, Manning Warehouse.

RELIABLE gas range, almost new. ROOMING house for sale, or trade for

> AUTOS FOR HIRE LOOK HERE! New Ford for hire, curumbia high-way, \$5 round trip, 4 persons; \$1 per hour around town, Marshall 3397. DODGE Auto Service, nighway, calling,

auto. Phone East 7336.

HE'S TALKING TO A STRANGER

DIS MUST

FUST GAME

BE DE

HE EBBA

SEEN - IF .

HE KEEPS

MAH PAR ITS

BE DE

BUZZIN IN

GWINE TO

shopping, other trips; reasonable ites. Main 2580. FORD TOURING CAR, also roadster, rates. Main 2530.

MUST BE SOLD. 211 Washington. RELIABLE auto service; 5. MUST BE SOLD.

1915 OLDSMOBILE, small touring car, like new, \$575. Main 1092.

CHALMERS, model K, touring, \$200.

CHALMERS, model K, touring, \$200.

AUTOS without drivers for nine city garage. \$6 10th at 16 way \$10. A-4246. 1916 MAX VELL for sale chea; C-403, AUTO for hire, easy riding car, old driver, Woodlawn 3471.

AW THIS IS A ROTTEN GAME.

NOTHIN' TO NOTHIN' AND

THEY VE PICKLED 8 INNINGS

YOU RE

TALKIN

TO A

STRANGER

KILL THE KAISER

HE KEPT

US OUT

PEACE

OF.

IF SOMEBUDDY DON'T

BACK

I'M GONNA SQUAWK

FOR MY MONEY

MAKE A HIT SOON

FOR SALE cheap, a twin Thor mo-torcycle, newly overhauled and painted: fully equipped with Presto ight, speedometer and dream tandem; no reasonable offer refused. Call or phone Broadway 3868, 195 N. 16th st. INDIAN Twin motorcycle, prest-o-lite, speedometer, tandem, new tires, \$75.

FOR SALE-Cheap coaster brake bl-Tabor 4904.

LAUNCHES AND BOATS 61

FOR SALE or trade one 32 ft launch, haif glass cabin, 25 h, p. engine. What have you? Phone 331, or ad-dress J. A. Webber, 308 W. 4th st, Vancouver, Wash. FOR SALE-Fishing boat, flat bottom, 1814 ft. long by 5 ft. beam, 1 car old. Call East 1105. 207 E. 26th bet. Salmon and Taylor. WANT to rent or lease furnished house boat. F-368, Journal. FOR SALE or trade, pleasure cruiser type launch, 25 H. P., 4 cyl., 4 cycle, good condition, Phone East 8723.

PIANOS, ORGANS AND MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS SECURITY Storage Co. has lined up specially for out of town cash buy ers some storage pianos, viz: \$325, 1915 mod., only stored, \$135 cash

1916 mod., only stored, \$160 cash 1916 mod., only stored, \$190 cash \$550, 1915 mod player plane, \$290 cash \$600, 1915 mod. player piano, \$315 cash Houdoir, upright plano \$45 \$225 Emerson, upright plane, \$65 \$375 Kimball, modern upright, \$95 \$500 Emerson, large, mah., \$165 \$450 Steinway & Sons, old m'dl. \$75 cash. \$1100 N. Y. planoforte grand, \$165 cash \$100 Burdett parler organ for \$20 cash \$100 Alleger parler organ for \$15 cash

Boxed and shipped f. red in city. Security Storage Co., 109 \$5 CASH, \$5 monthly without interest for 2½ years places new 1916 model piano in your home for \$260. Compare with \$350 planos sold elsewhere with 8 per cent interest added. Schwan Plano Co., 111 4th st. at Washington.

Vern L. Wenger Phonographs and records, all makes bought, sold, exchanged; casy terms,

\$68 CASH OR TERMS Large new \$100 cabinet talking ma-See Mr. Sanborn, Edwards Co.,

5th and Oak. \$160 CASH closes out a few \$350 \$160 CASH closes out a few \$350 new 1916 model pianos from storage. WE STORE for 60c monthly, buy and sell planes for cash only. Security Stor-

Weber upright piano must be sold at once. Security Stor-age Co., 109 4th st. \$100 CASH buys \$425 Smith & Barnes large ma-

logany upright plane. Security Storage Co., 109 4th st. East 2556. HIGHEST cash price paid for used pl-anos, or will trade up to date talk-MOTORS, gears, bearings, wheels, axles, we wreck all makes of cars and sell their parts at 1/2 price. Auto Wrecking Co., 89 N. Broadway. ng machine and allow larold S. Gilbert, \$84 Yamhill st. sold and exchanged. H day, 126 lst. Main 7098. FINE Edison diamond disc and records cheap, 127 West Wygant.

TYPEWRITERS NEW REMINGTON retail plan, with manufacturers' guarantee and rent-

WE save you from 50 to 75% on all makes of typewriters. Send for our fllustrated folder. Retail department, WHOLESALE TYPEWRITER CO., diamond or most anything of value.

1 Washington st. REBUILT typewriters, supplies, Corona dealers, E. W. Peane Co. 110 6th. ALL makes typewriters rented and re-paired Royal T. W. Agency, 262 Stark HOUSEHOLD GOODS for SALE 65

BARGER'S AUCTION HOUSE
Will retail at wholesale prices for two
weeks, then auction the balance in lots
to suit, or by piece. We are absolutely
retiring from the furniture business,
Cail at 248-350-352 Hawthorne ave.
Special price to dealers.
LEAVING LEAVING town, must sell my house-hold goods at once. Have stoves, beds, dressers, tables, chairs, writing desk, sofa, folding beds, etc. 292 Clay Marshall 3960, A-2294. cost \$40; gas water heater, some fur-niture; very reasonable. Wdin 1453.

FOR BARGAINS in used house fur-nishings, visit our exchange dept. Calef Bros. E. Morrison St., at E. 2d. FOR SALE—Used furniture, in good condition, reasonable, 1195 E, 10th st., N., Wdln, 644. HOUSEHOLD goods for sale at 440 Jefferson st. FOR SALE-MISCELLANEOUS 19

00 ROND letter heads, \$1.90, 1000, \$2.90; 500 envelopes, \$1.90; 1000, 2.90. Smith, printers, 204 Stark at 50,000 KALE plants for sale at \$2.50 per thousand. East 6224. C. S. steam eng., set 6 books, \$4.50. Broadway 3502.

DE BECK

WANTS HIS

FAT THE

GLASS

MONEY'S WORTH

MOTORCYCLES-BICYCLES 55 FOR SALE-MISCELLANEOUS 19 (Continued)

typewriters, musical insts., phono-ungraphs and records, cafeteria, hotel 1 supplies, scales, cash registers, safes, st Everything under near Alder. \$3



Electric Motors Bought, sold, rented and repaired. Walker Electric Works, 413 Burnside, cor. 10th Broadway or A-5674.

ALL mathines sond for less. Renting \$2 per month. No agents employed. Sewing machine Emporium, 190 3d, near Taylor. Main 9431, A-3626. - THE ST with attachments, good condition. Sewing machines rented at \$2 per month. East 2359, B-3207, E. R. Steen.

152 Grand ave., near Belmont. "MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS," writers" and "Household Goods" are separate classifications. All adverdisements of these goods are published under their respective classifications.
LOOK THEM OVER.

FOR SALE—Logging engine, \$x10 Washington wide drum, 1800 feet of 1 inch main line, 2000 feet of 5-8 trip line, 5 blocks, 3 chokers, etc. A-545, Journal. AUTOMOBILES, MOTORCICLES, lanches or boats are separate classifications. A large listing can be found under these different classifications ACCUUM CLEANERS \$2 to \$200 each. We sell, rent, exchange or buy. EXPERT REPAIRS, Duntleys and all. Bentley & Co., 739 Hoyt, Main 8582. VACUUM cleaners, \$5. guar, 5 years, Phone for demonstration; all makes repaired, rented, exchanged. Jacger Mfg Co. 701 Swetland bldg. Mar 608 Mig Co. 701 Swettand bidg Mar 608 Reading daily. 292 Clay. Mar. 3960. LARGE winter cabbage plants, 5c per DR. V. G. KETHUM-Women's male-

FOR SALE—1 800 lb Fairbanks platform scale; 1 handcart, with springs.
Sunset Creamery, 281 lst st,
FOR SALE—Buck range, with hot
water coils, good condition, \$5. Bdwy.
3068. 954 N. 13th st.

SHAMPOOING and electric scalp FIRST class fir wood for sale, Place your orders before price go up. Phone Broadway 293. BITTMAN Hardware Co., mechanical tools and bicycles, 213 Front, Main

east

WAXNE gasoline pumps for stations and garage. E. H. Ruppell, 473 Washington st. Main 160. A BARGAIN in a tent house, 12x14, in good condition. Mt. Scott car. 4712 614t st. S. E. OAK bird sage, hand made. 4417 66th

PLI MINING supplies, v Stark Davis Co., 212

Hall & Cassi- 2675. Hartzeil Furniture Co., 335 1st st. and pay you cash. M. R. Seater, 289 Hawthorne ave. corner of Union.

L-446 Journal. .I. exchange expert plano tuning and repairing for groceries, books or what? Tabor 5716. PIANO to trade for good launch. W-912. Journal. FOR SALE or trade, twin Reading; take chickens, cow or piano, Sell 3069

WANTED-MISCELLANEOUS 5 THE LEVIN Hardware & Furniture Co dealers in new and second-hand furniture and hardware. We buy hotel and restaurant outfits and tools of any description; will pay the top prices for them, cash or exchange. Four large stores are ample proof that we can furnish you with practically anything you need in home or elsewhere. 221 Front. Main 9072, A-7176.

Old False Teeth

bought. \$1 to \$20 paid set. Very old sets are most valuable. Old jewelry, gold, silver, diamonds bought. Bring or mail. Randolph, 1218 Yeon bldg. SECOND-HAND CLOTHING WANT-ED-J. MEYER THE TAILOR PAYS \$7.50 AND UP FOR 2D HAND SUITS. HE PAYS MORE FOR SHOES AND CLOTHING, MAR. 1229, 229 MADISON Change Kodaks, lenses, shutters. See Sandy first. Sandy's Kodak Shop, 328 Washington, next Sanset theatre, Front, L. SHANK CO. Portland, Hides-Metals-Rubbers. Write for prices and shipping tags. Main 1699. DIAMONDS—Any quantity. Will pay cash, want old vold, platinum, eliver and high grade ore. H. M. Pickering, Mfg. Jeweler, 218 Oregonian bldg.

We pay highest prices for your used furniture, rugs, carpets, stoves, ranges, etc. Phone N. W. Fur. Ex., East \$36 TO THE HOUSEKEEPER.
Will call with machine for your
junk, paper, rags or clothes; we pay
absolutely highest prices. Mrshl. 2866. WANTED - Second hand furniture. ranges and stoves. Best prices paid. Morgan Furniture Co., 390 E. Morrison st. Phone East 2238. WANTED-The people of Portland to

Will pay cash. Phone Main 3333 GOING EAST? Household goods shipped at red. fates Pac. Coast Fw'd'g Co. 201 Wilcox bidg. Mar 2467. WANTED—Rifles, shotguns, kodaks, cameras, lenses. Hachfield, 85 3d. Main 3581

SECOND-HAND FURNITURE WANT-ED, MAIN 2705. HIGHEST cash price paid for furni-ture and gen. mdse. Simmonds, E. 5868 PAYS highest price for 2d hand cloth-ing, tools, etc 273 Front. Main 4802. PARTY wants to buy furniture, stoves, carpets. Marshall 4783.

LOST AND FOUND

LOST-Eyeglasses and case about last Wednesday, if anyone found same please return to 90 5th st., near Stark. LOST-Plain open face gold watch Saturday in business district or near refferson st. Phone Main 1715. WILL party that found green silk umbrella in jitney or Mt. Scott car Sun-ay call D-1622 for reward? LOST-Tuesday, glasses in case. Marshall 304. LOST—Red tandem cushion on 82d st. S. E. Phone Main 1025 or B-1991.

(Continued) THE following articles were found on the cars of the Portland Railway, TRADE BUY, SELL THE following articles were found on the cars of the Portland Railway, picture machines, films, lantern sides, Light & Power Co., June 25, 1917; Two umbrellas, 1 package, 1 pin, 1 tin can, es scales cash registers safes string beads, I lunch box, 2 purses, 1 thing under the sun. House of suitrase, grip, 1 basket, 1 lantera, 1 thing under the sun. House of suitrase, grip, 1 basket, 1 lantera, 1 thing under the sun. House of suitrase, grip, 1 basket, 1 lantera, 1 barrel, I lunch box, 2 packages, 1 glove, 1 pair gloves, 1 key, 2 purses. Owners

LOST AND FOUND

obtain lost property at 1st and Alder st. STRAYED—Last Friday, a red boar of about 150 lbs., was sick when gone. Notify route 4, box 26. Beaverton. Reward.

LOST-On cast side Sungay afternoon one hunting case gold watch, Ed-ward E. Butler special movement. Re-turn for reward. Phone Sellwood 1393. LOST-Saturday in Cascade a morocco handbag containing \$45, pair of glasses and small change. Please notify 1134 E. 20th N. Reward. FUUND-Auto tire, Sunday. 190 E. 44th et.

PERSONAL

GLASSES AT A SAVING The same service and quality you pay double the fitted glasses as low as \$1.50. Thousands of satisfied customers. odman, optometrist, 209 Morrison st, SPIRITUALIST, MRS. M. L. LAMAR. 235 5th st., cor. Main, teaches paimistry and card reading, also lessons in the science of health and success. Daily. VIBRATORY massage, face and scalp treatment, 386 Washington, reem 56 third floor, Marshall 4727, TRAINED nurse gives baths, mas-sage, magnetics. 170% 2d, first MARIE JOHNSON—Chiropody DR. blanket sweats, magnetics. 327 % Washington st. Office 510. Main 504. HAVE , our halr permanently waved. Guaranteed to last. Sanitary Beau Parlors, 400 Dekum. Marshall 1702 JOHNSON, facial, ALMA S. JOHNSON, facial, scalp, France-American tollet articles. Main 1451. nakes SPIRITUALISM - Rev. M. A. Price-Circles Tues., 2, 8 p. m.; Suns., 8 p.

dozen. 458 E. 88th st. N. Montavilla dies and acute diseases of men. Wash car to 82d, 82d to Tillamook, 6 blocks bldg., 4th and Wash., Rm. 441. Mar. 448. ASTROLOGICAL Studio 206 Centra SHAMPOUING and electric scalp treatment 162 West Park room 80, third floor.

MASSAGING, shampooing, manicur-ing. 291½ Morrison st., office 18. MAY IRVIN, vibratory massage. 201½ Morrison st., office 7. Lawyer Consultation FREE. Main

SALE OF TIMBER, FLATHEAD INDIAN RESERVATION, Scaled bids marked outside "Red Finthead Timber, Roman Unit," and addressed to Superintendent of the Finthead Indian school, Dixon, Mont., will be received Stark liavis Co. 212 3d. Main 197.

LADIES: bicycle and white Norfolk coat for sale. U-265, Journal.

FUMED oak library table, cost \$35. Fargain, \$10, 275 Stark at.

FURNITURE WANTED 74

WE will pay cash and best price for your second hand hotel and rooming house or residence FURNITURE. Give us a call before selling. Phone Marshall 2675. Hartzell Furniture Co., 335 1st st. PHONE East 7815 when you want to sell your furniture. We come at once and pay you cash. M. R. Seater, 389 Hawthorne ave, corner of Union.

Bindin school, Diron, Mont. will be received and indian school, Diron, Mont. will be received and indian school, Diron, Mont. will be received intil 12 o'clock, noon, mountain time, Tuesday, Peptember 11, 1917, for the purchase of the merchanishle timber upon tribal and allotted lands situated within townships 19, 20 and 21 north, ranges 19 and 20 west; containing approximately 57,000,000 feet of timber, over 80 per cent western yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousand feet for yellow pine and \$1,25 per thousand feet for yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousand feet for yellow pine and \$1,25 per thousand feet for yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousand feet for yellow pine and \$1,25 per thousand feet for yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousand feet for yellow pine and \$1,25 per thousand feet for yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousand feet for yellow pine and \$1,25 per thousand feet for yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousand feet for yellow pine. No bid of less than \$3 per thousa

sell your furniture. We come at once and pay you cash. M. R. Seater, 789
Hawthorne ave, corner of Union.

To Moke money for your furniture, rugs and office fixtures. Main 7714.

We pay highest cash prices for used house furnishings. East 452, B-1944
Trype-road
WILL make suits to order for growing and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications, which may be obtained at office of F. A. Naramore, superintendent of properties, 363 Courthouse. Occurrhouse of plants and specifications.

EXCHANGE—3 room house rent for directors reserves the right to reject any and all proposals.

EXCHANGE—3 room house rent for directors reserves the right to reject any and all proposals.

EXCHANGE—1 room 304

Courthouse 1917. The order of t

TRANSPORTATION



San Francisco Los Angeles

Cicas Comfortable SS. BEAVER

The Big

Sails From Ainsworth Dock S P. M. THURSDAY, JUNE 28 100 Golden Miles on Columbia River. All Rates Include Berths and Menia. Table and Service

For sailing dates apply to The San Francisco & Portland SB. Co., Third and Washington streets (with O.W. R. & M. Co.) Tel. Broadway 4500, A-6121.



PORTLAND TO SAN FRANCISCO TUESDAY, THURSDAY, SATURDAY

California Steamer Express leaves 9:30 s m. Steemer arrives S. F. S:30 next day. Fares \$8, \$12.50, \$15, \$17.50 and \$20. ROUND TRIP \$32. North Bank, 5th and Stark

STEAMSHIP

OFFICES Station, 10th and Hoyt 3d and Morrison, N. P. Ry. 843 Wash. G. N. By. 100 3d, Burlington Ry.

SAN FRANCISCO

TOMORROW, 8:30, JUNE 27.
San Francisco, Portland & Los Angels
Steamship Co.
Steamship

LOS ANGELES-SAN DIEGO

FOUND-Lady's purse. Call Journal

office, LOST-410 in 23d st. jitney; 1/4 to Red Cross. D-425, Journal. DECK GOIT ST Z. KOSKY

IF HE BOUGHT A DRINK HE'D know I pay the highest cash prices for household goods. Prompt attention. East 6707. N. M. Beater, 143 Russell st. Want Household Furniture

OOK! 2d hand clothes bought. Phone Broadway \$55. We call immediately, pay highest prices.
GOING EAST? Household