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Gloria Ladson-Billings

Author Gloria Ladson-Billings, 
w ho is know n  fo r h e r 
groundbreaking research on the 
factors that contribute to the aca­
demic achievement gap between 
white and black students, will be

Episcopal 
School Open 
Houses

The Oregon Episcopal School 
has scheduled two open houses 
this month for interested parents 
and students.

A session for grades 6-12 will 
be held Sunday, Oct. 27 from 1 
p.m. to 4 p.m. Parents and stu­
dents will be able to meet OES 
faculty , students, and current 
parents. Visitors can also experi­
ence the school’s teaching style 
through a variety o f mmi-classes.

The second open house is for 
grades pre-kindergarten through 
5th and will be held on W ednes­
day, Nov. 6 from 6 pm. to 8 p.m. 
The format will allow for self- 
guided exploration o f the lower 
school’s classrooms.

Student ambassadors will help 
visitors find their way as they 
meet classroom teachers and spe­
cialist teachers, interact with cur­
rent students and parents, and 
meet the student support team.

You can pre-register for the 
open houses by visiting oes.edu/ 
admissions or calling the school 
at 503-768-3115.
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Home Equity Line of Credit

1.99 %APR’

Introductory Rate tor 6 Months 
Rate available 09/09/13-11/10/13 

Rates are subject to change

Rates As Low As

3.99
Variable Rate after Introductory Period

Get a great rate on a Home Equity Line of Credit.
With rates still at an all-time low. now is the time to make those home improvements 

you ve been thinking about. U S. Bank is offering a Home Equity Line of Credit at a 

great rate with no closing costs? Not to mention potential tax advantages,3 great service 

and convenient branch locations. Start adding value to your home today.
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