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Classifieds
GORGE The Dalles Chronicle 

541-296-2141 

TheDallesChronicle.com

Hood River News 

541-386-1234 

HoodRiverNews.com

White Salmon Enterprise 

509-493-2112 

WhiteSalmonEnterprise.com

Goldendale

Announcements 
& Notices

Classified
Deadlines:

MONDAY 9AM
Mid-Week Editions:

Hood River News
The Dalles Chronicle

White Salmon Enterprise
The Gorge Reminder

THURSDAY 10AM
Weekend Editions:

Hood River News
The Dalles Chronicle

Gorge Classifieds

ATTENTION 
READERS:

Readers respond to 
ads at their own risk. 
If in doubt about a par-
ticular offer, check with 
the Better Business 
Protection Agency @ 
503-378-4320 before 
investing any money. 
This publication as-
sumes no liability over 
advertisers.

Hood River Marina
2020 Moorage 

Seasonal Lottery
The Port of Hood River has 
4 slips for boat lengths of 23 
feet or less, 1 slip for boat 
length of 20 feet or less and 
2 slips on the south side of 
the dock for PWC (jet skis) 
or inflatables 12 feet and 
under.  This is for the 2020 
seasonal moorage only 
on the South Basin Dock.  
Lottery applications will 
be accepted through 1:00 
p.m. on Wednesday, April 
1, 2020.
For entry rules and Lottery 
application see:
https://portofhoodriver.

com/2020-seasonal-
moorage-lottery/

Loans
IT’S ILLEGAL for com-
panies doing business by 
phone to promise you a 
loan and ask you to pay 
for it before they deliver. 

A public service mes-
sage from the Federal 
Trade Commission and 
the Hood River News, The 
Dalles Chronicle and the 
White Salmon Enterprise.

Lost & Found
FOUND: Woman’s wedding 
ring set in the area of Cas-
cade Square Shopping Mall 
on or around 2/13/2020. 
Call 541-705-7546 to iden-
tify.

Support Groups
FAMILY Alzheimer’s/De-
mentia Support Group: 
family members and friends 
caring for individuals with 
Alzheimer’s disease or a 
related dementia are in-
vited to participate in our 
Dementia Support Group. 
Come and gain support and 
insight from others who are 
going thru or have gone 
thru this journey. Join us 
monthly in a caring envi-
ronment to discuss your 
challenges and questions. 
Meeting held third Wednes-
day, every month, at 3:00 
pm at FlagStone Senior Liv-
ing at 3325 Columbia View 
Drive. For more information 
about our group, contact 
Karen Wilson at 541-298-
5656. All Welcome.

RECOVERING COUPLES

ANONYMOUS
Meets 2nd & 4th
Sundays at 10am.

216 Cascade St., Suite 26
Hood River

Adult Grief Support

Groups in Hood River
You are not alone. We’re 
here to listen. Call to reg-
ister: 541-387-6449. All are 
welcome!

AA in MAUPIN (open), 
Ma u p i n  C o m m u n i t y 
Church, 490 5th St., Thurs-
days @ 7pm.

NAMI|Oregon 
National 

Alliance on 
Mental Illness

NAMI is the largest 
education, support and 

advocacy organization on 
mental health in the na-

tion. The Mission of NAMI 
Oregon is to improve the 
quality of life of persons 
with mental illness and 

of their famillies through 
support, education and 

advocacy.

Under NAMI Oregon 
sponsorship, NA-

MI-Gorge providees a 
monthly support group 

meeting for caregiv-
ers, friends, and family 

members of persons with 
mental illness.

The Dalles: 1st Thursday 
of every month from 6 

to 7:30 pm at One Com-
munity Health Center, 

1040 Webber Street (Our 
monthly meeting in Hood 
River has been suspend-
ed; Gorge residents from 
any county, either state 

are welcome at The 
Dalles meeting)

Email Contacts: susan-
bgabay@gmail.com or 

margiest@centurylink.net

NAMI Oregon Support 
Line 1-800-343-6264

PARKINSON’S Support 
Group: 1st Wednesday of 
every month, 2pm @ Wa-
ter’s Edge, 551 Lone Pine 
Blvd., 2nd Floor. For more 
information, please contact 
Chad @ 541-340-0142.

GOLDENDALE 
PREGNANCY  

RESOURCE CENTER
Free pregnancy self-tests,  
pregnancy and parenting  
education and supplies,  
post-abortion support.  
Center Hours: Monday and  
Wednesday, 10:30 a.m.-  
3:30 p.m.
Tuesday noon - 5:00 p.m.  
120 W. Allyn, 509-773- 
5501.

Survivors of Suicide Loss
Support Group

Open to anyone who has 
lost a loved one to suicide! 
Meets monthly on the 
2nd Tuesday from 5:30 to 
6:30pm at the Hood River 
Campus of the Columbia 
Gorge Community College. 
Contact: belinda.ballah@
co.hood-river.or.us

AA in WAMIC (open): 
Tuesdays @ 7pm, NEW 
LOCATION! Molly B’s @ 
57740 Main St., Tygh Val-
ley, Oregon.

Alcoholicos Anonimos 
Reuniones

Jueves 7:30 pm to 8:30 
pm

St. Paul Episcopal Church
1805 Minnesota St.

The Dalles, OR 97058

DO YOU HAVE
HURTS, HABITS, 

HANG-UPS?
Attend

CELEBRATE RECOVERY,
a faith-based 12 step 

program, every Thursday 
night at 

Hood River Alliance Church
2650 W. Montello
(Off Rand Road)

Dinner provided at 
5:45pm

and large group meeting 
at 6:30pm

Childcare is provided.
For more info. call

507-820-0871

NARCOTICS Anonymous: 
Goldendale, 412 S. Colum-
bus, Tues. @ 6:30pm.

YOUNG Parents Support 
Group: ages 15-21, Tues-
days @ 7pm, call Tess @ 
541-298-5104.

Providence Hospice of 
the Gorge Children and 

Teens Grief Groups
for families that have 

experienced the death of 
a parent of sibling.

First and Third Thursdays, 
6-7pm in Hood River. Piz-
za dinner and gas cards 

provided. 
Contact Gwen Thomas at 
541-387-6449 to register.

AA MEETINGS
TUESDAYS and FRIDAYS:

12 noon, St. Joseph’s 
Catholic Church, 240 
NW Washington Street, 
White Salmon, WA

THURSDAYS: 7 p.m.
SUNDAYS: 7 p.m.

Umpqua Bank, 73 NE 
Estes Avenue, White 
Salmon, WA

Adult Grief Support

Group in The Dalles
You’re not alone. We’re here 
to listen. Call to register: 
541-387-6449. All are wel-
come!

MAC Lung Disease Support 
Group: for details, please 
call 541-483-2253 or 541-
805-5068.

AA in HOOD RIVER, meet-
ing every Tuesday evening 
from 7-8pm @ St. Marks 
Episcopal Church, 11th/
Eugene, Hood River, OR.

RIVERVIEW Al-Anon Fam-
ily Group in The Dalles: 
Episcopal Church of St. 
Paul, 1805 Minnesota, 
Taylor Hall. Meets every 
Thursday, 12:30-1:30pm. 
This meeting is free and 
open to anyone in the com-
munity who is interested in 
attending.

TOPS OR #942 meets at 
Gateway Presbyterian 
Church, The Dalles, Thurs-
days, 5:30-6:30pm.

Gorge Grief Groups

for Families
(Children, Teens, and Care-
givers). 1st & 3rd Thursday 
of the month, 6-7pm (Oc-
tober-April) at the PHTG 
offices, 1630 Woods Court. 
Please call 541-387-6449 for 
more information. All are 
welcome.

TOPS OR #443 meets
Thursday mornings, 
8 - 10 am. @ Zion Lutheran 
Church, main entrance, 
10th and Union St., The
Dalles, OR.

24 HOUR AA HOTLINE
and meeting information: 
District 14. 1-833-423-3683

AA in PARKDALE, meeting 
Sunday nights from 6-7pm, 
Parkdale Fire Dept., 4895 
Baseline Dr., Parkdale, OR.

AL-ANON in The Dalles: 
The Dalles Serenity meet-
ing every Monday at 7pm 
@ Gateway Presbyterian 
Church, 1111 Dry Hollow. For 
more info, call 541-296-2677.

HAVEN: Weekly counseling 
groups for victims of do-
mestic/teen dating violence 
or sexual assault. Biweekly 
educational classes given 
in Spanish and English for 
domestic violence. Call Ha-
ven, 541-296-1662.

DEMENTIA Support Group
every 3rd Friday at the
Oregon Veterans Home,
1:30 - 2:30 pm.
541-296-7190 for info.

AL ANON FAMILY GROUPS
(Support for family and 

friends of alcoholics) 
meets  Mondays at noon

Pathways to Recovery
Riverside Community 

Church
317 State St.

Ruth Wells Room

Tuesdays at 7pm
St. Mark’s

11th & Eugene
Hood River

GRIEF SUPPORT
Establishing a

Grief Support Group.
Please call Natasha

702-755-0778

NA MEETINGS
Every Wednesday.
6:30 - 7:30 at the

Casa Guadalupe House,
1603 Belmont,

Hood River, Oregon.

STROKE SURVIVORS
SUPPORT GROUP

Oregon Veterans Home
700 Veteran Drive

The Dalles
3rd Thursday of the 

month
1:30pm-3pm

Questions, 541-296-7441

Volunteers
Gorge Youth Mentoring

(G.Y.M.)
a program of The Next 
Door, is seeking a posi-
tive, adult role model for a 
9-year-old boy in The Dalles 
who is described as kind, 
helpful and considerate. He 
has been waiting to spend 
a couple days a month with 
a mentor who could join 
him in outdoor adventures 
and introduce him to new 
hobbies & interests. He 
enjoys swimming, soccer, 
animals and boating. For 
more information on how 
to get involved with G.Y.M., 
please call (541) 399-0259.

Gorge Youth Mentoring
(G.Y.M.)

a program of The Next 
Door, is seeking a posi-
tive, adult role model for a 
10-year-old boy in Mosier, 
who is very outgoing, goofy, 
and smart. He has been 
waiting to spend a couple 
days a month with a mentor 
who could expose him to 
science projects, reading, 
and just go with the flow 
sometimes. He enjoys 
seeing how things work, 
doing projects that change 
his memory, and exploring. 
For more information on 
how to get involved with 
G.Y.M., please call (541) 
399-0259.

MENTORS WANTED
Would you enjoy building 
a meaningful friendship 
with a child or teen? If so, 
become a mentor! Gorge 
Youth Mentoring, a program 
of The Next Door, provides 
children and teens with 
community based, one-
on-one mentoring relation-
ships with adult volunteers. 
Right now, 18 youth ages 6 
to 21 are waiting to make a 
new friend. Mentors and 
youth plan their own ac-
tivities based on their own 
schedules, meeting at least 
twice a month, for one year 
or more.
For more information, visit
www.nextdoorinc.org/

gym
or email

gym@nextdoorinc.org

Gorge Youth Mentoring
(G.Y.M.)

a program of The Next Door, 
is seeking a positive, adult 
role model for an 11-year-
old girl in The Dalles. She 
has been waiting to spend 
a couple days a month with 
a mentor who could expose 
her to a mix of activities, 
both indoor and outdoor. 
She enjoys being around all 
kinds of domestic & exotic 
animals, play sports and 
going out for an all-day na-
ture adventure.  For more 
information on how to get 
involved with G.Y.M., please 
call (541) 399-0259.

Antiques & 
Collectibles

FRENCH Provincial nesting 
stacking tables, carved, $45 
each. Call 541-296-1533.

Apparel & Jewelry
WOMAN’S Garnet Ring size 
6, 14 k gold extra wide band, 
$850. 541-801-6480.

Appliances
WHIRLPOOL Dryer. Can 
deliver locally in Hood River 
White Salmon and Mosier 
areas. $50. 541-354-1748.

S M A L L  r e f r i g e ra t o r 
(24”x24”x60” tall). 30 day 
warranty! $245. Can deliver 
(for a fee). Patrick, 541-298-
2687.

MAYTAG dryer, 30 day 
warranty. $175. Can deliv-
er (for a fee). Patrick, 541-
298-2687.

GE ADORA electric, black, 
glass top SELF-CLEANING 
range stove oven. 30 day 
warranty! $275. 541-298-
2687.

NO-NONSENSE Kenmore 
washing machine. 30 day 
warranty. Can deliver. 541-
298-2687.

GE LP/PROPANE black & 
stainless, SELF-CLEANING 
range stove oven, 30 day 
warranty! $185. 541-298-
2687

E L E C T R I C  R a n g e 
Self-Cleaning Oven with 
four burners. Works well. 
$100. 541-386-3602.

WHITE Kenmore dishwash-
er, 30 day warranty! $175. 
541-298-2687

KENMORE trash compac-
tor, 30 day warranty! $175. 
541-298-2687.

MICROWAVE, 1000 watt, by 
Emerson, white, like  new, 
works great, $65. 541-387-
4752.

LIKE new Whirlpool Cabrio 
electric clothes drier. $275. 
Patrick, 541-298-2687.

S M A L L  r e f r i g e ra t o r 
(24”x24”x60” tall). 30 day 
warranty! $245. Can deliver 
(for a fee). Patrick, 541-298-
2687.

Computers
DELL Laptop with Printer/
Copier. Both in very good 
condition. Comes with 
paper and ink. $40 OBO. 
541-354-2661.

Electronics
ZENITH colored 21” TV with 
tubes $100. 541-965-2251

TWO fairly new TVs, LG 
and Sharp.  Call for details.  
Very new, all in very good 
condition.  Best offers.   503-
895-7276.

50” PHILLIPS Plasma 
screen TV with wall mount. 
$100. 541-980-4154.

COMPONENT stereo, 
plays 5 discs, also plays 
cassettes, 2 speakers, $100. 
541-965-2251.

Firewood & 
Heating Fuel

CEDAR KINDLING
Bundles - $2.50
Boxes - $4.00
Firewood - $5/bundle
Call 541-806-3322.

Furniture
JEWELRY chest, top open-
ing with mirror, slots for 
ten rings, 2 open squares 
for loose jewelry.  Second 
and third drawers, bottom 
with a two-door opening 
that accommodates more 
storage. Plus both right and 
left sides open up to hang 
necklaces.  So nice.  503-
895-7276.

SOFA BED, the good 
mattress has been rarely 
used.  Soft green pattern, 
6-1/2 feet wide.  Excellent 
condition.  Best offer.  503-
895-7276.

DECORATIVE chests, all 
living room appropriate:  
two matching chests—one 
20” wide, one 23” wide; one 
44” wide leather chest with 
comfortable leather seat-
ing on the lid; one wood-
en chest 21” wide; and 
one 33”woven rattan; all 
in excellent clean condition.  
Best offers.
503-895-7276.

ANTIQUE child rocker 
chairs (2). $40 and $20 or 
$50 for both. 541-806-0859

ANTIQUE brown head-
board and footboard, tubu-
lar iron bed, newer mattress 
and box springs, pillows, 
spreads, sheets.  Fantastic 
deal at $300 firm.  503-895-
7276.

CUBICLE panels, some 
with desk tops and file 
drawers, multiple attach-
ments, 3 foot, 4 foot or 5 
foot heights. They can be 
arranged in many different 
widths and sizes. Beige, 
Henry Miller brand, excel-
lent condition. Best Offer 
accepted. 541-386-1234 ask 
for Joe Petshow.

1920s DREXEL 6-foot wide 
pristine shape desk to die 
for.  $320 or best offer.   503-
895-7276.

BEAUTYREST comfor-
pedic loft 4 inch supreme 
gel memory foam mattress 
topper by Simmons, king 
size, new, $150. 541-993-
5369 leave message.

TV Stand, $150.
 541-965-2251

S W I V E L  r o c k i n g 
chair, white, measures 
36”x33”x32”, $85. 541-490-
7254.

THREE black high gloss 
new bookshelves, 6’ tall X 
4’ wide, 3’ X 3’ and 7’ X 2’.  
Best offer.   503-895-7276.

SOFA SLEEPER, king size, 
white fabric with grape 
print, $500. 541-965-2251.

WHITE computer table on 
wheels.  Excellent condi-
tion.  Best offer.   503-895-
7276.

QUEEN Sized Bed in-
cluding maple colored 
headboard, mattress, box 
springs and frame. Very 
nice. $150. 541-436-4575.

ONE rocking recliner, light 
brown fabric, good condi-
tion, $75. Come look at it! 
360-518-7282.

Household 
Merchandise

TWO FLOOR LAMPS, 1 is 
maple table lamp, 5 ft tall, 
1 is white pine, $30 each. 
541-965-2251.

TEA POTS, 6 or 5 cup. $6 
each. 541-387-4752.

Health & Fitness
BLOOD pressure kit, digital, 
battery, with charger, $50. 
541-965-2251.

Miscellaneous
DOLL HOUSE, 12” dolls, 
wood, with furniture, 
33x51x14, good condition. 
Grandkids have outgrown 
it. $50. Melissa, 541-806-
0599.

NEW Pagoda patio fire-
place fire pit, steel, $125. 
Patrick, 541-298-2687.

CHRISTMAS decorations 
galore, some beautiful 
angel ornaments, stuffed 
Santa and deer and helper, 
2 outdoor deer, 6 Christmas 
trees, most 6 and 7 feet tall, 
one short one.  Plus, tons 
of lights.  Beautiful old 
and new ornaments and 
arrangements.  Also, one 
3-foot diameter wreath for 
the front porch (a must-
see).

VINYL records, 1 tub plus 
milk crate with metal rim, 
full. Over 200 LPs, various 
genres and conditions. $20. 
541-993-6127.

CANOPY Swing, steel 
frame only, kid sized, sturdy. 
FREE. 541-387-4752.

VINTAGE salon hair dryer, 
used, works good, it’s quiet, 
made in USA, has temp & 
timer control know, neck 
adjustments. $99. 541-296-
1533.

AGROBRITE grow light, 4 
ft, 8 tube, fluorescent, full 
spectrum, 40,000 lums. 
$150, new in box. 541-993-
7528.

38” WIDE Circular half inch 
thick glass table top. Top 
only. $20. 541-980-4154.

SURPLUS 
Sherman County

40 Foot Used 
Red Shipping Container

As Is Condition

Sealed bids must be sub-
mitted to the Sherman 
County Court, P.O. Box 365, 
Moro, OR 97039 by 5:00 pm 
Tuesday, March 17, 2020. 
Bids will be opened and 
read aloud during Coun-
ty Court on Wednesday, 
March 18, 2020. Minimum 
bid for the 40 Foot Used 
Red Shipping Container 
is $1,500. For additional 
information, contact the 
Sherman County Court at 
541-565-3416.

1919 AMERICAN Flag, Bet-
sy Ross Memorial Assoc. 
cert., no. 60133, originally 
registered to HB Moore. 
$55. Goldendale, WA. 541-
490-7254.

2 PORTABLE cribs, good 
cond. Approx 40”x24”, no 
mattress. Free. 541-296-
1289

PETRIFIED wood book-
ends, 8.5”x3”x1.5”, $40.541-
490-7254.

VINTAGE Harley Davidson 
chain guard, used, in good 
condition, 22”, no cracks or 
dents, $75. 541-296-1533.

WOOD slab cocktail/bar 
table, on rollers, in good 
condition, very unique, 
measures 33”x27”x25”x16”. 
$125. Call 541-296-1533.

***Be Aware***
GOING OUT

OF BUSINESS
Come quick and don’t 
miss your opportunity. 
As the consignors are 
taking out some of their 
stock as we close, the 
vendors and I are still 
squeezing in a few last 
minute new items for 
your interest.

SO DON’T SNOOZE
TOO LONG...

‘CAUSE BEFORE YOU
KNOW IT...

WE’LL BE GONE!

YOUR LOCAL
Antiques, Collectibles, 

House-Yard-Shop, 
Office Decor and So 

Much More Store

ANOTHER
CHANCE

RESALE & MORE LLC
409 East 2nd Street
The Dalles, Oregon

509-261-1296
Mon-Fri, 10:30 to 6

Saturday, 10:30ish to 4

CUSTOM Mirrors - 2, gold 
trim frames, used, very 
heavy, 48.5”x57.25”, good 
condition, $50. 541-296-
1533.

MYSTIC Mud decorative 
6” tiles,  4 cherry, apple, 
2 pears. $20 for set. 541-
490-7254.

MODEL Soldiers, WWI 
& WWII for modeling/
diorama, 1/87-1/72 HO 
scale AirFix Kits, British/
French/German/Russian. 
$7.50 per set. 360-518-7282. 
Hood River.

SHELVING metal racks, 
47”x9”, stands 66”, brackets, 
10” heavy duty moveable 
shelves, good condition, 
$60. 541-296-1533

WWII HO precise Roco for 
modeling/diorama, 1/87 
scale - mini tanks, Ger-
man Half Tracks, Russian 
Tanks, Transport Trucks, 
misc. vehicles. $7.50 each. 
360-518-7282, Hood River.

E L E C T R I C  R a n g e 
Self-Cleaning Oven with 
four burners. Works well. 
$100. 541-386-3602.

NEWSPAPER tubes, FREE! 
Great for projects. Call 
Hood River News, 541-
386-1234.

LARGE galvanized poultry 
feeder, $20. 541-490-7254.

NEW LogicTeck steering 
wheel & pedal for PS4 & 
PS3, in original box for $200. 
Call Joe at 541-478-3777.

KIDS fishing poles, (3) two 
30” by Shakespeare or one 
24” by Zebco. $6 each. 541-
387-4752.

1957 + 1958 THE DALLES 
Steelhead yearbooks with 
autographs. $200 both. Will 
not donate. 541-993-6127.

Office Work Stations
Eight custom-made office 
work stations; 88 inches by 
88 inches with 4 AC plug 
electrical power junctions 
with each station. Four 4 
ft. high oak dividers with 
dark green laminate count-
er tops. $50 each. 541-386-
1234.

Miscellaneous 
Wanted

WANTED: Old Rock

Collections
Agate, jasper, jade etc.

541-386-2397

Tools
CURT Weight Distribution 
System, Round Bar, 10,000 
lbs, GTW, 1,000 TW. $175. 
With anti sway bar, $195. 
541-298-2687.

HYDRAULIC 3 point trac-
tor wood splitter. $425. 541-
298-2687.

Sporting Goods
BROOKS BIKE SADDLE. 
Vintage Brooks Profession-
al leather saddle for your 
vintage bike or butt. Always 
oiled. Good condition. $75. 
541-436-4408.

BIKE, vintage Schwinn, 
girl’s “Little Chic”, Stingray 
style, $75. 541-387-4752.

NOTICE
Certain laws and restric-
tions, as well as registra-
tion requirements, apply to 
the sale of firearms. Fore 
more information, contact 
the Seattle Field Division of 
the Department of Alcohol, 
Tobacco and Firearms at 
206-204-3205. This field 
division is responsible for 
Washington, Idaho, Oregon, 
Alaska and Hawaii. You may 
also go to www.atf.gov for 
FAQs and information.

Bold
Headlines
Stand Out!

Include a headline on your 
ad for only $5 per week.

A Picture is Worth
a Thousand Words.

Add a picture to your ad 
for only $5 per week.

GE LP/PROPANE black & 
stainless, SELF-CLEANING 
range stove oven, 30 day 
warranty! $185. 541-298-
2687

KENMORE trash compac-
tor, 30 day warranty! $175. 
541-298-2687.

HYDRAULIC 3 point trac-
tor wood splitter. $425. 541-
298-2687.

NEW LogicTeck steering 
wheel & pedal for PS4 & 
PS3, in original box for $200. 
Call Joe at 541-478-3777.

AGROBRITE grow light, 4 
ft, 8 tube, fluorescent, full 
spectrum, 40,000 lums. 
$150, new in box. 541-993-
7528.

LIKE new Whirlpool Cabrio 
electric clothes drier. $275. 
Patrick, 541-298-2687.

ANTIQUE child rocker 
chairs (2). $40 and $20 or 
$50 for both. 541-806-0859

VINTAGE salon hair dryer, 
used, works good, it’s quiet, 
made in USA, has temp & 
timer control know, neck 
adjustments. $99. 541-296-
1533.

FRENCH Provincial nesting 
stacking tables, carved, $45 
each. Call 541-296-1533.

DODGE Fender Flares, 77-
78 era, extra thick, heavy 
duty, left and right fender 
flares, in good condition. 
$99. 541-296-1533.

DELL Laptop with Printer/
Copier. Both in very good 
condition. Comes with 
paper and ink. $40 OBO. 
541-354-2661.

TIRES, set of 4, near new, 
Hankook, LT245/70R17, 
95% tread, all season, $325. 
541-993-7528.

KIDS fishing poles, (3) two 
30” by Shakespeare or one 
24” by Zebco. $6 each. 541-
387-4752.

LARGE galvanized poultry 
feeder, $20. 541-490-7254.

ZENITH colored 21” TV with 
tubes $100. 541-965-2251.

NEWSPAPER tubes, FREE! 
Great for projects. Call 
Hood River News, 541-
386-1234.

ANTIQUE 1940’s refrigera-
tor G.M. Made only by Gen-
eral Motors, works great, 
perfect for man cave, keep 
a keg of beer ice cold. $400. 
57” tall. 541-340-0215.

WHITE Kenmore dishwash-
er, 30 day warranty! $175. 
541-298-2687

BROOKS BIKE SADDLE. 
Vintage Brooks Profession-
al leather saddle for your 
vintage bike or butt. Always 
oiled. Good condition. $75. 
541-436-4408.

50” PHILLIPS Plasma 
screen TV with wall mount. 
$100. 541-980-4154.

MODEL Soldiers, WWI 
& WWII for modeling/
diorama, 1/87-1/72 HO 
scale AirFix Kits, British/
French/German/Russian. 
$7.50 per set. 360-518-7282. 
Hood River.

MICROWAVE, 1000 watt, by 
Emerson, white, like  new, 
works great, $65. 541-387-
4752.

COMPONENT stereo, 
plays 5 discs, also plays 
cassettes, 2 speakers, $100. 
541-965-2251.

1957 + 1958 THE DALLES 
Steelhead yearbooks with 
autographs. $200 both. Will 
not donate. 541-993-6127.

1919 AMERICAN Flag, Bet-
sy Ross Memorial Assoc. 
cert., no. 60133, originally 
registered to HB Moore. 
$55. Goldendale, WA. 541-
490-7254.

BLOOD pressure kit, digital, 
battery, with charger, $50. 
541-965-2251.

2 USED dog crates. 1 extra 
large, 1 large. Extra large 
cost $179.95 sell for $75. 
Large $50. Used only inside. 
541-340-0215.

2 PORTABLE cribs, good 
cond. Approx 40”x24”, no 
mattress. $10/ea. 541-296-
1289.

WOOD slab cocktail/bar 
table, on rollers, in good 
condition, very unique, 
measures 33”x27”x25”x16”. 
$125. Call 541-296-1533.

BIKE, vintage Schwinn, 
girl’s “Little Chic”, Stingray 
style, $75. 541-387-4752.

PETRIFIED wood book-
ends, 8.5”x3”x1.5”, $40.541-
490-7254.

YAKIMA Space Cadet Car-
go Box (15 cu. ft.) with lock 
and keys. Excellent condi-
tion. $325. 541-806-0859.

LAWN EDGER, Craftsman, 
electric, $75. 541-965-2251.

WHIRLPOOL Dryer. Can 
deliver locally in Hood River 
White Salmon and Mosier 
areas. $50. 541-354-1748.

MYSTIC Mud decorative 
6” tiles,  4 cherry, apple, 
2 pears. $20 for set. 541-
490-7254.

CANOPY Swing, steel 
frame only, kid sized, sturdy. 
FREE. 541-387-4752.

FREE: 2 gun shooters 
benches, great for target 
practice, fold up. Home 
made. Call 541-296-2535.

QUEEN Sized Bed in-
cluding maple colored 
headboard, mattress, box 
springs and frame. Very 
nice. $150. 541-436-4575.

38” WIDE Circular half inch 
thick glass table top. Top 
only. $20. 541-980-4154.

UPPER extendable arm 
for an engine hoist, 1 ton, 
2 piece extendable arm, 
comes with chains and 
clips. $45. 541-296-1533.

DRYER, Whirlpool, electric, 
works great, delivery avail-
able, $140. 509-493-4266 
or 509-281-0276. (White 
Salmon)

LUND 18001 88-93 Chevy 
C/K PU Suburban hood 
deflector shield protector, 
$75. Patrick, 541-298-2687.

ONE rocking recliner, light 
brown fabric, good condi-
tion, $75. Come look at it! 
360-518-7282.

TEA POTS, 6 or 5 cup. $6 
each. 541-387-4752.

VINTAGE Harley Davidson 
chain guard, used, in good 
condition, 22”, no cracks or 
dents, $75. 541-296-1533.

SOFA SLEEPER, king size, 
white fabric with grape 
print, $500. 541-965-2251.

VINYL records, 1 tub plus 
milk crate with metal rim, 
full. Over 200 LPs, various 
genres and conditions. $20. 
541-993-6127.

NEW Pagoda patio fire-
place fire pit, steel, $125. 
Patrick, 541-298-2687.

TURBO VF239111, serial 
100, RHF5 0953IE, part 
14411AA73, works and in 
good condition, $99. Call 
541-296-1533.

GE ADORA electric, black, 
glass top SELF-CLEANING 
range stove oven. 30 day 
warranty! $275. 541-298-
2687.

CURT Weight Distribution 
System, Round Bar, 10,000 
lbs, GTW, 1,000 TW. $175. 
With anti sway bar, $195. 
541-298-2687.

TV Stand, $150.
 541-965-2251

S W I V E L  r o c k i n g 
chair, white, measures 
36”x33”x32”, $85. 541-490-
7254.

DOLL HOUSE, 12” dolls, 
wood, with furniture, 
33x51x14, good condition. 
Grandkids have outgrown 
it. $50. Melissa, 541-806-
0599.

TWO FLOOR LAMPS, 1 is 
maple table lamp, 5 ft tall, 
1 is white pine, $30 each. 
541-965-2251.

BEAUTYREST comfor-
pedic loft 4 inch supreme 
gel memory foam mattress 
topper by Simmons, king 
size, new, $150. 541-993-
5369 leave message.

SHELVING metal racks, 
47”x9”, stands 66”, brackets, 
10” heavy duty moveable 
shelves, good condition, 
$60. 541-296-1533

TUFF shed w/contents, you 
move. $200. Call for details 
541-340-0852.

CUSTOM Mirrors - 2, gold 
trim frames, used, very 
heavy, 48.5”x57.25”, good 
condition, $50. 541-296-
1533.

TRENDLE BED, twin, mat-
tresses included, good con-
dition, $100. 509-493-2930.

MAYTAG dryer, 30 day 
warranty. $175. Can deliv-
er (for a fee). Patrick, 541-
298-2687.

ENGINE hoist, 1 ton, 2 piece 
extendable arm, comes 
with chain and clips. $45. 
541-296-1533

WWII HO precise Roco for 
modeling/diorama, 1/87 
scale - mini tanks, Ger-
man Half Tracks, Russian 
Tanks, Transport Trucks, 
misc. vehicles. $7.50 each. 
360-518-7282, Hood River.

Support Groups Support Groups Appliances Furniture Miscellaneous Miscellaneous

PRIVATE PARTY • NO COMMERCIAL • ITEMS PRICED $500 OR LESS • 1 ITEM PER 
AD • NO FOOD, FUEL, ANIMALS, GARAGE SALES, OR AUTOMOBILES


