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"GOLLY, I'VE GONE AND DID IT AGAIN!"
CANEMAH WALL TO

ROOSEVELT READY TO MISS STROHMEYER

BECOMES BRIDE

NEW PM LEADERBE

will be influenced to a large extent

BE BUILT BY R. R.

CONFERENCE OF OFFICALS AND

OREGON CITY COUNCIL

IS HELD

COMPANY TO OFFER SPECIFICATIONS

Couricilmen Insist That Improvement

Shall Be Adequate To Pro-

tect City Against

Floods

Representatives of the Portland
Railway, Light & Power Company,
the city council and a committee from
Canemah, at a conference Thursday
afternoon, considered the building of
a wall and raising the railway tracks
and walk between Canemah and this
city. The meeting was the result of.
a motion made at a recent meeting of
the council by Mr. Tooze, which pro-

vided that the city recorder ask the
Portland Railway, Light & Power
Company to participate in a confer-
ence. The spokesman for Canemah"
were William Hedges and S. L. Stev-
ens.

Councilmen Tooze, Roake, Meyer
and Albright, accompanied by the
railway representatives, Mr. Hawley,
of the Hawley Pulp & Paper Company
and his attorney, C. D. Latourette,
made an examination of the walk and,
tracks, and afterward met in the
council chamber. Franklin T. Grif-
fith, attorney for the railway com-
pany; Chief Engineer Pumfrey, Traf-
fic Manager Hunt and Publicity Agent
Buchanan offered plans of the propos
ed improvement by the company. Mr.
Tooze insisted that the proposed wall
be of such a height and stability as
to protect the city against floods.;
Mayor Dimick and Councilman Hol-ma-n

were notified of the meeting and
arrived in time to participate in the
proceedings. City Engineer Mont-
gomery also was present

A resolution introduced by Mr.
Tooze requesting the railway com-
pany to present specifications before
next Friday when a special meeting
of the council will be held was adopt-
ed. The council and Canemah com-
mittee are determined that a wall be
erected of sufficient height to prevent
high water from flooding the walk and
tracks and menacing the lower part
of the city. The representatives of
the railroad promised that the propos-
ed work would be thorough.

LIGHTNING HITS WIRE

ELL
Oregon City experienced Wednes-

day evening the greatest electrical
disturbance in the history of the city
according to the old inhabitants.
There was a vivid flash of lightning
followed by a loud thunder clap sev-
eral minutes after 10 o'clock, whlen
frightened scores of persons. The
electric lights in the hill section were
put out and several motors in .the
down town section were rendered
usless. L. E. Jones Lee French who
were standing on Center street near
Monroe had the sensation of their
lives. The lightning flashed along an
electric wire, being converted into a
ball of fire as it neared a pole. The
pole, however, was not splintered and
no damage was done to the wire.

Mb BOXES
The Falls best choco-

late creams

FREE TODAY
AT

The

5 boxes at 2:15 P. M.

S boxes at 8:00 P. M.

7 boxes at 9:30 P. M.

Don't miss the little

Watson Sisters

Entire Change of Pictures

FORMER OREGON CITY GIRL AND

CHARLES SCHINK ARE

MARRIED

REV. KRAXBERGER OFFICIATES

Young Couple Start On Wedding Trip

And On Return Will X3o To

Housekeeping In

Portland

One of the prettiest church wed-

dings that- - has taken place in this
city wa3 solemnized at the German
Lutheran church Wednesday evening,
when Rev. William Kraxberger, past-
or, united in marrige Miss Rose
Strohmeyer, eldest daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Theodore Strohmeyer, of
this city, and Mrs. Charles Schink, of
Portland. Many friends of the young
couple witnessed the impressive cere-
mony, which was performed at 8

o'clock. Preceding the marriage Miss
Hattie Brandt, of Portland, sang very
sweetly "Beloved It Is Morn," follow-
ing thi3 Miss Erna Petzold, who pre-
sided at the organ played "Lohen-
grin's Wedding March" to which the
bridal party entered the church. The
ushers were Albert Schink, of Port-
land, and Herman Treichler, of this
city, followed by the two little flower
girls, Agnes Petzold and Ruth .Krax-
berger, carrying baskets filled with
rose petals which were scattered
along the path of the bride who fol-
lowed escorted by her father, Mr.
Theodore Strohmeyer, the maid of
honor, Miss Louise Strohmeyer, sist-
er of the bride, and the bridesmaids,
Miss Sophia Schink, of Portland, and
Miss Laura Adrian, of Eugene. The
bridal party was met at the altar by
the bridegroom and his best man,
Theodore Strohmeyer, Jr., brother of
the bride. After the ceremony about
70 invited guests repaired to the
home of the bride's parents at 317
Pearl Street, where, a reception was
held, after which Mr. and Mrs.
Schink left by automobile for
Portland and after , a short wedding
trip will return to that city to live.
As Mrs. Schink departed on her trip
she threw her bouquet, which was
caught by Misa Sophia Schink, of
Portland.

The bride looked very pretty in her
handsome gown of white crepe met-
eor made entrain and embellished
with Duchess lace. Her long tulle
veil was held in place by a wreath
of orange blossoms, and she carried
a shower bouquet of Bride's roses.
The maid of honor, Miss Louise Stroh-
meyer, wore a pretty gown of pink
with . lace overdress, and carried
white sweet peas; the bridesmaids,
Misses Schink and Adrian, were be-
comingly attired in white lingerie
gowns,. while the little flower girls,
Agnes Petzold and Ruth Kraxberger
wore .pretty dresses of white with
decorations of pink roses, and wear-
ing pink wreathes of roses.

The decorations of the church were

(Continued on page 2)

DELIGHT BIG CROWD

McLoughlin. Hall was crowded
Thursday night at the commencement
exercises of McLoughlin Institute,
and the program was one of the best
ever given by a school in this city.
The hall was beautifully decorated,
and the graduates were remembered
by their friends who sent handsome
floral offerings. Rev. Hillebrand pre-

sented the diplomas and made an in-

teresting address to the graduates.
J. E. Hedges spoke on "Opportunities
Responsibilities and Advantages of
Education and true purpose of Life."
Father Hillebrand in closing the ex-

ercises said that he was delighted to
know that the graduating class was
one of the best in the history of the
school.

There were six graduates. Miss
Mary A. Nuttall, president; Miss Lou-

ise M. Weber, t; Thomas
C. Barry .secretary; Daniel E. n,

Miss Ellen V. McMillan, and
Miss Margaret C. Sullivan. The
class motto is "The Begging," and the
class flower is the white, carnation. v

The following program was given
Coronation March, by G. Meyerbeer

Piano Quarette, Salie Clancy, '11 ;

Anna McMillan, First piano; Ellen V.
McMillan, '12; Opal Rains, '13; Sec
ond Piano. "

Salutatory Ellen V. McMillan, '12.
The Ocean Spray by B. Richards,

Intermediate grades, S. Clancy, ac-

companist. '
Roses, by A. Strelezki Piano Quar-

tette, Loverne Brooks and Anna Rose
Canzer, first piano; Margaret Brady,
and Anna Lenon,. second piano.

Sword Drill by the boys.
Goin' to Meetin Song, by Minims.
Faust Waltz, by Gounod Lenore

Hutson, Rose Muench,- - first piano;
Joseph Gadke, 14; F. Champion, '13,''
second piano. -

Adrift, Song F. Champion, N. Mi-che-ls

and F. Bruce, 9th grade.
Class Drill 7th and 8th grades.
Class Song.
Jubel Feier Piano Trio, Anna Mc-

Millan, H. Forsberg and E. McAnul-t- y.

Valedictory D. E. McMahon, 12.
Presentation of Diplomas, by Rev.

A. Hillebrand.
Address to Class, by Hon. Joseph

E. Hedges. .

plan then to proceed to the nomina-
tion of the Colonel in the Coliseum
and claim regularity for. him.

Colonel Roosevelt has not definitely
committeed himself to the latter part
of this plan. He is considering the ad-

visability of "delaying action for sev-

eral weeks and then summoning an
entirely new convention. This would
not be held until after Democrats
have acted in Baltimore

Roosevelt members of the creden-
tials committee, acting under the sug-

gestion of Colonel Roosevelt, return-
ed, to the meeting of that committee
today. Their statement last night
that they had "left the committee for
good" was followed by a decision to
go back and participate in the hearing
of contest cases.

Under the revised rules the Roose-
velt men concluded they had won
their chief points, namely, to secure
the introduction of new evidence and
to secure greater time for debate.

The National convention itself
marked time today waiting for the
committee on credentials to conclude
its consideration of the contested del-
egates. The committee planned to
work throughout tonight, so as to re-
port to the convention when it meets
at 11 A. M.

It was predicted tonight that the
nominating stage of the convenion
might not be reached until late Sat-

urday. A wide latitude of debate is
to be allowed tomorrow in the con-

vention.
Colonel Roosevelt said emphatical- -

LA F0LLETTE.

ly tonight that he would make the
fight for the Presidency if

he were convinced there was a popu-
lar demand for him. -

"I shall have to see if there is a
popular demand for me to run," he
said.

Fifteen minutes before the Repub-
lican national convention met for the
afternoon sessi&n, Chairman Devine
of the credentials committee, sent
word to Temporary Chairman Root
that his committee could hardly re
turn a report on the roll of delegaes
before tomorrow.

The convenion was reassembled at
4:06 p. m., and was adjourned until
11 o'clock tomorrow moraine.

While the commitee on credentiats
threshed out in detail the contested
seats which have, resuled in the block
ing of the wheels of the Republican
national convention, the convention
held a four minute perfunctory ses-
sion today. The only business tran
sacted was the prayer of the chap
lain. .

Until the credentials committee re--
pors the roll of the convention no bus-
iness can be transacted.

The contests before the committee
it was officially announced to Senat
or Root, temporary chairman of the
convention, by Chairman Devine of
the credentials committee, would
likely be confined to the Ninth Ala
bama district, Texas as a while,
Washington .Airzona and the Fourth
district of California. In these cases''
the widest debate was allowed. Oth
er minor contests were to be rail
roaded as being without merit.

Complete new and careful plans to
quell any disorders from any cause
whatever in the Coliseum were made
today by Sergeant-at-Arm- s Stone.

"Arrest any man senator,- - judge,
state's attorney or what not who
starts trouble," was Stone's order to

COLONEL TO AWAIT

CALL OF PEOPLE

ANOTHER CONVENTION PROBABLE

FRIENDS AT

CHICAGO WILL NOT BOLT,

BUT WILL TAKE NO HAND

IN PROCEEDINGS

CHICAGO, June 20. Colonel Theo-
dore Roosevelt indicated tonight that
under certain conditions he might
withdraw from the Republican party
to take the lead in the formation of a
new party.

"If the people want a progressive
party, I'll be in it,"he said.

Some of the Colonel's supporters
urged their associates, to precipitate
the crisis in the Republican National
convention at the earliest opportunity
tomorrow. More conservative coun-
sels finally prevailed and it was decid-
ed there should be no "bolt' from the
regular convention.

It was the plan tonight of the
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ROBERT MARION

Roosevelt delegates to make their
last stand on the report of the cre-
dentials committeee. If- the 78 dele-
gates asserted by them to be fraudu-
lent are seated, the Roosevelt forces
will remain in the convention until
the end, but will not vote. It is their

Don't Miss This

The Famous

M'NAMARA
Trial

Illustrated Lecture by
S. C. Benson

This lecture is sensa-
tional and educational

Miss Margaret True
Will appear in charm-
ing character singing

Also 4 big reels of the
best of censored pic-
tures will complete the
bill at the

ELECTRIC Theater
T 0 D A Y

Remember we have a
complete change of
program every day

Assistant Chief of Police Schuettler.
At roll call of the police in the Col-

iseum Stone gave his orders. "If no
violene ics offered, do not take any
action," said Stone, "but grab the first
man who starts anything."

Many extra policemen went on duty
in the hall today. They brought their
night sticks with them, twirling them
in front of them, where heretofore
they had been tucked away in their
belts. - -

The rumor factory was working
overtime, and one of the reports was
that, as a stop to the progressives, the
delegates from California and Wash-
ington at large were to be unseated
and the Roosevelt men given their
plaes.

The members of the committee de-

nied that any such argreement had
been entered into.

"We will decide every case put be
fore .us squarely and on its merits,"
said Chairman Devine when told of
the rumor.

When the rumor was circulated on
the authority of Governor Post of
Porto Rica that Rooseveut would re-
lease his delegates, there was a gen-
eral jubilation among the Taft men.
They claimed this would give them
the solid vote of Massachusstts and
also mean at least 16 delegates from
Ohio. .

-

Although it was certain that a re
cess would have to be ordered the
Coliseum filled up rapidly today.

The Taft forces emphasized their
control of the national committee in
the first test, vote before the creden
tials committee." By a vote of 34 to
14 the committee seated James R.
Sloan and J. R. Carter from the
ninth Alabama district. They were
originally placed on the roll by the
national committee and it was this
action that drew the colonel's original
charge that the committee was "in
league with thieves."

The committe debated the issue at
length after the contestants had re-
tired and the entire morning was con-
sumed on this single district. Chair
man Devine,- however, expressed the
belief when the luncheon recess was
ordered that the committee had now

found itself" and there would "be
rapid progress on all other cases. The
Arizona cases were taken up after

(Continued on page 3)

We recommend
an Guarantee the

South
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Watch
'HE world famous "SOUTH

BEND" watch is so marvel- -

ously -- perfect that extremes of
heat or cold have no effect on
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BRYAN DEFEATED

IN PARKER FIGHT

CANDIDATE IS

ELECTED TEMPORARY
'CHAIRMAN

JAMES LOSES HONOR BY ONE VOTE

Murphy Men Say Nebraskan Will Not

Be Allowed To Control Dem-

ocratic Conven-

tion '

BALTIMORE, June 20. Alton B.

Parker was elected temporary chair-

man of the Democratic national con-

vention on the second ballot in the
committee on arrangements shortly
after 3 o'clock today. On the first
ballot he needed only one vote to be
elected.

On the first ballot Parker received
seven votes and Ollie James of Ken-
tucky six. On the second ballot the
chairman of the committee voted with
the Parker forces, electing him. The
second ballot resulted:

Parker 8; James 3; Henry, of Texas
3; Kern, of Indiana, 1; O'Gorman, of
New York, 1.

Parker was bitterly opposed by Wil-
liam J. Bryan, but had the support of
Leader Murphy of Tammany halL

The plans to prevent Bryan from
capturing the convention are well un-
der way, according to the Murphy
followers.

Aside from the opening of head-
quarters by the active candidates for
the presidency, Clark, Wilson, Harm-
on, and Underwood, and the activity
of their press agents and boomers,
Baltimore will not take real interest
in the Democrats until the Republi-
cans at Chicago close, r It is conced-
ed on all sides that the Democrats

1 - i .jtaet 4

& Andresen
Bridge Comer

South Bend Watches

by what happens at Chicago.
All the managers for candidates

here are making claims, that are con
sidered exaggerated and unwarranted
yet none of them comes within two
or three hundred votes of claiming
the number necessary for nomination.
The Clark people declare the Mis-
sourian will go into the convention
with nearly 500 votes while Wilson's
managers claim approximately 350 for
him at the start with Underwood and
Harmon claims of about 100 each.

Discussion of the platform has
hardly started, except that the con-
servatives appear to be organizing to
oppose the indorsemen of the initia- -

t'Vmmm
v

Charles F. Murphy, Leader of Tam-
many Hall, Who Won His Fight To
Make Alton B. Parker Temporary
Chairman of Democratic Conven-
tion. -

tive and referendum and " the recall
planks, said to be favored by Bryan.
All appear . agreed that the tariff
plank will call for immediate revision
of the tariff downward, and that the
trust plank shall demand criminal
punishment, for violation of the trust
laws.

The committee named Urey Wood-
son as . temporary secretary of the
convention and John I. Martin as tem-
porary sergeant at arms.

WIFE, SUING, SAYS

HUSBAND HIT CHILD

Charging that her husband while
intoxicated struck one of their chil-
dren Hannah P. Pike Thursday filed
suit for divorce against William E.
Pike. They were married in Bandon,
Or., September 2, 1896 and have five
children. The plaintiff says she in-

herited in 1904 $4,500, which she turn-
ed over to her husband. She asks
the return of the money and $75 a
month alimony. The defendant is a
merchant of Myrtle Point, Or.

Frances Haner asks a divorce from
Francis J. Haner, alleging cruelty.
They were married in Portland June
11, 1902. '

Judge Campbell has granted decrees
in the following divorce cases: Mary
Kimbell Stryker against Amber Stry-ke-r,

Ellen Parazoo against Lewie Par-azo-

Rose Tharp against Elva Tharp
Edward Streumeyer against Mary
Streumeyer, Annie P .Sater against
Louis Sater and Jessie M. Vreeland
against George A. Vreeland. The di-

vorce suits of Mary Brooks Clarke
against George T. Clarke and Cardin
Smith against Cora E. Smith have
been dismissed.

4 CoupleGet Licenses.
Licenses to marly have been issued

to Bertha M. Lane and Carl F. Cary;
Rose Strohmeyer and Charles Schink,
Stella I. Turk and Charles L. Powell
and Hazel L. Kinckerbacker and
Frank P. Spring. -

its time-keepi- 'qualities - '
Every watch passes hundreds of factory inspections. It is tested
made to run accurately in extreme cold and intense heat No wonder
we guarantee it to keep perfect time in your pocket

The Master Timepiece
The picture shows the Certificate given with "THE STUDEBAKER,"

the South Bend Watch Company's Master railroad movement which guaran-
tees the watch to pass railroad time inspection for five years.

We carry a full line of South Bend Watches to fit every purse and
pocket. . ,

Don't buy Any watch, at Any priice, --until you see the "South Bend."
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