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Announcements 
& Notices

ATTENTION 
READERS:

Readers respond to 

ads at their own risk. 

If in doubt about a par-

ticular offer, check with 

the Better Business 

Protection Agency @ 

503-378-4320 before

investing any money.

This publication as-

sumes no liability over 

advertisers.

HAPPY TAILS 
BOARDING KENNEL 

in White Salmon, WA is 
officially closed.

Thank you for boarding 
with us. A new kennel will 
be opening soon, under 

new management. 

Thank you!
Pat Morgan

Loans
IT’S ILLEGAL for com-

panies doing business by 

phone to promise you a 

loan and ask you to pay 

for it before they deliver. 

A public service mes-

sage from the Federal 

Trade Commission and 

the Hood River News, The 

Dalles Chronicle and the 

White Salmon Enterprise.

Lost & Found
LOST! Shy, bright yellow 

over silver foam Carbon 

Cub 1.3m/53 inch electric 

RC model aeroplane last 

seen flying west south 

west from NW corner of 

Barrett RC Model Air Park 

over standing dead trees 

along Indian Creek, possi-

bly beyond Methodist Rd. 

$50 reward for return. 360-

790-4517.

Support Groups
MAC Lung Disease Support 
Group: for details, please 
call 541-483-2253 or 541-
805-5068.

24 HOUR AA HOTLINE
and meeting information: 
District 14. 1-833-423-3683

STROKE SURVIVORS

SUPPORT GROUP

Oregon Veterans Home

700 Veteran Drive

The Dalles

3rd Thursday of the 

month

1:30pm-3pm

Questions, 541-296-7441

AA in WAMIC (open): 

Tuesdays @ 7pm, NEW 

LOCATION! Molly B’s @ 

57740 Main St., Tygh Val-

ley, Oregon.

YOUNG Parents Support 

Group: ages 15-21, Tues-

days @ 7pm, call Tess @ 

541-298-5104.

AA in HOOD RIVER, meet-

ing every Tuesday evening 

from 7-8pm @ St. Marks 

Episcopal Church, 11th/

Eugene, Hood River, OR.

NARCOTICS Anonymous: 

Goldendale, 412 S. Colum-

bus, Tues. @ 6:30pm.

Alcoholicos Anonimos 

Reuniones

Jueves 7:30 pm to 

8:30 pm

St. Paul Episcopal Church

1805 Minnesota St.

The Dalles, OR 97058

NAMI|Oregon 
National 

Alliance on 
Mental Illness

NAMI is the largest 
education, support and 

advocacy organization on 
mental health in the na-

tion. The Mission of NAMI 
Oregon is to improve the 
quality of life of persons 
with mental illness and 

of their famillies through 
support, education and 

advocacy.

Under NAMI Oregon 
sponsorship, NA-

MI-Gorge providees a 
monthly support group 

meeting for caregiv-
ers, friends, and family 

members of persons with 
mental illness.

The Dalles: 1st Thursday 
of every month from 6 to 
7:30 pm at One Commu-
nity Health Center, 1040 
Webber Street. However 
due to COVID-19  these 
meetings are suspended 
until further notice. For 

information on resources 
and updated meeting 
status please contact: 
susanbgabay@gmail.

com. 
For other NAMI informa-

tion or resources: 
NAMI Oregon Support 
Line 1-800-343-6264

Adult Grief Support

Group in The Dalles
You’re not alone. We’re here 
to listen. Call to register: 
541-387-6449. All are wel-
come!

TOPS OR #942 meets at 
Gateway Presbyterian 
Church, The Dalles, Thurs-
days, 5:30-6:30pm.

FAMILY Alzheimer’s/De-
mentia Support Group: 
family members and friends 
caring for individuals with 
Alzheimer’s disease or a 
related dementia are in-
vited to participate in our 
Dementia Support Group. 
Come and gain support and 
insight from others who are 
going thru or have gone 
thru this journey. Join us 
monthly in a caring envi-
ronment to discuss your 
challenges and questions. 
Meeting held third Wednes-
day, every month, at 3:00 
pm at FlagStone Senior Liv-
ing at 3325 Columbia View 
Drive. For more information 
about our group, contact 
Karen Wilson at 541-298-
5656. All Welcome.

AA in PARKDALE, meeting 
Sunday nights from 6-7pm, 
Parkdale Fire Dept., 4895 
Baseline Dr., Parkdale, OR.

TOPS OR #443 meets
Thursday mornings, 
8:30- 10 am. @ Zion Lu-
theran 
Church, use elevator en-
trance only. 
10th and Union St., The
Dalles, OR.

Providence Hospice of 
the Gorge Children and 

Teens Grief Groups
for families that have 

experienced the death of 
a parent of sibling.

First and Third Thursdays, 
6-7pm in Hood River. Piz-
za dinner and gas cards 

provided. 
Contact Gwen Thomas at 
541-387-6449 to register.

RIVERVIEW Al-Anon Fam-
ily Group in The Dalles: 
Episcopal Church of St. 
Paul, 1805 Minnesota, 
Taylor Hall. Meets every 
Thursday, 12:30-1:30pm. 
This meeting is free and 
open to anyone in the com-
munity who is interested in 
attending.

RECOVERING COUPLES

ANONYMOUS
Meets 2nd & 4th
Sundays at 10am.

216 Cascade St., Suite 26
Hood River

AL ANON FAMILY GROUPS
(Support for family and 

friends of alcoholics) 

meets  Mondays at noon

Pathways to Recovery

Riverside Community 

Church

317 State St.

Ruth Wells Room

Tuesdays at 7pm

St. Mark’s

11th & Eugene

Hood River

Adult Grief Support

Groups in Hood River
You are not alone. We’re 
here to listen. Call to reg-
ister: 541-387-6449. All are 
welcome!

Survivors of Suicide Loss
Support Group

Open to anyone who has 
lost a loved one to suicide! 
Meets monthly on the 
2nd Tuesday from 5:30 to 
6:30pm at the Hood River 
Campus of the Columbia 
Gorge Community College. 
However due to COVID-19 
meetings are suspended 
until further notice. Con-
tact: belinda.ballah@co.
hood-river.or.us

PARKINSON’S Support 
Group: 1st Wednesday of 
every month, 2pm @ Wa-
ter’s Edge, 551 Lone Pine 
Blvd., 2nd Floor. For more 
information, please contact 
Chad @ 541-340-0142.

NA MEETINGS
Every Wednesday.
6:30 - 7:30 at the

Casa Guadalupe House,
1603 Belmont,

Hood River, Oregon.

DEMENTIA Support Group
every 3rd Friday at the
Oregon Veterans Home,
1:30 - 2:30 pm.
541-296-7190 for info.

HAVEN: Weekly counseling 
groups for victims of do-
mestic/teen dating violence 
or sexual assault. Biweekly 
educational classes given 
in Spanish and English for 
domestic violence. Call Ha-
ven, 541-296-1662.

Gorge Grief Groups

for Families
(Children, Teens, and Care-
givers). 1st & 3rd Thursday 
of the month, 6-7pm (Oc-
tober-April) at the PHTG 
offices, 1630 Woods Court. 
Please call 541-387-6449 for 
more information. All are 
welcome.

GRIEF SUPPORT
Establishing a

Grief Support Group.
Please call Natasha

702-755-0778

DO YOU HAVE
HURTS, HABITS, 

HANG-UPS?
Attend

CELEBRATE RECOVERY,
a faith-based 12 step 

program, every Thursday 
night at 

Hood River Alliance Church
2650 W. Montello
(Off Rand Road)

Dinner provided at 
5:45pm

and large group meeting 
at 6:30pm

Childcare is provided.
For more info. call

507-820-0871

AL-ANON in The Dalles: 
The Dalles Serenity meet-
ing every Monday at 7pm 
@ Gateway Presbyterian 
Church, 1111 Dry Hollow. For 
more info, call 541-296-2677.

AA MEETINGS
TUESDAYS and FRIDAYS:

12 noon, St. Joseph’s 
Catholic Church, 240 
NW Washington Street, 
White Salmon, WA

THURSDAYS: 7 p.m.
SUNDAYS: 7 p.m.

Umpqua Bank, 73 NE 
Estes Avenue, White 
Salmon, WA

AA in MAUPIN (open), 
Ma u p i n  C o m m u n i t y 
Church, 490 5th St., Thurs-
days @ 7pm.

Volunteers
Gorge Youth Mentoring

(G.Y.M.)
a program of The Next 
Door, is seeking a posi-
tive, adult role model for a 
10-year-old boy in Mosier,
who is very outgoing, goofy, 
and smart. He has been
waiting to spend a couple
days a month with a mentor 
who could expose him to
science projects, reading,
and just go with the flow
sometimes. He enjoys
seeing how things work,
doing projects that change 
his memory, and exploring.
For more information on
how to get involved with
G.Y.M., please call (541)
399-0259.

Gorge Youth Mentoring
(G.Y.M.)

a program of The Next 
Door, is seeking a posi-
tive, adult role model for a 
9-year-old boy in The Dalles 
who is described as kind, 
helpful and considerate. He 
has been waiting to spend 
a couple days a month with 
a mentor who could join 
him in outdoor adventures 
and introduce him to new 
hobbies & interests. He 
enjoys swimming, soccer, 
animals and boating. For 
more information on how 
to get involved with G.Y.M., 
please call (541) 399-0259.

MENTORS WANTED
Would you enjoy building 
a meaningful friendship 
with a child or teen? If so, 
become a mentor! Gorge 
Youth Mentoring, a program 
of The Next Door, provides 
children and teens with 
community based, one-
on-one mentoring relation-
ships with adult volunteers. 
Right now, 18 youth ages 6 
to 21 are waiting to make a 
new friend. Mentors and 
youth plan their own ac-
tivities based on their own 
schedules, meeting at least 
twice a month, for one year 
or more.
For more information, visit
www.nextdoorinc.org/

gym
or email

gym@nextdoorinc.org

Gorge Youth Mentoring
(G.Y.M.)

a program of The Next Door, 
is seeking a positive, adult 
role model for an 11-year-
old girl in The Dalles. She 
has been waiting to spend 
a couple days a month with 
a mentor who could expose 
her to a mix of activities, 
both indoor and outdoor. 
She enjoys being around all 
kinds of domestic & exotic 
animals, play sports and 
going out for an all-day na-
ture adventure.  For more 
information on how to get 
involved with G.Y.M., please 
call (541) 399-0259.

Apparel & Jewelry
JEWELRY, be your own 
boss! Private and commer-
cial collection of hundreds 
of pieces of costume jewel-
ry to sell online or at shows. 
$500. 509-637-4111.

Building Materials
DOOR, 3-0 x 6 x 8, 2 panel, 
knotty alder, pre hung, 4 
9/16 jam, left hand swing. 
$175. 541-980-4154.

MAROON Kitchen Base 
Cabinets with hardware, 
4 cabinets, 34.5” tall x 24” 
deep, various widths. Call 
for details. Sell all for $225. 
541-980-4154.

GARAGE Door. White, 
metal, 9’ x 7’. All hardware 
included. Easy installation. 
Like new. $200. Call Dave, 
541-490-5670.

Furniture
RECLINER, brown color. 
Excellent condition. Hardly 
used. $100. 541-354-1059.

CUBICLE panels, some 
with desk tops and file 
drawers, multiple attach-
ments, 3 foot, 4 foot or 5 
foot heights. They can be 
arranged in many different 
widths and sizes. Beige, 
Henry Miller brand, excel-
lent condition. Best Offer 
accepted. 541-386-1234 ask 
for Joe Petshow.

LAZYBOY reclining couch  
& love seat. Excellent con-  
dition, cream colored.  
$950.00 call 509-261-2038

Household 
Merchandise

TEA POTS, 6 or 5 cup. $6 
each. 541-387-4752.

Health & Fitness
TREADMILL, Sears Deluxe 
with incline. Can connect to 
web and much more. Excel-
lent condition. Purchased 
for $700, selling for $200. 
541-296-9596.

Miscellaneous
1919 AMERICAN Flag 
House and Betsy Ross Me-
morial Assoc. certificate, no. 
60133. $55. 541-490-7254.

NEWSPAPER tubes, FREE! 
Great for projects. Call 
Hood River News, 541-
386-1234.

PATIO Cover made of wood 
and aluminum, 12’ x 20’. 
Free. 541-296-1271.

HUNTERS: Complete Com-
mercial Meat Grinder with 
all sausage making parts; 
new knives, grind plates, 
stuffing tubes. $500 firm. 
541-352-7273.

DOUBLE/FULL Bed with 
Futon-Style Mattress. $135. 
541-490-7254.

CHESS Folding Table. 
Championship Marquetry 
fine inland wood genuine 
chess board. $125. Call 541-
296-1533.

LIFE Jacket Vest, Stearns 
brand, youth size, 50-90 
lbs., blue and black color. 
Very good condition. $15. 
541-386-1371.

EMILY Meritt Desktop Dec-
orative Mirror from Pottery 
Barn Teen with a golden 
finish and cute kitty ears. 
Brand new, never used, new 
in box. $50. 541-386-1371

Office Work Stations
Eight custom-made office 
work stations; 88 inches by 
88 inches with 4 AC plug 
electrical power junctions 
with each station. Four 4 
ft. high oak dividers with 
dark green laminate count-
er tops. $50 each. 541-386-
1234.

BERKEL 12” Commercial 
Meat Slicer. Slice hams, ba-
con and more. $500 firm. 
541-352-7273.

Miscellaneous 
Wanted

WANTED: Old Rock

Collections
Agate, jasper, jade etc.

541-386-2397

Tools
CHAINSAWS (3), 20” with 
bar and chain. $75 for all. 
541-296-1271.

TOOL Box, metal, hand 
carry with upper tray, 19” 
x 7” x 7”. $20. 541-490-7254.

Sporting Goods
GOLF Clubs. Top Flite set 
includes driver, 3 wood, 4 
Hybrid club, 5 Hybrid club, 
6-pitching wedge irons, ex-
tra wedge, putter and golf 
bag. $95. 541-490-6466.

NOTICE
Certain laws and restric-
tions, as well as registra-
tion requirements, apply to 
the sale of firearms. Fore 
more information, contact 
the Seattle Field Division of 
the Department of Alcohol, 
Tobacco and Firearms at 
206-204-3205. This field
division is responsible for
Washington, Idaho, Oregon, 
Alaska and Hawaii. You may 
also go to www.atf.gov for
FAQs and information.

Cats

“SNOWFLAKE”

Flamepoint Siamese female. Blue 
eyes. Sweet. Loving. Spayed. Felv 
tested. Indoor only.

MORE CATS 
AVAILABLE

TO CHOOSE FROM

FREE MICROCHIP!

Call Elizabeth

541-386-5099
PURRFECT FIT

CAT 
ADOPTIONS

  () ()
== . ==

purrfect-fit.petfinder.com

Farm Equipment 
& Supplies

FARM Equipment for Sale: 
John Deer 6602 Combine 
($2500), 1980 Ford Grain 
Truck ($2000),  Farmall 
Hydro 70 Tractor ($4300), 
Farmall “M” Tractor with 
Bucket ($3200), JD 9350 
grain drill/seeder ($2300), 
JD disc ($1300), 3-Point 
Sprayer ($500).  503-930-
8988.

Food, Meat, 
Produce

THE BERRY SHACK
8320 Cooper Spur Rd.

Parkdale - 541-352-4188
Blueberries, U-pick.

$1.50 pound.
Pesticide free.

U-PICK Blueberries at 
Middle Mt. Farm

5895 Boneboro Road, 
Parkdale.

On Fruit Loop, Facebook, 
Google

Contact: 817-995-0698

Horses & Tack
A SWEET 3-year-old Filly 
to an approved home. Free. 
Call for more info and pho-
tos. 509-281-2221.

Livestock & 
Supplies

BUYING
All types of horses.
We pick them up

and pay cash
J.A. Bennett Livestock

541-519-2802 or
541-256-0502

Garage/Yard Sales

Advertise
Your

Garage Sale
Up to 10 lines

Print and Online

$25 Prepaid
To place your ad contact 

your local newspaper.

Hood River News
541-386-1234

hoodrivernews.com
Click Classifieds

The Dalles Chronicle
541-296-2141

thedalleschronicle.com
Click Classifieds

White Salmon Enterprise
509-493-2112

whitesalmonenterprise.
com

Click Classifieds

ANOTHER BIG SALE 
AFTER A LONG WAIT

Friday-Sunday, 
Aug. 14-16
8am-5pm

4465 Woodworth Road
Mt. Hood/Parkdale

After a two year break 
we’re having a big sale with 
something for everyone! 
Lots of household goods, 
sewing machine, furniture, 
art, clothes for men and 
women, antiques, kitchen 
needs, carpentry tools from 
a retired builder, gardening 
tools and supplies.

GARAGE SALE 

Friday, Saturday & 
Sunday

August 14,15 & 16
8am-4pm

8160 Clear Creek Road
Parkdale, OR. 

Furniture, Electronics, 
Farm Equipment and 

much more!

HRVCC THRIFT SHOP
RE-OPENING on a 

LIMITED BASIS

Wednesdays Only! Begin-
ning Aug. 5. 
9am-12pm

Masks required. 
No children.

5 shoppers at a time.

Hood River Valley Chris-
tian Church

975 Indian Creek Rd.
Hood River

MARGARET’S PORCH 
SALE!! 

Come to Margaret 

Walker’s historic house 

at 245 W. Jewett Blvd. 

in White Salmon on 

Saturday, August 15th 

from 9am-3pm for a 

giant sale. 

A little bit of everything, 

dishes, pots and pans, 

garden stuff (pots), outdoor 

furniture, antiques, some 

toys and clothes, puzzles 

and much more. Stop by 

and find a treasure or two.

YARD & FARM 
EQUIPMENT SALE

Fri., Sat. & Sun. 
Aug. 14, 15 & 16 

9am-5pm
17 Harris Road

Goldendale, WA 98620

Tools, filters, jack stands, 
chains, car ramps, tow 

cables, generators and all 
sorts of farm equipment. 

Call 503-930-8988 for 
more specific info.

Cars
SELL your automobile 

quickly in our Gorge Classi-

fieds. Place your ad through 

one of our websites or call 

one of our newspapers:

hoodrivernews.com
541-386-1234

thedalleschronicle.com
541-296-2141

whitesalmonenterprise.
com

509-493-2112

VW BEETLE
2002, turbo, sunroof, heated 
leather seats, brand new 
tires, needs work, $900.

541-806-3607
(White Salmon, WA)

Wheels
Deal

Advertise Your Car, 
Truck, Boat, Motorcycle,

 Motorhome

• 10 Lines
• 4 Weeks

• Print & Online
• 10 Online Photos

• Online Map

Only $25
hoodrivernews.com

or
whitesalmonenterprise.

com
or

thedalleschronicle.com

Click on “Classifieds”
Click on “Place An Ad”

2014 SUBARU Legacy 2.5i 
Premium. 144,000 mi. Runs 
great. 4 new snow tires in-
cluded in price. Contact 
Laurel at 541-380-0462.

Biggs Auto Auction
Tuesday, August 18

91610 Biggs-Rufus Hwy.
Biggs Jct., OR

8am-11am

GOLDENDALE  
AUTO AUCTION

Wednesday, August 12
1180 W. Broadway St.

Goldendale, WA
8-11 a.m.

GOLDENDALE  
AUTO AUCTION

Wednesday, August 19
1180 W. Broadway St.

Goldendale, WA
8-11 a.m.

Jeep Grand  
Cherokee Laredo,  

2002
6 cylinder “in line” 4.0 liter  
engine-auto trans-4WD- 
AC-power windows. Runs  
well, does not burn oil-new-  
er tires and shocks-good  
interior-well maintained-  
230k miles. Asking $1800,  
no trades.
503 307 9023 0r email to  
fireit.mc@gmail.com

Pickups & Trucks
1964 GMC Pickup. Par-
tial restoration, selling as 
is.  $3500. 503-449-7802. 
Leave a message.

2003 CHEVY F10, gold 
color. Comes with 4 new 
tires. Runs well. $2200. 541-
296-2677.

Boats & Motors
TWO BOATS TOO MANY!
One is nice 16’ Starcraft with 
easy load trailer. Second 
is 14’ Boston Whaler with 
trailer, 50 HP Merc. Needs 
TLC. $1750 each. OBO. 360-
261-0298.

Campers & 
Canopies

KIWICK Pop-Up Motorcy-
cle Camp Trailer. Good con-
dition. $1250. 509-493-1433.

Motorcycles 
HONDA Ruckus 2011 50cc 
Motor Scooter. Only rode 
669 miles. $1600. 541-980-
1970.

ROAD Racing Motorcycle 
Parts: Custom Wheels, 
Dual Disc Brakes, Axel 
Brake Rotors and Speedo 
Cable Forks. $500. Call 541-
296-1533.

Travel Trailers
FIFTH Wheel Prowler 
House Trailer, 24’. Excel-
lent condition, kept under 
cover for its lifetime. New 
tires. $8,500. 541-806-2108. 
No texting.

FLATBED TRAILER. 16  
foot. $1200.00. call 509- 
773-3925

Apartments 
for Rent

THE DALLES - 1 Bedroom 

apartments available for 

rent in The Dalles. WSG 

paid, no pets allowed. 

Please call for more infor-

mation 541-298-7015.

PUBLISHER’S
NOTICE

All real estate advertised 
herein is subject to the 
Federal Fair Housing Act, 
which makes it illegal to 
advertiser any preference, 
limitation or discrimina-
tion based on race, color, 
religion, sec, handicap, 
familial state or national 
origin, or an intention to 
make any such preferenc-
es, limitations or discrim-
inations. Familial state 
includes children under 
the age of 18 living with 
parents or legal custodi-
ans, pregnant women & 
people securing custody 
of children under 19.

This newspaper will not 
knowingly accept any 
adverting for real estate 
which is in violation of 
the law. All persons are 
hereby informed that 
all dwellings advertised 
are available on an equal 
opportunity basis. To 
complain of discrimina-
tion call HUD toll-free 
at 1-800-669-9777, TTY/
TDD: 1-800-927-9275.

Business/
Commercial 

Rentals
THE DALLES - New 
Co-Working space in The 
Dalles. 3 individual offic-
es at the remodeled Auto 
Electric Building at 314 Lin-
coln St. A great light filled 
space w/ common area 
shared by the tenants. 80 
or 88 sq ft $300/mo each 
& 66 sq ft $250/mo. Small 
& large conference space 
is available. Includes util-
ities, high speed internet, 
kitchen, bathrooms & copy/
scan. Parking at City lot on 
3rd St. Contact Carmen at 
541-980-3280.

Houses for Rent
THE DALLES House for 
Rent. Roomy 3 bdrm., 2 
full bath, vaulted ceilings, 
on wide street with off 
street RV parking. Stan-
dard wheelchair handicap 
accessible. May consider 
pets. Short term or long 
term contracts possible. 
$1395 per month+depos-
its. TEXT ONLY PLEASE: 
541-993-7372.

MT. HOOD AREA - 4 bed 
+ office, 2 bath, KLM Drive. 
W/D hookups, stove, dish-
washer, refrigerator, A/C,
water and sewer.  One-year 
lease minimum. $1600/
month, first/last plus $1500 
security deposit.  Pets con-
sidered on individual basis: 
$500 pet deposit plus $25
extra per month per pet.
$40 screening fee per adult; 
includes criminal back-
ground, credit and tenant
history checks.  Available
September 15th.  Call 541-
354-2495.

THE DALLES - 2 Bdrm., 1 

Bath, near Middle School 

w/ washer & dryer hook-

up & off-street RV park-

ing. $995/month. Furnished 

$1095/month, with utilities 

& not furnished $1295/

month, with utilities & fur-

nished $1395/month. Plus 

deposits. Short or Long 

term contract. TEXT ONLY 

PLEASE, 541-993-7372.

Acreage & Lots
GOLDENDALE, WA - 5 

acres, building lot with 

sweeping views including 

Mt. Hood & Mt. Adams, 10 

miles west of Goldendale, 

power pole on site, 2 sheds, 

windmill, generator, satellite 

dish and potential for well. 

$55,000. 503-930-8988.

Clerical/Office

CLERICAL 
POSITION 

Diamond Fruit has an 

immediate opening for a 

full time Clerical position. 

Interested applicants shall 

have a high school diploma, 

or greater, be a self-mo-

tivated/self-starter, highly 

organized, analytical, and 

methodical individual with 

excellent phone skills who 

has a passion for error free 

results, problem solving, 

and a variety of job re-

sponsibilities. Proficiency 

in Excel and Word is strong-

ly desired. Bilingual in En-

glish and Spanish is pre-

ferred. Applicants should 

e-mail resume and wage

requirements to carlab@

diamondfruit.com.

Help Wanted

MARKETING 
BRAND 

MANAGER 
$ DOE

Typical hours M-F, 
7am-4pm

Full Time, Benefits & 401K 

The ideal person filling 
this position has market-
ing experience in the spirits 
industry.

Send resume to 
HR@hrdspirits.com 

www.hrdspirits.com for full 
job description

TRACTOR/
EQUIPMENT 
OPERATORS

Tractor/Equipment Op-

erators for Pear Harvest 

wanted in Parkdale, Or-

egon. Harvest beginning 

mid-August. Must have 

transportation to job site. 

$14.00 -$15.00/Hour. Call 

509-388-3139 for more info.

Support Groups Support Groups Volunteers Miscellaneous Cars

Classifieds
GORGE Serving Washington & 

Oregon in the Columbia 
River Gorge

The Dalles Chronicle 

541-296-2141 

thedalleschronicle.com

Hood River News

541-386-1234

hoodrivernews.com

Week of August 12, 2020

Business &
Service Directory

4 Weeks
Up to 10 Lines

Print and Online

Only $45
$5 per additional line.

Contact your local news-
paper or place your ad 

online using our fact and 
easy online entry system.

hoodrivernews.com
541-386-1234

thedallechronicle.com
541-296-2141

whitesalmonenterprise.com
509-493-2112


