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LEGAL NOTICE 

 

( E d i t o r ’ s 

Note: Names, 

ages, addresses, 

incidents and 

charges are pro-

vided by official 

law enforcement 

agencies. All per-

sons listed in this 

report are inno-

cent until proven 

guilty in a court 

of law. Charges 

can be amended 

or dismissed.) 

*** 
Saturday, Nov. 8 

*A concrete 
garbage can was 
removed from in 
front of a business 
in Downtown Cave 
Junction on Red-
wood Hwy. after 
an alarm went off 
for an unknown 
reason. 

*A man said 
he saw six people 
shooting fish with 
guns from the 
Green Bridge on 
Pugetville Road. 

*The concrete 
garbage can was 
found in the street 
in front of a busi-
ness in the 100 
block of Redwood 
Hwy. 

*In the 300 
block of Mona 
Way a woman said 
two mature mari-
juana plants were 
missing from her 
house. She had a 
marijuana card but 
had more plants 
than allowed. 
Deputies seized 
two mature pot 
plants and left 
three. 

*A woman 
said her non-injury 
a c c i d en t  w a s 

IN THE CIRCUIT 
COURT OF THE 
STATE OF ORE-
GON FOR THE 
COUNTY OF JOSE-
PHINE 
In the Matter of the 
Estate of: Robert 
James Nicolaw, de-
ceased, Case No. 
03-P-0300 NOTICE 
TO INTERESTED 
PERSONS 
Notice is hereby 
given that the under-
signed have been 
appointed and have 
qualified as the Co-
Personal Represen-
tatives of the estate. 
All persons having 
claims against the 
estate are hereby 
required to present 
their claims, with 
proper vouchers, 
within four months 
after the date of first 
publication of this 
notice, as stated 
below, to the Co-
Personal Represen-
tatives at P.O. Box 
234, Cave Junction, 
OR 97523 or the 
claims may be 
barred.  
All persons whose 
rights may be af-
fected by the pro-
ceedings in this es-
tate may obtain addi-
tional information 
from the records of 
the court, the Co-
Personal Represen-
tatives, or the attor-
ney for the Co-
Personal Represen-
tatives. Dated and 
first published, No-
vember 5, 2003.  
 
Shalwa Nicolaw  
Lisa Valenzuela 
c/o P.O. Box 234  
Cave Junction, OR 
97523. 
 
Mansfield R. Cleary 
Attorney for the Es-
tate, P.O. Box 234 
Cave Junction, OR 
97523 
 
Publish: Nov. 5, 12, 
19, 26 

NOTICE OF 
PUBLIC  

HEARING 

caused by an ani-
mal in the road or 
an ice patch at the 
top of Hay’s Hill at 
11:01 a.m.  

*In the 36000 
block of Redwood 
Hwy. a woman 
said her father as-
saulted her hus-
band. It was a case 
of mutual harass-
ment. 

* M i s t y 
Marlene Kiene, 24, 
was cited and re-
leased on a charge 
of DUII after she 
was involved in a 
non-injury single 
vehicle accident in 
the 1000 block of 
H a p p y  C a m p 
Road. 

*In the 200 
block of Ollis 
Road a woman 
said she saw a sus-
picious man possi-
bly carrying a 
spray paint can. 

*In the 100 
block of Hogue 
Drive a man threw 
his shoe at a 
woman. She said 
she was sick of his 
antics but decided 
not to press 
charges. 

*In the 4000 
block of Holland 
Loop Road a 
w o m a n ’ s  e x -
boyfriend was 
pounding on her 
windows and re-
fusing to leave. He 
said she should 
“shoot him or he 
will keep doing 
this.”  

Sunday, Nov. 9 

* H o w a r d 
Conley, 95, was 
dead on arrival 
after being trans-
ported to Three 
Rivers Community 
Hospital from the 
200 block of S. 
Junction Avenue. 

*In the 100 
block of Warren 
Road a woman 
said her husband 

stole then sold her 
truck and was sit-
ting in her living 
room laughing at 
her. She was afraid 
he would abuse 
her. The truck was 
recovered. The 
couple said they 
would stay away 
from each other for 
a while. 

*In the 900 
block of N. Old 
Stage Road a 
woman said she 
heard two gunshots 
at 12:52 p.m. 

*A man in the 
300 block of Wal-
damar Road said 
he received a 
phone call from 
one of his three 
children and that 
they were in dis-
tress. Deputies 
contacted their 
mother and she 
said they were OK. 

*In the 700 
block of Pine Cone 
Drive a man said 
he was struck in 
the genitals by a 
woman. He said he 
did not want to 
pursue charges. 

*In the 6000 
block of Westside 
Road a woman 
said she saw a sus-
picious vehicle 
back into her 
driveway. 

Monday, Nov. 10 

*In the 700 
block of Pine Cone 
Road a man said 
someone was at his 
house that was not 
supposed to be 
there.  

*On Hussey 
Avenue Robert 
James Wilbourne, 
23, was cited and 
r e l e a s e d  o n 
charges of driving 
while suspended, 
driving uninsured, 
and for possession 
of less than an 
ounce of a con-
trolled substance 

and for failure to 
appear on charges 
of fourth-degree 
assault.  

*In the 200 
block of W. River 
Street a woman 
wanted the welfare 
of a couple 
checked on. A case 
worker said the 
couple was OK. 

*In the 600 
block of East River 
Street a man said a 
vehicle was used 
without permis-
sion.  

* D e p u t i e s 
were able to con-
tain a loose horse 
in the 5700 block 
of Westside Road. 

Tuesday, Nov. 11 

*A woman 
said she heard gun-
shots in the 200 
block of Aries 
Lane. 

*In the 500 
block of South 
Redwood Hwy. a 
woman said she 
was going to get a 
gun and harm her-
self because she 
was arrested the 
night before for a 
DUII and child 
endangerment. She 
was voluntarily 
transported.  

*In the 400 
block of Redwood 
Hwy. a woman 
said items were 
missing from two 
vehicles. 

*A man in the 
35000 block of 
Redwood Hwy. 
said his ex-
business partner 
was refusing to 
give him a prop-
erty deed until he 
gave him $5,000. 

*In the 3900 
block of Almar 
Road a man said 
his neighbor’s 
mailbox was sto-
len. 

*In the 3400 
block of Westside 

Road a man said 
his neighbor’s 
house looked like 
it had been broken 
into. A chain was 
cut and his garage 
door was open. 
The vacationing 
neighbor said he 
would check on 
the house when he 
got home. 

*In the 35000 
block of Redwood 
Hwy. a man said a 
$6 lock was miss-
ing from a gate. 

*A woman in 
the 600 block of 
Dick George Road 
said her neighbor’s 
dog looked like it 
could be starving 
and she wanted a 
welfare check done 
on her elderly 
neighbor. Deputies 
gave the dog water 
and biscuits but 
did not locate the 
homeowner. 

*Eric Griffie, 
32, was arrested on 
warrants and addi-
tional charges of 
possession of a 
controlled sub-
stance, giving false 
information and 
failure to carry and 
present.  

 * At  Sh o p 
Smart Food Ware-
house in Down-
town Cave Junc-
tion Eileen Patricia 
Szz i l a ge yhedes 
was arrested on 
warrants for the 
charges of failure 
to appear for the 
original charges of 
third-degree theft, 
DUII and for fail-
ure to appear for 
possession of a 
schedule II and IV 
controlled sub-
stance.  

*A woman 
said that a man 
was yelling at her 
children for knock-
ing over a porta-
potty in the 3000 

block of Rocky-
dale Road in a case 
of continuing har-
assment. Deputies 
said the harass-
ment was un-
founded.  

*In the 18000 
block of Redwood 
Hwy. a man said 
there was an emo-
tionally disturbed 
man sitting in a car 
in his driveway. 
Deputies trans-
ported him to a 
nearby motel as he 
was not a danger to 
himself or others. 

*A woman at 
the I.V. Substation 
said her runaway 
daughter may be in 
Takilma. Deputies 
referred the infor-
mation to the day 
shift.  

Monday, Nov. 10 

*In the 300 
block of Prottsman 
Way at 12:26 a.m. 
deputies responded 
to a fully engulfed 
structure fire. The 
fire was put out.  

*Gary W. Ed-
wards, 56, listed as 
a transient, was 
arrested on charges 
of driving while 
suspended after 
being pulled over 
for unauthorized 
use of a vehicle on 
Airport Drive. 

*At  Home 
Valley Bank in the 
100 block of S. 
Kerby Avenue a 
woman said win-
dow stripping had 
been removed and 
there was damage 
to the glass and 
molding. The dam-
age was listed at 
$350. 

*At milepost 
18 of Redwood 
Hwy. deputies re-
sponded to a traffic 
accident at 12:42 
p.m. between a 
pickup truck and a 
jeep. A man suf-

fered minor inju-
ries. 

*In the 100 
block of S. Hussey 
Avenue at Lube 
and Shine a man 
said his gate was 
kicked open, Coke 
machine was van-
dalized, and a win-
dow was broken 
out of a vehicle 
causing a listed 
damage of $200. 

*In the 11000 
block of Takilma 
Road a woman 
said her neighbor 
threatened her in 
an ongoing dis-
pute. She wanted 
the information 
logged. 

*In the 100 
block of Watkins 
Street a man said 
someone used a 
hammer to break a 
car window and 
the stereo was 
missing. 

*A man was 
transported to the 
Three Rivers Com-
munity Hospital 
from the 35000 
block of Redwood 
Hwy. after suffer-
ing “mental epi-
sodes.” 

*A woman in 
the 200 block of 
Ollis Road said she 
saw headlights 
outside and some-
one tried to push in 
her home’s back 
door. She put a 
chair against the 
door and someone 
pushed it hard 
enough to knock 
the chair away. 
Deputies were un-
able to locate any-
one suspicious. 

*A woman in 
the 100 block of 
Redwood Hwy. 
said someone was 
hitting her in front 
of her children. 
Deputies were un-
able to locate her. 

* D e p u t i e s 

were unable to lo-
cate anyone suspi-
cious on Airport 
Drive after they 
received a call 
from a concerned 
citizen at 11:16 
p.m. 

Thursday, Nov. 

13 

*A heater with 
a listed value of 
$83 was missing 
from a mushroom 
buyer’s tent in 
Downtown Cave 
Junction. 

*Deputies re-
covered a stolen 
vehicle in the 100 
block of Watkins 
Street at 12:09 
p.m. 

*Deputies re-
covered a stolen 
vehicle on Logan 
Cut Road at 2:55 
p.m. 

*Two jackets, 
two pairs of pants 
and two shirts 
were missing from 
a vehicle on Deer 
Creek Road. The 
value was listed at 
$200.  

*A woman 
said she lost her 
purse on Old Stage 
Road. It included 
$20 in cash and a 
food stamp card.  

*A woman 
said a quad was 
missing from her 
home in the 300 
block of Waldamar 
Road. She said a 
man may have vio-
lated his restrain-
ing order to snatch 
the ATV. 

*On Caves 
Hwy. near Laurel 
Road a man said 
he was assaulted 
by two men. Depu-
ties filed a report 
for fourth-degree 
assault. 

*In the 500 
block of Sherwood 
Avenue an 101-
year-old man died. 
His name was not 
listed. 

This is to give notice 
that on Monday, De-
cember 8, 2003 at 
7:30 p.m. in the 
Council Chambers of 
the City Hall, 222 W. 
Lister St., Cave 
Junction, Oregon, 
the Common Council 
in accordance with 
the Land Use Hear-
ing Rules and ORS 
197.763, will hold a 
Public Hearing to 
consider a two lot 
Land Partition, sub-
mitted by Lynn John-
son, for property 
located at 656 N. Old 
Stage Road, more 
particularly described 
as Assessor’s Map 
39-08-22-BB, Tax 
Lot 500. Possible 
actions include Ap-
proval, Approval with 
Conditions, Disap-
proval, Table or Con-
tinue.  
Persons with hear-
ing, visual, or manual 
impairment who wish 
to participate in the 
meeting should con-
tact the city to ar-
range appropriate 
communication as-
sistance. City Hall 
can be reached by 
telephone at (541) 
592-2156, Fax (541) 
592-6694 or TDD 
Relay 1 (800) 735-
2900 
Publish date: Nov. 
26, 2003 

  
Happy 

Thanksgiving! 

Illinois Valley News 
321 S. Redwood Hwy., Cave Junction, OR. 97523 

A Look Back This Week 
 

On November 30, 1782, a preliminary 
agreement between Britain and the 
United States was signed in Paris, 
wherein Britain recognized the inde-
pendence of the new nation ... Novem-
ber 24, 1832, a South Carolina con-
vention passed the Ordinance of Nulli-
fication against a permanent tariff, 
threatening to withdraw from the Un-
ion ... November 29, 1864, the U.S. 
cavalry attacked Cheyenne and Arap-
aho Indians in the Sand Creek massa-
cre; the Indians were awaiting surren-
der terms ... November 29, 1916, the 
U.S. established a military government 
in the Dominican Republic ... Novem-
ber 26, 1950, reacting to UN actions, 
China sent troops across its border ... 
November 24, 1963, Lee Harvey 
Oswald, arrested and charged with the 
murder of President Kennedy, was 
shot and fatally wounded by Jack 
Ruby, a nightclub owner ... November 
30, 1993, President Clinton signed the 
Brady Bill, a major gun-control meas-
ure ... November 28, 1995, the federal 
55-mile-per-hour speed limit was re-
pealed by a measure signed this 
day ... November 25, 2001, a Massa-
chusetts company announced it had 
created the first-ever human embryos 
by cloning ... November 26, 2001, 
President Bush said he considered the 
work on human cloning to be im-
moral ... November 27, 2001, Attorney 
General John Ashcroft announced that 
those individuals still held under suspi-
cion of terrorist activities were primar-
ily of Middle Eastern descent and in 
most cases were being detained on 
immigration violations, including over-
staying their visas ... November 29, 
2001, senior Justice Department offi-
cials conceded that only a handful of 
the detainees were suspected of links 
to al-Qaeda. 
(c) 2003 DBR Media, Inc. 

Sports Challenge By WALTER BRANCH 
1. What 1987 golf tournament received 5,542 entry forms? 
2. What athlete's 1988 marriage in Edmonton was dubbed Canada's "royal wedding of the decade"? 
3. What baseball team owner was described in Tip O'Neill's memoirs as "gracious"? 
4. What female athlete inspired Esquire to exclaim: "At last! A German we'd like to get to know bet-
ter"? 
5. Who was MVP of the 1988 World Series? 
6. What eastern U.S. city made a pitch to the NCAA to host the "Crab Bowl"? 
7. What sport saw Soviet strongman Oxen Mirzoian clinch a gold medal at the 1988 Summer Olym-
pics? 
8. What bald athlete was pictured in 1988 ads for Right Guard Sports Stick deodorant? 
9. What must a baseball player accomplish to be a "40-40 man"? 
10. How many meters did Eric Heiden skate to win his record-setting fifth gold medal at the 1980 
Winter Olympics? 
Sports Challenge Answers 
1. The U.S. Open; 2. Wayne Gretzky's; 3. George Steinbrenner; 4. Katarina Witt; 5. Orel Hershiser; 
6. Baltimore, Maryland; 7. Weightlifting; 8. Marvelous Marvin Hagler; 9. Hit 40 home runs and steal 
40 bases; 10. 10,000       (c) 2003 DBR Media, Inc. 
 


